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FUNNY BUSINESS Frl., April 13, 1956 Th N.wi-Revi.- 1ml urf, Or. 13LEGALTeachers Becoming Scarcer, Educators Learn At Session

'hssifiedSsctiois
in Bakersfield and Kern County,
Calif.

Asked why, the superintendent
said salary offers from the trio
surpassed others. Portland public
school teachers have a salary
schedule maximum of $6,600; Kern
of $7,700; and Bakersfield of

Maximum salary for a District
4 instructor after 16 years teach
ing experience is $6,050, Deller
continued.

He told board members that thus
far "we have done fairly well for
Roseburg recruitment, but it ap
pears this year that more active
recruiting than ever before will be
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COME IN AND

The nearly 2,500 educators at-

tending the recent annual conven-
tion of the Inland Empire Educa-
tion Assn. in Spokane learned that
teachers are becoming a scarce
commodity.

ltoseburg School Supt. M. C, Del-le- r

told school board members
Wednesday of his trip to the con-
vention to find instructors for the
district. The supply, he said,
doesn't equal demand.

Three schools represented at the
session received practically all the
attention of potential teachers.
(The potential were a small share
of the 2,500 in attendance.) Those
districts were Portland and schools

Around the World

ACROSS DOWN

1 Thailand 1 European
5 Notoriety river
8 Angeles, 2 Preposition

California 3 Upon
12 Opposed 4 Actors
13 Nights before 5 Turkish

evenU headgear
14 Era 6 Reluctant
15 Fine sprayers 7 Simple
17 Before 8 German city

(prefix) 9 Stones
18 Lassoed 10 Monstet
19 Shriller 1 1 Foreteller
21 The seven 16 Fancy

20 Is overfond
23 Bow 22 Fend off
24 Harbor, 24 Given life

Maine 25 Toward the
27 Prayers sheltered side
29 Ethiopian

lake I i 1
32 Ester of

oleic acid il "
34 Sway
36 Short coat B Z
37 Place within -s38 Immediately
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distress
42 Kind of cat fT 144 Mix
46 Evening

parties
49 Flowing s

garments
53 Vestment ii
54 Entertainment
56 Hawaiian
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necessary." He foresaw the possi-
bility of increased travel to some
areas where potential teachers
are.

A news story coming from the
conference quoted the findings of
one high school principal. Ho need-
ed one teacher, interviewed 40 pros-- 1

pects and offered a $4,100 starting
salary, lie received no accept-
ances.

S. Umpqua BPW
Supports Getting
Juvenile Officer

The South Umpqua Business and
Professional Women's Club has
agreed to throw its weicht behind
a campaign by Canyonville Justice
of Peace Nina Pietzold to secure
a juvenile officer exclusively for
southern Douglas County.

Mrs. Pietzold is the Canyonville
organization's legislation commit-
tee chairman.

She asked the organization's
backing for such an officer who
would search out juveniles in trou-
ble before they commit serious of-

fenses, according to correspondent
Virginia Proctor.

In other business the club presi-
dent, Helcne Altrce, appointed
Mrs. Norman Chappell historian
and increased membership on each
standing committee.

A meeting in the home econom-
ics room of Canyonville High
School soon was called for the
budget committee to prepare a re-

port for the May 3 meeting. The
program committee will also make
a report.

Vital Statistics
Marriage Licenses Issued

I.ONG-ADAI- Hoy li. Long
and Charlotte Lee Adair, both of
Roseburg.

Ceilan
H. Radcr and Dixie Ann Hollister,
both o Oakland.

Divorces Granted
GOODLIN Paul S. from Min-

nie Goodlin. Plaintiff awarded cus-

tody of two children. Defendant
awarded custody of four children,
$75 per month for their support.
Property settlement ratified.

WEAVER LeRoy L. from Hel-

en Z. Weaver.

BIRTHS

Mercy Hospital
MURPHY To Mr. and Mrs.
Robert Murphy, Box 274, Dillard,
April 10, a daughter, Kathleen
Hannah; weight 9 pounds 10 ounc-

es.
LEWELLEN To Mr. and

Mrs. William Lewellcn, Box 927,

Yoncalla, April 9, a son, Douglas
Blanchard; weight 8 pounds 3Mi

ounces.

LEGAL
NOTICE OK S11KRI1'F"S SALE

tn the Circuit Court of the Slate of
Oregon for the County of Douglai, Case
HO. 1H71H.

National Life asurnnce Company.
Vermont Corooratlon. Plnlntlff. vs. Vcr
nan Checsman and Litlth Pearl Chces- -

man. husband and wife, ucrcnunnts,
By virtue of an oxecution issued out

of the above entitled court in ine bdovb
entitled cause, to me directed and dated
the 22nd day of March 1056, bused upon
a Default Judgment and Decree render-
ed and entered in said court on the 21st
day of March 1056, in favor of National
Life Insurance Company, a Vermont
Corporation, plaintiff, and against Vern-

on Checsman and Lidth Pearl dices-ma-

husband and wife, defendants, for
the sum of $8,765.26 together with Inter-
est at 4',i per cent per annum from
November 1, 1053, to date of payment;
Plui: 24. M Title exnense Involved in
suit; $592.50 Attorney's fees; SB.0I Late
fees; $42.62 Costs and aisnuraemerus;
LESS: $39.10 heretofore paid by the
Mortgagors, and the costs of and upon
this writ, commanding me to make
sale of the following described real
property situated in the County of
Douglas, State of Oregon, legally de-

scribed as follows,
Lot Two 12) Twin ubkb Tract a ,
a subdivision located In Section 24,
Township 30, South, Hnnge 6 .West,
Willamette Meridian, within the cor-

porate limits of the City of Riddle,
in the County of Douglas and Stale
of Oregon.
NOW. THEREFORE, by virtue of

said Execution and- Default Judgment
and Decree and in compliance with Ihe
commands of said writ, I will on the 301 h
day of April 1056, at 2;:t0 P.M., at the
south front door of the Douglas County
Court House in Roseburg, Oregon, sell at
public auction and subject to redemption
to the highest bidder for cash In hand,
all the right, title. and interest
which the d defendants had
on the 2lst day of March lOM, the dale
of said judgment, or thereafter had in
and to the above described real prop-
erty or any part thereof, to satlnfy faid
Execution and ueiauii JUOKinrm ann
Decreo and Interest costs and accruing
costs.

Dated at Roseburg, Oregon,
thii 30th day of March 10.Vt

IRA C. BYRD
Sheriff of Douglas
County. Oregon
By Ruth Avrea

Deputy
Date of 1st publicallon: March 30, 10M
Date of last publication: April ''O, llt.Vi

NOTIf'R OF STREET VACATION IN
TIIK COMMON COIfNCIl, OF THE

CITY OF IIOSEIil ltn,
DOtJ(iL.At4 COUNTY, O It Eft ON.

Notice is hereby given that re resolu-
tion duly adopted by the Common Coun-
cil of the City of Roseburg, Oregon on
March 26, 1036, proceedings have been
Initiated by tiald Common Couneil to
vacate the following described property:

All of that land between the ceriler-lln- e

and the south nghL of way line
of S. E. Burke Avenue and went of
the following described line,
Beginning at a point on the south
right of way line of S. E. Burke Ave-

nue, said point of beginning bearing
N 62 degrees 00' W !Ht 00 fret from
the southwest corner nf the Inler ter-
tian of S. E. Burke Avenue and H. E.

Short Street; Ihenre N 2H degre-- s

00' E 30 0 feet to the centerline of
S E. Burke Avenue.
Any person Or persons havlnif an ob-

jection or remonstrance to the vaca-
tion of said portion of said slreel mav
in writing make and file the same with
trie undersigned Recorder of aid City
at or before the time set for hearing nf
th" objections and remonitranrei. The
time and place of said hearing will be at
the regular meeting of the said Cnmninn
Council at 7 M pm. on April 23rd, WM.
in the Council Chamber of the City Hall
of Hteburg, Oregon.

Dated and firt published this Ulti
day of June, ift.V).

Catherine L Farrell
City Hetorder
City of Roseburg

NOTICE TO CHE I) IT OB1
NOTICE IS Jtr.RFBY OIVEN that the

undersigned has been duly appointed ad
minlitralrix of the estate of Solon Sew-e-

Well. decHKed. bv order of the Cir-
cuit Court of the State of Oregon for
Douglas County, and has duly qualified
a surh

All persons having claims against us id
estate are hereby required to pre .rtt
the same within six months after the
date of this nollce to the undersigned at
the offices of Winston & Keonane, 420
Parifie Building, Roteburg. Douglas
County. Oregon,

Dited and published thf 13 day of
April 19..')

MAX INT ANDERSON.
Administratrix of the Estate f
Solon Sewell Wells, deceased.

TIMBER KOR SALE, UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OK THE
INTERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. ORAL AUCTION
BIDS as hereinafter designated
will be received by the District
Forester. Bureau of Land Manane-- 1

mcnt, Knights of Pythias Hall 6Z8
S.E. Rose Street, Roseburg, Ore-- !

Son beginning at 9:00 A.M., PACI-
FIC STANDARD TIME, on May
4, 1956, for all timber marked or
designated for cutting. Before bids
are submitted, full information
concerning the timber, the condi-
tions of sale and submission of
bids should be obtained from the
above District Forester, 744 S.E.
Jackson Street, Roseburg, Oregon.
The risht is hereby reserved to
waive technical defects in this ad-
vertisement and to reject any or
ail bids. The United States re-
serves the right to waive any in-

formality in bids received when-
ever such waiver is in the interest
of the United States. IN DOUG-
LAS COUNTY: OREGON: SOUTH
UMPQUA MARKETING AREA:
O & C LAND: ORAL B I D:
GREEN: Ail timber designated
for cutting on SWUNEH,

Sec. 33, T; 28 S., R. 4 W.,
W.M., estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 909 M bd. ft.
Douglas Fir, 8 M bd. ft. White Fir.
43 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar. No bid
for less than $32.05 per M bd. ft.
for the Douglas Fir, $12.95 per M

bd, ft. for the White Fir, and In-

cense Cedar or a total purchase
price of $23,793.90 will bo consider-
ed. Minimum deposit with bid
S2.100.0U. DOUGLAS MARKETING
AREA: All timber designated for
cutting on NVi.NSW, NWVi-SE-

Section 13, T. 29 S., R. 7

W., W.M., estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 5634 M bd.
t. Douglas Fir. 21 M bd. ft. Pon- -

derosa Pine, 53 M bd. ft. White
Mr, a m hd. tt. incense Leuar. io
bid for less than $30.30 per M bd.
Ft. for the Douglas Fir, $33.40 per
M bd. ft. for the Ponderosa Pine.
$1040 per M bd. Ft. for the While
fir, and incense Cedar or a total
purchase price of $172,037.80 will
be, considered. Minimum deposit
with bid $7600.00. All timber desig-
nated for cutting on Lots 14(SE-SW'-

15 & lGlSViSEW). Sec. 9,
T. 24 S., R. 7 W., W.M., estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
2724 M bd. ft. Douglas Fir, 228 M
bd. ft. Whito Fir, 48 M bd. ft. In-
cense Cedar. No bid for less than
S31.05 per M bd. ft. for the Doug-
las Fir, $15.95 per M bd. ft. for
the White Fir, $10.95 per M bd. ft.
for the Incense Cedar or a total
purchase price of $83,742.40 will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $5,050.00. SALVAGE: All lim
ner designated lor cutting on
NWHSWW, S'ASWW, Sec. 33, T.
26 S., R. 7 W., W.M., estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
30 M bd. It. Douglas Fir, 3 M bd.
It. White Fir, 4 M bd. ft. Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than $28.80
per M bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir,
$7.95 per M bd. ft. for the White
Fir. $5.45 per M bd. ft. for the In
cense Cedar or a total purchase
price of $909.65 will be considered.
Minimum deposit with bid $200.00.
All timber designated for cutting
on K'iiWWW, Lots 1 & 2(W'a.,
NW'i), S5C. 7, T. 30 S., R. 7 W.,
W.M., estimated for the purpose
of this' sale to be 1265 M bd. ft.
Douglas Fir, 20 M bd. ft. Ponde
rosa Pine, 67 M bd. ft. White Fir,
98 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar, 8 M
bd. ft. Sugar Pine. No bid for less
than $29.30 per M bd. ft. for the
Douglas Fir. S30.95 per M Dd. it
for the Ponderosa Pine, $9.25 per
M bet. ft. for the White Fir, nnd
Incense Cedar, $25.80 per M bd.
ft. for the Sugar Pine or a total
purchase price of $39,416.15 will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $2,600.00. All timber designated
for cutting on SWNWVi. NW'i- -

SWU, Sec. 7 T. 22 S., R. 5 W.,
W.M., estimated for the purpose
of this sale (to be 94 M bd. ft.
Douglas Fir. tNo bid for less than
$26.30 per M bd. ft. for the Doug
las Fir, or a total purchase price
of S2.472.20 will be considered.
Minimum deposit with bid $350.00.

NOTICE OF SHERIFF'S 8AI.E
Ti the Circuit Court of the Stat 6f

Oregon for the County of Douglas,
Case No. H1710.

Notional Life Insurance Compnny, a
Vermont corporation. Plaintiff. va.
Homer J. Grnble and Ruth Ann Grable,
husband and wife, Defendants.

Bv virtue of an execution issued out
of the above entitled court In the above
entlMed cautic, to nie directed and dated
the 22nd day of March 105B. based upon
a Defnult Judgment and Decree render-
ed and entered In said court on the 21st
day of March lfiiifi. In favor or Nntlonnl
Life Insurance Comnany. a Vermont cor
poration, plaintiff, find ajrdnst Homer J.
Grable and Ruth Ann Grnble, husband
and wife, defendants, for Ihe sum of
3H.B78.42, with Interest thereon at the
rate of 4'i per cent ppr annum from
December 1, 1935 to date of payment;
Plus; $24.30 Tide expense involved in
suit; $fi03.00 Attorney's fee; $5.04 Lnlc
fen: $;;0 02 Conti and disbursements;
LESS; $40.38 heretofore paid by the
mortKaffori, and the costs of and upon
this writ, commanding me to matte sate
of the following described real properly
xt tu a led in the County of Douftla", State
of Oregon, legally described as follows,

Lot Four f4, TWIN OAKS "TRACT
A", a subdivision lornfed In Section
24. Town-.fli- 30 South, Range 6
Wet, Willatnetle Meridian, within
tl:e corporate limits of ho City of
Kiddle, Douglai Counly, Oregon.
NOW. THKREFORE. by virtue of

aid KKfcutlon and Default Judgment
and Drrrre and in compliance with the
command of said writ, I will on the .Kith
day of April l!h"8, at 2 W o'clock PM
nt the south front door of tbe Douglas
County Court House In Koneburg, Ore
gon. sell at public auction and subject
to redemption, to the hifihent bidder for
cn:ih in hand, all the right, title and In-

terest whirl) Ihe above named defendants
had on the 21 it dnv of March Vii,C, the
dale of ssid Judgment, or thereafter
had In and to the above described real
property or any part thereof, to snthf.v
aid Execution and Judgment

and and interest costs and ac-

cruing costs,
Dated at Rniehurg. Oregon,
this Mth day of March ISM

IRA C RYRD
Sheriff of Douglas County,
Oregon
ily Huth Ayres

Deputy
Dale of 1st Publication; March .'10, lflSfl

Date of Itnt Publication: April 20, liM

notice of rrmic trrAiiiNO op
ZONK HANiK

NOTICE IS HKREHY GIVEN: That
the Common Council of the City of Rose-

burg, Oregon, will hold a public hear-
ing and afford perrons particularly in-

terested and the general public an op-

portunity to le heard in the City Hall of
said City at 7.;tO n m. on April 2.1, l'J3ft.
either fur or against the following propo- -

SJ'ton,
The re zoning from RfMdentlal to
H'Knesa, the lollowing described prop-
erty:
A p'srllon of land on the Norlh lde
nf West Harvard Ave, fnim Ihe West
right of way line of Highway (tit lo
1he Wet right nf wy line of Wet
Kir Street, .100 feel deep and all of
the Count v HuptUl properly and
Dmjglas Community Hospital prop-
erty.

, led and first published April 13,
103.

Catherine Tarreil
City Recorder

LOCAL CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING

Adverliung placed from within
Hotcourg irada area

Minimum charge for any one ad U 50c

CLASSIFIED RATES

doy per word 5c
day per 'word 7c
days per word 9c
days per word tic
days per word 32c
days per word 13c

Line ad, per line a day ... 18c
Line ad, repeat insertion, per day 9c
Line ad, per line, per month 2.35

DISPLAY CLASSIFIED

First" Insertion, per col. inch .. $1.60
Repeat insertion, per col. inch .80
1 col. inch per month $20.80

National Clauifiea' AdvertUinf
5c per word, no repeat rote
25c per line, no repeat rat

DEADLINE

NEW ADS
11:00 A. M. day previous to publication

CANCELLATIONS
LP TO 11:30 A. M.

ADJUSTMENTS

If your advertisement appears incor-
rectly, notify ua Immediiiely. We will
not be responsible (or more than one
incorrect insertion. Such responsibility
Is limited to refund of price paid or
correct insertion of advertisement.

LEGAL

National FortsrTimber For Sol

South Umpqua Falls
Oral auction bids will bo received
by the forest supervisor or his au
thorized representative at the of
fice of the forest supervisor, Post- -

ofuce Building, Roseburg, Oregon,
becinning at 2:00 p.m.. May 18,
1956, for all merchantable timber
marked or designated for cutting
on an area embracing about 1,5-1-

acres located within sections 3, 4,
9 and 10, T. 29 S R. 1 K., W.M.,
surveyed, in the South Umpqua
River drainage, Umpqua National
Forest, Oregon, estimated to be
5,900 itf board feet of Douglas-fir- :
800 M board feet of sugar pine and
ponderosa pine; and 1,100 M board
feet of whito fir and ot'nor species
of timber. No bid of less than
$28.35 per M board feet for Douglas-

-fir, $42.80 per M board feet for
sugar pine and ponderosa pine and
$5.45 per M board feet for white
fir and other species will be con-
sidered. In addition to the prices
bid for stumpagc, a cooperative
deposit of $0.40 per M board feet,
to be used by the Forest Service
for paying the cost of the slash dis
posal not required to be performed
by the purchaser, and a coopera-
tive deposit of $0.65 per M board
feet, to cover the cost of tree plant
ing, seed sowing and umber stand
improvement work on the area cut
over, for the total cut ot timber un-
der the terms of the agreement,
will bo required. The minimum ad
vance payments, minimum ad
vance balance and maximum ad
vance payments will be based on
the estimated volume and value of
the daily cut. As a qualification for
oral bidding, all bidders must sub
mit, a sealed bid accompanied by
the required payment to the for
est supervisor prior to 2:00 p.m.,
May 18, 1956. Sealed bids will be
posted at the beginning of the auc

tion for the information of all bid
ders. A money order, bank draft or
certttied check for S20.000.00 must
accompany each bid, to be applied
on the purchase price, refunded,
or returned in part as liquidated
damages, according to the condi-
tions of sale. If an oral bid is de-
clared to be high at the closing of
the auction, the bidder must im-

mediately confirm the oral bid by
submitting it in writing on a For-
est Service bid form. The right to
reject any and all bids is reserved.
Forest 'Service bid forms for use
in submitting scaled bids and full,
information concerning the timber,
the conditions of sale and the sub-

mission of bids should be obtained
from the district ranger, Tiller,
Oregon, or the forest supervisor,
Roseburg. Oregon, before bids are
submitted.

NOTICE OK HIIKKIFP'R BALE
In the Circuit Court of the State of

Oregon for the County ot Douclae.
Ca,c No, 111.147.

Elmer L. Hampton and Peart M.
Dinpton, husband and wife, plaintiffs,
i. Hubert G. Humpton and Laura Mae
amnion , his wife, and Natalie Loulne

Harney (formerly Natalie Louise Hump-ton)- ,

defendants.
Ily virtue of an execution Issued out of

the above entitled court In the above
entitled rnue, to me directed and dat-
ed the 20th day of March 103fi, based
upon a Decree rendered and entered in
Si'iid court on the lioth day of March
l!lffl. In favor of timer L. Hampton and
Prjirl M. Hampton, husband and wife,
plaintlfs, and against Hubert O. Hamp-
ton and Iaura Mae Hampton, his wife,
and Natalie Louise Harney (formerly Na-
talie Lou Lie Hampton), defendants, for
the sum of S6.M7D..10, together with inter-
est at the rate of 8 per cent per an- -

nim from January 24, 1958. until paid:
plui $00 00 Insurance procured by plain-
tiffs; till-I- Heal properly taxes paid

plain tiffs: S7.W.00 Attorney's fees:
71.:i2 Costs and disbursements, and the

conts of and upon this writ, commanding
me lo mnko sate of the following de-
scribed real property situated In the
County of Douglas, State of Oregon,
legally described as follows,

Lot Two 2. Work One 1, South-Vie-

a portion of Lots Two I2i and
Three CD of Pacific Highway Fruit
Lands ttn platted and recorded In
the ofilce of the County Clerk of
Douglas County, Oregon.
NOW. THKHKKOHK, by virtue of

hu id Execution and Decree and In com-

pliance with the commands of said writ,
i win on the vtn day or Mny m.Vi, at
10:00 o'clock A at the south front
door of the Dougta County Court Houae
in Roschuig. Oregon, sell at public auc
tion and subject lo redemption, In the
highest bidder for cash in hand, all the
right, title, and Interest which the above
nnmed defendants had on the 20th day
of March lft:6, thf dale of said judg
ment, or thereafter had in and to the
above described real property or any
part thereof, to satisfy said Execution
and Decree and Interest costs and ac-

cruing cost
Dstrd at Roiehurg, Oregon, this th

day of April nos
1HA C HVRD
Sheriff of Douglas County, Ore.
Hv Huth ven, Deputy

Dale of first publication; April S. IBM.
Date of last publication: April 27, 1950.

IT PAYS TO
PATRONIZE

NEWS. REVIEW
ADVERTISERS

Reel Estate 1

Prompt Courteous Service
Here It Is!!!

IN a commercial aone CORNER LOT!
DON'T WAIT THIS DEAL WON'T
LAST. lOS' frontage. 230' deep. Near
new Safeway Shopping Center. You
can have it for 934,000 as Is, or make
It $20,000 and we'll move the buildings
off. Terms if desired.

Gracious Living
NEARLY completed this beautiful

new home pictured in Better Homes
St Gardens. 3 bedrooms, bath, and
half. LoU of closets. Swedish fireplace.
Forced air heat. Featuring Aalwinttta
windows, sliding glass doors to patio.Nice view. $16,800 terms, .,

CLOSE TO GREEN Can you beat
these features and price. 2 bedroom
newer home. Plastered. Insulated. Con-
crete foundation. Hardwood floors. El-
ectric heat. Modernfold doors. Full
bath. Separate utility and kitchen. All
for (6800, 1000 down.

Williamson Real Estate
1157 N.E. Stephens St. OR

Eve's and Sunday
Ted Smalle, Salesman OR
Polly Merle, Saleslady OR

Young's Best Buys
ONE ACRE AND A GOOD 2 B R. HOME.

Seven miles south of town. Lots of
garden space and a dandy buy at
$6750 about 91250 Down. Good terms on
the balance.

WESTS1DE 3, B.H. HOME ABOUT S
YRS. OLD. Dandy living room with
large fireplace. Nice large kitchen wi'--

lots .of built-in- All bedrooma are
large with plenty of storage. Attached
garage, large, level lot and on paved
street. We believe its worth the asking
price. Call us for further information.

GOOD 3 BEDROOM HOME ON more
than an acre of good soil. Home ia
about three years old. Large patio,
lawn and carport. Insulated and wired
for stove. Located south of Dillard
and should be a good deal for some
one working in the mills. Priced to
sell at S8.200 and only 11,300 down.

WS HAVE A PARTY with a 1954 Kalwr
sedan In fine condition and low mile-
age wants to trade It in on a small
Irome in the Riverside area. If you
have something to trade give us a call,

Roy O. Young and Son, .
'

Realtors
W. FRANK BROWN, SALESMAN ....

733 St. Cass St., ' Phone OR
Pacific Bldg. Eve. OR

For Sale
Alcan Lumber Mill

SITE, Canyonville,. Oregon. 7.6ft ai
in neart ot city, uooa Diutnesa or
residential.

Approxt 5 Acres
II CITY of Myrtle Creek, Former Ore

West Mill site. Burner end mill pond
and 4 car spur on site. Alio good for
residential.

42 Year Lea$e
CT TORMEB Alean Lumber Mill site

in Riddle, Ore. tTrojanl 12 acres,
planing mill, 10 ear spur track burn- -
er, 5 oahlna, garage end tool ahed,
Inquire C, JS. Parker.' Canyonville

Phone a4fiB

Long Distance Moving
Of Household Goods

NATIONWIDE OR WITHIN STATB
Ph. OR

FOR FREE ESTIMATE
WILLIAMS TRANSFER CO.

AGENTS FOR

Aero-Mayflow- er

Transit Co.

Subdivision
APPROXIMATELY 0 a eras in Wait

Winston. On county road. Some road
In, City water. Consider cash offer.
OS after 6 OS

THREE bedroom house, 3 lots. Hard
wood floors. Ceramic tile bath and ia
kltohon. Electric heat. Large fireplace.
Drapes throughout house. Partly

Also 2 bedroom cottage apt
in rear, completely furnished. Rent
for $73 month. OR

LARGE THREE bedroom, West slda
noma, aouoie nam, wnn ceramic uie,
lots of closets, and bulltina, diningroom and breakfast nook. Utility room,
double gnrago. 123 W. Cardinal St,
OR '

SMALL, our room hou6 In Winston,
.not moacrn. trice. amau down
payment, balance term te' suit pur
chaser, Martin Suksdcrf, Winston, Ore
gon.'

TWO bedroom home."Virepface, oil" fur--
nace. wired for electric range and
automatic dryer. Large yard. Low
down payment Monthly payment! Ilka
rent. OR

TRADE or sell, $3,000 equity for $1,260
unfurnished, or 1 1,800 furnished. 2 bed
room home. Garden spot. Consider
car trade in. Contact Jim Hesa, Win-

ston, or phone OR
GOOD BUY $2,200. equity for $1,200.

in 3018 W. Sherwood dwelling. Balance
of $B,700 payable $75- monthly. Key
at 2046 Sherwood. Contact A. G. Drake,
873 Sunset Dr., Whlttler, Calif. Ph.
OXford

SELL OR TRADE 3 bedroom home.
4 acre. Shop and garage. Will con-

sider unfinished or smaller house,
close in, or acreage. F. Jensen, 3.4
miles south ot Dillard.

ONE bedroom modern house, vacant.
uig lot. some turntiure. sjuuo., sow.
down, $33. month. Three bedroom
house, large lot, 09x119', $4050., $500.
down and $53. month. OS

FOR SALE My equity In 3 level
acres in trie neart of Winston, 1,200.
Glenn Hadley, Myrtle Creek. Phone
33UB.

100 ACRES or less, Partly cleared. Live
creeK. uood well. Two bedroom un-
finished house. 3 miles West Looking
glass store. Box 1109. OR

FOR SALE Acreage, well drained.
Free soil. School bus. District 4. 10
down. Good terms. E. D. Russell, Wil-

bur, Oregon.
BY OWNER 4 room temporary house

on rear of 73x130' lot. Electricity and
water. $R00 equity. Plum St., Winston,
OS

WINSTON, Division street. 2 bedroom.
plastered. Hardwood floors, utility
room. Carport, $8,730. terms. Paul
Bender.

SECURE your dam and water rights.
Jim Daughterly. The Engineer. Phone
OS OR

fM MEDIA TE possession. "Modern, coity
two bedroom house. $730. down. OR

"Always have It surveyed." Jim baufh-ert-

The Engineer. Ph. OS or
OR

FOR SALE OR TRADE 8 arree with
buildings and stock. Call OR
before 7 p.m.

T W 6 BEDROOlhome. Hardwood
floors, fireplace, ell furnace heat. 1418
U.K. Strong. OR2.113l.

NICE if bedroom house,Near Winston.
' acre. Fruit trees, electric heat.
Low down payment. OJt3-7R4-

280 ACHE STOCk ranch, modern 'house.
Would consider town property ai part
payment, OR3-670-

THREE bedroom morternhome for sale.
Total price, $3600. Grape and Robinson
Streets. Winston.

A

TWO "BEDROOM" home for sale, about
l"i acres. Melrose, OR

TIIK EE BEDROOM "home! Good loca-

tion. OR
LOT." libxl 23." in dreen. LthneTAve.'OR

two BEDROOM home for tale, to
Green. Ph. OR 7BH

SEVERAL nice itrta for sale. Call OS

COTS - Ad'joMki atoieWt, OR 3473$
after 4:30.

T3wT J Will I saxcn Them I'll Y Tun's
mi&fmK C HIS EARS.' tlLTEU. uTjWVfhh1

C N0TWIM6 BUrAM roilIW , Cl BE 1

26 Show again 46 Lake
28 Wading bird City, Utah
30 Fiddling 47 Bread spread

emperor 48 Persian prince
31 Wiles 50 New Guinea
33 Ensuing wild hog
35 Whole 51 Within
40 Gives forth (prefix)
43 American 52 Female saints

painter (ab.)
45 Latin 55 Prosecute

couRse iLt have To vwut
PAr Uf wtf

COMPLETELY

I5s

WELL. WHAT PYOU
WANT ME

GO RUMMIMG

AROUND LIKE

SOME KID? tS

1

YOU WEAN THAT
SWEET OLD GENTLEMAN J

' IS YOUR UNCLE ? I

V ABBJ..CQfi8HLr I WAKEI BUT CHIEF.7-IT- 'S I WHILEVOU WERE V (HE 4 I YOU'RE J OH. IT'S NOT THAT,naL BCVVUlU f W!r J ONLY AND SNORING YOUP. V SLAPPED CRYING, 9 CHIEF-M- Y
g feJK. VOU ACCORD NG TO THICK HEAD OFF-- Jt Wtr FOSDICK" J FINGERS HUR-T-

Vtlfl ft LAXV, POLICE REGULA- - GUESS WHO W6 VCXJ-o- I DIDN'T A AND THEY'RE' UIXORY-1TIO- 832,1 AM THROTTLED NEARLY ) PARKNG KNOW YOU a TERRIBLY I

V r f VMk LOVING ENTITLED TO 6 ' TO DEATH, IN HIS FINE WERE THAT BJ SWOLLE- N- I
P

TUSFl

E NCTO

1 WOULDMTCOMSIDER. Bur of
PATINOYOU IF YOU WERE a limn
THE VAST I"AA1 ON

EARTH r

REALLY? Il'1

( MP. DITHERS )
V. IS MY y(uncle ) v '

4
c5S

I H I LAST I HEARD HE BCTtHAT'5 RIGHT, I I ...DON'T SEE
HAVaI SO THE GREAT 1 WAS DOWN IN THE. f OH... W0NMUGI GLAD HOW YOU DO I

fSSia3S? DR. ENN 9 WANTS TO SEE ANDES A3MEWHERe OOTTDC TO SFF Mil IT. CTAVINi

Sgg5S ME ON A MATTER Or J HUNTING THfc I K ENNISP LOOKING SO COOPED UP INI

faktAI IMKUKIU,rfc... T StVtN,LMIfeb Jtm I Xw gfV HI, SIR! YES, I 1HI5 LAB LIKE V

hT OF GOLD. A I MiftA. INDEED.. 1 I VOLI DO. YEAR
Ft rr ..4i k. -- r v i i :t.7 ; r

.mihljjlHill' ( IT WOULD BE FlNfl I'jjiiilllllH" C
t..i,ll'li' VCiTWES6NTFOf! iJiJillil AN UGLY

' v. v.loLPMftNOITHERS, "'NfOiSPOSlTION)--- .

I JUST STARTED E B0SS
J A JVvVr--(HE'- S A


