

Woman Pleads Insanity In Slaying Of Uncle

VANCOUVER, Wash. (U.P.)—Anna Clark, 35, accused of killing her uncle after he criticized one of her paintings, Thursday pleaded innocent because of temporary insanity.

The uncle, Thomas F. Pert, 84, was shot three times the night S.E. Rose Street, Roseburg, Ore., of March 23 at his home in Battle Ground, where the woman also lived.

A psychiatric examination was ordered for the woman.

Before you buy... See our display of WINDOWS

- Your choice of
- SLIDE SIDWAYS
 - AWNING
 - CASEMENT
 - DOUBLE-HUNG

See on display at

ROSEBURG CABINET AND SUPPLY
318 S.E. Jackson • OR 3-7233

SHOP YOUR INDEPENDENT DRUG STORE

OPEN 'TIL **9** TONIGHT

AND EVERY NIGHT THIS WEEK

FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE
Fullerton Drugs
635 S.E. Jackson ORchard 3-7415

AND NOW... A FLOOR PAINT

For Interior or Exterior... Concrete or Wood

- That you can put on a damp surface!
- That dries in 40 minutes!
- That wears like iron!

Luminall Floor Paint

- Basements ● Patios ● Steps
- Commercial Garages ● Factories

COEN SUPPLY CO.
Floor & Mill "Everything for the Builder" Dial 3-4461

LEGAL

TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT, ORAL AUCTION BIDS as hereinafter designated will be received by the District Forester, Bureau of Land Management, Knights of Pythias Hall 638 S.E. Rose Street, Roseburg, Ore., beginning at 9:00 A.M., PACIFIC STANDARD TIME, on May 4, 1956, for all timber marked or designated for cutting. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale and submission of bids should be obtained from the above District Forester, 744 S.E. Jackson Street, Roseburg, Oregon. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement and to reject any or all bids. The United States reserves the right to waive any informality in bids received whenever such waiver is in the interest of the United States. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY, OREGON: SOUTH UMPQUA MARKETING AREA: OREGON: ALL TIMBER DESIGNATED FOR CUTTING ON SW1/4 NE1/4, W1/2 SE1/4, Sec. 33, T. 28 S., R. 4 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 909 M bd. ft. Douglas Fir, 8 M bd. ft. White Fir, 43 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.05 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.25 per M bd. ft. for the White Fir, and Incense Cedar or a total purchase price of \$20,793.90 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$2,100.00. DOUGLAS MARKETING AREA: ALL TIMBER DESIGNATED FOR CUTTING ON NW1/4 NW1/4, NW1/4

LEGAL

SE1/4, Section 13, T. 29 S., R. 7 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 5634 M bd. ft. Douglas Fir, 21 M bd. ft. Ponderosa Pine, 53 M bd. ft. White Fir, 9 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.30 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, \$3.40 per M bd. ft. for the Ponderosa Pine, \$10.10 per M bd. ft. for the White Fir, and Incense Cedar or a total purchase price of \$172,037.90 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$7800.00. All timber designated for cutting on Lots 14 (SE1/4 SW1/4), 15 & 16 (SW1/4 SE1/4), Sec. 9, T. 24 S., R. 7 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2724 M bd. ft. Douglas Fir, 228 M bd. ft. White Fir, 48 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.05 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, \$15.95 per M bd. ft. for the White Fir, \$10.95 per M bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar or a total purchase price of \$88,742.40 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$5,050.00. SALVAGE: All timber designated for cutting on NW1/4 SW1/4, SW1/4, Sec. 33, T. 26 S., R. 7 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 30 M bd. ft. Douglas Fir, 3 M bd. ft. White Fir, 4 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$28.00 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, \$7.95 per M bd. ft. for the White Fir, \$5.45 per M bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar or a total purchase price of \$909.65 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$200.00. All timber designated for cutting on E1/2 NW1/4, Lots 1 & 2 (W1/2 NW1/4), Sec. 7, T. 30 S., R. 7 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1285 M bd. ft. Douglas Fir, 20 M bd. ft. Ponderosa Pine, 67 M bd. ft. White Fir, 18 M bd. ft. Incense Cedar, 8 M bd. ft. Sugar Pine. No bid for less than \$29.30 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, \$30.95 per M bd. ft. for the Ponderosa Pine, \$9.25 per M bd. ft. for the White Fir, and Incense Cedar, \$25.80 per M bd. ft. for the Sugar Pine or a total purchase price of \$39,416.15 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$2,600.00. All timber designated for cutting on SW1/4 NW1/4, NW1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 7, T. 22 S., R. 5 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 94 M bd. ft. Douglas Fir. No bid for less than \$26.30 per M bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, or a total purchase price of \$2,472.20 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$350.00.

NOTICE OF FILING APPLICATION FOR A CHANGE OF DIVISION OF WATER

Notice is given hereby that Harley U. France has filed an application for the approval of a change in point of diversion of water from Cow Creek. Certificate of water right issued to H. I. Cooke and recorded on page 11833, Vol. 10, State Record of Water Right Certificates, confirms a right under Permit 11888 for the use of water of Cow Creek for the irrigation of 10 acres in NE1/4 NW1/4 and 20 acres in SE1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 14, T. 32 S., R. 3 W., W.M., with a date of priority of Sept. 25, 1935. These lands are irrigated thru the Johns ditch, the point of diversion of said ditch being located 495 ft. S. & 900 ft. E. from E1/4 corner of Sec. 3, and being within NW1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 4, T. 32 S., R. 4 W., W.M. The applicant herein, owner of the lands above described, proposes to change his point of diversion for the irrigation of said lands to a pumping plant, the point of diversion of said pumping plant to be located 600 ft. E. and 5 ft. W. from NE corner of NE1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 14, and being within said NE1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 14, T. 32 S., R. 3 W., W.M. All persons interested are notified hereby that a hearing will be held at the county court house in Roseburg, Ore., on May 17, 1956, beginning at 10:00 a.m. Any objections to the proposed change, if any there are, will be heard at said time and place. All objections shall be prepared in writing, one copy to be served on Harley U. France, Box 204, Astoria, Ore., and one copy to be mailed to the State Engineer, Salem, Ore., together with a \$2 filing fee, at least 10 days prior to the date set for hearing. If no objections are filed, the application may be approved by the State Engineer without a hearing.

Dated at Salem, Ore., this 20th day of March 1956.
LEWIS A. STANLEY,
State Engineer

Rallies Set For Saturday

A Missionary and Youth Rally will be held at the Pine Grove Sunday School Chapel on Saturday, according to the Rev. Arthur Kolstrup, missionary of the American Sunday School Union.

The Missionary Rally will begin at 3:30 p.m. with the Rev. Swift, returned missionary from Peru, speaking. The Rev. Mr. Swift is home on his first furlough from his field. He will have curios and costumes from Peru on display.

After the missionary rally there will be a potluck supper beginning at 5:45 p.m.

The Youth Rally will begin at 7:30 p.m. The Rev. Willard Fenderson of Tiller will be the speaker and Tommy Vance will be the song leader. A capacity crowd is expected. These rallies are open to the public, and are not restricted to young people. Young people will appear on the program throughout the day.

Appearing on the program in the evening will be Patsey Shelly who just recently returned home from attending the American Soul Clinic in Los Angeles. Also appearing on the program will be Mary Elizarraras from Mexico who attended the same Bible School.

DFPA Sets Up Fire Protection Rates For Year

The Douglas Forest Protective Assn. set up fire protection rates for 1956-57 at its annual meeting in Roseburg this week.

Tentative price per acre for protection of timberlands was placed at 14.87 cents, according to Secretary-Treasurer T. H. Pargeter. The price for 1955-56 was 14.5 cents.

The budget for 201,000 acres of grazing lands was placed at 4.168 cents per acre for a total of \$8,416. The figure for 1955-56 was 3.9 cents per acre.

Both per acre prices were approved Wednesday afternoon at a state hearing in the hotel conducted by Elliott Jenkins. He is a member of the State Board of Forestry.

Earlier State Forester Dwight Phipps had commended the association in a resolution for "cooperation and good progress in forest protection."



MINISTER OF MUSIC Harley Abel, of Portland, will direct the Portland Rose Chorus on Saturday at 8:15 p.m. in the Roseburg Junior Academy auditorium. Abel is with the Oregon Conference of Seventh-day Adventists and has taught music at college level for more than 25 years.

Circuit Court

Probate Orders
Mary Spencer Bell appointed executrix of estate of Frank A. Spencer, who died in Coos County on March 23 at age 80, leaving property with probable value of \$10,000. Heirs include nephews Harry Spencer Black of Roseburg and Allen Francis Swafford of Redport and sister Mary Spencer Bell of Redport.

Orders
Elita Founce Reeves White vs. Alvin Reeves. Defendant ordered to pay \$75 per month child support through Alameda County, Calif., Welfare Commission.

Bertha White vs. James Buck. Order of Jan. 6 dismissing action is set aside.

LESSONS TO START
The first dance lesson in a new series of five which will start Saturday at 8:30 p.m. at the Roseburg Country Club will be conducted by Mr. and Mrs. Milton Hard.

Concert Member Campaign Closed; Artists Selected

The Roseburg Community Concert Assn. membership campaign has closed with the member list filled for next winter's concert series, and artists for the series have been selected.

Association President Miss Gladys Strong announced the following concerts, the exact dates to be determined later:

Coming in the fall will be bass-baritone Yi-Kwei Sze, who has appeared in concert, opera, oratorio and with symphony orchestras. The Chinese singer made his debut last season at the New York City Opera Co. and is said to be a growing favorite in recital over the nation. He has toured extensively in Australia, New Zealand, Hawaii and Alaska.

Also coming in the fall will be the Paganini Quartet, composed of artists Henri Temianka, Gustave Rosseels, Charles Foidart and Lucien La Porte, playing a most Stradivarius instruments of Paganini. They record for RCA Victor and have toured extensively.

Frances Bible, mezzo soprano, will be here after the first of the year. This star of the New York City Opera made her debut with the San Francisco Opera last season and, during the summer, her first appearance at Glyndebourne. She has also been a soloist with orchestra and a recitalist.

British pianist Clifford Curson, returning to this country after a season's absence in Europe, is next in the series. He is considered one of the foremost artists in his line.

The final concert in early spring will be the appearance of the Vienna Boys' Choir.

BENEFIT DANCE

The Camas Valley VFW is sponsoring a dance Saturday for the benefit of Mrs. Maude Johnson, who lost her home and all belongings in a recent fire. The public is urged to attend. Music will be furnished by the Hoot Owls.

Under New Management

Expert Furniture Cleaners
Furniture, automobile interiors, and rugs cleaned with existing attention.
ON OLD HWY 98 NORTH
BACK OF RICHIE'S DRIVE IN
PHONE OR 3-3191
Pick up and delivery... free estimates

Fri., April 6, 1956—The News-Review, Roseburg, Ore. 3

Two Glide Teachers Submit Resignations

Superintendent Byron Evans reports that all present teachers in Glide School District 12, have renewed contracts for the coming year except two. Mrs. Cornelius McAuliffe, high school English instructor, has resigned to devote her time to her family, and Miss Marlene Alsbaugh, fourth grade teacher, has resigned on account of her forthcoming marriage.

New teachers engaged are Frank Maxwell, Eugene Blair, Charles Bailey, and Mrs. Dora Cooper. The new superintendent for Glide Schools is Harry Harvie who succeeds Byron Evans. Evans resigned to attend the University of Oregon to obtain his

PHOTO FINISHING
in at 5, out at 9
We give 50¢ Green Stamps
CLARK'S STUDIO
105 S. Jackson OR 3-8526

A FAVORITE ALL WAYS!

BOTTLED-IN-BOND

- 100 PROOF
- PREMIUM QUALITY
- STRAIGHT BOURBON

Haller's County Fair

W. A. HALLER CORP., PHILADELPHIA, PA.

\$4.40 4.5 QT.
\$2.85 1.5 QT.

Here's the **BIG** Fact You Need to Know
About the Mobilgas Economy Run!

Pontiac Beats All Eights of All Makes in Actual Miles per Gallon!

Positive Proof That Pontiac's Great Strato-Streak V-8
Is America's Most Modern and Efficient Automotive Engine

Official Results
Released by General
Petroleum Corporation,
Sponsor of the Event

- | | |
|--------------------------------------|---------------------------------------|
| 1. PONTIAC 21.1098 miles per gallon | 9. CAR H....19.7044 miles per gallon |
| 2. CAR A....21.0420 miles per gallon | 10. CAR I....19.1552 miles per gallon |
| 3. CAR B....20.9012 miles per gallon | 11. CAR J....18.7496 miles per gallon |
| 4. CAR C....20.7124 miles per gallon | 12. CAR K....18.6694 miles per gallon |
| 5. CAR D....20.7032 miles per gallon | 13. CAR L....18.0750 miles per gallon |
| 6. CAR E....20.6793 miles per gallon | 14. CAR M....17.8341 miles per gallon |
| 7. CAR F....20.5217 miles per gallon | 15. CAR N....17.7798 miles per gallon |
| 8. CAR G....20.4894 miles per gallon | 16. CAR O....17.4191 miles per gallon |

See Your Pontiac Dealer for the **Greatest Economy** plus the **Greatest GO on Wheels**

ROSEBURG MOTOR CO.

ROSE AND WASHINGTON STREETS

PHONE ORchard 3-6651

Dr. Scholl's Foot Comfort Service MOBILE UNIT

FREE FOOT RELIEF DEMONSTRATION
by **Dr. Scholl's**
PERSONAL REPRESENTATIVES FROM CHICAGO!

Feet Hurt? Hard-to-Fit?

If you suffer from foot pains... or have difficulty finding shoes in your proper size and width... don't miss this opportunity! Dr. Scholl's Personal Representatives will bring to our store a complete stock of Dr. Scholl's Remedies, Appliances and Arch Supports... plus over 1600 pairs of Dr. Scholl's Shoes for men, women and children in more than 625 combination fittings!

Dr. Scholl's representatives have had many years of training and experience helping thousands find quick relief from common foot troubles! With their aid, and the vast stock of Dr. Scholl's products they will bring to our store, we can offer the same Foot Relief facilities normally available only in the nation's major metropolitan areas!

After taking Podo-graph prints of your stocking feet, Dr. Scholl's representatives will demonstrate... without obligation... how the correct Dr. Scholl's Appliance, Arch Support or Shoe will make your feet wonderfully comfortable!

Plan now to come in for a **FREE FOOT TEST!**

Petersen's Family Shoe Store
Quality Shoes Priced Right for the Entire Family
826 S. E. Cass Roseburg



We Carry A Complete Stock of Dr. Scholl's Remedies