

### Retired Mariner Dies Thursday

Fred J. Hall, 72, resident of Camas Valley, died Thursday. He was born April 8, 1882, in Wisconsin and came to this community 13 years ago to make his home. He was a retired merchant mariner.

Surviving are his wife, Addie, Camas Valley; a son, Fred Jr., Tacoma; and a daughter, Mrs. Ernest (Bertha) Witzke, in Japan.

Funeral services will be held in the Chapel of the Roses, Roseburg Funeral Home, Saturday at 2 p.m. Elder E. W. Striplin of the Seventh-day Adventist Church will officiate. Interment will follow in the Noah Cemetery in Camas Valley.

### Beamer Infant Dies At Hospital Friday

Linda N. Beamer, infant daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Virgil E. Beamer, 1316 Fair St., Roseburg, died at a local hospital Friday morning. She was born Thursday.

Surviving besides her parents are the grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Beamer and Mr. and Mrs. Vint DeChiara, all of Roseburg; a great-grandmother, Mrs. Cena Beamer, Elkton, Md.; and a great-grandfather, Luigi DeChiara, Naples, Italy.

The body has been removed to Long and Orr Mortuary and funeral arrangements will be announced later.

### NEW MEMBERS TALK

Part of the program at the regular Roseburg Rotary Club meeting was taken up with impromptu talks by new members. The members gave brief speeches on their backgrounds and present employment.

### Two-Week Lamp Shade Making School Slated

A two-week school in lamp shade making and cake decorating will be held here soon, probably starting sometime next week, according to Jack Brookins, director of adult education for the Roseburg public schools.

Mrs. Orma Farnham, Grants Pass, will be here as an itinerant instructor in the two crafts. She recently completed similar classes in Eugene, and now is in Coos Bay.

Brookins said three classes are planned — one each in the mornings, afternoons and evenings. Two of the class periods will be devoted to the craft in which most interest is displayed.

Mrs. Farnham will be at the library arts building at the senior high school at 4 p.m. Saturday to meet with prospective students. She says that a minimum of 36 students will be needed for the classes. At the Saturday meeting, a list of materials needed will be revealed.

Brookins said that an attempt will be made to start the classes next week. They run through 10 days.

### LOCAL NEWS

**Community Club Meets** — The Riverside Community Club will meet tonight at 6:30 at the Riverside school house for a potluck supper. Each one is asked to bring his own table service.

**Social Hour Sunday** — The Eden Lutheran Church will hold a social hour Sunday at 8:00 p.m. at the church. Rev. Johnson, missionary from Africa, will show colored films and give a lecture on his work there. Coffee will be served following the talk.

### LEGAL

**TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT, ORAL AUCTION BIDS** as hereinafter designated will be received by the District Forester, Bureau of Land Management, 132 South Jackson Street, Roseburg, Oregon, beginning at 10:30 A.M., PACIFIC STANDARD TIME, on Wednesday, May 5, 1954, for all timber marked or designated for cutting. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale and submission of bids should be obtained from the above District Forester. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement and to reject any or all bids. The United States reserves the right to waive any informality in bids received whenever such waiver is in the interest of the United States.

**IN DOUGLAS COUNTY, OREGON: DOUGLAS MARKETING AREA: O&C: ORAL AUCTION: GREEN:** All timber designated for cutting on SE1/4NW1/4, E1/2SE1/4, Sec. 11, T. 24 S., R. 4 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1017 M. bd. ft. Douglas Fir, 33 M. bd. ft. White Fir, 32 M. bd. ft. Hemlock, 22 M. bd. ft. Western Red Cedar, 10 M. bd. ft. Incense Cedar, No bid for less than \$20.19 per M. bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, \$7.75 per M. bd. ft. for the White Fir, \$8.00 per M. bd. ft. for the Hemlock, \$4.25 per M. bd. ft. for the Western Red Cedar and Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$20,936.65 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$1,650.00. **SALVAGE:** All timber designated for cutting on SW1/4SW1/4, Sec. 27, NE1/4W1/4, Sec. 32, T. 21 S., R. 6 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 157 M. bd. ft. marked Douglas Fir, 7 M. bd. ft. marked Incense Cedar, No bid for less than \$16.60 per M. bd. ft. for the marked Douglas Fir, \$5.45 per M. bd. ft. for the marked Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$2,644.35 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$400.00. All timber designated for cutting on NW1/4SE1/4, SW1/4SE1/4, SE1/4SW1/4, Sec. 9, T. 24 S., R. 6 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 790 M. bd. ft. Douglas Fir, 7 M. bd. ft. Incense Cedar, No bid for less than \$5.45 per M. bd. ft. for Douglas Fir, \$3.00 per M. bd. ft. for Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$4,326.50 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$500.00. All timber designated for cutting on NW1/4SE1/4, SW1/4SE1/4, SE1/4SW1/4, Sec. 27, NE1/4W1/4, Sec. 32, T. 24 S., R. 7 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2309 M. bd. ft. Douglas Fir, 77 M. bd. ft. White Fir, 67 M. bd. ft. Incense Cedar, No bid for less than \$5.00 per M. bd. ft. for Douglas Fir, \$3.00 per M. bd. ft. for the White Fir, and Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$11,517.00 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$1,200.00. All timber designated for cutting on W1/4SW1/4, Sec. 27, T. 24 S., R. 6 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 4,600 M. bd. ft. Douglas Fir and 7 M. bd. ft. Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$7.75 per M. bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, \$3.00 per M. bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$35,671.00 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$2,400.00. **SOUTH UMPQUA MARKETING AREA: GREEN:** All timber designated for cutting on NE1/4E1/2NW1/4, NE1/4SE1/4, Sec. 19, T. 30 S., R. 2 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1695 M. bd. ft. Douglas Fir, 61 M. bd. ft. Sugar Pine, 47 M. bd. ft. Hemlock, 67 M. bd. ft. White Fir, 43 M. bd. ft. Incense Cedar, 2 M. bd. ft. Western Red Cedar, No bid for less than \$8.65 per M. bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, \$16.60 per M. bd. ft. for the Sugar Pine, \$3.80 per M. bd. ft. for the Hemlock, \$3.00 per M. bd. ft. for the White Fir, Incense Cedar and Western Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$16,190.35 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$1,450.00. All timber designated for cutting on W1/4NE1/4, E1/2NW1/4, SW1/4, NW1/4, Sec. 13, T. 31 S., R. 6 W., W.M., estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 5,311 M. bd. ft. Douglas Fir, 79 M. bd. ft. Sugar Pine, 1 M. bd. ft. Incense Cedar, No bid for less than \$8.20 per M. bd. ft. for the Douglas Fir, \$14.60 per M. bd. ft. for the Sugar Pine, \$3.00 per M. bd. ft. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$49,626.60 will be considered. Minimum deposit with bid \$3,200.00.

### County Planning Group Employs Consultant

(Continued from Page One)

believed necessary to prevent slumlike conditions. Although no two areas present the same problems, Bell will probably begin his work on the basis of his previous experience — mainly that in Wasco County.

He outlined recent developments, telling of the commission's establishment, the approval of the people for zoning, and the method of making the planning group a functioning one.

Briefly, he said Wasco County did this: Hired a technician on a full-time basis; made scale maps of the Dalles area and the county; put a record of all land use on the maps; set up subdivision rules; adopted the Pacific Coast Code pertaining to building and set up a building inspector's office; worked out a zoning ordinance after county patterns had been established.

An early project in Wasco County was to compile an economic base study, including analyses of topography, weather, general land use, agriculture, irrigation, forests, retail and wholesale trade and industry, power, employment, population, etc.

Not only did many people and agencies help in this compilation, but many now use the information as reference.

Believing it would be beneficial to the future of the county to have zoning as well as planning, the local commission feels should put the matter of zoning on the ballot as soon as possible. In the meantime, Bell and the commission will develop an educational program to let Douglas County residents know the value of the commission's future work.

Until July 1, the commission will work with limited funds. It is hoped next year's budget will include funds for necessary operation of the group, which was appointed by the county court earlier this year.

Not only did many people and agencies help in this compilation, but many now use the information as reference.

Believing it would be beneficial to the future of the county to have zoning as well as planning, the local commission feels should put the matter of zoning on the ballot as soon as possible. In the meantime, Bell and the commission will develop an educational program to let Douglas County residents know the value of the commission's future work.

### Plane Collision Death Toll Now Placed At 37

**MOOSE JAW, Sask.** — Canadian officials pressed an investigation today into the nation's worst commercial aviation disaster, the collision-crash here Thursday of a Trans-Canada Airlines North Star and a light military training plane.

Mayor L. E. Lewry called a special meeting of the City Council to renew protests against student flights from the nearby Royal Canadian Air Force base over this city of 25,000.

The dead included 31 passengers and a crew of four in the west-bound airliner; a British RAF pilot training here under an NATO program; and a cleaning woman who died in the wreckage of a house struck by the airliner's flaming debris. There were no survivors.

As it hurtled to the ground in flames, the big four-engine North Star came within 100 feet of a school where 350 children were in classes.

### British Comet Missing Over Mediterranean Sea

(Continued from Page One)

Pas, a Westinghouse engineer headed to Cairo to direct repairs on a small power station.

Ray L. Wilkinson, 63, of Marble Head and Salem, Mass., a manufacturer of shoe parts. He was on a combination pleasure and business trip to Livingstone, Africa.

### Siegfried Mahn Speaks To Young Democrats

Siegfried Mahn, German exchange student at Roseburg High School, this week told Douglas County Young Democrats that he hopes to come back to the United States for college work in poultry husbandry after he graduates.

Mahn is here under sponsorship of the National Grange. He lives at the Ray Doerner home, Melrose.

He also described differences in the schools of the United States and Germany to the group. The meeting was held in the Episcopal parish hall.

Next meeting of the Young Democrats will be on May 5 at 7:30 p.m. in the Veterans Memorial Building.

### Penney Manager Discusses Store Building Problems

Intricate problems of planning, negotiating, designing, construction and stocking with merchandise a store such as the new J.C. Penney store in Roseburg were discussed by Manager Bruce Elliott at the Roseburg Lions Club's weekly meeting Thursday night in the Hotel Umpqua.

Also on the program, speaking briefly, was Jack Cooper, special Lions representative for Oregon, Washington, Idaho, Montana and British Columbia. He discussed Lionism in general and his work with the clubs in his area.

District Lions Governor Lee Mellish, Medford, was also a guest.

The new Penney building, said Elliott, is expected to be ready to occupy in four weeks. It is located on Jackson Street, south of Cass.

After it had been determined that the present store was no longer adequate for the company's needs in Roseburg and with the current lease soon to expire, the company made a special study to determine the exact size of store required to meet the Roseburg community's growing needs, said Elliott.

While final decisions rested with the company most of the planning and negotiations were left with the local management. The company, said Elliott, allowed him practically everything he asked for.

After planning and designing the new structure came the problem of negotiating a lease, acquiring

property and finding a broker to finance the structure. A deal was finally made through Norris, Bacon, Simpson Co., with the Spalding estate. Contract was let to Henry Mason Co., contractors, to erect the building, after numerous sketches had been submitted and blueprints revised many times.

Planning for merchandise and stocking of the store has been one of the big problems recently, in order that the business could be opened, with complete stocks on the scheduled date. Elliott said each department head in the store worked out his individual needs before the orders were sent in.

The new store will be completely self-service, with each item plainly marked for size and price.

The store has been designed, Elliott said, to fully comply with what the people of Roseburg want.

### Umpqua Basin Association To Form Monday

The Umpqua Basin Development Assn. will be ready for formal organization Monday night when representatives of eight Douglas County communities gather in Roseburg.

Harold Hickerson, secretary-manager of the Roseburg Chamber of Commerce, said Friday that chambers in seven of the cities and a service club in the eighth have approved their participation in the associations.

The chambers are in Winston, Myrtle Creek, Riddle, Canyonville, Oakland, Drain and Roseburg. In addition, Sutherlin Lions Club has agreed to join. Each will have two delegates to the body.

The eight cities were the ones originally invited to membership, Hickerson, however, said that the way is being left open for other communities to join.

Election of officers is on the agenda Monday when the association's second meeting is held in the Roseburg Chamber offices at 8 p.m.

From Roseburg, Hickerson has been named two-year delegate and J. F. Dillard one-year delegate to the governing body of the association. Hickerson said he didn't have the names of delegates from the smaller communities.

burg; two sisters, Mrs. Lena Grady and Mrs. Mary Morse, both of Springfield, Ill.; 23 grandchildren and 17 great-grandchildren.

The body has been removed to Long and Orr Mortuary and will be sent to Bend for services and interment.

### Rebels Launch Violent Attack

**HANOI, Indochina** — The Communist-led Vietnamese unleashed a violent artillery bombardment on Dien Bien Phu today in what might be a prelude to a new infantry assault on the besieged French fortress in northwest Indochina.

A French communique said the defenders answered back with tremendous barrages as the rebels rained down thousands of shells from their 105 and 75mm. artillery and heavy mortars in the hills encircling the French-held plain.

Such artillery steps have helped the Vietnamese two previous attempts to overrun the fortress, a two-day wave of assaults beginning March 13 and six days of repeated attacks on various corners of the plain's defenses which ended last Monday.

Some French army sources, however, still believed the Vietnamese renewal would not come for another four or five days.

The artillery duel started after the French had reported the full in the Dien Bien Phu area had continued through its fourth successive night.

### Portland Doctors Will Speak Here

A panel of Portland doctors will speak before a meeting of the Douglas County Medical Society at the Roseburg Country Club Tuesday evening, April 13.

The physicians, from the rheumatology clinic of the University of Oregon Medical School, will discuss arthritis and rheumatism. They are Doctors Edward E. Rosenthal, R. E. Rinehart, Frank B. Smith and Arthur C. Jones.

Considered experts in diagnosis and treatment of arthritis, the doctors have spoken before a number of county medical societies and have been well received. They speak under the auspices of the Arthritis and Rheumatism Foundation.

The local association is composed of county medical doctors who meet regularly the second Tuesday of each month for scientific discussions.

### W.C. Goetz, 83, Dies Suddenly At Local Hospital

William C. Goetz, 83, well-known retired Southern Pacific employe, died suddenly Thursday at a local hospital.

He was born July 6, 1870, at Gresham, Oregon, and came to the United States at Montevideo, Minn., Nov. 23, 1902, to Meta Elizabeth Spelter. They came to Roseburg from Minnesota in 1918. He was employed for many years by the Southern Pacific as a machinist. He retired several years ago. He and Mrs. Goetz celebrated their golden wedding anniversary in 1952.

Surviving him are: His wife, Meta, Roseburg; five daughters, Mrs. Joe (Rose) Noyer, Mrs. Russell (Pearl) Kaine, Mrs. Roy (Goldie) Hebard, Mrs. Lewis (Vera) Wilson and Mrs. Ron (June) Walls, all of Roseburg; a son, Wilford (Bud) Goetz, Warner, Robins, Ga.

He is also survived by six grandchildren, Clarence, Noyer, Mrs. Bobby (Cloe) Allen, Judy and John Hobard, Rusty, Kaine and Greg Goetz and three great-grandchildren, David Allen and Victoria and Pamela Noyer.

His body has been removed to Long and Orr Mortuary and funeral time will be announced later.

### GLEEMEN TO SING

The Myrtle Creek Rotary Club will sponsor a concert by the Eugene Gleemen on May 4, according to the Myrtle Creek Mail.

## FOR A BETTER TENNIS GAME WILSON EQUIPMENT

**FAMOUS PLAYER TENNIS RACKETS**

Strata-Bow Frame of ash and fibre laminations. Select from this list of famous player models... Sedgeman Squire, Budge Autograph, Budge Signature, Kramer Autograph, Hardwick Signature, Jack Kramer Pro. Model. There are many others from which to select.

**Priced From \$5.75**

**TENNIS SHOES**

Special Price **4.95**

**RACKET PRESSES**

Made of hardwood with four winged nut screws. Keeps frames straight. Easy to use. Light weight.

**Thrifty Price 1.10**

**NYLON RACKET COVERS**

Zipper Closure **1.75**

**BASEBALL GLOVES**

Wilson, Famous Player Model, 4 and 5-finger.

**BASEBALL GLOVES from 3.50**

**FIRST BASEMAN'S MITTS from 6.95**

**BASEBALL SHOES**

**SPECIAL SCHOOL OR TEAM PRICE 6.45**

**Umpqua Valley HARDWARE**

202 N. Jackson Dial 3-6628

## BIG SALE NURSERY STOCK

Complete Landscape at A Very Low Cost RHODEDENDRONS, CAMELLIAS, AZALEAS, MAGNOLIA, HOLLY, DOGWOOD AND MANY OTHER EVERGREEN AND DECIDUOUS SHRUBS. SHADE AND FLOWERING TREES, ROSES, HEDGE PLANTS, RHUBARB, HORSERADISH, BERRIES, FRUIT AND NUT TREES.

Please allow ample time to dig, if possible.

**CLOSED SUNDAY FORENOON**

**PLAT 1 NURSERY**

3 Miles East, 1 Mile South On Plat 1 Road Sutherlin, Oregon Watch for Signs

## New! "Paint-It-Yourself" KITS

**Towels, Dinette Cloths, Aprons, etc.**

The designs are already printed... you just paint in the colors with "Paintex" — the new washable textile paints



**It's easy...** the design is already printed on the fabric — not just in the outline but with shading and highlights. You just paint in the color. Even if you never had a paint brush in your hand, you can do it the first time you try.

**It's fun...** painting your own dinette sets... dainty pillow cases... gaily decorated aprons and many other articles for your home and for gifts. Come in and see how quick and easy it is to do.



Dinette Ensembles from \$1.79  
Kitchen Towels \$1.69  
Aprons \$1.69 & \$1.89  
5 pc. Sets \$2.59  
Paintex-washable textile paints 25c jar

**Miller's**

Handwork—Downstairs Store

## A FREE GIFT

At Absolutely No Additional Cost



With the purchase of the new Vigorelli Robot Sewing Machine.

The **VIGORELLI** is the first and, to date, the ONLY FULLY AUTOMATIC SEWING MACHINE ON THE MARKET. The only sewing machine that can automatically make many beautiful designs and stitches without moving a dial... no wheels or wires to add.

First the straight sewer, then the zig-zag, and now the Vigorelli Robot, the greatest advancement in sewing machine history.

only the **VIGORELLI** Robot can sew automatically with 6 cams at one time. There are over 200 cams to choose from and each cam represents a stitch. Just select any combination that you desire, and slip them into the machine. You can change from one intricate stitch to another without stopping your machine, by merely pressing a button. Priced no higher than ordinary machines.

**take the VIGORELLI blindfold test...** You can sew like the experts while completely blindfolded, with the revolutionary new Vigorelli Robot, the FIRST COMPLETELY AUTOMATIC SEWING MACHINE IN THE WORLD.

\*This lovely stationary rack for easy, comfortable relaxing—an asset to any home. \$49.50 retail value but yours free and at no additional cost when you purchase a Vigorelli.

**SEE THEM... TRY THEM IN OUR STORE OR FOR A FREE Home Demonstration**

Phone... **3-4448**

**Miller's**

Make Us Your Sewing Headquarters