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Winston-Dillar- d Fire District
Names Dean Collins President

with shade trees and a broad ex-

panse of lawn has been seeded
at the entrance,

'41 CHRYSLER 4 door New Yorker,
good shape. Extras. 444 S. Jackson.

LaSAULE CLUB coup, axcellent
ccndilion.

Instruction 29
TUTORING. IN READING lor gradt

school children. Mary H. Eastman.
Ph.

Personal 30
ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS. Be 11U,

Notices 31
CARD OF THANKS

We thank our many friends for their ex-
pressions of sympathy in our recentsorrow and for the many beautiful
(lowers.

Lyd)a Paulson and family
lAM NOT RESPONSIBLE for anydebts only my own. Sarah K. Van

Lone.

LEGAL

NationalForestTimberForSale

Bear Camp Salvage Area No. 3
Oral auction bids will be received
by the Forest Supervisor or his
authorized representative at the
office of the Forest Supervisor,
Post Office Building, Koseburg,
Oregon, beginning at 2:00 p.m.I' .S T. July 28, 1952, for all the live
timber marked or designated for
cutting and all merchantable dead
timber located on an area embrac-
ing about 40 acres within section
13, T. 28 S., R. 2 W.. W.M. sur-

veyed. Bear Camp Area, Unipqua
National Forest, Oregon, estimated
to be 630,000 board feet more or
less of Douglas-fir- , western while
pine and sugar pine, and 370.000
board feet more or less of western
hemlock, white fir and other spe-
cies of sau timber. No bid of less
than $25.25 per M board feet fur
Douglas-fir- , western white pine
and sugar pine, $4.10 per M board
feet for western hemlock, white
fir and other species will be con-
sidered. In additin to the prices
bid for stumpage, a cooperative
deposit of $0.45 per M board feet,
to be used by the Forest Service
for paying the cost of slash dis-

posal, and a cooperative deposit
of $0.30 per M board feet, to cov.-- r

the cost of tree planting, seed soar-

ing and timber stand improve-
ment work on the area cut over,
for the total cut of timber under
the terms of the agreement, will
be required. As a qualification for
oral bidding, all bidders must sub-

mit a sealed bid accompanied by
I he required payment to the forest
supervisor prior to 2:00 p m., P S.
T. July 28. 1952. Sealed bids will
be posted at the beginning of the
auction for the information of all
bidders. $8,000.00 must accompany
each bid, to be applied on the
purchase price, refunded, or re-

tained in part as liquidated dam-
ages, according to the conditions
of sale: If an oral bid is declared
to be high at the closing of the
auction, the bidder must immed.
ialely confirm the oral bid by sub
mitting it in writing on a Forest
Service bid form. The right to
reject any and all bids is reserved.
Forest Service bid forms for use
in submitting sealed bids and full
information concerning the tinv
ber, the conditions of sale and the
submission of bids should be ob
tained from the district ranger,
Tiller, Oregon, or the forest super-
visor, Roseburg, Oregon, before
bids are submitted.

National ForeirTimbtr For Sole

Bear Camp Salvage Area No. 1

Oral auction bids will be received
by the Forest Supervisor or bit
authorized representative at the of-

fice of the Forest Supervisor, Post
Office Building, Roseburg, Oregon,
beginning at 2:00 p.m., P.S.T. July
28, 1952, for all the live timber
marked or designated for cutting
and all merchantable dead timber
located on an area embracing
about 69 acres within sections 12
and 13, T 28 S., R. 2 W., W.M. sur-
veyed, Bear Camp Area, Umpqua
National Forest, Oregon, estimat-
ed to be 2,780,000 board feet more
or less of Douglas - fir, western
white pine and sugar pine, and

board feet more or less of
western hemlock, white fir and oth-
er species of sawlimbcr. No bid of
less than $24.40 per M board feet
for Douglas-fir- , western white pine,
and sugar pine, $3.25 per M. board
feet for western hemlock, white
fir and other species will be con-
sidered. In addition to the prices
bid for stumpage, a cooperative de--
Soslt of $0.15 per M board feet, to

by the Forest Service for
paying the cost of slash disposal,
and a cooperative deposit of $0.30
per M board feet, to cover t

of tree planting, seed sowing and
timber stand improvement work on
the area cut over, for the total cut
of timber under the terms of the
agreement, will be required. As a
qualification for oral bidding, all
bidders must submit a sealed bid
accompanied by the required pay-
ment to the forest supervisor prior
to 2:00 p.m. P.S.T. July 28, 1952.
Sealed bids will be posted at the
beginning of the auction for the
information of all bidders. $15,000.-0- 0

must accompany each bid, to be
applied on the purchase price, re-

funded, or retained in part as liq-

uidated damages, according to the
conditions of sale. If an oral bid is
declared to be high at the closing
of the auction, the bidder must
immediately confirm the oral bid
by submitting it in writing on 3
Forest Service bid form. The right
to reject any and all bids is re-

served. Forest Service bid forms
for use in submitting sealed bids
and full information concerning ihe
timber, the conditions of sale and
the submission of bids should lie
obtained from the district ranger,
Tiller, Oregon, or the forest super-
visor, Roseburg, Oregon, before
bids are submitted.

The famous Jonker diamond
was sent by registered air mail
from Kngland to the United
States for 67 cents.

Cleopatra wore pearl earrings
worth, in today's currency, a mil-

lion and a half dollars at the cele-

brated banquet for Mark Antony,

ONE 3 drum loader, mounted on
a tea, inn. iruc motor, gooa con-

dition, 2000.

ONE heavy duty friction feed works
with chain and jear drive, tl2O0.

ONE 6x42 4 savr edger, double
and out (red rolls with outboard

bearing and V belt drive. Condition
lik new, U50.

ONE x48 4 saw edger. single In feed
and oulfeed rolls, complete with out
board bearing, endlesa belt and aawe,
SI 500.

TWO GMC twin dieseli, com piste
with V belt drives.

ONE GMC dietel standard In
dustrlal unit, $1900.

ONE 6 7t GMC diesel standard In-

dustrie) unit, completely recondition-
ed, JuO0.

Industrial Supply Co.
132' 3. Stephens Ph.
1947 KB 7 International short log or lum-

ber, long wheelbaae, good condition.
Ph.

B-- "CAT 1947 model, blade and drum"
Good condition. Stanley Keepers, Box
5U4. Oakland.

FOR SALE International short
log truck; art ol HD 7 AC tracks, good
condition. Ph. evenings,

FOR SALE 40 Cletrac tractor, bl.de
and drum. Beebe Lumber Co., Camaj
Valley.

f"OR "SALE Power chaiiT"iriv7b:T
blade. Inquire 646 S. Pine, Apt. I.

TD cat with doTtr for sale. Write NewsP
Review Box 268.

7 cat for sale wlinbJadeandloVingwinch. Glendale, Oregon Phone 124.
FOR SALE HD infractor, cable blade'

Phone 591 or 392 Voncalla.
FOR SALE , 900 hours." Ryce Wil-

son. Azalea, Oregon.
f INTERNATIONAL, good condf-tio-

Ph.

Machinery For Sale 23
RENTAL EQUIPMENT

PAH shovel
D8 cat
Le Tourneau Carryall
Hough Diesel 1, yard loader
Ford hydraulic scoop
Compressors Jrk hammers Pave-
ment breakers Wagon jack Elec-
tric Concrete buggies Rub-
ber tired wheel barrow

GOOD EQUIPMENT
COMPETENT OPERATORS

Pre-Mi- x Concrete, Inc.
Box 49. Roseburg Ph.

Farm Equipment 24

TIME
I was a think in the other dav white 1

was a walkln along old Sheridan Street
when the old S P.'s 5:13 would come a
roar i ii in. and the restaurants owners
all got out there a nngin their bells

me customers wouia come to their
place to eat. And some of us bojswould be a tryln lo sell extras of the
old Evening News a telltn' about our
Dough Boys and Kaiser Bill, or may-
be a wreck on Roberts Mountain.
Along about that time, we all thoughtyou had to have B or 10 horses, or a
tractor as big as the S.P.'i Engine to
pull a plow, but like I was a saylntimes have changed, we sure would
like to demonfctrate our Beautiful,
Wonderful, World Most Copied, New
Ferguson TO-3- 0 with Ferguson Sys-tem Implements on vour own Farm
today. Yes Sir, MORE AND MORE
Oregon farmers are a savin "THE
NEW FERGUSON 0 with KE--

U S O N SYSTEM IMPLEMENTS,
urir.B mure oi my neeas, mor of thetime than any other."

Why dontcha. phone us for a Demon-
stration today? Our appraisal on yourold tractor and equipment might sur- -
Erlse you when traded in on our

GREY BUNDLE OF DYNA-
MITE THE NEW FERGUSON

We have a Dandy Used Case Tractor
V.A.C, Model with self starter, rubbertires and all we told you about thiscase tractor last week, insteati of
buyin it, you let our "WILD TRAD-
ER BILL PITTS", take another one In
trade on a New Ferguson Tractor. 1

wish to goodness one of you luckv
Douglas County boyi would come inand make a deal before "Kouain Ken "
puts poor old Bill and me both In the
Dog House.

Used M.M. Tractor. Rubber tires, self
starter, If you really want a tale modeltractoc at a real old fashioned price,why doncha climb on your saddlehorse and come on over?

GRANT EQUIPMENT.
COMPANY

200 So. Pine St. 18.10 W. 7th
itnseourK. ore. Eugene, Ore.
Phone Phone

McCULLOCH POWER
POST HOLE AUGERS, TO RENT

NIELSEN'S POWER SAW SHOP

Winston, Ore. Ph.

Used For3 Tractors
A Few left. Also one used Model A

Farmall. Large stock new Ford trac-
tors.

UMPQUA TRACTOR CO.
123 S. Pine St.

FOR SALE 8 ft. Oliver Combine, rea
sonable. Noble Snider, Yoncalla, Ore-
gon.

Trucks 26
Southern Oregon

Truck

Headquarters
USED LOGGING TRAILERS. NEW

GMC TRUCKS IN ALL SIZES. SOME
ARE AVAILABLE TOR IMMEDIATE
DEI JVERY.

WA 22 OTitte dual drive, new motor.
mis is a clean one. 6231 Brown-llp- e

ber rolls. Ready to go to work to-
day.

50 FORD Pickup. 4 speed trans.

'47 GMC rear axle, Fruehauf
tag axle, 623 Aux. trans, lum--

4 GMC pickup
48 CHEV DUAL DRIVE, B lip

'47 FORD single axle, tires exception-
al, motor like new.

44 WHITE 10:00 ruhber. $1000.
will buy this on.

USED 4 cyl. 2 cycle GMC diesel. En
gine complete with all accessories
and 5553 main trans. Ready to In-

stall.

'40 CHEV. panel, good mechanical
condition, but looks rough. t'JSn.

Whatever your requirement maybe you
can find It at

Smith Motors
TRUCK DEPT.

Par. Hwy. North Ph.
FOR SALE International duai

drive log truck and trailer, motor
Just rebuilt, gooH rubber and good
mechanical condition. Ph. eves
or anytime. Sat. and Sun- - .

Axle shafts, ring Gear and Pinions,
Spring, for trucks of all makes.

RAY'S TRUCK PARTS
Ph. Hoseburg, Oregon
111.11" FORD i, ton" pickupr 9.W0

miles. si:e. 1281 Ball!, after e P.M. or
phone

4 FORD 1 ton pickup MM Good

Tractors 25
REBUILT, guaranteed caterpil-

lar trarlra Tr,n rnnrillinn 9IM M

lftsth Ave.. Poptland Oregon. Greaham
0H26.

FOR SALE .John Deere crawler- -
type tract or MC 100, with Hydraulic
tilting doser, tpwlng winch. Purchased
in May, a.wou. mam jonnson, a
mtlea S, onw, Log Cabin Grocery,
evenings or Veekenda.

Autos & Mtr. Cycles 27

BETTER

BUYS

AT

B A RCUS
'51 PACKARD Deluxe sedan.

drive. R At H. tubetess
tires .2495

5l Ht'DSON Commodors, I, over- -

'SI KAISFR Deluxe sedan Ilka new
Insida and out. Only 19sS

'90 FORD V aedan, R H M5
'90 PLYMOUTH SURBURBAN 1909

'W rRAZCR Manhattan, sverdrlvt 1309

' HUDSON SUPER Sed. 1399

'49 KAISER, Deluxe Sedan, Special 119
' DeSOTO Conv. R fc H New

black top. light beige eolor Tip-
toe Trana. , . !79

'47 BU1CK Sedan, R 1. H 1149

'4T OLDS 98 sedan. Hydramatlc
R a H. This ona owner ear tn

top condition ... . 1289

4 CHRYSLER WINDSOR aedan,
K c H. very clean . 995

'4 FORD Club coupe. R H,
NEW PAINT AND SEAT

covera 893

'40 BU1CK SUPER Sedan, RAH 999

41 OLDSMOBILE I Convertible -- .399

'41 PONTIAC Club Cpa 399

'41 DODGE Sedan, R It H 349

41 FORD Sedan .. 393

'41 CHEVROLET Tudor, runs good.. 199

41 BUICK CLUB COUPE t9S

40 CHEVROLET COUPE 199

'40 CHRYSLER SEDAN 193

40 FORD TUDOR 199

'39 DODGE sedan, extra good 243

'M PLYMOUTH Sedan, runs good ..143

36 FORD V- - Tudor ..

AS IS SPECIALS
'40 MERCURY Sedan ...

'41 CHEVROLET AERO Sedan ...

42 BUICK aedanetta - 199

'41 BUICK Convertible 149

'37 BUICK Sedan

OPEN TIL S P.M. EVENINGS
AND ALL DAY SUNDAY

BARCUS
Your Packard Dealer

Highway It N at Garden Valley ltd.

Phone --SI'

"SI" DILLARD
. USED CARS

All of our cars are very
clean and are New Dodge

trade-in- s

194( DODGE 1 door sedan - 11.193.

1930 FORD sedan . overdrlva -- 1095.

1940 FORD aedan 10.15.

1947 FORD aedan 35.

1940 FORD sedan - RAH- - Special 073.

1940 CHEVROLET aero Sedan . U43.

1947 CHEVROLET aedan J0M.

1940 CHEVROLET sedan MS.

1047 MERCURY sedan 095.

1941 OLDSMOBII.K 9R low mileage
Trucks

DODGE - nearly new - 2 ton truck
3 speed axle-- 5 speed 0

tires a big bargain
at . 24M.

DODGE lit ton 1495.

14' PLATFORM body 150.

1950 CHEVROLET pickup 1295.

BESIDES THESE CARS AND TRUCKS
WE HAVE MANY MORE TO
CHOOSE FROM.

"SI" DILLARD

MOTOR CO.
DODGE PLYMOUTH

Stephens Se Douglas Sta.,
HOseDurg, uregon

HANSEN'S
REASONABLY PRICED GMAO TERMS

CHEVROLET, BUICK, PONTIAC

CADILLAC TRADE-IN-

USED CAR CENTER
Roue aV Oak

OPEN SUNDAYS AND EVENINGS
40 FORD COUPE

GOOD WORK CAR
See Kert at Smith Motors Truck Dept.
Highway fit. North.
FOR SALE ''51 CadinacTser.es 82 For-d-

Sedan. This car is 6 months old and
owned by original owner. Phone 645
Mvrtte Creek before 5 p.m. or 594
after.

' PLYMOUTH excellent-
-!-

vate party. 5793. Days call eve-

nings.
'41 PONTIAC sedanette. Will sell cheap.

r,. Douglas. Call between :30 and
7 PM

LOOK '52 HENRY J
Sell or trade for '41 or older -

y ou Ph 36'J I even ns.
'l9: BUICK SPECIAL. oodransporta

tlon. for 1200. See after P.M., 426

Moeri.
fOR BALK-19- 40 Pontfar Club Coupe"

Radio and heater. Not much for
but good work car. $75. Phone

TUTO RUICK. good condition. See Bob
Green, Koseburg Motor Cu. body shop,
or ph. efler 6.

NEW NASH RAMBLER Conv. Will trade
or discount for ra.h. Ph.

WII.fTsell '4o'oids'76 or trade for' older
Chevrolet or Plymouth. Phona i

FOR SALE OR TR ADZ Spirited, beau-
tiful, good saddle, mare, 7 old.
fOatonabl price, or would trade for
good, gentle calf, suitable lor beef pur-
poses. A. V. Chcvr, Box U4, JUkion,
Oregon.

FOR BALE OR TRADeT Nice Jersey
heifer, IS mo. old, S125.. or trade for
one or two beef tpe an. mats of equal
value, Call Mrs, Brooke at

mornlngi, or Kt. I, Box 733,
Glengary District.

" FOR SALE Full blooded. unreiiT-tere-

Corriedale ram. yrrl'nm and
3 year olds. Max Burkharl, I'runedale
Farmi, JU. 2, Lebanon, Ph. Leb." 1M.13 or 11223 3' milei north rnd'" 1 mile east of

FARMKRS-
-

AND STOC'KMKN If It7

eattle, sheep or I'll buy tt, any
time, anywhere. Ph. morningor evenings, or write Paul HetnoeJ
P. O. Box 82. Robur

FOR SALE 2 feeder pit,.,, 3 year-o-
W

Whiteface cow with whitefaee hfifer
calf. Guernsey row with 2 Angus calve
ready to butcher. VW Plymouth pick-
up, good transportation, H. McCord,
Dillard. ,

,.,TOR SALE RegUteVedlierefordnrunT,
yearlings to A year olds, Incl. Round
Prairie Ranch, Myrtle Creek. Ph.
28.1.

FOR SALE A few purebred-yearli-
ng"

Romney bucks, 40. each. Gilbert
neaver, weaver Road, Mjrtle Creek,
Oregon.

iVt year old HampRhireramrilf blond
not registered. Rt. 2. Box 787. Booth
Ranch, Garden Valley.

7oR SALE
"

Registered yearflng.
Rommey Rams. Virgil Smith, Phone

WANTED Sheep and cattle of all
kindi. W. A- Blackherl, Ph. 22, Myr-" tie Creek, Oregon.

WANTED Sheep of all klnfls. Darnll
w. nay 44O0 Hooker Road. Ph.
or JameiJLewu Ph. 84. Myrtle Creek

"WANTED
Holm8ren' Kt Bo 773- Pt'5 F42

W A NTED CAfTOTRYcVnsedrbondl
edi cattle buyer. Write or phone Oscar
Shelter, Creiwell.

' WANTED to buy. Fat andHreedcFlVmbl
John Rohr. Phone evenings.

, WEANER pigs ior aale. I. R. LowmanT
Phone

Poultry 15

jCHICKS SALES WEEK
5.000 STARTED

NEW HAMPSHIRE CHICKS
1 to 4 wks old. Choice meat birds as

well as egg producers on sale at a
. discount. Take any amount.

PONTON HATCHERY
1440 Harvard Ave. Ph.
8TEWING HENS fof7le7Cair3-7852- .

Rabbits 16
11 DOES with litteri. mtlea out N.

Unipqua Road. C. L. Bibby.
RABBIT HIJTCHS for' lale. Ph.

Pets 17
COCKER PUPS for sale. Ph.

, FOR SALE singer and new case, $15.
Also beautiful bronze singer, $15. Call

or see at 123 W. Commercial.
5RA-H- COCKER KENNELS Phr.ie

or Reg. and ped. s

All colorsStud service.

Jacobs Kennels. Ph.
SINGER and 3 hen canariea. Last house

on Darrelt Ave., Winston.
'fiKGISTERED Wlrehair puppies, $J3.
w Glide eveninm.

For Sale, Misc. 18

CTR0WBRID6E'S

V COI.DSPOT

.. $691)3

USED WESTING-IIOUS- E

RANGE
109.93

yM(f 1
USED B E N D I X

Sll WM WASHER 80.93

:.. now, t
AH used appliances guaranteed for 90

days. Many mora bargains. Come in
and see them.

, Liberty TRAILER Sales
New and used trailers for sale. Bank

terms

..NEBO TRAILER PARK
Highway 99 'Norti

Schwinn' Bicycles
Rntomatlc power tawn mowers. Rose

pur & s oniy complete Dicycte ana iiwn
istower hospital.

AL'S FIXIT SHOP
320W. Washington Ph.
6 "ft. STAINLESS STEEL FOUNTAIN.
. self contained compressor and Lewis

Carbonator. 6 burner Garland stove
With 23X28" grill. Other restaurant
equipment used short time. Phone

'
FOR SALE Good as new FriRidaire

electric range, used only two months.
Price 2CO. cash. Inquire Anderson- Addition. C. W. Billingsley, Canon-vill-

Oregon.
fOR" SALE Free Weslinghoiisc sewingC machine. $140.. Just like new. Large- -

mouth fruit jars, 50c doz. Other ar- -

tides. Ph.
FOR SALE Electric appliances fix- -

tures and wiring material, 10 to 25
. percent discount. Electric Co., 2023

Myrtle. Ph.3-8.T,-

JD00 GALLON metal water tank. Fair- -

banks Morse motor and irrigation,
"pump, all for $200. Ed Lamoreaux,
phone 2702, Oakland.

Io32 GLIDER house Trailer. See
for appreciation. Kuckenbeig Con- -

truction Camp, 7 niilei E. of Idle- -

yld Park, on North Umpqua.
MATERNITY STYLES

Houner's Maternity Shop
MHarvgrdAve. Dial

TOR SALE 1!)46 model M ft." trailer
nouse witn aony. tasn or icrms.

Trailer Court, Space 6, Winston.

RIVERGRAVELBAR:olsostrc'k"pile
of sand and pea gravel. 6 miles

' snuth of Roseburg. Ph.
General electric refrigerator.6 cu. ft., very good condition, $70.

Ph.
IBM Sunrr lo Hnrrtrane Mrrrurv out

board, new, $H). Wilbur Texaco Sta- -
tlon. Wilbur. Oregon.

ft VTO DtlAf.P iiiliilnuidF lir.
coll and kale. Moore's Nursery, li
mile E. of Courthouse on Douglas St.

(2i "UPRIGHT Coca Cola" bottle coolers.
slightly used. Priced riKht. Phone
877 after 10 a m. or anytime.

Portable "electric "
dishwasher,almot new. Cost Will scii for

W.. W. C. Thurlow,
SPINIT PIANO. WJ1 sacrifice. Terms.

Write D. G. Lawson, ufii, Del., nov-bur-

llKE NEW'Simmons green'
Orlsinally sold for $250. Will sell for

HW. Call
LIKE new apt. size '51 model electric

range. Will sacrifice at $40, Phone
after 5 p.m.

marlow Wisconsin irrigation punp.
motion pipe and outlet hose. Ph.
12 all wool pattern rug and two throw
ruas to maTrri. r0. Phone

HOUSE tralle.Tsiion 'as Lhevrulct. iih7.
Oldrield. 1M2 Eden Lane.

J TIRES. T tubes, size 7:10X15. saC
Ph.

T.I

INDIAN RED MOHAIR friere daveno.
food as new. Ph. daytimes.

SPARTAN
30' 35'

America's Finest

Trailer Home
Unfit by skilled airplane mechanics who

really understand aluminum. Your
Spartan will be the beat, trailer In the
park. Up tn ft yar at 5 percent

COLUMBIA
26' 30' 34'

The Gov't Jutt purchased T9S Colum-bia-

We have othrr high quality
coaches available: PAN AMERICAN,
KIT. IHONWOOl). HOWARD. TRAV.
IXO. NEW MOON, ROYCRAFT. Wa
believe tha above coachea aro the
best in tha Industry.

TERMS TRADES

Earl E. Smith

Trai ler
Homes

The Coast's Largest Dealer
Nine Lorallons In Oregon and Washing;,

ton, main office at 7007 N E. Union,
Portland

ROSEBURG LOCATION
23.". N. Stephens Ph.
PORTABLE ELECTRIC DISHWASHER

almost new. Cost lf WiU sell lor
sa.V W. C. Thurlow,

a" OIL BURNING hot water heaters:
20 gal, 2Q; JO gat. .15. Nebo Trailer
Park. Stephens.

FOR SALE Light and power plant
new and used. 700 watts to lO.uoo
watts See at Model Marknt. Winston.

FOR SALE - le gas appliances;
all late models and exoelient condi-
tion Ph or 1X1 N Jackson

14 Ft. Runabout boat, almost new. See
Mr. McAllister, sporting uooas
Montgomery Ward's.

WANTED USED lIGHT PLANT.
rn. v .

1944-2- ft. Travelite Trailer house, W).
Terms. Call at 90 Tavt-rn- , Winston.

Miscellaneous 19
LANDSCAPE WATER COLOR CLASS.

Thurs. mornings. Phone Amy
M. mo Din son.

Fuel 20
PLANER ENDS, peeler core, and

mill ends, no bark. Claude Willey
Fuel Co 1!H2 E. Douglas, Roseburg.

Timber & Sawmills 21

FOUNDRY

Sprockets 12c Per Pound
Grate bars, all sires B'je
Burner cones.

Surherlin Iron Works
FOUNDRY

Archie Boggs Ph. 2363

nuinerun, urr.
run SALL 1' yara iorvn nrcaiciu

shhvel, model 104, eouioped '".h
guide line, boom and 1 4 yard drag
bucket, being used for decking logs.
This machine is in A- mecnanical
condition and will stand rigid inspec-
tion. Reason for Selling Is our mill
burned. Machine located in Mvrtle
Crek, Oregon. For low price of $10,500.
Davs phone 1515 Myrtle Creek, Da' or
night 2Tt5. Canyonvitle. Oregon.

'

HAUL TO
DOUGLAS MFG. CO.

Vour lumber brings more cash. We
buv year around mixed 1X4 through
tX12's. No end trim. Cash weekly

DOUGLAS MFC CO.
P. O. Box 414

Roseburg. Oregon
3 ml. south of Roseburg on 89

"REBUILT McCULLOCH
POWER SAWS

S S 7 H P. Machine!

Nielsen Power Saw
Winston. Oregon Ph.

WANTED T0"BUY
Gang logs; also timber, large or small

tracts. Top prices. Stomar Lbr. Co
Ph. 4M Riddle days, Canyonville 1291

evenings.
Wanted large or small trarts stand-

ing timber. Vicinltv of Elkton d

or Sutherlln. MGinty-Rlgg- s Lbr
Co. P. O. Box 526. Elkton. Phone 4."0.

Evenings phone Warren Hansen Cot-

tage drove 871--

"PLANER MAN with years of experience.
Can handle any type of mnchine.
Would like to make connections with
mill not over 100,000. Box 266,

WANTED
SECOND GROWTH LOGS

CONTACT WILHtTR LUMBER CO

SELL, RENT OR TRADE
For good O. G. timber. Consider yard-

ing by thousand. P. O, Box 5726,

TIMBER FOR SALE near Sitkum: 23.43
acres, lot 7. N'a. 7, Sec. 6, Twp. 28,
S. R. 9. Hans Hagedorn, Silverton,
Oregon.

WANTED Gooo awrolll logs. Good
on re Iverson Lumber Co. Phon

WANTED Sawyer for stud mill. Ap
ply Andrus Lumber Co., Dillard, Ore.

WANTED Long log truck for 30 mile
haul, $l2.Call 15U2 Myrtle Creek.
WANTED Logging "for donkey and or

cat. Phone

Logging Equipment 22
"aTtrucispecials
1!48 FORD LUMBER truck. straiRht

air brakes, motor overhauled, utility
tag, riRged for Immediate hauling.
Can he converted to short logger
with little additional expense. Priced
to sell.

1947 DIAMOND T dual drive longer
with 1940 dual axle Pierre trailer.

rear axles. W) per cent rubber.
Late model Continental motor.

Can be seen at

LOCKWOOD S USED CAR' LOT
or phone

194(1 BU"R1 SKAGIT yarder with 140 GK
Waukesha engine. Machine has new
42 ft. sled, complete with steel roof
and new 550 gal. fuel tank. Alio hat

ft. of new mainline. 2500
ft. haulback and 2500 ft. of
strawllne. Logged less than 1 million
ft. since machine was overhauled.
Priced J1!)0. Ph. L. L. Burr Logging
Co,, Roseliurg. evenings.

LOG LOADER
Northwest model 8, I'-- yard shovel

with heel boom and shovel front.
Good shape. Immediate delivery,

Sutherlin ,il.l!.
I94 FORD 5.1 passenger school bus,

new motor, new tiros, neat can pe
to suit buyer. This is an

excellent buy. Terms can be had. See
Lock wood Motors for particulars, or
phone

FOR SALE 1046 Studebaker lossing
truck. bx6, and single axte Isaacson
trailer, good tires. .1' slakes. iUOoo.
Charlie Johnson. 3 miles N. on - Log
Cabin Store, evenings or weekends.

I OR SALE-- Late mooel Kenworth log- -

ei'r. l 21 ho Hilda dle.el
Kruehatif trailer. No trade In. Ted
TeaKlie. Box 53. Cam,. Va'lrv.

f'OH SALE International lb
factory bed. and 14.000 lb. n

rear end. FiMt class shape. See
David Fink. l:mpqua. or call

4 YARD GENERAL shovel, good work-
ing order. Ideal for converting Into
Ir.g loarirr or donkee. or use as la.
Price slROO. Ph.

National ForcttVimber For Sola

Bear Camp Salvage Aret'No. 1

Oral auction bids will be received
by the Forest Supervisor or his

representative at the office
of the Forest Supervisor, Post Of-

fice Building, Roseburg, Oregon,
beginning at 2:00 p.m., P.S.T. July
28, 1952, for all the live timber
marked or designated for cutting
and all merchantable dead timber
located on an area embracing
about 45 acres within sections 13

and 24, T. 28 S., R. 2 W., W.M. sur-

veyed. Bear Camp Area, Umpqua
National Forest, Oregon estimated
to be 1,200,000 boatd feet more or
less of Douglas-fir- , western white
pine, and sugar pine, and 570,000
board feet more or less of western
hemlock, white fir and other spe-
cies of sawtimber. No bid of less
than $24.35 per M board feet-- for
Douglas-fir- , western white pine and
sugar pine, $4.15 per M board leet
for western hemlock, white fir and
other species will be considered.
In addition to the prices bid for
stumpage, a cooperative deposit of
$0.35 per M board feet, to be used
by the Forest Service for paying
the cost of slash disposal, and a

cooperative deposit of SO. 25 per M

board feet, to cover .(he cost of
tree planting, seed sowing and tim-

ber stand improvement work on
the area cut over for the total cut
of timber under the terms of the
agreement, will be required. As a
qualification for oral bidding, all
bidders must submit a sealed bid
accompanied by the required pay-
ment to the forest supervisor prior
to 2:00 p.m. P.S.T. July 28, 1952.

Sealed bids will be posted at the
beginning of the auction for the in
formation of all bidders. $10,000.00
must accompany each bid, to be
applied on the purchase price, re-

funded, or retained in part as liq-
uidated damages, according to the
conditions of sale. If an oral bid is
declared to be high at the closing
of the auction, the bidder must im
mediately confirm the oral bid by
submitting it in writing on a Forest
Service bid form. The right to re-

ject any and all bids is reserved.
Forest Service bid forms for use in
submitting sealed bids and full in
formation concerning the timber.
the conditions of sale and the sub
mission of bids should be obtained
from the district ranger. Tiller,
Oregon, or the forest suiervisor.
Roseburg, Oregon, before bids are
submitted.

National ForestTimber For Sale

Boar Camp Salvage Area No. 4
Oral auction bids will be received
by the Forest Supervisor or his
authorized representative at the of-

fice of the Forest Supervisor, Post
Office Building, Roseburg, Oregon,
beginning at 2:00 p.m., P.S.T. July
28, 1952, for all the live timber
marked or designated for cutting
and all merchantable dead timber
located on an area embracing
about 34 acres within sections 13,
T. 28 S.. R. 2 W.. and 18. T
28 S., R. 1 W., W M. surveyed.
Bear Camp Area. Umpqua Na
tional Forest, Oregon, estimated
to be 1.040,000 board feet
more or less of Douglas-fir- , west
ern white pine, and sugar pine,
and 500,000 board feet more or less
of western hemlock, white fir and
other species of sawtimber. No bid
of less than $25.30 per M board
feet for Douglas-fir- , western white
pine and sugar pine, $5.10 per M

board feet for western hemlock,
white fir and other species will be
considered. In addition to the pric-
es bid for stumpage, a cooperative
deposit of $0.25 per M board feet,
to be used by the Forest Service
for paying the cost of slash dis-

posal, and a cooperative deposit
of $0.35 per M board feet, to cover
the cost of tree planting, seed sow-

ing and timber stand improvement
work on the area cut over, for the
total cut of timber under the terms
of the agreement, wilt be required,
Ai a qualification for oral bidding,
all bidders must submit a sealed
bid accompanied by the required
payment lo the forest supervisor
prior to 2:00 p.m. P.S.T. July 28,
1952. Scaled bids will be posted
at the beginning of the auction for
the information of all bdders. $10,- -

000.00 must accompany each bid,
to be applied on the purchase price
refunded, or retained in part as
liquidated damages, according to
the conditions of sale. If an oral
bid is declared to be high at the
closing of the auction, the bidder
must immediately confirm the oral
hid by submitting It in writing on a
Forest Service bid form. The light
to reject any and all bids is re-

served. Forest Service bid forms
for use in submitting sealed bids
and full information concerning the
timber, the conditions of sale and
the submission of bids should be ob-

tained from the district ranger, Til-

ler, Oregon, or the forest super
visor, Roseburg, Oregon before bids
are submitted.

4 From Eugene Attend
Fete For Mrs. Wimberly

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Harlow,
accompanied by their daughter,
Charlcne, and Mrs. Harlow's moth-
er, Mrs. R. M. Day, visited in
Roseburg from Eugene, Saturday
night. Mr. and Mrs. Harlow at-

tended the reception for Mrs. Leila
Wimberly, Worthy Grand Matron
of the Grand Chapter of Oregon,
Order of the Eastern Star. Mrs.
Harlow is worthy matron of the
Eugene chapter, 0ES.

The party also visited with Mrs.
Day's nieces, Mrs. Charles V.
Stanton and Mrs. Fred L. Perry,
and her grandniccc, Mrs. Sidney
Moon.

Mrs. Day, a former teacher in
the Roseburg schools, who for
many years has been active in

religious work, especially in the
missionary field, is leaving early
in August with her grandson, Ray-
mond Collins, Seattle, for Austral-
ia, where she is to attend a world
missionary conference.

There Is a tunnel through an is-

land in the middle of Ihe San Francisco-

-Oakland Bay Bridge.

By MRS. GEORGE BACHER
Officers have been named for

the recently organized Winston-Dillar-

Rural Fire district. They are:
Dean Collins, president; and Bill
Tipton, secretary-treasurer- . Di-

rectors, besides the two named,
include Cyril Nichols, Pat Manley
and Kny Fisher. The budget has
been compiled and the purchase
of fire trucks is now under con-

sideration, according to the di-

rectors; Meeting dates have been
set for the first Friday in each
month.

The local fire district was voted
in by ballot on June 6.
Winston Briefs:

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Alpine and
daughter of Coquille were dinner
guests in the Frank True home on
Wednesday.

Mr. and Mrs. George Bacher and
son, Bryce, accompanied by Mrs.
Bacher's parents, Mr. and Mrs. J.
Kearby Masters, motored to Eu-

gene on Saturday, where Bryce
received medical attention.

Miss Agnes Waugh stopped over
for the weekend in Winston

from a vacation in San Fran-
cisco to Auburn, Wash. She was
a guest of her uncle and aunt,
Mr. and Mrs. M. E. Ulschafer,
proprietors of Schaffer s lodge in
Winston.

Winston's newest business enter-

prise is Paul's Shoe Repair shop,
recently opened by Paul L. Wil
liams and located on highway 42

next door to the Box Gift shop
bin dine.

Grounds surrounding Schaffer's
lodge in Winston have been re
cent v beautified by the owners
Mr. and Mrs. M. E. Ulschafer.
The island, located in the triangle

Davis To Mr. and Mrs. Dene
Allen Davis, Winchester, July 18,
twins, Charlotte ignore, weignt,
four pounds one ounce: Paul Al

len, weight, four pounds 12 ounces.
HARDAGE To Mr. and Mrs.

William D. Hardage, Winston, July
18. a girl. Linda Joyce: weight.
eight pounds 14 ounces.

STADIti To Mr. and Mrs. Ice
land Arthur Stadig, 2130 Jacobson,
July 18, a girl, Kathryn Lee; six
pounds 13 ounces.

W11.SON To Mr. and Mrs.
Johnnie William Wilson, 1215 Broc-
coli Lane. July 18. a boy. Daniel
Wilson; weight, seven pounds nine
ounces.

MCFAI.L To Mr. and Mrs
Everett Ncal McFall, 1934 Fair- -

mount, July 16, a girl, Kerry Lynn;
weight, six pounds 10 ounces.

MOFF1TT To Mr. and Mrs.
Gerald Raymond Moffitt, 2041 Mol

lis. July 16, a boy, Michael Lee;
weight, seven pounds nine ounces.

JOHNSON To Mr. and Mrs.
Calvin Johnson, Sutherlin, July 17,
a girl, Jan Marie; weight, six
pounds 14 ounces.

NEUSON To Mr. and Mrs.
Fred Robert Nelson, Oakland, July
16, a girl, Sheryl Anna; weight,
seven pounds five ounces.

STEWARD To Mr. and Mrs.
Carve Hugh Steward, Box 1127, Ju-

ly 16, a boy, Gregory Lynn; weight,
seven pounds 12 ounces.

CARR To Mr. and Mrs. Wil-

liam James Carr, 1504 Walnut, Ju-

ly 15, a boy, Dennis James; weight,,
eight pounds three ounces.

BERRY To Mr. and Mrs. Les-
ter Berry, 1817 Ellen, July 14, a
girl, Judith Grace; weight, six
pounds four ounces.

Even Split Urged
On O-- C Revenue

PORTLAND A Congres-
sional subcommittee Saturday was
told that Oregon Counties are en-
titled to at least half the revenue
from Oregon and California re-
vested lands.

The Association of 0 & C Coun-
ties told the committee that the
counties are making large outlays
to maintain mads which trucks,
hauling 04C logs, are using.

The counties now are supposed
to receive 75 per cent of the in-

come. But some congressmen have
objected and part of the funds have
been held back in recent years.

Rep. Harris Ellsworth
has introduced a bill which would
divide the revenues evenly between
the federal government and the
counties,

Ellsworth was among the four
congressmen here for the confer-
ence. The others were Ben F. Jen-
sen of Iowa, Wesley A. D'Ewart
of Montana, and John P. Saylor
of Pennsylvania.

Duke Ricketts Gets YM
Jr. Leaders Top Post- -

Duke Ricketts, son of Mr. and
Mrs. C. A. Ricketts, 730 E. Lane,

.is elected Junior leader Corps
head for Northwest YMCAs at sum
mer school in Scabeck, Wash., last
week.

Ricketts is a local YMCA work
er. He and Merlin Donaldson, Rose
burg YMCA general secretary, re
turned early today from the k

school. They left last Mon
day.

About 135 secrelaries and their

EXPERT RANGE

REPAIR

ALL MAKES

ELECTRIC

RANGES

Reasonable Rates

Kit
129 Wait Oak Diol

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Harrk
son and nephew, Gary Garrison,
spent Sunday picnicking with
friends at Bandon beach.

Mrs. Helen Duncan sperft
Wednesday and Thursday i n
Grants Pass and Medfnrd attend
ing to business. She was accom
panied home by Fred Green, who
for the past several weeks has
been enjoying an outing at hit
mining claim near Jacksonville.
Mr. Green is employed by Mrs.
Duncan.

Guests in the home of Mr. and
Mrs. Frank True last week were
Mrs. Margaret Glick and daugh-
ters, Diane and Sylvia, of Red-
wood City, Calif.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Pannell of
Chico, Calif., are guests in the
home of their and
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Roy Fish-
er this week. Expected on Satur-
day is Mr. Fisher's brother,
Charles R. Fisher and family, al-

so of Chico. A week-end'- s outing
and fishing trip at Lake Tacken-itc- h

is planned by the group.
Mr. and Mrs, Russ Turner spent

the weekend fishing near Bend.
Weekend visitors in Coos Bay

were Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Calla-
han and daughter, Pat, of Win
ston.

Mrs. Jim Taber left Wednesday
for Portland where she will be a
guest for the next several days in
the home of her son and daughter-in-la-

Mrs. Archie Wilson spent last
week in Portland where she re-
ceived medical attention.

Wilbur Resident
III In California

By MRS. ELSIE BROSZIO

Word has been received br Mrs.
Charles Sands of the sudden ill-

ness and operation of her step-
father, Charley Schroeder, at the
Woodland Hospital in Woodlands,
Calif.

Mr. Shroeder. who makes his
home with Mr. and Mrs. Charles.
Sands in Wilbur, had gone to Cali-

fornia for i short vacation. Ha
is reported as getting along nicely.

Mr. and Mrs, Dale Banta and
son of Wilmer, Minn., Colleen
Christie and Mr. and Mrs. Pat-
rick Christie spent the weekend
vacationing at southern coastal
points and driving through tha
giant redwoods.

Christiania Ann Christie spent
the weekend with the Phillip Scal- -
lon family during the absence of
her parents.

Mr. and Mrs. Max Hyatt of
Portland were weekend guests at
the home of Mr. and Mrs. R. E.
Brown.

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Russell and
family motored to Coos Bay Satur-
day for some fishing and a short
vacation.

Mr. and Mrs. Barney V a a
Cleave motored to Florence Fri-
day and spent a few days vaca-
tioning.

Mr. and Mrs. Douglas Hart and
son, Jimmy, spent a short vacation
at Diamond Lake and Klamath
Falls.

A reception was held at tha
church in honor of the new min-

ister, the Rev. Luis Boye and his
wife. After a short business meet
ing refreshments were served.

Mr. and Mrs. Les Moorhous, alt
er spending a few days driving
along the coast to Astoria and Sea
side, entertained out of town
guests at their home in Wilbur.
John Moorhous visited from d,

Calif., as did Mr. and Mrs.
George Moorhous and family ol
Los Angeles. The next week, Mr.
and Mrs. Caley Spain and family
of Lindsey, Calif., were overnight
guests. Mrs. Moorhous and Mrs.
Spain were childhood friends.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Workman or
Crescent City, Calif., have rented
the former Irving residence and
plan to reside in Wilbur. Mr.
Workman is employed by Engle
and Worth Co. in Winchester.

Mrs. Harry Baird has been quits
ill at her home In Wilbur but is re-

ported as much improved.
Mr. and Mrs. Phil Barge are tha

parents of a baby girl, Laura Lea,
born July 13 at Community Hos-

pital in Roseburg.
Mrs. L. D. Fohl aBd Mr. and

Mrs. Donald Lee motored to Salem
Monday and visited with Mrs.
Fold's father, W. D. Turner, who
is convalescing from a recent ill-

ness at a rest home there.

families attended the school, ac-

cording to Donaldson. Four men
from national YMCA headquarters
led the session.

Accompanying Donaldson end
Ricketts were the former's wife,
son and mother-in-law- , Mrs. A. E.
Baldrich, of ln Angeles.

DAY & NIGHT

AMBULANCE

SERVICE

3 QUAUFIED

FIRST AID DRIVERS

FOR PROMPT, COURTEOUS

SERVICE, PHONE

3-52-
11

P&B AMBULANCE
AND TOWING SERVICE


