

NOTICE OF 1952-1953 BUDGET MEETING

NORTH ROSEBURG SANITARY DISTRICT

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That in accordance with the provisions of the Local Budget Law, Sections 110-1201 to 110-1215, O. C. L. A., and amendments thereto, The Budget Committee of the North Roseburg Sanitary District of Douglas County, Oregon, in compliance with said law, prepared and adopted on May 29, 1952, the budget estimates for the North Roseburg Sanitary District for the ensuing fiscal year, beginning July 1, 1952, and ending June 30, 1953, as set forth in the accompanying schedules.

All persons are hereby notified that on Tuesday the 1st day of July, 1952, at the hour of 7:30 P. M. daylight saving time, at the office of the North Roseburg Sanitary District in the Landis Iron Works building on highway 99 North, Douglas County, Oregon, said estimates may be discussed with the Board of Directors, the Levying Board of the North Roseburg Sanitary District, and any person subject to the proposed tax levy or tax levies, when made, will be heard in favor of or against said tax levy or tax levies or any part thereof.

BUDGET

Costs for year ending June 30,		Costs		Budget		Estimated Expenditures for ensuing fiscal year
1949	1950	1951	6 months	12 months	Appropriations	
\$	\$	\$	\$	\$	SUPERVISION	
					Director's salaries	\$ 300.00
					Secretary — salary	1,200.00
					Bond of officers	50.00
						\$ 1,550.00
					ADMINISTRATION	
					Bookkeeper	\$ 2,400.00
					Audit and accounting	400.00
					Attorney	1,200.00
					Office supplies and expense	150.00
					Office rental	300.00
					Printing and advertising	500.00
					Travel	100.00
					Elections	50.00
					Interest on loans	100.00
						\$ 6,400.00
					OPERATION	
					Superintendent	\$ 4,500.00
					Labor	1,000.00
					Electric energy	960.00
					Truck operation	360.00
					Chlorination	300.00
					Maintenance and repair	600.00
					Tools and supplies	1,500.00
					Pickup — purchase	100.00
					Insurance — liability	100.00
					Insurance — industrial	100.00
						\$ 9,420.00
					CONSTRUCTION	
					Plant	\$
					Sewer mains and truck lines	
					Survey and engineering	6,000.00
					Rights of way	
						\$ 6,000.00
					INDEBTEDNESS	
					Bonds of 1950—redemption	\$ 9,000.00
					Bonds of 1950—interest	5,410.00
					Bonds of 1952—redemption	3,000.00
					Bonds of 1952—interest	3,375.00
					Sinking funds	3,394.80
					Loans repaid	
						\$27,179.80
					EMERGENCY	
					Unclassified	\$ 1,572.92
					GRAND TOTALS	\$53,122.74

Total estimated expenditures, as above	\$ 52,122.74
Deduct estimated receipts, as follows:	
Estimated unexpended cash balance	\$ 1,000.00
Delinquent taxes	500.00
Operating service charges	18,000.00
Balance to be raised by taxes	19,500.00
Calculation of 6% statutory limitation	
Tax base, as used in 1951-1952 budget	\$ 5,134.85
ADD — 6% statutory increase	308.09
Tax base, as used in this budget	\$ 5,442.94
ADD — Exempt items (Indebtedness section above)	27,179.80
Total tax levy — inside 6% limitation	\$ 32,622.74
Indebtedness of district:	
Bonds of 1950	\$209,000.00
Bonds of 1952	90,000.00
Bancroft warrants	53,843.45
	\$352,843.45

NOTE: * Bancroft warrants will be liquidated upon completion of project by Bancroft bonds.

We, the undersigned, do hereby certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of the budget as compiled by the Budget Committee, for the North Roseburg Sanitary District of Douglas County, Oregon, for the fiscal year beginning July 1, 1952, and ending June 30, 1953.

By order of the board of directors of North Roseburg Sanitary District.

ATTEST: Edith A. Landis, secretary.
Published June 6th and June 14th, 1952.

Dated at Roseburg, Oregon this 29th day of May, 1952.

Budget Committee: By J. E. Cooper, chairman.
R. H. Gladwill, secretary.
C. V. Landis, chairman of board.

LEGAL

National Forest Timber For Sale
King Mountain

Oral auction bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor or his authorized representative at the office of the Forest Supervisor, Post Office Building, Roseburg, Oregon, beginning at 2:00 p.m. P.S.T., July 8, 1952, for all the live timber marked or designated for cutting and all merchantable dead timber located on an area embracing about 30 acres within section 14, T. 33 S., R. 5 W., W.M., surveyed, King Mountain Area, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 1,340,000 board feet more or less of Douglas-fir and ponderosa pine, 60,000 board feet more or less of sugar pine, and 20,000 board feet more or less of incense cedar and other species of sawtimber. No bid of less than \$14.30 per M board feet for Douglas-fir and ponderosa pine, \$25.35 per M board feet for sugar pine, and \$2.65 per M board feet for incense cedar and other species will be considered. In addition to the prices bid for stumpage, a cooperative deposit of \$0.40 per M board feet, to cover the cost of tree planting, seed sowing and timber stand improvement work on the area cut over, for the total cut of timber under the terms of the agreement, will be required. As a qualification for oral bidding, all bidders must submit a sealed bid accompanied by the required payment to the forest supervisor prior to 2:00 p.m., P.S.T., July 8, 1952. Sealed bids will be posted at the beginning of the auction for the information of all bidders. \$5,000.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied

on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to the conditions of sale. If an oral bid is declared to be high at the closing of the auction, the bidder must immediately confirm the oral bid by submitting it in writing on a Forest Service bid form. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Forest Service bid forms for use in submitting sealed bids and full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale and the submission of bids should be obtained from the district ranger, Tiller, Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, before bids are submitted.

National Forest Timber For Sale
Black Creek Salvage Area

Oral auction bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor or his authorized representative at the office of the Forest Supervisor, Post Office Building, Roseburg, Oregon, beginning at 2:00 p.m., P.S.T., July 8, 1952, for all the live timber marked or designated for cutting and all merchantable dead timber located on an area embracing about 9 acres within sections 28 and 29, T. 27 S., R. 1 W., W.M., surveyed, North Umpqua District, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 300,000 board feet more or less of Douglas-fir and ponderosa pine, and 35,000 board feet of Western hemlock and other species of sawtimber. No bid of less than \$18.80 per M board feet for Douglas-fir and sugar pine, and \$3.25 per M board feet for Western hemlock and other species will be considered. As a qualification for oral bidding, all bidders must submit a sealed bid accompanied by the required payment to the forest supervisor prior to 2:00 p.m., P.S.T., July 8, 1952. Sealed bids will be posted at the beginning of the auction for the information of

National Forest Timber For Sale
(Maple Ridge Power Line Right of Way Area)

Oral auction bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor or his authorized representative at the office of the Forest Supervisor, Post Office Building, Roseburg, Oregon, beginning at 2:00 p.m., P.S.T., June 16, 1952, for all the live timber marked or designated for cutting and all merchantable dead timber located on an area embracing about 18 acres within sections 31, T. 25 1/2 S., R. 1 E., W.M., surveyed, North Umpqua District, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 640,000 board feet more or less of Douglas-fir and sugar pine; 20,000 board feet of incense cedar and other species of sawtimber. No bid of less than \$3.75 per M board feet for Douglas-fir and sugar pine, and \$3.10 per M board feet for incense cedar and other species will be considered. As a qualification for oral bidding, all bidders must submit a sealed bid accompanied by the required payment to the

forest supervisor prior to 2:00 p.m., P.S.T., June 16, 1952. Sealed bids will be posted at the beginning of the auction for the information of all bidders. \$2,000.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to the conditions of sale. If an oral bid is declared to be high at the closing of the auction, the bidder must immediately confirm the oral bid by submitting it in writing on a Forest Service bid form. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Forest Service bid forms for use in submitting sealed bids and full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale and the submission of bids should be obtained from the district ranger, Glendale, Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, before bids are submitted.

Receiving Burglary Loot Charged To Taxi Driver

Robert Edwards Adams, taxi driver of 441 S. Stephens St., was ordered held for the grand jury Wednesday in a district court preliminary hearing. He is charged with receiving property stolen in a recent burglary of the South Stephens St. Market.

Some tribes of American Indians once believed there is an old woman in the moon making a basket and that the world will be destroyed when the basket is completed.

DUE SOON!

SHIPMENT OF
Aluminum Roofing

NO LIMIT ALL SIZES

Place Order Now

DENN-GERRETSEN CO.

402 WEST OAK ST.

PH. 2-2636

LEGAL

National Forest Timber For Sale
(Jack Creek Power Line Right of Way Area)

Oral auction bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor or his authorized representative at the office of the Forest Supervisor, Post Office Building, Roseburg, Oregon, beginning at 2:00 p.m., P.S.T., June 16, 1952, for all the live timber marked or designated for cutting and all merchantable dead timber located on an area embracing about 10 acres within section 10, T. 26 S., R. 1 E., W.M., surveyed, North Umpqua District, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 204,000 board feet more or less of Douglas-fir and sugar pine; an estimated amount of incense cedar and other species of sawtimber. No bid of less than \$5.90 per M board feet for Douglas-fir and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M board feet for incense cedar and other species will be considered. As a qualification for oral bidding, all bidders must submit a sealed bid accompanied by the required payment to the forest supervisor prior to 2:00 p.m., P.S.T., June 16, 1952. Sealed bids will be posted at the beginning of the auction for the information of all bidders. \$1,000.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to the conditions of sale. If an oral bid is declared to be high at the closing of the auction, the bidder must immediately confirm the oral bid by submitting it in writing on a Forest Service bid form. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Forest Service bid forms for use in submitting sealed bids and full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale and the submission of bids should be obtained from the district ranger, Glendale, Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, before bids are submitted.

National Forest Timber For Sale
(Boundary-Fall Creek Power Line Right of Way Area)

Oral auction bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor or his authorized representative at the office of the Forest Supervisor, Post Office Building, Roseburg, Oregon, beginning at 2:00 p.m., P.S.T., June 16, 1952, for all the live timber marked or designated for cutting and all merchantable dead timber located on an area embracing about 3 acres within sections 8 and 18, T. 26 S., R. 1 W., W.M., surveyed, North Umpqua District, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 110,000 board feet more or less of Douglas-fir and sugar pine; 20,000 board feet of incense cedar and other species of sawtimber. No bid of less than \$7.45 per M board feet for Douglas-fir and sugar pine, and \$3.55 per M board feet for incense cedar and other species will be considered. As a qualification for oral bidding, all bidders must submit a sealed bid accompanied by the required payment to the forest supervisor prior to 2:00 p.m., P.S.T., June 16, 1952. Sealed bids will be posted at the beginning of the auction for the information of all bidders. \$800.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to the conditions of sale. If an oral bid is declared to be high at the closing of the auction, the bidder must immediately confirm the oral bid by submitting it in writing on a Forest Service bid form. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Forest Service bid forms for use in submitting sealed bids and full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale and the submission of bids should be obtained from the district ranger, Glendale, Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, before bids are submitted.

STUDENT HONORED

OREGON STATE COLLEGE, Corvallis — Kathryn Smith of Roseburg was recently given special recognition at the annual Oregon State College honors and awards convocation by being pledged into Phi Kappa Phi, national all-school scholastic honor society.

Graduate students, seniors and juniors were selected on the basis of scholarship and campus activities.

Miss Smith is a graduate student in education.

WHY BE SICK?

You've not tried everything until you see

DR. SCOFIELD

X-Ray Chiropractor
3 minutes from town on
Rifle Range Rd.
Dial 3-5133

LEGAL

National Forest Timber For Sale
(Fairview-Bogus Creek Power Line Right of Way Area)

Oral auction bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor or his authorized representative at the office of the Forest Supervisor, Post Office Building, Roseburg, Oregon, beginning at 2:00 p.m., P.S.T., June 16, 1952, for all the live timber marked or designated for cutting and all merchantable dead timber located on an area embracing about 3 acres within sections 9 and 11, T. 26 S., R. 1 W., W.M., surveyed, North Umpqua District, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 100,000 board feet more or less of Douglas-fir and sugar pine; 5,000 board feet of incense cedar and other species of sawtimber. No bid of less than \$8.00 per M board feet for Douglas-fir and sugar pine, and \$2.60 per M board feet for incense cedar and other species will be considered. As a qualification for oral bidding, all bidders must submit a sealed bid accompanied by the required payment to the forest supervisor prior to 2:00 p.m., P.S.T., June 16, 1952. Sealed bids will be posted at the beginning of the auction for the information of all bidders. \$800.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to the conditions of sale. If an oral bid is declared to be high at the closing of the auction, the bidder must immediately confirm the oral bid by submitting it in writing on a Forest Service bid form. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Forest Service bid forms for use in submitting sealed bids and full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale and the submission of bids should be obtained from the district ranger, Glendale, Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, before bids are submitted.

Nora Kohlhaugen
Memorial Vases
Accepted Sunday

To memorialize Nora Kohlhaugen, pioneer Roseburg resident who died recently, two bronze vases have been accepted by Rev. Raymond Schafer on behalf of First Baptist Church. Over 100 individuals and groups contributed to the memorial.

The vases were cast on original moulds by the Oregon Brass Works, Portland. The bronze used was part of a special allotment for religious purposes only. Engraving was by Whitechurch Engraving Company, Portland.

Some of the gifts were from friends and relatives in Oregon and several old state points, including California, Nevada, Wisconsin and Iowa.

Formally accepted Sunday, June 1, the memorial vases will be located by the pulpit in the main auditorium of the church.

LEGAL

National Forest Timber For Sale
(Redman Creek Power Line Right of Way Area)

Oral auction bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor or his authorized representative at the office of the Forest Supervisor, Post Office Building, Roseburg, Oregon, beginning at 2:00 p.m., P.S.T., June 16, 1952, for all the live timber marked or designated for cutting and all merchantable dead timber located on an area embracing about 7 acres within section 4, T. 26 S., R. 1 E., W.M., surveyed, North Umpqua District, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, estimated to be 285,000 board feet more or less of Douglas-fir and sugar pine; 15,000 board feet of incense cedar and other species of sawtimber. No bid of less than \$6.40 per M board feet for Douglas-fir and sugar pine, and \$1.00 per M board feet for incense cedar and other species will be considered. As a qualification for oral bidding, all bidders must submit a sealed bid accompanied by the required payment to the forest supervisor prior to 2:00 p.m., P.S.T., June 16, 1952. Sealed bids will be posted at the beginning of the auction for the information of all bidders. \$1,200.00 must accompany each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded, or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to the conditions of sale. If an oral bid is declared to be high at the closing of the auction, the bidder must immediately confirm the oral bid by submitting it in writing on a Forest Service bid form. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved. Forest Service bid forms for use in submitting sealed bids and full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale and the submission of bids should be obtained from the district ranger, Glendale, Oregon, or the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, before bids are submitted.

Beer seems to have been used from the most ancient times in Babylon and Egypt.

There is little evidence that bells were invented before the Christian era.

JUMBO SHRIMP
at
The DRIVE INN

Open Every Day 4:30 p.m.
1 mi. South on Hwy 99

ORDER SCREENS NOW!

WINDOW SCREENS . . . from 75c up. Bronze or Galvanized wire as you wish.

SCREEN DOORS . . . any size or weight. At reasonable prices.

CABINETS . . . Any kind you wish. Made to fit your home. We measure.

WHEN BETTER CABINETS ARE BUILT, HOWES WILL BUILD THEM.

Howes Cabinet Shop

866 Hoover Street

Phone 3-4113

Lovelier Figure

on your money back

Fat is Never Fashionable
You need a slim, trim figure to look your best in latest styles.

You Can Cut Down Your Weight
Wonderful New Kessamin Plan Helps you Lose Excess Weight Easily — No Special Exercise, No Starvation Diet, No Drugs.

It's so easy for you to lose these extra 8-12 pounds that have stood in your way to a stylish figure, more fun, more romance, more admiration, more happiness.

The Sensible
Kessamin Plan

WORKS TWO WAYS:

1. Helps curb appetite.
2. Helps provide the needed vitamins, minerals and proteins to make up for what you miss when you eat less!

FREE FOR THE ASKING! Valuable booklet, prepared by a physician, tells what to do to start losing weight at once. Contains suggested diet. Ask your druggist. No obligation. (Not for Glaucoma or Obesity.)

KESSAMIN
REDUCING TABLETS

CHAPMAN DRUGS

103 North Jackson
DIAL 3-4533

June Clearance Sale



LADIES—

SHORTIE COATS . . . 5.95 to 19.95

SUMMER SUITS . . . 12.95 to 19.95

DRESSES . . . 3.95 to 5.95

SKIRTS . . . 1.95 to 2.95

BLOUSES . . . 1.39 to 2.95

SLIPS - Rayon . . . 1.95

SLIPS - Nylon (Special) . . . 4.95

PANTIES - Rayon . . . 50c

GIRLS—

DRESSES

(1 to 14 YEARS)

\$1.39--\$2.95

BOYS—

T-SHIRTS

(4 to 14 YEARS)

89c

MEN'S—

SPORT SHIRTS

\$1.95--\$4.95

SPORT JACKETS

\$7.95

OXFORDS

(4 SELECTIONS)

\$9.95

WOMEN'S and GIRLS SUMMER SHOES - \$2.95, 3.95

HOLLENBECK DEPT. STORE

WINSTON, OREGON

EXPERT RANGE

REPAIR

ALL MAKES

ELECTRIC

RANGES

Reasonable Rates

Umpqua Valley
APPLIANCE

120 West Oak Dial 3-5374

TED ASKS:

"KINK IN YOUR LINC?"

Banish body kinks in your favorite "Lincoln" today. Bring your car to us for complete body repair. It's not expensive. It adds value to your car.

LET US MAKE IT LOOK LIKE A '52 MODEL

Ask For An Estimate

TED'S Auto Body Service

Just two miles west of city center on Melrose Road. Phone 3-4223 for free delivery.

