
OUT OUR WAYFor Sale, Misc. 18 By J. R. WmUum Fri Feb. 1, 1952 Th Newt-Revie- Reitburg, Or. 9Autos &Mtr. Cycles 27 Autos ft Mtr. Cycles 27
zrM-.u- . .. V

- - nc WA-z- r LtAW IM C7M
W TH' HOOKS AND HE I

& : ,,,. - 1.. D''T EVEM SEE (
Mill IIIIIH W in i3ijy& waitin

Jr-ff- i LOTltti TO cSET OFF THEREnrr'ii I hh ittA quick--th- at must
I

It, "viJSKS,

limber, estimated for the purpose
ol this sale to be 170 MBM No
bid for less than $970.00 will ba
considered.
TRACT NO. 7 Timber only to

be Sold
Twp. Rge. W.M.,

See. 8, SW'.SE1,, all merchant,
able timber, estimated for lhe pur-
pose of this tale to be 1,610 MBM.
No bid for less than $14,364.00
will be considered.
TRACT NO. 8 Timber only to

be Sold
Twp. Rge. W M.,

Sec. 15, Lot 4, all merchantable
timber, estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 270 MBM. No
bid for less than $1,116.00 will be
considered.
TRACT NO. 9 Timber and Land

to be sold
Twp. 22S., Rge. W.M.,

Sec. 34, Lot 4 (SEviSEVi), all
merchantable timber estimated
for the purpose of this aale to
be 240 MBM. The land mutt be
purchased with the timber. No bid
for less than $1,711.40 will be con-
sidered.
TRACT NO. 10 Timber and

Land to be Sold
Twp. Rge. W.M., Sec.

34. NE'iSEVi. all mer

LEGAL

NOTICE OP TIMBER SALE
Douglas County will sell at oral

auction the tracts of land and or
merchantable timber thereon

described. The place of
sale will be 'he Circuit Court
Room, Douulos County Courthouse,
Roseburg, Oregon and the sale will
begin at 10:00 A.M., P. S. T.,
March 3, 1952.

Cruise reports on the lands and
timber to be sold can be seen at
the Douglas County Forest Ap-
praisal Department Office in the
Courthouse, Roseburg, Oregon.

The rights to waive technical
defects in this advertisement and
to reject any and all bids are
reserved.
TRACT NO. 1 - Timber and Land

to be Sold
Twp. 25S.. Rg. W.M.,

Sec. 30, NEV.NW1: Lot 2 );

all merchantable limber,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 1,220 MUM The land
must be purchased with the tim-
ber. No bid for less than $9,026.07
will be considered.
TRACT NO. 2 Timber and Land

to be Sold
Twp. Rge. W.M.,Sec.

12, E'mSKV., all merchantable tim-

ber, estimated for the purpose of
this sale to be 830 MBM. The land
must be purchased with the tim-
ber. No bid for less than $5,346.00
will be considered.
TRACT NO. 3 Timber only to

be Sold
Twp. Rge W.M.,

Sec. 6, Lot 4 (WNWViNWU)
all merchantable timber, esti-
mated for the purpose of this sale
to be 580 MBM. No bid for less
than $6,726.00 will be considered.
TRACT NO. 4 Timber only to

be Sold
Twp. 21S., Rge. W.M.,

Sec. 4, SWV.SWi., all merchant-
able timber, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 700
MBM, No bid for less than

will be considered.
TRA7T NO 5 Timber only to

be Sold
Twp. 21S., Rge. II, W.M.,

Sec. 5, SW'.i. all merchantable
timber, estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 870 MBM. No
bid for less than $4,710.00 will be
considered.
TRACT NO. 6 Timber only to

oe soia
Twp. Rge. W.M..

Sec. 6, SiiNEVi, all merchantable
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chantable timber, estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be
1,120 MBM. The land must be
purchased with the timber. No bid
for less than $8,953.00 will be con-
sidered.
TRACT NO. 11 Timber and

Land to be Sold
Twp. Rge. W M..

Sec. 12 SWV.NWV., all merchant
able timber, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be
470 MBM. The land mus be pur-
chased with the timber. No bid
for less than $3,400.00 will be con-
sidered.

Iran Cracks Down
On Alien Culture Spots
TEHRAN, Iran W A U.S. em.
bassy spokesman said Thursday
Iran has ordered immediate shut
down of all American State De-

partment information and educa-
tion centers here except the one
in Tehran.

The order also applied to British
and Russian cultural ccnteri out-
side the capital, it was reported.

The Iranian action was based on
a 1949 decree permitting foreign
cultural activities only in Tehran.
The decree had not been enforced,
however.
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FOR 8 ALE Liiht plant. 110 volt,
11 H. P.. 4 cylinder Her.
rules motor, 3 phase generator, ail
In one unit. I. r. Callahan, Sher-
wood, Oregon.

HIGH CHAIR. 1 waihinf machine,
ike, klddy-ca- sandbox. PIv

FOR SALE Westlnghouse electric
range. priced right. Ph. 3k4293.

KELVIN ATOR refrigerator, good con-

dition. 313 W. Lane.
FOR SALE Easy Sptndrier, $30. Ph.

FOR SALE Electric Incu-

bator In excellent condition. 50.

Knlght-Porte- 458 Stephena St.

COLEMAN oil heater, 2 barrels,
all connections, 30. Hugh Stsk, RU 1.
Box 043.

rO" SALE OR TRADE Man's white
gold wrlitwatch, like new, trade for

jnaple furniture or luggage. Ph.

SPINET PIANO
Mutt sell tome term, can b

Box 44.JJew,-Revle-

is TT TRAILER hou.e. clean. food
condition. nd ood tlref. Reaionable,
Jnd trailer behind WlnHon Cale.
Winitqn. '

Sxia RUG, 30; wood circulating heater.

FOR SALE While enamel cook

tov,KU.Ph.
WATER HEATER, "city ai. O K.

BEAUTirUL antloue mantel with Ursa
mirror. Call

TOn SALE KellOM air compreiior,
960. Walt'i Radiator Shop, ph.

OALTshalloS well pump. Ilka"new.
Rt. 1. Box 63a.

GOOD AERONCA ChamSTTfcemed.

Olanvllle. Myrtle Creek.
WANTED USED UOBTPUItt

Ph
AVON Representative. Dial

Fuel 20
FOR SALE Seaioned fir wood No

Saturday cans. tn.

Timber & Sawmills 21

WANTED
OLD GROWTH

SAWMILL LOGS

CONTACT: HOWARD WILSON

Independence Lbr. Gr

Mfg. Co. Reload
GRANTS PASS. ORE.

Ft. 1. Box 741 Ph. 4083

ELECTRIC POWERED SAWMILL for
sale, on R R. and highway. Pond.
40 000 capacity. Adapted for small
logs. Inquire at 136 S. Stephens, Roee- -
purg urcgon.

WANTED
SECOND GROWTH LOGS

CONTACT WILBUR LUMBER CO

WANTED TO BUY
Gang logs also timber large or small

tracts. Top Prices Stomar Lbr Co.
Ph 451 Riddle days 2202 Sutberlin
Evenings.

WANTED large or small tracts stand-
ing timber Vicinity of Elkton Oak-
land or Sutberlin McGlnty-Rigg- s Lor
Co. P O Box 52 Elkton. Phone 430

Evenings phone Warren Hansen Cot
tage Grove 871--

WISH TO PURCHASE old growth fir
timber for cash. Write Carl K, Steph-en- s

Co., P.O. Box 194. Gearhart, Ore.
W ANTED - Good awmTirlngs. Good

price. Iverson Lumber Co, Phon

Logging Equipment 22
1 NEW BU 135 Skagit yarder, powered

with 209 H. P. Cummins engine, comp.
equipped with 1500 ft of 1 main
line. 3000 ft. of 8 haulback. 3000
ft. of strawline, 8 300 ft

1 block. 2 haulback
blocks and straps, 1 Esco butt rig-
ging. 1000 gal. fuel tank, 1 moving
block, new falrleads, new sled. Ma- -
cnme is in new condition, nas log-
ged lens than 1.000.000 ft. Price $18,000
For information, call or write Coffee
(J reek ivogglng Co., Canyonvllle.

1 H. D. 7 Allls Chalmers 1950 model,
equipped Carco straight hydraulic
blade and Carco model F towing
winch. Machine Is In new condition.
Priced $i923. Ph. evenings or

FORD LOG TRUCK, single drive. Fab-c-

single axle trailer. $2200. Write
itj siepnens pnone

1 LOGGING HORSE good set harness.
io saie. rn, oiit. i.amas vaney.

drum Skagit loadlngdonkey with
all rigging, for sale. Ph.

FOR SALE Page Ac Page log-
ging trailer, 9750; small double drum
loading pot, 3 years old. $400. See
Anthony Lumber Co., Days Creek.

Machinery For Sale 23
RENTAL EQUIPMENT

P&H t yard shovel
D8 cat
Le Tourneau Carryall
Hough diesel la yard loader
Ford hydraulic scoop
Compressors Jack hammers Pave
tnent breakers Wagon Jack Elec-
tric Concrete buggies
Rubber tired wheel barrow

GOOD EQUIPMENT
COMPETENT OPERATOR

PRE-MI- X CONCRETE, Inc.
Box 49 Roseburg Ph.

Farm Equipment 24
400 GAL. Hardfe orchard sprayer, power

taxe-or- good shape, 600. Alio nave
3 bottom tractor plow and 8 ft. cover
crop aisk for tractor. J75. each, a f.
Suksdorf. Winston. Oregon. Ph.

WARb'SPLOWtraccuItivatoK plow
and wheel weights. Kenna Hugnes
1311 Winchester.

Tractors 25
FOR SALE Pnrdsnn tractor, magneto

and rubber. J. M. Hartley Garage,
i." i. Hose St.. ph.

Trucks 26

FOEt SALE
GROCERY STORE

-- V Stock and Fixtures
fa 4 Year Lease with Option
V 5 Room Living Quarters
jc Large Parking Area

You'll have to see this store to appreciate.
Will take house and lot up to $5000. on trade.

845 Garden Valley Road

KJO, KJOT INSTINCT
IT'S MEMORY.'

IT JUST CAME
TO THE BULL
THAT WHEN HE
WASAOR- -
MAKI HEV NEVER

CALL TH' CRAh

tut. T. M. Btt V. t. H. Off. M

"it - T M3T

was the largest seizure of its
dollars. (AP WIKtHHUIOI

No. 2 bakers, to 4 15; Washington
russets No. 1 A,

Hay: U.S. No. 2 green alfalfa,
delivered car and Iruck lots, f.o.b.
Portland, $50 00 ton: No. 1 timothy
mixed hav, f.o.b. Portland, baled,
$47.00-$48.-

LIVESTOCK
PORTLAND Cuttle salable

50; scattered sales About steady
but demand fairly r.arrow; odd

utility steers cutler and
utility heifers canner
and cutter cows shells
down to 12.00; utility cows

few utility bulls weak at 25.00
27.00.

Calves salable 25; market steady
few head prime lb calves
and vealcrs 38 08; good and choice

; utility an-- commercial
; culls down to 14.00.

Hogs salable 150; market fairly
active, about steady; choice

lbs 20.25 mosilv 20.50; few
choice 250 lbs 19.25; 178 lb slaugh-
ter pigs 18.00; choice lb
sows good and choice
78 lb feeder pigs 18.00.

Sheep salable 25; market nomin-

al; odd lots good a. id choice lambs
unsold; good and choice under 100

lbs quotable ; medium
and Rood feeders salable
good slaughter ewes 12.50 13.00.

sttj. BETTER

BUYS ,

AT

B A-- R C U S

'50 PACKARD Super sedan equtpoed
.ith n Mi H and Ultramatie
drive -

i iratttrt sHan desert rose uo- -

holstery. ict black finish 1905

'50 HUDSON PACEMAKER
aMin. tart condition Ihrouehout

.... 1843

'SI HENRY J. 8 cylinder, only 11.000
milt--, has overdrive and heater

1495

'49 FORD Convertible new ion and
aeat covera . ... - .-.- 1493

'49 FORD Club eouoe. new teat
covera - 1295

'48 DeSOTO Club coupe. R & H.
Fluid drive, beautiful condition

'49 CHEVROLET Aero sedan. R 9c H
excellent condition .... 1245

'49 BUICK Suoer Convertible. It
it H, Dynaflow and new top 1830

'47 OLDSMOBILE 70 Sedanette. R
& H. Hydramatlc and new
paint - 1195

47 PONTIAC CONVERTIBLE. R
& H 1095

'41 FORD Tudor ...... 295

'42 CHEVROLET AERO sedan 295

40 CHEV Tudor Sedan 195

'39 PLYMOUTH tudor Sedan 145

Many Other Good Cars
From $95. Up

TRUCKS and PICKUPS
'47 Int. PI) ton 4 speed trans .. 745

motor completely reconditioned
Good Rubber

'48 FORD Dump 3 speed rear end
good 4 yd bed St hoist 945

'40 FORD Pickup
'46 DODGE SHORT LOGGER, new

motor. BrownUpe Truxtel tag.new tires .. ..... . 2775

"48 CHEV Log truck New 270 CMC
mtr cook chain drive new
chains At sprockets 397S

OPEN SUNDAYS AND EVENINGS

BARCUS
YOUR PACKARD DEALER

Highway 99 N at Garden Valley Rd.
Phone

1947 BUICK Sedanette. mechanically In
gooa condition, new paint, never
wrecked. Must sell, $995. Ph.
ncr o r.ai.

WANTED cars for wrecking. Will call
juu aeuver.

Roseburg Steel Metals
2344 N, Stephens. Ph.
'51 Lincoln sports sedan with hydra-mat-

and extras or will consider late
moqei car ior equity. Phone

FOR SALE 1938 Buick. soocTTdVriT.
tlon. See after 3:30. 1720 E. Douglas.

PLYMOUTH
1050 SPECIAL Deluxe dun. Ilk ni.ii

radio, heater and low mileage. N o
tax and a new car guarantee. Your
car or aown payment ana 973.07

ROSE MOTOR CO.
Rose & Lane Sts Ph. 3

DODGE
1949 CORONET Sedan. A low mileageone owner car with radio, heater,new tires. S560. or your car at down

ROSE MOTOR CO.
Roie8t Lane Sts. . Ph.
1950 NASH Ambassador

accessories, hvdramatle. 1.1 ana
actual miles. Can be seen at West

mag, auppty to., Mill & Moaher
SU

1942 FORD coupe, motor overhauled,in fine shape, 9173. down. 509 Ave. A.
Ph.

1931 NASH RAMBLER Conv.. new, now
In storage, private party will discount
for cash. Pb.

38 PONTIAC motor, completely over-
hauled. Also double laundry trays.
$12.50. Ph. a f ter 6 P.M.

MODEL. A Ford, good tlrea. Runs, Make
offer Ph.

1 CHEVROLET, 13.000 miles on a
new motor Ph. Jonas t.

Vet's Hospital.
1936 GREEN Dodge, runs goo

Save your new car, drive this to
work. See between 8 a.m. and 2
p.m. 60. 431 East Broadway, Myr-tl- e

Creek.
1937 Dodge Sedan. Good transport ation.

$135. 620 Alameda. Phone
1950 WILLYS STATION wagon radicT

heater, undersea I. 12.000 miles: 1946

Jeep, A- condition, power take-of-

Mac Woods Union Service Station,
248 N Stephens St., Roseburg, Ore-io-

Instruction 29
DANCING

Classes now starting. Ballet 9r Tap.
Ballet and Tap claa Tuen, night 7:30
Daytime classes and private lessons
in ballroom.

ENROLL NOW!
SALLY HILT STl.'DIO

OF DANCE ARTS
327 W. Cass Ph.

Personal 30
ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS Boa lilt

Notices 31
We will not b rfsporWble for any

arrju oiner man our own. rtomer ana
Marion Tucker, Myrtle Creek, Or.

Portland Markets
PRODUCE

THURSDAY

PORTLAND iJI Bullerfat
tentative, subject to immediate
change: Premium quality to .35 to
l per cent acidity delivered in
Portland. 8487c lb: first quality,

second quality, Val-

ley routes and country points 2c
less.

Butter Wholesale f o b. bulk cu
bes to wholesalers: Grade AA, 93
score. 79c lb: A, 92 tcore. 78c; B,
90 score, 77c C, 89 score, 76c. Above
prices strictly nominal.

Cheese Selling price to Portland
wholesalers: Oregon singles,

c lb; Oregon 5 lb loaf, 49 'i-5-

Vic.

Eggs To wholesalers: Candled
eggs containing no lost, cases in

Lockwood's
Used Cars

BEST BUYS ANYWHERE
190 8TITDEBAKER CLUB COUPE

heaver and O. d. Low Hllea 1483

HM FORD DLX TUDOR SEDAN
Heater. Sound aa a dollar . 139t

19S0 MERCURY rORDOR SEDAN
R & H. Plastic Seat cover.
Undercoat Sharp 1943

1850 FORD COW CLUB COUPS
R & H Whit, walla
Low mileage 1793

1950 FORD CUSTOM CLUB CPI
A beaut ,. L and heater 13J

1949 FORD FORDOR SEDAN.
a, H. and O.D. Really eharn.
low mllei 1J75

1949 BUICK SUPER rmtnnn RrnAN
R e. H Dynailow. Seat cov 174S

1949 FORD FORDOR SEDAN
1 e H aeat covera

1949 MERCURY CLUB SEDAN
Low oilleafe. Clean aa a pin . IMS

1949 OLDSMOBILE SEDANETTE
.xira iiw Mlleaae. R&H

Mydra. Slick H9J
194J CICEV. TUDOR SEDAN 949

1947 STUDA. TUDOR SEDAN 999

194 FORD FORDOR SEDAN, new
motor, new paint, new rubberR Jc 11 .

1949 FORD CONV. CLB CP 993

1947 BUICK FORDOR SEDAN 1049

1941 OLDSMOBILE CLUB CPI 3S3

1941 BUICK FORDOR SEDAN KS
1941 NASH CLUB COUPE 995
1940 OLDS. FORDOR SEDAN Slick 399

TRUCKS AND PICKUPS
1991 FORD 3 PICKUP 1795

19S0 FORD I 4 apd. PICKUP 1393

1950 FORD F- V- - PICKUP 1345

1949 FORD F- -l V PICKUP H45
1949 CHEVROLET tt T PICKUP

H 11M
194 INTERNA T. li T PICKUP 995

H49 FORD LUMBER TRUCK

"fL'i1 rubber like new
1947 JEEP, 4 WHEEL DRIVE 695
1949 FORD H T Pickup 975

1944 FORD U TON FLATBED
quipped with I ipd Brownl.

ehap. 12SJ

Open Evening!

By Appointment
TERMS

Ph. el Stephen,

DEPENDABLE

USED CARS
1991 KAISER 4 DR. Sedan. Radio.

heater, overdrive 1,995

1951 HENRY J 9 DR Sedan, Heat-
er, Overdrive, WSW 1,495

1930 BUICK SEDANETTE. radio,
'"i Hnwiow 1,895

1950 WILLYS 4WD Pickup 1,595

1950 CHEVROLET !4 T pickup, 4

1950 WILLYS JEEP 1395

1949 CHEVROLET H T pickup,

1949 CHEVROLET
n 6c n 1295

1949 Kalier 4 DR Sedan. HH, O.D.. 1,395

1949 FORD CLUB COUPE, 1295

1949 INTERNATIONAL H T pickup 995

1949 WILLYS JEEP, RH. Winch. 1.495

1949 DODGE 4 DR. Sedan 1.195

1945 PLYMOUTH Sedan , 1.095

1949 WILLYS JEEP 995

1947 WILLYS STATION Wagon,Hurricane engine . 911

1947 CHRYSLER TiC, convertible 995

1947 WILLYS JEEP, metal top. 795

1942 FORD CLB. Cpe 495

1941 PONTIAC CLB. Cp. 395

1941 NASH DR. Sedan 445

1941 PONTIAC DR. Sedan 450

1941 FORD 1 DR. Sedan . 395

1940 CHEVROLET Sedan 395

1940 PONTIAC SpL Cp. 345

1939 PLYMOUTH Sedan , 195

1937 INTERNATIONAL Pickup 145

1937 CHEVROLET J

RIVERSIDE Motors
2 LOCATIONS TO SERVE YOU

1444 N. Stephens Street
(Next To Snack Shack)
1800 N. Stephens Street

(Across from Roattta Lodge

Check Both Locations

SI DILLARD MOTOR CO.
-0-UALITY USED CARS
1949 DODGE Coronet Sedan 91.995
1949 DODGE Wayfarer 1,395

1949 PLYMOUTH Sedan 1J45
1949 PT.YMOIFTH Club Coup. Spe-

cial Deluxe 1,185
1949 PLYMOUTH Spec. Deluxe Sdn 1,095
1947 DODGE Custom Town Sedan 1,095
194S CHEVROLET Coupe 1,095
1949 FORD Sedan 945

1942 OLDS SEDAN 365
1939 DODGE Sedan 195

TRUCKS

1949 DODGE l'i Ton Truck 1.495
1949 DODGE ., Ton Panel 945

1950 CHEVROLET'! Ton Pickup 1445

1948 FORD Ton Flat Rack . ... 1.093

Si Dillard Motor Co.
Stephens At Douglas Sts ttoieBurg

1936 Plymouth Sedan
FOR SALE

Heater, good condition

$100. CASH

No phone calls. See at Flegel Trans-
fer Co.

Come See This One I

1048 Hudson, fully equipped, R Ac H,

overdrive 8030.00. Take over payment
Cox's Richfield Service

Mniher ArS. Stephens
roit-8A-

LX
1948 Jp. PhOIW 4J-- f l

mis.
maWRnrsu- - me win FURNITURE d

NARCOTICS FOUND IN MAGAZINES Customs Agent Myron Kohn (left) and Col-

lector of Customs Paul R Leake at San Francisco, examine cutout center of one of several
magazines in which 60 ounces of illegal heroin was found. Kahn became suspicious when he
noticed many similar packages of magazines mailed from Hong Kong. Each woo found to
contain a cutout section concealing the drug. Officials said it

i

EtscOC

$1000. DOWN
A amall home, with one ill crt of

land, well worth the full price of
f3fO0. It haa one bedroom, living
room, dining room and kitchen.
Thtr tahle top Water heater and all
ruxi are Included tn the purchase
price. Balnnce owing, ONLY M.
per month.

750 ACRES
One of the nlceit ranche. !n the

County, and only one mile, frnm
the Post Office. Belter than 200
aerci are cultivated. 3 arrea In
permanent paature. All the land la
frnred and ha good roadi. Creek,
10 Springs, with water piped to the
home and barn. The home ! all
modern, 3 rooma. wllh basement.
There li one large barn, 1 amall
garage, blacksmith ahop, 2 brood-
er hoimea and a wood ihed. The
property will eaiilly run 300 head
of aheep. All of the hay In the
barns, rattle and machinery can
he hoiiKht eirlra VttVflQO. li the

price with approx. $11,- -

ooo. down and aaty yeany wrmi,
on the balance.

600 ACRES
Thlt fine ranee la In the very bent

ahape. with 2'tO acre cultivated
and vin tr1id. In choice sraties.
to permanent pasture. All Free
Soil. Well. Creek and spring, which
Is piped to both h ousts and barn,
This property has a A room, older

home, htingnlow type, with KIRE--

CF, fndr-r- In fvrrv detail,
and a half dozen outbulldln, all
tn utiiitl rondilioii i cutfd

month roads. Jut 17 miles from
Ronrbiirff. with all the rural con
veniences. 7."S.ono. full prire with
good terms, or. K Tina uincm

$1300. DOWN
A fin suburban two bedroom home,

with Living Room, Kitchen, Nice
Hslh and Garasre. All rugs, on
floor, go with the ale. Close to
litis Line, onlv block from
grocery. City Water, tiuod Streets.
pi2M, FULL. PRICE.

Tor the Wlnston-DHIar- area con
tact, our affrnt. Dean Guyer. at
the Myrtlewood Treasure House,
in Winston, Phone smvi.

WILL TRADE
ThFi (wo story, modern home, on

the Melrose Road, haa a huge lot,
MX200. 3 bedrooms, L.R., D.R.
Comb., kitchen and Bath. la on
the City bus line and only 60 ft
from a grocery. Haa a nice yard
and apace for a garden. The full
price la 7OO0 or the owner will
trade for a gaa station, sawmill,
groc. store., etc.

87 ACRES
Only 1'4 rmiea from town. W acre

of thla good soil la cultivated. A
creek Is thru the property making
Irrigation possible. Lota of rrult.
Good Fences and Roads. Big
Barns, a Hog Houses, 6 room, mod-

ern home: with all furniture
WILL TRADE. $18,000.

or 23,0O0. full price In-

cluding Cows, Calvev Lambs,
Ewes. Pigs, Hay. Grain. Wood,
All Furniture and All Equipment.
A GOOD BUY!

CLOSE IN
Practically nsw hurtgalew type

home, wllh nice living room
which has picture window and
WONDERFUL FIREPLACE, kit.
chen; with double sink, and Brkft.
Nk. comb., 3 bedrooms, Bath, Util-

ity mom, with laundry trays, and
Hallway. Hardwood floors, electric
heating, City water and on the
City aewer line. Overhead Insula-
tion, Wired for electric range.
Very Clean. Located within walk-
ing distance of the City Center.
Will take car ai the down pay-
ment of Siaoo, FHA Terms, $9100.
full price,

SUTHERUN
A completely furnKhed 2 bedroom

home with cement foundation.
ONLY 3 years old. In a nice dis-
trict and completely high and dry
ONLY 1830. Down and 330. full
price.

WAREHOUSE
A pumice alone building, all on con-

crete and situated on Hlway 09.
Has a small office apace, storage
room, 1.1X;iO, and refrlg. room
13X.W. ONLY $2000. DOWN.

We have 1 to 99 Acre
Tractt, Reasonably Priced.

hove sold for a n

commercial $50.00-5- 40.
Calves: All weights, good choice

; commercial

Pork cuts: Loins, No. 1 lbt
; shoulders, 16 lbs. down
; sparcribs, $44.00-4- 90;

fresh hams lbs. ;

Lambs: Choice-prime- , lbs,
$.00 58.50; good, .

Mutton: $.13.40.80.
Wool: Willamette Valley, mostly

nominal, grease basis.
Mohair: 50c lb on 12 month

growth, fob. country shipping
points.

Country-kille- Meats:
Mutton: Best, ewes and wethers,

24 26c lb; rough heavy bucks, ewes,
1518c.

Veal: Top quality, 53'c lb;
others 37'ic and above.

Hogs: Lean blockers, 27 - 28c lb;
sows, light, 2022c.

Beef: Utility cows, lb;
canners, cutlers,

Lambs: Top grade, 5254c lb;
other grades according to quality.

Onions: 50 lb sacks, Ore. Yel-

lows, med., S3.50-.75- ; some lo $4.00;
10 lb med., large $3.75 $4 00;
Idaho, sweet Spanish, No. 1, 3 inch
min., $3 50 .75.

Potatoes Ore. deschutes russets,
No. 1, 2 inch min., OPS ceiling
range, $4.91 5 25 a hundredweight;

kind in San Francisco ond would

cluded, f o b. Portland: A large, 47

Vc; A medium, V4c; a large,
42 44c.

Live chickens No. 1 quality,
f.o.b plants: r'ryers, 2 lbs,

lbs, roasters, 4
lbs and over, light hens, all
weights, 16-- 7c; heavy hens, all
weights, old roosters, all
weights,

Rabbits Average to growers:
Live white, lbs, c lb;
lbs, old does, few
higher; fresh dressed fryers to re-

tailers, some higher.
Dressed turkeys A grade young

bronze hens net to growers f.o.b.
farm on dressed basis, 39c lb; A

grade toms, same basis, 37c. To
retailers, A grade toms, New York
style, 47c; A grade hens, 49c.

Kresh dressed meats wholesalers
to retailers; dollars per c.w.t.:

Beef: Steers, choice, lbs,
$57. 10; good, $55.70-5- 10;

commercial, $50, 10; utility,
; cows, commercial,
; utility, ;

canners-cuttcr- .

Beef cuts choice steers: Hind
quarters, $63.60-6- 00; rounds, $62
70 63.10;' full loins, trimmed, $84-2-

60; triangles, ;

$52. ; chucks, ;

ribs, .

Veal: Good choice, $56.00 58.40;

i FOR SALE 1!M7 , ton pickup, heater.
i defrnatrr, plywood crummy, new
t paint, $730. Grover James RL 3, Box

f TRUCK FOR SALlT4S0ni.rvfx:k
rark. l condition. Call T. H Boone,i

FOR SALE Dodgetruek. 1 torPiTc"- -

i lory stake body, verv clean, recentlyf overhauled, good rubber; heater, ex- -
J tra whe?ls fnr duals. W. B. Evans
1 n 1. Box 4:i2-- Sutherltn. Ph. 2420.

I '41 Ford tnn pickup, 47 moto'r. can- -
opy, good rubber, new paint. Rt. 1

l Ptl0n 2V'"

! Autos & Mtr. Cycles 27
CHRYSLER

; 1949 WINDSOR HIGHLANDER CLUB
coupe special paint and upholstery

,, radio heater new car guarantee.or your car as down payment. 78,
? per mo.

i ROSE MOTOR CO.
Sow and Lan. Sf Ph i.mm
"li?.R0. CHEVROLET-R- ""i H,un- -

" "MODIL A
Pack; new motor 9100. CaU 34399.


