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ORDIR YOUH WINTER WOOL! '41 FORD 4 pickup, new Mercury
General John J. Pershing is the

only person ever to have held the
rank of General of the Armies, (as
distinguished from today's rank of
General of the Army.) Pershing
was authorized to prescribe his
own insignia for the rank, but
never more than four stars.

NASH
FACTORY

DELIVERY

4wi(tj i LET ME STOP AMD lJ HERE )

tT Wwt VOU FRONA OFFICE Vvj JUST BACKOFF TH' JJW; 1 ENJOYING THOSE PICNICS-- hj ROAD AND HAS V
' A VULGAR BUMS' 1 BAH AA tSOT SOME CANDIES J? &g COMPAKJVMORE h-C-

rv:

Z H '- t- iJw THAN MINE fc? . hDTffFPl

STATE JOB GIVEN .

SALEM UP) Deschutes
County Judge C. L. Allen was ap-
pointed a member of the ad-

visory committee to the state
board of control on training schools
for delinquent boys and girls at
the board's meeting here.

Heretofore the president of the
Oregon County Judges association
filled this position.

DEALER
TITAN Sltllt 60

IN DRAIN AREA
FOR AUTHORIZED SALES AND SERVICE

OF THE TITAN CHAIN SAW.

IF INTERESTED PLEASE CONTACT ...
LEONARD EN D RES EN

WESTERN EQUIPMENT CO.THE ASSEMBLY LINE

3001 North Stepheni

"OOS" REYNOLDS, Dlftl

WEST ROSEBURG
1 bedroom home and 3 extra build-

ing lots. Clou to itore and school!.
Taxes last year, Mta. 4 walnut,
1 cherry, t peach tree and a lawn
with shrubbery complete the pic-
ture. This ti a modern clean food
home at 10830. FUi-- P

227 ACRES
90 Acrea of bottom toll In cultivation

with a live creek alto, A good
well Is pressured to the 5 room
modern home. One large barn,
chicken house, 1 garages, Taxes
last year, $180., now that leaves
approx. ISO acres of extra good
sheep grating land almost all open
land with shelter and that makes
this place a real bargain at

full orice with terms to suit
the purchaser. Thla owner can-

not stand the work eo will trade
for an apt. houie or motel, etc.

NEW HIGHWAY??
181 Acrea with approx. 100 acrea

cultivated. 45 of these can be lr--
rlnntorl frnm th river and there
Is a strong possibility that the
nw niwsv will touch this, at
present it Is about I mile off of
Bi). An eleven room noune com

Eletely plastered with a very good
1 larire bam and a chicken

house 4 milea from town. FULL
PRICE $21,000. 110,000. DN.

BARGAIN
1 Bedrootm, Living room, ihower.

large kitchen, service porch. Lot
100' x 50'. Youra for foOOO. WW.
DOWN.

BRAND NEW
Ve have ft ves six brand new FHA

financed 2 bedroom modern homes
In an exclusively new district,
where every home owner la proud
of their new lawns and ihrubs.
These are of the best ao don't
delay. Make your choice today.

$9850. FULL PRICE Let us get
your FHA Committment xor you.

We "SELL"

We art pleased to announce that wa
can again offer this service for a
limited time. Enjoy a paid vacation
to our factory and return

S A VE

m i o

$275.00
PHONE OR COME IN

TED REED MOTORS

NASH
321 W. Oak Phona

"

Eskimo Ed says he's
GONNA OITCH HIS DOGSLED
'N GET A GOOD USED CAR AT

KEEL'S
JUST SOUTH OF THE ROSE HOTEL

PHONE

1990 STUDE. Comm. 5 pi. cpa.
1950 STUCE. Land Cruiser ,
1950 STUDE. 5 pa. cpe. '
1950 STUDE. Champ. 4 dr sedan
1950 CHEVROLET 2 dr. aedan
1950 CHEVROLET 4 dr. Sedan
1950 PLYMOUTH 2 dr.
1949 OLDSMUtULB 4 dr. aedan
1949 PONTIAC Sedan cpe,
1949 BUICK Sedanette
1949 BUICK 4 dr. sedan
1949 FORD 2 dr. O. D.
1949 STUDE. Champ. O. D. 4 dr.
1948 CHEVROLET 2 dr.
1942 STUDE. 4 dr.
1941 POnD Club cpe, Carson top
1940 CHEVROLET cpe
1937 CHEVROLET 2 dr.
NEW CARS, TRUCKS AND PICKUPS

Open Sundays & Evenings
E, J, "Doc" & Jim Byiord

USED CARS
So. City Limits, Highway 99

Myrtle Creek, Oregon

CAR AUCTION
SATURDAY, AUGUST 11TH

Public Invited
Finances can be arranged

Old and late model cars lots of
good work cars will be sold to
high bidder. Sale will start 3 P. M,
sharp.

If you have a car to sell, come earlyand see Jim or Doc Byford.

1947 CHRYSLER

NEW YORKER SEDAN
26,000 miles, perfect condition, all the

extras, ceiling price. One owner.
Terms. Paul Ryan, Hotel Grand.

SELLING
YOUR CAR ?

See Rose Motor Co.
At Rose & Lane Streets

CHEVROLET '41 8 passenger Special
Deluxe Coupe. Radio and heater. Will
trade for good pickup. Rt. 1, Box
405, Sutherlln.

FOR SALE $375. '41 Ford con-
vertible, good top. Good condition.
Radio, must sell Immediately. See
C. G. Kelley, care of Shelton St Burr
Camp, Glide. Oregon.

FOR SALE 2 door.
Radio, heater and overdrive. Good
condition. $1495. Terms. 504 West St.
Riverside Add.

FOR SALE 1930 Chev. very
good condition, good tires. Just like
new. Had toned up. Reasonable. Vs

time n m uaKiana. martin Ulsun,
1940 PLYMOUTH COUPE very good

condition, with 1000 miles on new r.

Ph.
EQUITY IN '49 Crosley Station Wagon.

75. Also '40 Hudson, $140. RoseburgAuto Park. Cabin 20.

FOR SALE 1931 Model A Ford.
gg.Hichard Melton, Fortune Branch.

u i i Eiuiijr 111 guua to
Chevrolet convertible or trade for
good. 40 or '41, 1127 Chatham. Ph.

FOR SALE OR TRADE '49 Ford Tu-
dor sedan, R & H. Ph.

1 WILL SELL YOU MYEQUlf iTlh
my 1930 Buirk Road master with all
its fine extras at a large savings to
you. If you want it now. Call John
T. Beck, Ph. 2451. Sutherlln, Duke
Hoad No Sat. Calls please.

FOR SALE 949Nash 600. Bargain.
S llg5. Terma.S04 West Riverside Add.

FOR SALE 1950 Plymouth, 2doofT
New car. Bill of sale. 81593. Terms,
504 West Riverside Add.

FOR SALE 1940 "HD. 45 Bags,
shield, good shape. 8250. Call 8u mer-
lin, 2804.

1936 STUDEBAKER President for sale
or trade for good outboard motor or
boat. Ph.

FOR SALE BY original owner 1948
Chevrolet Aero Sedan, fully equipped.Service recordg available. Can be seen
evenings at L. E. Sullivan and Son,
2mlles No. Highway 99

FOR SAL- - 1W47 OKD "deluxe club
coupe. Excellent condition, radio,heater. 325 South St.

Personal 30
IF YOU HAVE A DRINKING problem,

get In touch with Alcoholics Anony-mous P. O Box 1116.

Notices 31
NO TRESPASSING on the Betcher

...mc., uuunrd Creek Road.
I WILL NOl"BEeiilpMjltifor anydebts other than ray own. Frank

Wasimuth.
NO HI fNTINO or trespassing-with-

out

perrMsiion on Wraver , Hart and Shel-
ton places. Located on Morgan Creek.
Tho Krfwpon

WHILE OUR SUMMER PRICKS
ARC ON

Double loada of peeler core, fireplace
and mill endi, $13; S inch planer
ends, ll3.su; i men planer enas. iiu;
Immediate delivery. Call Claude y

Fuel Co., or 15WI .

Dougiaa a i.
Cog ENDS, fireplace, cook stove and

furnace woods per unit you haul.
No deliveries Sullivan St Son Lumber
Co., 2 mi lei No of Hoseourg on ww.

Timber & Sawmills 21

For Sale

TWO 48"

STEEL HEAD BLOCKS
o

Less Dogs
OTHERWISE COMPLETE WITH SEI

WORKS. SHAFT SPROCKETT AND
NO. 60 DOUBLE RUN ROLLER
CHAIN

$250.00
L. E. SULLIVAN & SONS

LUMBER CO.
Highway 99 No. Ph.

WANTED TO BUY

Gang logs alio timber large or imall
tracu. Top Prices. stomar Lbr. Co.
Ph. 451 Riddle dan 2201 SutherUn
Evening!. ,

ATENTION LOGGERS

SLED & BOOM
CONSTRUCTION
Inquire at

SUTHERLIN MACHINE WORKS
Ph. 247G

WANTED

SECOND GROWTH LOSS
CONTACT WILBUR LUMBER CO.

WANTED Cat to yard i million
ft. 2nd growth. Joe Pruitt, South
City Limit, Myrtle Creek.

SAWMILL for sale, 15,000 capacity, with
or without inter. Inquire E. R.
Christie, 2 miles W. Wilbur on Colea
Valley Hcvd

FOR SALE - 6x10 ticker, complete
with blower, blow pipe, and i;

power plant. y Lumber
Co.. Myrtle Creek.

WANTED Good tawmil) loi- Good
price. Iverson Lumber Co ln.

Logging Equipment 22
FOR SALE

Yard in tr Donkev oowercd by 125 H. P,
Hercules Motor excellent condition.

Dual truck. 12.000 ml.
3 speed Brownie, extra long wheel
has, good rubber.

118,000 2 speed timkin rear end for
Ford truck complete wun wneeii ana
springs.

1 Rear end for Studebaker truck com

plete with wheels and springs.
1 l.E.L. Bucking saw.

PRICED FOR QUICK SALE
See Jack Russell at North City limits of

Canyonville.
FDL Cietrnc. with Isaacson blade. Car-

co single drum. Best condition. Bar
gain at jifooo. vn. noscDurg.

FOR SALE - 46 INTERNATIONAL
Logging truck, with luso umu

Diesel engine. Pa Re trailer. Leo-

nard Clifton. Canyonville.
"INTERNATIONAL 6 wheel log truck

and trailer. Ph.
ONE MOBILE log loader with heel boom

one TD 18 cat, for sale. Apply Lu-
cas Bros.. Sutherlln. Ph.

1950 D6 CAT with cat blade and hyster
winch. Fully armored for logging, vn.
9411, evenings. Brownsville. Oregon.

iLinn SAI.F! One registered Belslan
V IfSBing team, harness, etc., about 1000

10s. uail 100 N. Mini in evenings.

Machinery For Sale 23

LOGGERS ATTENTION

Tractor, brand new, never used. 's

largest model fully equipped
for logging. Isaacson cable hoist dozer,
Carco single logging drum, steel can-

opy, fully armored. No waiting for
delivery, put it to work at once.
phone; Springneiq. urc.

MACHiNe-R- tor rent. Portable elec-
tric welder; also electric drills and
grnders. Ph. 136 S. Stephens.

FOR SALE '41 H. P. Red Seal Con-

tinental gas motor used one day. $500.
O. IS. Weaver, Myrtle Creek. Oregon.

Farm Equipment 24
FOR SALE Slightly used super A

Farmall. new Plow and 5' disk. At
$4O0. less than new price. A. B.
Balrd. Star Route, Oakland

Tractors 25
D6 1947 CAT. For sale or trade. Good

condition. Some terms. Inquire Union
Station. Riddle. H. L. Sharp.

Trucks 26
PICKUPS

1948 DODUB It ton, elean at a pin- - 1045

1947 INTERNATIONAL V. ton Ml

lk'40 CHEV. Panel, elean,
ready to go

1948 CMC 270 mtr complete
with W I trailer. Complete unit
weigh, only 15.000 pound.

1D47 INTERNATIONAL
3010 axles. Log Bunki ready
to go.

1945 DODGE dual drive, short log
truck with bunki

1944 WHITE WA 23 yard dump
box

1941 GUNDERSON log trailer

LONG WHT.ELBASE International
Gl ahort log or lumber truck.

LET US HELP YOU WITH YOUR
TRANSPORTATION PROBLEMS

New GMC Trucks

SMITH MOTORS
TRUCK DEPARTMENT

HIGHWAY 99. NORTH Ph.

TRUCKERS ATTENTION

Good, used transmission with
housing, Reasonable. Dillard Oarage.

FOR SALE '48 GMC 450 with 30
ft semitrailer, good rubber, new
palm, good shape. JHOO0. Call Suther-
lln 2804.

AXLE SHAFTS sprrngs. for all makes
of trurks. Ray's Truck Shop, 2035 N.
Stephens., Fhone

CHEV. TRUCK. 4! van body, extra
good. 300 amp. Lincoln Hercules drive.
Ph.

FOR SALE Two ton 1948 Dodge
truck and trailer, equipped for piling
or short logs. 82500. Ed Lamoreaux,
Oakland.

FOR SALE 'so dual axle
truck. 408 engine. 82.11 G 0

rubber. Driven flh'OO miles. Phone
3Q23. Sutheri i n

MEW MACK AND SINGLTXLTlralT:
er. Lumber or lof bunks. Phone
Elk ton. 407. G.E. Benedict.

'41 CHEV. pickup. Good condition. Rt
. Box 148. Keasey Road.

Intrtmck,Bxl3fiat Bed75
ton winch optional elmot new tires,new transmission, new brakes, excel-
lent condition throughout. Bargain.John Musgrove, Box 395, ph. 2774,
BUUICHiJL

u. 8. pt. off.

$19.55 per M. ft. B. M. for Doug-la- s

fir, $5.80 per M. ft. B. M. for
Incense Cedar, or a total purchase
price of $19,705.75, will be con-
sidered. Minimum deposit with bid
$1,975.00. T. 30 S., R. 8 W., W. M.,
Sec. 1, all timber designated for
cutting on Lot 1 (NEWNEV4), SEV
NEVi estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 1010 M. ft Doug-
las fir, 10 M, feet Sugar Pine, 15
M. feet White fir, 20 M. feet West-
ern Red Cedar, 40 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than $22.20
per M. ft. B. M. for Douglas fir,
$30.95 per M. ft. B. M. for Sugar
Pine, $10.80 per M. ft. B. M. for
White Fir, $5.80 per M. ft. B. M.
for Western Red Cedar, $9.30 per
m. ii. is. m. lor incense Cedar,or a total purchase price of

will be considered. Mini-
mum deposit with bid $2,340.00.

IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: ORE.
GON: SOUTH UMPQUA MAR-
KETING AREA: All timber desig-nate- d

for cutting on NEWSWW, Lot
2 (SEWSWV.), NWWSEW, Lot 3
(SWMSEV4), Lot 4 (SEV4SEV4), of
Sec. 33 T 28 S R. 3 W., W. M.,
and Lot 3 (NEWNWW). Lot 4
(NWV4NWW) of Sec. 3, T. 29 S.,
R. 3 W., W. M., estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 2895 M.
fct Douglas fir, 95 M. feet Sugar
Pine, 150 M. feet Incense Cedar,
15 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 95
M. feet White Fir, 5 M. feet Hem-
lock. No bid for less than $21.55
per M. ft, B, M. for Douidas fir.
$29.90 per M. ft. B. M. for Sugar
Pine, $9.70 per M. ft. B. M. for
incense cedar, $6.20 per M. ft. B
M. for Western Red Cedar, $12.70
per M. ft. B. M. for White Fir,
$7.55 per M. ft. B. M. for Hem-
lock, or a total purchase price of
$68,020.00, will be considered. Min-
imum deposit with bid $6,805.00.
T. 28 S R. 4 W., W. M., Sec. 3,
all timber designated for cutting
on SWV4NWV4, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 655 M.
feet Douglas fir, 75 M. feet In-

cense Cedar. No bid for less than
$23.15 per M. ft. B. M. for Doug-
las fir, $11.40 per M. ft. B. M. for
Incense Cedar, or a total pur-
chase price of $16,018.25, will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $1,605.00. T. 29 S., R. 3 W. W.
M. Sec. 11, all timber designated for
cutting on SWV4 NEW, SV4 NWV4,
N'iSW'i, estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 1255 M. feet
Douglas fir, 100 M. feet Sugar
Pine, 10 M. feet Western Hemlock,
15 M. feet White fur, 80 M. feet
Incense Cedar, 5 M. feet Western
Red Cedar. No bid for less than
$21.70 per M. ft. B. M. for Doug-
las fir, $29.50 per M. ft. B. M. for
Sugar Pine, $7.10 per M. ft. B. M.
for Western Hemlock, $10.75 per M.
ft. B. M. for White Fir, $8.75 per
M. ft. B. M. for Incense Cedar,
$4.25 per M. ft. B. M. for Western
Red Cedar, or a total purchase
price of $31,137.00, will be con-
sidered. Minimum deposit with bid
$3,115.00. T. 31 S., R. 4 W., W. M
Sec. 21, all timber designated for
cutting on NV4NWV4, SWV4NWV4, es-

timated for the purpose of this
sale to be 2740 M. feet Douglas
fir, 15 M. feet Incense Cedar, 10
M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less
than $20.85 per M. ft. B. M. for
Douglas fir, $5.25 per M. ft. B. M.
for Incense Cedar, $6.75 per M. ft.

tor.
'51 DELUXE CHEVROLET i T pick-u-

undercoated, etc. 347 Ntwton
t. reen oaa. n.

Autos SMtr. Cycles 27

if '
BETTER

BUYS

M AT

BARCUS
EASY TERMS LIBERAL TRADES

50 PACKARD SEDAN, St H,
and O. D. .

49 BUICK Suoer Sedanttte. R St
H . - 1793

'49 CROSLEV STATION wagon.
cast iron block 885

'48 CROSLEV SEDAN

'48 CHEVROLET SEDAN,
condition ..,

'46 OLDS Cluo sedan, 6 cyl., R
H. A nice car and a real

value 1103

41 PLYMOUTH Super De-- t
luxe '47 Dodge motor, R &H,
extra clean

'40 OLDSMOBILE sedan

'40 FORD TUDOR

'40 DeSOTO Sedan, rebuilt motor..

'39 PLYMOUTH COUPE Real
good work ear

39 WILLYS SEDAN

'37 BUICK coupe

.. TRUCKS & PICKUPS
'50 INT. LWB truck. 31.000

actual miles. Top condition .... 1993

GMC Short lotf. dual drive, ready
to haul . 2395

'48 STUDEBAKtR pickup - 795

'47 FORD DUMP, GOOD tires,
ready for work

'48 FORD Cabover dump truck, a
sDeed axle, good tires. Only $363.
dn, full price 1095

BARCUS
YOUR PACKARD DEALER

OPEN SUNDAYS AND EVENINGS

Highway 99 N. at Garden Valley Rd.
Phone

REASONABLY PRICED OMAC TERMS

' CHEVROLET, BUICK, PONTIAC

CADILLAC TRADE-IN-

Hansen's
USED CAR CENTER

Rose tfc Oak

NASH
19.10 AMBASSADOR CUSTOM SEDAN,

Hydramatic, weather eye, 11,000
miles. Local owner.

$2095.00
- Ted Reed Motors

NASH

. Select Used Cars
321 W. Oak Ph.

Studebaker
CONVERTIBLE

1948 COMMANDER Regal Deluxe, over-
drive, radio, heater, white sidewalls,
leather upholstery. Only $1495.

TED REED MOTORS

NASH

SELECT USED CARS
321 W. Oak Ph.

Lockwood';

Used Cars
BEST BUYS ANYWHERE

1950 FORD TUDOR SEDAN 1845
19S0 FORD FORDOR SEDAN 17P5
1050 FORD COUPE 1443
1P4!) OLDSMOBILE SEDANETTE 1895
1949 FORD CONVERTIBLE 1343
1949 MERCURY FORDOR Sedan , 1H93
1949 FORD TUDOR S&DAN . 1295
1949 MFRCURY TUORD SEDAN .lf95
1949 MERCURY sedan 1545
1919 FORD FORDOR SF.DAN JW3
1949 FORD FORDOR SEDAN 1393
1949 LINCOLN COSMOPOLI

TAN Fordor Sedan, Fully
equipped 3495

1948 NASH CONVERTIBLE
COUPE 1245

1947 FORD TTDOR SEDAN. 13,000
actual mile. RAH 1138

11947 CHEVROLET CLI'B COUPE - 1193
7 CHEVROLET At.RO SEDAN 1UW5

1948 BUICK SEDANETTE 1245
1948 PONTIAC SEDANETTK 1195
1942 CHEVROLET FORDOR bb- -

DAN . 593
1941 Bt'ICK FORDOR SEDAN 640
1941 FORD TUDOR SEDAN 540

,. TRUCKS PICKUPS

1951 FORD H T. PICKUP 1493
1950 DOIX.E i, T. pickup Q 1.145
194 FORD j T pickup 1193
1949 STUDEBAKER dump truck IMS
1947 FORD DUMP TRUCK 995
Late model Ford tractor with hydraulic

coop and dual Urea $1093.

For Your Convenience We

Are Open Evenings frl 9
TERMS

Ph. 8. Stephens
FOR SALK BY OWNER 1931 Kaiser

deluxe sedan with overdrive,
radio, heater, visor, whit sidewall

tires. Ph.

The area of Italy is 119,800
square miles.

WANTED

Roieburg Dial

!Tfii.qra
HARRY WINTER, Dial

SERVICE STATION LEASE

Complete Station let up Including
grease racK, guns ana won. mrw
1000 gal. tanks St 2 pumpa. Thli
la a location on the Hlway In the
business district and will ihow a
good return. 2 yrs. to go on a
3 yr. renewable lease. All atock
at Inventory. Approx. B700. lease
at $125. per mo.

$925. DOWN
$4450. Full Price Thla la B Cedar

aningie noma onin acre piece oi
good earth that la on a ptved
road with city water. Tub St
shower complete a nice bathroom
and kentlle and fir floors are the

finish lor L.R., Bedroom and Kit-
chen. Double Oarage. Thla good
home needs some finishing but
most of the material la on the
ground and goes.

3 BEDROOMS
Thla beautiful home near Stewarts

Meadowa in West Roseburg la on
a paved street, the bus line and
close to the new Fullerton School,
grocery store, etc. The shake ex-

terior adda to the setting of a
bungalow, type Insulated, picture
window, good home, on one of
the cleanest newest streets In Rose
burg. Thla home has everything
including a down payment of
$5000. for a total price of $12,000,

$2000. DOWN
Full basement, S bedroom modern

home with a dining room aa well
as a good sized living room. This
nice kitchen is also wired for

electric range. Insulation helps the
wood furnace keep thla home snug

Ac easy. Tinted walls and hard-
wood floors gleam thruout the

hallwal anr other roome. The util-
ity room la good size and thla la
all covered with a new roof which
drains to the city sewer. Good
garage too. Thla la very close In,
to the business dlst and la well
worth the $10,000. with only 92000
down.

Real Estate

DIAL 2-26-
31

B. M. for Hemlock, or a total pur-
chase price of $57,275.25, will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $5,730.00. T. 31 S., R. 5 W.,
W. M Sec. 25, all timber desig-
nated for cutting on EVSEtt, esti-
mated for the purpose of this sale
to be 1440 M. feet Douglas fir, 5 M.
feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less
than $22.35 per M. ft. B. M. for
Douglas fir, $6.75 per M. ft. B. M.
for Incense Cedar, or a total pur-
chase price of $32,217.75, will be
considered. Minimum deposit with
bid $3,225.00.

JtNswvR.vIewd hat Rot been 1
i ctellverecj by 1
1 : I S pjn,, phone f

between
4:15 and 7 p.m. I

in Ihlf r,

Dominion
AUTOMATIC

POP-U-

TOASTER

Everybody likes
Icwill

Especially when
lt'e so easy to
make io uniformly good. Superb
styling and other line features
make this a better buy. For that

peclal occasion give thie beaur
.liful, practical Dominion Toaster.

iri another FAMILY. FAV0PJTS
featuied all

Douglas County

FARM BUREAU
COOPERATIVE EXCHANGE

ROSEBURG, OREGON

DIAL

Located W. Washington it.

TMf III.Y.11-- 1

copb. ii bv srnvicr, mc t. m ato

Notices 31

I WILL NOT BE RESPONSIBLE for any
bills contracted by anyone other than
myself. Mollie M. Fountaine.

LEGAL

TIMBER SALE
TIMBER FOR SALE, UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
INTERIOR, BUREAU OF LAND
MANAGEMENT. Timber marked,
o r otherwise designated for
cutting, as noted hereafter, will be
offered for sale by ORAL AUC-
TION bid starting at 9:30 a.m.,
PACIFIC STANDARD TIME, on
August 22, 1951 by an authorized
representative of the Bureau of
Land Management, located a t
Room 206, Post Office Building,
Roseburg, Oregon. Information
concerning the conditions of sale,
including such items as the qual-
ifications of bidders, the procedure
for submitting bids, the amount of
the initial deposit and subsequent
payments, the kind and amount of
bond, operating restrictions and
the availability of access, should
be obtained prior to the sale from
the Regional Administrator, B

of Land Management, Build-

ing No. 1, Swan Island, Portland,
18, Oregon, or from Bureau of
Land Management Forest District
Offices. The volumes given below
are standing timber estimates. IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY: OREGON:
UUUIrLAd MAKim I IINU AKCAI
T. 22 S., R. 4 W., W. M., Sec. 9,
all timber designated for cutting
on SWSW1,, estimated for the pur-

pose of this sale to be 1100 M.
feet Douglas fjr, 220 M. feet White
Fir, 40 M. feet Western Red Cedar,
55 M. feet Incense Cedar, 10 M.
feet Hemlock. No bid for less than
$25.20 per M. ft. B. M. for Doug-
las fir, $12.90 per M. ft. B. M. for
White Fir, $10.40 per M. ft. B. M.
for Western Red Cedar and In-

cense Cedar, $9.50 per M. ft. B. M.
for Hemlock, or a total purchase
price of $31,641.00, will be consid-
ered. Minimum deposit with bid
$3,165.00. T. 25 S., R. 3 W., W. M
Sec. 29, all timber designated for
cutting on Lots 7 and 8 (SWNEV4),
Lot 1 (NEV4NEV4), estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be 4270

M. feet Douglas fir, 35 M. feet
white Fir, 40 M. feet Incense
Cedar, 65 M. feet Western Red
Cedar, 25 M. feet Hemlock. No bid
for less than $27.10 per M. ft. B. M.
for Douglas fir, $13.25 per M. ft.
B. M. for White Fir, $10.25 per M.
ft. B. M. for Incense Cedar, $11.25
per M. ft. B. Mi for Western Red
Cedar, $9.70 per M. ft. B. M. for
Hemlock, or a total purchase price
of $117,564.50, will be considered.
Minimum deposit with bid

T. 2B S., R. 8 W., W. M.,
See. 21, all timber designated for
cutting on NWWSWVs, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
825 M. feet Douglas fir, 70 M. feet
White Fir, 15 M. feet Incense Ce-

dar, 5 M. feet Western Red Cedar,
5 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less
than $23.45 per M. ft. B. M. for
Douglas fir. $13.50 per M. ft. B. M.
for White Fir, $11.50 per M. ft.
B. M. for Incense Cedar, $7.00 per
M. ft. B. M. for Western Red Ce-

dar, $10.25 per M. ft B. M. for
Hemlock, or a total purchase pi ice
of $20,550.00. will be considered.
Minimum deposit with b I d
$2,060.00. T. 28 S R. 8 W. W. M.,
Sec. 27, all timber designated lor
cutting on WWNEW, NW'a esti-

mated for purpose of this sale
to be 3380 M. feet Douglas fir,
205 M. feet Incense Cedar, 180 M.
feet White Fir, 15 M. feet West-

ern RedCedar. No bid for less
than $24,85 per M. ft. B. M. for
Douglas fir, $11.40 per M. ft. B. M.
for Incense Cedar, $13.40 per M.
ft. B. M. for white Fir, $6.90 per
M. ft. B, M. for Western Red

Cedar, or a total purchase price
of $88,845.50, will be considered.
Minimum deposit with bid
$8,885.00. T. 29 S R. W., W. M.,
Sec. 19, all timber designated for
cutting on SWV.SEVi, estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be 1005

M. feet Douglas fir, 10 M. feet
Incense Cedar. No bid for less than
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Running a Classified Ad

Everyday is

Sure to bring you

Unusual results and '

Lots of Good

Timely customers and

Sales as well!

SELL IT!

RENT IT!

INQUIRE ABOUT IT TODAY!

BUY NOW

SAVE THIS WINTER!

IMMEDIATE DELIVERY

o 6lnch Green Wood
o Planer Ends

STOCK UP NOW BE ASSURED OF FAST,o
o DEPENDABLE HEAT DURING THE COLD WINTER

MONTHS!
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ISO I Rtir'Ai)a.il .... ;ut' .oiiingen33 Ranch, rh - n 's Bros., and
Edward O. Kohlhagen.

$100 REWARD OFFERED

Reward of 1100. offered for Information
leading to the arrest and conviction
of the person or persons who broke
Into my houso located on th South

lido of tho Callahan Road on mil

from Doerner Cut Off on tho evening
f July 4, 1031, and who stole 22

Winchester rifle, aerial No 87831
E.Q
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SUPPORT THE INDUSTRY THAT SUPPORTS YOU!
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