
Thurt., Oct. 27, 1949-Th- e Newt-Revie- Roseburg, Ore. 11pose of this sale to be 225 M. feet
.branded Douglas fir, 20 M. feet
sound Douglas fir snags, 20 M.
feet dead and down Douglas fir.

iNo bid for less than $3.90 per M.
Jdar, or a total purchase price ot pose of this sale to be 300 M. feet

"lied Doill-la-. fir fcf fnnl fitmAwin ne consinerco
iSEALED BIO: SALVAGE SALE: Incense Cedar. No bid for lea
SOUTH UMPQUA MARKETING man Sb.so per M. ft. B. M. lor the

felled Douglas fir, $4.30 per M. ft,n HA In. tk fAlll I
AREA: T. 29 S.. R. 4 W.. W. M

u. ... .mt icii.ru
Idar, or a total purchase price of

Sec. 33, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on Por.
N1NW1, estimated for the pur ai.iiso.su, win oe considered.

iXic"rd,n

fjy Traa Surgtry
SiiVlSSS Nursery Stock

PHONE 1712-- J

; JACK MAY
Landscape Company

40 years experience it your
guarantee

Britain Protests Talk

Of U. S. Committiontr
LONDON', Oct. 26 .T Brit-

ain has protested to the United
States that statements made by
High Commissioner John J. Mo
Cloy are seriously harming west-
ern policies in Germany.

Diplomatic officials who re-

ported this today said McCloy is
going back to Washington early
next week for special talks with
Secretary of State Acheson.

In Washington, government of-

ficials reported the British are
"annoyed" at McCloy'a recent
marks on dismantling of Ger-
man plants. However, they pic-
tured it as a "tempest In a tea-

pot" and predicted the affair will
be straightened out amicably.

ft. B. M. for the branded Doug-
las fir, $2.50 per M. ft. B. M. tor

;the sound Douglas fir snags, $3.S0
per M. ft. B. M. for the dead and

'down Douglas fir, or a total pur-- !

chase price of $1,005.50, will lie
considered. SEALED BID: DOUG-
LAS MARKETING AREA: T. 23
S U. 4 W., W. M Sec. 3. all mer-
chantable timber designated for
cutting on Por. NiNVVl, estl-- i
muted for the purpose of this
sale to be 535 M. feci Douglas fir,

opened at 2:00 P. M PACIFIC;
STANDARD TIME, on November

It, 14, for the purchase of all
merchantable timber designated

;for cutting upon tracts hereinafter
described as SEALED BID. ORAL
AUCTION BIOS will be received;
by the District Forester at his of--1

fice located at Room 206, Post
Office Building. Roseburg. Ore--

igon. at J:00 P. M., PACIFIC;
STANDARD TIME on November
7, 14, on those tracts of timber
hereinafter described under
ORAL AUCTION BID. Any
sealed bids on tracts so advertised
and accompanied by the required
deposit received by the District
Forester prior to the start of the
oral auction bidding, will be con-
sidered the equivalent of an oral
bid and will be posted for the in- -

formation of all bidders. To quail-- 1

fv for oral auction bidding, the
bidder must submit to the officer
in charge of the sale, prior to the

(beginning of the auction de-- ,

posit In the amount as hereinafter
rponired. If an oral bid is de

at designated for each tract
Delow In accordance with

the Orders of the Secretary of the
Interior, No, 2283, and No. 23K0
to 2390, Intl., dated December 11,
1946 and November 29, 1947, re-
spectively. The United States has
bv agreement been given the
right to authorize its purchaser
to use certain roads and rights-of-wa- y

for the removal of timber.
Each bidder should ascertain
from the respective District

office the location of the
road right-of-wa- covered by such
agreement relating to the tract
upon which he wishes to bid. It is
the bidder's responsibility to de-

termine for himself the extent to
which such agreement will per-
mit the use of the road or right-of-wa- y

subject to the payment of
reasonable compensation to the
assignor of the United States,
further information, including
special contract clauses, standard
contract form, bid forms and
schedules of contract payments
may be obtained at District Of-
fices of the Bureau of Land
Management, located at Salem.

covered by such agreement relat-
ing to the tract upon which he
wishes to bid. It is the bidder's
responsibility to determine for
himself the extent to which such
agreement will permit the use of
the road or right-of-wa- subject
to the payment of reasonable
compensation to the assignor of
the United States. The right is
hereby reserved to waive techni-
cal defects in the advertisement;
to reject all bids, or to award the
timber for the amount of the
highest bid to the next highest
qualified bidder when the officer
authorized to approve the con-
tract shall deem the high biduer
unqualified to fulfill the contrac-
tual requirements of the adver-
tisement. All tracts advertised for
sale for whUh no bid is received
on the sale date may be sold on
the 30th day after the sale date to
bidders offering the highest mice
during the thirty day interim. In
no case will the timber be sold for
less than the appraised price.
Further Information, including
copies of the form of contract,
bid forms and schedules of con-
tract payments may be obtained
at District Offices of the Bureai
of Land Management, located at
Salem, Eugene, Roseburg, oos
Bay and Medford. Oregon, or at
the office of the Regional Admin

it) M. Icet Incense Ledar. No old
for less than $2.55 per M. ft. B.
M. for the Douglas fir. $2.30 per
M. ft. B. M. for the Incenso Ce- -

LEGAL KOTICCS

Koseburg, Coos Bay, and
Medford, Oregon, or at the office 1T- m k'X'of the Regional Administrilor,
Building I, Swan Island, Portland is to . . .18, Oregon. Dated at Portland.

( GARDEN GROWN )
r IN OREGON! )

f Ifi- - ,,oeeo" If 1

Oregon, this 21st day of October,
1949. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY:
OREGON: ORAL AUCTION
BID: SALVAGE SALE: DOUG
LAS MARKETING AREA: T. 28
S., R. 8 W.. VV. M., Sec. 31. all
merchantable timber designated

The champs-a- re k

beverages! They are re-

freshing aa a mountain
pool . . . bubbling over with

r. Hurry ... get

clared to be high at the closing
'of the auction, the bidder must
immediately confirm the bid by
submitting it In duplicate on the
regular Bureau of Land Manag-

ement bid proposal form. The cut-

ting and removal of the timber
shall be carried out in accord-
ance with the forest practice rules
approved on July 7, 1938 by the

'Secretary of the Interior. Each
Ibid must state the amount per
thousand feet, board measure,
that will be paid for each species,
the total consideration which will
be paid for the timber and a
statement that the bidder w ill com-

ply with local manufacturing re-

quirements as hereinafter stated.
No bid for less than the appraised
value will be considered. Each
sealed bid must be submitted In

duplicate and be accompanied by
a deposit. The deposit must be In
cash or in the form of a certified
check on a solvent bank and in
favor of the Treasurer of the

tor cutting on the SWtNWt. and
N1SWI. estimated for the pur- -

--Tii tin

ta tA. nnt fttybody likes

Notice of Timber Sale
ORAL AUCTION BIDS, will

be received by the District For-
ester, Bureau of Land Manage-
ment, Region 1, at his office
located at Room 206, Post Of-

fice Building, Roseburg, Ore.
at 2:00 P. M., PACIFIC STAND-
ARD TIME, on November 7,
1849, for the purchase of all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting upon tracts herein-
after described. The cutting and
removal of the timber shall be
carried out in accordance with
the forest practice rules approved
on July 7, 1938 by the Secretary
of the Interior. Each bid must
state the amount per thousand
feet, board measure, that will be
paid for each species, the total
consideration which will he paid
for the timber and a statement
that the bidder will comply with
local manufacturing require-
ments as hereinafter stated. No
bid for less than the appraised
value will be considered. Each
sealed bid must be submitted in
duplicate and be accompanied by
a deposit. The deposit must be
in cash or In the form of a certi-
fied check on a solvent bank and
In favor of the Treasurer of the
United States. The amount of the
deposit will be at least 20 of
the first $1,000 of the appraised
value of the timber: an additional
10'" of the next $9,000; an addi-
tional 5 of the amount between
$10,000 and $100,000; and addi-
tional 3"o of anv amount in ex-

cess of $100,000. 'The deposit will
be returned to unsuccessful bid-

ders; applied as a part of the pur-
chase price of the high bidder;
or that portion of the deposit
representing the minimum re-

quired by law shall be retained as
liquidated damages if the high
bidder does not execute contract
and furnish satisfactory bond
within thirty days of acceptance
of the bid or cannot furnish evi-

dence of his ability to comply
with the local marketing require-
ments. In sales over $5,000. and
in small sales when required, tne
high bidder will be required io
furnish a sworn financial state-
ment, showing ability to fulfill
the terms of the contract. A bond
on all sales will be required in
an amount computed at the rate
of at least 15 per cent of the oid
price. Payment for timber will be
required In advance of cutting,
payment In full at the time of
filing the contract being required
in sales amounting to $5,000 or
less. In larger sales, the Regional

V(ATl

istrator, Building No. 1, Swan is-

land, Portland 18, Oregon. Dated
at Portland, Oregon, this 7th day
of October, 1949. IN DOUGLAS
COUNTY: DOUGLAS MARKET-
ING AREA: T. 20 S., R. 7 W
W. M., Sec. 33, all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
Por. NWiNEi, All NlNWt, Por.
SWJNWJ, Por. SEINWI.

for the purpose of this sale
to be 2420 M. feet Douglas fir. 135
M. feet Hemlock, 50 M. feet West-
ern Red Cedar. No bid for less
than $6.30 per M. ft. B. M. for
the Douglas fir, $2.50 per M. ft.
B. M. for the Hemlock. $2.30 per
M. ft. B. M. for the Western Red
Cedar, or a total purchase price
of $15,698.50, will be considered.
T. 21 S., R. 8 W W. M.. Sec 3,
all merchantable timber desig-
nated for cutting on Por Lot 4
(NW1NWD. All SWINWi. P.jr.
SEJSE1, estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to he 2655 M.
feet Douglas fir, 10 M. feet In-

cense Cedar, 5 M. feet Western
Red Cedar, 30 M. feet Hemlock.
No bid for less than $5.85 per M.
ft. B. M. for the Douglas fir,
$2.30 per M. ft. B. M. for the In-

cense Cedar and Western Red
Cedar, $2.50 per M. ft. B. M. for
the Hemlock, or a total purchase
price of $15,641.25, will be con-
sidered. T. 29 S., R. 9 W., W. M..
Sec 15, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on Por. Lot
2 INWJNEJI, Por. Lot 3 INM
NWtl. All Lot 4 (NWtNWJI,
Por. SJNWj, Por. NW1SWJ,

for the purpose of this sale
to be 3480 M. feet Douglas fir. 545
M. feet dead Douglas fir. 185 M.
feet Hemlock. 90 M. feet Western
Red Cedar, 450 M. feet Port

Cedar. No bid for less than
$11.75 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Douglas fir, $2.50 per M. ft. B. M.
for the Hemlock and dead Doug-
las fir, $2.30 per M. ft. B. M. for
the Western Red Cedar. $14.00
per M. ft. B. M. for the Port

Cedar, or a total purchase
price of $49,222.00, will be con-
sidered. T. 29 S., R. W, W. M.,
Sec. 31, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on the
SE1NEJ, NEJSWi, NiSEl, Por.
SiSEt, estimaled for the purpose
of this sale to be 3920 M. feet
Douglas fir, 320 M. feet While fir,
25 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid
for less than $3.50 per M. ft. B.
M. for the Douglas fir, $2.50 per
M. ft. B. M. for the White fir
and Incence Cedar, or a total pur-
chase price of $14,582.50, w ill be
considered.

Perfect Color Matching
i Regular Paint Prices

All Paint Finish
All Can Sixes . . . from
' pint to a gallon
No Waiting . . , buy any
color right over the
counter
Same Color Again ...
any time you want it

B0YSEE3

PABNTSU
Tru Lite 19 qt.
TruGlo 1.43 qt.
Outside Paint ...1.4S qt.
Quick Dry Enamel 1 89 qt.
Tru Tone 1.2 qt.
TruKote 1.15 qt.

Plus 25c to 30c for the Colorizer
tube.

Cost variea with different colors.

ROSEBURG
Cabinet & Supply

440 N. Jackson Phone 303

United States. The amount or the
deposit will be at least 20' of the
first $1,000 of the appraised value
of the limber: additional 10' of
the next $9,000; an additional 5
of the amount between $10,000
and $100,000; and additional 37r
of any amount in excess of
$100,000. The deposit will be re-

turned to unsuccessful bidders;
applied as a part of the purchase
price of the high bidder; or that
portion of the deposit represent-
ing the minimum required by
law shall be retained as liqui-
dated damages If the high bidder
does not execute contract and
furnish satisfactory bond within
thirty days of acceptance of the
bid or cannot furnish evidence of
his ability to comply with the
local marketing requirements. In
sales over $5,000, and in small
sales when required, the high bid-

der will be required to furnish a
sworn financial statement show-

ing ability to fulfill the terms of
the contract. A bond on all sales
will be required In an amount
computed at the rate of at least 15

per cent of the bid price. Payment
for timber will be required in ad-

vance of cutting, payment In full
at the time of filing the contract
being required in sales amounting
to $.1,000 or less. In larger sales,
the Regional Administrator may
permit payment in a number of
installments. The right is hereby
reserved to waive technical de-

fects in the advertisement; to re-

ject all bids, or to award the tim-
ber for the amount of the highest
bid to the next highest qualified

LIMITED TIME OFFER!

$1.29 VALUE FOR ONLY 59c
6 Libby Sofedge Glasses ond Decanter with purchase
of two cartons Royal Crown, Nehi or 4 bottles of
PAR-T-PA- .

NEHI BEVERAGE COMPANY
BEST SELLER try Hmm .th p.pular r.rt.r
AT GROCERS p -- Sp09h.nl, H.nw-My- l.

EVERYWHERE m?.n- - ",L,-- ' ''nd SMihtll macaroni.

Administrator may permit pay-
ment in a number of installments.
Timber sold in accordance with
this advertisement must be manu-
factured within the marketing
area as designated for each tract

AT N
EXTRA
COST!

bidder when the officer author-
ized to approve the contract shall
deem the high bidder unqualified
to fulfill the contractual require-
ments of the advertisement. All
tracts advertised for sale for
which no bid is received on the
sale date may be sold on the 30th
dav after the' sale date to bidders

hereinafter described In aeeorii-anc-

with the Orders of the Secre-

tary of the Interior. No. 22S5, and
Nos. 2380 to 2390. Incl., dated
cember 11, 1946 and November 29.

Notice Of Timber Sale
SEALED BIOS, marked outside

1947, respectively. The united
States has hv agreement been
given the right to authorize its
purchasers to use certain roads
and rights-of-wa- for the removal
of timber. Each bidder should as

offering the highest price during
the thirty day Interim. In no case
will the timber be sold for less
than the appraised price. Timber
sold in accordance with this ad-- ;

vertisempnt must be manufac-
tured within the marketing area

"Bid for Timber," and addressed
to the Regional Administrator,
Bureau of Land Management,
Region I, Room 131, Building No.

Il, Swan Island, Portland 18, Ore-- '
gon, will be received until and

certain from the respective t

Forester's office, the loca-
tion of the road or right-of-wa-1stus

SMALL WHITE I" All . --:M

BEANS 2-!- b. pkg. 25c
LONG GRAINKm RICE 2-l- b. pkg. 35c

MUUli. IJ . . . . SPOON IN PACKAGE 29cMtU WHEAT HcAKTS
'ONI

IN IVIST AH1P CREAM botjIe TOP 1 tablespoon and 1 teaspoon5P23c REDDI-WI- Pncoi or

BOTTOM V4 teaspoon and ',4 teaspoon

SKIPPY PEANUT BUTTER m 31c
c LI

nvfiEasTOVvasM31cJELLY KERR'S,
12-0- 1. GLASS 2Jsl NOW PACKED IN EVERY BOX OF

HI-H-
Q CRACKERS t, pko 25c

BEST FOODS MAYONNAISE or. 69c
ALL-B-R

Get yours todayTIDE 25cLARGE PACKAGE

lack of bulk in the diet( enjoy a bowlful of Kellogg'a
all-bra-n every Hay. And drink plenty of water.
Delicious natural laxative food!

HURRYI Get your ai.l-bs.a- n measuring spoon
now. Supply is limited. Visit your grocer quick! Offer
made by Kellogg'a of Battle Creek, Mich.OATMEAL 69c

Flush radiator odd
anti- - freeze

Check thermostat

Change to winter
lubrication

Tune engine
Check battery
Check brakes

Check hearer and
defrosters

BAG

while the supply lasts!
YOURSI Accept this measuring spoon now in every
package of delicioua Kcllogg'a ai.i.-bba-

MODIRNI All apoon measuring sizes in one! Table-
spoon and teaspoon on one side! and
quarter-teaspoo- n on other aide. Handier than 4 separate
spoons. Waah.es easily, quickly. Acidproof!

Offer made to acquaint you with the sweeter-tastin- g

and crispier Kellogg a aix-hfa- n of today! Use ai.i.-bra-

and measuring spoon to make mulhns everybody love8
Light! Tender! Kecipe on ai.l-bra- n box.

Laxative, too! If suffering from constipation due to

UMPOUA CHIEF FLOUR 5 3.39
Giant

Siie

Borene

VEGETABLES AND FRUITS

BANANA SQUASH lb. 2c
CABBAGE, solid heads lb. 2c
PUMPKINS lb. 4c
CRANBERRIES lb. 25c

79cBesfSewce
Costs Less Prices Effective Friday and Saturday

31

oh Franks (Grocery
Cats end Stephens FREE DELIVERY Phone 118 "

L0CKW00D MOTORS
V
fiose and Oak Phsna 80


