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Committee Heads For Lions Named;
Talks By State Sanitarians Heard Fruits and Vegetables

IN THE COUNTY COURT OF THB
STATE Or OREGON rOR THE

COUNTY OF DOUGLAS
PUBLICATION OF

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
In the Matter oi the Estate

of
JAKE ROBBINS. Deceased.

Notice li hereby given that 8. H.
Robblni hai been appointed and hat
qualified as the administrator of the
abova entitled estate. AU person! hav-
ing claims against the estate should
present them with proper vouchers to
the said administrator at the office of
Avery W. Thompson, attorney at law.
203 Douglas County State Bank Build-
ing, Roseburg, Oregon, within six 141

months from the date of this notice.
Dated this loth day of June. 1949.

S. H. ROBBINS, Adminis-
trator of the abova entitled
estate.

Data of first publication June 10, 1940.
Data of last publication July 8, 1849.

ed a report on his experience at
Beaver Boys State at Oregon

nil Red Cedar, or a total pur
chase price of $25,228.25, will be
considered.- The contract for
sale of this timber will contain
special requirements for the pro
tection oi tne hock tree fisn
Hatchery, of the Oregon State
Game commission, Details re
garding these requirements can
be obtained from the District
Forester, Roseburg, Oregon, or
from the Regional Administrator,
Bureau of Land Management,
T. 30 S., R. 7 W., W.M., Sec. 17,
all merchantable timber desig
nated for cutting on por. SJNEt,
por. NEJSW1, all SEaSWl, SEI,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 1185 M. feet Douglas
fir, 410 M. feet branded Ponder-os- a

Pine, 85 M. feet branded
Sugar Pine. 15 M. feet White Fir,
60 M. feet Incense Cedar. No
bid for less than $4.65 per M. ft.
B.M. for the Douglas fir, $14.55
per M. ft. B.M. for the branded
Ponderosa Pine, $19.90 per M.
ft. B.M. for the branded Sugar
Pine, $2.80 per M. ft. B.M. for
the White Fir. $2.50 per M. ft.
B.M. for the Incense Cedar, or a
total purchase price of $13,359.25,
will be considered. SOUTH UMP
QUA MARKETING AREA: T. 32
S., R. 1 W W.M., Sec. 3, all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on por. SEiSWi, all
NISEI, por. SWiSE, all SEiSEi,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 6295 M. feet Douglas
fir, 25 M. feet branded Sugar
Pine, 160 M. feet White Fir, 160
M. feet Incense Cedar, 10 M. feet
Hemlock. No bid for less than
$6.25 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Douglas fir, $20.40 per M. ft. B.M.
for the branded Sugar Pine, $3.00
per M. ft. B.M. for the White
Fir, $2.30 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Incense Cedar, $2.50 per M. ft.
B.M. for the Hemlocks or a total
purchase price of $40,726.75, will
be considered. SEALED BID: IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY: DOUGLAS
MARKETING AREA: SALVAGE
SALE: T. 30 S., R. 9 W., W.M.,
Sec. 3, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on por.
SISWi, all SISEi, estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be
1770 M. feet Douglas fir, 315 M.
feet Douglas fir, 110
M. feet White Fir, 10 M. feet
Hemlock, 5 M. feet Port Orford
Cedar, 10 M. feet branded Sugar
Pine, 45 M. feet Incense Cedar,
10 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than $6.15
per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas
fir, $1.50 per M. ft. B.M. for the

d Douglas fir and
Incense Cedar, $2.50 per M.

ft. B.M. for the White Fir, Hem-
lock, and Incense Cedar, $15.00
per M. Ft. B.M. for the Port
Orford Cedar, $22.40 per M. ft.
B.M. for the branded Sugar Pine,
or a total purchase price of
$12,084.50, will be considered.
80UTH UMPQUA OR JOSE-
PHINE MARKETING AREAS:
T. 31 S., R. 3 W W.M., Sec. 29,
all merchantable timber designat-
ed for cutting on the NEJ, NEl-NW-

por. WiNWJ, all SE1NW1,
NEiSWJ, por. WiSWJ, por. SEi-
SWl, all 'SEi, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 7980
M. ieet Douglas fir, 770 M. Ieet
branded Ponderosa Pine, 85 M.
feet branded Sugar Pine, 940 M.
feet Incense Cedar, 175 M. feet
White Fir, 65 M. feet Hemlock.
No bid for less than $7.65 per
M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas fir,
$16.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the
branded Ponderosa Pine, $23.00
per M. it. B.M. for the branded
Sugar Pine, $3.50 per M. ft. B.M.
for the Incense Cedar and Hem-
lock, Si.SO per M. ft. B.M. for
the White Fir, or a total purchase
price of $79,592.00, will be

Boysenberries
tlVtC LB You pick, orderi filled. WOO

flat Pnone nui Meyer, iva
mile west lxxm.nggiasa attire.

CHERRIES are rip
now. ideal tor canning; ana ior mara-
schino cherries, Will give reel pa. 8c lb.
A. Rom, MTQCKway.

LAMBERT, ROYAL ANNE, and Blng
cherriei; 4c you pick. Bring contain
ed!. 3a miiea a. ULxonviiie. win. a.
uauey.

RASPBERRIES. NTCTARBERRIES,
Ynunsberriei. Blackberries for sale.
To place order, call or contact
r. l. Mattnewi, uaraen vauey.

NECTAR BERRIES ARE ready. You
Phone out of order. C. B.Sick. 4 mllea E. of Dlxonville.

FOR SALE Lambert and Blng cherriei.
4c lb. Good picking. So, Deer Creek
Koaa. if. v. nauieia.

LAMBERT CHERRIES, you pick, 9c lb.
Argot Fisher on n Val
ley oaa.

CHERRIES You pick. Blngs and Royal
Annes, 6c. E. L, Church, 3 miles .X.
Dlxonville. Phone

FwFRRIES YOU PICK. 5c lb. Also fry-
en. 2nd house back of Tenmlle
Church. Rami.

FOR SALE Cherries. Blng, Lamberts,
any amount Sunray Orchard, Galley
Hoaa, myrtle

RASPBERRIES 93.30 m flat delivered In
town. Bert Gilbert, Melrose Bt. Box
103. fnone buo-- h or i.

BOYSENBERRIES, X2V,c per pound. You
pick. 6 miles south on 99 at Harry
winiion i.

CANNING CHERRIES, Royal Annei,
RIfisTr Orders nicked or you nick.
Alien Tuiniu, i mi.es west or auintnin.

FOR SALE Pickling cucumbers, fresh
dill. Phone Calkins Road, Box
169.

FOR SALE Ripe pie cherries at 5c lb.
You pick. Bill Stutsman. Winston.

Poultry
Baby Chicks

Hamps, Reds, Crosses. Every week In
the year. Best of breeding. Pullorum
patsea. ,

Hatching Eggs Wanted
Year around market.

City agent, Douglas Co. Flour Mill

Carr's Hatchery
Look inff glass Rt Phone

Chicks Chicks
New Hamnihlre chicks all year around.

Day old and started from our PULL
ORUM PASSED IlOCKB. mCCd 10 Mil.

Wanted New Hamp hatching eggs, Year
arouna mantel, uur mono u o serve

Ponton Hatchery
1440 Harvard Ave.

West Roseburg
Phone 168

FOR SALE New Hampshire pullets
ready to lay. H. L. Lander, 2nd road
west, south of Kelly a Korner.

LARGE WHITE fryers. Turn right at
Meirose store ivi mnes. u. it. ,

Melrose Route. Box 318--

HENS, REASONABLE price. Call

NEW HAMPSHIRE FRYERS for sale.
Mrs. Alton Kice, uinara. rn.

FRYERS FOR SALE. Maurice F. Weber.
Rt. 1. Box 17B.

Farm Equipment
Used Tractors

1948 Ford tractor.
1943 John Deere model B.
1940.Farmall model A.
7' I. H. C. field disc harrow.
7' Cover Crop disc harrow.
3 bottom 12" i. h. tractor piow.
6' Oliver disc harrow. $40.

UMPQUA TRACTOR CO.
Ford Tractor Dealers

SMALL COMBINE for sale. T. E. Beall.
a miles out on N. umpqua noaa.
Phone

TOR SALE BINDER In good working
conaiuon wnen lasi usea; also rorn- -

son tractor. Phil Nachter, Melrose.
WILL TRADE Montgomery Ward small

size nay ana grain cnopper xor nay.
L. M. Tankersley, Brockway.

CALCUTTA DINNER SET
The annual Calcutta dinner for

members of the Rosebure Coun
try Club and their
guests will be held at 7 o'clock
Saturday night, July 9, at the
clubhouse. Reservations for the
dinner must be made by telephon-
ing

Use mint leaves lavishly to
give cool fragrance to summer
dishes and beverages. Top a dish
of sweetened raspberries with
the leaves; add them to a glass
of orange or lemonade;
chop them and add to buttered
carrots for a new flavor touch.

...$6,984,107.83

officers' checks, etc.).... 63,798.56
$6,733,277.57

19,242.50

Including subordinated
t, sasu.u (

ACCOUNTS
$ 100,000.00

100,000.00
31,587.76

... .. $ 231,587.76

CAPITAL ACCOUNTS..$6,984,107.83

secure liabilities and

Autos

LockwoocTs
USED CARS

Best Buys
Anywhere

1949 Ford Cuit Tdr.
9500 ml.

1948 Chev. Conv.
run only 12000 ml.

1947 Chev. Club Coupe
extra good.

1947 Ford Tdr.
equipped with everything.

1946 Ford Fordor
Priced to sell.

1946 Ford Tdr.
Clean as a pin.

1948 Ford Sta. Wag.
Excellent.

1941 Ford Tdr.
Fair.

1941 Ford Tdr.
Extra good.

1941 Ford Coupe
Bargain priced.

1940 Ford Coupe
Bargain priced.

1938 Plymouth Coup
Priced to sell.

1936 Plymouth Coups
All new tires.

Easy Terms

LOCKWOOD
MOTORS

LockwoocTs
Pickups &

Trucks
1947 Ford Pickup. 995.09
1947 Ford Pickup. 595.09
194S Ford Pickup. . 695.00
1948 Willys Pickup. 1195.09
1941 Ford truck . 400.00
1941 Ford Dump .. . 445.09
1937 Ford Flatbed 275.00
1941 Dodge School Bus . 1095.09
1945 Ford Tanalong with

with rolls 1995.09

Terms To Suit

LOCK-WOO- D

MOTORS
'47 STUDE COUPE, like new. less than

7,000 miles. Phone 646-- or

Financial

F. H. A.
Loans

BUILDERS
BUYERS

SELLERS
See:

UMPQUA REALTY
Across from Post Office on Highway P9
112 N. Stephens Ph. 1533-- J

Financial
Large or small sums placed with us

firoduce above average earnings. All
In first mortgage loans

on improved Douglas County proper-
ty. Investigate our monthly savings
Jian. Dividend credited July lst

Umpqua Savings &

Loan Association

WANTED TO BORROW, J1250. Give
first mortgage and 6 Interest. Box
910,

Trucks
'43 G. M. C. 6x6, short log or lumber

truck. Bunks and rolls, cab guardand apron. Ready to work. Less than
$1,000. Phone Hoy Buell,Look Inggl ass Rt.

'47 CHEVROLET log truck, dual axle
trailer. Good shape and good rubber.
Priced to sell quickly.Box 909.

11946 INTERNATIONAL pickup; 1 v
104R lntirn.llnn.1 nli... 'li- -
axle niltniT trailer fnr lnrA.M.,1..

itv ana Ave. SQUtn.
FOR SALE WB28 White truck andtrailer with Job, reasonable terms.

See Don Witcher. Rt. 1, Box 149--

evenings or Phone l.

'38 FORD ton panel. $400, good
$230 cash. Myrtle Creek Laun-

dry.
FOR SALE 21 ft. Fruehauf Tandem

trailer and '32 Dodge truck, with '47
Chryslerjpotor. $800. Terms. 412 Floed.

FOR SALE 1937 Ford sedan deliveryAce Electric, 316 E. 2nd Ave N.
Phone 1095--

AXLE SHAFTS, for all makes of trucks;
Ray's Truck Shop. 2055 N. Stephens.Phone

--

Machinery For Sale
DON'T BUY DIESEL POWER Till you-'ve seen Gilkey Gulberson single 150 4

250 b.h.p.
DUAL UNIT, 0 b.hp.
? M. C. Gray marine dleiels, 165 h...3 HYSTER straddle buggies. large.FACTORY TRAINED MECHANICS, com-

plete stock of parts. Oregon's onlyreliable Gulberson dealer.

Gilkey Diesel Sales
523 N. Jackson

FOR SALE LeTourneau Angle dozer.
Lu,ilt,leic wan irom end P.C.U. forD8 cat Lee Mortensen, 200 S. Pine.Phone

.'"----- - - uu timuum niwi.ru
Business Opportunities
NEIGHBORHOOD GROCERY with beer

P8""" doing a good business. New
building, new equipment. Property,stock equipment, all for $9,000. $5,000down. See Truman Ellis at store on
Cedar St. in Riverside Addition.

COUNTRY STORE for sale. Good com- -
asonaoie.

BOX 89".
FOR LONti TERM LEASE, city highway

npi,uumiHiy 2UU Xt MeWS- -
oox eon.

MOTOR COURT for sale. Call

Fuel
Wood

FIREPLACE, stove and furnace, green"'' core, mm, ana nara
woodi Special tengths. Prompt deliv-
ery. Claude Wllley, Rt 1. Box 43. Ph.or

SAWDUST
It" MILL WOOD

CO.
Prompt DeliveryPhone 128

Dogs

Pedigreed Chow Chow

Puppies For Sals
colors: black, tan and cream

1. T. L1LLARD, 709 RIDGEVIEW
fnone 1021 Y

Jacob's Kennel's Ph. 73-6-

Representative Geddes
Representative Paul Geddes,

speaking at the monthly meeting
of the Oregon State Employes
Association Thursday night, ex-

plained the function, Importance
and value of lobbyists at the
State Legislature. ,

This was preliminary to his
interesting and helpful discussion
of the manner in which O. S. E.
A. presented its program at the
last legislative session. "The

period following
Geddes' talk brought out some
matters of great Interest to the
organization," president Ross
Newcomb declared.

Durine the business meetln?.
Article X of the pertain-
ing to the welfare fund, was
amended. It was decided to hold
the annual picnic on Aug. 7, at
tne itoa & uun uwo grounds at
wincnesier.

Vlsltlno Teddie and Ardith
Anderson, children of Mr. and
Mrs. Shopp of Newport, are visit
ing tneir uncles ana aunts, Mr.
and Mrs. R. C. Holmquist and

ir, ana Mrs. uari jonnson,
and cousins. Miss Patricia Holm.
qulst and Miss Henrietta Johnson,
in jMgarose.

Home From Vacation Mr. and
Mrs. Andy Schllck and daugh-
ter, Donna, and son. Michael.
are back at their home on West
Mosher street In Roseburg, fol-

lowing two weeks vacationing
In California. Thev visited in
San Diego, Los Angeles and San
irancisco. They returned home
over the Redwood Highway and
report a most enjoyable trip.

Aid Neighbor David Sand,
Dick Holmquist, George Sund-
berg, Fritz Hareesheimer. Carl
Johnson, Gunnar Johnson and
Andrew Hanson, all residents of
iugarose, spent last Saturday put-
ting up hay for Lee Brown. Mr.
Brown suffered a fractured back
in a fall from a cherry tree sev-ver-

weeks ago and was only
recently discharged from Mercv
Hospital. He is reported to be
convalescing satisfactorily at his
nome in Elgarose.

Return to Tacoma Master Set.
and Mr. Wesley Little and daugh
ler, oanora nave returned to
their home in Tacoma. where
Sgt. Little is stationed as a re-

cruiting officer, following a visit
from Friday through Monday in
Roseburg with Set. Little's moth- -

er, Mrs. Eugene Little, on South
Stephens street. While here, Sgt.
Little also enjoyed visiting Fran-
cis Herron, a former Marine bud-
dy, who served with him on his
first enlistment on a trip around
the world with the Marines. Sun-
day they enjoyed a picnic at Loon
lake and were accompanied by
Mrs. Little and Mr. and Mrs.
C. C. Albright and the latter's
mother, Mrs. Bales, who Is visit-
ing here from Portland. They
spent Monday visiting Mr. and
Mrs, V. S. Woodruff in Elgarose.

Here For Weekend Rodney
Houser of Portland Is spending
the weekend in Roseburg visit-
ing his maternal grandparents,
Mr. and Mrs. Fred A. Knight,
on West First street. His father,
R. B. Houser, representative for
the Western Auto Supply Com-
pany, brought him to Roseburg
Wednesday and left yesterday for
Myrtle Creek to attend to busi-
ness, after which he will visit
coast points. Rodney will attend
the Peewee baseball game here
Saturday night to see his cousin,
Philip (Buck) Knight, of Port-
land play shortstop with the
Portland team. Buck and his fa-

ther, Attorney William W.
Knight, will arrive here from
Portland tonight. Buck will visit
his maternal grandmother, Mrs.
Harry F. Hatfield, and his pa-
ternal grandparents, Mr. and
Mrs. Fred A. Knight. Rod and
Buck are nephews of Mr. and
Mrs. Frederick J. Porter of this
city.

More Culture Needed
Harvey L. Johnson, a North-

western University professor, has
found South Americans more
culture-minde- than people in
the U. S.

National Forest Timber For Sale
Oral auction bids will be re-

ceived by the Forest Supervisor,
Post Office Building, Roseburg,
Oregon, beginning at 2:00 p.m.
Pacific Standard Time, July 18,

for all the live timber
marked or designated for cutting
and all merchantable dead timber
located on an area embracing
about 120 acres within See. 28,
T27S, R1W, W.M., Umpqua Na-
tional Forest, Oregon, estimated
to be 6,000,000 feet B.M. more or
less of Douglas-fir- , 150,000 feet
B.M. more or less of western red
cedar, 50,000 feet B.M. more or
less of western white pine and
sugar pine and 1,000,000 feet
B.M. more or less of western
hemlock and other species of
sawtimber. ' No bid of less than
$6.30 per M feet for Douglas-fir- ,

$1.15 per M feet for western red
cedar 6.30 per M feet for west
ern white pine and sugar pine,
$1.05 per M feet for western
hemlock and other species will
be considered. In addition to the
prices bid for stumnaee. a co
operative deposit of $0.10 per M
ieet a.m.. to tie used By the f or
est Service for paying the cost of
slash disposal, a cooperative de
posit ot su.3S per M ieet a.m.,
to cover the cost of tree planting,
seed sowing and timber stand
improvement work on the area
cut over, for the total cut of
timber under the terms of the
agreement, will be required.
$6,000.00 must accompany each
sealed bid and must be shown to
be in the possession of oral bid-

ders as a qualification for auction
bidding. If an oral bid Is de-

clared to be high at the closing
of the auction, the bidder must
immediately make the required
payment and confirm the bid by
submitting it In writing on a
Forest Son-ic- bid form. The
right to reject any and all bids
Is reserved. Before bids are sub-
mitted, full Information con-

cerning the timber, the condi-
tions of sale and the submission
of bids should be obtained from
the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg,
Oregon, or the District Ranger,
Glide, Oregon.

SEALED BID3, marked outside
"Bid for Timber," and addressed
to the Regional Administrator,
Bureau ot Land Management,
Region I. Room 131. Building No.
1, Swan Island, Portland 18, Ore
gon, will be received until and
opened at 2:00 P.M., PACIFIC
STANDARD TIME, on July 12,
1949, for the purchase of all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting upon tracts herein'
after described as SEALED BID:
ORAL AUCTION BIDS, will be
received by the District Forester
at his oitlce located in Koom zub,
Post Office Building, Roseburg,
Oregon, at 2:00 P.M., PACIFIC
STANDARD TIME, on July 12,
1949, on those tracts of timber
hereinafter described under
ORAL AUCTION BID. Any seal-
ed bids on tracts so advertised
and accompanied by the required
deposit received by the District'
Forester prior to the start of the
oral auction bidding, win De con-

sidered the equivalent of an oral
bid and will be posted for the
Information of all bidders. To
qualify for oral auction bidding,
the bidder must submit to the
officer in charge of the sale,
prior to the beginning of the
auction a deposit in the amount
as hereinafter required. If an
oral bid is declared to be high at
the closing of the auction, the
bidder must immediately confirm
the bid by submitting it In dupli-
cate on the regular Bureau of
Land Management bid proposal
form. The cutting and removal
of the timber shall be carried
out in accordance with the forest
practice rules approved on July
7, 1938 by the Secretary of the
Interior. Each bid must state the
amount per thousand feet, board
measure, that will be paid for
each species, the total considera
tion wnicn win De paid tor tne
timber and a statement that the
bidder will comply with local
manufacturing requirements as
hereinafter stated. No bid for
less thai) the appraised value will
be considered. Each sealed bid
must be submitted in duplicate
and be accompanied by a deposit.
The deposit must be in cash or
in the jorm oi a certuied cnecK
on a solvent bank and in favor
of the Treasurer of the United
States. The amount of the de-

posit will be at least 20 of the
first $1,000 of the appraised value
of the timber; an additional 10
of the next $9,000; an additional
5 of the amount between $10,-00- 0

and $100,000; and an addi-
tional 3 of any amount in ex-

cess of $100,000. The deposit
will be returned to unsuccessful
bidders; applied as a part of the
purchase price of the high bid-

der; or that portion of the de-

posit representing the minimum
required by law shall be retain
ed as liquidated damages if the
high bidder does not execute
contract and furnish satisfactory
bond within thirty days of ac-

ceptance of the bid or cannot
furnish evidence of his ability to
comply with the local marketing
requirements. In sales over
$5,000, and in small sales when
required, the high bidder will be
reauired to furnish a sworn
financial statement showing
ability to fulfill the terms of the
contract. A bond on all sales
will be required in an amount
computed at the rate of at least
15 per cent of the bid price. Pay-
ment for timber will be required
In advance of cutting, payment
in full at the time of filing the
contract being required in sales
amounting to $5,000 or less. In
larger sales, the Regional Admin-
istrator may permit payment in
a number of Installments. The
right is hereby reserved to waive
technical defects in the advertise-
ment; to reject all bids, or to
award the timber for the amount
of the highest bid to the next
highest qualified bidder when the
officer authorized to approve the
contract shall deem the high bid-

der unqualified to fulfill the
contractual requirements of the
advertisement. Timber sold in
accordance with this advertise-
ment must be manufactured with-
in the marketing area as desig-
nated for each tract described
below In accordance with the
Orders of the Secretary of the
Interior, No. 2285, and Nos. 2380
to 2390, Incl., dated December 11,
1946 and November 29, 1947,
respectively. The United States
has by agreement been given the
right to authorize its purchasers
to use certain roads and rights-of-wa- y

for the removal of timber.
Each bidder should ascertain
from the respective District
Forester's office the location of
the road right-of-wa- covered by
such agreement relating to the
tract upon which he wishes 10
bid. It is the bidder's responsi-
bility to determine for himself
the extent to which such agree-
ment will permit the use of the
road or right-of-wa- subject to
the payment of reasonable com-
pensation to the assignor of the
United States. Further informa-
tion, Including copies of the form
of contract, bid forms and sched-
ules of contract payments may be
obtained at District Offices of
the Bureau of Land Management,
located at Salem, Eugene, Rose-
burg, Coos Bay, and Medford,
Oregon, or at the office of the
Regional Administrator, Building
No. 1, Swan Island, Portland 18,
Oregon. Dated at Portland, Ore-
gon, this 10th day of June, 1949.
ORAL AUCTION BID: IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY: DOUGLAS
MARKETING AREA: T. 20 S.,
R. 6 W., W.M., Sec. 25, all mer-
chantable timber designated for
cutting on the SEI, estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be
4715 M. feet Douglas fir. 45 M.
feet Hemlock, 15 M. feet Western
Red Cedar, 20 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than
$8.65 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Douglas fir, $2.80 per M. ft. B.M.
for the Hemlock, Western Red
Cedar and Incense Cedar, or a
total purchase price of $41,008.75,
will be considered. T. 25 S R. 3

W., W.M. See. 35, all merchant-
able timber designated for cut-

ting on Lot 10 (NWJSEU, por.
Lot 11 (NE1SWH, por. Lot 12

INWISWJ). estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 2040 M.
feet Douglas fir, 205 M. feet
branded Sugar Pine, 20 M. feet
White Fir, 25 M. feet Incense
Cedar, 15 M. feet Red Cedar. No
bid for less than $9.80 per M. ft.
B.M. for the Douglas fir, $24.65
per M. ft. B.M. for the branded
Sugar Pine, $3.05 per M. ft. B.M.
for the White Fir, Incense Cedar,

Autos

3 Days Free
Driving Trial

Full Deposit-Bac- k

Guarantee on Our

Quality Used Cars

3 Day Special
41 Bulck Sedan Special W15.00

Clean end food mechanically
'46 Mercury Sedan. Radio and

Heater $1390.00
Very clean and low mileage

'46 Plymouth Sedan. .11294 00
'43 Studebaker Coupe. . m 797.00

'jl De Soto Sedan. . 897.00
'40 De Soto Sedan . 784.00
'40 De Soto Sedan . 767.00
'41 Plymouth Coupe , 719.00
'40 Pontlac 2 Door Sedan,

Radio Sc Heater, new paint 782.00
'to ronuac s Passenger loupe,

Radio & Heater 847.

Shop Evenings
For Your Convenience

Open Until 9:00 P. M.

KEEL'S QUALITY
Used Car Lot

230 S. Stepheni
Phone 128

Better Buys
, At Barcus
VACATION SPECIALS

1948 Bulck roadmaster sedan
ette. dvnaflow. all extras.
Low mileage, like new. $2293

1946 Dodge sedan, New paint and
tires. This Is an esDeclally
clean car. REDUCED PRICE.... 1S9S

1647 International pickup, spe
cial factory duiu aeuvery
body 1

1941 Chrysler coupe, fluid drive. .

1940 Ford pickup, excellent

1937 Ford idn. .

1937 Ford coup
193S Chrysler, air flow S passen

ger coupe, mis car is ex
ceptional for only

1935 Ford 2 dr. adn. 250

1937 Chevrolet 4 door sedan, 225

1937 Nash LaFayette sedan. 195

1936 Plymouth sedan 185

BANK TERMS OPEN EVENINGS

BARCUS SALES &

SERVICE

Your Packard Dealer
Hwy. 99 N. at Garden Valley Road'

SAVE
ON USED

CARS
1947 Willys station wagon, R & H $1395
1947 Mercury 4 door. R & H ........ 1595
1946 Ford 4 door, R & H 1193
1942 Plymouth reconditioned,new paint 995
1942 Oldsmobile 4 door B95
1942 Studebaker 4 door 995
1942 Chevrolet Aero sedan . 1093
1941 Chevrolet 2 door 893
1941 Nash 4 door, new paint 750
1941 Oldsmobile 5 nassentrair cnun Rfl.l

inn unrysier 4 aoor, me-
chanics special 74.1

1937 Chevrolet 2 door 330
i37 unevroiet 2 door 275
1946 Jeep 693
1947 Jeep 995
ism Jeep 1195
1949 4 ton Ford nlckun. low mileaire.
1HW lTlllJf piCKUp,

RIVERSIDE
MOTORS

Sales Willys Service
1640 North Stephens Phone 450--

Roseburg

Used Car
Center
Oak and Rose

FINE USED CARS

Chevrolet Bulck Pontlao Cadillac
iraae-in-

1947 Chev. panel ...1195.00
1947 Fraer manhattan ...1695.00
1946 Packard ..1695.O0
1S4I Chev. - 850.00
1940 Chev. 750.00
1938 Chev. 375.00
1939 Merc. 295.00
1937 Olds. Co. - ,. 295.00
1936 Bulck 175.00

UMPQUA AUTO &

IMP. CO.
1444 N. Stephens

. Phone 1049--

For Sale
1937 OLDSMOBn.t 4 door Sedan (1946

1939 MASTER 85 Chev. coupe. $55o!

junction, v. mile on Hiway 42
Alio light 2 wheel trailer and

electric range. Come and see
them or phone

IS" SALE1M0 1 lon panel Ford.750x20 tires, excellent condition. Nearly" .iiwr. rou. see ai uaxianaor Phone 1143, Oakland. Bill
Campbell.

1941 OPERA COUPE, excellent condl- -
.,rts, W. w. urea, r & H.,chrome dash, tog llghu. Best buy intown. W. W. Lewis, 446 Garden Vslley

'48 NASH, like new, low mileage. 25
M,,.r. it, B,. naoto, neater, bed
Terms, will trade. 51395. See Shorty.Modern Furniture 8:30 to 5:30.

FOR SALE 1948 Ford pickupTone own-e- r.
excellent condition, 50 cash.

Slacy D. Fenley, Sawyer Rapids Re- -srt. 10mllesweatofElkton.
FORD PICKUP. 1936 model, original

ft!",1 uPh''"y- Run aboutmiles since motor overhaul. $450Walter Leake. 12JSouth Pine St
t46 CHEVROLET Master deluxacoupeas la S3i5.
Inquire Joe Douglas Co. SUM Bank

Bldg.. or Phone 468.
fipRai MONEY tof your cat. Cash onthe spot. Corkrum Motors, Inc. De

Soto, Plymouth. Phona 401. lit N

42 CHEVrpILKUP. $575. 20" wheels';

SALLE Good condition, goodrubber, radio, neater and seat coven.
. Cary, 1 mi. I. of Dlxonville.

Committee heads for the com-

ing year were announced at the
Lions Club meeting Thursday
night In the Hotel Umpqua by
Vice President Wayne Safley, act-
ing lor President Dr. J, E. Camp-
bell.

The chairmen Include: attend
ance, Al Parr; constitution and

Robert Hatterschied
convention, Thomas Hartfiel: 11

nance, Henry Palmer; informa
tion, Dr. Earl Neuru; member-
ship, E. R. Buckingham; pro-
gram, Joe Spousta; publicity,
Leroy Inman; bulletin (elective)
Ralph Turner; boys' and girls' ac-

tivities, Frank Von Borstel; citi-

zenship and patriotism, Bruce El-

liott; civic improvement, Jim
Daugherty; community better-
ment, M. W. Slankard; education
(to be named); safety, O. C. Rolf-nes-

sight conservation and
blind, Keith Phillips; wheel
chairs, Bill Unrath.

Each committee' chairman Is to
appoint two colleagues. The di-

rectors' meeting was changed
from the first to the second
Thursday of each month, and all
members are welcome to attend.
To Clear Picnio Sits

An announced work party will
be held at the Rod and Gun Club
grounds at Winchester Sunday to
assist in clearing a picnic site.
The Lions have been offered use
of the grounds for an lnter-clu-

picnic July 24, provided the
members assist with the prepar-
ations of the grounds, it was re-

ported.
An Impromptu program includ

LOCAL
Building Carl Backlund is

building a new garage and wood-
shed at his home In Elgarose.

Goes To Portland Jim Turk,
News-Revie- advertising man-
ager, left Wednesday night for
Portland on business.

Home From Eugene Mr. and
Mrs. Carl South are back at their
home in Elgarose, following a
visit witn relatives in Eugene.

Here On Business Frank
Jenkins, president of the South
ern Oregon Publishing Company,
Klamath Falls, Is in Roseburg
attending to business at The

Baek From Tour Dick Sjo-
gren, Joe Sand and Teddy South
nave returned to their home In
Elgarose, following a stock
tour through the Rogue River
valley.

Box Social to Be Held Mem-
bers and friends of the Winston
Community Club are invited to
attend a box social Saturday
night, July 9, at Howard's Hard-
ware store at Winston.

Visiting In Portland Marlene
ana uavia Bartnoiomy, who make
their home with their uncle and
aunt, Mr. and Mrs. George Sund-ber-

In Elgarose, are in Portland
visiting their grandparents.

Visit at Elgarose Ralph Ander-
son and Dan McNalley of Bisbce,
Ariz., have been spending the last
week in Elgarose visiting at the
homes of Mr. and Mrs. R. C.
Holmquist and Mr. and Mrs,
George Sundberg.

To Celebrate Anniversary Mr,
and Mis. Louis Kohlhaeen Sr..
will celebrate their golden wed-
ding anniversary Sunday, July
10, at a reception from 2 to 5:30
o'clock at their home at 901 Mil-
itary street. Relatives and friends
are invited to call.

AN AMAZING OFFER
The makers of Dr. Porker's
Corn Remover will give you
double your money back if it
fails to remove your com or
callous. Only 35c at Chap-
man's Drug Store.

KIDNEYS

MUST REMOVE

EXCESS ACIDS
Help IS MlUi of Kidney Tubei

Flush Out Poisonous Wasto
When dlsordt r of kidney function permlti

poisonous nutter to remain in your blood,
It mav cause nrursintr bapkiifh. rhitutnnl (a

palm, leg palm, loss of pep and energy, get
ting' up nights, welling, putlinnm under the

yet, Jieauacnea ami u.ix.ncss. frequent or
canty piusaitv with smarting and burning
ometlmea shows there Is aomethiiur wruiiB

With your kidneya or bladder.
Don't wait Auk your drufnrist for Doan'i

Fills, a atirmilant diuretic, used successfully
by mlllioni for over 60 years. Doan's glvo
happy relief and will help the 16 miles of
kidney tube flush out poisonuuiwajtafrom
your blood. Get Dou'a Pilla.

PHONE 1354
for Immediate delivery

en any quantity.

Champion

Stove and Fuel

Oils

Diesel Oil

BARCUS
Sales and Service

Hlway M N. al Gsrdtrt

Valley Road
"Better Buys at BsrouV

atate college by Gene Henry,
Junior Lions member, who was
sponsored by the club. He dis-
cussed the program and told how
members in attendance were
given the opportunity to see how
city, county and state govern
ments tunction.
Sanitarians Speak

Paul Howen and John
sanitarians of the motor

court section, Oregon State
Health Department, were visitors
as guests of County Sanitarian
Claude Baker. Each spoke brief-
ly discussing their work. Howen
stated their department's aim is
educational rather than that of
making arrests. He said they
plan to visit motels about the
state every six months if possible,
and to suggest methods of sani
tary improvements, especially as
to sewage disposal and water
sanitation.

Ketchum, elaborating further,
said that their effort Is to elim-
inate breeding places of flies and
insects as carriers of disease. This
is most effectively done by cor-

recting sewage disposal methods.
Karl Feucrhelm, Rogue River,

a visiting Lion, invited members
to his community at any time.
and especially to a donkey base
ball game July ia. unanes Wil
son was a guest of Edell Bryant.
Humorous sidelights were a fish
story told by Bruce Elliott, and
a firecracker backfiring incident
told by Ivan Pickens.

NEWS
Back From Eugene Mrs.

Ida Neal has returned to her
home In Roseburg, following a
week in Eugene visiting Mrs.
Jan Young.

Visits Wife H. G. Bonney,
bookkeeper for the Riverside
Lumber Company In Roseburg,
spent the holiday weekend in
Portland visiting his wife.

Vacationing Mrs. Margaret
Shelton and son of Roseburg are
enjoying a vacation trip to Yel-
lowstone National Park and points
oi interest in tne mia-wes-

Returns Home Mrs. Marv
Hanson returned to her home
In Elgarose, following a visit
in Camas Valley with her

and daughter, Mr. and
Mrs. Wayne Reetz.

Visit at Woodruff Home Mr.
and Mrs. Conrad Lundeen have
returned to their home in Suth- -

erlin, following a visit with Mr.
and Mrs. V. S. Woodruff in Elga
rose.

Flshert Home Mr. and Mrs,
Walter Fisher are back at their
home, on Overlook In Roseburg.
iouowing several montns enjoy-
ing an extended vacation at nolnts
of interest In Europe.

Return to Portland Mr. and
Mrs. Brian E. Shirley (Bcttv
Jane Roberts) have returned to
their home In Portland, follow-
ing a visit In Roseburg with the
latter's parents. Mr. and Mrs.
Leslie Roberts.

Here From Euoene Mrs. A.
L, Hawn, of Eugene and her
youngest sister, Miss Virginia,
who is a registered nurse, have
arrived in Roseburg to visit their
sister, Mrs. Michael Lydon, and
tneir motner, Mrs. t. H. inpss.
of Eugene, who has been at the
Lydon home in Laurclwood for
the last several weeks.

Plcnlo To Be Held Members
of the Deer Creek Hustlers Llv
stock Club and their families are
invited to a picnic to be held at
tne unrisier place on tne Buck-hor-

road. Idloyld route. Sunday,
July 10, at 2 o'clock. The regular
meeting or tne ciuo win De held
following the picnic.

Out of Hospital Mrs. Dexter
Rice has been discharged from
Mercy Hospital and is reported
to be convalescing satisfactorily
at the Hotel Umpqua. where she
will remain until she is suffi-
ciently well enough to return to
her nome on south Kane street
In this city.

Visitors leave Mr. and Mrs.
Arthur L. Taylor and children,
Jimmy and Norma Jean, have
returned to their home In Vallejo,
Calif., following two weeks in
Rotjburg visiting Mr. Taylor's
parents, Mr. and Mi's. H. A. Tay-
lor, on West Mosher street. Mr.
Taylor has been engaged as an
electrical engineer since 1938 at
the Mare Island Shipyards. The
H. A. Taylors' son and daughter-in-law- ,

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Tay-
lor, of Portland snent the holiday
weekend here and returned home
Tuesday. They formerly made
their home in Roseburg. Harold
Taylor Is now engaged In the
grocery business In Portland.

Advertisement

Inches Of Gas
Bloat Is Gone

KAL-ODE- worked so much
gas and bloat from my stomach
that my waistline has gone down
7 Inches,' "I used to get so full of
ens after menls that It even Dress
ed Into my chest and caused hor-
rible misery around my heart and
awful heart palpitation. This suf-
fering kept up all night. 1 couldn't
sleep because of it. KAL-ODE-

cleared out this gas and now I eat
my meals with a relish and don't
suffer afterward, and sleep sound-
ly all night. I never shw anything
to equal KAL-ODE- It Is Mar
velous:

K AI..r.niTV l an TTprhnl for.
mula containing medicine juices
from 5 Great Herbs. Miserable
opoole soon feel different all over
when thev take It. So don't go on
suffering.' Get KAL-- DEX at all
Drug Stores Here In Roseburg,

REPORT OF CONDITION OF

DOUGLAS COUNTY STATE BANK

Of Roteburg, In tht Stats of Oregon, at the close of business
on June 30, 1949.

ASSETS
1. Cash, balances with other banks, Including reserve

balances, and cash items in process of collection $1,195,471.53
2. United States Government obligations, direct and

guaranteed 3,064,247.00
3. Obligations of States and political subdivisions 330,727.77
6. Loans and discounts 2,376,664.53
7. Bank premises owned none, furniture and fix-

tures $16,997.00 16,997.00

12. TOTAL ASSETS

LIABILITIES
13. Demand deposits of individuals, partnerships, and

corporations $4,079,983.11
14. Time deposits of individuals, partnerships, and cor--

Q1n fCJ 11
porations om,aoi.i

15. Deposits of United States Government (Including
postal savings) 65,655.26

16. Deposits of States and political subdivisions 1,469,638.79
17. TVnoslts of hanks 234,547.74
18. Other deposits (certified and
19. TOTAL DEPOSITS
23. Other liabilities

24. TOTAL LIABILITIES (not
obligations shown below)

CAPITAL
25. Capital
26. Surplus
27. Undivided profits

29. TOTAL CAPITAL ACCOUNTS

30. TOTAL LIABILITIES AND

MEMORANDA
31, Assets pledged or assigned to

for other purposes w,(U,U(B.
33. (a) Loans as shown above are after deduction of

reserves of - 9,808.49

I, E. G. Young, Cashier, of the above-name- bank, do solemnly
swear that the above statement is true, and that it fully and correctly
represents the. true state of the several matters herein contained and
set forth, to the best of my knowledge and belief.

E. G. YOUNG.
Correct Attest:

T. B. GARRISON U E. GARRISON
ROY O. YOUNG L. E. HENNINGER

E. R. METZGER, Directors
State of Oregon, County of DourIbs, ss;

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 6th day of July, 1949.

(SEAL) EVELYN U FRAZIER. Notary Public.
My commlsison expires August 15th, 1952.

GRA-H- COCKr.t KENNELS, Phone W
?Iii d Pad. puppies 1.

Stud service.


