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purpose of this sale to be 7980
M. feet Douglas fir, 770 M. feet
branded Ponderosa Pine, 85 M.
feet branded Sugar Pine, 940 M.
feet Incense Cedar, 175 M. feet
White Fir, 65 M. feet Hemlock.
No bid for less than $7.65 per
M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas fir,
$16.00 per M. ft B.M. for the
branded Ponderosa Pine, $23.00
per M. ft. B.M. for the. branded
Sugar Pine, $3.50 per M. ft. B.M.
for the Incense Cedar and Hem-
lock, $4.30. per M. ft. B.M. for
the White Fir, or a total purchase
price of $79,592.00, will be

d Douglas fir and fire-kille-

Incense Cedar, $2.50 per M.
ft. B.M. for the White Fir, Hem-
lock, and Incense Cedar, $15.00
per M. Ft. B.M. for the Port
Orford Cedar, $22.40 per M. ft.
B.M. for the branded Sugar Pine,
or a total purchase price of
$12,084.50, will be considered.
SOUTH UMPQUA OR JOSE-
PHINE MARKETING AREAS:
T. 31 S., R. 3 W., W.M., Sec. 29,
all merchantable timber designat-
ed for cutting on the NE1, NEJ-N-

por. WJNW1, all SE1NWJ,
NE1SWJ, por. WJSW1, por. SEI-
SWI, all SEt, estimated for the

one set of documents will be re-

turned to each actual bidder with-
in a reasonable time after receipt
of bids.

All contractors shall comply
with all state laws pertaining to
the qualification of bidders, and
particularly Title 98, Chapter 1,
Oregon Compiled Laws Anno-
tated.

Each proposal shall be made
out on a Bid Form contained in
the contract documents and shall
be accompanied by a certified
check or bid bond made payable
to the Oregon State Game Com-
mission of the State of Oregon
in an amount not less than ten
per cent (10) of the total
amount of the proposal.

The Oregon State Game Com-
mission reserves the right to re-

ject any or all bids.
No bidder may withdraw his

bid after the hour set for the
opening unless said award is de-

layed for a period exceeding 30

days.
OREGON STATE GAME

COMMISSION.
By:

C. A. LOCKWOOD,
Supervisor,
State Game Commission,
1634 S. W. Alder Street,
P. O. Box 4136.

' Portland 8, Oregon.
Date June 29, 1948.

Daylight Saving
Spells Confusion,
Neuner's Opinion

SALEM, July 1. UP) All will
be confusion if Oregon's daylight
saving time law becomes effec-
tive July 16, Attorney General
George Neuner says.

The law provides for standard
time over the whole state unless
the governor proclaims daylight
saving time. There is a move to
refer the law to the people, and
thus hold it up until the Novem-
ber, 1950, general election.

Neuner said that if the measure
becomes effective and if the gov-
ernor doesn't proclaim daylight
saving time, these things will
happen:

1. Cities which now are on day-
light saving time will stay that
way, because there isn't anythingin the new law to make a local
ordinance void.

2. Courthouses in cities on day-
light time will have to change to
standard time.

3. State offices in Salem and
Portland will have to go back to
standard time.

Cops Must Be Courteous,
But Not Forget Ticket

B.M. for the Douglas fir, $14.55
per M. ft. B.M. for the branded
Ponderosa Pine, $19.90 per M.
ft. B.M. for the branded Sugar
Pine, $2.80 per M. ft. B.M. for
the White Fir, $2.50 per M. ft.
B.M. for the Incense Cedar, or a
total purchase price of $13,359.25,
will be considered. SOUTH UMP-
QUA MARKETING AREA: T. 32
S., R. 1 W., W.M., Sec. 3, all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on por. SEiSWi, all
N.SEJ, por. SWiSEJ, all SE1SEJ,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 6295 M. feet Douglas
fir, 25 M. feet branded Sugar
Pine, 160 M. feet White Fir, 160
M. feet Incense Cedar, 10 M. feet
Hemlock. No bid for less than
$6.25 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Douglas fir, $20.40 per M. ft. B.M.
for the branded Sugar Pine, $3.00
per M. ft. B.M. for the White
Fir, $2.30 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Incense Cedar, $2.50 per M. ft.
B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total
purchase price of $40,726.75, will
be considered. SEALED BID: IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY: DOUGLAS
MARKETING AREA: SALVAGE
SALE: T. 30 S., R. 9 W., W.M.,
Sec. 3, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on por.
SISWi, all SiSEi. estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be
1770 M. feet Douglas fir, 315 M.
feet Douglas fir, 110
M. feet White Fir, 10 M. feet
Hemlock, 5 M. feet Port Orford
Cedar, 10 M. feet branded Sugar
Pine, 45 M. feet Incense Cedar,
10 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than $6.15
per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas
fir, $1.50 per M. ft. B.M. for the

MARKETING AREA: T. 20 S.,
R. 6 W., W.M., Sec. 25. all mer-
chantable timber designated for
cutting on the SE1. estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be
4715 M. feet Douglas fir, 45 M.
feet Hemlock, 15 M. feet Western
Red Cedar, 20 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than
$8.65 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Douglas fir, $2.80 per M. ft. B.M.
for the Hemlock, Western Red
Cedar and Incense Cedar, or a
total purchase price of $41,008.75,
will be considered. T. 25 S., R. 3
W-- , W.M. Sec. 35, all merchant-
able timber designated for cut-

ting on Lot 10 (NW1SEJ), por.
Lot 11 (NE1SWJ), por. Lot 12
(NWJSW1), estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 2040 M.
feet Douglas fir, 205 M. feet
branded Sugar Pine, 20 M. feet
White Fir, 25 M. feet Incense
Cedar, 15 M. feet Red Cedar. No
bid for less than $9.80 per M. ft.
B.M. for the Douglas fir, $24.65
per M. ft. B.M. for the branded
Sugar Pine, $3.05 per M. ft. B.M.
for the White Fir, Incense Cedar,
and Red Cedar, or a total pur-
chase price of $25,228.25, will be
considered. The contract for
sale of this timber will contain
special requirements for the pro-
tection of the Rock Creek Fish
Hatchery of the Oregon State
Game Commission. Details re-

garding these requirements can
be obtained from the District
Forester, Roseburg, Oregon, or
from the Regional Administrator,
Bureau of Land Management.
T. 30 S., R. 7 W., W.M., Sec. 17,
all merchantable timber desig-
nated for cutting on por. SJNE4,
por. NE1SW1, all SE1SWJ, SEJ,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 1185 M. feet Douglas
fir, 410 M. feet branded Ponder-os-a

Pine, 85 M. feet branded
Sugar Pine, 15 M. feet White Fir,
60 M. feet Incense Cedar. No
bid for less than $4.65 per M. ft.

will be required in an amount

computed at the rate of at least
15 per cent of the bid price. Pay-
ment for timber will be required
in advance of cutting, payment
in full at the time of filing the
contract being required in sales
amounting to $5,000 or less. In
larger sales, the Regional Admin-
istrator may permit payment in
a number of installments. The
right is hereby reserved to waive
technical defects in the advertise-
ment; to reject all bids, or to
award the timber for the amount
of the highest bid to the next
highest qualified bidder when the
officer authorized to approve the
contract shall deem the high bid-

der unqualified to fulfill the
contractual requirements of the
advertisement. Timber sold in
accordance with this advertise-
ment must be manufactured with-
in the marketing area as desig-
nated for each tract described
below in accordance with the
Orders of the Secretary of the
Interior, No. 2285, and Nos. 2380
to 2390, Incl., dated December 11,
1946 and November 29, 1947,
respectively. The United States
has by agreement been given the
right to authorize its purchasers
to use certain roads and rights-of-wa- y

for the removal of timber.
Each bidder should ascertain
from .the respective District
Forester's office the location of
the road right-of-wa- covered by
such agreement relating to the
tract upon which he wishes io
bid. It is the bidder's responsi-
bility to determine for himself
the extent to which such agree-
ment will permit the use of the
road or right-of-wa- subject to
the payment of reasonable com-
pensation to the assignor of the
United States. Further informa-
tion, including copies of the form
of contract, bid forms and sched-
ules of contract payments may be
obtained at District Offices of
the Bureau of Land Management,
located at Salem, Eugene, Rose-
burg, Coos Bay, and Medford,
Oregon, or at the office of the
Regional Administrator, Building
No. 1, Swan Island, Portland 18,
Oregon. Dated at Portland, Ore-
gon, this 10th day of June, 1949.
ORAL AUCTION BID: IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY: DOUGLAS

FOR SALE I

Beautiful River Property .

Very Attractive and New Home
300 Feett oj River Frontage , .

I

Big Firepk Ji Roman Brick . . i
Automatic Gas Furnace I

''One Mile hi'.' office ' '

Latest in Plas.erniq Design I

Immediate i" .. jion l
Close to School, Bus, Store I

Very Secluded
Plus One Acre of Ground, All Fenced I

Shown by Appointment Only

Price $20,000

Earl 6c Gladys Wiley

House, Commercial and
Industrial Wiring
Electrical Trouble Shooting
Motor and Appliance Re-

pair
Free Pick-U- and Delivery
Service

t

17 Years Experience

ACE ELECTRIC
Licensed Electrician

316 E. 2nd Ave. N. Ph. 1095--

Realtors
Reeervatlone for private

Skating Parties
are available at the

Roiabaw Skating Rink
Winchester ROSE HOTEL BLDG.

L

TACOMA, July 1 m
mat oia wneeze about where s
the fire" became outmoded in
Tacoma's Police Traffic Squad
today by official order.

Instead, a directive issued by
chief Robert Marshall says to
cops who have just observed a
violation, you will:

"Courteously approach the
violator XXX advise his of the
mistake and at the same time
inform him why he should not
be Involved in this type of viola-
tion, giving him data as to how
many accidents occurred with-
in the city of Tacoma," etc.

With the statistical data, of
course, will come the customary
ticket.

-- fi. MID.WFST I

.., - tea !urH int.

"Dm'I look now, fiwM, but tbtra'i tbat

mw bay... mi.. . ok,

Cwm, In mo sif

Order Your Classified Ad by Mail

IN THE COUNTY COURT Or THI
STATE Or OREGON TOR THE

COUNTY Or DOUGLAS
PUBLICATION or

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
In th Matter of th but

of
JAKE ROBB1NS. Dictated.

Notice U hereby given that S. H.
Robbins hu been appointed and has
qualified aa the administrator of the
above entlUed estate. AU persons hav.
lng claims against the estate should
present them with proper vouchers to
the said administrator at the office of
Avery W. Thompson, attorney at law,
303 Douglas County State Bank Build-
ing, Roseburg. Oregon, within six IS)
months from the date of this notice.

Dated this 10th day of June. 1949.
s S. H. ROBBINS. Adminis-

trator of the above entitled
estate.

Date of first publicaUon June 10, 1940.

Date of last publication July S, 1940.

NOTICE OF WARRANTS MORE
THAN SEVEN YEARS OLD

Notice is hereby given that the
following listed warrants of
Douglas County, Oregon, are
more than seven years old and
have not been presented for pay-
ment and are now outstanding.
All persons holding said war-

rants, or any of them, are here-

by notified to present the same
to the county treasurer of said
county for payment not later
than September 1, lswa, omer-wis- e

said warrants will be can-
celled and payment thereof will
be refused,

GENERAL, COUNTY FUND
Warrant No. 20400, issued May

27, 1942, to Eunice Lyster for
services on election Doara, in tne
sum of $3.00.

Warrant No. 22594, issued No-

vember 9, 1942, to Carl W. Oil-

man, for services on election
board, in the sum of $3.50.

. GNERAL ROAD FUND
Warrant No. 9203, issued Jan-

uary 10, 1942, to L. D. Homel-
and wife, for road right of way,
in the sum of $224.00.

Warrant No. 9205, issued Jan-

uary 10, 1942, to David H. Flem-

ing and wife and Ellen Dawson,
for road right of way, in the sum
of $408.00.

Dated this 1st day of July, 1949.

ROY AGEE,
County Clerk.

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS

Sealed proposals will be re-

ceived by the Oregon State Game
Commission, 1634 S. W. Alder
Street, P. O. Box 4136,. Portland
8, Oregon, until 11:00 A. M. Fri-

day, July 22, 1949, Daylight Sav-

ing Time for the CONSTRUC-
TION OF A CONCRETE DAM,
CONCRETE INTAKE BOX,
PIPE LINES, CONCRETE
NURSERY AND BROOD PONDS
AND AN ASSISTANTS DWELL-
ING. ALSO THE REPAIR OF
CERTAIN WOOD FLUMES, etc.,
on the property of the Oregon
State Game Commission at the
Rock Creek Trout Hatchery site
on Rock Creek near it's junction
with the North Umpqua River in
Douglas County, Oregon, approxi-
mately twenty-seve- miles north-
east of the City of Roseburg, and
will then and there be opened
and publicly read aloud. Bids re-

ceived after the time fixed for
opening the same will not be con-

sidered.
Plans, Specifications, and

Forms of Contract Documents
may be obtained at the Office of
the Oregon State Game Commis-
sion at 1634 S. W. Alder Street,
Portland 8, Oregon, upon deposit
of Twenty-Fiv- e Dollars ($25.00).

The full amount of deposit for

6-w-
ay I. E. S.

FLOOR LAMP

3 Candle Lites

100, 200, 300
Watt Light

Bronze or Gold

Rayon Pleated Shade

Again Jack Fariss and Son
have made a quantity pur-cho-

and can bring you this
$15.95 I. E. S. Floor Lamp
ot this low, low price of . . .

$8.88

P. M. Friday Nite

'til S for your convenience.

News-Revie- w

Classified Rates

Send In Your

Classified Advertisement

'

By Mail!

You can turn unwanted Items (Unwanted

by you) . . . but .SURE to be wanted

by somt NEWS-REVIE- Classified Ad

Reader . . . Into quick, cold cash, by simply

filling In the coupon below. Spend a few.

Notice of Timber Sal

SEALED BIDS, marked outside
"Bid for Timber," and addressed
to the Regional Administrator,
Bureau of Land Management,
Region I, Room 131, Building No.
1, Swan Island, Portland 18, Ore-

gon, will be received until and
opened at 2:00 P.M., PACIFIC
STANDARD TIME, on July 12,
1949, for the purchase of all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting upon tracts herein-
after described as SEALED BID:
ORAL AUCTION BIDS, will be
received by the District Forester
at his office located in Room 206,
Post Office Building, Roseburg,
Oregon, at 2:00 P.M., PACIFIC
STANDARD TIME, on July 12,
1949, on those tracts of timber
hereinafter described under
ORAL AUCTION BID. Any seal-
ed bids on tracts so advertised
and accompanied by the required
deposit received by the District
Forester prior to the start of the
oral auction bidding, will be con-

sidered the equivalent of an oral
bid and will be posted for the
Information of all bidders. To
qualify for oral auction bidding,
the bidder must submit to the
officer in charge of the sale,
prior to the beginning of the
auction a deposit in the amount
as hereinafter required. If an
oral bid is declared to be high at
the closing of the auction, the
bidder must immediately confirm
the bid by submitting it in dupli-
cate on the regular Bureau of
Land Management bid proposal
form. The cutting and removal
of the timber shall be carried
out in accordance with the forest
practice rules approved on July
7, 1938 by the Secretary of the
Interior. Each bid must state the
amount per thousand feet, board
measure, that will be paid for
each species, the total considera-
tion which will be paid for the
timber and a statement that the
bidder will comply with local
manufacturing requirements as
hereinafter stated. No bid for
less than the appraised value will
be considered. Each sealed bic'
must be submitted In duplicate
and be accompanied by a deposit.
The deposit must be in cash or
in the form of a certified chec'
on a solvent bank and in favc
of the Treasurer of the Unite
States. The amount of the d
posit will be at least 20 of tl
first $1,000 of the appraised va!'
of the timber: an additional 10
of the next $9,000; an addition
5 of the amount between $1(
000 and $100,000; and an add
tional 3 of any amount in

of $100,000. The depos.'
will be returned to unsuccessfu
bidders; applied as a part of the
purchase price of the high bid-

der; or that portion of the de-

posit representing the minimum
required by law shall be retain-
ed as liquidated damages if the
high bidder does not execute
contract and furnish satisfactorybond within thirty days of ac-

ceptance of the bid or cannot
furnish evidence of his ability to
comply with the local marketing
requirements. In sales over
$5,000, and in small sales when
required, the high bidder will be
required to furnish a sworn
financial statement showingability to fulfill the terms of the
contract. A bond on all sales

Who is at Fault?

Of course, since you are
a careful driver, in case
of an accident the "other
fellow is ot fault. We

Days Per Word

1 .03

2 .05

3 . .06

4 .. ,, .06

a , .10

2 weeks . .16

3 weeks .22

Month . .30

Fariss'

Friday Folly
Between the Hours of 6 and 9 P. M.

Jack Fori is and Son

Bring You Such Savings as These .

pennies . . . get back dollars!

COUPONUSE HANDY

BELOW

Write your complete ad, using one word to each'

space. Include name, address or phone number;

payment may accompany order or If you desire,

.we will bill you for your classified advertisement.

Between 6 and 9

Phone
Theob art not tho only buys that you will find hero be-

tween 6 and 9 p. m. every Friday. Be euro to shop for
other bargains during these hours.

Use Handy Order Blank

or Call 100 to Place

Your Ad By Phone

No. of Days . f
r

Name

Street or RFD No.

City

Bill to My Account .

t1

Amount Enclosed .

Kluver Radio Service open

Classification

I :TOi fitting

feel that way, too, but if

the jury disagrees it may
cost you plenty. . Make
sure your automobile in-

surance is complete. If it
is not, better call

R. O. YOUNG
Phone 4)7-20-

W. Cass St.

Roseburg

u

jStore No. 2 Next Te

Wolly's l
Phone 1371-- R


