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NOTICE TO CBEDITOBI
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that th.

undersigned hai been appointed as Ad-
ministrator of the Estate of MOISELLE

f. FOSS, Deceased, by the County Court
oi ine state oi uregon, lor uouglas wuon-ty- .

by an order dated May 10. 1B4S.
All persona having claims against said
Estate are hereby required to presentthe same, duly verified, with the proper
vouchers, at the law office of RICHARD
L. THWING. 34 N. 6th St.. Cotta.e Grove.
Oregon, within six months from the date
of the first publication of this Notice.
Dated and first published June 8. 1940.

WILLIAM CYRUS GARLINGHOUSE,
Administrator.

RICHARD L. THWINO,
Attorney.

Notice of Timber For Sale
8EALED BIDS, marked outside

"Bid for Timber," and addressed
to the Regional Administrator,
Bureau of Land Management,
Region I, Room 131, Building No.
l, swan Island, Portland is. Ure
gon, will be received until and
opened at 2:00 P. M., PACIFIC
STANDARD TIME, On July 12,
1949. for the Durchase of all mer
chantable timber designated for
cutting upon tracts hereinafter
described as skalkd BID:
ORAL AUCTION BIDS, will be
received by the District Forester
at nls olllce located in ftoom 206,
tost Office Building, Roseburg,
Oregon, at 2:00 P. M., PACIFIC
STANDARD TIME, on July 12,
1949. on those tracts of timber
hereinafter described under
ORAL AUCTION BID. Any sealed
bids on tracts so advertised and
accompanied by the required de-

posit received by the District
Forester prior to the start of the
oral auction bidding, will be con-
sidered the equivalent of an oral
bid and will be posted for the in- -

lormatlon of all bidders. To quali-
fy for oral auction blddine. the
bidder must submit to the offi-
cer in charge of the sale, prior

merclal Abstract Company Tues-
day.

Attend Weddlno Mrs. C. W.
Clark, Mrs. Minnie Clark, Mr.
and Mrs. J. Jarvis Robertson and
son, Jimmie; Mr. and Mrs. John
William Robertson and children,
uamuie ana jonn Marvin, or Kose-
burg; and Mr. and Mrs. Wallace
Robertson and daughter, Lor-
raine, and Mrs. Laura Robertson
of Cottage Grove went to Klam-
ath Falls Sunday to attend the
wedding of Mrs. Clark's son,
Charles W. Clark Jr.

Attend Meetlna Mr. and Mrs.
George Quine, Mr. and Mrs. T,
W. Bernard, Mr. and Mrs. Thom-
as Scott, Mrs. Prlscilla Darby,
Mrs. Sig Fett and Mrs. L. G.
Twohy of Douglas Court, U. D.,
Order of Amaranth, drove to
Eugene Monday to attend the
meeting of Willamette Court, Or-
der of Amaranth, at the Mason-
ic temple. Initiation was follow-
ed by a dance.

FOOD SHOPPING

Roseburg

Leaves for Points North Mrs.
Grace Hunt of St. Helens, Calif.,
left Monday for points north, fol
lowing a visit in Roseburg at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. a. l Kid-
der on North Stephens St.

Critically III According to
word received here, Vic Petterson
is critically 111 In the Southern
Pacific Hospital in San Francisco,
He was stationed here as train
master by the Southern Pacific
before being promoted to a high'
er position with ths company in
ban t rancisco.

Enjoy Trip Mr. and Mrs. J,
P. Sweltzer and daughter, Mary
jane, oi Koseburg, and Mr. swelt
zcr's parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. A.
hweitzer, of Jiverett, wash., en
joyed a trip Sunday to Bend, Ore.
Mr. sweltzer plans to take his
parents back to Everett over the
coming weekend.

Back From Coast Carl Seelev.
of Seeley's Sound Service, has
returned to his home in Rose-
burg, following a few days at
the coast attending to business
and visiting friends. While at
Mapleton, he visited friends who
formerly resided in the same
Illinois town he did.

Go to Medford Mr. and Mrs.
Forest Losee and Mr. and Mrs. J.
P. Motschenbacher of Roseburg
went to Medford Tuesday to in-
stall new officers for the Med-
ford Lions and Lady Lions Clubs.
Mr. Losee is district governor for
the Lions and Mrs. Motschen-
bacher is past state president of
the Lady Lions.

Visit In Eugene Mr. and Mrs.
Lome Swenson have returned to
their home at Brockway, follow-
ing a three-da- stay in Eugene as
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Gene
Nabb. Mr. Swenson is a linotype
operator for the News-Revie-

Mrs. Nabb worked for the News-Revie-

prior to moving to Eu-
gene.

Perrys Return Mr. and Mrs.
Fred L. Perry have returned to
their home in Roseburg, follow-
ing a trip to Fresno, Calif., to at-
tend the Fresno State Colleee
commencement exercises, at
wnicn time tneir son, Don perry,
was graduated from the School in
Industrial Arts and received his
B. A. degree. He mlnored in
speech. Don is a member of Kap-
pa Delta Rho, national fraternity.
He plans to take a special course
at the college during the summer
school sessions. Mrs. Perry re-
turned to her work at the Com- -

COMPLETE

Highway 99 N.

THE PROOF

LOCAL
Vacationing Mr. and Mrs,

George Weseman of Roseburg
are spending the weeK vacation
ing.

Sewing Club to Mtet The
Rifle Rangers Sewing Club will
meet Thursday at 2 o'clock at the
Home oi Mrs. Addle bcmcK.

Team to Practice The Eagles
Auxiliary drill team will meet
Thursday night at 8 o'clock at
the Eagles hall to practice.

Potluck Lunchean The Rid-

dle P. N. G. Club will meet at a
noon potluck luncheon Thursday
at the home of Mrs. Ann Worth-ington- .

Club to Meet The Childrens
Club will meet Thursday night
at the Olalla hall. Games will be
played during the social hour.
All young people of the commun-

ity are) invited.

Back From Fort Lewis Col.
Robert Irving has returned to his
work at the Douglas Abstract
Company, following the last 17
days at camp at Fort Lewis,
Wash.

Vaoatlonlng Mr. and Mrs. Jim
Turk of Roseburg are enjoying
a vacation on the Rogue. Their
small daughter, Kathy, is stay-
ing in Bandon with her grand-
parents. Mr. Turk is advertis-
ing manager of the Roseburg
News-Revie-

To Meet Thursday Women
of the Roseburg Country Club
will meet Thursday morning at
8:30 o'clock at the club course
for golfing. Luncheon will be
served at 12:30 o'clock and the
contract bridge play will begin
at 1:30 o'clock.

To Entertain Winners The
losing team in the pest hunt con-

test of Evergreen Grange will
entertain the winning side Sun-
day, July 3, at the hall. All mem-ebr- s

of the Grange are asked
to be at the hall at 10 a.m.

Son Is Born A son, weighing
seven pounds was born Monday,
June 27, at 7 p.m., at Sacred
Heart Hospital in Eugene to
Mr. and Mrs. William Fredericks
of Eugene. Mrs. Fredericks was
formerly Shirley Carter of this
city. Her parents, Mr. and Mrs,
H. B. Carter of Roseburg spent
Monday evening in Eugene with
her. The Carters' younger daugh-
ter, Miss Ann, is attending sum-
mer school at University of Ore-
gon. ,

BOYER'S
MEAT MARKET

After July flrit we will ogain

accept custom cutting and

slaughtering.

PORK ROAST

Lean Center 45cCuts, lb.

Assorted

LUNCH MEAT

Lb. 45c

SAUSAGE

Lean, well 35cseasoned, lb.

SLAB BACON

Lean, light, our
everyday price, lb. 35c

MATSON'S
FRESH PRODUCE
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Work on the extension and
chlorinating of Glendale's water
supply system will begin very
soon, according to an announce-
ment made by Don Saver, city re
corder. The contractors, on whom
the work has been waiting, are
bound by their contract to begin
work by about July a.

The road from Sether Avenue
to the pumping site has been
comDleted. so that the contrac
tors will not be hampered in be
ginning their work.

Also, because of a serious loss
nf water between the intake from
the dam on Section Creek and the
city reservoir, work was begun
Thursday on replacing leaky sec-

tions of pipe in that area.
So far as is possible, says

Sayer, local help will be em-

ployed both on the repair and the
new worn.

to the beginning of the auction a
deposit In the amount as nerein
after reouired. If an oral bid is
declared to be high at the closing
of the auction, the bidder must
immediately confirm the bid by
submitting It In duplicate on the
regular Bureau of Land Manage-
ment bid proposal form. The cut-

ting and removal of the timber
shall be carried out in accordance
with the forest practice rules ap-

proved on July 7, 1938 by the
Secretary of the Interior. Each
bid must state the amount per
thousand feet, board measure,
that will be paid for each species,
the total consideration which wili
be paid for the timber and a
statement that the bidder will
comply with local manufacturing
requirements as hereinafter
stated. No bid for less than the
appraised value will be consid-
ered. Each sealed bid must be
submitted in duplicate and be ac-

companied by a deposit. The de
posit must be m cash or in tne
form of a certified check on a
solvent bank and in favor of the
Treasurer of the United States.
The amount of the deposit will
be at least iiU7o of the first Sl.uuu
of the appraised value of the tim
ber; an additional iu7o or tne
next $9,000; an additional 5 of
the amount between $10,000 and
$100,000: and an additional 3
of any amount In excess of $100,- -

U00. I he deposit will be returned
to unsuccessful bidders; applied
as a part of the purchase price of
the high bidder; or that portion
of the deposit representing the
minimum required by law shall
be retained as liquidated damages
if the high bidder does not exe-
cute contract and furnish satis
factory bond within thirty days
of acceptance of the bid-o- can-
not furnish evidence of his abil-
ity to comply with the local mar-
keting requirements. In sales

CENTER
FREE PARKING!

BEST FOODS

MAYONNAISE

Pt.Jar 33c

63cQuart Jar

FRIDAY MYSTERY

?
SPECIALS

Start Friday Morning

End Friday Night
In Addition to Ad Specials

CANNING

SUPPLIES!

Low Prices at Wally's

CERTO

19c
BOTTLE

Autos

USED CARS

Traded In

On New

Hudsons
Own.
Pymt

1041 Buick Sedan 1190.00 400.M

1941 Hudson Sup.r--
Sedan . 931.00 390.M

1947 Hudson
Brom-Sup- r . 1495.00 100 M

1940 Pontile Sedan 4-- . 9S0.00 390.00

1940 Hudson Super--
Coupe . 799.00 SO0 .00

1941 Ford Coupe 8M.00 300.00

1939 Hudson Six Sedan . 016.00 290.00

Mor Car For Your $ Ar

ROSEBURG HUDSON CO.

HUDSON DEALER

702 S. Stephens Ph. 1278--

FOR SALE '39 Bulck coupe.
radio and heater. Inquire Wallac
Wilson, 'a mile west of Fairground
after 4:00 p. m.

FOR SALE '41 Plymouth deluxe
sedan. Excellent condition. Vacuum
booster, heater, windshield squirts,
$795. 827 Houck St. Phone 351--

1940 CHEVROLET Master deluxe coup
as is $345.

Inquire 206 Douglas Co. Stat Bank
Bldg. or Phone 466.

'41 PONTIAC silver streak 6 Sacrlfic
my equity, $400. Phone

Farm Equipment
FOR SALE

Earlhave for One t. auger table,
Massey-Harr- Combine,

used very little. A- -l condition $3,000.
Automatic clutch. Love Pickup Reel
(extra) $150.

One Oliver Crop Tractor. Good
condition $1,000.

One Platform Reo Truck, t. bed
with cab. 7,50x20- tires. Hauls 150
sacks' grain; good condition $500.

One p. Feed Grain Grind-
er complete $300.

One 325 acre grain and seed or cattl
ranch; 223 acres under cultivation;
balance pasture; good buildings.

One same type ranch practi-
cally all under cultivation. All land
$100 per acre.

E, G BATES, Owner
P. O. Box 67

Junction City. Oregon
1 USED No. 62 Int. harv. 6' englndriven combine. Excellent ennriitinn
1 USED caterpillar "22" Crawler tractor.

peneci condition.
1 USED 10' Dyrr heavy duty Tandem

disc, completely rebuilt New guaran-
tee.

1 USED 14" plow on rubber
iikc new.

SIG FETT
527 N. Jackson Phon 1150

Woods Bros. Combines
CAN MAKE DELIVERY NOW.

Umpqua Tractor Co.
FORD TRACTOR DEALERS

FOR SALE Irish Fordson, 100 gal.Ward s Sprayer, slightly used, M. M.
combine with motor, irrigation sprink-
ler. 840 ft. ot pipe with 13 sprinklers,1 n mowers with tractor
hitches, stock trailer and washing ma-
chine. Contact Lewis Wilson, Patter-
son's Bakery after 6:00 d. m.

FOR SALE OR TRADE for livestock.
e rt. AlctJormlck Deerlng No. 62 com-
bine. 3 years old. Ready to go to
Work. Lawrence Michaels, Canyon- -
viiie. iwji.

FOR SALE Slightly Used model 30 Mat--
sey Harris tractor and 2 bottom plow.
Roseburg Grange Supply.

THRASHING MACHINE and binder
$100. Art Rye hard, Yoncalla.

Logging Equipment
SKAGIT LOADER powered with new

mercury engine complete with goodsled and some lines. Price $1,500.
Inquire Heath Bros, at Hew Lumber
Company, S. Myrtle Creek Road, Myr-
tle Creek. Oregon.

INTERNATIONAL TRACTOR T. D. 40
jjiesei, ready tor logging. Drum blade

complete overhaul. Phone
or night call Mr. Norden, Umpqua

Boiler Repair
Sales and Installation.
Steel Construction Co.

Eugene 6312-- or 8,189 W
D4 CAT, serial number wlta

Hyster drum and LaPlant Choat hy-
draulic dozer. See at Tyee Lumber Co.,
Sutherlin, Ore., or phon 1202 Suther- -
lin.

FOR RENT New BU 30 loader. Sled.
lines and all rigging. Will go any-where. E. G. Nelson, 1220 E. 3rd,Roaebura--. Phone 2.16--

FOR SALE -- TD 14. TD lfl enulDBeMl fnr
logging. Arch with TD 14. Call after
o:uvp, rnone

1948 TON PICKUP. drive.
12,000 miles. Howard Mlckelsen, Rout
1. Box 31. Sutherlin.

FOR SALE D4 Cat equipped for log- -
uium una aiaae. ian D seen atnterstate Tractor. Mauric Weber.

SMALL LOGGING arch, 129 2nd Av.So. Phone 432.

Tracks
INTERNATIONAL pickup; 1

1948 International pickup: 1 alnfi. axl.
DUini trailer For information Phon

432. 139 2nd Ave. south.
TOR SALE WB28 White truck and

trailer with Job, reasonable terma.
See Don Witcher, Rt. 1. Box 149--

evenings or Phone l.

SALE 1337 Fnrrt ud.i, dliverv
v- Ace Electric, 318 E. 2nd Av. N.
Phone .

1948 TON PICKUP drivT
12.000 miles Howard Mlckelsen, Rout.
1. Box 31, Sutherlin.

AXLE SHAFTS, for all makes of trucks.
SI " V2C! ."P. N- Stephens,Phon.

For Trade
Farm Machinery

I ft. Oliver combine. Oliver 70 tractor.
One 14" plow, T ft powermower. 7 ft. tandem disc, 3 section,
fjex hsrrow. 1 heavy tractor trailer.Cash or trade for 49 automobile. Call
S03 Yoncalla, Noble Snider.

w'y- - TRADE" equity of 81800 in new
,

9 'ordr Hudson sedan for equityra hou cl0 '" c"lsnd.R l

Hay, Grain, Feed
FOR SALE-Alf- alfa and oat mlied h.v.

K, J' n "l,.d,"r'J G'don Hughei.
Garden Vall.v

HAY TOR SALE. 70 tST irxw, n
ciitttni alfalfa, wire ble. o. .
HindV. M rc BKnn. a r OI

Autos

LockwoocTs

Used Cars
Every Car

In Stock On
The Spot

Prices Slashed
To A New All

Time Low
1948 DODGE FORDOR SDN.

Beautiful to see and to
drive. Rest while vou drive
this one. Every extra 1795.00

1948 PACKARD FORDOR SDN.
For tops in beauty check
this one. radio
and heater, and many more.
extra low mileage 2399.00

ivvt funu f UKUUH nun.
No slipshod car for your
monev. Shinv new metalie
paint - 1205.00

1947 FORD TUDOR SDN.
Lovely lady, here's your
car. Inside and out she
looks like new. Tod notch
performance 1266.00

1947 FORD STATION WAGON
Boom for the whole family
Dlus bafftrane. Dvnamlte in a
smooth package 1295.00

1VW rlIiVlUUlll UUUfG.
Mechanically perfect A
honev anvwav you look at
It. Low mileage too 1395.00

184(1 LHEV KULET ULiUH CUUfl
Real savings on this sporty
little iob. Lots of extras.
Top performance 1243.00

1946 FORD CLUB COUPE
Newest one on the lot
Fully eoulDDed. Perform
ance plus In this motor. 1295.00

1946 FORD TUDOR SDN.
Save yourself worry: drive
without strain. Swell look
erfull of value 1095.00

1946 FORD TUDOR SDN.
Brilliant good looks. All
the extras you need. Like
new power plant 1195.00
LMtVMULtT 1UUUK OUN.
Mechanically sound. De

1941 MERCURY FORDOR SDN.
New motor. Radio and
heater. Here's a peach for
Dunishment 1050.00

Storage room behind front
seat. Small, sturdy, for con
stant use 745.00

1941 rOHB FORDOR SDN.
Driving made a pleasure
with this little mum. Ra
dio and heater 745.00

You Can Bet

You'll Pay Less For

Used Cars At
LOCKWOOD MOTORS

Open Sundays
9 Till 3

Better Buys
At Barcus

VACATION SPECIALS

1948 Packard super convertible. All
extras, uniy ia,ouu mues. new
car guarantee, yet priced $1200
under new price.

1941 Olds sdnette. Hydra ma tic.
R. & H. Excellent Condition 1095

1942 Plymouth sdn. new paint
reconditioned motor. A real
bargain 995

1939 Oldsmobil sedan. X.
& H., reduced pric .. ....... 696

1946 Dodg sedan. New paint and
tires, i nis is an especiallyclean car. REpUCED PRICE.... 15t

1937 Ford sdn. 395

1937 Ford coup 350

1936 Chrysler, air flow 5 passen
ger coups, xnis car it ex-

ceptional for only
1938 Ford S dr. sdn.

1938 Char. 4 door sdo.

1930 Modal A Ford sdn. 148

BANK TERMS OPEN EVENINGS

BARCUS SALES &

SERVICE

Your Packard Dealer
Hwy. 9, N. at Garden Vall.y Road

Roseburg

Used Car
Center
Oak and Rose

FINE USED CARS
Reaionablv BrtcA R M A G rma

Chevrolet Buick Pontlao Cadillac
trade-in-

For Sale
1947 Oldsmobil. 93

CLUB SEDAN A 1 condition and rub-
ber. $1975. Terms. Phone 441 J 4.

FORSALE 1946 super" 6 Hudson, private party, neater, new tires, 1st Class
condition. Special at $1193. Bank
terms. Henry I. Campbell, E. 1st Ave.,
between Willamette and Umpqua.
outncriio.

For Sale
1937 OLDSMOBILR 4 door Sedan HA 46

motor) saw cash, contact AI Williams,
Yoncalla.

TOR SALE 1939 Ford deluxe se--
aan, motor overnauied, anginal finish,
good clean upholstery, hand operatedbooster brake, seal beam lltes, life-
guard tubes, good tires. Price tties.
Phone 1114-- or see at 1259 West
First Street

MY EQUITY FOR SALE

Late '48 Chevrolet
Convertible

All extras, low tnlltn
1200 Corey Ave. or 186-- J after 6 30

1937 PLYMOUTH SEDAN. Nic clean
car, reasonably priced. See at 28
Ann Ave. Coatei Addition after 6:00

m.
'33 FORD WITH '46 MOTOR and '34

rear end and transmission. Good
shape, good upholstery. $196. Ph.
12H:UL.

MORE" MONEY-f-
or

your car. Cash on
me spot, Motors, inc.
Soto, Plymouth. Phon 408. 114 N.
Rose St

1940 FORD CONVERTIBLE, new black
faint job. planed nose and trunk

Mercury engine, new tires. Phone
1048 J after 3:00 in evenings.

1946 NASH 600 h bed. radio,
heater, low mileage. Perfect through-
out. $1443. Phone 348 or 1264 R.

1936 FORD adooir. Good motor. $175
cash. Hillcrest Motel, N. Stephens,

1948 PLYMOUTH station wagon Radio
ana neaier. iiw mileage, can BUQ.
412 Ella St.

1939 LA SALLE Good condition, good
rubber, radio, heater and seat covers.
R. Cary. 2 ml. K of Dixonvtlle.
9 STITDKBAKER for Kile Good tires
and battery, seal beam lights $60.
1330i Cedar St. Phone U0O--

1938 FORD, CLEAN, tfood Ures, air
plane shocks. 135 Cedar, Riverside
Addition

1933 BUICK SEDAN, good motor and
res. 23 726 Rtdceview St

MUST SELL '38 Ford Tudor CleaA ear

Help Wanted
Wanted

First Class Body Man

Ted's Auto Body Service
Corner Metros, and Looklnggl.ss Hosd

Wanted
Auto Mechanics

Service Salesman
LOCKWOOD MOTORS

WANTED PART TIME secretary for
afternoon work. Shorthand desirable
but not required. Muit be able to
type and do simple bookkeeping. State
experience and salary expected. Write

aox owe.

CAR HOP WANTED
AT

THE DRIYE INN
ONI MILE SO. ON HIWAY 99

WANTED Rachet letter and edgerman
in diesel electric mill. SO M capacity.
Cawrse Lbr. Co. Phone Myrtle

oi ni, uragon.
SALESMAN WANTED. Must have car.

Good watei, See Mr, Bain between
9 and 11 "a. m. 230 N. Stephens, Rm,

HELP WANTED Truck to haul loes.
short haul. Phone 4 after 6:00

WANTED YARDING donkey for about
a minion. au

Work Wanted

Rsbg. Sanitation Service
SEPTIC tanks cleaned, no extra charge

zor arain lines, no cnarge lor open-I-
tank. PromDt service. No mile.

age charge, reasonable rates, specialrates for commercial tank.
Ph. 1563-- P.O. Box 286

2444 N. Stephens
ALL BUILDING construction, new and

old, remodeling, IQ down, no Job too
large or too amau, un lype masonry
construction. flaaafnnm and brlrk-
barbecues and patios a specialty.

floors and drainboards. Phone
iaw-H-- contractor. A. it. snow.

Oliver's
Septic Tanks and Drain Fields Installed.

Tames jfumped
Roseburg, Oregon

Phone 3 Rt. 1, Box Tl

Custom Watering ,
BY THE HOUR or contract You fur.

nun road and water and we do rest.
Li. j. wnson, autnernn. n. jxti.

MAN WITH several years' experienceun reiau ury cleaning route wouia ime
opportunity to learn piant work
starting in cleaning room. Write Box
vw,

Your Shake Maker
Bill Badger, Drew

Carpenter Work
By Hour or Contract

Write H. C. Harty, C.V. Star Rt
DO YOU WANT to go vacationing and

jiavei yuur viiutiren ana nome tflKcn
care or? uaii nitJ-L- , mornings,after 6:00 p. m.

EXPERIENCED baby sitter wants work
any evening, except Tuesdays, rhone
II J.

FLOOR COVERING Complete sales and
installations, rree estimates. Modern
y ioor covering, v none :.4B.

ALTERATIONS, DRESSMAKING.
types. Mrs. Don W. Garrison,Madrone St. Phone 802--

EXPERIENCED WOMAN would like
ironim house cleaning. Phone

HOME FOR CHILDREN by week
month. (Certified) Phone S63--

WILL DO IRONING in my home. Phone

WATER WELL DRILLER, Phone 660--

Carl E. W. Bell, oan. jacKson.
WILL DO IRONING In your home. Call

io-- n anytime.
PIANO TUNER J S Jane. Ph. 1340-- lt

Wanted
Wanted

BEEF, VEAL AND PORK

Fred Boyer
Phone or 5 or writ

Houie i, itoseourg
Will Pay CaTi;

WE BUY used furniture, all types. Call
at 444 No. Jackson. Phone 1593--

The Bargain House
WANTED 2 BEDROOM homo for new

Firestone manager and family. Best
of reference If necessary. Phone 372,
Mr. Clune.

TEACHER. WIFE' and babv dpstra to
rent unfurnished house or
apartment in or near city. Reliable,no smoking or drinking. Phone 1137--

WOULD LIKE to rent cabin Suitable
for 2, on th North Umpqua, perma-nentl-

JBox 901.
Wanted to buy small 2 to 10 m ft

capacity sawmilL Writ Box 898, co
CALL Al's for fair bid on your fur.

nlture. Al's Furniture Center, 114 Win
cnester ml rnone ua7-K- .

WANTED TO BUY All kinds of furnt-tur- .

Let us bid on your house of fur- -

nlture. Call 803-- at B09 N. Jackson St
$10 REWARD for information leading

to tne rental or a nice a oearoom
home. Phone

WANTED TO BUY Used furniture.
Winston Furnlutr Exchange, Phone

WANTED 1 Used row boat, 12 to 14 ft.
Call 144--

WANT TO RENT House, adults. Call
U 97 L morn ngs.

WANTED Water well drilling. Lloyd
Powell. 714 Rldgevlew. Phone 128S--

WANTED TO BUY Hides and wast
fats. Roseburg Meat Co. Phoo 260.

Building Materials
SPECIAL

Grade A 8" grooved
Redwood siding,
$145.00 per M.

PHONE or see at Vernon Crane
residence. Garden VaJley Road.

Cement -
0Q lbs. rolled roofing.
45 id. ronea rooiina.
Grade 1 shingles
Also Sherwtn Williams paints at adver- -

useQ prices.Your Hardware Stor
Howard's Hardware

Winston, Oregon

Fuel
Wood

FIREPLACE, stov and furnac. green
or dry. Peeler core, mill, and hard
woods. Special lengths. Prompt deliv-
ery. Claude Wiltey, Rt 1, Box 43. Ph.

or
GET YOUR ORDERS In now for season-

ed Oak and Laurelwood. Price for
3 tier truck load, $18.50. Special priceon 20 cords or more. 2 ft. fireplaceand furnace wood and 16" for stov.
rnone iHii--

SAWDUST
18 MILL WOOD

CO.
Prompt Dellveiy

Phon 13

Machinery For Sale
DON'T BUY DITSRL POWER Till you'vseen Gilkey Gulberton single 130350

DUALUNTT, b.hp.
O. M C. Gray marine diesels, 169 k. p.,
3 HYSTKR straddle buggies, large.
FACTORY TRAINED MECHANICS, eom- -

Klete stock of parts. Oregon's only
Guiberson dealer.

Gilkey Diesel Sales
333 N. Jack too

fOR SaH LeTourneau Angle dozer,
complete with front ad P.C.U. foe

eat L Mortnan, SO ft. Pin.

Instruction

Clip This Ad
. WANTED

Men 17 to 55 To Learn

REFRIGERATION

Learn By Doing
Come for Interview with W. C. T. I.

representative at Umpqua Hotel, re-

garding starting dates, housing and
e jobs. Interviews on JTli

10 a. m. to 7 p. m. ONLY.

G. I. APPROVED

Timber Sawmills
WANT PEELED Douglas Ftr poles and

tiling delivered to our yard at Greenf4 mi. South of Roseburgi. Contact ui
for price and sizes before cutting.
Pugei Timber Co., P.O. Box 46, Bow
burg. Phone 1339.

oawmill
PORTABLE BELLS AW iawm.ll, new,

still crated, include! planer. W. R
Da me wood, Silver Nook Grill.

FOR SALE Sawmill or any part.
G.M.C. diesel edger and other unit.
Roy Denny, 835 Vi Winchester.

Dogs
BEAUTIFUL GREAT DANE puppies.

International champion sir. From
one of America's favorite blood lines.
For show, companion and guard.
Truly a dog of rare beauty and in-

telligence. Write Hollis Sumpter, Rt.
1, Uox 273-- Roseburg. Phone 1586- -

B

Jacob's Kennel's Ph. 73-6- -J

GRA-H- COCKER KENNELS, Phone 630
or 492-- Reg. and ped. pupplea,all
colors. Stud service.

Lost Found
ANYONE FINDING lady's Bulova h

In clothing washed at Wirth's
Washerteer on Monday, June 27,
please return to Wirth's Washerteer.
Reward. '

$29 REWARD for return of small white
aog, namea xiuicn, unc uiavft ojb,black ears, black spot on rump.
R eply aox 899.

LOST. Red billfold, Loren Miller. No
money, vaiuaDie papers, eic. ieave at

office for reward.
LOST $15 in currency. 137 Kane.

Notice
CARD OF THANKS

WE WISH to take this opportunity to
express our appreciation jar xne Kina-ne-

and sympathy extended by our
friends during our recent bereave-
ment, and for the beautiful floral

MRS. MARTHA STEINER.
MRS. GERTRUDE HELFRICH.
MRS. REGINA MILLER.
MRS TWARTR FUTRELL.

Business Opportunities
COUNTRY STORE for sale. Good com

munity. HeasonaDie.
Box 885.

FOR LONG TERM LEASE, city highway
frontage. Approximately auu it. ewi- -

Review, ttox o.
MOTOR COURT for sals. Call 199 -

over $5,000, and in small sales
when required, the high bidder
will be required to furnish a
Bwnrn financial statement show
ing ability to fulfill the terms of
tne contract, a Dona on an saies
will be required In an amount
computed at the rate of at least
15 per cent of the bid price. Pay-
ment for timber will be required
in advance of cutting, payment
In full at the time of filing the
contract being required
amounting to $5,000 or less. In
larger sales, the Regional Admin-
istrator may permit payment in a
number of installments. The right
is hereby reserved to waive tech-
nical defects in the advertise-
ment; to reject all bids, or to
award the timber for the amount
of the highest bid to the next
highest qualified bidder when
the officer authorized to approve
the contract shall deem the high
bidder unqualified to fulfill the
contractual requirements of the
advertisement Timber sold In ac-

cordance with this advertisement
must be manufactured within the
marketing area as designated for
each tract described below in ac-

cordance with the Orders of the
Secretary of the Interior, No.
2285, and Nos. 2380 to 2390, Incl.,
dated December 11, 1946 and No-

vember 29, 1947, respectively. The
United States has by agreement
been given the right to authorize
its purchasers to use certain
roads and rights-of-wa- y for the
removal of timber. Each bidder
should ascertain from the respec-
tive District Forester's office the
location of the road right-of-wa-

covered by such agreement relat-

ing to the tract upon which he
wishes to bid. It is the bidder's
responsibility to determine for
himself the extent to which such
agreement will permit the use of
the road or right-of-wa- y subject
to the payment of reasonable
compensation to the assignor of
the United States. Further infor-
mation, including copies of the
form of contract, bid forms and
schedules of contract payments
may be obtained at District Of-

fices of the Bureau of Land
Management, located at Salem,
Eugene, Roseburg, Coos Bay, and
Medford, Oregon, or at the office
of the Regional Administrator,
Building No. 1, Swan Island, Port-
land 18, Oregon. Dated at Port
land, Oregon, this 24th day of
June 1949. ORAL AUCTION BID:
IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: DOUG-- !

LAS MARKETING AREA: T. 20
S., R. 7 W., VV. M., Sec. 25, all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on the EINElNEi
and NWiNEJ, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 43
branded Douglas fir trees con-

taining approximately 240 M.
feet. No bid for less than $14.95
per M. ft. B. M or a total pur-

chase price of $3,588.00. will be
considered. SEALED BID: IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY: DOUGLAS
MARKETING AREA: T. 22 S., R.
7 V., W. M Sec. 15, all mer-- '
chantable timber designated for
cutting on por. NEiNWi. esti-- I

mated for the purpose of this
sale to be 29 branded Douglas fir
trees containing approximately
(0 M. feet. No bid for less than
$9.45 per M. ft. B. M., or a total
purchas prleo of $."i67.00, will be
considered. SEALED BID: IN
COOS COUNTY: SOUTH COAST
OR DOUGLAS MARKETING
AREAS: SALVAGE SALE: T. 29
S., R. 9 W., M. W., See. 33, all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on por. NWJSWJ, es-- '
timated for the purpose of this
sale to be 580 M. feet Douglas
fir, 135 M. feet Hemlock. No bid
for less than $5.00 per M. Ft. B.
M., for the Douglas fir, S?.0n w
M. ft. B. M. for the Hemlock, or
a total purchase price oi

will b considered.

PUDDING!of e

Everybody says "We sell cheaper." Who can you believe? Let our

friendly, courteous service and low prices please you.

CARNATION

MILK
TALL CANS

10c

LIBBY South American

ROAST BEEF

DENNIS0NS

FINE QUALITY

PORK & BEANS

NO. 1 TIN

c

49c

49c

LBS. 97c

15c
6 FOR 79c

5.9848 FOR

MAXWELL HOUSE, 1 lb.

COFFEE 2

DEL MONTE

PEAS
NO. 303 TIN

BEGMORE canned

DOG FOOD

GOD'S WORD
29. And ho that ovoroumoth, and keopoth my works, unto

tho nd, to him will I glv powtr ovtr tho nutlonti

27, And hi .hull rult thorn with a rod of Iron) at tho
veiael. of a pottor shall they bo broken to ihlvort;
tven ai I received of my Father,

Revelation 2:2a, ir

s l -- ana runs guoa. ra. nji-i- .


