
of the next $9,000; an additional Bureau of Land Management.12 Tht News-Revie- Roieburg, Or. Fri., June 24, 1949
5 of the amount between 1V
000 and $100,000: and an addiLEO Ait NOTICE

T. 30 s., n. 7 w., w.M., See. 17,
all merchantable timber desig-
nated for cutting on por. SJNEJ,
por. NEISW1. all SEISW1. SEi.

branded Ponderosa Pine, $23.00

per M. ft. B.M. for the branded
Sugar Pine, $3.50 per M. ft. B.M.
for the Incense Cedar and Hem-
lock, $4.30 per M. ft. B.M. for
the White Fir, or a total purchase
price of $79,592.00, will be

tional 3 of any amount in ex

of reorganization of the debtor wfhin
the time fixed for the debtor to file
plan of reorganisation or any extension
thereof.

3. The court reserves jurisdiction to
extend or continue the time for any of
the filings herein referred to or the
time of the foregoing hearing without
xurther notice. .

DATED June 3, 1949
PORTER CHEEK LUMBER CO.,
By A. E. STEB1NCER,

President.

estimated for the purpose of this
IN THE DISTRICT COURT OF TH1

UNITED STATES FOR THE
DISTRICT OE OREGON
In Proceeding! for th

Reorganization of a Corpora Uo
No.

In the Matter of
PORTER CREEK LUMBER CO..

Corporation, Debtor.
NOTIC--

sale to be 1185 M. feet Douglas
fir, 410 M. feet branded Ponder-os-a

Pine, 85 M. feet branded
Sugar Pine, 15 M. feet White Fir.
60 M. feet Incense Cedar. No

To the Secretary of the Treasury, the andHouse, CommercialSpcurJtlei and Exchange Commliiion
and all creditor! and atock holder of Beautify

the purpose of this sale to be
1770 M. feet Douglas fir, 315 M.
feet Douglas fir, 110
M. feet White Fir, 10 M. feet
Hemlock, 5 M. feet Port Orford
Cedar, 10 M. feet branded Sugar
Pine, 45 M. feet Incense Cedar,
10 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than $6.15
per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas
fir, $1.50 per M. ft. B.M. for the

d Douglas fir and
Incense Cedar, $2.50 per M.

ft. B.M. for the White Fir, Hem-
lock, and Incense Cedar, $15.00
per M. Ft. B.M. for the Port
Orford Cedar, $22.40 per M. ft.
B.M. for the branded Sugar Pine,
or a total purchase price of
$12,084.50, will be considered.
SOUTH UMPQUA OR JOSE-
PHINE MARKETING AREAS:
T. 31 S R. 3 W., W.M., Sec. 29,
all merchantable timber designat-
ed for cutting on the NEJ, NE4-NW-

por. WlNWi, all SEiNWJ,

the debtor:

cess of 5100,000. me deposit
will be returned to unsuccessful
bidders; applied as a part of the
purchase price of the high bid-

der; or that portion of the de-

posit representing the minimum
required by law shall be retain-
ed as liquidated damages if the
high bidder does not execute
contract and furnish satisfactory
bond within thirty days of ac-

ceptance of the bid or cannot
furnish evidence of his' ability to
comply with the local marketing
requirements. In sales over
$5,000, and In small sale when
required, the high bidder will be
required to furnish a sworn
financial statement showing

Notice hereby U given that pursuant
to order of tha d court Your Grounds

Tt,A haaith, nt vmir cjrnllnHfl All.
duly made and entered in the d

cauie on June 3, 1949:

IN THE COUNTY COURT OF TH
STATE OF OREGON FOR THE

COUNTY OF DOUGLAS
PUBLICATION OF

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
In the Matter of the Estate

of
JAKE BOBBINS. Deceased.

Notice is hereby given that S.
has been appointed and has

qualified as the administrator of the
above entitled estate. All persons hav-
ing claims against the estate should
present Ihem with proper voucher! to
the said administrator at the office of
Avery W. Thompson, attorney at law,
203 Douglas County State Bank Build

Industrial Wiring
Electrical Trouble Shooting
Motor and Appliance Re-pa-

Free Pick-U- and Delivery
Service

17 Years Experience

1. All creditor! and toexnojaem or
e debtor are directed to file their

claimi and proof of intereit on or be-
fore June 30. 1949, with the Clerk of

hanoes the beauty of your
home. Arrange now to have
our skilled gardeners do your
landscape Job. Free estimates.

the united state unmet court tor tne
Dittrlct of Oregon, United Statei Court
Hnuu. Portland. Oregon: Droofi of

L. H. McPherson
Rt. 2, Box 153 Phone 715-J--

ing. rtoseDurg, ureson, wnuin ivj
months from the date of this notice.

Dated this loth day of June, 1949.
s u nnnniNS. Adminis

claim and proof, of intereit ihall be
substantially in the form subscribed by
Section 57 of the National Bankruptcy
Act and related rules of the Supreme
Court of the United States; If a claim
is founded upon any written Instrument,
the same shall be filed with the claim:

ACE ELECTRIC
Licensed

E. 2nd Ave. N. Ph. 1095--

bid lor less than $4.65 per M. ft.
B.M. for the Douglas fir, $14.55
per M. ft. B.M. for the branded
Ponderosa Pine, $19.90 per M.
ft. B.M. for the branded Sugar
Pine, $2.80 Der M. ft. B.M. for
the White Fir, $2.50 per M. ft.
B.M. for the Incense Cedar, or a
total purchase price of $13,359.25,
will be considered. SOUTH UMP-QU-

MARKETING AREA: T. 32
S., R. 1 W., W.M., Sec. 3, all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on por. SE1SWJ, all
NiSEJ, por. SW1SEJ, all SEiSEt,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 6295 M. feet Douglas
fir, 25 M. feet branded Sugar
Pine, 160 M. feet White Fir, 160
M. feet Incense Cedar, 10 M. feet
Hemlock. No bid for less than
$6.25 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Douglas fir, $20.40 per M. ft. B.M.
for the branded Sugar Pine, $3.00
per M. ft. B.M. for the White
Fir, $2.30 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Incense Cedar, $2.50 per M. ft.

trator of the above entitled
estate.

Date of first publication June 10. 1940,
Date of last publication July 8, 1948.

except upon order of court for cause
shown, no holder of any claim or in- -

INEJ5W4, por. WiSWl, por. SEI-SW-

all SEJ, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 7980
M. feet Douglas fir, 770 M. feet
branded Ponderosa Pirfe, 85 M.
feet branded Sugar Pine, 940 M.
feet Incense Cedar, 175 M. feet
White Fir. 65 M. feet Hemlock.

Notice of Timber Saleentitled proceeding In form and manner
aforesaid on or prior to said June 30,

ability to fulfill the terms of the
contract. A bond on all sales
will be required in an amount
computed at the rate of at least
15 per cent of the bid price. Pay-
ment for timber will be required
in advance of cutting, payment
in full at the time of filing the
contract being required In sales
amounting to $5,000 or less. In
larger sales, the Regional Admin-
istrator may permit payment in
a number of installments. The
right Is hereby reserved to waive
technical defects In the advertise-
ment; to reject all bids, or to

Ok, K yes rUHertrl Yen dwiys
Itpcvt vnSit I m thfnkfttf too! Any oartv la Interest mar file ob- - SEALED BIOS, marked outside

"Bid for Timber," and addressed
to thee Regional Administrator,
Bureau of Land Management,
Region I, Room 131, Building No.

JetMluni to luch claim! and proofs of
Interest with the clerk of the d

court on or before July 11, 1849.
3. On July 21, 1H49, at the hour of

10:00 A. M., a hearing will be held be-
fore the Honorable Estea Snedecor. Ref

No bid for less than $7.65 per
M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas fir,
$16.00 per M. ft. B.M. for theeree In Bankruptcy, in Room 312, United

States Court House, Portland, Oregon,

LET US HELP
Remodel or Complete Your Home

Budget Plon If Desired

COEN SUPPLY COMPANY
Everything For The Builder

Floed 4 Mill Sts, Phone 121

1, Swan Island, rortlana is, ure-go-

will be received until and
opened at 2:00 P.M., PACIFIC

to consider all proofs of claim or In-
terest and all objectloni to proofs of

B.M. for the Hemlock, or a total
purchase price of $40,726.75, will
be considered. SEALED BID: IN

award the timber for the amount
of the highest bid to the nextclaim or interest filed as above set

forth.
Debtor is reauired on or prior to highest qualified bidder when tne

officer authorized to approve thejuiy .hj, iwih. 10 me in me amove-

Fire Equipment Co.
All types of Fire Extinguishers

and Refills.
GLENN H. TAYLOR

C02 Service
220 N. Main St Phone 1433--

entitled proceeding a olan of reoraani contract shall deem the high bidzation. and any creditor or stockholder

DOUGLAS COUNTY: DOUGLAS
MARKETING AREA: SALVAGE
SALE: T. 30 S., R. 9 W., W.M.,
Sec. 3, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on por.
SISWi, all SiSEi, estimated for

of tha debtor iikcwim may file a plan der unqualified to fulfill the
contractual requirements of the
advertisement. Timber sold in
accordance with this advertise

STANDARD TIME, on JUiy lz,
1949, tor the purchase of all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting upon tracts herein-
after described as SEALED BID:
ORAL AUCTION BIDS, will be
received by the District Forester
at hi office located In Room 206,
Post Office Building, Roseburg,
Oregon, at 2;00 P.M., PACIFIC
STANDARD TIME, on July 12,
1949, on those tracts of timber
hereinafter described under
ORAL AUCTION BID. Any seal-
ed bids on tracts so advertised

ment must be manufactured with-
in the marketing area as desig-
nated for each tract described
below in accordance with theill gaML S
Orders of the Secretary of the
Interior, No. 2285, and Nos. 2380
to 2390, Incl., dated December 11.

and accompanied by the required
deposit received by the District
Forester prior to the start of the
oral auction bidding, will be con

1946 and November 29, 1947,
respectively. The United States
has by agreement been given the
right to authorize its purchasers
to use certain roads and rights- -sidered the equivalent of an oral

bid and win be posted lor tne
Information of all bidders. To
qualify for oral auction bidding,
the bidder must submit to the
officer In charge of the sale,
prior to the beginning of the

Wiis buyers look for the Imperial
auction a deposit In the amount
as hereinafter required. If an
oral bid is declared to be high at
the closing of the auction, the
bidder must Immediately confirm
the bid bv submitting it In dupli

for the removal of timber.
Each bidder should ascertain
from the respective District
Forester's office the location of
the road right-of-wa- covered by
such agreement relating to the
tract upon which he wishes to
bid. It is the bidder's responsi-
bility to determine for himself
the extent to which such agree-
ment will permit the use of the
road or right-of-wa- subject to
the payment of reasonable com-
pensation to the assignor of the
United States. Further informa-
tion, including copies of the form
of contract, bid forms and sched-
ules of contract pavments may be
obtained at District Offices of

silver label that says the finest in

wallpapers. Guaranteed to with,
stand room exposure without fad-

ing and to clean satisfactorily
when Instructions art followed.

cate on the regular Bureau of
Land Management bid proposal
form. The cutting and removal
of the timber shall be carried
out In accordance with the forest
practice rules approved on July
7, 1938 by the Secretary of the
Interior. Each bid must state the
amount per thousand feet, board
measure, that will he paid lor

the Bureau of Land Management,
located at Salem, Eugene, Rose-
burg, Coos Bay, and Medford,
Oregon, or at the office of the
Regional Administrator, Building
No. 1, Swan Island, Portland 18,
Oregon. Dated at Portland, Ore

each species, the total considera-
tion which will be paid for the
timber and a statement that the

gon, mis ium aay ot June, 1949.
bidder will comply with local
manufacturing requirements as
hereinafter stated. No bid for
less than the appraised value will
be considered. Each sealed bid
must be submitted In duplicate

ORAL AUCTION BID; IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY: DOUGLASHome Furnishings MARKETING AREA: T. 20 S.
R. 6 W.. W.M., Sec. 25, all mer-
chantable tltnber desienated forand be accompanied by a deposit.

The deposit must be In cash or cutting on the SEJ, estimated for
the purpose of this sale to bein the form ot a certltled checK

on a solvent bank and In favor nia M. feet Douglas fir, 45 M.
feet Hemlock, 15 M. feet Western
Red Cedar, 20 M. feet Incense

of the Treasurer of the United
States. The amount of the de-

posit will be at least 20 of the
first $1,000 of the appraised value

PERSONALIZED SERVICE FOR THE HOME Leaar. No bid for less than
$8.65 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Douglas fir, $2.80 per M. ft. B.M.
for the Hemlock, Western Red

of the timber; an additional 10

Leoar and Incense Cedar, or a
total purenase price of $41,008.75
win ne considered. T. 25 8., R, 3
W., w.M. So. 35, all merchant- -

aoie timber designated for cut-tin-

on Lot 10 (NWiSFH) nni- -

Lot 11 (NEJSWJ), por. Lot 12
(NWlSWi), estimated for the

SPECIALS FOR SATURDAY, JUN! 23TH

purpose or this sale to be 2040 M.
feet Douglas fir, 205 M. feet
branded Sugar Pine, 20 M. feet
White Fir, 25 M. feet Incense
Cedar, 15 M. feet Red Cedar. No
bid for less than $9.80 per M: ft.
B.M. for the Douglas fir, $24.65
per M. ft. B.M. for the branded
Sugar Pine, $3.05 per M. ft. B.M.
for the White Fir, Incense Cedar,and Red Cedar, or a total pur-
chase price of $25,228.25, will be
considered. The contract for
sale of this timber will contain
special requirements for the pro-
tection of the Rock Creek Fish
Hatchery of the Oregon State
Game Commission. Details re-

garding these requirements can
he obtained from the District
Forester, Roseburg, Oregon, or
from the Regional Administrator,

DUZ

BIG fJ CU. FT. ZENITH v7Large
Pkg. .. 28c

MILK
ALL BRANDS

FRESH

FRUITS AND VEGETABLES

Watermelons
LB

4Vac

Cantaloupes
2 F0R 25c

LOCAL

Carrots 2 bunches 15c
NICE, FIRM

Tomatoes
2 LBS 19c

TENDER, YELLOW

Corn
EARS 35c

Gr. Onions & Radishes BUNCH 5c

Tall
Cons 12c

minim s rrm

81
non

BIG...
BETTER
BUY...

America's Best Refrigerator
Value of the Year... Bonus Offer

This beautiful 35-p- 4 d"innrwoe set plus genuine
Pyrex refrigerator set 43 pieces in atl included with your pur-cha- se

of Zenith De Luxe or Super De luxe refrigerator . . . ol ne
increase in price! Dainty Meissen pattern in soft pastel colors on

rich ivory glased domestic china from Crooktville potteries. All

this Is yours when you select your extra value Zenith Refrigerator
if you act at encel See and compare the features of both Zenith

Refrigerators with ether nationally advertised models that sell

from $10 to $40 higher See the "Seal-tito- " door latch, the extra

large crispert, the extra flexible food arrangement, and in the

Super De luxe, the extra capacity frozen feed storage space.
You'll be glad you bought Zenith!

GERBER'S

Baby Food

3 cons 23c

19cPORK & BEANS HOT WATER
HEATERNO. Vi CANS

Zenith Super De Luxe

Refrigerator c f f
There's ZENITH REFRIGCRATO ovoHeMe for tWIe w 1 89.9539cMAYONNAISE PINTS

On Display at Your Zenith Dealer Today!2 TALL CANS
DR. ROSS

DOG FOOD 25c
j a :

Ineuf k het weter for

everything ! Awtm-t- l,

ttiermeseet HN- -
CAMPBELL'S Ckramal!. . .

46-O- CANS
mitt, 'ifcerflee !23cTOMATO JUICE
lularM. MMry r
teek!SPERRY

2 ROLLS 29cpancaks PAPER TOWELS
WAFFLE

Myrtle Creek, Oregon

Marshall-Well- s Stores

Oakland, Oregon

Marshall-Well- s Stores

ROSEBURG, OREGON

MARSHALL-WELL- S STORES
130 N. JACKSON

HIWAY NORTH OF CITY
MIX SKIPPY

Easy Payment Ttrms
Available

W. M. Sandall Co.
Highway a North

Phone 1117R

oge PEANUT BUTTER jars 35c, 328-oz- .

Pkg


