
Regional Administrator, Building Frl., Juna 17, 1949 The News-Revie- Roseburg, Or. 3nu. i, awan isiana, roruana la,
required, the high bidder will be
required to furnish a sworn
financial statement showing
ability to fulfill the terms of the
contract. A bond on all sales
will be required in an amount

snip tn hA YT fut rtanoln
fir, 410 M. feet branded Ponder

uregon. Dated at Portland, Ore-
gon, this 10th day of June, 1949.
ORAL AUCTION BID: IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY: DOUGLAS
MARKETING AREA: T. 20 S.,
R. 6 W...W.M., Sec. 25, all mer-
chantable timhpr ripciannlnH fni--

computed at the rate of at least
15 per cent of the bid price. Pay

osa bo ki. ieet Dranned
Sugar Pine, 15 M. feet White Fir,
60 M. feet Incense Cedar. ' No
bid for less than $4.65 per M. ft.
B.M. for the Douglas fir, $14.55

ment for timber will be required
cutting on the SE1, estimated for

German-Authore- d Book Says
Hitler Murdered Pregnant
Niece To Hush Love Affair

By HERMAN M. TIMM
FRANKFURT, Germany, June 17 UP) A new German book

published in Germany alleges that Hitler killed his niece, Angela
Raubal, In 1932 after he learned that she was to become the mother
of his child.

The book Is a biography of Fritz Michael Gerlich, German news-

paper publisher who died in Dachau concentration camp in 1934 for

opposing the Nazis.
Author of the book is Baron Erwein von Aretin, a close acquaint

per m. it. b.m. tor the branded
Ponderosa Pine, $19.90 per M.
ft. B.M. for the branded Sugariv Myr -

feet Douglas fir, 110
M. feet White Fir, 10 M. feet
Hemlock, 5 M. feet Port Orford
Cedar, 10 M. Ieet branded Sugar
Pine, 45 M. feet Incense Cedar,
10 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than $6.15
per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas
fir, $1.50 per M. ft. B.M. for the
fire-kille- Douglas fir and d

Incense Cedar, $2.50 per M.
ft. B.M. for the White Fir, Hem-loc-

and Incense Cedar, $15.00
per M. Ft. B.M. for the Port
Orford Cedar, $22.40 per M. ft,
B.M. for the branded Sugar Pine,
or a total purchase price of
$12,084.50, will be considered.
SOUTH UMPQUA OR JOSE-
PHINE MARKETING AREAS:

at his office located in Room 206,
Post Office Building, Roseburg,
Oregon, at '2:00 P.M., PACIFIC
STANDARD TIME, on July 12,
1949, on those tracts of timber
hereinafter described under
ORAL AUCTION BID. Any seal-
ed bids on tracts so advertised
and accompanied by the required
deposit received by the District
Forester prior to the start of the
oral auction bidding, will be con-
sidered the equivalent of an oral
bid and will be posted for the
information of all bidders. To
qualify for oral auction bidding,
the bidder must submit to the
officer in charge of the sale,
prior to the beginning of the
auction a deposit in the amount
as hereinafter required. If an
oral bid is declared to be high at
the closing of the auction, the
bidder must immediately confirm
the bid by submitting it In dupli-
cate on the regular Bureau of
Land Management bid proposal
form. The cutting and removal

iu per M. ft. B.M. lor
the White Fir, $2.50 per M. ft.
B.M. for the Incense Cedar, or a
total purchase price of $13,359.25,
will be considered. SOUTH UMP-
QUA MARKETING AREA: T. 32
5., K. 1 W., W.M., Sec. 3, all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on por. SE1SW1, all
NISEI. Dor. SWJSRJ all

me purpose ot tnis sale to be
4715 M. feet Douglas fir, 45 M.
feet Hemlock, 15 M. feet Western
Red Cedar, 20 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than
S8.65 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Douglas fir, $2.80 per M. ft. B.M.
for the Hemlock, Western Red
Cedar and Incense Cedar, or a
total purchase price of $41,008.75,
will be considered. T. 25 S., R. 3
W., W.M. Seo. 35, all merchant-
able timber designated for cut-

ting on Lot 10 (NWlSEi), por.
Lot 11 (NEJSWl), por. Lot 12
(NW1SWJ), estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 2040 M.
feet Douglas fir, 205 M. feet
branded Sugar Pine, 20 M. ieet
White Fir, 25 M. feet Incense
Cedar, 15 M. feet Red Cedar. No
hiH fnr lpeo than ta fin . M It

estimated for the purpose of this T. 31 S., R. 3 W., W.M., Sec. 29,
all merchantable timber desienat
ed for cutting on the NEi, NE1- -

saie io oe ozao m. teet Douglas
fir, 25 M. feet branded Sugar
Pine, 160 M. feet White Fir, 160
M. feet Inren ppHni-- in m fM. NWi, por. WiNWi, all SE1NWJ,

NE1SW1, por. WiSWl, por. SE1-SW-

all SE, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 7980
M. feet Douglas fir. 770 M. feet

Hemlock. No bid for less than
$6.25 per M. ft. B.M. for the

of the timber shall be carried
out in accordance with the forest
?ractice rules approved on July

by the Secretary of the
jjuukihs nr, qiu.iu per M. It. B.M.
for the branded Knonr pirm rui

the suppression of the police rec-
ords of the girl's death.
Hitler 8quelche Probe

Hitler was not yet in power
when his niece died. But the book
says his power in Bavara was al-

ready enough to force Munich
Police to drop their investigation
and to list Angela's death as sui-

cide. News stories about it were
suppressed.

According to the book Hitler
shot Angela Raubal in his Mu-

nich flat in 1932. But it does not
describe the shooting or name
any witnesses.

The book says the girl's piano
teacher knew of the murder

B.M. for the Douglas fir, $24.65Interior, tach bid must state the(NEA Ttlepholot
branded Ponderosa Pine, 85 M.
feet branded Sugar Pine, 940 M.
feet Incense Cedar, 175 M. feet
White Fir, 65 M. feet Hemlock.
No bid for less than $7.65 perM. ft. B.M. for the Douplni fir.

per M. ft. B.M. for the White
Fir, $2.30 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Incense Cedar, $2.50 per M. ft.
B.M. for the Hemlock, or a totai
purchase price of X4n79R75 ...m

per m. it. b.m. tor the branded
Sugar Pine, $3.05 per M. ft. B.M.
for the White Fir Tnmnco rHor

amount per thousand feet, board
measure, that will be paid for
each species, the total considera

In advance of cutting, payment
in full at the time of filing the
contract being required in sales
amounting to $5,000 or less. In
larger sales, the Regional Admin-
istrator may permit payment in
a number of installments. The
right is hereby reserved to waive
technical defects in the advertise-
ment; to reject all bids, or to
award the timber for the amount
of the highest bid to the next
highest qualified bidder when the
officer authorized to approve the
contract shall deem the high bid-

der unqualified to fulfill the
contractual requirements of the
advertisement. Timber sold in
accordance with this advertise-
ment must be manufactured with-
in the marketing area as desig-
nated for each tract described
below In accordance with the
Orders of the Secretary of the
Interior, No. 2285, and Nos. 2380
to 2390, Incl., dated December 11,
1946 and November 29, 1947,
respectively. The United States
has by agreement been given the
right to authorize its purchasers
to use certain roads and rights-of-wa- y

for the removal of timber.
Each bidder should ascertain
from the respective District
Forester's office the location of
the road right-of-wa- covered by
such agreement relating to the
tract upon which he wishes to
bid. It is the bidder's responsi-
bility to determine for himself
the extent to which such agree-
ment will permit the use of the
road or right-of-wa- subject to
the payment of reasonable com-
pensation to the assignor of the
United States. Further informa-
tion, including copies of the form
of contract, bid forms and sched-
ules of contract payments may be
obtained at District Offices of
the Bureau of Land Management,
located at Salem, Eugene, Rose-
burg, Coos Bay, and Medford,
Oregon, or at the office of the

ance of Gerlich.
Baron von Aretin claims that

Gerlich knew of Hitler's guilt.
He says Gerlich passed his knowl-

edge to another Dachau prisoner
who survived.

But the prisoner who is sup-
posed to have received the story
from Gerlich is not named. And
no documentary evidence to sup-
port the murder charge is con-

tained in the book.
Sensational rumors about Hit-

ler's alleged love affair with his
pretty young Austrian niece have
circulated in Germany for many
years.

Officially, her death was listed
as suicide.

However, Baron von Aretin
charges in his book that the Nazis
suppressed the true facts of the
case and sent to concentration
camps all persons who had knowl-

edge of it.
Dr. Wilhelm Frick, Hitler's

minister of the interior who was
hanged at Nuernberg for war
crimes, was said to have handled

be considered. SEALED BID: IN

RARE FIND Contractor Wesley
R. Collins (above) displays a small

quantity of gallium, a metal so
rare It is worth $3000 an ounce. Re
dug for a swimming pool In Costs
Mesa, Calif. He has about $5000

worth. Gold and uranium were
also found around the excavation.

DOUGLAS COUNTY: DOUGLAS
MARKETING AREA: 8ALVAGE
SALE: T. 30, S ROW u ,

tion which will be paid lor the
timber and a statement that the
bidder will comply with local
manufacturing requirements as
hereinafter stated. No bid for
less than the appraised value will
be considered. Each sealed bid
must be submitted in duplicate
and be accompanied by a deposit.

SeC. 3. All DIArphanlDhln'ltH.i.J

$16.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the
branded Ponderosa Pine, $23.00
per M. ft. B.M. for the branded
Sugar Pine, $3.50 per M. ft. B.M.
for the Incense Cedar and Hem-loc-

$4.30 per'M. ft. B.M. for
the White Fir, or a total purchase
price of $79,592.00. will be con.

and died in the same concentra

and Red Cedar, or a total pur-
chase price of $25,228.25, will be
considered. The contract for
sale of this timber will contain
special requirements for the pro-
tection of the Rock Creek Fish
Hatchery of the Oregon State
Game Commission. Details re-

garding these requirements can
be obtained from the District
Forester, Roseburg, Oregon, or
from the Regional Administrator,
Bureau of Land Management.
T. 30 a.. R 7 w vu M s. it

designated for cutting on por
SiSWl, all SJSE1, estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be
1770 M. feet Douglas fir, 315 M. sidered.The deposit must be In cash or

tn tne lorm ot a certitied checK
on a solvent bank and in favor

all merchantable timber desig- -

tion camp as Gerlich. The piano
teacher is not named. Nor is it
related how he learned of the
shooting.

It Is an unchallenged fact that
the old daughter of Hit-
ler's had been living
in Hitler's home since 1928. She
attended the University of Mu-

nich, and was his companion at
many social events.
Weddlnq Prevented

At one time she was engaged
to marry Emil Maurice, Hitler's
personal chauffeur and No. 2
man in his Elite Corps, the SS.

Maurice told the Associated
Press a year ago that Hitler or-

dered Angela to break the en- -

naiea ior culling on por. SiNEi,
por. NE1SW1, all SE4SW1, SE1,
estimated for the purpose of this

gagement and threatened to quit
supporting her and her mother if
she did not obey. She obeyea.

"He was very jealous of her,"
said Maurice, now in a Nazi in-

ternment camp.
But Maurice said he know noth-

ing about the circumstances of
her death because he parted with
Hitler after quarreling with him
about his interference with his
romance.

Maurice, like many Germans,
doubts that Hitler ever had physi-
cal love affairs with any woman.

Even his publicized romance
with Eva Braun is still believed
by many Germans to have been
"purely platonic."

p WALLPAPER
200 Pattarns
180 U I1J0

Ptft Lumbar &

164 E. 2nd Ave.
Phone 242

Fuel

SAWDUST

SLAB WOOD

PLANER ENDS

DENN-GERRETSE- N CO.

of the Treasurer of the United
States. The amount of the de-

posit will be at least 20 of the
first $1,000 of the appraised value
of the timber: an additional 10
of the next $9,000; an additional
5 of the amount between $10,-00-

and $100,000; and an addi-
tional 3 of any amount in ex-
cess of $100,000. The deposit
will be returned to unsuccessful
bidders; applied as a part of the
purchase price of the high bid-

der; or that portion of the de-

posit representing the minimum
required by law shall be retain-
ed as liquidated damages if the
high bidder does not execute
contract and furnish satisfactory
bond within thirty days of ac-

ceptance of the bid or cannot
furnish evidence of his ability to
comply with the local marketing
requirements. In sales over
$5,000, and in small sales when

"LET US SETTLE

YOUR DUST"
We will do oil dusting inex-

pensively for Roseburg and
vicinity. Oiling good for sev-
eral years.

Phone 1289

ROSEBURG FUEL

OIL SERVICE
343 N. Jackson

LEGAL NOTICK

Dr. E. W. Carter
Chiropodist Foot Specialist

129 N. Jackson
Phone 1170

Over Rexall Drug Store

IN THE DISTRICT COURT OP THE
UNITED STATES FOR THE

DISTRICT OF OREGON
In Proceedingi for the

Reorganization of a Corporation
No.

In the Matter of
PORTER CREEK LUMBER CO.,

a Corporation, Debtor.
NOTICE

Phone 128 402 W. Oak

To the Secretary of the Treasury, the
Securities and Exchange Commission,
and all creditori and stockholder! of
the debtor:
Notice hereby Is given that pursuant

duly made and entered in the above
entitled cause on June 3. 1949:

1. All creditors and stockholders of
the debtor are directed to file their
claims and proofs of interest on or be-
fore June 30, 1949, with the Clerk of
the United States District Court for the
District of Oreflon. United States Court
House, Portland, Oregon: proofs of

That's the timt THE SNACK BAR starts
serving these delicious breakfasts

THE SNACK BAR
Next to the Star.Theater

From Lighf-B- ui Carriers to Heavy-Dut- y Haulersclaim ana proojs or interest man ot
substantially In the form subscribed by
Section 57 of the National Bankruptcy
Act and related rules of the Supreme
Court of the United States; If a claim
is lounaea upon any written instrument,the same shall be filed with the claim: MBA'S Die. 1except upon order of court for cause
shown, no holder of any claim or In-
terest against the debtor or its property
may participate unless proof of such
claim or interest is filed in the d

proceeding In form and manner
aforesaid on or prior to said Juna 30,

2. Any party In Interest mar file ob
lections to such claims and proofs of

HERE'S DAD'S PRESENT!

Mercury Motors in 314, 5, 10 H. P.
(Th Vt and Super 5 have Full Reverse)

interest wnn tne cierx or tne
court on or before Julv 11. 1949.

3. On July 21, 1949, at the hour of
10:00 A. M., a hearing will be held be-
fore the Honorable Estes Snedecor, Ref

HIRE'S your trusty

eree in Bankruptcy, in Room 512, United
States Court House, Portland, Oregon,to consider all proofs of claim or In-
terest and all objections to proofs of
claim or Interest iiied as above set
forth.

4. Debtor ta required on or prior to
July 30, 1649, to file in the

proceeding a plan of reorgani-
zation, and any creditor or stockholder
nf th riahtnr lilruiu mv f(l m nln

hunting and
fishing pal!

of reorganization of the debtor within
KIEKHAEFER

fflEFicuny
ine iime nxea lor ine aeoior io me a
plan of reorganization or any extension
thereof.

S. The court reserves Jurisdiction to
extend or continue the time for any of
the filings herein referred to or the
time of the foregoing hearing without
further notice.

DATED June 3, 1949.
PORTER CREEK LUMBER CO.,
By ! A. E. STEBINGER,

President.

Super 5, Super 10

Dad will really appre-
ciate a fine, new Mcr.
cury outboard motor for
Father's Day . . . what
man wouldn't? The Mer

IN THE COUNTY COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR THE

COUNTY OF DOUGLAS
Pl'FlLICATION OF

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
In the Matter of tht Estate

of
JAKE BOBBINS, Deceased.

Notice is hereby given that S. H.
Robbins has been appointed and has
qualified as the administrator of the
above entitled estate. All persons hav-
ing claims against the estate should
present them with proper vouchers to
the said administrator at the office of
Avery W Thompson, attorney at law,
203 Douglas County State Bank Build-
ing, Roseburg, Oregon, within six (6)
months from the date of this notice.

Dated this 10th day of June, 1949.
S. H. ROBBINS, Adminis-

trator of the above entitled
estate.

Date of first publication June 10, 1949.
Date of last publication July 8, 1949.

cury delivers efficient,
Mat consistent performance

MittMit. at ANY SPEED because
TbMftM vital moving parts ride

m) on ball and roller bear- -

W lngs. There's more fun,
lace fiiGa nn flchlnff Hava
with a Mercury.

Made by the people who make the motor
lor Disston cnain taws.

See Them Now At

UMPQUA VALLEY

Notice of Timber Sale

SEALED BIDS, marked outside
"Bid for Timber," and addressed
to the Regional Administrator,
Bureau of Land Management,
Region I, Room 131, Building No.
1, Swan Island, Portland 18, Ore-
gon, will be received until and
opened at 2:00 P.M., PACIFIC
STANDARD TIME, on July 12,
1949, for the purchase of all
merchantable timber desienated

Top-volu- production brings you
top-val- ue features!

for cutting upon tracts herein SDaU7lLleiTA Home-Owne- d and Operated Store
202 N. Jackson Phone 73

alter described as SfcALtD BID:
ORAL AUCTION BIDS, will be
received by the District Forester

"Have You Seen Tuffy?' ASes.SCn" TOMSK
Ken Wernsinq Fred Gooch Jr

formerly of Esco A IN U of Gooch Logging Supply,
Sweet Home, OregonPortland, Oregon

THE CAI THAT "IRIATHIS"

Driver njoyt perfect comfort In oR

weuther. Out tide air It drawn In and
vied olr U forced out) Heated In cold
we other.

POWERFUt VAlVt INGINES

Chevrolet's and r

engines are the world's mott economical
for their sizet engines in
Series 5000-600- models.

TRANSMISSION

Operation h quicker, easier and quieter
with Chevrolet's new rransminlon In

3800 terfet and heavier duty model.
Speed and momentum con be main-

tained on graded

SPUMED REAR A I II HUI CON MICTION

Another Chevrolet "Ant," thfe unique
hub connection addi to the itrength
and durability of the reor cJe to
eorry the big toodi longer!

l1!l'frWrn Your preference for Chevrolet Advance-Detig- n truck only

iSSSi waits on the moment when you drive one4 Right then and there,

youH know why more people use Chevrolet trucki than any other make. Youll

like their power, ttamina and giant-tir- e load capacity. Youll like their eturdy

quality and their comfort and convenience. And youll alio prefer them for their

g economy, for these truckt have THRIFT lower operating

cosU, lower upkeep costs and the lowest list prices in the entire truck field I Come

In and let ui discuss your delivery and hauling need.

THERE'S A CHEVROLET TRUCK FOR YOUR JOB!

Invite You to Inspect a Complete Line of
Logging Supplies

Union Wire Rope Young Blocks and Rigging
Eico Rigging Larson Logging Tools

rire Fighting Equipment Falling and Bucking Tools
Road Building Items

Socketing and Splicing

SERVICE-WH- EN YOU WANT IT-SE-
RVICE

TRIANGLE LOGGING SUPPLY

OTHER ADVANCt DtStGH FEATURES

Th Cab Uniweld, all ileef cab construction e

visibility with windows e Ml floating Hypoid rear
axles In Sorlet 3600 ond heavier duty models e Hydrovoc power brakes
on Series 5000 and 6000 models t steering e Wide-bat- e

wheel e Multiple color options.

fWhf eW wrtbrtwg tjtHm mi wWwi wf ftm rip 9phml ef tttre w

HANSEN MOTOR CO.Hwy. 99 South
Opposite Nielsen's Market Phone 446Oak & StephensConvenient Parking Phone 1580


