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NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, that I J
O. T. Carter, aa Sheriff of Douglas
County, Oregon, will, on the 31st day
of May, 1949, at the hour of 10:00 !
clock A. M., tn view of the property
to b lutd, ael) at the Corkrutn Motor
Co.. at Roaeburg. Douglaa County, Ore- -

ton, upon the atreet In front thereof,
that certain uaed 1930 Ford Automobile.

CALL KEN TODAY!
Just phone 1261-- R today for someone
to do repairs on your typewriter Pl-

odding machines.

mated for the purpose of this
sale to be 1355 M. feet Douglas
Fir, 65 M. feet Incense Cedar, 10
M. feet Red Cedar, 15 M. feet
White Fir, 5 M. feet Sugar Pine.
No bid for less than $8.55 per M.
ft. B.M. for Douglas Fir, $2.80 per
M. ft. B.M. for the Incense Cedar,
Red Cedar and White Fir, $14.25
per M. ft. B.M. for the Sugar
Pine, or a total purchase price
of $11,908.05, will be considered.

Nofice of Timber Sale
Sealed bids, marked outside

"Bid for Timber", and addressed
to the Regional Administrator.

Oregon llcenae (1949) No. 3 to the
highest and beat bidder for caah. at
public autclon, all pursuant to the fore-
closure of that certain Chattel mortgage
filed in the office of the County Clerk
of Multnomah County. Oregon. March 22,
1949, and aaalgned Instrument No. 8H0.

certificate of which la filed In the
office of the Secretary of State.

Witness my hand this 0th day ot May,
1049.

O.' T. Carter.
Sheriff ot Douglaa County.
Oregon.

Notice of Timber Sale
SEALED BIDS marked outside

"Bid for Timber", and addressed
to the Regional Administrator,
Bureau of I and Management, Re- -

fion I, Room 131. Building No. 1,
Island, Portland 18, Oregon,

wil; be received until and openedat 2:30 P. M. Daylight Saving
Time, on May 31, 1949, for the
purchase of all merch intable tim-
ber designated for cutting upon
tracts hereinafter described as
SEALED BID. ORAL AUCTION
EiDS will be received by the Dis-
trict Forester at his office located
at 206 P. O. Bldg., Roseburg, Ore-
gon, at 2:30 P. M. Pacific Stan-
dard Time, on June 3, 1949, on
those tracts of timber hereinafter
described under ORAL AUCTION
BID. Any sealed bids on tracts
so advertised and accompanied

KEN'S OFFICE EQUIPMENT
631 S. Stephens Phone 1241-- R

Bureau of Land Management, Re-

gion I, Room 131, Building No.
1, Swan Island, Portland 18, Ore

b the required deposit received
by the District Forester prior to
the start of the oral autcoin bid-

ing, will be cons'dered the equiv-
alent of an oral bid and will be
posted for the information of all
bidders. To qualify for oral auc-
tion bidding, the bidder must sub-
mit to the officer 'n charge of
the sale, proir to the beginning
of the auction a deposit in the
amount as hereinafter required.
If an oral bid is declared to be
high at the closing of the auc-
tion, the bidder must immdeiately
confirm bid bv submitting it in
duplicate on the regular Bureau
of Land Management bid pro-
posal form. The cutting and re-

moval of the timber shall be
carried out in accordance with
the forest practice rules approved
on July 7, 1938 by the Secretary
of the Interior. Each bid must
state the amount per thousand
feet, board measure, that will be
paid for each species, the total
consideration which will be paid
for the timber and a statement
that will comply with
local manufacturing requirements
as hereinafter stated. No bid for
less than the tppraised value will
be considered. Each sealed bid
must be submitted in duplicate
and be accompanied by a deposit.
The deposit must oe in cash or
In the form of a certified check
on a solvent bank and in favor
of the Treasurer of the United
States. The amount of the depos- -

gon, will be rece ved until and
opened at 2:30 P. M DAYLIGHT
SAVING TIME, on May 31, 1949,
for the purchase of all merchan

It will be at least 20 of the first
$1,000 of the appraised value of
the timber; and additional 10
of the next $9,000; an additional
5 of the amount between $10,-00-

and $100,000; and an addition-
al 3 of any amount in excess of
$100,000. The deoosit will be re-

turned to unsuccessful bidders:
applied as a part of the purchase
price of the nigh bidder; or that
portion of the deposit represent-
ing the minimum required by law
shall be retained as liquidated
damages If the high bidder does
not execute contract and furnish
satisfactory bond within thirty
days of acceptance of the bid or
cannot furnish evidence of his
ability to comply with the local
marketing requirement. In sales
over $5,000, and in small sales
when required, the high bidder
will be required to furnish a
sworn financial statement. In du-

plicate, showing ability to fulfill
the terms of the contract. A bond
on all sales will be required in
an amount computed at the rate
of at least 15 per cent of the bid
price. Payment for timber will be
required in advance of cutting,
pavment in full at the time of
filing the contract being required
in sales amounting to $5,000 and
less. In larger sales, the Regional
Administrator may permit pay-
ment in a number of installments.
The right is hereby reserved to
waive technical defects In the
advertisement; to reject all bids,
or to award the timber for the
amount of the highest bid to the
next highest qualified bidder
when the officer authorized to
approve the contract shall deem
the high bidder unqualified to
fulfill the contractual require

table timber designated for cut

strator. Building No, 1, Swan Is-

land, Portland 18, Oregon. Dated
at Portland, Oregon, this 6th day
May, 1949. IN DOUGLAS COUN-

TY: DOUGLAS MARKETING
AREA: T. 23 S., R. 4 WH W.M.,
See. 3, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on Por.
NViNWW, estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 535 M. feet
Douglas fir, 10 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than $3.00
per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas
fir, $2.80 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Incense Cedar, or a total purchase
price of $1,633.00, will be consid-
ered. T. 23 S., R. 4 W., W.M., Sec
11, all merchantable timber desig-
nated for cutting or the SEii-SEV-

estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 400 M. feet
Douglas fir, 5 M. feet Incense Ced-

ar, 10 M. feet White Fir. No bid
for less than $5.80 per M. ft. B.M.
for the Douglas fir, $3.10 per Si-

ft. B.M. for the Incense Cedar and
White Fir, or a total purchase
price of $2,366.50, will be consid-eied- .

T. 26 S., R. 8 W W.M., Sec.
1, all merchantable timber desig-
nated for cutting on the SEVi-N-

Ei4SE, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 920 M.
feet Douglas fir, 50 M. feet In-

cense Cedar. No bid for less
than $8.60 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Douglas fir, $3.40 per M ft. B.M.
foi the Incense Cedar, or a total
purchase price of $8,082.00, will be
considered. JOSEPHINE MAR-

KETING AREA: T. 32 S., R. 3 W.,
W.M., Sec. 3, all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
Por. WHSWK, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 270 M.
feet Douglas fir, 115 M. feet brand-
ed Ponderosa Pine, 10 M. feet
White Fir, 5 M. feet Hemlock. No
bid for less than $9.65 per M. ft.
B.M. for the Douglas for, $20.60
per M. ft. B.M. for the branded
Ponderosa Pine, $3.90 per M. ft.
B.M. for the White Fir and Hem-
lock, or a total purchase price
of $5,033.00, will be considered.

.'

j . Q U ;J x
ting upon tracts hereinafter de-
scribed. The cutting and removal
of the timber shall be carried
out in accordance with the forest
practice rules approved on July
7, 1938 by the Secretary of the
Interior. Each bid must state the
amount per thousand feet, board
measure, that will be paid for
each species, the total consider-
ation which will be paid for the
timber and a statement that the
bidder will comply with local

NEW LOCATION!
Dr. H. B. Scofield

Palmer Chiropractor
Rifle Range Road
410 mi. North of

County Shops
Office Hours 2 and J

COMBINATION

WATER HEATER

and

ELECTRIC RANGE

Something new has been added for the small
home or apartment! A combination range and
water heater. 20-3- 0 or 40 gallon water. heater
plus a three unit range with 7 speeds on each
unit.
Wiring is separate. Insulated oven for range
available at extra cost. lAATC

Saturdays 2 A. M

manufacturing requirements as
hereinafter stated. No bid for less
than the appraised value will be
considered. Each sealed bid must
be submitted In duplicate and be
accompanied by a deposit. The de-

posit must be in cash or in theTHE "PRICELESS" 177"Price .torm of a certified check on a
solvent bank and in favor of
the Treasurer of the United

(Without Oven)

States. The amount of the deposit
will be at least 20 of the first KIER-CROOC- H PLUMBING CO.$1,000 of the appraised value of
the timber; an additional 10
of the next $9,000; an additional 316 Mill St.Phone 1242 R

BY 5 of the amount between $10,'
000 and $100,000: and an addition
al 3 of any amount in excess
of $100,000. The deposit will beGraduation's not complete unless it includes a handsome

gift watch like these beautiful Crotons
for only $17,501 But the quantity's lim
ited. Choose today pay later

.y on easy terms! ' 5

ments oi me advertisement, um-
ber sold in accordance with this
advertisement must be manu-
factured within the marketing
area as designated for each tract
described below in accordance
with the Orders of the Secretary
ot the Interior, No. 2285, and Nos.
2380 to 2390, Incl., dated-

-
Decem-

ber 11, 1946 and November 29,
1947, respectively. The United
States has by agreement been
given the right to authorize Its
purcahsers to use certain roads
and rights-of-wa- for the removal
of timber. Each bidder should
ascertain from the respective Dis-

trict Forester's office the loca-
tion of the road right-of-wa- cov-

ered by such agrement relating
to the tract upon which he wishes
to bid. It is the bidder's responsi-
bility to determine for himself
the extent to which such agree-
ment will permit the use of the
road or right-of-wa- subject to
the payment of reasonable com- -

Sensation to the assignor of the
Further informa-

tion, including copies of the form
of contract, bid forms and sched-
ules of contract payments may
be obtained at District Offices
of the Bureau of Land Manage-
ment, located at Salem, Eugene,
Roseburg, Coos Bay, and Med-ford- ,

Oregon, or at the office
of the Regional Administrator,
Building No. 1, Swan Island, Port-
land 18, Oregon. Dated at Port-
land, Oregon, this 22nd day of
April, 1949.
IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: SEAL-
ED BID: DOUGLAS MARKET-
ING AR.A: T. 23 S., R. 4 W., W.
M Sec. 13, all merchantable Um-
ber designated for cutting on Por.
SEtfSWy, Por. SEHNWy. Por.
NE!4SW?i, estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 2055 M.
feet Douglas Fir, 5 M. feet In-

cense Cedar, 15 M. feet White

returned to unsuccessful bidders;
applied as a nart of the purchase
price of the high bidder; or that
fiortion of the deposit

minimum required by law
shall be retained as liquidated
damages if the high bidder does
not execute contract and furnish
satisfactory bond within thirty
days of aceptance of the bid or
cannot furnish evidence of his
ability to comply with the local
marketing requirements. In sales
over $5,000, and in small sales
when required, the high bidder
will be required to furnish a
sworn financial statement, show-
ing ability to fulfill the terms of
the contract. A bond on all sales
will be required in an amount
computed at the rate of at
least 15 per cent of the, bid.
Price payment for timber will
be required in advance of cut-

ting, payment in full at the
time of filing the contract being
required in sales amounting to
$5,000 or less. In larger sales,
the Regional Administrator may
permit payment in a number of
Installations. Timber sold in ac-

cordance with- this advertisement
must be manufactured within the
marketing areas as deisgnated
for each tract hereinafter de-

scribed in accordance : with the
Orders of the Secretary of v the
Interior, No. 2285, and .Nos. 2380
to 2390, Inch, dated December 11,
1946 and November 29, 1947, re-

spectively. The United States has
by agreement been given the
right to authorize its purchasers

' Exmv J1750

feJsiJl Same fine movement as .

f: in Croton higher priced
J watches. Non- - tarnish

'tee' back.

Jj&kSsS' j That new thin looH

H' Sparkling chrome front

...sturdy steel back...
M. lax rich cord strap.

When You Buy A
U HE

We olso carry a full line of other
Croton, Longines, Hamilton and Waltham Watches.

It Pays To Buy From

ASHCRAFT JEWELERS
BUY n(LxYaDam.tnJQ.

Fir, 5 M. feet Hemlock. No bid
for Jess than $5.55 per M. ft. B.M.
for the Douglas Fir, $2.50 per M.
ft. B.M. for the Incense Cedar,
$3.60 per M. ft. B.M. for the White
Fir and Hemlock, or a total pur-
chase price of $11,489.75, will,
be considered. ORAL AUCTION
BID: DOUGLAS MARKETING
AREA: T. 30 S R. 7 W W.M.,
Sec. 19, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on Por.
NWUSEK, All SWiiSE'.i, esti- -

Where Your Dollar Has Cents

The 6 cubic foot capacity holds 210 pounds of
frozen food ... the quick freeze section holds 25
pounds of frozen food at one time . . . the 36 inch
height conforms with standard drainboards . . ,
the 23 inch width permits easy movement
through doors

Look at all the features, then come In and see
the Kelvinator Home Freezer ot our store. You'll
be glad you did.

A home freezer means a lot to your family and
it is an important purchase . , , that's why you
should see the Kelvinator Home Freezer before
you buy, Kelvinator, the oldest name in the re-

frigeration field, offers you more for your money
in home freezers.

The unique space saving design of the Kelvin-

ator gives you as much usable capacity as other
freezers having larger exterior design. Of equal
importance, the Kelvinator Home Freezer is pow-
ered by the famous Polarsphere Sealed Unit, un-

rivalled for dependable and trouble-fre- e

THE NEW JOHN DEERE

to use certain roads and rigms-of-wa-

for the removal of timber.
Each bidder should ascertain
from the respective District For-
ester's office, the location of the
road or right-of-wa- covered by
such agreement relating to the
tract upon which he wishes to bid.
It is the bidder's responsibility
to determine for himself the ex-

tent to which such agreement
will permit the use of the road
or right-of-wa- subject to the pay-
ment of reasonable compensation
to the asignor of the United
States. The right is hereby re-

served to waive technical defects
in the advertisement; to reject
all bids, or to award the timber
for the amount of the highest
bid to the next highest qualified
bidder when the officer author-
ized to approve the contract shall
deem the high bidder unquali-
fied to fulfill the contractual re-

quirements of the advertisement.
Further Information, Including
copies of the form of contract,
bid forms and schedules of con-

tract payments may be obtained
at District Offices of the Bureau
of Land Management, located at
Salem, Eugene, Roseburg, Coos
Bay, and Medford, Oregon, or at
the office of the Regional Adminl- -

MODEL Look at these features:
Spring Action Lid

Easy opening and easy closing.
'

Baskets Simplify Storage

Two steel wire baskets make easy stor
age and accessibility.

Stainless Steel Cold Ban

CRAWLER TRACTOR!

r Gives better appearance, makes It easier

"I JO'!r to clean.

11 --Setting Temperature Control

Permits temperature adjustment for anyr re!:. vi ! 1
He

freezing or storage requirements.

Accurate Thermometer

Tells Instantly the degree of cold.

Five Surfaces Refrigerated

Uniformly low temperatures throughout
the Interior are assured by four refrig-
erated walls. The floor In the quick- -

freeze section gives the fifth refrigerated
surface.

6 cu. ft. model Illustrated

0027 DOWN

24' Months to Pay
Full Price (269.95

Mail This Coupon For

Further Details

Why suffer...
with an old fashioned bath-

room when you can buy a new

beautifully styled bath for your
bathroom for such a low, low
cost. You can have a three-piec- e

bathroom set for as
low as

$155.00
Complet. with Chrom. Trim

All of the necessary fittings
and soil pipe are also available
to complete the Installation of
your bath.

TERMS AVAILABLE

W. M. Sandall Co.

Highway 99 North

Phone 1117 R

I
Modern Furniture Co.,
222 W. Ook St., Roseburg

Please sand me your tree Illustrated folder
I giving full details on the KELVINATOR I
1

Home Freezer, I

"Crawler Tractor Performance

at Wheel Tractor Cost!
V

SEE IT TODAY
AT

INTERSTATE TRACTOR & EQUIP. CO.

709 N. Jackson Roseburg

Name

Add reu j

222 W. Oak


