"Top Winners At
Livestock Fair
Are Announc

Champlon awards  are being
kanded out at the Paclfi¢ Inter-
natjonal  Livestock  Exposition

arenas in wholesale lows today.
af divisions,

halds
champlonship ribbons for entries
in
Swiss caitle,

Sons, Winona,
Shorthorn competition won grand

and resorve champlonships for
ows. A, 1D Radebaugn, Daytoy,
Wash., took the g d champion-
ship ribbon for his bull. An ani-

L

I

competition saw
12, Sliverton, O,
champion swine showman in the
junior division

Kitckitat County
champton 4-H Club county steer

nitl owned by C. J

< herd, Sherman County, Ore., took
second. Eupgene Helmgartner, 12, |
Julinetta, Idaho, ' ad the gramd
champlon market hog, a Chester

White ba

’
]

ed

PORTLAND, Oct. 5

Judging has started in a soore

A. J,. Uliver, Wallowa

both grand and

Ore.,
reserve
the of Brown
HBonnet and

ontries in

division
J. W,
Wash

bull

Broughton, |

was  reseryve champion

ar-H Clubs  showmanship
Howard Watts, |

named grand

other 4H Club events

Wash,, had the

In

Jack Bennett, 18,  Winona,

Wash., won first and his brothers,

Dougla und Don, 15yearold
twins, won second and third with
(light Shorthorns entered in the
Club fat stock contest

The oldsr Bepnett bov's animal
wor i wd ehamplonship for

o

SCHOLARSHIPS FOR SALE
unable to

are

wi - Dillion, Caldwell, Idaho,
had the champlon Hereford stoer

and Ritn Barker, Donnelly, 1daho,
| the reserve champ

wing wtudents

Eleanor Corning, the 17-year
old Richland, Wash, girl who
parlier won the beef showman

o, had the champlon Angus
resorve  grand r!'.un-.t-lnh
“enhard, * Dver  Park,

ook the reserve titde
amplonships were

Ore.,

SUN LIFE ASSURANCE
COMPANY OF CANADA

m DON

FORBES

Represents
Douglax Ce 1
State Bank Bldg
Phone 565-R
Res. 859

kin by Gith F Purn

v both Hampshir

shires. Claude Steusloff,

had the top Southdown lamb. W
MeMinnvil

Cr

City Council Chembers

Get Beauty Treatment

Repainting and renovation of
the City Council chambers on the
second floor af the City Hall was
started roday, suid City Munager
M. W, Slankard, The rugs will be
taken and linoleum tile laid down
Plaster on the walls will be

NO WAITING!

Immediate repair service on
11l mokes of home and car

radios. We, the Radlo Doe
1ore, are authorized ra
serviee station for Zon

G

ith and rral  Electric
Witn radios, Call we, we will
pick up, repair and dellver
your radia,

Radio Doctors

g N, Stephens *h, 1023

ADMINIGTRATOR 15 YLARE—

PAINTING
:"_-..-. n.—.--—m~~_:' @ Dec

STATE TREASURER
*

ELECT A
SUCCESSFUL MAN

SUCCTSIFUL FARMIR —
31 yeary eperavieg o
Canby, Oregen

JUCCESIFUL LEGITLATOR end

Ll

rating
® Paper Honging

Best Quality Materiale

WELLS
PAINTING SERVICE
Phone 502.J.3
Member P, D, C. A,

tate E=prge ; Beard

SUCCITITUL BUSINESS MAN —
Pank Directer, Dire
Fire Palief Agmm
Telephane Apn

tor Faresers
Ditzitar Canky

C-5-1-0

o
L+ ]

Jewelers

d

248 N. Jackson

11y 68 Shopping Days

SAWDUST
SLAE WOOD
PLANER ENDS

DENN-GERRETSEN CO.

Phone 128 402 W. Oak

Tasty Token

(‘if.n'rlrrmr 'nlymm E Dewey nccepla gift of fou.
beopie of Keiso, Wush., following a brief back platform appearance
in the Pacifle Northwest community,

contract and furnish satisfactory

ful bidder will be required to

furnish a sworn financlal state

ment In duplicate, showing abili
| [ty to fulfill the financial require.
ments of the contract. In sales
of $5,000.00 or less, the deposit
may be retained as a cash bond;
in sales of more than $3,000.00,
| surety bonds will be required as
follows: more than $5,000.00, but
| [pot more than $10,000.00, at least
20% of the amount hid; more
than $10.00000, at least 104 of
| ]Il'.r‘ amount bid. In salex of $10.-
§ | 000,00, less, payment In full

will be required prior to  exe

cution of the contract. In larger
|siles  pavments may be made
I installments  In  accordance
with contract payment schedule,
dated March 1, 188 The right
is hereby reserved to waive toch-
nleal defects In the advertise-
ment: to relect all bids, pr 1o
award the timber for the amount
af the highest bid to the next
| highest qualified bidder when
tha atficer authorized to app
the contract shall deem the

or

-——)
| bidder unqualified to fulfill th
— contrmctual requirements of the
advertisements. Timber sold in
MR | accordance with this advertise-

ment must be manufactured withs

In the marketing area as desip

nated for each tract described

ow  in  accordance with the

Chders of the Secretary of the

Inte r, No. 2285 and Nos, 2380

o 850, Incl, dated December

11, 1M6 and Novem 25, 1947

| respectively. The United Siate

has by agreement been given the
| right to acthorize its purchasers
to use certain roads and rights

INEA Telephota)
king salmon from
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North and East of a blazed lin

M. 1t. BM. for the Douglas

vin
51 of 4 blazed lrlw n the NWi- |
SEl. The remainder of the
named subdivisions are reserved, | ‘
including blazed and 1ed ling | 10r the Hemlock, Incense Cedar,

trees. All Hemlock, Western Red|#0d White Fir, or a total pur.
Cedar, White Fir, and Incense|CTse Price of 331.800.50. wiil be
Cedar trees over 14 Ina. DBH|
must be felled. DOUGLAS MAR.
KETING AREA: B s R
5 W, WM, Sec, 19, all merchant:
able timber (h-slénnrm for cut
vng on the WASWL, estimated
for the pusrpose of this sale to be
1300 M. feet Douglas Fir, 20 M.

KETING AREA: T, 32 S,
W., WM, Sec. 17, all merchant-
mble timber designated for cut

teet Douglas Fir, 15 M,

Sugar Pine, 10 M. feet

feet White Fir, 25 M. feet In-| ~
eense Cedar. No bid for less than 'M ttﬂl‘lto hiwn‘;a-"‘“'?.or' h;m
SHBES per M. ft. BM for the|pi¥l TOYHMR I :

Douglas Fir, $6.65 per M. f1. B.M.
for the White Fir, 3280 per M.
ft. BM. for the Incense Cedar,
or a total rm'clms-' price of §11..
T08.00, will be considered, T. 24

|than 31025 per M. ft. BM. for

r M. f1. BM, for the Ponderosa

S, R 6 W, WAL, Sec. 5 alllk v
merchantable timber :lreﬂpnllctl Th:%\;ﬁfaﬁ ;t:_r ;‘..!.-50“‘ ?h;“ ‘f?:

for cutling on por, SWiNE], por.
NEISWL, por. WISE$ estimated
for the purpose of this sale 10 be

B.M. for the Incense Cedar (85.

Ins Fir, $7.00 r M, fi. B)

0 M. feet Sugsr Pine, 65 M. marked line: Lot § lSWlWll*
I/ feet Hemlock, 40 M. feet Incense  and area of approx. 3623 acres

r | marked line; Lot 6 (SEANWI) an |
\r, | area ol agrmn. J943 acres lying

mnr:L and ;auv.inﬁuri-- v:itlmw .‘:-pn;.\' I'.!::: mz&-n In‘{ho ‘\fl—.

of abliity to comply with the SEY Iying North and West of al - y .

! incal marketing requirement. In blozed and posted line: and ap “;If.)d'hl;d }f:: ?:u ﬂ'{:“\;{glfo Fir, | lyin
sales over $10.000.0¢. the success  prox. 1.25 acres | North and| § 5

05 M. . BM. for the|South of
Sugar &'lre B0 per M. !:rﬂ.s'f,lﬂ T ISWINEL) an ares of ap
}&r‘m: 3241 acres lyin
| blured

: | (SEINE})
considered. « JOSEPHINE MAR./ 3900 acres lyin
R. !\‘innd marked

|
|ting on the E), estimated for the |llne: Lot 10 (NWiSEL an arca
-t‘urpoue of this sale to be n,le?nff,“ll}(‘,m"”“"""' 13.99 acren 1y
§ Ponderg:nilme: Lot 11 INEISWi) an area
Pine, 190 M. feet White Fir, 225 of
M. | North of blazed and marked line:
feet | Lot
feet Incense Cedar— | approx. 2248 acres lying North
Salvage Saled. No bid for less| of blazed and stamped line, There

the Douglas Fir, $23.25 per M. fr. | acres
'B.M. for the Sugar Pine, $1355 | ting. The total sale area Is 220,00 |

00 per M. ft. BM. for the Dm.ﬁ

2070 M. Feet Douglas Fir, 35 M. . - .

feet White Fir, 25 M. feet Red| 100 the Fine SLE per B ft

Cedar, 30 M. feet Hemlock, No Salvage  Sale), or & total pur

;""I Irl.ﬁil l":‘ ’h";" SIIS.MI wrr?" ;hnrh prir:e of 32435225, will|
&, ar e CHHELY i 1 y e

$355 per M. fr. BM. for the D¢ Considered Only Pine trees

stamped USOC to he cut. Al

White Fir, Red Cedar Douglas Fir trees less than 22

and Hem-

lock, or a total purchase prioe of N : - 5
SIRER550. will be I”ll}‘ldl‘l'l“lt | ins lllﬂlll.ll reserved. To .bn
The sale area consists of approx. logged with  caterpillar type
585 acres and Is described ag fol. | IFACtor equipmont: IN DOUG.

LAS COUNTY: ORAL AUCTION
SALE: DOUGLAS MARKETING
AREA: T.26 8. R, 2 W, WM.,
Sec. 25, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on Lots
17T, 8 3 4 5 6 11,12 9 10 (Sd
{NE{, NWi, NiSWi, NiSE{, re-
| spectively), estimated for the

lows: that portion of the NEI-
BW1i lving South and East of Yel-
K: that portion of the
Iving East and South
Creek and West of
+ that portion of the
Iving South and East

iow

| of-way for the removal of timber. of Yellow Creck and West of

e AL Each bldder should ascertain blized line: and that portion ol'-.‘r’“'p"l’fo“fi'hl‘[:"h‘ ‘_.?u']’",a‘\ma' '“l

© from the réspective District For-|the SWISEL  Iving  West u!'}?‘ i kl-l o M "]'.'N.n‘li tl.,‘.ed‘:;'
patched. A new railing will be in- #steFs office the location of the blazed line. Al other timber m'm‘"{""‘t' L tte Fir. 20 M Teet
stalled. ropd  right-af-way covered by | the SWINEY, NEISWi, and Wi Biane ‘;’;ml. ‘_,\{,ﬂ 'i-_’;".a-l * Peat
While the work Is going on, In 1:":‘]. e lating to the SEL I« reserved from sale, In|ped Codnr Poles. No bid for less

£ 1 spont. which he wishes to cluding the blazed and posted h €9.90 M. ft BM.
the next two weels, driver’s lie- ' bid. 1t {s the bidder's rosponsibili- line trees. Caterpillar type log. |00 _Seall per af, St BAL for
ense examinations ordinarily giv- tv ta determin L i Jess othetwine antsiined |10 Douglas Fir, $110 per M. [t
en at the City Hall will be ¢ extent which : in writing by the officer in| ;M. for the Homlock and White
ducted at the Chamber of C permit the use of the 1o «l or charge of the sale, T. 25 8. R. Fir, 3‘1 5 per M. ft, BM. for the
merce  offices, in Med right-ol-way subject to the nasy.|S W. W.M. Sec. 1, all merchan. Red Cedar, $23.90 per M. ft. BM.
Arts Building on Main 8t,, 7 moent of tensonable com ;.l— + | table timber designated for eut. | 107 the Sugar Pine, 05 per Lin.
duy and Friday this week and | yjan 1o the asstgnor of "th_ ltl-“r::u ting on por. SINE, all NEiSWi, | [t for the Hed Cedar Poles, or a
next Stutes Fr:].‘l'.l'l'.H'.!'(l.:;-l‘._ fony, In wor, SEISWI, 1-nr.b3\'|".15'f{i, pnrl !":‘nl urchase price of $86811..
The city manager pointed out cluding copies of the form of h':‘;f‘.‘-'l. estimated for the pur|: will be tonsidered. Sale area
that the council chambers In (the contract, bid forms and sched s¢ of this sale to be 2415 M. | "f be tractor logged uniess
City Hall recelve heavy use, not ules of contract pavments may feet Douglas Fir, 130 M. fedt nl_lu-lu-lsar authorized In writing
only by the council and its varl- be obtained at Distr Offices White Fir, 15 M. fent Inpense by the officer In charge of the
ous “commisions, bul by many of the Bureau of Land M « | Coditr, 45 M. feet Red Cedar, 20|5ale. The sale area ls haunded
clvic orgunizations. He sald the ment, located at Salem, Bugene, M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less on the North by a blazed ling and
room has been in need of repair Roseburg, Coos Bay, and Med | than $5.95 per M. fi. BM. for 00 the South by a blazed line:
for a long time, tord, or at the office of the Re the Douglas Fir, $3.00 per M r|.|ll"\?r;l{!{"‘.::‘m m:l]_':d“ ['“a I"m‘;‘
- glonal Administrator. Bldg. No. BM. for the White Fir, Incense “Ii\ﬂ.u:‘.'rrlld;n %ut.h gl' r:c(l

If your youngsters Insist on 1, Swan Island, Portland 18, Ore  Cedar. Red Codar, and Hemiock, | 100 'k'}d flosse Lot ,‘“,-\?“»l
studying at the dining room gon. Dated at Portland, Oregon, or a total purchase price of $i4, .I'\!!\"ll;nnl':l‘ll‘lt?lml-i' P rmx. 3.00
table, he sure 8 study lamp s this 1st day of Ociober, 1948 99025 will be considered, Rights | Iy South of phil d b 1
moved to the table o p IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: SEAL. and interests of /W permittee "“"”_ .“E_E u___ plibnassdanhadibin

VOung eyes

Notice of Timber Sale
SEALED BIDS, marked outside

“Hid
o t

| Burean of

Hegl

land,

be T
P10

Time,

pure!

ber

oy |

ORAL AUCTION BIDS will be ed on the East by a hlaswd
received by the Reglonal Admini- | posted line. Sale area Is 36 ¢
strator on those tracts herein. or less consisting of 0x
yfter deseribed as “Oral Auction | acre In the s rilor
Sales” at the close of the sealed the NWINWYE approx. 1
bid sale. Any sealed bids on tracts Afres in the West p 1
s0 decoribed and 3 mpanied by . Approx
the required depo rétceived hy portion
the Reglo IPProx
to the start of the ¢ } nid
bidding, will be gon mil
UiV t of an oral bid and
will be posted for the (nforma-
tion of all bidders. To qualify
for oral auction bidding. the big i
fer must submit 1o the officer o % resa d I
in charge of the sale, prior to 1 including blamd e

winning of the i S, R EW WM

in the amount all merchant
required, If an

a
decla
1

tiee
048

carh

v submitting It in duplicate
the mgular Bureau of Land Fir, 285 M
1t bid prog al form. M. feet W
¢ und 1w feet Whi
e rrsr Crd
h " than $14.45
rules approved on 1 the Dou
by the Secretary of the BM. fr
Each bld must he em R
per thousand feot, BM
1 that will he p conse Oy
species, the total cor 4

tlan

timibw

cate
i

ext

af the

“Sales Under Sealed Bids

ED BIDS: SOUTH COASBT MAR-
METING AREA: T. 23 S, R
W, WM, S 9 all merchan
table timber designated for cu
ting on a portlon of the Wiws

g

for Timber," and addressed tstimated for the purposs of t

he Regional Administrator, sale 1o be 1665 M. teet Doug
Land Management, Fir, 15 M. fest Her ¢, B M
on 1, Bldg. No. 1, Swian s [eet White Fir, 30 M #l West
Partland 18, Oregon, will ern Red Cedar. No bid far less
ecelved untll and opened at | than $13 50 per M . BM. for
) A, M, Pacilic Standard the Douglas Fir, $2.80 per M. ft
on November 9, 1948, for B.M. for the Hemlock and White
hase of all merchantable tim.  Fir, $250 per M. ft. BM. for the
destgnated for cutting upon Western Red Cedar, or a toal

s  heroinafter descrl

s purchase price of $32 83250, will
be congidered, Sale area Is boun

redd to be high at
sl the aur )

Irmme conlirm

be pald for the

tement that the 1L W)

which will
r and

mnd
g the Fast
nded by

me, et h

B blazed and

tred In the NE}

Yo FLOOR SANDING
; and

FINISHING

Estimates

Leslie Pfaff

320 Ward 5t.
Phane 1346.)

LU VT B

ind

jonal 3%

= QRN ILER =~ et

ROSEBURG VENETIAN BLIND FACTORY
615 M. Jackson St
Roseburg, Oregon

PHONE—1098-)

Qur Deluxe Blinds Are The
BEST in the WEST

Better Cuality for Less

to be protected. The road shall | »
be kept open at all times lor
pormittee’s use, In the SWiINEL, o'L To IURN
an area approx, 9 acres lylng
North and East of blawed and

srked line: in the SEINEL, an || For prompt courteous meter-
aroa of approx 2T acres Iving 8 od delivaries of high quality

wth of blazed and marked lineg,
are resorved from sale including
blazed line trees. The NEISW]
is bounded non West and North

steve and bumner oil

CALL 152
Priroleum Products for

by blazed and marked line. The

SEINED ix bounded on West by

a hlazed and marked line. Al MYERS oll (o
timher South of Little Walf 22
Creek In the SEISWI; NISE}L Distributors of Hancock

and SWISEl comprising approx, Douglas County

85 porex |8 plso reserved from
sile. SOUTH UMPQUA MAR - o B
KETING AREA: T. 32 S, R. 3
W., WM, Sec. A all merchant:
able timber designated for cut
ting on all of the NENEL estl

mated far the purpose of this sals
to be 2535 M. feet Douglas Flr

-
GOOD-YEAR
TINES

GOODSYEAR
Extra-Mileage

RECAPPING

Bring \hose smoolh tires
in ol make them sale
for stop and go — sound
lor  extra  thousands eof
miles with loag-wearing

Frva it e $7.70

Exira Mileage
mld

Recapping,

: MURDEROUS

L FISH TRAPS

318

“FISH BILL”

AN TAR-FRET MIASURL
TMAT WILL BENERIT

" EVERY ORKGON CITiZen

HANSEN MOTOR (0.

TIRE DEPT.
Phone 440
Oak & Stephena

SEEDS SEEDS SEEDS
GREY OATS YEICH AUSTRIAN PEAS
CLOVERS

Red, Altike, Sweet, Landine, Subterrancan, White

FESCUE
Alta or Tall, Red Creaping, Chewing, Meadow

OTHER GRASSES
Highland Bent, Kentuchy Blue, Meadow Foxtail,
Lotus, Orchord Gross, Common and English Rye

DOUGLAS COUNTY

Farm Bureau Co-Operative Exchange
ROSEEBURG, OREGON
ne 98

Lecated—-W. Wask ngton St.ond 5. P. R R, Trocks

Windows, Doors & |
Paint

PAGE LUMBER & FUEL
64 E. 2nd Ave. S. Phone

South of blazed and|

nred and marked line;

South of
and marked line; Lot B

an area of approx.

North of red |
ne; Lot 8§ (NEL.
SEL) an area of aprox. 4.00 acres |
lying North of blazed and marked |

FEET HURT?

Visit Clark's

FOOT RELIEF
SHOP

Roliaf Immaediately From
Carns, Callauses, Buniona,
Burning and Aching Fest.
—FREE—
Analysis of Your Feet
5315 8. Stephens
Plenty of Free Parking

rth of bluzed and marked

approx. 4545 acres  lving

12 INWISWI! an area ol

Is an nﬁprox, total area of 23462

at ix reservod from eut-

aAlres, .

A book of fine aristo-tex

Arrived the other day.

And such a cloth would make kings droel,
And to each other soy—

“I think I'll buy a dozen suits

When | can raise the hay.”

But with regret I°ll send it back,
There's no one here who'd pay.

The natives here would take one look,
And push the book oway,

For even though a king may drocl

He doesn't have to weigh

Each obligation that he meets,

For all he does is play.

JACK MOLLARD

The "Fits-1t" Tailor

Rocm 4

327 N. Main Phone 1024.)

Ulah Rhoden

School of Dance Arts

School of TAP and Authentic HULA

Registration for ¥all Session
Saturday, Ox't. 910 a. m, to 4 p. m.
at our new studio: 220 N. Main St

COURSES IN:

TAP professional routines for children
ond odults. Class and private in-
struction, Beginner, Intermediate
and advanced.

HULA Authentic Hawaiian ancient
and modern hula, Chants, bomboo
and gourds,

A Gentleman's.
Whiskey-

from Kentucky

DISTILLERS FRODUCTS CORP,, NEW YORK
65% GRAIN NEUTRAL SPIRITS

NATIONAL
E6 FPROOF .

= wh
A yow Reod thy

L end poy iitep,

Hansen Moator Co.

Tire Dept.
Oak & Srephons
ROSEBURG, ORE. hone 446




