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nailum al tha erhool In Cenjronvltle,
Oregon, according to plana and .pecin- -vided the total amount bid li M. ft. B. M. for the Incense

Cedar, $.75 per M. ft. B. M. for
upon tha return of tha plans and peci- -
ficauona to the ClerK..

School Dirtrict No
I.AI RA U. GOODIU.
Clerk.

over $5,000.00 and less than $50, canon.. A copy 01 pian. u
. h rm (ha Schoolthe tiea Cedar h"oies, or a total000.00; it will be $10,000.00 pro Clark upon dcpuail o S3 uo which will
he refunded upon the return of thavided tne total amount oia is

over $V).000.00 and less than
$100,000.00; It will be 10'. of the
amount bid when the bid exceeds

plana and epecilicattona to tna Clers.
School Dl.trlct No S.

LAI HA M. GOODEIX.
Clerk.

$100,000.00. If the total amount

purchase price of $11,584.50, will
be considered. Only those por-
tions of the SWtSWl (approx.
5 acres) and the SEiSWi (ap-
prox. 30 acres) lying South and
East of Yellow Creek are Includ-
ed in the sale. The main fork of
Yellow Creek must be kept clear
of logging debris. Logging Is to
be done by caterpillar type trac-
tor equipment unless otherwise
authorized in writing by the offi-
cer in charge of the sale.

Rattlesnakes do not climb trees
habituallv, but occasionally some
sjiecies do.

Finish Lumber'
PAGE LUMBER & FUEL I

I
64 E. 2nd Ave. S. Phone 2tl

bid Is less than $5,000.00 the de-

posit shall be the amount of the
bid. The deposit will be returned
to unsuccessful bidders; applied
as part of the purchase price of

KOTICI rO BIDS FOB Bt'lLDINO
Sealed bid. will ba received until

S (XI P M. Saturday, September 11.

for fumithing all maienala and labor
for finishing tha Interior walla and
celling of the gymna.ium at ha aclwol
In Canyonville. Oregon, according to
plana and apeciflrationa. A copy of the
plana and epeclficatlone may be ob-

tained from tha School Clerk upon
of S3 00 which wlU ba refunded

tne successiui Diauer; or tnat por-
tion of the deposit, representing
the minimum required by law,
shall be retained as liquidated,

Notice of Timber Sale
Scaled hid, marked outside

"Bid lor Timber", and addressed
to the Regional Administrator,
Bureau of Land Management, Re-

gion I, Swan Island Administra-
tion BuiUing, I'ortland 18, Ore-
gon, will be received until and
opened at 10:30 a. m, Dalyllcht
Savings Time, Sept. 14, VMS,
lor the purchase of all merchan-
table timber designated for cut-

ting upon tracts hereinafter des-

cribed; the cutting and removal
of the timber to be carried out
In accordance with the forest
practice rules approved on July
7, 19., by the Secretary of the
Interior. Kach bid must state the
amount per thousand feet, board
measure, that will be paid for
each species and the total consid-
eration which will be paid for
the timber. No bid for less than
the appraised value will be con-

sidered. Kach hid must be submit-
ted In duplicato and be accom-
panied by a deposit. The deposit
must be In the form of a certi-
fied check on a solvent bank
and In favor of the Treasurer of
the United States. The amount of
the deposit will be $5,fKX3.0O pro

LEGAL NOTIC'K

for the Incense Cedar, White Fir,
and Hemlock, or a total purchase
price of $75,849.25, w ill be consid-
ered. In the SWiSW. of Sec. 9.
an area of approx. 7 acres lying
generally to the north and west
of a blazed line; and In the SEi
NEi of Sec. 17 an area of ap-

prox. 3 acres on the west tide
of the forty lying generally west
of a blazed line; and in the
NElSEi of Sec 17 an area of
approx. 10 acres lying generally
west of a blazed line are reserved
from sale Including blazed line
trees. Logging in that portion of
the sale area in Sec. 9 is to be
done by caterpillar type tractor
equipment T. 30 S., R. 4 W, W.
M., Sec. 33 all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
the NEI, Por. E1NWJ. all Lots
1 and 2, por. Lot 3, estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be
4385 M. feet Douglas fir, 185 M.
feet Incense Cedar, 65 M. feet
White Fir, 10 M. feet Hemlock.
No hid for less than $8.65 per M.
ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir,
$3.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the In-

cense Cedar, White Fir, and Hem-
lock, or a total purchase price
of $38,710.25, will be considered.
An area of approx. 39 acres In
the EiNWJ and in Lot 3 lying
generally north and west of the
cat road that traverses the ridge
Is reserved from cutting.

highest bid to other than the
highest bidder when necessary,
pursuant to the At of August
28, 1937 '50 Stat. 874), in order
to provide a continued supply of
timber to local industry and con-
tribute to the permanence of the
community which is dependent
upon such Industry. Timber sold
in accordance with this advertise-
ment must be manufactured
within the marketing area as des-

ignated for each tract described
below in accordance with the
Orders of the Secretary of the In-

terior, No. 2285, and Nos. 23X0
to 2390, Incl., dated December 11,
1946 and November 29, 1947, re-

spectively. Further Information
regarding this sale may be ob-

tained at District Offices of the
B. L. M. located at Salem, Eu-

gene, Roseburg, Coos Bay, and
Medford, or at the office of the
Regional Administrator, W. H.
Horning, Swan Island Admin-
istration Building, Portland 18,
Oregon. Dated at Portland, Ore-
gon, this 27th day of August,
1948. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY:
DOUGLAS MARKETING AREA:
T. 24 S., R. 6 W., W. M.; Sec. 5,
all merchantable timber desig-
nated for cutting on Por. SiSWl,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 1005 M. feet Douglas
Fir, 10 M. feet White Fir, 10 M.
fet Incense Cedar, 40 pieces Red
Cedar Poles. No bid for less than
$11.40 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Douglas Fir, $5.50 per M. ft. B.
M. for the White Fir. $4.25 per

KOTiei ros bios iob elictsicHUSK
Sealed blda will bo received until

S ou P. M Saturday. September 11. ItHH
for ftirnlahlns all material!, ftxturea
and labor fur wiring and lighting gym- -

damages If the high bidder does
not execute contract and furnish
satisfactory bond within thirty
days of acceptance of the bid
or cannot furnish evidence of his
ability to comply with the local
marketing requirement. This evi-
dence must be submitted with
the bid and shall conform with
the requirements as set forth
In this advertisement. In sales
over $10,000.00, the successful bid-

der will be required to furnish
a sworn financial statement. In
duplicate, showing ability to ful-
fill the terms of the contract.
A bond on all sales will be re- -

131 mPAINTING
O Decorating

O Paper Hanging
Best Quality Material

WELLS
PAINTING SERVICE

Phone 502-J-- 3

Member P. D. C. A.SEEQf
CALIFORNIA

quired In an amount computed at
the rate of at least 20 per cent
of the first $10,000 00 of the bid,
plus 10 per cent of any additional
amount of the bid In excess of
$10,000.00. Payment or timber
will be required in advance of
cutting, payment In full at the
time of filing the contract being
required in sales amounting to
SI O.m ).00 or less. In larger sales,
at the option of the Regional
Administrator, payment may be
made in a number of installments
scheduled to keep pace with the
rate of timber cutting and pay-
able upon demand Irom the Re-

gional Administrator. The right
is hereby reserved to waive tech-
nical defects In this advertise-
ment; to reject all bids, or to
award the timber for the amount
of the highest bid to other than
the highest bidder when neces-
sary, pursuant to the Act of Aug-
ust 28, 1937 ( 50 Stat. 874), in
order to provide a continued sup-
ply of timber to local industry
and contribute to permanence of
the community which is depend-
ent upon such Industry. Timber
sold In accordance with this ad-

vertisement must be manufactur-
ed within the marketing area as
designated for each tract describ-
ed below In accordance with the
Orders of the Secretary of the
Interior, No. 2285, and Nos. U80
to Incl., dated December
11, 1946 and November 29, 1947,
respectively. Further Information
regarding this sale may be ob-

tained at District Offices of the
B. L. M. located at Salem, Eu-

gene, Roseburg, Coos Bay, and
MeJford, or at the office of the
Rerional Administrator, W. II.
Homing, Swan Island Admin-
istration Building. Portland 18,
Oregon. Dated this 13th day of
August, 1948. IN DOUGLAS
COUNTY. DOUGLAS MARKET-
ING AREA: T. 23 S., R. 6 W,
W. M Sec. 13. all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
a por. of the NEJSWJ, all of the
WiSWi, por. SE1SWJ, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to
he 2990 M. feet Douglas fir, 20
M. feet Red Cedar, 15 M. feet
Incense Cedar. No bid for less
than $9.15 per M. ft. B. M. for
the Douglas fir, $3.50 per M. ft.
B. M. lor the Red Cedar and
Incense Cedar, or a total purch-
ase price of $27,481.00, will be
considered. In the KJSWj an
area of appro. 60 acres lying
to the east of a blazed line is
reserved from cutting Including
blazed and posted line trees. T.
25 S., R. 2W., W. M. Sec. 29,
all merchantable timber desig-
nated for cutting on the NEJ-NE-

SINE, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 3955
M. feet Douglas fir, 625 M. feet
Sugar Pine. 120 M. feet Red Ced-
ar, 20 M. feet Incense Cedar, 20
M. feet White Fir, 20 M. feet
Hemlock, 120 pieces Red Cedar
Poles. No bid for less than $11.45

on your trip East
If Ass" V

Notice of Timber Sale
Sealed bids, marked outside

"Bid for Timber", and addressed
to the Regional Administrator,
Bureau of Land Management, Re-

gion I. Swan Island Administra-
tion Building, Portland 18, Ore-
gon, will be received until and
opened at 10:30 a. m., Davlight
Savings Time, Sept. 14. 1948, for
the purchase of all merchantable
timber designated for cutting up-
on tracts hereinafter described;
the cutting and removal of the
timber to be carried out In ac-

cordance with the forest practice
rules approved on July 7, 1938, by
the Secretary of the Interior
Each bid must state the amount
per thousand feet, board meas-
ure, that will be paid for each
species and the total considera

J--

BUILDERS- -

For Your Millwork

-- FARMERS

Needs Coll on the
tion which will be paid for the

No Extra Rail Fare
ON YOUR ROUNDTRIP to Chicago, New
York and most other eastern cities, you
can go or return via San Francisco or Los
Angeles for not le more rail fart than you'd
pay to go direct east and back; This remark'
able travel bargain permits you to go east
one way, return west via another see
twice as much at no additional ticket
cost. For details call:

SVD Tha ffIendy
Southern Pacific

J. E. Clark, Agent Phone 1 1

f'itb Excusiti

JLadiantuU Mating t,'

Only Tngidain Hal lit

Plenty ot clan, hot witer ilwiyi
...for baths, shaving, dishwash-

ing, showers, laundering, and

many other daily household
needs. No other convenience in

your home gives you so much

help and pleasure for so little

cost Here's wh- y-

a Na Krai ta light ar t. tarsal.

a Na teal ta iKovaU

a Temperarars Is alway exacriv at yea
want H.

a Na Nvater-heat- rail.

a Clean, aafa, dependable,
a hilly utemetici previse, set water

withevt even thinking ebaat h

iwasssw "1" ""'""
iii' t 'ir,l'"(i

''aVaulaalt ,r

ROSEBURG CABINET & SUPPLY
'

for

SASH WINDOWS WINDOW FRAMES

FIR DOORS SCREEN DOORS

WINDOW SCREENS KITCHEN CABINETS

GENERAL WOODWORK OF ALL KINDS

Come and see us for quotations or call 303

Let us help you with your millwork problems.

ROSEBURG CABINET & SUPPLY

440 N. Jackson

Phone 303

timber. No bid lor less than the
appraised value will be consid-
ered. Each bid must be submitted
In duplicate, and be accompanied
by a deposit. The deposit must
be in the form of a certified
check on a solvent bank and In
favor of the Treasurer of the
United States. The amount of the
deposit will be $5,000.00 provid-
ed the total amount bid is over
$5,000,000 and less than $50,000.-00- ;

it will be $10,000.00 provided
the total amount bid Is over 0

and less than $100,000.00;
it will be lore of the amount bid
when the bid exceeds $100,000.00.
If the total amount bid is less
than $5,000.00; the deposit shall
be the amount of the bid. The
deposit will be returned to un-
successful bidders; applied as a
part of the purchase price of the
successful bidder; or that portion
of the deposit, representing the
minimum required by law, shall
be retained as liquidated damages
If the high bidder does not exe-
cute contract and furnish satis-
factory bond within thirty days
of acceptance of the bid or can-
not furnish evidence of his ability
to comply with the local market

UMPQUA VALLEY APPLIANCE

SALE Phone 1218120 W. Ook St.

Mm"9

per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas
fir, $23.55 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Sugar Pine. $3.05 per M. ft. B. M.
for the Red Cedar, Incense Ced-

ar, White Fir, and Hemlock, $75
per piece for the Red Cedar
Poles, or a total purchase price
of , will be considered.
A logging plan for the SWiNEi
is to be agreed upon with the
officer In charge of the sale prior
to the start of logging operations
on that forty. T. 28 S R. 8 W.,
W. M, Sec. 23. all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
the NElSWi, por. NWJSW'i, all
SlSWl, estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 3765 M. feet
Douglas fir, 65 M. feet Incense
Otlur, 115 M. feet White Fir,
5 M. feet Western Red Cedar.
No bid for less than $955 per
M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas
fir. $3.80 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Incense ( edar, White Fir, and
Western Red Cedar, or a total
purchase prle of $'16,658.75, will
I considered. In the NWiSWi
an area of apprux. 3 acres lying
to the north of a hlaed "line
is reserved from cutting Includ-
ing blazed line trees. SOUTH
I MPyUA MARKETING AREA:
T. 30 S, R. 2 W., W. M Sees. 9
and 17, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on a por.
SWlSW't. all SEiSWl of Sec. 9,
and all NEINEJ. por. SE.EJ.
por. NE1SEI of Sec. 17, estimat-
ed for the purpose of this sale
to be 7870 M. feet IVmglns fir.
245 M. feet Sugar Pine, 225 M.

Incense Cedar, 560 M. feet
White Fir. 5 M. feet Hemlock.
No hid for less than $8.65 per
M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas fir,
$21.25 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Sugar line. $3.25 per M. ft. B. M.

li

ing requirement. This evidence
must be submitted with the bid
and shall conform with the re-

quirements as set forth In this
advertisement. In sales over

the successful bidder will
be required to furnish a sworn
financial statement. In duplicate,
showing ability to fullill the
terms of the contract. A bond on
all sales will be required In an
amount computed at the rate of
at lcat 20 per cent of the first
$10.000 00 of the bid. plus 10 per
cent of any additional amount of
the bid In excess of $10,000.00.
Payment for timber will be re-

quired In advance of cutting, pay-
ment In full at the time of filing
the contract being required in
sales amounting to $10.00000 or
less. In larger sales, at the op-
tion of the Regional Administrat-
or, payment mav be made in a
number of Installments scheduled
to keep pace with the rate of
timber cutting and payable up-
on demand from the Regional
Administrator. The right Is here-
by reserved to waive technical
defects In this advertisement; to
reect all bids, or to award the
timber for the amount of the

ww ii w. j.i li m i taTTTn rrrrcx jtttTi vci m i

f. .y
'- -' 'LAlVi Regular Price CORONADO WASHER 105.50

rj Regular Price CORONADO IRON ER 44.95UVO TOTAL PRICE 1 5 0.4 5

jl- - BOTHP3 FOR 13045
i ONLY uMmuk

; ;l1 SAVE $20
--fri CORONADO FAMILY WASHER

't Bf' . JTV The fomoui CORONADO Washer that washes clothes cltaner, fatt.H
' ' 'J 1 23 gallon capacity ond a 7 lb. dry load woshing capacity. All electric,

; t V : I I I soaltd-ln-o- transminioo, l" agitator, lift timo lubrication.

I
l

'mil '''''
'

ENTIRE STOCK AND
1

EQUIPMENT AT

COST AND BEYOND

Oil Furnaces

As low as $200.00 on a blower
Hi-B- unit

Conversion Burners
' As low as $35.00

Stainless Steel Sinks

As low as $20.00

Pipes and Fittings

Evaporative Coolers

--jAf Many Other Items

too numerous to mention

GENERAL SHEET

A1ETAL WORKS

East Douglas Street

(Just Pott the City Limits)

PHONE 905-- R

Save $ $ $
Save those checked and discarded brake drums. Old and

new drums machined and banded. Satisfied users claim

up to 500 Co more mileage on bonded drums, salvaged or

new.

1 to 3 drums banded

3 or mora drums bonded

.$16.75 each

.$16.00 each

$1.75 eitroRenew broka surface, machined

Freight Paid to Albany, Ore.

Send "Freight Collect"

P & H MACHINE WORKS

303 E. First St. Tel. 1173 -
Albany, Oregon Stephens and Cass 97 m


