

FUNNY BUSINESS

By Hershberger



"Jim's golf has improved since he took up croquet!"

MODEST MAIDENS

Trainers Registered U. S. Patent Office



PARDON ME, OLD MAN, BUT MAY I SPEAK TO MY WIFE A MINUTE?

BLONDIE



ALLEY OOP



FRECKLES AND HIS FRIENDS



RED RYDER



Children Are Always Friends



At a baby beauty contest in New York, held to benefit the American Overseas Aid-United Nations Appeal for Children, youngsters of many nations demonstrated how to make international friendship work. Janice Henderson of Norway escorts Maureen Choy, left, and Priscilla Eng, all 2-year-olds, to the contest.

U. S. Senator

HORIZONTAL
1. S. Pictorial U.S. senator.
11. Light boots.
12. Of Asia.
13. Hall.
14. Game.
15. Game.
16. Game.
17. Game.
18. Game.
19. Game.
20. Game.
21. Game.
22. Game.
23. Game.
24. Game.
25. Game.
26. Game.
27. Game.
28. Game.
29. Game.
30. Game.
31. Game.
32. Game.
33. Game.
34. Game.
35. Game.
36. Game.
37. Game.
38. Game.
39. Game.
40. Game.
41. Game.
42. Game.
43. Game.
44. Game.
45. Game.
46. Game.
47. Game.
48. Game.
49. Game.
50. Game.
51. Game.
52. Game.
53. Game.
54. Game.

ANSWER TO PREVIOUS PUZZLE
1. S. Pictorial U.S. senator.
11. Light boots.
12. Of Asia.
13. Hall.
14. Game.
15. Game.
16. Game.
17. Game.
18. Game.
19. Game.
20. Game.
21. Game.
22. Game.
23. Game.
24. Game.
25. Game.
26. Game.
27. Game.
28. Game.
29. Game.
30. Game.
31. Game.
32. Game.
33. Game.
34. Game.
35. Game.
36. Game.
37. Game.
38. Game.
39. Game.
40. Game.
41. Game.
42. Game.
43. Game.
44. Game.
45. Game.
46. Game.
47. Game.
48. Game.
49. Game.
50. Game.
51. Game.
52. Game.
53. Game.
54. Game.

Stop Encouraging Them Birds, Gal



San Francisco's Mayor Elmer Robinson has decreed that pigeons and sea gulls around the city's public places are a nuisance. So feeding them in Union Square, like 3-year-old Susan Smyk of San Bruno, Calif., is doing, is out. A city cleaning bill provides for trapping or killing the birds.

LODGE DIRECTORY

Ladies Auxiliary to Fraternal Order of Eagles—Meetings held on the 2nd and 4th Tuesday of the month at the Eagles Hall. Visiting Sisters in good standing always welcome.
ETHEL L. LARSEN, Secy.

CLARA STEWIG, Secy.

Alpha Lodge No. 47, Knights of Pythias—Meets every Wednesday night at 8 o'clock. R. P. Hall, Rose street.

JOHN D. HESSE, C. C.

CARL O. PERMIN, Sec.

DeMolay Chapter—Regular meeting every second and fourth Thursday at the Masonic Temple. Scribe.

Job's Daughters, No. 8—Meet first and third Thursdays at 7:30 p. m., Masonic Temple. Master Mason and O. E. S. members always welcome.

CYNTHIA TURNER, Hon. Queen.

KARNA HENSON, Rec.

Union Encampment No. 9, I. O. O. F.—Meets each second and fourth Friday night in the Odd Fellow Temple at 8 o'clock. Visiting Patriarchs cordially invited to attend.

EVERETT L. TEATER, C. F.

RALPH L. RUSSELL, Scribe.

FRANK H. BEELS, Treas.

Knights of Columbus—Roseburg Council No. 2839. Meets every 2nd and 4th Tuesdays. St. Joseph's School. Visiting brothers welcome.

BOB WANDLING, G. K.

JOE REIDY, F. S.

F. O. E.—Aerie 1407, meets Macabee hall on Pine street every Tuesday evening at 8 o'clock. Visiting brothers always welcome.

ELMER HAMPTON, Pres.

ERNEST J. FOX, Sec.

Valentine Chapter, No. 98, O. E. S.—Meets in I. O. O. F. hall, Myrtle Creek, 2nd and 4th Mondays each month. Members all ways welcome.

ZENOBIA M. AKER, Pres.

JANE KNIGHT, F. Sec.

W. B. A. Roseburg Review, No. 11—Holds regular meetings on second and fourth Thursdays at 2 p. m. Visiting sisters invited to attend reviews. Macabee hall Pine and Cass Streets.

HELENA HAYES, Pres.

JESSIE VINSON, F. Sec.

Temple No. 23, Pythian Sisters—Meets the second and fourth Thursdays of each month at the K. P. hall.

LELA KUYKENDALL, M. E. C.

B. P. O. Elks, No. 326—Meet in Elks Temple every 4th Thursday. Visiting brothers always welcome.

ROBERT HELLWELL, Sec.

Neighbors of Woodcraft, Lilac Circle, No. 49—Meets at 8:00 p. m. every third Monday evening in I. O. O. F. hall. Visiting neighbors invited to attend.

LOIS BURTON, G. N.

CYNTHIA GERMOND, Clerk.

O. E. S., Roseburg Chapter No. 8—Holds stated communications on the first and third Thursdays of each month. All sojourning brothers and sisters are cordially invited to attend.

CLAYTON OSBORN, Worthy Master.

CHRISTINA MICELLI, Sec.

Veterans of Foreign Wars—Regular meeting of the Veterans of Foreign Wars, Post No. 2468, meets the second and fourth Tuesdays each month at 8 p. m. Veterans' Lounge.

Roseburg Rebekah Lodge, No. 41—Meets in Odd Fellows Temple every second and fourth Tuesday evenings.

LAVERN NICKENS, N. G.

RUTH DISHMAN, Rec. Sec.

Maple Lodge No. 127, A. F. & A. M.—Meets in I. O. O. F. hall, Myrtle Creek, 1st and 3rd Mondays each month. All members always welcome.

GEO. R. ACKER, Sr., W. M.

J. L. CHANEY, Secy.

Lady Elks—Meets every second and fourth Thursday at 8:00 o'clock at the Elks Temple. All members welcome.

MRS. PAUL K. RYAN, Pres.

MRS. FRANK J. BISTAK, Sec. Treasurer.

LIVESTOCK—PORTLAND, Ore., July 7.—(AP) (USDA)—CATTLE: Market uneven; common-medium grades rather slow; general market steady; some weakness early on beef cows; bulls under pressure; hogs—light blockers, 36c-38c; heavy blockers, 36c-38c; mutton 14c-20c.

Beef—Good cows 36c-40c; canners and cutters 33c-36c.

Wool—Coarse, valley and medium grades, 45c lb.

Mohair—25c lb. on 12-month growth.

Chinns—Wash., Walla Walla yellows, com., \$2.25-2.50; Calif., yellows and reds, \$2.65-2.75; few \$2.50; Ariz., white globes \$3.75-3.85.

Potatoes—New crop California White Rose, 100 lbs., \$3.85-4.10; size B, \$2.50-2.75.

PORTLAND, Ore., July 7.—(AP) (USDA)—CATTLE: Market uneven; common-medium grades rather slow; general market steady; some weakness early on beef cows; bulls under pressure; hogs—light blockers, 36c-38c; heavy blockers, 36c-38c; mutton 14c-20c.

Beef—Good cows 36c-40c; canners and cutters 33c-36c.

Wool—Coarse, valley and medium grades, 45c lb.

Mohair—25c lb. on 12-month growth.

Chinns—Wash., Walla Walla yellows, com., \$2.25-2.50; Calif., yellows and reds, \$2.65-2.75; few \$2.50; Ariz., white globes \$3.75-3.85.

Potatoes—New crop California White Rose, 100 lbs., \$3.85-4.10; size B, \$2.50-2.75.

LIVESTOCK—PORTLAND, Ore., July 7.—(AP) (USDA)—CATTLE: Market uneven; common-medium grades rather slow; general market steady; some weakness early on beef cows; bulls under pressure; hogs—light blockers, 36c-38c; heavy blockers, 36c-38c; mutton 14c-20c.

Beef—Good cows 36c-40c; canners and cutters 33c-36c.

Wool—Coarse, valley and medium grades, 45c lb.

Mohair—25c lb. on 12-month growth.

Chinns—Wash., Walla Walla yellows, com., \$2.25-2.50; Calif., yellows and reds, \$2.65-2.75; few \$2.50; Ariz., white globes \$3.75-3.85.

Potatoes—New crop California White Rose, 100 lbs., \$3.85-4.10; size B, \$2.50-2.75.

HOGS: Market act #1: 1.00-50

higher; good-choice 180-230 lbs., 31.50-32.00; latter record high; 240-300 lbs., 28.50-30.00; few 150-165 lbs., 30.00; good 400-530 lb. sows 22.00-23.00; lighter weights 23.50-24.00; good 104 lb. feeder pigs 31.00; choice quotable to 32.00.

SHEEP: Market fairly active, steady with slaughter ewes strong to 50 cents higher; good-choice spring lambs 24.50 to mostly 25.00; common grades and feed ewes mostly 21.00-25.00; good yearlings 19.00; good slaughter ewes 8.00-50; common down to 5.00.

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS

Sealed proposals will be received by the Oregon State Game Commission, 1634 S. W. Alder Street, P. O. Box 4136, Portland, Oregon, until 10:30 A. M. Friday July 16, 1948, for the CONSTRUCTION OF A CONCRETE DAM AND FILTER, INSTALLATION OF AN EIGHT INCH GALVANIZED IRON PIPE LINE, AND CONSTRUCTION OF A HATCHERY BUILDING INCLUDING BACHELOR QUARTERS, ETC., at the Diamond Lake Trout Hatchery site on Lake Creek Outlet for Diamond Lake for the Oregon State Game Commission and will then and there be opened and publicly read aloud. Bids received after the time fixed for opening the same will not be considered.

Plans: Specifications, and forms of contract documents may be obtained in the Office of the Oregon State Game Commission at 1634 S. W. Alder Street, Portland 8, Oregon, upon deposit of Twenty-Five Dollars (\$25.00).

The full amount of deposit for one set of documents will be returned to each actual bidder within a reasonable time after receipt of bids.

All contractors shall comply with all state laws pertaining to the qualifications of bidders, and particularly title 88, chapter 1, Oregon Compiled Laws Annotated.

Each proposal shall be made out on a bid form contained in the contract documents and shall be accompanied by a certified check or bid bond made payable to the Oregon State Game Commission of the State of Oregon in an amount not less than 10 per cent of the total amount of the proposal.

The Oregon State Game Commission reserves the right to reject any or all bids.

No bidder may withdraw his bid after the hour set for the opening unless said award is delayed for a period exceeding 30 days.

OREGON STATE GAME COMMISSION

By: C. A. Lockwood, Supervisor, State Game Commission, 1634 S. W. Alder Street, P. O. Box 4136, Portland 8, Oregon.

Date July 1, 1948.

Notice of Timber Sale

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Regional Administrator, Bureau of Land Management, Region 1, Swan Island Administration Building, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 a. m., Pacific Daylight Saving Time, July 20, 1948, for the purchase of all merchantable timber designated for cutting upon tracts hereinafter described, the cutting and removal of the timber to be carried out in accordance with the forest practice rules approved on July 7, 1938, by the Secretary of the Interior. Each bid must state the amount per thousand feet, board measure, that will be paid for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit. The deposit must be in the form of a certified check on a solvent bank and in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The amount of the deposit will be \$5,000 provided the total amount bid is over \$5,000.00 and less than \$50,000.00; it will be \$10,000.00 provided the total amount bid is over \$50,000.00 and less than \$100,000.00; it will be 10% of the amount bid when the bid exceeds \$100,000.00. If the total amount bid is less than \$5,000.00, the deposit shall be the amount of the bid. The deposit will be returned to unsuccessful bidders; applied as a part of the purchase price of the successful bidder; or that portion of the deposit, representing the minimum required by law, shall be retained as liquidated damages if the bidder does not execute contract and furnish satisfactory bond within thirty days of acceptance of the bid or cannot furnish evidence of his ability to comply with the local marketing requirement. This evidence must be submitted with the bid and shall conform with the requirements as set forth in this advertisement. In sales over \$10,000.00, the successful bidder will be required to furnish a sworn financial statement, in duplicate, showing ability to fulfill the terms of the contract. A bond on all sales will be required in an amount computed at the rate of at least 20 per cent of the first \$10,000.00 of the bid, plus 10 per cent of any additional amount of the bid in excess of \$10,000.00. Payment for timber will be required in advance of cutting, payment in full at the time of filing the contract being required in sales amounting to \$10,000.00 or less. In larger sales, at the option of the Regional Administrator, payment may be made in a number of installments scheduled to keep pace with the rate of timber cutting and payable upon demand from the Regional Administrator. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued

supply of timber to local industry and contribute to the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Timber sold in accordance with this advertisement must be manufactured within the marketing area as designated for each tract described below in accordance with the Orders of the Secretary of the Interior, No. 2285, and Nos. 2380 to 2390, Incl., dated December 11, 1946 and November 22, 1947, respectively. Further information regarding this sale may be obtained at District Offices of the B.L.M. located at Salem, Eugene, Roseburg, Coos Bay, and Medford, or at the office of the Regional Administrator, W. H. Horning, Swan Island Administration Building, Portland 18, Oregon. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 11th day of June, 1948, in DOUGLAS COUNTY: DOUGLAS MARKETING AREA: T. 20 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 28, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the W1/4 SW1/4, E1/4 SW1/4, SE1/4 NW1/4, and NW1/4 SW1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1195 M. feet Douglas Fir, No bid for less than \$12.10 per M. ft. B.M., or a total purchase price of \$14,459.50, will be considered. T. 21 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 11, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the N1/4 NW1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2710 M. feet Douglas Fir, 13 M. feet Western Red Cedar, No bid for less than \$9.75 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$3.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the Western Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$26,857.50, will be considered. T. 22 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 31, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW1/4, NE1/4 NW1/4, SW1/4 NW1/4, and SE1/4 NW1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2665 M. feet Douglas Fir, 70 M. feet White Fir, 50 M. feet Incense Cedar, 10 M. feet Red Cedar, No bid for less than \$9.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$3.30 per M. ft. B.M. for the White Fir, Incense Cedar, and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$24,947.00, will be considered. Caterpillar type logging is mandatory on the NW1/4 NE1/4 and SE1/4 NW1/4 in DOUGLAS COUNTY: SOUTH COAST MARKETING AREA: T. 22 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 31, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on por. Lots 1 and 2, por. SE1/4 NW1/4, por. NE1/4 NW1/4, por. Lot 3 (NW1/4 NW1/4), por. Lot 4 (SW1/4 NW1/4), por. SE1/4 NW1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 5100 M. feet Douglas Fir, 45 M. feet Hemlock, 35 M. feet White Fir, 70 M. feet Western Red Cedar, No bid for less than \$14.15 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.30 per M. ft. B.M. for the Hemlock and White Fir, \$2.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the Western Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$72,573.75, will be considered. Areas reserved from cutting, all bounded by blazed and posted lines: (a) An area of approx. 120 acres lying east of a blazed line which extends generally north and south from a point on the ridge top approx. 800 feet east of the northwest corner of Sec. 31 to a point approx. 125 feet west of the south quarter corner of Sec. 31; (b) An area of approx. 5 acres in the NW1/4 of Lot 1 (NW1/4 NW1/4); (c) An area of approx. 15 acres north, east, and south of the west quarter corner of Sec. 31; (d) An area of approx. one-half acre on the ridge northeast of the west quarter corner of Sec. 31, and between two large reserved areas; (e) An area of approx. 3 acres adjacent to the southwest corner of Sec. 31; and (f) An area of approx. 4 acres in the SW1/4 NW1/4. Logging is to be done by caterpillar type tractor equipment unless otherwise authorized in writing by the officer in charge of the sale. Prior to the initiation of logging operations, logging plan is to be agreed upon with the officer in charge of the sale. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: SOUTH COAST MARKETING AREA: T. 22 S., R. 9 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on por. Lot 14 (NE1/4 NW1/4), por. Lot 15 (SE1/4 NW1/4), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 930 M. feet marked Douglas Fir, 35 M. feet marked White Fir, No bid for less than \$6.80 per M. ft. B.M. for the marked Douglas Fir, \$2.80 per M. ft. B.M. for the marked White Fir, or a total purchase price of \$15,768.00, will be considered. Only those trees stamped USOC are to be cut. All unstamped trees are reserved. Logging is to be done by caterpillar type tractor equipment unless otherwise authorized in writing by the officer in charge of the sale. The stamped trees are confined to an area of approx. 15 acres in the northern portion of Lot 13 (SE1/4 NW1/4) and 17 acres in the southern portion of Lot 14 (NE1/4 NW1/4) in DOUGLAS COUNTY: DOUGLAS MARKETING AREA: T. 25 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 1 (NE1/4 NW1/4), Lot 2 (NW1/4 NW1/4), Lot 3 (NW1/4 NW1/4), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3995 M. feet Douglas Fir, 445 M. feet Sugar Pine, 80 M. feet White Fir, 30 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 30 M. feet Incense Cedar, No bid for less than \$14.05 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$3.15 per M. ft. B.M. for the Sugar Pine, \$4.15 per M. ft. B.M. for the White Fir, Western Red Cedar, and Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$65,677.50 will be considered. Only those Pine trees stamped USOC are to be cut. All unstamped Pine trees are reserved. All trees of other species less than 26 in. D.B.H. are reserved from cutting. Logging is to be done by caterpillar type tractor equipment. DOUGLAS COUNTY: SOUTH UMPQUA MARKETING AREA: T. 31 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 25, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the SE1/4 NW1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1440 M. feet Douglas Fir, No bid for less than \$9.45 per M. ft. B.M., or a total purchase price of \$10,773.00, will be considered. Only that portion of the SE1/4 NW1/4 lying to the east of a blazed line is included in the sale.