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the purpose of this sale to be 2395

oseburg3leiys-Reuie- u

M. feet Douglas Iir, 3U fit. ieet
Ponderosa Pine, 370 M. feet Sugar
Pine, 25 M. feet White Fir, 10 M.

Acts 20 23. A pure church. Eph. 5:27.

Unity of the Church, John 10:10; Rjm.
12:5, Unity of the Brethren. Ps. 133:1;
John 17:21; Acts 2:42. A command, Keb.
12:16. Endeavoring to keep, Eph. 4:3.
Till we come In unity of the faith, Eph.
4:13. Let us live by Bible doctrine for
no man made creeds can save us. Come,
a warm welcome awaits you to worship
with us, at any or all of the services,

KRNR
Mutual FJroadoasting I yetem

A90 KllooyolM

feet Hemlock, 10 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than $10.55
per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir,

Uw
NtWH-V(t- COMPANY INC.

PORTER CREEK CAFE
Highway 42

2 Miles East of Tenmile

Open Under NEW Management.
Home Cooked Food Good Coffee

TRUCKERS WELCOME

Notice of Timber For Sale
Private owner solicits oflers on

land and timber, LOTS 1 and 2;
SWi of NEi; SEJ of NW1; all
in Sec. 6, Tp. 30S, R2W, 174 Acres
cruised at; 880M Yellow Fir, 33
peelers 1310.M Bastard Fir, 13
peelers 245M Incense Cedar
2fX)M Sugar Pine 6GM Poles &
Piling, 170M Second Growth Fir,
with a Rood stand of young fir
reproduction over practically en-

tire area.
Astride Texas Creek gulch

details of cruise on request.
Wm. F. Morton, 760 SW Vista,

Portland 5, Ore.

entered lecond cim matter Mu
. 1920, ai the pottofljce at Hoaeburg.
Jregon, undar act ol March 1, 107 B.

UAHLGS V. STANTON IHIT OB.
' UWit KNAr-P- MANAOfcBy

Member of the Auoclated Preu, Or
tun Newnpaper Publishers AuocliUon.
&e Audit bureau ol Circulation.

Represented by DAY CO..
MC offices to New York, Chicago, Saa
ranciituu. Lot Angola, Seattle, PorV
md, St. lxmt.

gnbiortptiaa EUlei

513.ua per m.u.b.m. tor me a

Pine, $19.50 per M.ft.
B.M. for the Sugar Pine, $4.50
per M.ft.B.M. for die White Fir,
$3.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hem-
lock and Incense Cedar, or a total
purchase price of $33,307.25, will
be considered. All Douglas fir
trees less than 22 ins. DBHOB
are reserved from sale. Only Pine
trees stamped USOC are to be
felled. Logging is to be done by
caterpillar type tractor

CHI'BCH OF THE NAZARCNE
401) Fait Douglas street

Forrest 11111, pastor. Sunday School,
10:00 A. M., S. S. Linnell, superinten-
dent; Worship, 11:00 A. M., sermon by
the pastor; junior aervlce, Q 'M P. M.,
Mrs. Albert Alien, supervisor; Young
Peoples Society, &'M P. M,, Murvm
Eppva, pretuui'iit, Francis and Waomi
Liavi. leaders; Evangelistic service. U.M
p. m., svrmon by tne pastor; Prayer
meeting, Wednesday, 7:30 P. M., Erneat
Kowiey, leader; Kadio Droadcast, Satur-

day, 6:19 P. M.County Count
fd.50 fU.0L

3.30 4.26

ily Mall-
ear Year
ilx Month
fhrea Months
car ear. bv city carrier....

er month, by city carrier.-- LEGAL NOTICE

REMAINING UOUBS TODAY

4:00 Fulton Lewis, Jr.
4:1ft Frank Hemingway, L. A. Soap.
4:30 Music.
4:45 W. C. T. U. Program.
S:(XJ Hi Neighbor, Caralens Furniture.
5:13 Superman.
5:110 Captain Midnight, Wander Co.
6:45 Tom Mix, Haiston Purina.
6:00 Veterans' Information Guide.
6:15 The Sports Page, Barcua Sales

and Service.
6:20 Musical Interlude.
e.s5 State and Local News, RoseburgMotor Co.
6:30 Information Please, Joe Richards.
7:U0 Musical Interlude.
7:10 Spotlight on a Star, Horn's.
7:16 What's New. Corkrum Motors.
7:30 The Cisco Kid, Modern Furniture.
B 00 Meet the Press,
8:30 High Adventure.
8:45 Music.
8:55 Billy Rose, Pitching Horeshoes.

R. B. Semler, inc.
0:00 Alka Seltier News, Miles Labs.
11:15 Hospitality Time. Jack arris and

Son.
0:30 Music.
0:45 Henry J. Taylor, General Motors.

10:00 Fulton Lewis, Jr., Umpque, Auto
& Implement.

10:15 Nocturne,
10:30 Wax Gallery, Mlller'i RCA

Department.
11:00 Muslo Hall.
11:15 Sleep Serenade.
11:30 Sign Off.

Notice of Timber Sale
Sealed bids, marked outside

"Bid for Timber", and addressed
to the Regional Administrator,
Bureau of Land Management, Re-

gion I, Swan Island Administra-
tion Building, Portland 18, Ore-
gon, will be received until and

the north and west of a blazed
line is reserved from cutting In-

cluding blazed and posted line
trees. Logging is to be done by
caterpillar type tractor equip-
ment unless otherwise authorized
in writing by the officer In
charge of the sale. T. 23 S., R. 4
W., Sec. 13, all merchantable tim-
ber designated for cutting on the
SW.INW4 and WISW1, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
2650 M. feet Douglas fir. No bid
for less than $8.50 per M.ft.B.M.,
or a total purchase price of

will be considered. On the
NElSWJNWi, all Douglas fir
trees less than 22 ins. DBHOB
are reserved from cutting. Cater-
pillar type tractor logging is
mandatory on the NE1SWJNW1.
T. 26 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 5, all mer-
chantable timber designated for
cutting on the SW1SE1, esti-
mated for the purpose of this
sale to be 1525 M. feet Douglas
fir, 85 M. feet White Fir, 10 M.
feet Western Red Cedar. No hid
for less than $11.15 per M.ft.B.M.
for the Douglas fir, $2.30 per
M.ft.B.M. for the White Fir, $2.20
per M.ft.B.M. for the Western
Red Cedar, or a total purchase
price of $17,221.25, will be con-
sidered. Logging is to be done by
caterpillar type tractor equip-
ment. All trees 22 ins. DBHOB
and less are reserved from cut-
ting. T. 27 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 3, all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on the SE4SE1 and
EiSWISEi, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 1250 M.
feet Douglas fir, 65 M. feet Sugar
Pine, 20 M. feet Western Red
Cedar, 5 M. feet Hemlock, 5 M.
feet White Fir, 10 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than $11.95
per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir,
$17.45 per M.ft.B.M. for the Sugar
Pine, $2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the
Western Red Cedar, Hemlock,
White Fir, and Incense Cedar,

The Weather
U. 8. Weathor Bureau Offlca

Roseburg, Oregon
Foreoaet for Roseburn and vi-

cinity: Soattered ahowera tonight
and tomorrow.
Highest temp, for any April.... 96

opened at 10:30 a.m.. Pacific

uuw:ii icinp. lur " num.... cb
Highest temp, yesterday 65

-S-PECIAL SERVICE-DILLA- RD

CHURCH
Sunday, April 18, 1943

Sunday School Program, 1 0:00 A. M.

Special Service, 1 1 :00 A. M.

POTLUCK DINNER
12 Noon

Bring Two Dishes and Table Service

Dedication
of

Annex-- 2 P. M.
Special Music

Guest Speaker:
Dr. S. Raynor Smith
Supt. of S. Ore. Dist.

NOTICE OP FINAL SETTLEMENT
Notice is hereby given that the un-

designed administrator with the will
annexed has illed In the County Court
of the State ol Oregon lor Douglas
County his final account in the settle-
ment of said estate, and Tuesday, the
IBth day of May. 1948. at 10:00 o'clock
A. M. in the County Courtroom in the
Court House in Roseburg. Douglas
County, Oregon, has been fixed as the
time and place for hearing objections,
if any there be, to said final account
and for the settlement thereof.

A. N. ORCUTT. Administrator
with the will annexed of the
Estate of Joseph J. Challe. de-
ceased.

IN fiiECOUNTY COURT OF--
!;""

STATE OF OREGON FOR THE
COUNTY OF DOUGLAS

NOTICE OF FINAL ACCOUNT
In the Matter of the Estate

of
HAROLD V. DENN. Deceased.

Notice is hereby given Uiat the un.
dersigned as Administrator of the es-
tate of Harold V. Denn, deceased, has
filed his Final Account In the CountyCourt of the State of Oregon for Doug-
las County and that Monday the loth
day of May. 1U48. at the hour of 9:30
o'clock in the forenoon of said day in
the Courtroom of said Court has been
appointed by said Court as the time
and place for the hearing of objectionsthereto and the settlement thereof.

Dated and first published April 9,
1048.

Date of last publication May 7, 1048.
BERNARD L. DENN.
Administrator.
WALTER T. McGUIRK,
Attorney.

Lowest temp, last nlgnt 51

Precipitation yesterday 14
Preoipitatlon from April 1 1.57
Exoesa from Sept 1 .2.12
Excess from April 1 - .17

In the Day's News

FIRST BAPTI8T CHtBCII
Hose burg, Oregon

"The Poison Tongue" is the sermon
topic from the Boo of James by He v.
H. P. Sconce, Baptist pastor, Sunday
morning at eleven. It is memueraiup
Sunday and a number of new members
are expected to bo recived. "How to
Defeat tne Devil" la the topic Sunday
evening at seven-thirt- a beaumut
oammal service will oe held. Tne tuny
graded Sunday School meeu each s
Day morning at Mrs.
rt. D. Kniggo and lorty helpers will
lead In a Vacation Bible School as soon
as school is out. Five nappy youtn
groups meet each Sunday livening at

One ween lrom Sunday has
ooen designated as Junior Hign Sunday,
'ine Ooa ot tne Atom" by irvln Moon,

will be snown at tne church Tnursday,
April 22, at 7:43 P. M. Tina Is a very
dramatic sound color film. The gen-
eral public is Invited to all services,

FIHWT METHOIHBT C III UC II
Corner ui Lane and boulh Mam btrcets

W. A. MacArUiur, minister. 'ine
morning worship service; will center
around the theme. "But Now!" Tne
Apostle Paul to a k os a dramatic use ot
two short words, "But Now" and tt
la from this source that Hev. W. A.

will bring th message at H.oO
o clock. Tne choir, under .the direction
of it. Cloyde itilte, will sing, "A Poci
Lived In Galilee" by F. M. cnrlHlmnsen
with solo part by Mr. C. A. KicKeiu.
All Who aro not worshipping elsewhere
are cordially Invited to worship here.
Uhter survives lor the day and week
include: Church School at B:4ii A. M.;
Handicraft class at 6:30 P. M.; Youth
Fellowships at (1:30 P. M.; Evening Wor-

ship ut 'i.M P. M. at which time a group
of band students from Junior and Sen-
ior High Schools under direction of t

A. Hick el la and accompanied by Miss
Melva Williamson will be special guest
and present special music. The paittor
will give a brief meditation, "The School
of One Tyrannus." Monday at 4:46 P.

Meditatlonu over KH.NR. At
7: JO P. M. the Keystone Club will meet
in the home of Mrs. Floyd Wilon on
Union Avenue and members are en-

couraged to be present und bring a
guest. Tuesday at 7:30 P. M. the cnoir
will practice in the sanctuary and the
Boy Scout, Trop 4, will meet in the
social hall. Wednesday at 7::i0 P. M.

tne prayer and praise service
will be held lu the sanctuary.

(Continued irom Fags One)

have, that the
conference will continue In Bo- -

or a total purchase price of $16,- -

guia. juai la lu Buy, luv aillliipil.u
Communist coup (If that is what
it really was) FAILED.

Communism, you see, ISN'T
Infallible.

a IP4NWHIIF (ho Rnoelnni ant

171.75, will be considered. All
sugar pine trees less than 38 Ins.

Rose Hotel Coffee Shop

SATURDAY, APRIL 17, 104S
6:00 Sunrise Serenade.
6:15 Farm Bulletin Board.
6:30 Yawn Patrol .
7:00 Frank Hemingway, L. A. Soap.7:15 Rise and Shine, Nabisco.
7:30 Slate and Local News, Dr. Bruce

Tuck,
7 3ft The Beehive.
7:40 Hhspsudy In Wax.
8:00 Haven of Rest. Good Ship Grace.
8:30 Wally's Wake Up Time, Welly's

Grocery.
8:45 Homemaker's Club.
0:00 Music.
0:18 Lone Star Serenadera, Hennlnger'sMarts.

:3C Telephone Requests, Miller's Inc.
10:00 Alka Seltzer News, Miles Labs.
10:15 Music.
10:30 Words and Music.
10:45 Easy Llutenin'.
11:00 Symphonies for Youth.
11:30 Teen Timer's Club.
12:00 Sports Page of the Air, Keel

Motor Co.
12:10 Musical Americana.
12:40 Slate and Local News, Hansen

Motors.
12:45 National Nows.
12:55 Terminal Market Reports, SlgFett.
1:00 Man on the Street, Hennlnger'sMarts.
1:15 Voice of the Army.1:30 All Western Request, Melrose

Dairy.
S:00 Great Talent Hunt.
2:25 News.
1:30 Oplnlonalre.
3:00 Reviewing Sland.
3:30 Saturday Sideshow.
4:00 Sports News.
4:15 Frank Hemingway, Fnlger's.4:30 Preston Sellers. Organist.4:45 Proof That Christian Sclonce

Heals.
S:I5 Church of the Nasarene.
5:30 True or False, Shotwell Co.
6:00 Stop Me If You've Heard This.
0:30 Keep Up With the Kids.
T;00 Slate and Local News, RoseburgMotor Co.
7:05 Musical Interlude.
7:10 The Sports Psge, Bare us Sales

and 8ervlcc.
Tils Hero's to Veterans.
7:30 Freddie Martin Show, B. O. High.0:00 Happy Valley Cowboys, Douglas

Manufacturing Company.8:30 Music as You Like It, Lockwood
Motors.

0:45 Songs for Everyone, Roseburg
Refrigeration,

O:00.-A- KelUor News, Miles Labs.
0:15 Saluto to Jluy Uloch.
8:30 Wrestling Parade, Ashoraft

Jewelers. ,
10:30 Floats.
11:00 Muslo Hall.
11:15 Sleep Serenade.
11:30 Sinn Off,

PRIMARY

REGISTRATION

APRIL

20

Whether it's just a sandwich

or a small wedding party think

of the Rose Hotel Coffee Shop.
In either case the food and

service will be the best

FIRST CIMfKCH OF C11U1ST
SCIENTIST

318 Fast Douglas direct
Regular services Sunday at 11:00 A.

M. Subject of lesson: "Doctrine ot
Atonement," Sunday School convenes

M tougher In their TALK.
A high Soviet official tells a

German youth meeting In Berlin
that the "Marshall plan means
the division of Germany, the
division ol Europe IT MEANS
WAR."

Is that true?
The answer is NO!
Germany was already divided.

It was divided at the Elbe river.
That happened at Yalta. There
can be little doubt that the pur-
pose of Moscow has been to make
the Elbe the western boundary of
Russia in Europe.

It is as near certain as anything
can be that what has been hap-

pening in Berlin has been merely
part of the continuing Russian

purpose to drive us out of the

at U:4A A. M. Wednesday evening meet
ings, which Include testimonies of heal-
ing und rem urns on Christian Science
arc held ut U o'clock. 1 ho Reading
Hoom at :ti7 Pacific Bu Id ng Is open
dully except Sunduy and holidays from
lil::i0 A. M. to 4:;M P. M. Here the
Bible and all authorized Christian Sci-

ence literature may be rend, borrowed,
purchased, or subncrlbed for. The pub-
lic Is cordially Invited to attend the
church services and to visit the read

DO YOU WANT

AMERICANISM

INSTEAD OF

LEFTISM?

DBHUb are reserved from sale.
Logging is to be done by cater-
pillar type tractor equipment un-

less otherwise authorized in writ-
ing by the officer in charge of
the sale. T. 30 S., R. 7 W., Sees.
17 and 19, all merchantable tim-
ber designated for cutting on a
por. NW1SW1, all SW1SWJ of
Sec. 17, por. EJNE1, all EiSEi of
Sec. 19, estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 3230 M. feet
Douglas fir, 30 M. feet stamped
Ponderosa Pine, 175 M. feet
stamped Sugar Pine, 50 M. feet
White Fir, 135 M. feet Incense
Cedar, 10 M. feet Western Red
Cedar. No bid for less than $7.85
per. M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas
fir, $8.55 per M.ft.B.M. for the
stamped Ponderosa Pine, $14.70
per M.ft.B.M. for the stamped
Sugar Pine, $3.00 per M.ft.B.M.
for the While Fir, Incense Cedar,
and Western Red Cedar, or a
total purchase price of $28,769.50,
will bo considered. In Sec. 17, the
N4NW4SW.1 and NiSElNWISWi
are reserved from cutting. In Sec.
19, the W4W1EJNE1 Is reserved
from cutting. All Pine treos not
stamped USOC are reserved from
sale. T. 30 S., R. 9 W., Sec. 3, all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on por. NE1SW4, all
NWJSW1, estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 2280 M.
loet Douglas fir, 10 M. feet White
Kir, 15 M. feet Incense Cedar. No
bid for loss than $11.45 per M.ft.
B.M. for tho Douglas fir, $3.75
per M.ft.B.M. for the White Fir
and Incense Cedar, or a total pur-
chase price of $26,199.75, wilt be
considered. In the NE1SWJ, an
area of approx. 30 acres iylng
south and east of a blazed line is
reserved from cutting including
blazed line trees. Logging is to
be done by caterpillar type trac-
tor equipment unless otherwise
authorized In writing by the of-

ficer in charge of the sale. In
DOUGLAS COUNTY: SOUTH

ing room.

WII.Hl'K MKTIIOIIIHT CHURCH
Trlcjihone HUU, Oak Is ml

Rev. Karl B. Cotton, pastor. Services
for Sunday, April 111. 1U4H. Morning
Worship, U:50 A. M., themu, "Itulus ol
tho Gume." Sunday School, 10:40 A-

you are not attending church else-
where you aro cordially Invited to thetc

RUSSIAN part of Germany.

Our menu includes all your favorite steak

dinners and sea foods, too. In fact, we

offer the most complete menu of savory

dishes that you will find in the vinicity.

Meet Your Friends For Morning Coffee
...

AT

ROSE HOTEL COFFEE SHOP

Oliver M. Willis Manager

standard lime, May li, 1M4, tor
the purchase of all merchantable
timber designated for cutting
upon tracts hereinafter described;
the cutting and removal of the
timber to be carried out in ac-

cordance with the forest practice
rules approved on July 7, 1938,
by the Secretary of the Interior.
Each bid must state the amount
per thousand feet, board measure,
that will be paid for each species
and the total consideration which
will be paid for the timber. No
bid for less than the appraised
value will be considered. Each
bid must be submitted In dupli-
cate and be accompanied by a
deposit. The deposit must be in
the form of a certified check on
a solvent bank and in favor of
the Treasurer of the United
States. The amount of the deposit
will be $5,000.00 provided the
total amount bid is over $5,000.00
and less than $50,000.00; it will
be $10,000.00 provided the total
amount bid Is over $50,000.00 and
less than $100,000.00; it will be
10 of the amount bid when the
bid exceeds $100,000.00 If the
total amount bid is less than
$5,000.00, the deposit shall be the
amount of the bid. The deposit
will be returned to unsuccessful
bidders; applied as a part of the
purchase price of the successful
bidder; or that portion of the de-

posit, representing the minimum
required by law, shall be retained
as liquidated damages if the high
bidder does not execute contract
and furnish satisfactory bond
within thirty days of acceptance
of the bid or cannot furnish evi-

dence of his ability to comply
with the local marketing require-
ment. This evidence must be

with the bid and shall
conform with the requirements
as sot forth in this advertise-
ment. In sales over $10,000.00, the
successful bidder will tie required
to furnish a sworn financial
statement, in duplicate, showing
ability to fulfill the terms of the
contract. A bond on all sales will
be required in an amount com.
puled at the rale of at least 20
per cent of the first $10,000.00 of
the bid, plus 10 per cent of any
additional amount of the bid In
excess of $10,000.00. Payment lor
timber will he required In ad-

vance of cutting, payment in full
at the time of filing the contract
being required in sales amount-
ing to $10,000.00 or less. In larger
sales, at the option of the Re-
gional Administrator, payment
may be made in a number of
installments scheduled to keep
pace with the rate of timber cut-
ting and payable upon demand
from the Regional Administrator.
The right is hereby reserved to
waive technical defects in this
advertisement; to reject all bids,
or to award the timber for the
amount of the highest bid to
oilier than the highest bidder
when necessary, pursuant to the
Act of August 28, 1037 (50 Stat.
871), in order to provide a con-
tinued supply of timber to local
industry and contribute to the
permanence of the community
which is dependent upon such
Industry. Timber sold in accord-
ance with this advertisement
must ho manufactured within the
marketing area as designated for
each tract described below in ac-
cordance with the Orders of the
Secretary of (he Interior, No.
22S5, and Nos. 2380 to 23!K). Incl.,
dated December 11, l!Mti and
November 29, 1917, respectively.
Further informalion regarding
this sale may be obtained at Dis-

trict Offices of the li.L.M. lo-

cated at Salem, Eugene, Rose-
burg, Coos Hay, and Medfurd, or
at the office of the Regional
Administrator, V. H. Horning,
Swan Island Administration
Building, Portland 18, Oregon.
Dateil at Portland. Oregon, this
2nd dav of April, . IN DOUG-
LAS COUNTY: DOUGLAS MAR-

KETING AREA: T. 21 S., H. 7
W., Sec. .T, all merchantable
timber designated for Milling on
pnr. SSSE1, estimated for the
purpose of (his sale to be 12.VI M.
feet Douglas fir, 20 M. feet Hem

service. The annual church fourth quar
terly conference for wiumr win ne
held Monday evening, April 111. at 7:M
P. M. Hermits uru expected from allSunday at

The Churches
officers of tho church. Voting privil-
eges are extended to all full members
of tne cnurcn wno aro eighteen yeun
of ago or over.

BT. PAttla MTTIIFHAN CIIUHCtl
(MUiourl Kynod)

Corey and Military Blreeta
Weil Itoaeliurs"The Churi'h nt th I mh...n n..- -

REGISTER

AND

VOTE

REPUBLICAN

The Sunriny School and adult Dibit
Claim meats Sunday, April 18, at IMS

EDWARD U. CONDON,DR. of the U. S. Bureau of
Standards, who has been made
the target of charges by the
House Committee on
Activities, says In a speech in
New York:

"The United States is in the
grip of hysteria and fear, FOR
NO SOUND REASONS."

To the extent that seeing a
Communist behind every bush
and charging everybody with
whom we disagree wltli being a
Communist is obviously a form
of hysteria, what he says Is true.

But just the same, thcro ARE
sound reasons for the feeling of
Insecurity, of uncertainty, even
of fear that unquestionably does
wlct In ihle rviilntrv -

n. m. iiie aorv.ee neuitia nt II A. M
Wo most cordially Invite all, especially nsiuisi. usei n IlllMRMass,

f'ii:'ja'.'''JlVi.'l WifS?

jm - " w iimusfj noving no cnurcn Hume, toour Sunday School, Bible rhmand service. The Luthernn Hour Is
broadcast Sunday over KHNH at P.Ju
A. M. Tuna In: url is in- tnii .,...-.- .

2 Of THE UM
Tht Douglas County Walt her Lciigin

mmtm
over

Only 4 More Services
WITH

Evangelist and Mrs. Keith Hume

(Ybuth Evangelists)

list some of these reasons.
LET'S one thing, we aren't pro $25,000.00

In mtrefiandU prtzt
In 4

8CTHr:ni,iN metiioihst ciii'kch
Telephone Hull, Oakland

Sunday School, 10:00 A. M. Morning
theme, 11:00 A. M.. "Community
Churches" und a message from Bishop
Wilbur E. Hammaker. 7:110 P. M. an-

nual church lourth quarterly conference
for Sutherlln will be conducted by Hev.
S. Hay nor Smith, Supt. of the Southern
District. Reports from all officers of
the church aro expected. Voting privil-
eges uie extended lo all full members
of the church who are clghtuen years
of ago or over.

THK RAI.VATION ARMY
i;tfl Huuth Jst kson St. '

Sunday: Sunday School at 10:00 A. M.

Holiness meeting at 11:00 A. M. Y. P.
mooting nt (I. .10 p. M. Salvation meet-
ing at 'I 'M P. M. Tuesday: Holy Le.igue

Sewing Circle), 2 P. M. Wedncs-dii-
Y. P. Club, 7:ao P. M. Thursday,

meeting at 1A27 Cedar street at
?rnyer M.

FDKN 1.1 THKHAN CHURCH
F. km ruse

Rev. Enoch Sututen, pastor. El kh rose,
Services Sunday, April 1U. at U 00 P.
M. I.adloa Aid meets with Mrs. Kelfer
Tuesday, April 20. Everybody welcome.

l.ll.I.AKO CIII'RCII
W. W. Applcyard, pastor. Sunday

School at 1(100 A. M , Paul Hummel,
superintendent. Wo are decorating the
new Sunday School 'rooms on Sunday,
the ltlth. and will have S Ha v nor Smith,
our superintendent, with us fur the

services Everyone Is Invited
to he with us for the pollock dinner
which will be ai the school
hi nine. Dr. Smith will bring the morn-lu-

message and at 2 P. M we return
to the church for tho dedication ser-
vice which will lc followed by the 4th
quarterly conference Thin will bo a
grand day and we are looking for every-
one to bo out.

TF.NMII K ( lit Kt H
W. W. Appleyard. pastor. Tom God-

frey, superintendent The Sunday
School Is doing fine and we are asking
the folks at Tennule to meet right at
11:00 A M and close on time anil come
down to DilLird for the pollock din-
ner and Iw with vis for the dedication
service nt 3 o'clock and the 4th

conference which will follow im-

mediately ailer the dedication All are
Invited to hi log a covered dish and be
with us. Come.

CAMAS VU.I.KV I 111 Ki ll
W W Apples ard, pastor. Stmd.iv

School at 10 oo A M. Hcsie Wtteelcr.
superintendent The Sunday School
Is now coming right lo the front ami
we are looking for a good turnout next
Sunday morning We trust that each
one may come to Sunday School und
bring a covered dish so that ttiev may

"Add a lint and malt H rftymt"

CONTESTS
on

ducing enough to meet our needs.
Lack of production means:

1. Fatal weakness In a pinch.
In a pinch, wo need THINGS
plenty of them. The last war
taught us that.

2. A declining standard of
living. A high standard of living
means plenty of things. Nothing
la truer than that wo can't huve
what Isn't produced.

mass Instinct of our peopleTHE that because of lack
of adequate production we could
get Into serious trouble. What we
iiecd is to SNAP OUT of our
fears and our uncertainties anil

get back to work. If we will do
that, we will have nothing much
to worry about.

COAST MARKETING AREA: T.
22 S., R. 9 W., Sec. 10, all mer-
chantable timber designated for
cutting on lot 1 (NE1NE1), Lot
2 (NW1NE1), Lot 7 (SWJNED,
Lot 8 (SEINED, Lot 3 (NEI
NW1). Tit 5 (SWJNW1), Lot 6
(SEINWI), estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 5645 M.
feet Douglas fir, 380 M. feet Hem-
lock, 250 M. feet White Fir, 375
M. feet Western Red Cedar. No
bid for less than $13.45 per M.ft.
B.M. for the Douglas fir, $2.50
per M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock
and White Fir, $2.80 per M.ft.
B.M. for the Western Red Cedar,
or a total purchase price of

will he considered. An
area of approx. 58 acres lying
between two blazed and posted
lines which run generally north-
east and southwest through the
NINEi (Lots 1 and 21, SE1NWJ
(Lot 6), and SW1NE1 (Lot 7);
an area of approx. 4 acres lying
generally east, north and west of
a blazed and posted line in the
NE1NW1 (Lot 3); an area of
approx. 2 acres lying generally
east, south and west of a blazed
and posted line in the SW1NW1
I Lot 51; and an area of approx.
4 acres lying generally east, south
and west of a blazed and posted
line in the SEINES (Lot 8) are
reserved from cutting including
blazed and posted line trees. In
DOUGLAS COUNTY: JOSEPH-
INE MARKETING AREA: T. 32
S R. 3 W., Sec. 9. all merchant-
able timber designated for
ting on the SE1. estimated for

.TRUE or FALSE

Saturday 5:30 to 6:00 P.M.

....Tu- .- nuuiinauiiv, ftprii ai, at 7:.K
H. M t tho pa ran it n . Election of
orriccm Is to tnko pinto at this meot-In-

The choir meets for Its regularrohi'arsnl on Friday, April a;i, nt tt P
M. at the church. The pastor Is now
orifnntBhiH another adult mrmliemhlpcInm. Anyone Interested In attendingIn ruqusdtrd to speak to the pastor. No
obligation la Involved In attcndlntr the
dlncuMloni,. W. A. Sylwester, 1170 Mil-
itary street. Wast Kosoburg, pastor.

NT. JOHN'S MJTHE RAN ( lit Kl II
(MIsNoiirl Kynod)Seoul Hall, Urn pejus and Central Ms.

Nultierlln
W. A. Sylwester, pastor. Tha Churrh

of the Lulhcrun Hour." The SututnySchool and adult Bible Class meet
Sunday. April 18. at 7.00 P. M We
most contlully Invite all. especiallythose having no church home, to at-
tend our Sunday .School, Iiibj dins,and service, The Dour Ins County r

league meets WoOncudJiy, April21. at 7,:tU P M at tho parsonage in
ItimebtirR. Khvttni, of ufriccra la to
taku plntre The Lutheran Hour Is
briMdcartl Sundays over KHNH at B :U
A. M. Tune In; write in; tell others.

mPK MFTIIOIHHT rill-RC-

Cernsr Harvard and Umpgus Avenues
U .Sldft

Sunday School at 10 A M . Preachingat It. V p. M. S. at 7 00 P. M, Kvatv
gellitle service at 7:;tQ P. M. on Tues-
day evening Gilbert James, superin-tendent or otir Negro work In the South,will he with us lor the service at 7..M)
P. M The public Is invited to these
services. Kenneth Itnrgor, pa.tor.

HHST I'KI HI N III Rt
l.ane and Jsckisn .Htrerli

The Hv. Morrts H. Hoach, Th TV.
minister; Mrs. Homer Grow, organist;Mr Hnlph Church, choir director; Mr
Howard Otl, superintendent of the Sun-
day School. Morning sermon: "Cod's
Student." Evening -- The- Bar-
ren Fig Tree" Calendar for the week.
Sunday; Sundnv School, 0 A!i A M

Morning Worship, li:00 A Mf
Fellowship, fl JO p. M Eve-

ning service. 7W P. M Tuesdav; "Pal-
lor's Call." KHNH. 11:00 A M : Hov
Scouts, 7.;0 P. M., Choir practice. 7 30
P M Wednesday: "The Fellowship."7.10 P. m Thursday. "Pastor's ScripDook," KHNH. 11:00 A. M.

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHI Rt'll
louU and Ksnt Ktreeti

Kenneth W Knox, Minister; William
Pnrath. Hihle schotil supertnteudent.Mr. and Mrs S C Trued, music direc-
tor: Dorothy McS.iv. Youth director.
Bible School mi 9 CImsscs for all
ages. Morning worship at 10 4 Ser-
mon topic. ' The Meaning of Steward-
ship " The choir will sing "The Cheru-
bim Song by TwhalkoWNky. Mrs Jes-
sie Waggoner will sing "!Usl Psalm"
by McDcnnid Christian Endeavor at
6 :W. M.irie Anderson. Donna lons-hue- ,

Dorothv and Mildred Christens.cn
are leading a joint meeting. Eveningservice at J M The Northern l.inhn

Friday and Saturday 7:45 P. M.

Sunday 1 1 :00 A. M. and 7:30 P. M.

DON'T MISS HEARING THESE OUTSTANDING

YOUTH EVANGELISTS
"The Church Where the Gospel and Friendship Meet"
Pastors: Hev. and Mrs. Di'Loss Crook P. O. Box 103

, KRNR t
lock. 5 M. feet Western Red
Cedar. No bid for less than $11.55
per M.tt.H.M. for the Douglas fir,
$2.50 per M.ft.H.M. for die Hem-
lock and Western Red Cedar, or

drive right on down to DilUrd and be

WOULD YOU LIKE TO KNOW ? ?

Why Adventists Keep the Seventh Day?

THEN HEAR THESE FREE TALKS

a total purchase price of
will be considered. An

area of approx. 22 acres lying to

uith us for the dedication of our new
church annex at 2 P. M and b here
for the 4th quarterly conference which

Search Continues For
Lost National Guard Plane

PORTLAND, April 15 11

Military units directing search
for the Oregon National Guard
bomber that vanished last week
are centering their activity to-

day In Northern Clark County,
Washington.

Air search is continuing over
Ariel and Yacolt areas while

will follow the dedication sccvlc. Come
evcr one.

police conduct a house-t- house WHO CHANGED THE SABBATHBy

WANTED
At Least 500 People to Hear the Message ot the

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
11 A. M. Sunday on "THE POISON TONGUE."

check for reports of low flying
airplanes the night of April 9.

They hope to establish the plane's
line of flight.

OH ft (' II OF Jr:l'! CHRIST
OF 1 VTI tR PAY S AIN I S

Sundav School at in 00 A M at the
Knights of Pythias Hall. Pilmary Tties-- !

day ut 4 10 P M at the Dnvall re si
dence at SdB Mill street. Everyone is
Invited.

ST. Gi nR(;i: s i piscop t, ( Ml Ri ll
Main and Csss Strrrl

Fr plaker. Sutnlsv cervices m aw.
and lion a M Wednesday nervier all
8 30 A M

PINK UROVF SI NOW SI IIOOI,
Nrar Illtnille

You are cordially invited to nltend
our Sunday Schoil April 1M. We now
have a beautiful piano we wlh to tjctll
cat next Sunday. Anyone interested

Mr. Arthur L. Robison, The Bible says: "The Seventh Day is the Sabbath." Ex. 20: 1 0 but

Layman most Christians observe the first day. Why?
Three men were aboard the

attack bomber. It was ap-

proaching Portland on instru-
ments after a flight from Me--

Club of Noi ihwest ChrUtian Collegehave charge of the program. This club
has Alaska as Us nmMonarv tuterct
Their program will Include talks on tho
work that is being done in Alaska. Joan

CIIFUnAY IM THE MEMI TECTAMCMT"By7:30 p. m. "HOW TO DEFEAT

THE DEVIL" tJWIllSn. Ill 1 Ilk MkBa 1 LJ I rll!lsi
in a get together lng each ThurM Mr. E. Bert Esrelle, Mr. Estelle will examine every reference to the first day of the

Layman week in the New Testament.mm-- -
Chord Field, Wash.

PAGE ORSON WELLES
COPENHAGEN. Denmark

tasnua win e ine soloist.
C lli Kt II or GOO

(srden U Kusd and Walnut
"Church of Free Salvation " Rev

A M. Fvans. pastor Sunday Schiwl,
9 45 A. M . Melvtn Palmer, superinten-dent: Morning Worship. 11 on A M

Young Peoples' Meeting. 7 iXI P M

evening phuns fr lnfrnuitl,Ml
as to time and nlii-e- . Mrs. Cora Colli-so-

suprrintrnilrnt Mr. K.th.'r
nccrrtar. MIm IVna Mortterg.

organist.April 15 (A') Rumors that war
Fully Graded Sunday School at 9:43

Five Youth Groups at 6:15

'THK GOD OF THE ATOM." beauti-
ful sound color film, 7.45 Thursday

evening, April 22nd.

ASSKHHI Y Of t,UI
Kathrlln

Sunday School, in uu A M

orship. 1100 A. M. ', i.uug

evening Worship. 7 i P M Praver
meeung Wednesday at 1.30 P. M The
Church of God Is not a sect among
the acls but Church that !

MiMnins

nad DroKPn out wiwren
Stale. and Russia caused

near panic today in Jutland, in
northern Denmark. Newspaper
telephone lines were jammed.
The origin of the rumor could
jiut be determined.

ly andService, 6 P. M Bthi
un an the day of the Pentacoit. Chlrmt ni aver service. Wcdnodjv. 7 JO

Si nSl I 1Ui Builder, Matt. 16 U No otherH Praise swrvlce Sstutday ot l.Wi P.
FouucUtioii. 1 Cot 2 .11. Church of Uod,.Mt. Uetty Willuiu. pdalui


