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local marketing reaulrement. Red Cedar, 5 M. feet Incense Ceting on Por. EJNEISWj, Por.
EiWiNEiSWi. all E.SElSWi.

be submitted with the bid and
shall conform with the require-
ments as set forth in this adver

' NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All parsons having claims against the

estate of Hyrum Earl Wilcox, deceased,
now pending In the County Court oi
Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby
notified to present the same properlyverified to the undersigned Adminis-
trator at the offices of Orcutt at Long,
Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon,
within six (fit months from the Itith
day of January, ItHtt

FRANCIS HUGH WILCOX.
Administrator of the Estate
oi Hyrum Earl Wilcox,

LEOAI. NOTICE
" " Notice or inal hearingNOTICE HEKEBY U g.vn lhat March
e, 1148, at the hour oi 10 o'clock A. M.
In th County Court Room at the Court
Hoiu in Kooebun. DuufUs County,
Oregon, hat ben fixed a the tlma and

lace for hearing objections. If any8.era be, to the final acoount filed by
the undersigned ajiecutor in the above
entitled court.

NORMAN W. HALTER. Execu-
tor of the estate of Mary U.
Chapman, deceased.

of the Interior, No. 2285 and Nos.
2380 to 2390 Inc.. dated December
11, 1946 and November 29, 1947,
respectively. Further Information
regarding tl.is sale may be ob-
tained at District Offices of the
B. L. M. located at Salem, Eu-
gene, Roseburg, Coos Bay and
Medford, or at the office of the
Regional Administrator, W. H.
Horning, Swan Island Adminis-
tration Building, Portland 18,
Oregon. Dated at Portland, Ore-
gon this 30th day of January,
1948. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY!
SOUTH UMPQUA MARKETING
AREA: T. 28 S., R. 3 W Sec. 33,
all merchantable timber desig-
nated for cutting on the NWJ,
NW.SWj, Lot 1 TswiSWt), esti-
mated for the purpose of this
sale to be 3415 M. feet Doug-
las fir, 125 M. feet White Fir,
415 M. feet Incense Cedar, 20 M.
feet Western Red Cedar, 175 M.
feet stamped Sugar Pine. No
bid for less than $9.60 per M. ft.
B. M. for the Douglas fir, $2.30
per M. ft. B. M. for the White
lir. Incense Cedar and Western
Red Cedar, $15.35 per M. ft. a
M. for the stamped Sugar Pine,

NOTICE TO CEEDITOSS
All parsons having claims asainat tha

astats o Lawla Milton DubeU, dacaaaad,now pandlas In tha Couiuy Court of
Douglas County. Oragoa, are haraby
notlftad to preaent tha aama. properly
varlftad, to lha undarslfnad Ajbnuiulra-to-r

at tha offices cf Orcutt L"'Lg.
Roaaburg, Douglas County, Oregon, with-
in six f J; months fiom tha 3uut day of
January. 1U4S.

CLYDE L. Dl'BELL. Admin-
istrator of tha Eslata of Lawla
MilUm DubaU, Daceaaad.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT Or THa
STATE Or OREOON rOR THE

COUNTY Ur BOUQLAS
SUMMONS

T. M. BENNETT, doing business as
THE SUGtNE COMMUNITY BUILDERS,

Plaintiff,
JOE MARTIN and HARRY MARTIN,

Defendanla.
TO: JOE MARTIN

IN THE NAME OP THE STATE OF
OREGON: You ara hereby required to
appear and answer the Complaint of
the above named Plaintiff In the above
entitled eourt, now on file with the
Clerk of said Court on or before March
10. IMS, being mora than four weeks
after tha first publication of thia sum-
mons, and you are hereby notified, that
if you fall to appear and answer said
complaint as hereby required. Plaintiff
wiu apply to tha above entitled court
for s Judgment against you In the
amount of SSOI.83. to be satisfied from
money of the Defendants garnisheed In
the possession of the Douglas County
State Bank of Roseburg, Oregon, and
directing that tha Douglas County State
Bank of Roseburg, Oregon, pay into
court to satisfy said Judgment the
SAUl.XS garnisheed In their possessionas money due tha Defendants on March
21. 1W7, at the time an Attachment
and Notice to Garnishee In the above
entitled caea waa served upon said
Bank

This summons Is served upon you
by publication In the Roseburg

for four consecutive weeks,
commencing with the issue of rebru-ar- y

13. 1S48, pursuant to an ordir of
the Honorable Carl E. Wlmberly, Circuit
Judae for the Clreult Court of the State

NOTICE TO CBUDITORS
All persona having cJaliru aitainat the

estate of Suaan Rosetta Alexander, de-
ceased, now pending In the CountyCourt of Douglas County, Oregon, are
hereby notified to present the same
properly verified to the undersigned to
Administrator at the offices of Orcutt to
At Long, Roseburg, Douglas County, Ore- -

within six tOi months from theron, day of January, 194K
WILLIAM ARTHUR ALEX-
ANDER, Administrator of the
Estate of Suaan Kosetta Alex-
ander, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the

state of Anna Marie Bryan, deceased,
now pending in the County Court of
Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby
notified to present the same, properly to
verified, to the undersigned Executor to
at the office of Orcutt it Long, Rute-bur-

Douglas County, Oregon, within
six (6) months from the 13th day of
February, 1848.

A. M. KNUDTSON. Executor
of the Estate of Anna Maria
Bryan, Dcsaased.

Distributed in Roseburg

This evidence must be submitted
with the bid and shall conform
with the requirements as set
forth in this advertisement. In
sales over $10,000.00, the success
ful bidder will be required to
furnish a sworn financial state
ment, in duplicate, showing abil
ity to fulfill the terms of the
contract. A bond on all sales will
be required in an amount com-
puted at the rate of at least 20
per cent of the first $10,000.00 of
the bid, plus 10 per cent of any
additional amount of the bid in
excess of $10,000.00. Payment for
timber will be required in ad
vance of cutting, payment in full
at the time of filing the contract
being required in sales amount-
ing to $10,000.00 or less. In larger
sales, at the option of the Re-
gional Administrator, payment
may te made in a number oi in
stallments scheduled to keep pace
with the rate of timber cutting
and payable upon demand from
the Regional Administrator. The
right is hereby reserved to waive
technical defects in this adver-
tisement; to reject all bids, or to
award the timber for the amount
of the highest bid to other than
the highest bidder when neces-
sary, pursuant to the Act of
August 28, 1937 ( 50 Stat. 874). in
order to provide a continued sup
ply oi timber to local industry
and contribute to the permanence
of the community which is de
pendent upon such Industry. Tim-
ber sold in accordance with this
advertisement must be manufac-
tured within the marketing area
as designated for each tract de-
scribed Delow in accordance with
the Orders of the Secretary of
the Interior, No. 2285, and Nog.
2380 to 2390, Incl., dated Decem
ber 11, 1946, and November 29,
1947, respectively. Further infor--.
mation regarding this sale may
be obtained at District Offices of
the B.L.M. located at Salem, Eu- -

fene, Roseburg, Coos Bay, and
or at the office of the

Regional Administrator, W. H.
Horning, Swan Island Adminis-
tration Building, Portland 18,
Oregon. Dated this 9th day of
February, 1948.

The volumes given below arc
standing timber estimates and
may be more or less than the
actual amounts.

IN DOUGLAS COUNTY:
DOUGLAS MARKETING AREA:
PUBLIC DOMAIN LAND: T. 26
S., R. 2 W., Soc. 30, aU merchant-
able timber designated for cut

or a total purchase price of
will be considered. Log-

ging is to be done by caterpillar
type tractor equipment unless au-
thorized in writing by the officer
in cnarge oi tne sale, in DOUG-
LAS COUNTY: DOUGLAS MAR'
KETING AREA: T. 21 S., R. 6 W,
sec. 11, all merchantable tim
ber designated for cutting on the
SJNWj, NWiNEJSWl, NJNW1
SWJ, NJSjNWsSWl, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
2510 M. feet Douglas fir, 70 M.
feet Hemlock, 60 M. feet Western

tisement. In sales over $10,000.- -

00, the successful bidder will be
required to furnish a sworn fi-

nancial statement In duplicate
showing ability to fulfill the
terms of the contract. A bond on
all sales will be required in an
amount computed nt the rate of
at least 20 per cent of the
first $10,000.00 of the bid, plus
10 per cent of any additional
amount of the bid in excess of
$10,000.00. Payment for timber
will be required in advance of
cutting, payment in full at the
time of filing the contract being
required in sales amounting to
$10,000.00 or less. In larger sales,
at the option oi the Regional Ad-

ministrator, payment may be
made in a number of installments
scheduled to keep pace with the
rate of timber cutting and pay-
able upon demand from the Re-
gional Administrator. The right
is hereby reserved to waive tech-
nical defects in this advertise-
ment; to reject all bids, or to
award the timber for the amount
of the highest bid to other than
the highest bidder when neces-
sary, pursuant to the Act of Au-

gust 28, 1937 ( 50 Stat. 874) in r

to provide a continued sup-
ply of timber to local Industry
and contribute to the permanence
of the community which is de
pendent upon such industry.
Timber sold in accordance with
this advertisement must be man-
ufactured within the marketingarea as designated for each tract
described below in accordance
with the Orders of the Secretary

You'll find
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NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the

estate oi Victor Phlpps. deceased, now
Ending In the County Court of

Oregon, are hereby notified
present the same, property verified,
the undersigned Administratrix at

the offices of Orcutt at Long, Roseburg,
Douglas County, Oregon, within aix oi
months from the stn day of February,

DALLIA E. PHIPPS. Adminis-
tratrix of the Estate of Victor
Phipps. Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the

estate of Lester Gammon, deceased, now
pending In the County Court oi Doug-
las County, Oregon, are hereby notified

present the same properly verified,
the undersigned Administrator, U. S.

National Bank Bids., Roerburg, Oregon,
within six months from the date oi this
notice which is February g, 1W48.

R. L. WHIPPLE. Administra-
tor with the Will annexed of
the estate of Lester Gammon,
deceased. .

by bates Candy Co.
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3 .aeVlj fli'V food buying a more exciting pleasure

dar. No bid for less than $13.30
per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas
ttr, $2.50 per M. It. . ri. lor tne
Hemlock, Western Red Cedar,
and Incense Cedar, or a total
purchase price of $33,720.50, will
be considered. T. 23 S, R. 8 W.,
Sec. 3, all merch!sntsb:! t!mbr
designated for cutting on Lot 3
(NEiNWi). Lot 4 (NW.NWi),
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to Be wra M. leet uougias
fir, 8 M. feet Hemlock, 15 M.
feet Incense Cedar, 30 M. feet
Western Red Cedar. No bid for
less than $11.35 per M. ft. B. M.
for the Douglas fir, $2.30 per M.
ft B. M. for the Hemlock, In-

cense Cedar and Western Red Ce-

dar, or a total purchase price of
$10,613,75 will be considered. T. 30
S., R. 8 W Sec. 13, all merchan-
table timber designated for cut-- '
ting on the SiNJSWJ, SiSWj.
SJN.SE., SSSE4, estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be 2800
M. feet Douglas fir, 20 M. feet
stamped Ponderosa Pine, 120 M.
feet stamped Sugar Pine, 215 M.
feet Incense Cedar, 130 M. feet
White Fir, 25 M. feet Western
Red Cedar. No bid for less than
$8.15 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Douglas fir, $10.45 per M. ft. B.'
M. for the stamped Ponderosa
Pine, $15.05 per M. ft. B. M. for
the stamped Sugar Pine, $2.54
per M. ft. B. M. for the Incense-Ceda- r,

White Fir, and Westerrf
Red Cedar, or a total purchase,
price of $25,760.00, will be con-
sidered. All Pine trees nor;
stamped USOC are reserved from,
cutting. Logging is to be done-b- y

caterpillar type tractor equip-- ;

ment.
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FARM-FRES- PRODUCE

NICE CRISP

IfTTUCE h- -s . 9
DELICOUS

APPLES u. 8t
FRESH

TOMATOES . 27C
JUICE

ORANGES dox. 17C

Lb. Jan 35c
Bottles

s. 10c

29c

5c

choose from the steady stream

FOODS AT REAL SAVINGS..1

pouring onto our shelves. For

KEN'S RHYMINDER OF THE BEST . . .
SAVINGS ...ALWAYS DEPEND ON...We cannot sell insurance

cheap, '
Nor would we if we could,
For good insurance

Can't be cheap,
OR cheap insurance good.

GRIMM'S GROCERY

EiWiSElSVY't, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 543 M.
feet Douglas Fir, 75 M. feet Hem-
lock, 15 M. feet Sugar Pine. No
bid for less than $55 per M.ft.
B.M. for the Douglas Fir, $2.50
per fll.lt.U.M. lor the Hemlock,
$15.95 per M.ft. B.M. for the Sugar
Pine, or a total purchase price of
$5,0Sfi.50, will be considered.

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE

Sealed bids, marked outside,
"Bid for Timber." and addressed
to the Regional Administrator,
Bureau oi Land Management,
Region I, Swan Island Adminis-
tration Building, Portland 18,
Oregon, will be received tintll
and opened at 10:30 a. m Paci-
fic Standard Time, March 9, 194b',
for the purchase of all merchan-
table timber designated for cut-

ting upon tracts hereinafter des-

cribed; the cutting and removal
of the timber to be carried out
in accordance with the forest
practice rules approved on July 7,
1938, by the Secretary of the In
terior. Each bid must state the
amount per thousand feet, board
measure, that will be paid for
each species and the total con-

sideration which will be paid for
the timber. No bid for less than
the appraised value will be con
sidered. Each bid must be sub
mitted in duplicate and be ac
companied by a deposit. The
deposit must be in the form of
a certified check on a solvent
bank and in favor of the Treas-
urer of the United Stales. The
amount of the deposit will be

provided the total amount
bid is over $5,000.00 and less than
$50,000.00; it will be $10,000.00
provided the total amount bid is
over $50,000.00 and less than
$100,000.00; it will be 10 of the
amount bid when the bid

$100,000.00 It the total
amount bid is less than $5,000.00,
the deposit shall be Die amount of
the bid. The deposit will be re-

turned to unsuccessful bid-

ders; applied as a part of the
purchase price of the successful
bidder; or that portion of the de-

posit, representing the minimum
luuiui tu uy law, snail uu imauiru
as liquidated damages If the high
bidder does not execute contract
and furnish satisfactory bond
within thirty days of accep-
tance of the bid or cannot furnish
evidence of his ability to com-
ply with the local marketing re-

quirement. This evidence must

1 Factory-buil- t and
this Oldsmobile

engine is newly made NOT
rebuilt with new materials

throughout, including cylinder
block, crankshaft, timing chain,
pistons and rods. Don't delay

yff -c- all us today lor an cany
A Mwj..M.w.t... ... ia htr thia all- -' ntv(-,- ii ,ii - -

SW ... . ni l wnmna
HC",HIW'WllwiiJiiui'v.i.v".
installed in your car now. Easy
budget terms are available.

a

Special Sat. Feb. 14th

Opening Bout
Fiankie Stojack vs.. Georges Dusette

Semi-Fina- l
Paavo Karonen vs. George Curtis

Main Event
Bulldog Jackson vs. Sammy Cohen

Are YOU Under Insured? Call

KEN BAILEY
INSURANCE AGENCY

315 Pacific Bldg.
Phone 398

Roseburg Armory Saturday, Feb. 14, 8:30 P.M.

of uregon for the County of Douglaa,
maae on me etn aay or reoruary. ivaa.

D. T. BAYLY.
Attorney for Plaintiff!
329 Miner Building,

ugne, Oregon.

National Forest Timber for Sale
Sealed bids will be received by

the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg,
Oregon up to and not later than
2:00 p.m. February 24, 1948, lor
all the live timber marked or
designated for cutting, and all
merchantable dead timber locat-
ed on an area embracing about
35 acres within Sections 4 and
10, T. 33 S R. 5 W., W. M.,
(Jmpqua National Forest, Ore-
gon, estimated to be 1,300,000
leet B.M., more or less, of Douglas-

-fir, 40,000 feet B.M., more or
less, of ponderosa pine, 4,000 feet
B.M., more or less, of California
incense-cedar-, and an unestlmat- -

ed amount of other species of
saw umoer. ino did oi less man
$H.50 per M feet for Douglas-fir-,
$11.50 per M feet for ponderosa
pine, $15.50 per M feet for sugar
pine, 54.50 per M leet lor call'
lornia incense-ceda- r and other
species will be considered. In ad
dition to the prices bid for stump-ag- e

a cooperative deposit of $0.50
per M feet B.M., to cover the cost
of tree planting, seed sowing and
timber stand Improvement work
on the area cut over, for the
total cut of timber under the
terms of the agreement, will be
required. $2,000.00 must accom-
pany each bid, to be applied on
the purchase price, refunded, or
retained in part as liquidated
damages, according to the condi-
tions of sale. The right to reject
any and all bids is reserved. Be-

fore bids are submitted, full in-

formation concerning the timber,
the conditions of sale and the sub-
mission of bids should be ob-

tained from the Forest Super-
visor, Roseburg, Oregon, or the
District Ranger, Tiller, Oregon.

Notice of Timber Sale
Sealed bids, marked outside

"Bid for Timber", and addressed
to the Regional Administrator,
Bureau of Land Management,
Region I. Swan Island Adminis-
tration Building, Portland 18,
Oregon, will be received until
and opened at 10:30 A. M., Pa-
cific Standard Time, March 9,
1948, for the purchase of all mer-
chantable timber .designated for
cutting upon tracts hereinafter
described; the cuttinrf and re--

mnual ftf thn tlmhor in hp car
ried out in accordance with the
forest practice rules approved on
July 7, 1938, by the Secretary of
the Interior. Each bid must state
the amount per thousand feet,
board measure, that will be paid
for each species and the total
consideration which will be paid
for the timber. No bid for less
than the appraised value will be
considered. Each bid must be sub-
mitted in duplicate and be ac-

companied by a deposit. The de-

posit must be in the form of a
certified chck on a solvent bank
and ir favor of the Treasurer of
the United States. The amount
of the deposit will be $5,000.00
provided the total amount bid is
over .uuu.uu ana less tnan
$50,000.00; it will be $10,000.00
provided the total amount bid is
over $50,000.00 and less than
$100,000.00; it will be 10' of the
amount bid when the bid exceeds
$100,000.00. If the total amount
bid is less than $5,000.00, the de-

posit shall be the amount of the
bid. The deposit will be returned
to unsuccessful bidders; applied
as a part of the purchase price
of the successful bidder; or that
portion of the deposit, represent-
ing the minimum required by
law, shall be. retained as liqui-
dated damages if the high bidder
does not execute contract and
furnish satisfactory bond within
thirty days of acceptance of the
hid or cannot furnish evidence of
his ability to comply with the

Campbell's

Tomato

Soup
3 cans

25c

CRISCO
SHORTENING

cans .
1.23

Sunshine

CRACKERS

2ibs : 43c
Preferred Stock

COFFEE
45cLb. cans .

Ranchers Pride
Turkey ond A Q
Noodles. 34-o- z can

e - --i " r

Just Received
Carload

REDWOOD SIDING
6 and 8 inch Vertical Grain

Place Your Orders Now While

Stocks Are Complete

DENN-GERRETSE- N CO.
Ph. 128 " 402 W. Oak

Skippy

Peanut Butter
HOW IS THE TIME

TO PLAN

that new home or remodel-

ing. Soon there will be lots
of activity in the building
line with resulting short-

ages of good mechanics

Trappey

Cocktail
Morrell's Pure

Lard
Hunt's

and materials,
For ideas,
and estimat

Sauce
W

Pound

Can

FRESH
MORRELL'S TENDERIZED

see us. Hot Sauce
pe

es SiV im

Phone 121

MEATS

COEN LUMBER COMPANY

B

pi'

NEW POWER.

NEW PEP1

NEW PERFORMANCE

'

"n-l- l

H'Ssf .. .

ARCO

PEAS N..2an, lit
KRAFT

DINNERS 2 for 25C

EGGS
Farm Fresh

Per doxen 54C

PICNIC HAMS " 49c
LINK SAUSAGE 59c
FANCY

T-B0-
NE STEAKS 79c

PRIME Rf B

ROLLED ROASTS " 69c

Mill and Floed St.

,i. .

4

' t, ;

Don't Miss
Paul Kopp

AT THE

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
Thurs. night: "Valentines Answer."

Fri. night; "What the Resurrection
Moons to Me."

Sun. 1 1 o.m.: "Why I Believe in the
Church."

3 p.m.: Mass Meeting, "Freedom
from Fear ond Worry."

7:30 p.m.: "Only Children Go to
Hcoven."

0
"
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No down payment if you own your ear . . .
Otherwise 20 down 12 Mos. to pay

RAY BUCKLEY MOTORS
233 N. Stephens rhone 311

"' 'a- . 'V.


