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LEGAL NOTICELEGAL NOTICELEGAL NOTICELEGAL NOTICE 69 feet to the place of beginning. In
Douglas County. Oregon.NOTICE OF SHERIFF'S SALE Or

REAL PROPERTY
TUnt- l- U herebv xiv tin that bv virtue

NOTICE OF SALE OF REAL
PROPERTY

Notice is hereby slven that under
and declaring the same to be a first,
prior and superior lien against said
property, and for sale of said real prop-
erty in the manner provided by law,of an execution and order of sale is

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON. IN AND

FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
SUMMONS

X. L. KVIDERA and JESSIE C.
KVIDERA, husband and wife.

Plaintiffs.
vs.

provide a continued supply of
timber to local Industry and e

to the permanence of the
community which is dependent
upon such industry. Dated at
Portland, Oregon, this 29th day
of May, 1947. W. H. Horning,
Regional Administrator, Bureau
of Land Management.

terest may appear, and tax general
relief.

This summons it served upon you
by publication pursuant to order of the
Hon. Carl E. Wlmberly, Judge of the
above entitled Court, dated May 13,
1847.

GEORGE LUOMA. .
RAY B. COMPTON,
Attorneys for Plaintiffs,
Post Office Address:
Roseburg, Oregon.

Date of first publication; May 16, 1947.

and pursuant to an order of the County
Court of the State of Oregon for Doug-
las County duly made and entered of
record in the matter of the estate of
Charles Oliver, deceased, authorizing

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING
NOTICE HEREBY Is given that June,

14, 1947, at the hour of 10 o'clock A. M.
In the County Court Roam at the Court
House in Roseburg, Douglas County:
Oregon, has been fixed ai the time and
place for hearing objections, if any
there be, to the final account filed by
the undersigned administratrix in the.
above entitled court.

GERTRUDE I. KELLY, Ad-

ministratrix of the Estate of
MARTIN T. KELLY, Deceased.

CLYDE GISH, and MILDRED GISH.

sued out oi the wircuu toun oi mc
Stale of Oregon for Douglas County on
the 32nd day of May, 1 947. upon and
pursuant to a judgment and decree duly
given and made in said court and cause
on the 22nd day oi May, 1947. In suit
for the foreclosure of a mortgage pend-
ing therein in which Mary L. Chapman
was plaintiff and Paul E. Fulton and

ana lor tne placing or ine purcnaser in
the Immediate possession thereof, and
applying the proceed to the costs and
expenses of sale and the costs and ex-

penses of this suit. Including attorneys'
fees, and to the amount found due and
owing to plaintiffs under said mortgage
and to pther defendants as their in

the uitdersiimed as administrator oi
said estate to sell the real property
hereinafter described;

nusuand and wife; DOROTHY htkuand MAYNARD C. BYRD. wife and
husband: W. H. GERRETSEN; nd
COEN LUMBER COMPANY, a cor--
Doration. Defendants.

NOW. THEREFORE. I. A. N. Orcutt,
LEGAL NOTICE administrator with the Will annexed of Ueraidtne M. ruuon, nisoana ana

TO: CLYDE GISH and MILDRED GISH,ife, and Douglas Creditors Association,
corporation, were defendants, which huiband and wife. Defendants.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OFexecution and order of sale was to me
OREGON: You are hereby required to
appear and answer the complaint filed
against you In the above entitled suit
within four weeks from the date of

Notice of Timber Sale

Sealed bids, marked outside
"Bid for Timber", and addressed
to the Regional Administrator,
Bureau of Land Management,
901 Guardian Building, Portland
4, Oregon, will be received until
and opened at 10:30 A. M.( Pa-
cific Standard Time July 8, 1947,
for the purchase of timber upon
tracts hereinafter described: each
bid must state the amount per M.
feet B.M., which will be offered
for each species and the total
consideration which will be paid
for the timber. No bid for less
than the appraised value will be
considered. Each bid must be
submitted In duplicate and be
accompanied by a deposit in the
form of a certified check in favor
of the Treasurer of the United
States. The deposit of any suc-
cessful bidder will be credited on
the contract. Payment in full at
the time of filing the contract is
required in sales amounting to
S10.000.00 or less. For copies of
the form of proposal, form of

Knnrl nrmc rf nflV.

SPEEDY, I CAME. OVER. To THANK J 'oT'F'sav. KiosTTBWfl:f7 oh rt say-the first oublication of this summons

the estate of Charles Oliver, deceased,
will at the offices of Orcutt & Long in
Roseburg. Douglas County. Oregon, on
and after the lBt day of July, 1947,
offer for sale and sell at private sale
for cash in hand, subject to confirma-
tion by the court, the following de-

scribed real property belonging to said
estate,

The Northeast quarter of Section
34 and the Northeast quarter and
the Southeast quarter of Section 86.

all in Township 32, South Range 4
West of Willamette Meridian in
Douglas County. Oregon.

A. N. ORCUTT, Administrator
with the Will annexed of the
estate of Charles Oliver,

directed and commanded me to sen tne
property therein and hereinafter de-

scribed to satisfy the liens and charges
in sntd decree specified.

NOW, THEREFORE. I will on Tues-
day, the 24th day of June, 1947, at the
hour of 10:00 o'clock in the forenoon of
said day at the Court House front door
in Riseburg, Douglas County, Oregon,
offer for sale and sell at public auction
for ash, subject to redemption as pro-vi- d

hv law. all the riant, title and

biiu u juu iau su io eflr emu unwoi. CWZy; ACCIDENTALLY (?) VllJkk set fire to it vy Yul- 1CORKBUM
MOTORS. INC.

for want thereof, tne piainims win
apply to the court for the relief prayed
for in their complaint, a succinct state-
ment of which Is as follows,

For lurttrment affninst vnu for the

NOTICE OP SPECIAL CITY ELECTION
CITY OF RIDDLE, OHEGON

NOTICE la hereby given that the
Common Council of the City of Riddle,
Oregon, has by Ordinance No. 100,
posted by the Common Council and
approved by the Mayor May 26th, 1947,
called a special election of the qualified
voters of the City of Riddle, Oregon,
which election will be held in said City
on Friday the 27th day of June, 1947,
for the purpose of voting upon the
question of authorizing the Common
Council of said City to issue and sell
general obligation bonds of said Ctty In
the sum of $20,000.00 for the purpose
of providing funds for the Improvement
and repair of the City's Water System,
by the construction of a Pump House,
purchasing and Installing pumping
equipment, construction of a chlorinat-
ing house, purchasing and Installing
chlorinating equipment, purchasing and
Installing all necessary water pipe and
fittings therefor, repairing the reservoir
and water mains, purchasing the nec-

essary sites upon which to construct

sum of Four Thousand Three Hundred FOR RERAIRIKV0 MY CAR.
SO SWELL LOOKIAJf.

inu.-cs- of the defendants in saia sun
and of all Demons claiming by, through
or under them, or either of them, since THAT WHEN THE INSURANCEthe lain day oi January, iiho, in ana a fi jMAN WW 11 f HE

IMSDR.ED IT FOR A PR
WHICH WILL KNOCK.

tOU OVfcK- -
NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
Notice Is hereby given that the un-

dersigned executor has filed in the
County Court of the State of Oregon
for Douglas County, his Final Account
in settlement of said Estate and Tues-Hn- v

the 241 h dav of June. 1947. at 10:00

to the following described real property,

Beginning at a point 434 feet and
8 inches South of the Northeast cor-

ner of Lot numbered 21 In Brooks
and Beldon's Addition, the same
being Brookslde Addition to the
City of Roseburg, Oregon; thence
running South 100 feet: thence West
198 feet: thence North 100 feet;
thence East 188 feet, to the place
of beginning, all lying and being
situated in Douglas County, Oregon;

tnotthr wlih the tenements, heredita

Forty and 23100 Dollars (f4.340.23) with
6 per cent Interest thereon from Decem-
ber .7, 1946, and the further full sum
of Four Hundred Fifty and no 100
Dollars ($450.00) attorneys' fees, and
for costs and disbursements, and for
decree foreclosing plaintiffs' mortgage
upon the following described real prop-
erty

Beginning at a point marked bya cross in a concrete driveway
which is South SI 30' West 73.18
feet from a street monument in
South Kane Street, said street mon-
ument being located in the center
of Kane Street opposite and south-
easterly from the Southeast corner
of Block 60 of the City of Roseburg,
Oregon; thence North 82 00 West
60 feet; thence North 28 00' East
68 feet; thence South 62 00' East
60 feet; thence South 28 00' West

o'clock A. M.. in the County Court
tne pump ana cmorinaung nouses, oaiu"u. I', 'hnnff- - t,; m.fnr mfIjiIIv nri bear in- -

Factory Authorized Parts and Service for your
PLYMOUTH DE SOTO

Genuine parts installed by authorized servicemen it the best recipe for continued "like new'
performance of your car.

ment, amount Of deposit reqUirea terest at not to exceed 4 per annum,
Room in the Court House in Roseourg,
Douglas County, Oregon, has been fixed
as the time and place for hearing ob-

jections, if any there be, to said Final
Account, and for the settlement thereof.

will JAM CHURCH

nnvahlwith bid. amount of bond re

ments and appurtenances thereunto be
ILL. Executor of the Last Will
and Testament of Anna Edith

The form in which said proposal shall
appear on the official ballot of said
election shall be as follows.

PROPOSED BY THE COMMON
COUNCIL

Shall the City of Riddle. Oregon,
issue and sell general obligation bonds
of said City in the sum of S20.0OO.OO,

114 N. Rose Telephone 408longing or in anywise appertaining.
Dated this 82nd day of May. 1947.

O. T. CARTER.Churchill, Deceased.
Sheriff of DouglasNOTICE TO CREDITORS
County, uregon.Notice is hereby srtven that the un

quired with contract and other
information, application should
be made to the address shown
above. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY:

' T. 22 S., R. 8 W.( Sec. 19, all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on Por. Lot 9 (NEi
SWi), Por. Lot 10 (NW1SW1),
Tor. Lot 11 (SWiSWi), Por. Lot

r 12 (SEiSWi), Por. Lot 8 (NWJ
SEi), Por. Lot 13 (SWJSE1),
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 5870 M. feet Douglas

dersigned has been appointed by the
County Court, State of Oregon for
Douglas County, Administratrix of the
Estato of Earl R. Hill, deceased. All CHERRY SUNDAE FEATURE OF

said bonds to mature serially and to
bear interest at not to exceed 4 per
annum, payable Said
bonds to be Issued and sold for the
purpose of providing funds for the im-

provement and impairs of the City's
Water System, by constructing a pump

persons having claims against said es- -

tnt nr-- nnti fieri to n resell t the same,
verified as required oy law, 10 me

nouBe. Durcnasina and installing Dump- -

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
NOTICE HEREBY Is given that Mon-

day, the 23rd day of June, 1947, at the
hour of 10 o'clock A. M. n the fV" tv
Court Room at the Court House in Row
burg, Douglas County Oregon have
been flxei the
hearing objections, if ny thera ft Ml

the final account It lea oy me Under-
signed in the above entitled court.

Dated May 23rd. 1947.
GUY STONEHOCKER, Admin-
istrator with the will annexed
of the estate of Minnie May
Stonehocker, Deceased.

iinriprBiimed Administratrix at her resi
dence, 811 West Mosher Street, Rose-
burg. Douglas County. Oregon, within

ing equipment, constructing a chlori-
nating house, purchasing and installing
chlorinating equipment, purchasing and six months from the date of this notice.

Dated May 30, iim.7.
LILLIAN C. HILL, Adminis-
tratrix of the Estate of Earl
R. HiU Deceased.

installing ail necessary water pipe ana
fittings therefor, purchasing sites upon
which to construct pump and chlori-
nating houses, repair reservoir and
water mains of present water- system.

f HANSON, SON. 1 f IF CRAMP MAD BEEN HURT IT I I f YOU RIDE YOUR BUS6Y, POP,
"

( . A 'll

OOKfTLETHEB WOULD HWE BEEN ALL J AND I'LL RIDE THE MORSE I fir IV 1

y
VOTE YES OR U

Mark X between number and answer
voted for
300 Yei
301 No

The Dollins Dlace designated and tne
Judges and Clerks appointed to conduct
said election are as follows.

Polling place City Hall in the City of
Riddle. Oregon.

JUDGES CLERKS Meet the High Standards

fir, 25 M. feet HemiocK, ju ivl
feet White Fir, 25 M. feet West-

ern Red Cedar. No bid for less
than $7.65 per M. ft.B.M, for the
Douglas fir, $4.20 per M. ft.B.M.
for the Hemlock, White Fir, and
Western Red Cedar, or a total
purchase price of $45,241.50, will
be considered. The following de-

scribed areas are reserved from
this sale, including blazed and
posted line trees:, (1) An area of
approx. 108.30 acres lying gen-

erally south and east of blazed
and posted line running through
Lot 8 (NW1SE1), Lot 13 (SWi
SEi), Lot 12 (SEiSWi), Lot 9
(NEiSWi), and Lot 11 (SWI
SWi), which area comprises
approx. 38.73 acres in Lot 8
(NWISED, approx. 39.73 acres
in Lot 13 (SWiSEi),' approx.
20.04 acres in Lot 12 (SEiSWi),
appro. 1.04 acres in Lot 9 (NEi
SWI). and approx. 8.76 acres in

Maggie Logsdon Mabel Durgin
Ida Crlpps Ella Hamlin
A. L. Howard

Siiid election shall commence at the
hour of nine o'clock A. M. on said day
and shall continue until seven o'clock
P. M. of said dav. provided that an ad

Demanded
..THE NEW VlHilJI N 1 N IL, " ljournment of one hour at noon may be

naa as provided oy tne oi ine
City of Riddle, Oregon. Manufactured and Distributed byAsk hjr

Dated this etn day or June. wrr,
F. L. KUMMER.
City Recorder of the
city oi Middle. Oregon.

Douglas County Creamery
Established 1899 ,

Jackson at Douglas Phone 340

MEL-O-MAI- D

BUTTER AND ICE CREAM
at your looal dealer'! . . .

ARMY. .IIWPublish Friday, June 6th
It ' H A.r W m "Vfurnish iriday, June ;n

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

Notice is hefebv given that the unLot 11 (SWiSWi). (2) An area
of approx. 7.37 acres surrounded
hv hlazed line in Lot 10 (NWi

dersigned has been by order of the
County Court of the State of Oregon
for Douglas County appointed Admin-
istrator of the Estate of Clara Cason.
deceased. All persons having claims
aualnst said estate are notified to nre- osent the same, verified as required by

SWI). All live unmerchantable
Douglas fir trees in the sale area
of the SWi (Lots 9, 10, 11, 12),
totalling approx. 170 trees larger
than 22 inches DBHOB, are re-

served from cutting. The sale WAlaw, to the undersigned Administrator
at his office in the United States Na

BOYER'S
GUARANTEED
FRESH MEATS

tional Bank Building. Roseburg. Doug Highlas County, Oregon, within six months
urea is to be lotrced with cater irom tne date ot tnis notice.

Dated May 10, 1947.
G. V. WIMBERLY. Adminis oral Characieryktrator of the Estate of Clara

pillar type tractor equipment un-
less otherwise authorized by the
officer in charge of the sale.
T 22 S.. R.. 9 W.. Sec. 7. all

Cason. Deceased. COMPLETE SHOPPINGHigh Physical;NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT CENTER
Phone 957-- R

1 II I j . smerchantable timber designated
for cutting on a Por. Lot 14 - V I J " Standards ' Highway 99 and Garden Valley RoadVf

YOUNG BEEF

ROAST

42$ lb.
ll (NEiSWi). Por. Lot 13 (SEi

Notice la hereby given that the un-

dersigned, administratrix of the estate
of Murray 'it, Rockwell, deceased, has
filed in the County Court of Douglas
County. Oregon, her final account as
such administratrix, and that the Court
hns fixed Saturday, the 14th day of
June, 1947, at 10 o'clock A. M. and the
County Courtroom In the Court House
at Roseburg. Oregon, as the time and

w High Mental- -SWi) estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 930 M. feet
Douglas fir. 35 M. feet White Fir. DON'T MISSQualifications- - MEATS IN A

TIN SAVE TIME
place for hearing objections, if any, to
said final account and the closing of
said estate.

H ILDA L. R OCK WELL, A d- -
STEAK

No bid for less than $11.30 per
M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas fir,
and $4.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the
White Fir, or a total purchase
price of $10,656.00, will be con-
sidered. Only those trees stamped
USOC are to be cut. The stamped

THE PARADEminlstratrix. Estate of Murray 55tK. KocKweil, Deceased. Small'
8-- 1 Oox., lb.

NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING
NOTICE HEREBY is given that June

14. 1047. at the hour of 10 o'clock A. M.
Cowboy boots and whiskers are fun butl There's a real
parade of values at Wally's this week. You can join In the
parade and enjoy shopping for Groceries at Wally's.

tfrmiyi&rlktir
2.aaii ificatioa ynUrwao

At the Armory

in the County Court Room at the Court
Houne in Roseburg. Douglas County,

This ad doniltd

ai a hMic Service

lf
Kershner and '

Matson Produce
and

Boyers Meat Market

Dregon, has been fixed as the time and
place for hearing objections, if any
there be. to the final account filed by

BACON
By the Piece

59$ lb.

trees are confined to an area of
approx. 15 acres in northern part
Df Lot 13 (SEiSWi) and 17 acres
Jn southern part of Lot 14 (NEi-SWi-

The sale area is to be
logged with caterpillar type
tractor equipment unless oth-

erwise authorized by the of-

ficer in charge of the sale.
T. 26 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 31, all
mnrnhantnhlf timber designated

the undersigned administrator in the

Armour's Treet
Sandwich Meat

...35$12-Q- i. tin

Corned Beef
HASH

above entitled court. 'UPllDIPC' So the roin Plled
WJtluJtiJr&lJUik e crop Try Wally'sPAUL E. GEDDES. Admin

istrator of the Estate of
CHARLES FREEMAN, D- -
ceaued.

VEAL STEAK HUNT'S No. 2Vi tin,
light or dark 39$for cutting on the NEJ, csti- -

512Lean
Shoulder Cuts, lb.mated lor tne purpose oi una

sale to be 2840 M. feet Douglas
fir, 130 M. feet White Fir, 385 M.
foot Tnronsp Cedar. 45 M. feet

rADy DEL MONTE CREAM STYLE

tUrlll BUY THE BEST FOR LESS. 27$No. 2 tinPA MCEWestern Red Qedar, 350 M. feet; Corned Beef 3.33$No. 2 tins . Case of 24 .stamped Sugar Fine, id m. ieei
Hemlock. No bid for less than
$4.50 per M.ft.B.M, for the Doug- - 45$Mild

Cure, lb. WESTWARD HO 2 4 SIEVE.
BLENDED SIZES FOR TOP FLAVOR.PEAS

Libby's
Vienna Sausage
No. Vi tin ... 17$- rrr

TO THE SWEET BEAT OF Limburger Cheese 3.852 .33$ Case of 24No. 2 tins

las iir. per ivi.ii.cm.
the White Fir, Incense Cedar,
Western Red .Cedar, and Hem-

lock, $11.20 per M.ft.B.M. for the
stamped Sugar Pine, or a total:
purchase price of $19,115.00, will
be considered. Of Pine, only

. those trees stamped USOC are
in hp cut. The-sa-le area is to be

.:. 75$Badger
Brand, lb.

(Er WILSON SWEET PICKLES WHOLE SWEETS.
and His

Orchestra KERSHNER & MATSON

49$29$ 24-o- z. jar .1 i. jar .Fresh Produce
FrI. and Sat. Specials

WALLY'S

Baby Food
Specials

"SIX MEN OF RHYTHM"
"JACK AND THE BEAN STALK" FANCY
BLUE LAKE CUT GREEN BEANS.BEANS

Ho. 2 tin. .19$ Case of 24. .4.49Tables Booths
Food Refreshments

Smooth Oak Floor
Air Conditioned PABLUMCUCUMBERS

90 each Large
Size . 37$BETTY CROCKER SPLIT PEA SOUP

3 packages ........... 250OUR PRICES HAVE BEEN CUT StrainedLETTUCE

2 for 15V
Baby FoodsAT

19$
rUECDIAC READY T0 SERVE OAT

InLLnlUj CEREAL LITTLE DONUTS.

2 packages .... tins23$
Dnlirlaae

logged with caterpillar type trac-
tor equipment unless otherwise
authorized by the officer in
charge of the sale. T. 32 S.t R. 3
W., Sec. 21, all merchantable

h timber designated lor cutting on
Lots 4, 5, and 12, and the Wi
SWi, estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 3780 M. feet
Douglas fir, 570 M. feet stamped
Sugar Pine, 65 M. feet Hemlock,
15 M. feet stamped Ponderosa
Pine. No bid for less than $6.35

per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas
fir, $14.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the
stamped Sugar Pine, $4.20 per
M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, $10.15

per M.ft.B.M. for th& stamped
Ponderosa Pine, or a total pur- -

chase price of $32,408.25, will be
considered. All Douglas fir trees'
less than 18 ins. DBHOB are re
served. Of Pine, only those trees
stamped USOC are to be cut. The
sale area is to be logged with
caterpillar type tractor equip-- ;

ment unless otherwise authorized;
by the officer in charge of the
sale. All timber cut from the
above described areas must be
manufactured in the local mar-

keting area designated, by the
Bureau of Land Management
unless otherwise authorized by
the Regional Administrator. In
case of two or more identical
bids for the same timber, the
successful bidder will be selected
on the basis of comparative
ability to produce immediately
lumber for the Emergency Vet-

erans Housing program and to
further the objectives of the Act
of August 28, 1937. The right is
hereby reserved to waive techni-
cal defects in this advertisement;
to reject all bids, or to award
the timber for the amount of the
highest bid to other than the
highest bidder when necessary,
pursuant to the Act of August 28,
193" (50 Stat 674). In order to

DUTCH MILL 2 Bunches
Swift's Strained
Meats for Babies

2 fins ....35$

ORCHARD
CARDENGRAPEFRUIT JUICE

46-oz.t-
in 19CGreen f (f

Onions ;
--mr2V2 miles South of Roseburg on Hiway 99

Orchestra
Texas Pinks

GRAPEFRUIT

b for 49?
PAR

SOAP PWDRVERY SATURDAY HIT

GOD'S WORD
17. For Christ sent me not to baptize, but to preach the

gospel: not with wisdom of words, lest the cross of
Christ should be of none effect.

18. For the preaching of the cross Is to them that perish
foolishness but unto us which are saved It is the power
of Cod.

19. For it is written, I will destroy the wisdom of the wise

and will bring to nothing the understanding of the
prudent.

1 Cor. 1:171

Sunkitt Giant Size

OPEN EVERY NiTE EXCEPT TUESDAY JUICE ORANGES

2 doz. 55C 671
Door Charge a Dollar (tax included) Saturday Only


