

Hedge Coos Bay Chamber

COOS BAY, Ore., Feb. 28.—(AP)—F. W. Linklater, 47, manager of the Aberdeen, Wash., Chamber of Commerce for the past seven years, will become manager of the Coos Bay Chamber March 15. Linklater was elected to the post, vacant for the last two months.

Notice of Timber Sale

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration.

DANCE

Every Saturday Night

Legion Hall

OAKLAND

Sponsored by American Legion

Baird-Heaton Post

\$1.25 per Couple

Including Tax

PLUMBING



Kier-Crooch Plumbing Co.

Formerly with L. W. Metzger Co.

1127 Harvard Ave.

Phone 613-Y

Monuments — Markers

Foreign and Domestic Granites

MARBLE



BRONZE

Order Now for Memorial Day

HARRY G. RAPP

All Work and Materials Fully Guaranteed
Phone 621 Roseburg 707 W. Mosher

KITCHEN CABINETS DELUXE!

Cabinet work of all kinds — Window and Door Frames, any size, any shape—

—48-Hour Delivery—

HAVE IN STOCK

3-PANEL PINE DOORS, FIR PANELS, PREFIT

2-0 x 6-8, 2-4 x 6-8, 2-6 x 6-6

2-6 x 6-8, 2-8 x 6-8

2-8 x 6-8, 1 ft. Top Glass

Why not use steel sash? — All ready to nail in — no waiting

City Lumber & Builders Supply

North Umpqua Highway, 1/4 Mile East of County Barn
Phone 659

ROSEBURG TRANSFER & STORAGE

ROSEBURG ORE.



PHONE 927

MOVING — STORAGE
PICKUP and DELIVERYUSE AN EXTERIOR PAINT
that lasts

Don't waste time and money on poor-quality paint. Fuller Paint Prepared is the highest quality all-purpose "house" paint made.

PURE
PREPARED
PAINT

Available NOW!

DENN-GERRETSEN CO.

402 W. Oak St.

Roseburg

FULLER PAINTS they last

Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until and opened at 10:30 A.M., Pacific Standard Time, March 11, 1947, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described: each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M. which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$5,000.00 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 20 S., R. 6 W., Sec. 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the NW1NE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 170 M. feet Douglas Fir, No bid for less than \$10.90 per M. ft. B.M., or a total purchase price of \$1,853.00, will be considered. Only those trees stamped U.S.G.C. are to be cut. The stamped trees are confined to an area of approx. 6.0 acres in the southern portion of the subdivision, T. 22 S., R. 6 W., Sec. 27, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the S1SW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1095 M. feet Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet Incense Cedar, 5 M. feet Western Red Cedar, No bid for less than \$5.40 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$4.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the Incense Cedar, \$4.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the Western Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$5,976.00, will be considered. An area of approx. 35.0 acres lying north of blazed line on ridge top is reserved from cutting, including blazed line trees, T. 23 S., R. 6 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 3 (NE1NW1) and Lot 4 (NW1NW1), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 680 M. feet Douglas Fir, 40 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 5 M. feet Hemlock, 15 M. feet Incense Cedar, No bid for less than \$7.90 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$4.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the Western Red Cedar, \$4.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$5,624.00, will be considered. The area is to be logged with cutspillar type tractor equipment unless otherwise authorized by the officer in charge of the sale. An area of approx. 13.0 acres was previously cut in eastern portion of Lot 3 (NE1NW1). All timber cut from the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester.

Notice of Timber Sale

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until and opened at 10:30 A.M., Pacific Standard Time, March 11, 1947, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described: each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M. which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$5,000.00 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. In Douglas County: T. 22 S., R. 6 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW1 and N1NE1SW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2500 M. feet Douglas Fir, 215 M. feet White Fir, 85 M. feet Incense Cedar, 10 M. feet Hemlock, No bid for less than \$8.25 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$4.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the White Fir, Incense Cedar, and Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$21,927.00, will be considered. All Douglas Fir trees 26 ins. and less DBHOB are reserved from cutting. No trees are to be rigged in the N1NE1SW1, T. 22 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the N1NE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1435 M. feet Douglas Fir, 180 M. feet White Fir, 30 M. feet Incense Cedar, 15 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 5 M. feet Hemlock, No bid for less than \$8.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$4.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the White Fir, Incense Cedar, Western Red Cedar and Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$12,733.00, will be considered. T. 22 S., R. 9 W., Sec. 25, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the N1NE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1460 M. feet Douglas Fir, 65 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 25 M. feet White Fir, 35 M. feet Hemlock, No bid for less than \$7.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$4.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the Western Red Cedar, White Fir, and Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$10,745.00, will be considered. An area of approx. 38 acres lying south and east of a blazed and posted line in east portion of the N1NE1 is reserved, including blazed line trees, T. 24 S., R. 8 W.,

In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative ability to produce immediately lumber for the Emergency Veterans Housing program and to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937, (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 12th day of February, 1947. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration.

Sec. 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE1NE1, EISENE1, NEISE1, and Lot 1 (SE1SE1), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2400 M. feet Douglas Fir, 170 M. feet White Fir, 30 M. feet Hemlock, 45 M. feet Incense Cedar, 20 M. feet Western Red Cedar, No bid for less than \$5.55 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$4.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the White Fir, Hemlock, Incense Cedar, and Western Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$14,433.00, will be considered. The entire W1SE1, NE1 is reserved from cutting, T. 30 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 19, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 1 (NW1NW1), Lot 2 (SW1NW1), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2085 M. feet Douglas Fir, 30 M. feet stamped Sugar Pine, 5 M. feet stamped Ponderosa Pine, 145 M. feet Incense Cedar, 35 M. feet White Fir, No bid for less than \$4.35 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$10.30 per M. ft. B.M. for the stamped Sugar Pine, \$7.35 per M. ft. B.M. for the stamped Ponderosa Pine, \$4.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the Incense Cedar, and White Fir, or a total purchase price of \$10,171.50, will be considered. T. 30 S., R. 4 W., Sec. 27, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the W1NE1, NW1, and S1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 7975 M. feet Douglas Fir, 410 M. feet Incense Cedar, 35 M. feet White Fir, 50 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 5 M. feet Hemlock, No bid for less than \$4.90 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$4.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the Incense Cedar, White Fir, Western Red Cedar, and Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$41,177.50, will be considered. T. 30 S., R. 9 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 1 (NE1NE1), Lot 2 (NW1NE1), S1NE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2070 M. feet Douglas Fir, 35 M. feet White Fir, 5 M. feet Incense Cedar, 15 M. feet Hemlock, No bid for less than \$5.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$4.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the White Fir, Incense Cedar, and Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$10,581.00, will be considered. All live Port Orford Cedar trees are reserved from cutting. The SE1NE1 is to be logged by use of caterpillar-type tractor equipment unless otherwise authorized by the officer in charge of the sale. In Douglas County: T. 21 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the NW1NE1, all of the SW1NE1, nor. of Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, all of Lots 6, 7, 8, per of Lot 9, all of the NW1SE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 6135 M. feet green Douglas Fir, 235 M. feet green Western Red Cedar, 60 M. feet green Hemlock, 2205 M. feet fire-killed Douglas Fir, 715 M. feet fire-killed Western Red Cedar, No bid for less than \$3.16 per M. ft. B.M. for the green Douglas Fir, \$3.50 per M. ft. B.M.

for the green Western Red Cedar, \$2.10 per M. ft. B.M. for the green Hemlock, \$2.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the fire-killed Douglas Fir, \$0.75 per M. ft. B.M. for the fire-killed Western Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$61,723.25, will be considered. An area of approximately 98.00 acres, more or less, lying north of a blazed and posted line traversing through the NW1NE1, Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, and 5, is reserved from cutting including blazed line trees. An area of approximately 1.50 acres, more or less, in the SE cor. of Lot 9, bounded by a blazed and posted line, is reserved, including blazed line trees. All snags shall be felled concurrently with logging operations. All timber cut from the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative ability to produce immediately lumber for the Emergency Veterans Housing program and to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the

highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 31st day of January, 1947. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration.

INDIAN

LAST TIME SATURDAY!

WALLACE BEERY
The Mighty McGurk

COMING SUNDAY!

OVERWHELMING...

WERE THE ODDS AGAINST THEIR
LOVE!...AGAINST THEIR
VERY LIVES!

CLOAK and DAGGER

Donald Duck
Cartoon
NewsGARY COOPER
ROBERT ALDA · VLADIMIR SOKOLOFF
J. EDWARD BROMBERG
AND INTRODUCING
LILLI PALMER

See Gail Russell in the Paramount Hit—"CALCUTTA"

GAIL RUSSELL says:
"Here's why even
the Russians agree
You can't make a
bad cup of M-J-B"

Gail Russell Tells How to Pep-up Parties with Iced Café Russe



RUSSIAN-STYLE ICED COFFEE
1 square unsweetened chocolate
4 tablespoons sugar
Melt chocolate in top of double boiler; add sugar and cream and blend thoroughly. Cook for 5 minutes. Cool, stir into cold coffee and place in refrigerator to chill. Just before serving, beat well with rotary egg beater. Pour into tall glasses; serve icy cold. Makes 4 servings.



US: Café Russe sounds like a great contribution to international harmony...especially with the bright bouquet of M.J.B. shining in every sip. That mellow flavor, Miss R., comes from searching out each year's best crops from the world's top coffee lands.

GAIL RUSSELL: So that's why M.J.B. always tastes so good! Whether I make it mild or hearty, that M.J.B. flavor seems to stay full and satisfying. Try Café Russe and you'll see what I mean. Incidentally it's a grand way to serve M.J.B. at parties.

US: Thanks for those kind words—and for the Café Russe; they both give us a lift. Speaking of boosting, M.J.B.'s individual roast lifts the flavor of every coffee bean in M.J.B.'s blend, coaxes out every smidgen of subtle goodness for your cup.



No finer coffee packed...we guarantee it

- Only the world's choicest coffee beans go into M.J.B.
- A special roasting process brings out all of M.J.B.'s flavor.
- M.J.B. Coffee is protected by a higher vacuum packing process.
- That's why we say there is no finer coffee on the market.

LOSEE'S
Baby TogsShower
Gifts

337 N. Jackson Phone 534-J

TRAILWAYS
★ LOW
FARES! ★San Francisco .6.90
Albuquerque 25.95
Memphis . . . 40.00
Plus taxDepot Ticket Office
119 N. Stephens Ph. 353TRAILWAYS
for friendly serviceROSE
Theatre

Mat. Sat. & Sun.

CISCO MEETS AN ANGEL
AND THERE'S
THE DEVIL
TO PAY!PLUS
SPECTER
of the
ROSESTAR
NOW!

Starts Sunday

Flight To
Nowhere
The
sensational story of Arac-
tic secrets concealed in an
innocent girl's ring!BETTY CO-ED
featuring
JEAN PORTER
in
"WILD BILL
HICKOK
RIDES"

Starts Sunday

Flight To
Nowhere
The
sensational story of Arac-
tic secrets concealed in an
innocent girl's ring!