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provide a continued supply ofposted line In east portion of the
NiNEl la reserved, Including
blazed line trees. T. 24 S., R. 8 W..
Sec. 35. all merchantable timber

Mrs. M. J. Phillips
Dies In RoseburgTHE RIVER GLIDES ALONG

of August 28, 1937. The right Is

hereby reserved to waive techni-
cal defects In this advertisement;
to reject all bids, or to award the
timber for the amount of .the
highest bid to other than the
highest bidder when necessary,
pursuant to the Act of August 28,
1M7 (50 Stat. 8741, fn order to

limoer iu wuu muusiry so mm to
assure the permanence of the
community which is dependent
upon sucn inausiry. uatea at
Portland, Oregon, this 31st day of
Januarv, 1947. W. H. Horning,
Chief Forester, O. & C.

bid for leu than $5.40 tier M ft.
B.M. for the Douglas Fir, S4J0
per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense
Cedar, J4.20 per M.ft.B.M. for
the Western Red Cedar, nr a
total purchase price of $5,976.00,
will be considered. An area of
approx. 35.0 acres lying north
of blazed line on ridge top is re-
served from cutting, Including
blazed line tries. T. 23 S., R. 6
W., Sec. 3, all merchantable tim

COMPANY, l0.Cntcrvd m mcoom clui matter May
iT, 1120, at th po tot Ilea at Aubur,
ytmgua, undr act ol March j. 1S18.

By CHARLES V. STANTON

Popular songs have had much influence upon our Amer-
ican life, as evidenced today by the fact that no one named
Richard will open a door.

In our search for lore concerning pioneer post offices in
Douglas County, we have learned that the community of Glide

same name received their title

STORAGE .ty
and the pout office of the
from a song quite popular in

Mrs. John Laird, who had
a new post office to replace
as Mt. Scott, was puzzling her

IV"
R0STBUR

f , ORE. ,
office.

Her young son was striving valiantly to master the then
popular song, "When the River Goes Gliding Along." Mrs.
Laird could look out upon the
as they slid swift end deep
her mind suddenly linked the

PHdNE"

"927

CHURCH SUNDAY

MOVING STORAGE
PICKUP and DELIVERYoffspring with the beautiful scene before her and the name

"Glide" was born.
From unpublished historical manuscripts in the posses-

sion of Mrs. Anna Alexander, retired postmistress at Glide,
Mrs. Lester Blakely has compiled much interesting infor-
mation.

The first mail route along the North Umpqua River was

FIRST BAPTIST

11 A. M. "AFTER ALL PASTOR
WHAT IS FAITH?" Gene Yates,
soloist

established in 1877 between
known as Patterson Mill, now
was carried once a week on
miles. Mr. Patterson was the
also was established at Oak

postmaster.
In May, 1897, the Mt. Scott

on the Samuel Blakely place,
postmistress.

7:30 P. M. "THE FAITH OF ABEL
AND CAIN." Also a serious an-
swer to where Cain got his wife.
C. A. Oysinger, soloist Most Inter-

esting pulpit guests.

After a few years the Patterson Mill post office was The poor preacher whose likeness (2 years ago) yoa see
In this ad each week certainly needs tho PRAYERS of all
Cod's people.

moved across the river to the
later was transferred up the
Still later it was switched to
the Shrum place at the mouth
Averilla Shrum as postmistress. This route was continued
for nine years, then was canceled Sept 14, 1886, and for
two years residents of the
forced to travel to Roseburg

NICHOLS Model 410

ALL-PURPO- SE TRACTORAnother route was established Jan. 1, 1888. The post
office at Oak Creek was revived with James Cox as post-

master, and II. L. Engels opened an office at Peel. COMPLETE WITH
Feel was named for Senator

friend of II. L. Engels and a

ber designated lor cutting on
Lot 3 (NElNWil and Lot 4
(NWiNWl), estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 680 M.
feet Douglas Fir,' 40 M. feet
Western Red Cedar, 5 M. feet
Hemlock, 15 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than $7.90
per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas
Fir. $4.20 per M.ft.B.M. for the
Western Red Cedar, $4.20 per
M.ft.B.M. for the Hemlock, $420
per M.ft.B.M. for the Incense
Cedar,. - f

or, n
a
n

total....purchase . -rjrlce
or k,u4.uu. wiu De considered.
The area is to be logged with
caterpillar type tractor eauir
ment unless otherwise author-
ized by the officer In charge of
the sale. An area of approx. 13.0
acres was previously cut In east-
ern portion of Lot 3 (NE4NWJ).
All timber cut from the above
described areas must be manu-
factured In the local marketingarea designated by the O. and C.
Administration unless otherwise
authorized by the Chief Forester.
In case of two or more identical
bids for the same timber, the
successful bidder will be selected
on the basis of comparative abil
ity to produce immediately lum-
ber for the Emergency Veterans
Housing program and to further
the objectives of the Act of
August 28. 1937. (50 Stat. 874).
In order to provide a continued
supply of timber to local indus-
try so as to assure the perma-
nence of the community which
is dependent upon such Industry.
Dated at Portland, Oregon, this
12th day of February, 1947. W.
H. Horning. Chief Forester. O. A
C. Administration.

Notice of Timber Sale

Sealed bids, marked outside
"Bid for Timber," and addressed
to the Chief Forester, O. and C.
Administration, aui- Guardian
Building. Portland 4. Oregon, will
be received until and opened at
10:30 A. M., Pacific Standard
Time. March 11. 1947. for the pur
chase of timber upon tracts here-
inafter described; each bid must
state the amount per M. feet B.
oi., wnicn win oe oiiered tor eacn
snecles and the total considera-
tion which will be paid for the
timber. No bid for less than the
appraised value will be consid-
ered. Each bid must be submitted
in duplicate and be accompanied
by a deposit in the form of a cer-
tified check in favor of the Treas-
urer of the United States. The de-

posit of any successful bidder will
be credited on the contract. Pay
ment in iuu at tne time oi tilingthe contract is reaulred in sales
amounting to 5,do0.00 or' less.
For copies of the form of 'pro-
posal, form of contract and bond,
terms of payment, amount of de-

posit required with bid. amount
of bond required with contract
and other Information, applica-
tion should be made to the ad-
dress shown above. In Douglas
County: T. 22 S., R. 6 W., Sec. 7,
all merchantable timber designat-
ed for cutting on the NWi and
NJNE1SW,- - estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 2500 M.
feet Douglas Fir, 215 M. feet
White Fir. 85 M. feet Incense Ce
dar, 10 M. fete Hemlock. No bid
for less than $8.25 per M. ft. B. M.
for the Douglas Fir. $4.20 per M.
ft. B. M. tor the White Fir. In
cense Cedar, and Hemlock, or a
total purchase price ot $u,!U7.uu,
will be considered. All Douglas
Fir trees 26 ins. and less DBHOB
are reserved from cutting. No
trees are to be rigged in the
NiNEISWi. T. 22 S., K. 7 W..
Sec. 13, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on the
NiNEl, estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 1435 M.
feet Douglas Fir. 130 M. feet
White Fir, 30 M. feet Incense Ce-

dar, 15 M. feet Western Red Ce
dar, 3 M. teet HemlocK. ino bid
for less than $8.20 per M. ft. B.
M. for the Douglas Kir, $4.20 per
ai. it a. m. tor tne vvnite nr, in-
cense Cedar, Western Red Cedar
and Hemlock, or a total purchase
price of $12,733.00, will be con-
sidered. T. 22 S., R. 9 W., Sec. 25,

II merchantable timber dcsienat- -

ed for cutting on a portion of the
Mtt, estimated lor tne pur- -

nose of this sale to be 1460 M. feet
Douglas Fir, 6n M. lcet Western
Red Cedar. 25 M. feet White Fir.
35 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for
less than $7.00 per M. ft. B. M.
for the Douglas Fir, $4.20 per M.
ft. B. M. for the Western Red Ce-

dar, White Fir, and Hemlock, or
a total purchase price of $10.- -

745.00, will be considered. An
area of approx. 38 acres lying
south and east of a blazed and

I sit ... ly Joe Marsh

designated for cutting on the
rnr.iii.j, ti&tt.'Nt.t, ltistt,and Lot 1 (SEISED, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
2400 M. feet Douglas Fir, 170 M.
feet White Fir. 30 M. feet Hem
lock. 45 M. feet Incense Cedar, 20
m. ieet western ilea cedar. No
bid for less than $5.55 per M. ft.a M. for the Douglas Fir, $4.20
per M. ft B. M. for the White Fir.
Hemlock, Incense Cedar, and
Western Red Cedar, or a total

irehase price of $14,433.00, will
be considered. The entire WISE!
NEI Is reserved from cutting. T.
30 S.. R. 2 W., Sec. 19, all mer-
chantable timber designated for
cutting on Lot 1 (NWiNWl),
Lot 2 (SWiNWl), estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be 2085
M. feet Douglas Fir, 30 M. feet
stamped, Sugar Pine, 5 M. feet
stamped Ponderosa Pine, 145 M.
feet Incense Cedar, 35 M. feet
White Fir. No bid for less than
$4 35 per M. ft B. M. for the Doug-
las Fir, $1030 per M. ft B. M. for
the stamped Sugar Pine, $7.35 per
M. ft B. M. for the stamped Pon-
derosa Pine, $4.20 per M. ft B.
M. for the Incense Cedar and
White Fir, or a total purchase
price of $10,171.50, will be con-
sidered. T. 30 S . R. 4 W., Sec. 27,
all merchantable timber desig-
nated for cutting on the WJNEJ,
NWi, and SI, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 7975 M.
feet Douglas Fir, 410 M. feet In-
cense Cedar, 35 M. feet White
Fir, 50 M. feet Western Red Ce-

dar, 3 M. feet Hemlock. No bid
for less than $4.90 per M. ft. B. M.
for the Douglas Fir, $4.20 per M.
ft. B. M. for the Incense Cedar,
White Fir, Western Red Cedar,
and Hemlock, or a total purchase
price of $41,177.50, will be con-
sidered. T. 30 S., R. 9 W.. Sec. 3,
all merchantable timber desig-
nated for cutting on Lot 1 (NEi
NEi). Lot 2 (NWiNEi), SSNEi,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 2070 M. feet Douglas
Fir, 35 M. feet White Fir. 5 M.
feet Incense Cedar, 15 M. feet
Hemlock. No bid for less than
$5.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Douglas Fir, $4.20 per M. ft. B. M.
for the White Fir, Incense Cedar,
and Hemlock, or a total purchase
price of $10,581.00, will be con-
sidered. All live Port Orford Ce
dar trees are reserved from cut
ting. The SEiNEl is to be logged
b use of caternillar-tvo- e tractor
equipment unless otherwise au--

thorized by the officer in charge
of the sale. In Douglas County:
I . 21 s., K. 8 w., sec. 7, all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on a por. of the
NWiNEi. all of. the SWINEi.
por. of Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, all of
Lots 6. 7. 8. por. of Lot 9, all of
the NWlSEi. estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 6133 M.
Ieet green Douglas Mr, M.
feet green Western Red Cedar,
60 M. feet green Hemlock, 2205
M. feet lire killed Douglas Kir.
715 M. feet Western
Red Cedar. No bid for less than
$9.10 per M.ft.B.M. for the green
Douglas Fir, $3.50 per M.ft.B.M.
for the green Western Red
Cedar, $2.10 per M.ft.B.M. for
the green Hemlock, $2.00 per
M.ft.B.M. for the fire-kille-

Douglas Fir, $0.75 per M.ft.B.M.
for the Western Red
Cedar, or a total purchase price
of $61,723.25, will be considered.
An area of approximately 98.00
acres, more or less", lying north
of a blazed and posted line tra-
versing through the NWINEI.
Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, and 5, is reserved
from cutting including blazed
line trees. An area of approxi-
mately 1.50 acres,' more or less,
In the SE. cor. of Lot 9, bound--'
edby a blazed and posted line.
ls reserved, including blazed
line trees. All snags shall be
felled concurrently with logging
operations. All timber cut from
the above described areas must
be manufactured in the local mar-- ;

keting area designated by the O.
and C. Administration unless oth-
erwise authorized by the Chief
Forester. In case of two or more
identical bids for the same tim--

ber, the successful bidder will be
selected on the basis of compara- -

tive ability to produce immediate- -

ly lumber for the Emergency Vet-- !

crans Housing program and to
further the objectives of the Act

Kev. Joseph i. Pitts
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Mrs. Mary J. Phillipa. 86. well,
known Roseburg resident, died
yesterday at the Roseburs Sanl- -

tarium following a long period of
Ul neaitn. Mrs. r'niillpa was born
Dec. 11, 1860, In Chaplehlll, Mo.
She came to (he state 36 years
ago from Arkansas.

She moved to Roseburg, to be
near her children, 10 years ago,
Mr. Phillips passed away several
years ago.

Mrs. Phillips was a member of
the Methodist Church.

Surviving are two sons, Jess
Phillips, Shedd, Ore., and Roy
Phillips, Roseburg: and three
daughters, Mrs. Grace Bush, Rose-
burg; Mrs. Violet Wade, Suther-lin-;

and Mrs. Lula McDonald,
Roseburg.

Also surviving are 24 grand,
children, 40 great grandchildren
and seven jgreat groat grand-
children.

One sister, Mrs. Annah Brown
of Girard, Kansas, and one
brother, Tom Wagoner, Kings-vill-

Mo., also survive.
Funeral services will be held

Monday. Feb. 24. In the Chapel
of the Long A Orr Mortuary at
2 P. M. interment will lollow In
the Fair Oaks Cemetery In
Sutherlin. Dr. C A. Edwards will
officiate at the service.

Convicts 'Strike' for
More Food and Less Toil

SAN QUENTIN, Calif., Feb. 20
(AO Warden Clinton Duffy

promised further Investigation
today of the latest stop-wor- k

demonstration at San Quentln
prison after dispatching one con
voy of 80 suspected ringleaders
ill) miles away to t oisom prison
under heavy guard last night

Demandins more food and less
work. Jute mill workers sullenly
refused to go back on the Job
after their noonday meal yester-
day. They were joined by mill
and quarry workers. There was
no violence. In all, 265 convicts
participated.

Duffy asserted that San Quen-tin'- s

4.200 inmates eat "a great
deal better than many Amer
ican families and tney are not
overworked." He blamed a "gang
of young hoodlums."

About 200,000 people arc en
gaged full time if the U. S. fish-
ing Industry.

Notice of Timber Sale

Sealed bids, marked outside
"Bid for Timber", and addressed
to the Chief Forester, O. and C.
Administration, mil Guardian
Building, Portland 4, Oregon,
will be received until and opened

10:30 A.M. Pacific standard
Time, March 11, 1947, for the
ourrhas of timber upon tracts
hereinafter described; each bid
must state the amount per M.
feet B.M., which will be offered
for each species and the total
consideration which will be paid
tor the umber. No bid lor less
than the appraised value will be
considered. Each bid must be
submitted In duplicate and be
accompanied by a deposit In he
form oi a certuiea cnecK in
favor of the. Treasurer of the
United States. The deposit of any
successful bidder will be credited
on the contract. Payment in full
at the time ot tiling tne contract
Is required in sales amounting
o or less, f or copies oi
he form of proposal, form of
contract and bond, terms of pay-
ment, amount of deposit required
with bid, amount of bond re-
quired with contract and other
Information, application should
be made to the address shown
ibove. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY:
T. 20 S.. R. 6 W.. Sec. 35, all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on a portion of the
NWiNEl, estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to he 170 M.
feet Douglas Fir. No bid for less
than $10.90 per M.ft.B.M., or a
total purchase price ot $1,8.X00.
will be considered. Only those
trees stamped U.S.O.C are to be
cut The stamped trees are con-
fined to an area of approx. 6.0
acres In the southern portion of
the subdivision. T. 22 S., R. 6
W., Sec. 27, all merchantable
timber dcslfinatcd for cutting on
a portion of the S1SWI, esti-
mated for the purpose of this
sale to ho 1093 M. feet Douglas
Fir, 10 M. feet Incense Cedar, 5
M. feet Western Red Cedar. No
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FaPst war the Martin eta went
as far as New York Cltr.

Bat when Cissy Cupper married
the roan Carter boy, they al-

lowed as how tbey were troinf to
spend their honeymoon right hern.

There! ns piece better than
narr town," Cissy aya. 'And I'd
like to start married life at home.

wiU things Bad and I are used to,'
Maine sense, some to think of is.

Polka naturally left tbarn alone;
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U. 8. Weather Bureau Office
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clnity: Cloudy tonight and Satur-
day: warmer toniaht.
Hlgheet temp, tor any Feb 7
Loweet temp, for any Feb 3
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Loweet temp, laet night 37

Precipitation yeeterday 0

Precipitation from Feb. 1 ....2.78
Deficit from Feb. 1 - 5
deficit from Sept. 1 3A

In the Day's Hews

(Continued from page 1)

some limp and shoddy discards
from a speculator's back door.

They gave him the burn t rush
and told him If he ever came back

they'd make dog food of him and
sell him over the counter. That
ended that.

If you'll track back 100 real
American successes In business,
you'll find about 99 of them
founded upon dependable high
quality of product.

Berry Farm Isn't to
KNOTTY'S descendants got to
the Forty-Niner-

The original Knott and his fam-

ily crossed the plains with an ox

train. He won through to the
gold fields, and washed a moder-

ate amount of dust out of the rif-

fles. But he was no hog. When he

got enough to make a comfort-
able weight when he hefted It, he

quit mining and went after a
piece of land..

The site of the present Berry
Farm is a part of that original
holding.

e

IT first he Just farmed. Then he

and dls descendants got to

trowing berries. When the
was developed, they
on It. They've stuck to A

more or less ever since. They've
branched out Into feeding people

both over the counter and
modest

plants. Over some of their restau-

rant counters they'll still sell you
a piece of Boysenberry pie whose
flavor will make the follicles at
the roots of your hair tingle.

They have various restaurants
scattered over the place, each

distinct and characteristic In Its

atmosphere, and in Its food. You
look at the crowds that come out
to be fed and wonder where all

the people come from.

Knotts, from the
THESE down, have in-

dulged a hobby. Their hobby Is

and has been the In
so far as It has been possible
within their means to do so, oi
the romantic past of
California.

They have assembled and set

up a ghost town of the early min-

ing days, complete down to the
saloons and the Jail and even tc

the bawdy house that was an In-

evitable part of the rough life of

that day with a wax figure blond
peeping from an upper window
and a red lantern hanging from

, the porch. AU these recreations
arc historically authentic.

At the other end of the moral

scale, they have a simple and Im-

pressive little chapel, beside a

lovely little lake, In which by the

legerdemain of modern lighting
tho transfiguration of Jesus is

realistically before your
eves. On the wav West, the orig
inal Knott and his family were

caught on a waterless desert,
drove all night and during the

night stood off an Indian attack.

They have made a diorama of this
and It is a real work of art.

Your hair stands on end when,
ugaln by the magic of modern
lighting, the redskins leap to the
uttui-k-

(his Is free. If you wish,
ALL, can wander and look all
afternoon and never dig for the
folding monry once. Here and
I here are museum-piec- old mu-

sic boxes, and if you are so moved
you ran drop in a nickel and listen

.to their tinkling medolies. But
that Is between you and your
God. There Is no urge to do so.

They make their money out of
their eating houses and their
stores where the product of the
farm are sold. The rest Is bac-
kgroundand you sent thai Its
t reat Ion has been as much labor
of love iu sluewd .

It la iviUuily wotlh wui,

the late 80's.
been appointed postmistress of
the station previously known
mind for a name for her new

waters of the North Umpqua
through the rocky channel and

tuneful efforts of her young

Roseburg and what was then
the Lon Smith property. Mail

pack horses a distance of 25
first postmaster. A post office
Creek, with J. J. Thornton as

post office was established
with Mrs. Matilda Blakely as

present DeBernardi farm, and
river to the Livingston place.
Little River, being located on
of Buckhorn creek, with Miss

North Umpqua district were
for their mail.

Peel of Arkansas, a personal
schoolmate of Mr. Engels

the Stacy place, site of the
Mrs. Minor Applegate own

posi oiuce w to.
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few ivenia.
ft AO Naw

father, A. A. Engels.
Service by way of packhorse was maintained weekly 'for

a number of months, then was stepped up to twice weekly,
ind finully advanced to alternate days.

The Glide poRt office was established April 3, 1890, in the
Alexander grove, near the spot where the John Casebecr
home now is located. Mrs. Laird, who named the station,
was first postmistress. Later the office was moved to the

present site, near which the North Umpqua and Little River
merge; the only known place where two rivers meet head-o- n,

a fact featured in Ripley's Believe-It-Or-N- ot column.

Other postmasters at Glide have been John Thomason,
John Wright, Clifford Lilly, John Alexander and Anna
Alexander. Agnes Moore, granddaughter of Mrs. Matilda

Blakely and a niece of Mrs. Alexander, is serving as post-

mistress nt present.
Interesting data concerning tw.o past offices in the north-r- n

part of the county comes from Mrs. Fred Lee of Von-all- a,

following her interview with Mrs. Bertha Stock, a

laughter of the late Mrs. Laura Applegate.
Mrs. Leo identifies Calvert post office in Scotts Valley.

)riginally known as Stacy and located on the E. J. Stacy
ilace. about a mile northwest of Scotts Valley schoolhouse,

t; ,1

toy.
Tractor, with Riding Attachment, 9" plow, and
two power take-off- s . . . delivered in CCQC
Roseburg ........................... 9 lv O

GREEN'S GARDEN TRACTOR
SALES & SERVICE

520 N. Jackson St. Roseburg, Oregon

he office was moved to the John Applegate place, with Mrs.

Uura Applegate as postmistress. Mrs. Applegato desired

office, because it was locatedo name the station Kelly post
n the original R. M. Kelly donation land claim; but due to

he fact ihiki thcro were other post offices of the same or

iimilar names in the state, the title was rejected, and the
name Calvert was substituted. Origin of the name is obscure,

jut Calvert is believed to have been a family name. A son

horn to Mr. and Mrs. Fred Applegate was named Calvert.

RIDINC ATTACHMENT

.1

i

i

SPECIAL

The Applegate property adjoined the land claim of the Scott

family from whom the valley derived its name. The Scotts

Valley schoolhouse is on the Scott Donation land claim, and

;he Calvert post office was located one mile north of the
and four miles east of Yoncalla.

BE SURE TO HEAR ! !

Joseph S. Pitts, Evangelist
Ex Chaplain

FEBRUARY 24 TO MARCH 9

t the
'

ROSEBURG

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE
400 E. Douglas

Rev. Pitts was a chaplain with the forces of General
McArthur from Australia to Tokyo. Several tiroes he
saw action which included the bombing of two ships
of his convoy by enemy suicide plans. He has many
unusual accounts to weave into his vivid- -

Gospel mes-- ,
sages.

Cissy Spent
Honeymoon

Mr. and Mrs. Lee now own

first post office, and Mr. and

the Kelly place where Uaiveri

KRNR
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and except for occasional visits to
the Garden Tavern for a flise of
beet, they stayed at home, getting
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