

Mrs. S. Cleverger, Former Roseburg Teacher, Passes

Mrs. Sarah Wimberly Cleverger, member of a Douglas county pioneer family and an early day school teacher of Roseburg, died Thursday, Feb. 6, at her home at Grants Pass following a heart attack. The daughter of the late Mr. and Mrs. Enoch Wimberly, she was born on the family donation claim at Glade 86 years ago. She was graduated from Wilbur academy and from Oregon College of Education at Monmouth. She moved from Roseburg to Grants Pass with her husband in 1898.

Mrs. Cleverger was a past state president of the Rebekah Lodge and was one of the first presidents of the Grants Pass Women's Club. She is survived by her husband, a retired utility plant manager, and a brother and sister, Elmer Wimberly, a former Roseburg printer, and Mrs. Elva Bywater, both residents of Los Angeles. Other survivors include three nephews living in Roseburg—Circuit Judge Carl E. Wimberly, Postmaster L. L. Wimberly and Glenn W. Wimberly.

The funeral will be held in Grants Pass tomorrow, with services at the Presbyterian Church, of which Mrs. Cleverger was a member.

Births Announced at Mercy Hospital

Marriage Licenses

MOORE - BERGER — Glenn Francis Moore, Roseburg, and Phyllis Elaine Berger, Dillard.

TAYLOR-VLECK — Kenneth F. Taylor and Lillian Marie Vleck, both of Idley Park.

DAVIS-DAVIS — Raymond E. Davis and Zelma E. Davis, both of Canyonville.

TURNER-SANDERS — Thomas E. Turner, Roseburg, and Joy Louise Sanders, Camas Valley.

BELLIN-SHUTROM — Kenneth Mark Bellin and Norma Virginia Shutrom, both of Myrtle Creek.

BRANDON-SUMMERS — Arthur E. Brandon and Phyllis A. Summers, both of Reedsport.

PADIGAN-DULLIN — Edward Arthur Padigan and Ann Dullin, both of Roseburg.

MORGANTI-CROSON — Durward LeRoy Morganti and Ellen Winifred Croson, both of Eugene.

MELVIN-SHRUM — Herbert G. Melvin and Shirley W. Shrum, both of Glade.

Divorce Complaints

WALLACE — Ada L. vs. Earl F. Wallace; married at Roseburg, Jan. 6, 1947; cruelty.

MILL — Eva May vs. Francis M. Hill; married at Vancouver, Wash., June 3, 1945; desertion.

LOOMIS — Merle vs. Darlene Beverly Loomis; married Oct. 5, 1946, at Sutherlin; cruelty.

PATTERSON — Cloy by Mabel Patterson, his guardian ad litem. Two Virginia Lee Patterson, defendant divorced from Roy E. Hoover, Jr. at Medford, April 29, 1946; allegedly to avoid Oregon laws regarding remarriage, plaintiff and defendant married at Reno, Nov. 1 Oct. 22, 1946; annulment asked.

JONES — Irene vs. Oral Jones; married at Vancouver, Wash., May 1, 1943; cruelty.

Vets Hospital Admits 104 Patients During January

One hundred and four patients were admitted to the Roseburg Veterans Hospital during January. Dr. George Melvin, hospital manager, reported today. Those transferred, discharged, and processed numbered 96.

Feb. 1 there were 219 service connected cases and 406 non-service connected cases, for a total of 616 patients in the hospital.

Of the patients registered, 175 were veterans of World War I; 372, of World War II, and 69, veterans of other wars and campaigns.

Justice Courts Fines Levied on Violators

Several fines were reported imposed for drunkenness or traffic violations, action of the Peace Court reported yesterday. They included:

Claude Allen Boswell, drunkenness on highway, \$100; John T. Anderson, drunkenness on highway, \$25; F. H. Fleckenstein, passing with view obstructed, \$25 bail.

MANY NEVER SUSPECT CAUSE OF BACKACHES

This Old Treatment Often Brings Happy Relief

Many sufferers relieve nagging backaches quickly, once they discover that the real cause of their trouble may be bad posture. The kidneys are Nature's chief way of taking the excess acids and waste out of the blood. They help maintain posture by keeping the body's balance. When disorder of kidney function permits poisonous matter to remain in your blood, it may cause rheumatism, backaches, aching joints, loss of sleep, loss of energy, getting up nights, swelling, puffiness under the eyes, headache and general tiredness. These are signs of kidney trouble. When you have these signs, there is something wrong with your kidneys or bladder. Do it right! Ask your doctor for Doan's Pills, a stimulant diuretic, used successfully for millions for over 50 years. Doan's gives happy relief and will help the 15 million who suffer from kidney trouble. Doan's Pills are made by Doan's Medicine Co., St. Louis, Mo.

Notice of Timber Sale

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until and opened at 10:30 A. M., Pacific Standard Time, March 11, 1947, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described, each bid must state the amount per M. ft. B. M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in less than \$5,000.00 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. In Douglas County: T. 22 S., R. 9 W., Sec. 7, 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW1 and NE1SW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2500 M. ft. Douglas Fir, 215 M. ft. White Fir, 85 M. ft. Incense Cedar, 10 M. ft. Hemlock. No bid for less than \$8.25 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$4.20 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, Incense Cedar, and Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$21,927.00, will be considered. All Douglas Fir trees 26 ins. and less DBHOB are reserved from cutting. No trees are to be rigged in the NE1SW1, T. 22 S., R. 9 W., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NW1 and NE1SW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1435 M. ft. Douglas Fir, 180 M. ft. White Fir, 30 M. ft. Incense Cedar, 15 M. ft. Western Red Cedar, 5 M. ft. Hemlock. No bid for less than \$8.25 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$4.20 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, Incense Cedar, and Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$12,733.00, will be considered. T. 22 S., R. 9 W., Sec. 23, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the NW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1480 M. ft. Douglas Fir, 65 M. ft. Western Red Cedar, 25 M. ft. White Fir, 35 M. ft. Hemlock. No bid for less than \$7.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$4.20 per M. ft. B. M. for the Western Red Cedar, White Fir, and Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$10,745.00, will be considered. An area of approx. 38 acres lying south and east of a blazed and posted line in east portion of the NW1 is reserved, including blazed line trees, T. 24 S., R. 9 W., Sec. 23, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE1NE1, EISEINEL, NEISEL, and Lot 1 (SEISEL), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2400 M. ft. Douglas Fir, 170 M. ft. White Fir, 30 M. ft. Hemlock, 45 M. ft. Incense Cedar, 20 M. ft. Western Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$5.55 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$4.20 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, Hemlock, Incense Cedar, and Western Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$14,433.00, will be considered. The entire WISEINEL is reserved from cutting. T. 20 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 19, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 1 (NW1NW1), Lot 2 (SW1NW1), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2085 M. ft. Douglas Fir, 30 M. ft. White Fir, 30 M. ft. Incense Cedar, 35 M. ft. Hemlock. No bid for less than \$4.35 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$10.30 per M. ft. B. M. for the stamper Sugar Pine, \$7.35 per M. ft. B. M. for the stamper Ponderosa Pine, \$4.20 per M. ft. B. M. for the Incense Cedar and White Fir, or a total purchase price of \$10,175.50, will be considered. T. 30 S., R. 4 W., Sec. 27, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the WISEINEL.

NW1, and S1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 7975 M. ft. Douglas Fir, 410 M. ft. Incense Cedar, 35 M. ft. White Fir, 50 M. ft. Western Red Cedar, 5 M. ft. Hemlock. No bid for less than \$4.90 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$4.20 per M. ft. B. M. for the Incense Cedar, White Fir, Western Red Cedar, and Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$41,177.50, will be considered. T. 30 S., R. 9 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 1 (NW1NE1), S1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2070 M. ft. Douglas Fir, 35 M. ft. White Fir, 5 M. ft. Incense Cedar, 15 M. ft. Hemlock. No bid for less than \$5.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$4.20 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, Incense Cedar, and Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$10,581.00, will be considered. All live Port Orford Cedar trees are reserved from cutting. The SEINE1 to be logged by use of caterpillar-type tractor equipment unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative ability to produce immediate lumber for the Emergency Veterans Housing program and to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874). In order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 31st day of January, 1947. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration.

LEGAL NOTICE

SUMMONS
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
Eugene M. Townsend and Christine Townsend, Husband and Wife, Plaintiffs.
vs.
Mildred M. Elkins and Fred E. Elkins, Husband and Wife, Defendants.
The undersigned, Matthew F. Dawson, Attorney for Plaintiff, do hereby certify that the following described real property belonging to the defendant, Mildred M. Elkins and Fred E. Elkins, is situated in the County of Douglas, State of Oregon, to-wit: The North half of the Southwest quarter of Section 20, Township 20 North, Range 9 West of Willamette Meridian, Douglas County, Oregon. The defendant, Mildred M. Elkins and Fred E. Elkins, are hereby notified to appear in the above entitled court and cause on or before a date to be fixed by the first publication of this summons, which is the time fixed by the court for you to appear and answer said complaint, and if you fail to do so, the plaintiff will apply to the court for the relief demanded therein, a summary statement of which is attached to this summons. For a decree that the South 1/2 of the Northwest 1/4 of Section 21, Township 20 North, Range 9 West of Willamette Meridian, Douglas County, Oregon, be sold in the manner provided by law, and the proceeds thereof be applied to the costs of this suit and \$100.00, as reasonable attorney's fees, and that the balance thereof be divided between plaintiffs and defendants herein according to their respective interests therein. This summons is served upon you by publication in the Roseburg News-Review, a newspaper published in Roseburg, Oregon, made and entered on the 20th day of January, 1947. Date of first publication, Friday, the 15th day of February, 1947. GEORGE JONES, Attorney for Plaintiff, Roseburg, Oregon.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
Notice is hereby given that the undersigned, executor has filed in the County Court of the State of Oregon for Douglas County, his Final Account in settlement of said Estate and has been allowed and approved by the court. Dated this 11th day of March, 1947, at 10:00 o'clock A. M. in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, has been fixed as the time and place for hearing objections to any claim against said Estate and for the settlement thereof. FLEARNOR HOLSTAD, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of J. O. Watson, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of S. Augusta Woodward, also known as Sarah Augusta Woodward, deceased, are hereby notified to present the same to the undersigned at his office at 315 Pacific Bldg., Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. IRA B. RIDDLE, Executor of the Estate of S. Augusta Woodward, deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Geo. F. Jones, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated this 7th day of February, 1947. C. B. CARLINS, Executor of the Estate of Geo. F. Jones, deceased.

NOTICE
The County Court will pay \$500.00 Reward for information leading to the arrest and conviction of any person caught dumping rubbish or destroying signs along County Roads.

LEGAL NOTICE
SUMMONS
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
CLARENCE G. HINES and LETA D. HINES, Husband and Wife, Plaintiffs.
vs.
ANDREW WALKER, the Unknown Heirs of Andrew Walker, if deceased, also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein, Defendants.
To Andrew Walker, if deceased, also, all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the Complaint herein, Defendants.
IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON, you are hereby notified to appear and answer the complaint filed against you in the above entitled court and cause on or before the expiration of four (4) weeks from the date of the first publication of this summons, if you fail to appear and answer, the plaintiff will apply to the court for the relief demanded in his complaint, to-wit: For a partition of that certain real property described in the Complaint herein, to-wit: Lot four (4) and the East half of the Southwest quarter (E1/2 SW1/4) of the Southeast quarter (SE1/4) of the Township twenty-seven (27) South of Range four (4) West of the Willamette Meridian in Douglas County, Oregon.
And judgment against the defendants for the sum of \$350.00 as attorneys fees for the prosecution of this suit and for all expenses of referees, surveyors and assistants, and for costs and disbursements incurred herein, said for and to be paid by the defendants, and a lien in the several shares of the parties entitled to share in the lands described in the Complaint to their respective interests therein, and to each other and further relief as to the court may seem equitable and just.
This summons is published by order of the Honorable Carl E. Wimberly, Judge of the above entitled court, made and entered on the 27th day of January, 1947, directing publication of this summons twice each week for four (4) successive weeks in the News-Review, a newspaper published in Roseburg, Oregon, in Douglas County, Oregon. Date of first publication, January 31, 1947. Date of last publication, February 22, 1947. ALBERT W. GENTNER, Attorney for Plaintiff, Roseburg, Oregon.

NOTICE OF GUARDIAN'S SALE OF REAL ESTATE
NOTICE is hereby given that under and pursuant to an order of the County Court of the State of Oregon for Douglas County made and entered of record in the County Court of Douglas County, the person and estate of George McGovern, an incompetent person, under the guardianship of the Court, to sell the real property hereinafter described:

THEREFORE, I, the undersigned guardian, will, at the law office of Orcutt & Long, in Roseburg, Oregon, on or after the 11th day of March, 1947, offer for sale said property at public auction, to-wit: subject to confirmation by the court, the following described real property belonging to the said incompetent person, to-wit:

The North half of the Southwest quarter of Section 20, Township 20 North, Range 9 West of Willamette Meridian, Douglas County, Oregon.

ANDREW WALKER, Guardian of the Person and Estate of George McGovern, an incompetent person, under the guardianship of the Court.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN: That the undersigned by Order of the County Court of the State of Oregon for Douglas County, and this Summons are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated January 10, 1947. MATTHEW F. DAWSON, Administrator of the Estate of Frank Buxton, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Elizabeth (Betty) Jane Haley, deceased, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated January 10, 1947. JONATHAN S. HALEY, Administrator of the Estate of Elizabeth (Betty) Jane Haley, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Louis L. Balle, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated this 21st day of January, 1947. W. H. RUZZELLA, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Louis L. Balle, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Ida May Van Buren, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Orcutt & Long in Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, within six months from the 24th day of January, 1947. VIVIAN GRAVES, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Ida May Van Buren, Deceased.

LEGAL NOTICE
SUMMONS
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
WARREN BARNES, CLARENCE BARNES and LENA BARNES, Plaintiffs.
vs.
REN BARNES and DOROTHY BARNES, his wife, EARL BARNES, and JANE DOE BARNES, their wife, ROBERT BARNES, and any persons unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the property which is the subject of this suit, Defendants.
To Clarence Barnes and Lena Barnes, his wife, Ren Barnes and Dorothy Barnes, his wife, Earl Barnes and Robert Barnes, and any persons unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the property which is the subject of this suit, Defendants.
IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON, you are hereby notified to appear and answer the complaint filed against you in the above entitled court and cause on or before the expiration of four (4) weeks from the date of the first publication of this summons, if you fail to appear and answer, the plaintiff will apply to the court for the relief demanded in his complaint, to-wit: For a partition of that certain real property described in the Complaint herein, to-wit: Lot four (4) and the East half of the Southwest quarter (E1/2 SW1/4) of the Southeast quarter (SE1/4) of the Township twenty-seven (27) South of Range four (4) West of the Willamette Meridian in Douglas County, Oregon.
And judgment against the defendants for the sum of \$350.00 as attorneys fees for the prosecution of this suit and for all expenses of referees, surveyors and assistants, and for costs and disbursements incurred herein, said for and to be paid by the defendants, and a lien in the several shares of the parties entitled to share in the lands described in the Complaint to their respective interests therein, and to each other and further relief as to the court may seem equitable and just.
This summons is published by order of the Honorable Carl E. Wimberly, Judge of the above entitled court, made and entered on the 27th day of January, 1947, directing publication of this summons twice each week for four (4) successive weeks in the News-Review, a newspaper published in Roseburg, Oregon, in Douglas County, Oregon. Date of first publication, January 31, 1947. Date of last publication, February 22, 1947. ALBERT W. GENTNER, Attorney for Plaintiff, Roseburg, Oregon.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Elizabeth (Betty) Jane Haley, deceased, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated January 10, 1947. MATTHEW F. DAWSON, Administrator of the Estate of Frank Buxton, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Louis L. Balle, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated this 21st day of January, 1947. W. H. RUZZELLA, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Louis L. Balle, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Ida May Van Buren, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Orcutt & Long in Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, within six months from the 24th day of January, 1947. VIVIAN GRAVES, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Ida May Van Buren, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Elizabeth (Betty) Jane Haley, deceased, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated January 10, 1947. MATTHEW F. DAWSON, Administrator of the Estate of Frank Buxton, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Louis L. Balle, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated this 21st day of January, 1947. W. H. RUZZELLA, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Louis L. Balle, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Ida May Van Buren, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Orcutt & Long in Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, within six months from the 24th day of January, 1947. VIVIAN GRAVES, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Ida May Van Buren, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Elizabeth (Betty) Jane Haley, deceased, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated January 10, 1947. MATTHEW F. DAWSON, Administrator of the Estate of Frank Buxton, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Louis L. Balle, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated this 21st day of January, 1947. W. H. RUZZELLA, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Louis L. Balle, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Ida May Van Buren, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Orcutt & Long in Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, within six months from the 24th day of January, 1947. VIVIAN GRAVES, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Ida May Van Buren, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Elizabeth (Betty) Jane Haley, deceased, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated January 10, 1947. MATTHEW F. DAWSON, Administrator of the Estate of Frank Buxton, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Louis L. Balle, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated this 21st day of January, 1947. W. H. RUZZELLA, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Louis L. Balle, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Ida May Van Buren, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Orcutt & Long in Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, within six months from the 24th day of January, 1947. VIVIAN GRAVES, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Ida May Van Buren, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Elizabeth (Betty) Jane Haley, deceased, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated January 10, 1947. MATTHEW F. DAWSON, Administrator of the Estate of Frank Buxton, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Louis L. Balle, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated this 21st day of January, 1947. W. H. RUZZELLA, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Louis L. Balle, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Ida May Van Buren, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Orcutt & Long in Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, within six months from the 24th day of January, 1947. VIVIAN GRAVES, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Ida May Van Buren, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Elizabeth (Betty) Jane Haley, deceased, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated January 10, 1947. MATTHEW F. DAWSON, Administrator of the Estate of Frank Buxton, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Louis L. Balle, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated this 21st day of January, 1947. W. H. RUZZELLA, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Louis L. Balle, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Ida May Van Buren, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Orcutt & Long in Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, within six months from the 24th day of January, 1947. VIVIAN GRAVES, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Ida May Van Buren, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Elizabeth (Betty) Jane Haley, deceased, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated January 10, 1947. MATTHEW F. DAWSON, Administrator of the Estate of Frank Buxton, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Louis L. Balle, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated this 21st day of January, 1947. W. H. RUZZELLA, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Louis L. Balle, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Ida May Van Buren, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Orcutt & Long in Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, within six months from the 24th day of January, 1947. VIVIAN GRAVES, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Ida May Van Buren, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Elizabeth (Betty) Jane Haley, deceased, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated January 10, 1947. MATTHEW F. DAWSON, Administrator of the Estate of Frank Buxton, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Louis L. Balle, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated this 21st day of January, 1947. W. H. RUZZELLA, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Louis L. Balle, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Ida May Van Buren, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Orcutt & Long in Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, within six months from the 24th day of January, 1947. VIVIAN GRAVES, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Ida May Van Buren, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Elizabeth (Betty) Jane Haley, deceased, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated January 10, 1947. MATTHEW F. DAWSON, Administrator of the Estate of Frank Buxton, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Louis L. Balle, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated this 21st day of January, 1947. W. H. RUZZELLA, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Louis L. Balle, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Ida May Van Buren, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Orcutt & Long in Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, within six months from the 24th day of January, 1947. VIVIAN GRAVES, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Ida May Van Buren, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Elizabeth (Betty) Jane Haley, deceased, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated January 10, 1947. MATTHEW F. DAWSON, Administrator of the Estate of Frank Buxton, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Louis L. Balle, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated this 21st day of January, 1947. W. H. RUZZELLA, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Louis L. Balle, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Ida May Van Buren, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Orcutt & Long in Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, within six months from the 24th day of January, 1947. VIVIAN GRAVES, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Ida May Van Buren, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of Elizabeth (Betty) Jane Haley, deceased, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the office of Paul E. Geddis, Attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date of this notice. Dated January 10, 1947. MATTHEW F. DAWSON, Administrator of the Estate of Frank Buxton, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the estate of