

Absent-Minded

METZ, France, Dec. 20. (AP)—Pierre Studzmann, a 55-year-old Alsatian who was conscripted in the German army in 1915, married a German woman and lived with her until 1936. Then he left Germany.

After World War II, Studzmann married a second time, this time a Frenchwoman, with whom he apparently was quite happy until wife No. 1 lodged a complaint from Germany.

"Between you and me," Studzmann told the judge, "my first wife was never very attentive."

"Between you and me," the judge told Studzmann, "you should have thought of that before giving her 10 children."

Disposition of the case was postponed.

Notice of Timber Sale

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 G. and A. Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until and opened at 10:30 A. M., Pacific Standard Time, January 7, 1947, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B. M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$5,000.00 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above, IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 22 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1435 M. feet Douglas fir, 180 M. feet White Fir, 30 M. feet Incense Cedar, 15 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 5 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$5.85 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$3.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, Incense Cedar, Western Red Cedar and Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$9,847.75, will be considered. T. 23 S., R. 4 W., Sec. 15, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 310 M. feet Douglas Fir, 25 M. feet Incense Cedar, 5 M. feet Western Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$6.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$3.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Incense Cedar and Western Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$5,350.00, will be considered. The SE1/4 of the subdivision is to be logged with caterpillar-type tractor equipment unless otherwise authorized by the officer in charge of the sale. T. 23 S., R. 6 W., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the E1/4NW1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 340 M. feet Douglas Fir. No

bid for less than \$4.00 per M. ft. B. M., or a total purchase price of \$1,360.00, will be considered. The sale area comprises approx. 23 acres lying east of the trail running north and south through the E1/4NW1/4. The balance of the area is reserved. T. 25 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 31, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the N1/4NE1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 770 M. feet Douglas Fir, 15 M. feet Western Red Cedar and Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$1,767.25, will be considered. Of Pine, only those trees stamped USOC are to be cut. The area is to be logged with caterpillar-type tractor equipment unless otherwise authorized by the officer in charge of the sale. T. 30 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE1/4 and Lot 4 (SW1/4SW1/4), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1065 M. feet Douglas Fir, 45 M. feet Incense Cedar, 10 M. feet White Fir, 5 M. feet stamped Ponderosa Pine, 435 M. feet stamped Sugar Pine. No bid for less than \$3.70 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$3.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Incense Cedar and White Fir, \$3.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the stamped Ponderosa Pine, \$10.35 per M. ft. B. M. for the stamped Sugar Pine, or a total purchase price of \$8,649.25, will be considered. Of Pine only those trees stamped USOC are to be cut. The area is to be logged with caterpillar-type tractor equipment unless otherwise authorized by the officer in charge of the sale. T. 30 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S1/4SW1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1280 M. feet Douglas Fir, 40 M. feet White Fir, 35 M. feet Incense Cedar, 80 M. feet stamped Sugar Pine. No bid for less than \$4.55 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$3.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir and Incense Cedar, \$11.65 per M. ft. B. M. for the stamped Sugar Pine, or a total purchase price of \$17,041.00, will be considered. All timber cut from the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative ability to produce immediately lumber for the Emergency Veterans Housing program and to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 13th day of December 1946. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration.

LEGAL NOTICE

NOTICE TO CREDITORS: Notice is hereby given that the undersigned has been appointed as administrator of the estate of Marion Perdue, deceased, by the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said estate are notified to present them in the undersigned's office at the law office of Ray B. Compton, U. S. Nat. Bank Bldg., Roseburg, Oregon, duly verified within six months from the date of this notice. Dated this 29th day of November, 1946.

AMANDA WIDRIG, Administrator of the Estate of Marion Perdue, Deceased.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT: The Administrator of the estate of ROSE WATSON, deceased, hereby gives notice that the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, has entered its final order of settlement on January 11, 1947, at 10 o'clock in the forenoon as the time, and the County Court Room in the Court House at Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, as the place for hearing objections, if any, there be, to said final account and for the settlement thereof.

FRANK E. KOPPE, Executor of the Estate of ROSE WATSON, Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS: Notice is hereby given that the undersigned has been appointed as administrator of the estate of Albert E. Neff, deceased, by the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon. All persons having claims against said estate are notified to present them in the undersigned's office at the law office of Ray B. Compton, U. S. Nat. Bank Bldg., Roseburg, Oregon, duly verified within six months from the date of this notice. Dated this 29th day of November, 1946.

JOHN M. THORNE, Administrator of the Estate of Albert E. Neff, Deceased.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT: Notice is hereby given that the final account of the undersigned administrator has been filed in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, and by order of said court Monday, the 6th day of January, 1947, at 10 o'clock A. M. in the County Court Room in the Court House at Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, has been fixed as the time and place for hearing objections, if any there be, to said final account and for the settlement thereof.

FRANK E. KOPPE, Executor of the Estate of W. A. Koepke, Deceased.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT: Notice is hereby given that the final account of the undersigned administrator has been filed in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, and by order of said court Monday, the 6th day of January, 1947, at 10 o'clock A. M. in the County Court Room in the Court House at Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, has been fixed as the time and place for hearing objections, if any there be, to said final account and for the settlement thereof.

FRANK E. KOPPE, Executor of the Estate of W. A. Koepke, Deceased.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT: Notice is hereby given that the final account of the undersigned administrator has been filed in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, and by order of said court Monday, the 6th day of January, 1947, at 10 o'clock A. M. in the County Court Room in the Court House at Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, has been fixed as the time and place for hearing objections, if any there be, to said final account and for the settlement thereof.

FRANK E. KOPPE, Executor of the Estate of W. A. Koepke, Deceased.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT: Notice is hereby given that the final account of the undersigned administrator has been filed in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, and by order of said court Monday, the 6th day of January, 1947, at 10 o'clock A. M. in the County Court Room in the Court House at Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, has been fixed as the time and place for hearing objections, if any there be, to said final account and for the settlement thereof.

FRANK E. KOPPE, Executor of the Estate of W. A. Koepke, Deceased.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT: Notice is hereby given that the final account of the undersigned administrator has been filed in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, and by order of said court Monday, the 6th day of January, 1947, at 10 o'clock A. M. in the County Court Room in the Court House at Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, has been fixed as the time and place for hearing objections, if any there be, to said final account and for the settlement thereof.

FRANK E. KOPPE, Executor of the Estate of W. A. Koepke, Deceased.

LEGAL NOTICE

STATE OF OREGON FOR THE COUNTY OF DOUGLAS
JAMES S. PARDEE, Plaintiff,
vs.
JANET ESTELLE BARRETT, Defendant.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

LEGAL NOTICE

STATE OF OREGON FOR THE COUNTY OF DOUGLAS
JAMES S. PARDEE, Plaintiff,
vs.
JANET ESTELLE BARRETT, Defendant.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

LEGAL NOTICE

STATE OF OREGON FOR THE COUNTY OF DOUGLAS
JAMES S. PARDEE, Plaintiff,
vs.
JANET ESTELLE BARRETT, Defendant.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

LEGAL NOTICE

STATE OF OREGON FOR THE COUNTY OF DOUGLAS
JAMES S. PARDEE, Plaintiff,
vs.
JANET ESTELLE BARRETT, Defendant.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

LEGAL NOTICE

STATE OF OREGON FOR THE COUNTY OF DOUGLAS
JAMES S. PARDEE, Plaintiff,
vs.
JANET ESTELLE BARRETT, Defendant.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
No. 1946
VIOLA FOSTER, Plaintiff,
vs.
WINFORD W. BEIDEN and JANE DOE BEIDEN, Defendants.

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF