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By CHARLES V. STANTON '

The Oregon State Fish Commission will go before the next
session of the legislature with a bill to give the commission
authority fd regulate reasons and gear and to control the
catch on all species 6f food fish other than trout and steel-head- s.

The proposal has resulted in a great deal of discussion HEALTH CENTER
Physical Therapy

Swedish and Nerve Massage

HOWARD R. MARTIN

throughout the state arid has aroused some opposition.
The fact that opposition comes from all sides indicates

that the bill has considerable merit. Hearings have been held
with spbrtsmen's groups, commercial fishermen, packers arid
legislators. Each affected group feels that the commission
should be given powers over other groups but opposes regu-
lation of its own activities.

welcome restrictions upon coni- - New Office Addrei

Phono 858--

Sportsmen, for instance,
mefcial fishing and packing.
angling out of the picture so they could have all the fish but
oppose any grant of authority which might cut down their
take. Commercial fishermen,
a livelihood, want more restrictions on sports angling and
insist upon escapement sufficient td preserve their jobs for
the future. Consequently each group is endeavoring to avoid
regulation for itself, while desiring" restrictions upon others.

If has been our pleasure to

BARTON SLANE says!
"You're a Stranger Here But Once . .

of hit OAKLAND TAVERN

On Highway 99 in Oakland, Oregon

Hours 10 A. M. 12 P.M.

Open Week Days, Holidays and Sundays
Cases io Go Out

ings as a representative of the sports angling faction. We
have found the Fish Commission quite cooperative in ad
justing its bill to meet desires of sports groups.

As originally proposed, the
mission unlimited authority. It would have made it possible
to reopen the Rogue River and all other closed waters and
would have abrogated completely the seasons established in
Bill 312, adopted at the last election.

We do not believe the commission had any expectation of
getting such powers,- but, naturally, in Opening argument,
started with a proposal for unlimited authority, hoping to
salvage as much as possible.

Sports fishermen insisted
of waters rtow closed to commercial fishing, nor extension
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shall have the effect of permitting the use of any gear or
equipment now prohibited by law or of authorizing com
mercial fishing in any stream,
cial fishing is now prohibited

Sportsmen also secured inclusion of stcelhead as protected
fish, although some program
for disposal of Steolhend taken
cial season.

The bill, as it now stands,
sports angling for salmon from
Fish Commission.

For those who may not understand our commission set-up- , IT'S OOT HIM I
TBCCAUSE AND IT'S I

VAtA I
UK.WO VP LIMi SiQUI DatBr

EVf.PV "tMC WIS KID

S HP5:SV5 A HE CAN THINK OP- -J
it should be explained that Oregon has two commissions, one

regulating game, which includes game fish, the other a fish
commjusjon which regulates commercial fishing. Sports

all merchantable timber designat-
ed for cutting on the WlSWf and
Lot S (SEJSWi), estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be 2585
M. reel Douglas Fir, 105 M. feet
White Fir, 40 M. feet Incense
Cedar, 5 M. feet Western Hem-
lock, 30 M. feet Western Red
Cedar. 1650 Lineal feet Western
Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less
than $5.70 per M. ft B.M. for the
Douglas Fir. $3.00 Der M. ft B.M.
for the White Fir, incense Oedar,
Western Hemlock and Western
Red Cedar, $0,025 per Lineal ft.
Western Red Cedar Poles, or a
total purchase price 6f $15,315.75,
will be considered. In Lot 3
(SEISW1), all DoUKias Fir trees
less than 22 ins. DBHOB are re
served from Cutting. Lot 3 Is to
De logged oy use of .caterpillar-typ- e

tractor equipment unless
oinerwise authorized by the offi
cer in charge of the sale. T. 22

n. w., aec. z4, all merchant-
able timber designated for cut-
ting on a portion of the NiSEi
and all of the SJSEl, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
5530 M. feet Douglas Fir, 20 M.
feet Hemlock, 10 M. feet Western
Red Cedar, 140 M. feet White Fir,No bid for less than $5.20 perM. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir,
$3.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Hemlock, Western Red Cedar and
White Fir, or a total purchase
price of $29,266.00, will be con-
sidered. An area of approxi-
mately 2.00 acres lying east of
a blazed line in east side of NE1-SE1- ;

an area of approximately5.00 acres bounded by a blazed
lipe in north side of NESSEJ; an
area of approximately 8.50 acres
lying north and west of blazed
line in northwest Corner Of NW1-SE1- ;

and an area of approximate-
ly 1.50 acres surrounded by a
blazed line in east side of NWJ-SEJ- ,

are reserved from cutting,
including blazed line trees. Thearea is to be loeced hv
caterpillar-typ- e tractor equipment unless otherwise authorized
by the officer in chare m tho
sale. All timber cut from the
above described areas must be
manufactured in the local market-
ing area designated by the O. and
C. Administration unless other
wise authorized by the Chief
Forester. In Case of two or more
luuinicai DIOS inr the nmo tim.
ber, the successful bidder win w

selected on the basis of compara- -

iivc auiuiy iu DrOOUeP ITHITW.
diately lumber for the Emergency

nuusmg program andto further the objectives of the
Act of August 28, 1937. The
right is hereby reserved tn
technical defects in this adver
tisement; to refect all bids, or n
award the timber for the amount
oi me nignest Did to other thanthe highest bidder when neces
sary, pursuant to the Act of
August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), In
order to provide a continued
supply of timber to local indus-
try so as to assure the perma-nence Of the communltv wdieh in

dependent upon such industry.
LWtcd at Portland, Oregon, the
26th day of November, 1946. W
H. Horning, Chief Forester, io'

C. Administration. ! .

National Forest timber for Sale
Sealed bids will he meeiw.,1 hv

thfl C.n n .

ujivisur, noseourg
Oregon, up to and not later than2:00 P. M., December 23, 1946, for
all the live timber marked or,
designated for cutting, and all
merchantable dead timber lo--'
cated on an area embracingabout fifty acres within NJ of
NEJ, Section 30, T. 33 S., R. 5
W., W.M., Umpqua National For-'- .
est, Oregon, estimated to be'
947,000 feet B.M., more or less,
Of Douglas-fir- . 2.000 feet BM
more or less, or white fir. 60,000
feet B.M., more or less, of sugar
pine, 3 000 feet B.M., more or
less, Of California incense-ceda-

saw timber. No bid of less than
$4.00 per M feet for Douglas-fir- ,

$1.70 per M feet for white fir,
$4.00 per M feet for western
white pine, $1.00 oer M feet for
ponderosa pine, S9.70 per M feet
for sugar pine. $2.20 per M feet
for California Incense-cedar- , and
other species will be considered.
In addition to the prices bid for
stumpage, a cooperative deposit
ui 9u.ou per m icei to.M., io cover
the cost of tree planting, seed
sowing and timber stand Im
provement work on the area cut
,fl Ik. . ... ..I . . . ,iui uir uiiai vu ui umoer
under the terms of the agree-
ment, will he required. $2,000.00
must accompany each bid. to be
applied on the purchase price, re-
funded, or retained in nart as
liquidated damages, according to
ine ronauions or sate. 1 ne riTjntto reject any and all bids Is

Before bids are submit-
ted, full information concerningthe timber, the conditions of sale
and the submission of bids should
be obtained from the Forest
Ranger, Tiller, Oregon, or the
Forest Supervisor, Roseburg,
Oregon.
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The Weather
U. i. Weather Bureau 6fflt

Roseburfl. Oreoon.
Forecast for Roseburg and vi

cinity: Light rain tonight and
Saturday.
Highett teniO. for any Dee. 70
Lowest tenia, fof any Deo. ....
Highett temp, yesterday .. 55
Lowest temp, last night 49
Precipitation yesterday 14
Precipitation from Dee. 1 38
Deflelt from Dee. 1 1.(8
Emm from Sept. 1 . .38

1.1 the Day's Hews

By FftANK JENKINS

ffli Coal strike was called oft
We don't know WHY it was

called Off, for Lewis hain't told
us and only Lewis knows why
he did what he did. For that mat
ter, we don't know why the strike
was called hi the first place.
Only Lewis' knew why, and he
kept silent as to his" reasons.

Both the Calling of the strike
and the calling off of the strike
were ONE-MA- decisions.

e

NYWAY, the coal strike Is oft
f The trains are running again.
The lights are shining again in
the cities. Factories that had ex
pectcd to be closed down are op-

erating. People who had expected
to be out of work are working.
Families' that had looked forward
shuddcringly to living In cold
houses now have the assurance
of staying warm. Wealth (which
consists of things) Is again being
created instead ot being de
stroyed

Because of what has happened,
everyone's outlook is Immeasur-
ably brighter.

brighter outlook is
rtlg dramatically in the be-

havior of the stock market.
The ending of the strike came

late Saturday, after the ex-

change had cloned at noon. The
market opened Monday morning
on 1 nolo of high hope. More
people wanted to buy than want-

ed to sell. The ticker tape soon
ten behind.

fn .the Upswing, which Is
in th dispatches as One

of the fastest of the past several
months, g.iins ran from one to
three or more points. This buying
splurge lasted until along to-

ward noon before It began to
level off.

Even tlien, It only leveled off.
Buyers remained In a hopeful
mood, and there wa no tall
spirt," as so often ha been the
case In recent months.

did the end of the coal
WHY so greatly encourage
Investors? The answeif Is quite
simple. It Indicated that there is
now a possibility that people can
again1 work and earn.

Only by working and earning
can Wealth be created. Only by
the creation of wealth, tn the
form of things, can standards of
llvin ho raised.

AKTER ALL
The only way to get the things

we all want Is to work for them
and earn them. They CANT be
created by the waving of wands.
Out of the travail of Industrial
unrest and dispute, we are slow
ly framing that baic lesson.

To that extent, we are making
progress.

can only speculate at to whyWEJohrt L. Lewis called the coal
strike off. Similarly, we can Only
speculate as to why he called it
ON In the first place.

It eeetris to this wrKer that a
Lewis must have reached the
point that has been reached by so
many Other men who have gath erered Into their own single pair of
hands TOO MUCH POWER.

ALEXANDER reached that
point when along the eastern

shores of the Mediterranean he
had destroyed the armies of Pers-

ia-. By drtng so. he had made
not only his Kingdom of Maee-donh- f

but all of Greece safe. He
could then have gone home and
told afl the Greeks to go fo work
at the pleasant tasks of peace,
fre from the menace of grasping
PerstmY power.

But he didn't. He was dazzled
by the power he held In hla own
ld hands. This instrument of
unshackled personal power was
so fascfnaihig that he simply tj
couldn't resist the temptation to us:
use It. So ne" went on and tried to
tonqutr the uoild. .He faiK-d- .

The 1947 Oregon Legislature
will be asked to enact laws estab-
lishing county veterans' service
officers on a statewide basis, with
the contles and the state, through
its Department of Veterans' Af-

fairs, sharing the costs of opera-
tion, according to a resolution
adopted- by the Association of
Oregon Counties at Its 41st an--

nual convention this week In
Portland.

The request followed an appeal
by Director George E. Sandy of
the nenartmnnt rif VntAran,' At
fairs to the assembled county
Judges and commissioners,
emphasizing the need for more
county veterans' service officers
to aid in the rehabilitation of
Oregon's returned servicemen.

Sandy told the group that the
18 counties now employing this
personnel were "being more than
repaid" In money returned to the
communities lor compensation,
pensions, insurance and other
benefits obtained for veterans,
but he said all counties should
nave sucn service through person-
nel trained on a uniform Dlan.

The resolution asks the Depart-
ment of Veterans' Affairs to
establish facilities fof training the

ivire omcers, ana proposes
inai me uirecior or veterans
niairs appoint persons recom
mended oy local veterans' organi-zations and the county courts.

The present law, passed by the
itj merely empow-ers county courts at their own
discretion to appoint veterans'
service officers. Amendment of
this law is essential, according to
the county officials' resolution, to
provide personnel in each county
"(1.. hnro tha..... w.nnl.ilnR .

vjiumiiuii wailttlllS,to assure the "readjustment of
uur wona war u veterans to
community life."

Fincham Promoted
Promotion of J. M. (Jack)Fincham to position of managerof the Roseburg branch office,was announced today by the In-

terstate Tractor and Equipment
Company. Mr. Fincham Joined
the sales staff of the Roseburgstore two years ago, followingrelease from military service. He
had previous experience with sev-
eral equipment firms a,nd in
Caterpillar's engineering research
department.

Mr. and Mrs. Fincham reside
at 803 S. Main St.

Double Role
HOLLYWOOD, Calif., DeC. 13.

P Within 24 hours, the stork
made Mrs. Eihel Wadler, 37, both
a mother and a grandmother.Just 23 J hours before Mrs.
Wadler's seven pund daughterwas born, another daughter, Mrs.
Edith Hood, 18, became the
mother of a daughter, also welch-
ing seven pounds.

During World War II flax cul
ture in northern Ireland expand-ed to 125.000 acres, four to six
times prewar averages.

Notice of Timber Sale
Sealed bids, marked outside

Bid for Timber." and addressed
to the Chief Forester. O. and C.
Administration, 901 Guardian
Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will
be received until and opened at
10:30 A. M.. Pacific Standard
nme, January 7, 1947 for the pur-
chase of timber upon tracts here
inafter described; each bid must
state the amount per M. feet B.M.,
which will be offered for each
species and the total considera-
tion which will be paid for the
timber. No bid for less than the
appraised value will be consider-
ed. Each bid must be submitted
In duplicate and be accompanied
by a deposit In the form of a
certified check in favor of the
ireasurer ot the United States
ine deposit of any successful
owner win he credited on the con
tract. I'ayment In full at the
time of filing the contract is re-
quired In sales amounting to
$2,500.00 or less. For copies of
tne lorm or proposal, form of
contract and bond, terms of pay-
ment, amount of deposit required
won um, amoum oi oona requiredwith contract and other Informa-
tion, application should be made
to the address shown above. IN
iwi ui.AS oiu.MY: T. 20 S.. R
6 W., Sec. 35, all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
the NF.iNE'., the NElNWt and
the SWJN'Wl, estimated for the
purpose oi tnis sale to be 33fO M.
teet Douclas Kir. 45 M. feet Hem-
iock. 3MM. feet Western Red
Cedar. No hid for less than Sfi.10
per ni. n. h..m. tor the Iiouglas
Fir, $300 per M. ft. B.M. for the
nemiocK ana western Red Cedar,or a total purchase pii of
$20,415.30, will be considered. The
area Is to bo logged bv use of
caterpillar-typ- tractor equlp- -
nu-i- uiim-s- oinerwise authorized
by the officer tn charge of the

SHORT ROUTE

EAST
amiuym

.$10.20
Soft Lottt City 17.30
Chicago 40.(5

Plus Tax
Ml 111 tin minium

HAVIt
f RAILWAYS
119 N. Stephens Phone 353

Rcsekurf. Ore.

ngling now is regulated by
all types of Commercial fishing
the Fish Commission.

Sportsmen fear that transfer
Game Commission to the Fish
way for commercial interests to
It has been proposed to the SPECIALIZED BRAKE SERVICE
that a further revision be made to the bill to provide that
any rules or regulations pertaining to sports angling for
salmon shall be jointly promulgated by the two commissions.

208 W. Douglas Street

Roseburo;

wo w 'aouLoea riohi

BRAKE (UPPLY
IS THS BEST PLAce

FOR OePFUtUM.
AND ECtLueNT SEBVICE

fssirosii
y fvfoaNKs4oa sashtfa

wjom finiih

MS. fttt iabBts

Phone 26

Packers would gladly kick

who depend upon fishing for

sit in on several of these hear

bill would have given the com

there should be neither opening

restrictions on gear. The com

proposal to provide that no
be" promulgated which

water or area where commer
by law."

must be worked out to provide
in nets during legal commer

would transfer supervision of
the Game Commission to the

the Game Commission, while
come under supervision of

of sports angling from the
Commission ould 6pen the
impose punitive regulations.

Fish Commission, therefore,

Monday, views of all groups

increased regulatory powers

and gear within limitations

proposal before giving the

opponents m the pnst two
months, it will be his first meet-
ing with the veteran Achlu, and
the Chinese grappler may cause
Sammy no end of trouble.

When sinned for the bout, Co-
hen said that he has had experi-
ence against Jin Jitsu before and
is confident he can handle Achlu.
The former Dayton University
backfleld star Is the master of
the miR'h feared Oriental mat
style and local ringhirds seem
certain Cohen la due for a su-
rpriseand tney're probably right.

Althouch the match should be
a scientific affair. If and when
Achlu uses , which Is In-

evitable, the bout may turn Into
Donnybrook.
The attrartlve program is ex-

pected to draw another big
rrowd-espeeinl- ly those who like
their wrestling "according to
the hook."

Elton Owen will referee the en-
tire program, starting promptlyat 8:30 P. M.

Special Season Kill of
Oregon Deer Reported

PORTLAND". Dee. tV-Th- rce

hundivd ninety three deer
were bagced by hunters in the
Dnvils tiardrn sjireial season held
from Nov. 30 to Dec. 4 in North-
ern fjike Coun.y, the State
Cnme Commission repotted

It was the last of a number of
special seasons in the stat- - de-
signed to control specific prob-
lems. The commission reported
that where local deer were the
problem, the seasons were held
early, while where migrants were
causing trouble the season was
later.

The total kill In all seven sne- -

rial seasons was SIJ deer, rh
state's total deer herd is esti-
mated at 2(10,1X10.

The people of Cl.hia have been
drmkinj tea for at lent 1,600

At a hearing in Portland last
were aired in an open discussion. It was unanimously agreed
that there can be no constructive program of fish manage
ment of conservation without
for the Fish Commission.

The commission has announced that it will revise its prd- -

posal to include suggestions offered by various groups, while

retaining powers over seasons
now provided by law. Tho various affected groups are now
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awaiting" copies of the revised
bill their endorsement.

Cohen-Actii- u Bout

Promises Fans

Batch of Thrills
The Roschurg Armorv will be

the scene .Saturday night of one
of the mnst outstanding profes-
sional wrestling shows In local
hlsfnry-.tw- n one hour matches
that are expected to give toug-la- s

county mat addicts the best ill
the sport.

Carrying the most weight In
the double main event will he a a
clash between two stellar scien-
tific matmen- - Frankie Hart from
Canada' Hilly fjoelz from Tonnes-see- .

To the winner, according to
Matchmaker Don Owen, will go

Pacific Coast light heavyweight
championship match againstSammy Cohen.

Cohen the well-buil- t New York
who Is willing to risk his cov-

eted crown against all comers,
will be one of the principals In
the other headllner. He meets
the famed JIu ltsu artist, Wal-
ter Achlu. In a skirmish that mav
pack more color and more wal-
lop than the nre tltle flit.

I The New York Jewish bov is
roNt only e rucged wrestler and
nas ansorocd all Kinds ol punishment from the villains of the
m.it. but he possesses a finished
technique that has dumped most

OVeecc failed with him.
Napoleon faced that same mo

ment. Hitler faced It. SO MANY
Men, holding In their hands too
rrtuch power, have faced It.

UJE should St least face this les
son that history has taught

TOO MUCH POWER IN ONE
SET OF HANDS IS ALWAYS
DANGEKOVS.
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