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THE WAGE SEESAW

BaeaaeasaeM ts
dressed torn, runnerup In dressed
division sweepstakes, grand
champion and reserve hen in live
division, live division sweepstakes
and reserve champion live torn.

Wheeler Pearson Turkey Hatch-
ery of McMinnville, Ore., won
second in the old hen class.

New Cub Pack

Will Be Headed

By Ben D. Irving
E) CsQ )'

nn o

Winners at Washington
Turkey Shew Announced

SUNNYSIDE, Wash;, Dec. 6.

() The Washington Cooperative
Chicken Association of Belling-ha-

and Kenneth Smith, Sunny-side- ,

grower, today held major
honors in the eighth rjinual
Washington turkey show.

The Bellingham Association
captured irizes for reserve cham-
pion dressed torn, grand and re-
serve champion dressed hen,
dressed division sweepstakes, live
division runnerup sweepstakes
and grand champion live torn.

Smith had grand champion

By CHARLES V. STANTON

Looking; over a counter filled with Christmas toys, we
observed a cute little device in the form of a metal teeter,
As the toy Wad placed in operation, the teeter, bearing its
two srriitll fjzures, climbed a rack to the top of the stand. If
not pushed too far it would work its way back to the bottom,
but if sent to the top it crashed off the uprights and fell with
a thud.

We could not help comparing the action of tin's toy with
the current wage-pric- e seesaw our nation is experiencing in
these troublesome days.

Organized labor bases demands for increased wages upon
the mounting cost of living. Better wage scales are negotiated
to put labor on the high end of the teeter. Then, because of
new wages, prices climb and labor is on the low end. Thus
the seesaw continues up and Up.

Eventually there must be a gradual decline, controlled and

Tonight is tops In listening . . . Remember Veteran's Informa-
tion Guide at 7:00 . .. a public service feature of which we are Justly
proud. Magic Melodies of the Islands . . . Fifteen minutes of music
from the land of the palm tree and hula makes its bow on the air to-

night at 7:15.
a a a

Let George Do It, 8:00 o'clock tonight, comes across a
tough customer when a wealthy man who was supposed to
have died In a highway accident turns up with a Job for
George. By the way . . . this Is an audience show, so if you'd
like to see as well as hear it, and If you're going to bo in
Hollywood, let us know, and we'll be happy to get ticket for
you.

a a a

"Henry Martin" the musical tale of a voune Scot who became a

NOTICE
Wa ara again operating on regular schadula

giving weekly service.
For regular pick-u- p and delivery of

LAUNDRY AND DRY CLEANING
Phone 88

NEW SERVICE LAUNDRY

scarfarer by mere chance, heads
irom o;ou to o:o. oooo listening aplenty In this fifteen minutes.

a

. If the street decorations don't give you that bid Christ-
mas feeling, then there Just ain't no Santa Claus so far as
you're concerned.

orderly, or, as the only other course, we reach the point in
wild inflation where the seesaw goes off the top, and the
whole thing comes tumbling down with a mighty crash.

With the little red toy on the Christmas counter our finger
furnished the motive power. There also is an impelling force

One of the foremost
Is Winston Churchill who

possesses every type of civilian
and military headpiece from ev-

ery country he has visited. His
military collection covers three
wars and a fifty-yea- r porlod.

JLmmmrtimmml

I sit ...Ay Joe MarsR,

How to

Stop Worrying
hour" after dinner, and gets his
worrying over in one concentrated
period. When that's over, he relaxes
ever a friendly glass of beer with
Ma Hoskins and they talk about
pleasant things together, until bed-

time.
From where I sit, that's as work-

able a formula as you could find . . .
right down to the mellow glass of
beer that seems to wink away your
worries.

Rom wherebehind the wave of strikes and wage demands. Is this force
the natural outgrowth of the period of high wages brought
about by the war, or is a sinister hand deliberately rocking
our economic structure for the
us to disaster?

Certainly labor leadership
evitability of inflation under
man cannot evade realization
venting full productivity, does
full earning capacity.

It is obvious thnt the workingman would be served best
if he were permitted uninterrupted work at comparatively

I fatt folks in oar town do about
as much worrying as in yoora evtr
housing; sad prices, and crops, and
Jobs snd the little domestic prob-
lems that are alwsjs coming up.

Dsd Roskins, who's lived to the
happy age of eighty, has a simple
formula for stopping worry. About
every problem, lie asks himself: Is
there anything I can do about it?
If there is, he never postpones
making a decision, or taking neces-

sary action.

If there lent anything he can do
about it, he sets aside a "worrying

high wnges now prevailing throughout most industries, thus,
by c rent big an abundance of consumer goods, forcing down
the cost, of living ant' bringing
of the law of supply and demand.

BUt what is the outlook?.
If Lewis and his coal miners obtain wage increases for

which they are Becking, oilier labor leaders, not to be out-

done, must also obtain more money for their workers, or
face discontent and ouster from their positions of leader Copnrimht. 194f. IfmtrJ States Brewers Foundation

ship. So we may as well prepare for a continuing wave of
strikes until or Unless public opinion decides that the seesaW
has gone High enough and forces a halt in the upward prog
ress through legislation. If that
suffer loss of many of its important and desirable gains.

Roseburg Welding Works
and .

Machine Shop
If a sinister force Is directing the economic seesaw, solu

tion to the problem may be more difficult.
The guiding principle of communism Is to create chaos and Court and Main

confusion, while dividing opposition forces and building up
disturbance to a point where the communistic minority may
seize control. If the communistic finger is the power behind
the teeter-totte- r it will not Stop until it has brought about
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"Forecast for Roeeburo and vi

cinity: Occasional light rain
and Saturday.

Highest tamp, for any Dee. .... 70
Lewost temp, for any Deo.
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i.jwest temp, laet night 40
Precipitation yesterday
Precipitation from. Deo. 1 1

Deficit from Deo. 1 78
ftoes from Sept. 1 1.26

In the Day's Hews

lcontinued Iroux page 1)

p&wer development. Only In Scot
land is water power feasible oil
fairly large scale.

England, once the coal bin of
Europe, is still unable to produce
enough power for her own uses.
This shortage is due to no lack of
coal in the ground. The known
supply still unmlned is enough
to last for another couple of hun
dred years.

The scarcity is due to the un-

willingness of men to go down In
to the bowels of the earth to dig
coal.

a

BRITAIN'S need for coal is

O much more acute than ours,
for there COAL IS MONEY as
well as a vital, raw material. It
must be understood that in Inter
national trade printing press
money has little or no value. Brit
ain can now import only what
the can TRADE something for.
Coal has .always . been prime
swapping stock in Britain.

Paper is a good example. We
newspaper people In America
think we have a paper shortage.
We worry about It day and night.
It upsets all our plans for the fu
lure, But, compared to British
glibllshers, we have no paper
problem at all.

J The great metropolitan papers
)K England, with circulations run- -

rgng Into the millions and adver
tisers clamoring for space with
fhlch to their war-

lent markets, are seldom larger
than four .pages. They simply

n t get the paper.
Yet Sweden, one of the world's

treat paper producers, is only a
ffiort boat haul from British
ports and Sweden is piled mountai-

n-high with accumulated pulp
vrood waiting to be made Into pa
lir. It can't be made into pa pel
because of LACK OK COAL for
power. The Swedes are now
burning a part of their pulp wood
ia order to get power with which
tft convert the rest Into paper.
a They would be delighted .to

trade paper for coal, but. the
British can't mine enough coal to
rfrat , their homes and provide
enough power for their own es-

sential home uses.

used to be a catchy
3'HEnE about Turkey being the

of Europe. At the pres-
ent moment, coal Is the Sick Man
of the World.
; We have read In the past few

days that coal is even scarce In
Russia scarce because the Rus-
sian miners can't be Induced to
l(iine enough to go around.

a

COMPTON'S statement thatOR.
by 1955 atomic power may be

a serious competitor of ronl Isn't
a new one. The British are now
dYflriltcly planning to bo operat-
ing the bulk of their Industry
with atomic power within at least
rr-- years.

That Isn't very far off.

Sen. Bilbo Nits Back at
Discrimination Charges
; JACKSON. Miss., Deo. 6. l.n

Sen. Theodore G. Bilbo
told senators Investigating

his Mississippi primary campaign
Hint if he was "censured, con
demned and deprived of my seat
In the senate because of his
Negro voting views, even' Missis-
sippi official elected in 36 years
should he so Ireilril.

The flamboyant Mississippi
ariuitor. lashing bark at alk'ga-tion- s

that his stump siiwIh's had
led to violence, I ri t iun and
disfranchisement of No!iws, said
he had legal grounds (or Ins con-
tention they were Ineligible to
Vote In Drmocratio primarli-s- .

He died a Mississippi statute
requiring a participant in a pri-

mary to nave been In accord with
(lie principles of the party fr
the preceding two yean and add-
ed:

j "It has been the general under-
standing for jo years that the
U'grix In . Mississippi, or pi ae-
ries II v all of them, have heen

fflllated with the Heputlkan

the impending crash.
As we stood watching the

Ben D. Irving will be cuhmas- -

ter of Pack 308, organized last
night at the First Baptist Church
of Roseburg, It was announced
today by pavid J. McCarrol,
director of organization and ex-
tension for the Douglas District
of tne Buy bcouts or America.

Other leaders of the new pack
will include Keith Mobley as
assistant cubmaster; Harry E.
Wilson, chairman, and John W.
Rouse, William Snyder, . and
Harry G. Howe, members of the
pack committee. Den mothers
will be Mrs. Thomas Bowen and
Mrs. William Gamble.

McCarroll also announced plans
for the organization of new Cub
pack at Green in the near future.

In a Cub leaders' meeting held
last night, Cubmaster Harle Kel-lc-

Pack 304, reported a gain In
membership of ZI boy since
September 1. His pack now in
cludes more than 60 boys.

A new Scout troop has been
organized at Riddle with a mem-
bership of 20 boys. The trooD
is sponsoreo. oy me ttiuclle
Grange. Jim Calhoun Is scout-
master and Fred Vedder assistant
scoutmaster.

A district court of honor will
be held in Roseburg, January .27,
and a district meeting January
30, at which Dwight Ramsay, of
the national headquarters of the
Boy Scouts, will be a speaker.

Douglas Winners
In FFA Contest
On Swine Listed

Benjamin Irving of Wilbur
took third place and a $10 prize
In the annual pig litter contest
sponsored by the Oregon Bankers
Association for the Future Farm-
ers of America. Benjamin enter-
ed a litter of nine Durocs in the
sow class.

There were 12 entries from
the Roseburg FFA chapter, all of
which v cre ol pure-bre- swine.
This was the largest entry of any
chapter In the state, according to
Homer Grow, director of the
chapter.

Other prize winners
'

from
Roseburg In the sow class lnclud'
ed Gordon Hughes, Garden Val-
ley, In ninth place with a litter
of 10 Hampshire?, $5 award; and
Charley Melton, Roseburg, Duroc,
fifteenth place.

In the gilt class, John Roedcr
of Umpqua was in second place
with his Duroc litter of seven,
$15 award. Charles Bailey, South
Deer Creek, was In tenth place
wun a uuroc uuer, j award.

Others entered in the contest '

were Dick Stritzke S t a n I e v
Brent. Ted Schattonkerk and Ta
Roy Sigfridson. Next year the
local chapter will have more
than 20 entries in the contest.

Wood Processing
Plant Projected
At Everett, Wash

SEATTLE. Dec Con
struction of a plant capable of
processing more than 1,000,000
ooara loot ot uimner a month
against fire, rot and insects is
filanned in Everett by the

& Treating Com-Dan-

J. F. I.lmhieum. firm pres-
ident, announced today from Chi
cago.

The plant, which company of
ficials In Washington said would-
dc in limited production by Jan- -

uaiy, win cover seven acres ad-
jacent to the Weyerhaeuser Tim-
ber Company's Everett mill.
Chemical processing will he done
for that company and others in
the Northwest Industry. Linthi-cu-

said. Full production is ex-

pected to be reached by earlysummer.
Lint hicum. said two huge steel

vacuum-pressur- treating cylin-
ders, each capable of handling
approximately two carloads of
limber at one time, will be in-
stalled.

The comjiany already has three
West Coast plants two in Cali-
fornia and one at VVauna, Ore.

"Expansion of facilities to con-
serve wood by chemical treat-
ment Is a major part of the lum-
ber Industry's eflort to protect
and develop the timber crop,"
Linthicum declared.

Sen. Ball Aims At

Closed Shop 'Evil'
NEW YORK. Doc. 6.- - i.Ti - Son.

Joseph H. Ball said
yesterday he would press In the
next congress for the outlawing
of the "closed shoo evil" and for
prohibiting Jurisdictional strikes.

In a speech at the session of
the National Assolcatlon ot Manu-
facturers' annual congress of
American Industry, the senator
said nationwide shutdowns in
coal. oil. steel, transportation or
communication were Intolerable.

Hut he warned against anv at-
tempt to rush In with ha.sty legis-
lation and advocated "an lnu:n-siv-

study" of the problem by the
new congress in January.New laoor legislation. Ball
said should restrict the govern-
ment's right to intervene in

disunion.
"We cannot have free collective

bargaining." the senator said, "if
the federal or stHte government
is goln" to butt in a. iv time it
foci like It. or any time one of
the Iwo parties believes that it
can gain some advinlage by such
Intervention "

The senator told the industrial
leaders, however, tliat the new la-
bor laws must not leave any
'.oooholos for cry emplavcrs o
hiduitd to go ou th; Uud vl

toy and forming comparisons with current problems, we
obeserved a mother very vigorously slap the hands of her
small son who followed the bad example we had set in play

Lethe, Sheper end Planer Work

of All Kinds

MILL WORK A SPECIALTY

We have some Carriage Blocks, Knees, and

Made Up. Have 60-l- Reilt in Stock.

COME IN AND SEE US WE CAN SUPPLY YOUR NEEDS

AND DO YOUR WORK TO YOUR SPECIFICATIONS

ing with the toys put upon display.

balladier Burl Ives show tonight

KRNR
Mutual BroadcMllng ftysUm

1490 Kilocycle

BtMADflNQ BODES TODAT
4:00 rultn Xcwli, Jr., Bn Hur

Product!.
415 Bex Millfr. Nitional Blfoutt Co.

n Johnson. Vick Chemical
Co.

4:45 Buck Hoffer 25th Century.General Poodi.
t Five. J. A. Poller.5:13 Superman, KeUofg't.

5;3 Captain Midnight. Wander Co.
S45 Tom Mix. Rale ton Purina.
S HeasUr. HcalUuUU.

Musical Interlude.
6:25 State and Local Newt. RotwburgMotor Co.
6;3o Evening Melodies. Joe Richards.
6:43 Son f for Everybody, Roseburg

Refrigeration.
T:0O Veterans' Information Guide.
7:13 Hawaiian Music, Valley RalEstate Agency.The Cisco Kid. Modern Furniture.
5 S?-- kk Geor' Do t. Standard OIL

30 Burl Ives. Philco Corp.
a:45 Sons of the Pioneers. Lock wood

Motors.
0O Alka Seltzer TtVwt, Mile Labs.

O 15 Rex Miller. SAW rtne Foods.
9 30 Hi Neighbor. Cars ten s Furniture.

Henry J. Taylor. Goners Motors.
10:00 Fulton Lewis. Jr., Roseburg

Pharmacy.
10:15 Behind the .World News, Earl

Henry.
10:30 Nocturne. 1

10; 30 Ten Thirty Club. Lawson'i
Jewelry.

11:00 Sign Off.

SATURDAY. DEC. T. 10M
00 Farm Bulletin Board.

o wn r'atroi.
:45 Treasury Salute.

7:0O Frank Hemingwav. J. A. Felger.7.15 Rise and Shine. Sterling Drug Co.
7:30 State and Local News. Boring

Optical.
7:35 -- The Beehive.
7:10 Rhapsody In Wax.
8:00 Haven of Rest. Crew of Good

Ship Grace.
8:3-0- Waiiy's Wake Up Time, Welly's

Grocery. .
45 The Homemakcr's Club,ftoo Hal Mclntvre.

9:15 Morning Melodies.
9 30Te lephone Requeftt, Miller's Inc.

10:00 Alka Seltser News, Miles Labs.
10:13 Novelty Ares.
10:30 Bob Crosby.
10:41 r.y Ustenln'.
11:00 Music.

l ton Checkerboard Jamboree,Ralston Purina.
12 00 Musical Interlude.
12 03 Sports Review.
12:15 Rhythm at Random.
12:40 Sute and Local News. Hansen

Motors.
12:45 National News. Douglas CountyState Bank. .
12:55 Terminal Market Reports. SlgPett.
1:00 Man on the Street. Hennlnger'sMarts.
1:15 Sentimental Serenade.
1:30 The Westerners, Roseburg Grange

Supply.
Sports Parade.

2 30 Vour Dog Goes to College.2.45 Talk by Lewis E. Star.
3 00 Scramby Amhy.J 30 Hill Show.
4:00 Hawaii Calls.
4 30 This Week in Washington.4:45 Sports Session.
5:00 Jlemingway at Five.- L. A. Soap.
5:15 Proof That Christian Selene Heal.

Christian Science Church.
5:30 Around the County, International

News.
5 45 Voice of the Army.
8 00 Author M eta the Critic.

:30 Meet the Press.
7:00 State and Local News, RoseburgMotor Co.
7:03 Musical Interlude
7 I.v Hire s to Veterans,
7 ?0 Red Ryder.oo Love Story Theater.
8:.TO Juvenile Jury
900 Alka Seltrer News, Miles Labs.
0 13 Duke Ellington.923 Behind the World News, Ander-

son Brace.
:30 Wrestling Matchas, RoseburgOutdoor Store.

Club, Lawsoa
Jewelers.

11:00 Sign Off.

Ing area designated by the O. and
C. Administration unless other
wise authorized by the Chief
Forester. In case of two or more
identical bids for the same tim.
ber, the successful bidder will bo
selected on the basis of compara-
tive ability to produce imme
diately lumber for the Emergency
veterans Mousing program ana
to further the ohH-ctiv- of the
Act of August 2. 1937. The
right ts hereby reserved to waive
technical defects in this adver-
tisement; to reject all bids, or to
award the timber for the amount
of the highest bid to other than
the highest bidder when neces-
sary, pursuant to the Act of
August 28, 1D37 ( 50 Stat. 874), in
order to provide a cor.tinued
supply of timber to local Indus-
try so as to assure .the perma--
nence 01 inc commun iv wnien is
dependent upon such Industry.
Uated at Portland. Oregon, the
26th day of November, 194ft. W.
H. Horning. Chief Forester. O.
& C. Administration.

Tired Kidneys
Often Bring

Sleepless Nights
ftf Unrtutoaor Aitre whlchlwlp Li'p jrifrtha'mrv mom KmlOir. WW. tWy Mlirvd and mnn'l worfc right In tbt sarUaM." Moal. mmn Una, aiaaU. rwvmrnl
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union-bustin- campaigns we had
after the first World War."

Epidemic danger from malaria
In the United States is remote. A
combination of Anopheles mos-
quitoes and active infections
would be required and only dur
ing an untreated relapse could a
patient transmit the disease (an
ordinary mosquito cannot spread
majaria.

Notice of Timber Sale
Sealed bids, marked outside

"Bid for Timber," and addressed
to the Chief Forester, O. and C.
Administration, 901 Guardian
Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will
be received .until and opened at
10:30 A. M., Pacific Standard
Time. January 7. 1947 for the Dur- -

chase of timber upon tracts here- -

inaner aescrinea; each Did must
state the amount per M. feet B.M.,
which will be offered for each
species and the total considera
tion which will be paid for the
ttmoer. No bid for less than the
appraised value will be consider-
ed. Each bid must be submitted
in duplicate and be accompanied
oy a aeposu in tne iorm of a
certified check In favor of the
Treasurer of the United States.
The deposit of any successful
bidder will be credited on the con
tract. Payment in full at the
time of filing the contract is re-

quired in sales amounting to
$2,500.00 or less." For copies of
the form of proposal, form of
contract and bond, terms of pay
ment, amount of dooosit reauired
w!'t1 bid' amunt of bond required
wun contract ana ouier iniormav
lion, application should be made
to tne address shown above. IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 20 S.. R.
6 W., Sec. 35, all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
the NEJNEi, the NE1NW1 and
the SWINWl, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 3305 M.
leet Douglas Fir, 45 M. feet Hem
lock, 50M. feet Western Red
Cedar. No bid for less than $6.10
per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglasnr. sj.uu per m. it.B.M. lor the
Hemlock and Western Red Cedar,
or a total purchase price of
$20,445.50. will be considered. The
area is to be logged by use of
caterpillar-typ- tractor equip-
ment unless otherwise authorized
by the officer in charge of the
saie. j. i k. 6 W., Sec. 25,
all merchantable timber dosicnat.
ed for cutting on the WJSW1 and
Lot 3 (SE1SWJ). estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be 2585
M. teet Douglas Fir, 105 M. feet
White Fir, 40 M. feet Incense
Cedar, 5 M. foot Western Hem-
lock. 30 M. feet Western Red
Cedar, I60O Lineal feet Western
Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less
than $5.70 per M. ft. B.M. for the
uougias 53.00 per M. ft B.M.
for the White Fir, Incense Cedar,
Western Hemlock and Western
Red Cedar, $0,025 per Lineal ft.
Western Red Cedar Poles, or a
total purchase price of $15,315.75.
will be considered. In Lot 3
(SE1SWD, all Douslas Fir trees
less than 22 ins. DBHOB are re-
served from cutting. Lot 3 Is to
be logged by use of caterpillar-typ- e

tractor equipment unless
otherwise authorized by the offi-
cer in eliarge of the sale. T. 22
S.. R. 9 W.. Sec. 24. all merchant-
able timber designated for cut-

ting on a portion of the N1SES
and all of the SISEJ. estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
55.10 M. feet Douglas Fir. 20 M.
feet Hemlock. 10 M. foot Western
Red Cedar. 140 M. teet White Fir.
No bid for less than $5.20 per
M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir.
$3.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Hemlock, Western Red Cedar and
White Fir, or a total purchase
price of $29,266.00, will be con-
sidered. . An area of approxi-
mately- .2 00 acres lying cast of
a blazed Line In east side of NEi-SE1- ;

an area of approximately
5.00 acres bounded by a blazed
line In north side of NE1SE); an
area of approximately HStO acres
lying north and west of biaed
line In northwest corner of NWi-SEI- :

and an area of approximate-
ly 1.30 acres surrounded by a
blazed line in east side of N WI-
SE!, arc reserved from cutting,
including blazed line trees. The
area is to he logged by use of
eaterplllartype tractor equip-
ment unless otherwise authorized
by the ol floor In charge of the
sale. All timber cut from the
above described areas must be
manufactured in the local market- -

du to colds... eased
without "fesinc"

T VAPORVS

express purpose of driving

bust be fully aware of the in
existing practices. The laboring

that continued unrest, pre
not allow him exercise of his

to bear the proven principles

situation develops, labor will

action of that little Christmas

is the answer to our problem.

It Judges economic practice by
the criteria of faith."

"It refuses dictation from
statesmen who think in

terms of power politics and are
unacquainted with the moral
law. The church calls for world
law and order in the name of the
Saviour of Ihe world.'

While a lengthy document, en-
titled "Towards Peace In the Far
East," adopted by the council yes-
terday, staled that continued civil
war in China "contains the t

danger that the United
States and the Soviet Union may
he drawn in on oposite sides,
Bishop Oxnam added:

"The churches have declared
'war with Russia can be avoided,
and mast bo avoided, without
comromise of basic convictions.' "

The council statement asserted,
too, that:

"The Far Eastern settlement
must encourage the most privi-
leged nations to share their
scientific and technical resources
with those loss privileged.
Otherwise, the Trans Pacific area
may become a clangorous l

's u m,' a breeding
ground for crimes against the
peace."

Charles Loomis, Former

Douglas Resident, Dies
Carrie Dixon of Dixonvllle has

received word of the death In San
Diego, Calif.. Nov. 17. of Charles
Loomis, age 6H. Services and In-

terment were held In San Diego.
Mr. Loomis was born In Oregon
and was a student of old Umpqua
Academy at Wilbur. Later with
his brother, John, they oerated a
merchandise store at Newport
for manv vears and also at
Klamath Falls.

Surviving are his wife, the for
mer Mamie Dixon of Roseburg;
four sons and a daughter: a
brother. John l.oomis of Toledo.
Ore,; a nephew. George Loomis,
and a nlooe, Mrs. Qintiey Brown,
both of Roseburg.

SPEECH CLINIC DATED
Sioch clinic for hamlicapocd

children will be hold at the court-
house Monday by l r l.oon I .ass-
ert of the State Department of
Fducation. I; was announced byMrs. Lula C. Gorroll, county
school superintendent. The clinic
will open at 1 p. M. and extend
through Tuesday morning.

HEAT WAVE IN MISSOURI
ST. LOUIS. Iee.

winter "heat wave" hit this
area yesterday. A temperature of
lii i recorded. makiiiB it Ihe
warmest Dec. 5 In 28 years and
the second warriiest In Weather
buuju nutuiy

OPENING SAT., DEC. 7
at

435 N. Jackson

gilkey Trading post
Veteran-Owne- d and Operated

Steeping bag
With waterproof cover and Waterproof carrying bag
40 'c down, 60:r feather filling an excellent Christmas
gift.

Phone 667

GILKEY
Jock,

Maybe that mother's action

Destruction of 34

arking Meters is

to Youths
GRANTS PASS, Dec. B Two
urphy youns men. David Wood.

20, and Hobby Rosco Wood, 1H,

appeared In Justice Court here
Tuesday, charged with "malicious

nd wanton Injury to personal
property" as a result of the do- -

truciion 01 J4 parklne meters
here Sunday morning. The pair
waived preliminary hearing and
were bound over to the grand
ury.

Arrest was rv Carl M. Dallas.
police chief, after a red flat-bo-

truck, seen In the vicinity of the
smashed meters, was found to he
registered to Bobby Wood. Pieces
of glass similar to that Used in
no parking meter heads wore
ound In the truck and a claw
ammer with cart of he one

claw broken was In the truck. A
A piece of stool taken from one ol
the damaged motors filled the
broken elaw.

In a signed statement Tuesday
Bobby Wood stated that the act

destruction was undertaken
because "I don't like parkingmotors." Wood admlted taking

"J.B7 from damaecd meters and
hrnwlng coin boxes from five

motors Into the Rogue River from
Caveman Bridge.

hurch Must Lead
In World Affairs,

Bishop Declares
SEATTLE. Doc. 6. t.V Rare

relations, postwar rooonstnintmi
and recommendation, for a iin'.'od
program on alcohol problems g

major Items on today's
program of the Federal Council
..' I hurohosot Christ In America.
Tonight the biennial mooting will
end with the Installation of
Charles Tafl. Cincinnati attorneyand son of the late former Presi-
dent of the fnlted States, as the
council's first lay president.

Taft. a member of the National
Council of the EiilM-npa- l Church.
succeeds Methodist ltishop ;.

Hromley Oxnam. who told a gen-
eral session last night:

"The chin ch tnui load." "It re
fuses to Identify the Christian
gospel with any social reloi ni or
economic system. It icIiik-- s to
take its economics from the Na-
tional Association of Manutac- -

I4iu U the Leiiunuiiut juity. '

New Casualty, er

SLEEPING BAG

Weight 25 Pounds

New, er

Mountain SLEEPING BAG

COMBAT BOOTS

New Marine Corps Blankets

AIjo Tents, Tarpi end meny ether War Surplus Iter,
Stop in to see

TRADER"
43S N.


