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Notice of Timfjer Sale '
Sealed bids,- marked outside

"Bid for Timber", and addressed

( .

MlNEC f?AL PROBLEMSaJfJ
EtVltW COMPANY, INC.

TURKEY SHOOT
Suniiay,1 Nov. 24fh-iO"- A. lA.

Roseburcf Rod and Gun Club
WINCHESTER.

12, 16, Shalh Furnished

By CHARLES V. STANTON r "an "o O DThe City of Myrtle Creek, being; in the throes, of growing
pains, is facing some tough municipal problems'. It has a
water system suitable for a community, of only about one-Ha- lf

Myrtle Creek's present! population. Its electrical dis-

tribution system is In need of reconstruction. A Targe" amount
6f street arid road' work is essential. ,

Reconstruction of the city's-
-

municipal water system Will
be", one' of.' the first requirement, and Councilman Henry

Our weather eye tells us' that the felloWl sitting around their ra-

dios listening to the Oregon-Orego- State game are going to be the
lucky ones. Anybody want to buy a couple of tickets?. Broadcast
starts'' at 1:45. This Is an game; so don't
miss it. "

Almost any radio program produces Its quota of storles-abou- t

listener reaction, tet deerge Do It had a show a
bo rt time ago In which the script was built around the

housing situation. Result ... a phone call from a conscien-
tious landlady who' wanted to tell George she had an apart-
ment for rent.

bhirtcliff reports that a complete new plant probably will be
necessary.

Myrtle Creek had an excellent water system, adequate for
a population of about 500 people. But Myrtle Creek is' no
longei a town of 500. It is growing1 so rapidly that no one

24-HO-

AMBULANCE SERVICE

LONG & ORR MORTUARY
Formerly Douglas Funeral Home

Phone) 112, Roseburg
Corner Lane and Pine Srs.

"To Serve Others as We Would Be Served"

Let George Do ft goes on
listening for the entire familycan even make a Reasonable'

but a municipal water system
the original will be necessary

Remember, too, that Burl Ives brings' you hi songs t
night at 8:30. This show draws a four-sta- r rating, too.

We're sbrry to say thaf Spotlight Bands bows out tonight .
Blame it on the sugar shortage.

UMPQUA CABINET SHOP
NEW LOCATION

Pacific Hwy. North at Edenbower

Featuring:
Modern Kitchen Cabinets Shelving Window and Door

Frames Custom-bui- lt Store Fixtures and Counters.

PROMPT SERVICE
Phone 137-R--

its installation completed.
From time to time the city has added to its water supply.

In one instance it built a new intake only to have the federal
government come along and install a housing project which
polluted the water and forced1 another move.

Recently the city has been pumping water out of South
Myrtle Creek to supplement its supply, but this source will
not long be adequate.

While plans are going forward1 for a new water system,
with residents wondering where the money is id come from,
reconstruction of the city's entire power system also is tinder
study. Recent growth has rendered obsolete and even dan-

gerous the present system, which is heavily overloaded.
Each meeting of city officials is given over to planning,

but the trouble is that by the tiriie a plan is formulated the
city has surged so far ahead in population growth that the
program is inadequate. The Fjr Manufacturing Company is

rapidly completing its huge plywood plant, which is expected
to be in full production early next year, bringing in perhaps
800 to 1000 more residents.
company has inaugurated an
construction.

Approximately 20 acres of land have been acquired and
priorities secured for 80 homes as the first of several units"

proposed to be constructed. These will be two and three--

HEAR!
Rev.

Wr.i. Dickson

Returned Missionary
From China

Thrilling1 Stories of

War Escapes

Sunday, Nov. 24th

11 A.M. and 7:30 P.M.

bedroom' houses, well constructed and furnished, and will be
sold to employes at actual cost.

Here is' a program which offers exceptional value in main

taining stable employes. Men

good jobs with a large concern
labor, demands. They will take
in schools and in local activities. Thus, by planning housing
projects, the Fir Manufacturing Company is making a most

tonight at 8:00 o'clock it's good

Pit Patrhctt
10:2J Noctu me.
10 30 Ta Thirty Club. Unon'i.
11:00 Sim Off.

SATURDAY. NOV. , 1(40
6:00 rarm Bulletin Board.

:30 Yawn Patrol.
8 5 Treaiury Salute.
7:00 Frank Hemingway, L. A. Soap
T lSHu. and Shine. Sterling-

- Drut Co.
':ov aiai ana lAKai news. nonn

7:10 Rhamody In Wax.
8.O0 Haven of Reel. Good Ship Grace
8:30 Wally'a Wake Up Time. Wally's

Grocery.
8:45 The Homemaker'l Club.
S OO Shorty Sherock Orch.

Mominf elelodlet. .
9 30 Telephone Request. Miller's Inc

10:00 Alka Seltzer News. Hllea Laba.
io:i rreddia Martin orch.
10:30 Dirk iurgen'a Orch.
u 45 EAiy ttntenln.
1100 The Jackie Hill Show.
11:30 Checkerboard Jamboree. Ralston

Purina.
12 00 Musical Interlude.
12:03 II. s. Recap of Sports, U. S. Tin

8tore.
12:13 Rhythm at Random.
12:40 State and Local News. Hansen

Motors.
12:45 National News, Douglas CountyState Bank.
12:33 Terminal Marks! Report, Slgrrett.

1:00 Men on the Street. Henninfer's
Marts.

1:15 The Westerners. Roeeburtf
Granjle supply.1:43 O 8 C. vs. Oregon. Associated
OIL

4:30 Dave Rose Orch,
5:00 Hemingway at Five.
3:15 Proof That Christian Science

Heals. Christian Science Church.
9:30 Around the County, International

News Events.
5:43 The Melody Mountain Boys.
11:00 Author Meets the Critic.
3:30 Mee4 the Press.
7:00 State and Lcal News. Roseburg

Motor Co.
7:05 Musical Interlude.
715 Here's to Veterans.
7:30 Red Ryder.
8:00 Love Story Theater.
8 .to Juvenile Jury,
poo Alka Se liter News. Miles Labs.
0 15 Earl Sheldon Orch.
8:23 Behind the World News, Rye,

Wilson.
30 Leave II to the Girls.

10:OO Joe Relchman.
10 3o Club, Lawson's.
11:00-Si- Off.

AN AMAZING OFFER
Th makors of Or. Porktr
Corn Rtmovaf will givo you
donbla your monty bock if It
fails fo romovo your corn or
callous. Only .15c a Chap-- .
man I Drug Jroro.

rtajMrvatlorsi foe prrvata
SKATING PARTIES

ara avatlabl at th
Rainbow Skatintj Rink

Winchester

LOSEE'S
Baby Togs

Shower 'wyGifts f
337 N. Jackson Phone 534-- J

OIL TO BURN
For prompt courteous merer-i-d

dellvoriM of fciqf) CjualTry
ttev and barncr en

Caff 152

MYERS OIL CO.

Distributors of Hancock
Petroleum Products foe

Oounlas County.

Xn tared aa Mconu cum wimill. .
UtiO. at th put toffive at RuMburg,turnUrtlUP) UHUW MM v Maya as,

"ilswibei of tha AMot uied Preaa. a

Nawapaper PuOlUttar Association,

"R7arN(iUtd bT CO..
INC., ofiicM in Hew Yoi. CWcao, San
rrmncUco, Lot An! 8alUa, Part- -

una, &l iAuu.
tffl

DoOglM put of
Br Mall-- Par Count Coui

Year v 0M B7.UU,
Mix ISoatlu 3.73,
rtiraa JHonthJl r, 1.1

Par by city carrier
Par month, by city carrier-- .

. i The Weather
ill 8. Weather Bureau Office"

Roseburg, Oregon. ,

forecast for Rosaburd and vt
elnlty: Rain tonight and Satur-
day..
Highest temp, for an Nov, 76

for" any Nov. 14

Highest temp, yesterday 53
Loweat temp, laet night 50
Preeipitatlon yesterday ...v 12
Precipitation from Nov. 1 3.15
Ixces. from Nov, V .02
Excess from Sept. T - ..... .60

la the Day's Hews

(Continued trom page li
with . ten thousand men and
marched right down again. And
maybe the other one: "Oh, ihe
walked right In and she turned
around and she walked right out

again."
' The government has talked

tough before:

liOLOTOV rather unexpectedly
ff announces that Russia Is

ready ttf accept a' United States
proposal that ALL members of
united Nations submit complete
figures oh. all troops, both at
home and" abroad. He says Rus-

sia and the U. S. see eye to eye
on that point and are ready to
draft agreements to carry it
through.
Jiump to no conclusions. It is
another move on the cheesboard.
Later moves will make it clearer.

t m . .
voting In Romania'sTHE

heavily favors the s

who ran the election.
', Out state department is pained,

and protests but probably Isn't
slirprised. These elections In commun-

ist-dominated countries" fol-

low a pattern. At many of them;
there Is ONE. ticket Jh the Hold.

The voter IS handed a burtot of
the type we used to call a "slate"
Here In America and told that he
can either drop it in tht? box as
h) or takn It to a viUng booth
and MAKE CHANGES.
J Knowing that the secret police
Ve watching him and keeping

totes, he thinks twice before tip-

ping himself off as anti social.
Oddly enough, the Russians

seem to be sincere In thinking
that this is "democracy.". e.

EMOCRACY, you see, b a word
D'

that has almost as many defi-

nitions as "liberal." tt all depends
on the point of view.-

IGN of the times:$ A Washington dispatch ap- -

jrriscs us that booklets (govern
inent printed) on baby care have
replaced free garden seeds as the
favorite congressional handout.

Constituents by the millions
are writing in for them. To date,
more than 18J MILLION copies
have been distributed.

a few years apA the
ONLY were telling us fhat
because of a' nosediving birth
rate the United States of Amer-

ica was headed swiftly and in-

exorably toward the status of an
old folks' home.

Malthus, a couple of ccnturir,
ago, scared everybody stiff with

prediction that population was

mereaslng so much faster than
food production that the world
was headed for starvation like a
stone rolling down a steep hill.

ills prediction Was followed by
FOOD SURPLUSES that ended
lb ne U. S. fiasco of killing the
pigs and plowing under crops.
, . . .

HE trouble with the predictersT'
(many of them, at least). Is

that they "know so many things
that ain't so."

Warren to Officiate iif

Medferd-Hoo- d Rfvar Tilt
; Paul (Pill) Warren, formerly

a Roseburg High School coach,
was announced by the Oregon
.mate inch School Activities As- -

(.Delation yesterday as selected
referee for the Medford-Hoo-

River seml-flna- l contest for the
Mate football championship
llnmt River todav.

Warren, who left Roseburg

valuable contribution to Myrtle
the" future.

, The problems experienced in

ZSSCJSbm in nearly any other
The names of Reedsport, Glendnle, Sntherlin, Oakland, Rid-

dle, Yoncalla, Drain, eta, could be substituted without

to the Chief r orester, O. and. C.
AdmfnUtT-ntlnn- Qn, nu,t-.-
Building; Portland 4, Oregon, will
ix-- leceivea until and opened at
10:30 A. M., Pacific Standard
Time, December 4, 1946,for the
purchase of timber upon- tracts
hereinafter described; each bid
must state the t amount per M.
feet B.M., which will be offered
for each species and the total
consideration which will bo puld
for the timber. No bid for less
than the appraised value will be
considered. Each bid must be sub-
mitted In duplicate and be accom-
panied by a deposit In the form
of a certified check in favor of
the Treasurer of tht . United
Slates. The deposit of any suc-
cessful bidder will be credited on
the contract. Payment In full at
the time of filing the contract Is

required In sales amounting to
$2,500.00 or less. For copiei of
the form of proposal, form of
contract and bond, terms of pay-
ment, amount of deposit required
with bid, amount of bond re-

quired with contract and other
information, application should
be made to the address shown
above. IN .DOUGLAS COUNTY:
T. 21 S.. R. 6 W Sec. 25, all mer-
chantable timber designated for
cutting on the WSNW1, SZi
NWJ, and NEiSWi, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
330 M. feet Douglas Fir,- 30 M.
feet Hemlock, 7a M. feet White
Fir, 65 M. feet Incense Cedar,
75 M. feet Western Red Cedar,
and 3775 Lineal Feet of Western
Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less
than $5.85 per M.ft.B.M. for the
Douglas Fir, $2.50 per M.ft.B.M.
for the Hemlock, Incense Cedar
and Western Red Cedar, $2.25
per M.ft.B.M. for the White Fir,
and $0,025 per Lin.ft. for the
Western Red Cedar poles, or a
total purchase price of $19,993.13,
will be considered. T. 22 S., R. 9
W., Sec. 25, all merchantable tim-
ber designated for cutting on a
portion of the NEJNWi. all of
WiNWi and SEJNWJ, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
3700 M. feet Douglas Kir. 255 M.
feet Hemlock, 145 M. feet White
Fir, 60 M. feet Western Red
Cedar. No bid for less than $5.80
per M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas fir.
$2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the Hem-
lock, White Fir, and Western Red
Cedar, or a total purchase price
of $22,380.00, will be considered.
An area of approximately 2 acres
lying north and east of a blazed
and posted line in the NEINWt
is reserved from cutting, includ-
ing hlatt'd line trees. An area of
approximately 20.00 acres lying
west of a blazed and posted line
in the NWiNWJ is to be logged
by use of Caterpillar-typ- tractor
equipment. All Douglas fir trors
22 Ins. DHHOB and less are re
served from cutting on the en
tire NWiN'Wl. T. 24 S.. R. 4 W.
Sec. 13, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on the tii
SW1 and SWiSEt, estimated f ti-

the purposo of this sale to he lfe
M- feet Douglas Kir", 100 M. F-- t

White FiCM M.'feet Incnjso'
Cedar, 110 M. fret Wesern Red
Cedar, 20 M. Feet Hemlock. No
bid for less than $5.t0 ner M.ft.
B.M. for the Douglas fir. SJ.50
per M.ft.B.M. for the White
ana incense cenar, sz. id peri.M.
ft B.M. for the Western fjed
Cedar, and $'425 per M.ft.K,M.
for the Hemlock, or a total uur-cha-

price of Sll,2(5fi.50, wlirbc
considered. T. 21 S.. ft. 6 W.. Sec.
7, all merchantable fimU-- r desig-- '
naiea tor cutting on tne NEt and
EiN'Wl, estimated lor the pur-
pose of this sale to he 478j M.
feet Douglas fir. 300 M. feet
White fir. 195 M. feet Incense
Cedar, 135 M. feet Western Red
Cedar, 20 M. feet Hemlock, and
34r0 Lineal feet of Western Red
Cedar Polos. No bid for less than
$4.50 per M.ft.B .M. for the Doug-
las fir, $2.50 per M ft. B.M. for the
White fir, and Incense Cedar,
S2 75 per M.ft B.M for the West-
ern Red Cedar, $2.25 per M.ft
B.M. for the Hemlock, and $0 023
per Lrn.ft. for the Western Red
Cedar l"oles, or a total purchase
price of $23,272.50, will he consid-
ered. The sale area is to he
logged by use of caterpillar-typ- t

traitor equipment unless other-
wise authorized hy the officer In
charge of the sale. T- 29 S.. H. 3
W., Sec. 27, all merchantable
timber designated for cuttlnf on
Lot 3 (NE1NW1), Lot 4 (NW1
NWl). Lot 5 (SWiNWl), and
Lot 6 (SEJNWJ). estimated for
the purpose of this sale to be
2185 M. feet Douglas fir, 80 M.
feet stamped Suij.tr Pine. SO M.
feet White Fir, 213 M. feet In
cense Cednr. No hid for less than
13.55 per M ft. B.M. for the Doug-
las Kir, $8.85 per M ft. B.M. for
the stamped Sugar Pine. $2.50
IOI M.ft.B.M. for the While Kir.
$2 7 i per M.rt.lVM. for the In
cense Ced.tr, or a total purchase
price of S9.2fi3 50. will he consid
ercd. The sale area is to be
logged hy use of caterpillar tvpe
tractor equipment unless other-
wise authorized hy the officer in
charge of the sale. T. 30 S R 2

., Nc. 19. all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
the NEISWI. NW1SE1. and Lot
6 iSWISF.Ji. estimated for the
purpose of this sale to he 2.VVI M.
feet Douglas Kir. M. feet Hem-loo-

70 M. feet White Fir. 70 M.
feet Incense Cedar, 35 M. feet
stamped Sugar Pine. No bid for
less than $.1.95 per M.ft.B.M. for
the Douglas fir, 52. Ml per M ft.
II M. for the Hemlock and While
Fir. $3.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the
Incense Cedar, $7.80 per M.ft.
H M. for the stamped Sugar Pine,
or a total purchase price of $t0,.
880..V). will he considered. Only
those Pine lives stamped l'Scare to be cut. T. 30 S . R. 2 V,
See. 23, ail merchantable timber
designated for cutting on the
NJNE1. NINWl, and SWiNWl,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 2583 M. feci Douglas

BABY'S COLDS
llii Relieve mlery

--without "dim nj.

change except in minor detail.
We take great pleasure in

ing So rapidly, but we must not

changes in conditions create many difficult problems which

require the whole-hearte- cooperation of all citizens for
solution.

tttV. UlCKtvOU

CHURCH OF

V. ...

Give

guess as to present population.
at least six times the size of
by the time the city can get

To meet housing demands, the
elaborate program of home

who own their homes and have
are not apt to be radical in
an interest in civic affairs,

Creek's good citizenship of

Myrtle Creek are no differ-
Douglu County community,- -

seeing our communities grow
overlook the fact that the

to the Southerner when Cohen

persisted in violating the rules,
hut Goeltz refused to accept it.
When the gong ended the battle
at the end of 9 minutes. Sammy
appeared on the verge of defeat
after being heavily slammed by
two successive whip-lashe-

There was a roar of acclaim
from the 500 spectators when, at
the end of the bout, Owen raised
(ioeltz' hand as a signal of vic-

tory that carried the top pri7e
money of the night's card.
Cohen's nasty methods through-
out the battle seemed to have
erased much of the prestige he

, gained two weeks ago when he
wrestled the coast light heavy-
weight championship from the
equally Unorthodox Crey Mask.
Ifis title was not at stake in his
bout with ;oelt.
Ross Defeats Cazzelf

In the semi-fina- l Thursday
night. Tony Koss defeated "Hig
Injun" Ike Cayell in 12:2") in a
eomlmt that .mi-s-t have fully sat-

isfied all fans present who like
their wrestling rough to the nth
degree. The argument ended
when the lX.Youitd Tony picked
up his opNiiv-n- ( and
whammed him across one knee
in a

The card opened with a
battle royal that

plenty of excitement. First
of the six entrants eliminated
Billy McEtiln, who was disposed
of in 4 minutes. He was followed
two minutes later by Carl (irey.
In another minute CaJiell was
ousted and Ross followed him by
S minutes, leaving Cohen and
Ciocltz as the finalists.

This was announced as the laM

wrestling card at the Armory
until Saturday, November JO.

Federal Works Agency Public
Buildings Administration. Office
of the Division Engineer. fc'S.1 V.
S. Appraisers Building, San Fran-
cisco 11, California. Nov. 6. WIS.
Sealed bids, In triplicate, will be
received at this office until 2 P.
M, Iec. 6. 1!W, and then public-1--

opened, for furnishing the ma-
terials, and performing the work
for Interior painting, new wood
flooring, new exterior entrance
doors and miscellaneous repairs
at the V. S. I'. ()., Kosehurg. lre-go-

in strict accorda1 ce 1th the
specifications dated I U i'lv-7-

Sept. 20, l!Hi. and diauings l(!
anyt mentioned therein: and the!
ceneral conditions dated Sept. IS.
1942. and addendum thereto;
dated May IS, !M4. Specifications
and olher data may be had at the
office of the custodian of the,
buildim or the of fice of the dl- -

vision engineer. Earl H. Lund,
I'Miiun fciiffluivr.

KRNR
Muturf Broadcasting System

1490 Kilocycles

KB MA (NINO nOL'M TODAY .
4:05 Fulton Uwli, Jr.. Bn Bur

Products.
13 Rex Miller, Nahlico.

4:30 Enklne Johnson. Vickf
Chemical Co. ,4 43 Buck Aofen. Gtncralv, Food.

8:00 Hemingway at r.va, J. A.
Soap Co.

5 13 Superman, Kel loafs.
9 JO Captain Midmfht.
3 43 Tom Mix, RaUton Purina.

:00 G j Uriel Heatter. Health ids.
0:13 MuMcal Interlude.
6:25 State and Local News', KoMburtf

Motor Co.
Bands. Coca Cola.

7:00 Veterans' Information Guide--.
7:13 Vern Buck.
7:30 The Cisco Kid. Modern Furniture'.

:00 Let George Do It, standard
5- ao Burt 1vt. philco Corp.Son of the Pioneers, Lock wood

Motors.
SOOAlke Seltw News. Miles Labs.
0:13 Rex Miller, 8. V W. Fine

Foods
9 30--Hi Neighbor. Carsten's

Furniture.
J. Taylor. General Motors.

10:00 Fulton Lewi. Jr., Roseburf
Pharmacy.

10:1 Behind the World News.

Br, 390 M. feet stamped Sugar
Pine, 85 Af. teet stamped a

Pine, 95 M. ft. Incense
Cedar, 40 M. feet White Fir, 20
M. feet Western Red Cedar. No
bid for less than $4.05 per M.ft.
B.M. for the. Douglas fir, $8.50
per M.ft.B.M. for the stamped
Sugar Pine, $5.50 per M.ft.B.M.
for the stamped Ponderosa Pine
$3.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the In
cense Ceda $2.50 per M.ft.B.M.
'or the White Fir and Western
fled Cedar, or a total purchase
price of will be con-
sidered. Only those Pine trees
samped L'SOC are to be cut. Un-

stamped Pine trees arc reserved.
All trees of other species 22 ins.
and less in diameter are reserved
from cutting. Logging is to be
HnnX......... Utth . r...uj,.Ivm. !,-,- ,

eauioment unless otherwise au-- l

thorized by the officer In charee
of the sale. T. 30 S., R. 3 W, Sec.
13. all merchantable timber

for cutting on the SEl
NE1, EJSE1. estimated for the
purpose of this sale to he 2015
M. feet Douglas Fir, 20 M. feet
stamped Ponderosa Pine, 60 M.
feet stamped Sugar Pine, 215 M.
feet Incense Cedar, 30 M. feet
White Fir. No hid for less than
$4.30 per M.ft.B.M. for the Doug-
las Fir, $6.30 per M.ft.B.M. for
the stamped Ponderosa Pine,
$8.70 per M.ft.RM. for the
stamped Sugar Pine. $2.73 per
M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar,
$2.50 per M.ft.B.M. for the
White Fir, or a total purchase
price of $9,978.75, will be con-
sidered. The sale area is to be
logged by use of Caterpillar type
tractor equipment unless other-
wise authorized by the officer in
charge of the sale. Only those
Pine trees stamped L'SOC are to
he cut. All timber cut from the
above described areas must be
manufactured m the local mar-
keting area designated by the
O. and C. Administration unless
otherwise authorized by the Chief
Forester. In case of two or more
identical bids for the same tim-
ber, the successful bidder will he
selected on the basis of compara-
tive ability to produce immedt-itt'l-

lumber for the Emergency
Veterans Housing program ?nd
to further the obiorttves of the
Act of August 2S, 1937. The right
Is hereby reserved to waive tech-
nical defects in this advertise-
ment: to reject all bids, or to
award the timber for the amount
of the highest bid to other than
the highest bidder when neces--

sarv, pursuant to the Act of
August 28, 1937 ( 50 Stat. 874).
In order to provide a continued!
supply of timber to local industry
so as to assure the permanence
of the community which Is de--

pendent upon such industry.
Dated at Portland, Oregon, this
15th diiv of November, 1946. W.
II. llornine. Chief Forester, O. 4
C Administration.

BACKACHE,

LEG PAINS MAY

BE DANGER SIGN
Of Tired Kidney

If d paina a matter na

tMtut thn.. Naturv my W wsrainaj jrou lh4
ymir ni tlntlin.

wyof tl(fria
tM arittfl and poirf wwt mi t Lh
VkiKstt ThT Rp ttuat pJwtt ttua about I
pinu a .r.

If tha II m(V f k(ln4r tnm ml rttVi
Jon't worti vll. pultHttHiu wttriv4itrsHava
h tlst lrnoJ. Th1? r.nifii mv t.rt nirtmf

tpari.4flfTTfT.fj4tiof ui nicalt. rrUIpr.
piiftriin-krtr- tV'1afxa r4 iilut
ini r rflU".torrsi,'y paj:tx tih twtm
tm trard bur in oi inr K s fiar i
thing rori ita jwr Mrt?ra aJMr4t

Don't iitt Ak rour dmnrUt for Dtn'a
rili. a fUniibnt dmmk, u?tl MKTfijTlif

r ninrMK r vr ftin. .Van sjt
hWT rMW antl vtU Mp tk II m.M of

rxuey mi Bau mi ss..tvaMia im inwa

Yourself!

THE NAZARENE

Phone 292 J

land, timbrr land and
them. I rue.s.i I just

all our wealth.

H

See" our large display of Phoro-Xrr- Cards All if fakes Is
youf negative 1 12CT size!, and we'lt print 12 cards for $1.20
If you haven't a 120 negative, we'll make a house call

tor only $2.50

Please caff or come In EARLY!

The Photo Lab

'Most Valuable'

Player Vote Again
Goes to Musial

NEW YORK, Nov. 22.
Stanley Musinl, stellar first base-
man of the World Champion St.
Lnuis Cardinals and his league's
batting king with a 1v5 average--
today was named the National
league's most valuable player In

In winning baseball's most
roveled prize for the second time
In hi four year m.ilor league
career, the Donora. l'a , clnxiter
who only yesterday celebrated his
Mth birthday, received the hlRh-es- t

total of points ever accorded
any player since the present
rating was adopied in WIS.

Musial, who also was voted
most valuable In HMD with 2ti7
points, purled 310 olnt in the
balloting by a 21 man committee
of the H.seball Writers' Associa-
tion of. America. Three writers
from each league city voted.

The1' previous high received by
any player.-wa- s .'HIS hy Jimmy
Koxx In '!): while a member of
the Boston Red Sox.

Second place went to Brook-'n- '
Plxle Walker, the "People's

Choice." whose ir!) points made
him the poorest runner up In the
last nine years. The iVxIgers'
popular veteran rightflelder,
whose .323 batting average and
116 runs batted In almost brought
Hrooklvn Its first pennant aim
1MI, did not receive a first place
vote.

Goelfc Win Over

Cohen; Tony Ross

Defeats Cazzell
Mllly CrfHtz, cx-f- from Ten-

nessee, making his firt Rosehurg
appearance In the Oregon wres-
tling wars, split two falls with
Sammy Cohen in the main event
at the Armory Thusday night and
then, In the third round, won a
referee's decision because of the
Hebrew's flagrant foul tactics.

Cohen gsincicd the firs! (till
wlih a surlrx.aid hold In Vi.ZS.
Goelti evened the in the
second stana in 6 SO with a

prone back stretch. The overall
time limit of 30 minutes was fin
Uhed in the third mutid without
either grappler gamma a fall.

2271 N. Jackson

Jessie H, Jones Said
r.rmr uevemment rinsncier

have alicatfx liked real cttatc'fnrm land, pasture
city ptoiierls. t hare had experience with all of
nalurutly like "the good earth," the foundation of

LOTS OF IRRIGATION WATER
WW acr?i with fn tillable anrl balanro panlur 20 arm frrigatlnn nahta nowand owner aavi 90 mora availabt. Mntly all tiHM urmind U crerk hottom
(aHo(l ham. ihffp a: .ed, two rhu'krn houat?a and marhinr ttied. Twn hour.'Wf with ninina wjitrr Pnd one three room and bll. NaafOakland. U3 300 with fltt.OnU don. Balanee at 9' interrt.

Senior High School faculty in
W3S to take over as track coach
at Grant High School In Portland,
mentored a hicl basketball team
to the state honp tournament In
1?:tS. Since leaving Roseburg he
Jus officiated at numerous l'acl-11-

Coast collegiate Rdmes.

ROSEBURG REALTY CO.Trrfmry records show that
Washington overdrew his first
Wm's salary bv Sl.042.wr and1 Umpqua Hotel Lobby

jt-f-t office wfihout drawing $3,9091 Twice during this period. Keferee
that was till due him. lEJton 0cu olUicU ihe miUkI


