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Ronrere Bernard Shaw's total
Income for the first nine years
he devoted to writing was oniy

Rain Timely for

Slash Burning Aid
Today's rain was welcomed by...,. m tha Tlmnniia National

$30.

THE BALLOT MEASURES

Civil Engineering
Service Sets Up

Roseburg Office
J. H. Clabby, who heads a civil

engineering, surveying and tim-
ber cruising service in Southern

Tilshd DsM Isoupt Snd 6Y d
NtHO bfcHlW CuMFANs. INC.

Entered a secun- - class matter May
1771". P"to" ' ",!'ir1, J . nf Mflrcd 2. lUitt. Forest, who are faced with theUfCBWIi m..mc. "
C1IAULE8 V. STANTON There should be no difficulty in understanding three of..MANAlittt

the measures appearing on the Nov. 5 election ballot These
include the bill authorizing Chinamen to hold real estate and

Memoer oi (iic - - --- -

son Newspaper Puulumera Awotuauon,
Uie Aualt touraau of cirulauuiia.

lTpre3cnled by CO.,
INC." oiiicea in New Vi.eUn.1;ug,1D
ftranclsuo, lx Ai.ge.ei., bcuUe,

task of burning approximately
4,000 acres of logging slash, said
Ray B. Hampton, in charge of
fire control for the forest.

Each ranger In the four dis-

tricts on the forest is using the
crews assigned to his district to

gather together and turn the
piles of debris left from logging
operations. In the South Myrtle

mining claims, an amendment permitting legislative bills to
Oregon and Northern caiuornia,
announced today the establish-
ment of a branch office in Rose-bum- .

Mr. Clabby, an experiencbe read by title only, and a constitutional amendment in
ed engineer, has his headquartersobtorlpUoa ftalea

iLuidioi Out nl creasing the number of state senators to 31.
Br Mail
Fur Year
fciix Muntns

County County
UMS
i ;s 2.UU The repeal amendment, which would permit Chinamen to

at Medford. Mis Koseourg oinee
is to be managed by John Smith,
recently returned from military
service. Temporary quarters are
being set up at 230 N. Stephens
St.

Of E'LDE)'
T2 D

Remember to tune In tonight in time to hear the 8 o'clock show,
"Let George Do It" . . . And to hear Burl Jves, who makes his bow
at 8:30, singing of the "Big Rock Candy Mountain," the flittlngs of
the blue-tal- l fly, and the sad demise of Fair Eleanor.

We think you're going to enjoy this fifteen minutes of
music with Ives, his guitar and his ballads. He's almost a
legend in the theater and has collected the American fclk .

songs he will sing for you from many odd,
corners across the country.

We'll keep you informed as to football scores during the eve-

ning, so, if you can't go to the game, at least you'll har the score
'

by quarters.

Now as to program changes during the next week.
Michael Shayne, Private Detective, moves out of Monday
night at 8 o'clock and Richard Davis, Private Detective,
hangs out his shingle In the same spot, with the same spon-
sor. Mike will be open for business in his new location at
7 P. M. on Wednesday. That means that Rhythm Round-U-

moves to 8:45 and changes Its title to Sons of the Pioneers.
A little complicated perhaps . . . but you can always tune
1490 at 6 A. M., and stay with us all day and not miss a thing.

..TrTT, ALSO " M4aW! J
ureeK area, nowevei, ttuuiuuuw
Forest Service crews are being
moved in.

The rain Is welcomed, Hamp- -

rer fcm, .

Ft moiiUi. oy city earner

Mr. Clabby was for many years IU,I CApnmvu,
-- --

titers wish to light each individ

own real estate and mining claims, would remove from the
State Constitution a provision conflicting with the U. S.

Constitution and treaties. It would allow no more acquisition
of land by Chinese than now permitted under federal and
state laws, but would simply remove, an obsolescent provi

with the Idaho bureau of high-
ways. He was engaged in num-
erous large projects piior to the

ual accumuiauon oi sia&u a

greater protection of the Jorests,
rwrcmsp thprp is less chance for
the fires to spread.sion.

The Weather
0. 8. Weather Bureau Office

Rouburg, Oregon
Forecast Tor HoseDurg and vl

cinity: Cloudy and warmer to-

night; light rain Saturday.
Highest temp, for any Oct 96

Lowest temp, for any Oct 22

Highest temp, yesterday 57
Lowest temp, last night 43

Precipitation yesterday 59

Precipitation from Oct.,1 1.14
Deficit from Oct. 1 21

Deficit from Sept. 1 52

war, and during tne war penoa
participated in engineering naval
air bases at Klamath Falls, Ore-

gon and Jacksonville, Florida,
and in engineering work at Camp

ine current siusu uuimug pi"
ject on the forest is approxi-
mately 60 per cent completed.The proposed amendment to permit legislative bills to be

8:00 PM KRNR 1490read by title only would make legislative procedure more U. S. farm fire loss Is more
than $90.000.000 annually.efficient.

The provision that legislative bills must be read in their
entirety, section-by-sectio- was placed in our State Consti

Adair, Camp White ana uamp
Abbot in Oregon. His firm is
licensed in Idaho, Washington,
Oregon and California.

Mr. Smith, who is to be local
manager, was with the Copco en-

gineering staff at Medford prior
to the war. During the war he
was with the Army Engineers at
Camp White, and later was
assigned to the Seabees. He saw

In the Day's News tution in days when bills were written by hand. Usually only
one copy was available and legislators became acquainted
with provisions of a proposed law only by having it read in

(Continued trom page 1)
full. Several readings often were required that there might 7:40 RhaDsodv in Wax.active service at uiunawa. KRNR

M utual B roadcastl ng System
1490 Kilocycles

AND NOW
Coen's Deluxe Kitchen Cabinets

with Upsliding Doors '

Every woman will appreciate this feature as being
the ultimate in convenient elegant cabinets.

Your Inspection Invited

COEN LUMBER COMPANY

8:00 Haven of Best. Gond Shi lrc9.bo no misunderstanding.
Now, however, all bills are prepared in printed form as Notice of Timber Sale

Sealed bids, marked outside

H:JO wally'g Wake Up Time, Wally's
Grocery.

8:4fl The Romemaker't Club.
9:00 Claude Sweeten and Hla Orch.
9.1S Morninff Melodlei.m

'Rid for Timber." and addressed 9:30 Teleohone Reouest. Miner's Tnc.

with .their hideous trail of blood
and bones and rotting fiish,

If not
But, why try to describe the

consequences of failure to get
along together In this age when
man's power to destroy Is already
fantastic and GROWING SWIFT-
LY? .

10:00 Alka Seltzer Newi. Mllee Labs.
10:15 Enoch Light and His Orch.
10:30 Endorsed bv Dorse.
10:45 Easy Llstenln.
11:00 Vic and Sade.

soon as they are introduced. Copies are placed in the hands
of all legislators for study. Members of the legislature may
inform themselves fully upon the exact wording of any bill

by reference to their files. Consequently, reading only by
title is all that is necessary, although the proposed amend-

ment would require reading "section-by-sectio- before final

to the Chief Forester, O. and C.
Administration, 901 Guardian
Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will
be received until and opened at
10:30 A. M., Pacific Standard l:JO Checkerboard Jamboree. Ralston

Purina.
Time. November 12, 194b, lor the 12:00 Musical Interlude.

12:08 1J. S. Recap of Sports, u. S. lire
Store.

12:18 Rhythm at Random.
12:40 State and Local News, Hansen

Motors.
12:48 National News, Douglas County

State Bank.
12:58 Terminal Market Report, Sig

passage, unless rules were suspended by a two-thir- vote

in either house in which the bill is pending.pROM Washington comes this
purchase of timber upon tracts
Hereinafter described; each bid
must state tne amount per M.
feet B. M., which will be offered
for each species and the total con-
sideration which will be paid for
the timber. No bid for less than
the appraised value will be con-
sidered. Each bid must be sub

dispatch:
"The government reportedly

drafted an order today to speed
the junking of wage controls.

The provision requiring full reading of a bill has been

frequently used by legislators as a mean,s of filibustering.
It has been common practice of legislators or blocs, desiring
to nush through a measure toward which the legislatureSimultaneously, OPA and the ag-

riculture department 'seriously mitted in duplicate and be accom- -

REMAINING HODUS TODAT

,4:00 Flirt on Lewis, Jr., Ben Hur
Products.

4:1(1 Rex Miller. Nabiico.
4:30 Good News Program, Assembly

of God.
4:415 Buck Rogers, 20th Century,

General Foods.
9:00 Hemlnnway at Five, L. A.

Soap Co.
5:15 Superman, Kelloftg's.
5:30 Captain Midnight, Wander Co.
5:45 Tom Mix, Ralston Purina.
8:(K Gabriel Heatter, Healthaids.

Muslcul Interlude.3:15 SUte and Local News, Roseburg
Motor Co.

6:30 Spotlight Bands, Coca Cola.
7:O0 Velernni' Information Guide.
7:15 Rhythm Roundup, Lock wood

Motors.
7:30 The Cisco Kid. Modern Furniture.
11:00 Let George Do It. Standard Oil.
R:.'!0 Hurl Ives, Philco Corp.
B:4S Monica's Music Box.
9:O0 Alka Seltzer News, Miles Labs.
0:15 Rex Miller, S. & W. Fine Foods.
fi;30 Hi Neighbor, Carsten's

Furniture.
0:45 Henry J. Taylor, Oeneral Motors.

10:00 Fulton Lewis. Jr., Roseburg
Pharmacy.

10:15 Behind the World News.
10:20 Nocturne.
10::to Ten Thirty Club, Lawson's.
11:00 Sign Of.

SATURDAY. OCT. 19, 1946

6 00 Farm Bulletin Board.
6:30 Yawn Patrol.
6:40 Before You Buy a Farm Think!
6:45 Treasury Salute.
7:00 Frank Hemingway, L. A. Soap

715 Rise and Shine. Sterling Drug Co.
7:30 State and Local News, Boring

ed by a deposit in tne ,T,mmight exhibit some reluctance, to force reading of long bills
considered' wiping out price cell

NOW AVAILABLE

CEMENT
LIME

WOOD LATH

DENN-GERRETSE- N CO.

n their entirety. Many hours were thereby wasted andings on all food Items still under
of a certified check in fjij' ";ol
the Treasurer of thr J 1ed
States. The deposit of - & suc-
cessful bidder will bo credited onprogress' of legislative work obstructed, while filibusters

sought and frequently gained concessions as members be-

came impatient to complete their work.

r ell.
1:00 Man on the Street, Henninger'sMarts.
1:15 The Westerners, Roseburg Grange

Supply.
1:45 Oregon vs. Washington State,

Associated OH.
4:30 David Rose and His Orch.
8:00 Hemingway at Five, J. A. Folger

Co.
5:15 Dance Music.
5:30 Around the County. International

News Events.
5:45 Hawaii Calls.
6:00 Author Meets the CrlUC.
0:30 Meet the Press.
7:00 State and lrfjcal News, Roseburg

Motor Co.
7:05 Musical Interlude.
7:15 Here's to Veterans.
7:30 Red Ryder.
8:00 Dance Music.
8:30 Juvenile Jury.

Alka Seltzer News. Miles Labs.
8:15 Lawrence Wetk's Orch.
9:25 Behind the World News, Ander-

son & Brace.
9:30 Wrestling Matches, Roseburg

Dutrinnr Ktnre

the contract. Payment in lull at
tht- - time of filing the contract is

The amendment is not apt to produce carelessness, as pro

control."
The dispatch adds:
"Senators studying the Implica-

tions of Mr. Truman's action on

meat foresaw an early end to

ALMOST ALL price controls, ex-

cept those over rent."

ROM now until the fateful 5th

reouired in sales amounting to
$2,500.00 or less, copies of
the form of proposal, form of
contract and bond, terms of pay-
ment, amount 5f deposit required
with bid .amount ot bond requir

vision is made for reading either in full or by title only as

the legislature may indicate by a two-thir- vote. It would

be difficult, however, for a filibuster to gain two-thir- sup-

port and thus the measure would be a protection against
Phone 128402 W. Oak St.ed with contract and other infor-

mation, application should be
I of November, the air will be

obstructionist tactics. made to the auuress snown anove.
fN DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 21 Club. Lawson's. I

"' '
11:03 Sign Off.i., R. 6 W., Sec. 2S, all mercnant-ihl-

timber desienated. for cut
The proposal to increase the number of state senators to

ting mi tho WlivWL SE.1NWI.
and NEJSWL estimated lor thfi31 results from the efforts of Deschutes and Klamath coun-

ties to secure better senatorial representation. Deschutes, purpose of this sale to be 3300
M. left uougias iir, ,iu m. teei
H,..-iin,l-c 7R M. foot White Fir.ifi,v,uih rvrw.lt .Ti.ffi.rMon and Lake counties, comprising
65 M. feet Incense Cedar, 75 M."j

the 17th- ..senatorial district, have only firm swe-sennxor.- -t

feet Western Red Ceuar, anu do

filled with political yowllngs and

yammerings over who killed
Cock Robin. Every politician of

whatever ilk will be putting the
bee on somebody else for tht
uiame and grabbing for himself

all. the credit if any.
It will be a. hideous din. But we

might as well get braced for ti-

ll has to come.

all, wage controls
AFTER CONTROL WAGES.

Price controls DIDN'T CON-

TROL' PRICES.
WnVr. already whtaine dizzily

Lineal Feet of Western Red ce-

dar Poles. No bid for less than
SS.85 per M. ft. B. M. for the

The population of these five counties in the 19 10 census was

72,9. Umatilla County has a senator and, in addition,
shares a senator with Morrow and Union counties. Umatilla

for the Incense Cedar, $7.80 per
M. ft. B. M. for the Sugar Pine,
or a total purchase price of

will be considered. Only
those Pine trees stamped USOC
are to be cut. T. 30 S., R. 2 W.,
Sec, 23, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on the
N1NEJ, NiNWJ, and SWINWi,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 2585 M. feet Douglas
fir. 390 M. feet stamped Sugar
Pine, 85 M. feet stamped Ponde-ros- a

Pine, 95 M. feet Incense Ce-

dar, 40 M. feet White Fir, 20 M.
feet Western Red Cedar. No bid
for less than $4.05 per M. ft. B.
M. for the Douglas fir, $8.50 per
M. ft. B. M. for the stamped Sug

Douglas tir, SV!.ru per ivi. it. a. m.
for the Hemlock, Incense Cedar,
and Western Red Cedar, $2.25County has a population of 26,030, while Umatilla, Morrow

imrl Union counties, combined have a population of 73,790, per M. ft. B. M. for tne wnue
and SO.025 Dor Lin. Ft. for

according to 1910 census figures. Thus we have a district
the Western Red Cedar Poles, or
a total purchase price oiwith 73,796 population represented by two senalois, vnne

' In the mazes of the dreaded in 993.13. will be considered. I. 24

ar Pine, $5.50 per M. ft. B. M. forflation spiral. Every time we get
out bljls for the month we. go

a district with 72,996 population has only one senator.

Rightfully, this Issue does not belong before the people

H should be settled by the legislature through redistribu

S., R. 4 W., Sec. 13, all merchant-
able timber designated for cut-

ting on the SJSW1 and SWJSE4,
estimated for the purpose of this
sole to be 1865 M. feet Douglas

I

if . , .

I i ' . w hi
fit ' ' , !fti ' ' ;t
,1 - '.

'w ( ' ' a

.
4
l t"V. f

jJ4
ELECT

I GOVERNOR
I SneHtWnf

the stamped nne,
$3.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the In-

cense Cedar, $2.50 per M. ft. B.
M. for thi- - White Fir and West

panicky.

THIS Is the cold truth:
tion. Klamath and Deschutes county have both been active

iti mull VPllt'M lit to secure senatorial representation. fir, 100 M. feet White fir, u m.
in.t Incpnse Cedar. 110 M. feet

Second Round Title

Tournament

Jack Kiser Sammy Cohen

ern Red Cedar, or a total e

of $14,686.75, will beI NfiTHINO CAN HELP US Western Red Cedar. 20 M. feet
RUT INCREASE OF PRODUC GHemlock. No bid lor less man

$5.60 nor M. ft. B. M. for theTION TO THE POINT WHERE
Numerous reapportionment bills have been introduced, but

without success. The State Constitution limits the number

of senators to 30 and the legislature,- - apparently despairing
of any reapportionment agreement, proposes to solve the

stalemate by securing authority from the people to amend

THERE WILL BE MORE SELL

considered. Only those pine trees
stamped USOC are to be cut. Un-

stamped Pine trees are reserved.
All trees of other species 22 ins.
and less in diameter are reserved
from cutting. Logging is to be
rfnnn with Cateioillar-tvp- trac

Douglas fir, $2.50 per M. It. B. M.
for the White Fir and Incense
Cedar, $2.75 per M. ft. B. M. forERS THAN BUYERS.

tlAT ii'lll linnrwn?
the western nca icaiir, aim
per M. ft. B. M. for the Hem- -

l,u'k nr a InLrtl DUrchase Ol'iec of- tor equipment unless otherwisethe Constitution and add a senator to tne wuu nuniou.

Billy McEuin Frankie Hart

Buck Davidson Bulldog Jackson

Wrestling, Roseburg Armory, Saturday, Oct. 19

If That dccnds almost wholly
. ...,? 1! ak A PEO- -

authorized py tne oincer in$11,266.50, will be considered. 1.
eharee of the sa e. All timoer cuiauthorized. ,

Thi ueLiiin oiM'iis a dangerous precedent m that any disUll ua ,,vm,ii " -

PLE. If we keep our shirts on, if
rir..W r hdfTirUh. if wp don't satisfied district likewise may demand increasing the si.e

of the senate. On the other hand, an apparent injustice existstry to grab all the feed In the

from the above described areas
must be manufactured in the lo-

cal marketing area designated by
tho O. and C. Administration un-
less otherwise authorized by the
Chief Forester. If the unit prices
bid are above those authorized by
MPR 460. thev will be reduced to

trough, for ourselves, u we noiu
within ri'jisim and at present ami should be remedied. Another argument in

r... r .,uu,.,rp it llmt the present even number of senatorsUUI UV, (I l,tr. n ......
DO WITHOUT rather than pay

.t , ., ....!,. ...Iw.r, It ,.UKi,...iiv results in tie voles, which an uneven number Douglas County Creamery
Presents

the maximum permitted undertnc oilier ienuws putt-- .......
hli'h. if we would prevent.

govern ourselves by the sound

manttp. actually was not a denial
SPECIAL

ANOUNCEMENT
principle of the uoiuen huh:

said Dr. Morris H. Roach, pastor,we'll come out of it all rigm.
If no- t-

24 S., K. b W., toec. I, an mer-
chantable timber designated tor
cutting on the NEl and E1NW1,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 4785 M. feet Douglas
fir, 300 M. feet White Fir, 195
M. feet Incense Cedar, 135 M.
feet Western Red Cedar, 20 M.
feet Hemlock, and 3450 Lineal
Feet of Western Red Cedar
Poles. No bid for less than $4.50
per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas
fir, $2.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the
White Fir, and Incense Cedar,
$2.75 oer M. ft. B. M. for the
Western Red Cedar. 52.25 per M.
ft. B. M. for the Hemlock, and
$0,025 per Lin. Ft. for the West-
ern Red Cedar Poles, or a total
purchase price of $23,272.50, will
be considered. The sale area is
to l)e logged by use of Caterpillar--
type tractor equipment unless
otherwise authorized by the offi-
cer in charge of the sale. T. 30 S.,
R. 2 W., Sec. 19 all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
the NFISWL NW1SEJ. and Lot
6 (SW1SEII, estimated for the
Dtirpose of this sale to be 2550 M.
feet DouL'las fir. 60 M. feet Hem- -

today.
a i,.iiir received Ibis wee

Conference Backs

School Measurethen w ill come theWell, from the CPA at Washington
states that since the manse is adeluge".
house, authority tor us coiimiui.-!.-

,i.r,u mil IhII under jurisdic

that order. In case ot two or
more identical bids for the same
timber ,the successful bidder will
be selected on the basis of com- -

parative ability to produce imme--'
diatelv lumber for the Emerg-- !

ency Veterans Housing program
and to further the objectives of
the Act of August 28, 1937. The
right is herebv reserved to waive
technical defects in this adver--

tiscment; to reject all bids, or to
award the timber for the
amount of the highest bid to oth- -

cr than the highest bidder when
necessary, pursuant to the Act of
August 28, 1937 150 Stat. 874), in
order to nrovide a continued sup- -

ply of timber to local Industry so
as to assure the permanence of
the community which Is depend-- !

1 WHATEVER wc do, let's not
tion of the CPA, but under that

tf llnten to the bawling and bel f llin HIA.
A new application will be sublowing politician who beats his

chest and bids us: "Vote for mo mittoii me rjm,
and all will be hunky-dory-- .

Approvals reported by the CPA
hitiri vi'sterdav included it u.The. politicians have had their

new classrooms at $4,000 for thechance AND HAVE f AiL.t.i
Myrtle I reek bcnooi.

rvnials included: Lee Morten-

Bakery to Close Week to sen, Roseburg, $70,000, auto l.K-- 70 M. feet White Fir. 70 M. ent upon such industry. Dated at
Portland, Oregon, tnis tin ciav oi
October. 1916. W. H. Horning,
Chief Forester, O. & C. Adminis

feet Incense Cedar, 35 M. feet

stamped Sugar Pine. No bid for
less than $3.95 per M. ft. B. M.
for the lXmglas tir, S2.50 or M.
ft. B. M. for the Hemlock and
While Fir, $3.00 per M. ft. B. M.

tration. - -

NIGHT

court; Dennis Mathews, ltosc-b- m

g, $2,000, garage.

Guerrillas Seiia Town
MANILA. Oct.

Nueva Ecija Province provost
said lodav 100 Huklwlahap guer-
rillas seized Pantahangan and
ousted town officials. A regiment
of military police were rushed to

Pantahangan. scene of a major
Iluk-M- battle in August.

tI;

Unanimous decision to actively
suplMirt the Basic Support Bill
was murte by representatives of
schools from all over Oregon at
the state administrators' confer-
ence in Salem Monday and Tues-

day. Superintendent of Schools
Paul E. Elliott sisid Thursday.

Attending the conference irt

representation of the Roseburg
schools were O. J. Monger, Sen-
ior High School: R. H. Brand,
Junior High; Ralph Turner.

School; Rov Crane, Benson
School, and Mrs. Nellie .Fisher,
Edenbowei' School.

The conference divided into
three groups: elementary. Junior
high, and senior high schools
was opened with a general ses-
sion and address by Covernor
Earl Shell endorsing the Basic
School Supixtrt Bill.

Highlighting the two-da- meet
was an informative address by
Dr. Stoltz, guidance director of
the public schools of Oakland.
Calif., who siKike on- "General
Philosophy of Education." Also a
prominent seaker was Dr. Elmo
Stevenson of I he Southern Ore-

gon College at Ashland, whose
topic was "A Comprehensive Edu-
cation Program."

Denial for 'Manse' Not

Applicable to 'House'
The "denial" reported yesief-da-

bv the CPA construction re-

view committee at Portland, of
the anneal Of fhe first Presby

due to colds

Tired Kidneys
Often Bring
Sleepless NigMs

nay yoor kMnoyi contain IB rniTca

of I my tutxur litter winch hvlv to purify Ut

nil keep yu lieulOiy. Wlirn y vet
titrtl ti'l dtn t wArk riudl in Iho ilyttm

Put in New Equipment
New equipment will be in-

stalled and the kilehrn rrmodrlpd
at Weber's Bakery, i'tl N. .lack-so-

Street, next week, In order
to give customers llm "bettor
merchandise they hiive so long
deserved," it was announced by
Charles Brundage and Harold

Krieger. managers.
The- - bokery will be closed

Monday. October 21, for one week,
while' the equipment is being
installed. Principal Installation is
to be that of a new oven.

Oakland Carnival to Aid

School Athletic Fund
A queen and four princesses

ire to reign over a oirnival at
Oakland next Thursday. October
21 which will benefit the Oak-

land High School aihleiic iund.
To be staged in the high school

gymnasium, the carnival will in-

clude r concessions, exhibits, a

country store, lun house, archery

WARD WEEK
SPECIAL

REV. LEONARD EILERS, the
former movie star and direc-
tor in cowboy pictures, will

preach Sunday morning and
evening and Monday and
Tuesday evenings at the
First Baptist Church, Rose-

burg. Mr.xEilers will preach
evenings in his cowboy cos-

tume, use rope tricks, and
play and sing.
Come early tor scats. Eve-

ning meetings at 7:30.
Remember folks . . . it's

guest Sunday at the
church

are eased, sticky phlegm loosened up.
Irritated upper breathiiu; passages are
soothed aivi rcltcwj, by rubbing Vicks

VapoUub oi throat, chest and back
at bedtime; Blessed relief VnpoRub

PENETRATtS to tipper bronchial

tubes with its special medicinal vapors,
STIMULATES chest and back sur-tic-rs

like a warming poultice.
Often by rnornins most of the mis-

ery of the cold is gone I Remember

ONLY VAPORUB Gires You this spe-
cial double action. It s
home-prove-d . . . the best-kno- home

remedy for reliev- - m a m l
ing miseries of viff 9 f S
children's colds. V VAPQRU8

nnv ihhm-- tinvc to crt ui mum . r mucnl
ornont
BoDu timr rIkwa there is nv thins ivrontf
w ith your kirttwys 01 Wmhler. Don't nrnlct
thlscoiidition and kvtcvahioMo, iistful

V hfti tlwrxVcof knttwy functiou pormiu
j lv4fOiicufl matter to .i:.tin in r Mixl it

may also cuffne?in3 Vchvhp. thrumitic
pali, trtf pains, lotta of pep atxl rwrci

and mintvs.
Ion't wait. Ank yrtir 8rurtrit IW IVn's

Pills, a itturKtc, atirmfiiLly
by milllcna fT ww 40 ys'. nn'tt giv
tuppy relief anil wilt help tha IB mitt of
Utility tulwa tlunh out iotcmou v.U Ire a.
jvut UvcU. Ut Dutu't sfOJ.

Cherry Sundae
FLANNEL

39 yd.
On Sale Tomorrow

A new serial cartoon, to appear each Friday in the News-Revie-

You'll enioy following Cherry's adventures.
end a merry-go-rounu- .

The public is iu ittd. terian Church lor a u',ow


