

Drops to Death From Empire State Building

NEW YORK, Aug. 23.—(AP)—Mrs. Rosalind E. Breslau, 38, employee of the War Assets Administration, plunged to her death yesterday from the administration's office on the 62nd floor of the Empire State Building to a terrace at the 21st floor.

Police said she left three notes.

Wanted

All horses and riders in Douglas County to ride in parade Sept. 2nd

All merchants and organizations are urged to enter floats — Contract Art Andrus, phone 137-R-3.

Musial's Batting Lifts Cards Into League-Lead Tie

(By the Associated Press) If the St. Louis Cardinals flag this season, it won't be the fault of Stanley Musial, the circuit's number one batter.

Top man in almost every offensive department of play, Musial, in the past two weeks, has staged a terrific batting rampage which reached stellar heights yesterday when he practically singlehandedly batted the Cards into a first place tie with the Brooklyn Dodgers.

Musial rapped out six hits as the Cardinals swept a doubleheader from the Philadelphia Phillies, 7-6 and 4-3, to draw even with the Dodgers who were shut out, 2-0 by the Reds in Cincinnati.

Antlerless Deer, Elk Tags Ended

PORTLAND, Aug. 23.—(AP)—The State Game Commission said yesterday applications for tags for the special antlerless deer and elk hunts this fall extended quotas for all areas and no more requests will be considered.

Successful applicants for each area will be decided at drawings today.

The general elk tag, however, may be obtained at any time and is good during the specified seasons in the various parts of the state.

The first shooting for bird hunters this fall will be available with the opening of the hunting season on September 1 for band-

Antlerless Deer, Elk Tags Ended

PORTLAND, Aug. 23.—(AP)—The State Game Commission said yesterday applications for tags for the special antlerless deer and elk hunts this fall extended quotas for all areas and no more requests will be considered.

Successful applicants for each area will be decided at drawings today.

The general elk tag, however, may be obtained at any time and is good during the specified seasons in the various parts of the state.

The first shooting for bird hunters this fall will be available with the opening of the hunting season on September 1 for band-

tailed pigeons and doves. The pigeon season extends through the entire month but the dove season closes September 15. Bag limit for each species is 10 a day or 10 in possession. Hunting is allowed from one-half hour before sunrise to sunset.

Notice of Timber Sale

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until and opened at 10:30 A. M., Pacific Standard Time, Sept. 10, 1946 for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B. M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2,500.00 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. The volumes given below are standing timber estimates and may be more or less than the actual amounts. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 23 S., R. 6 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the NE 1/4 SE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 555 M. feet felled and bucked Douglas fir, 35 M. feet felled and bucked Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$6.05 per M. ft. B. M. for the felled and bucked Douglas fir, \$4.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the felled and bucked Incense Cedar, a total purchase price of \$3,515.25, will be considered. Only that timber previously felled and bucked is included in the sale. An area of approx. five acres in the southern portion of the subdivision is reserved. T. 32 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 15, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the W 1/2 NW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1450 M. feet Douglas fir, 210 M. feet stamped Sugar Pine. No bid for less than \$4.90 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas fir, and \$10.65 per M. ft. B. M. for the stamped Sugar Pine, or a total purchase price of \$8,341.50, will be considered. All Douglas fir trees less than 22 ins. DBH are reserved. Only those Pine trees stamped USOC are to be cut. The area is to be logged by use of Caterpillar-type tractor equipment unless otherwise authorized by the officer in charge of the sale. All timber cut from the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement, to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 16th day of August, 1946. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration.

Notice of Timber Sale

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until and opened at 10:30 A. M., Pacific Standard Time, September 10, 1946, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described, each bid must state the amount per M. feet B. M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2,500.00 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. The volumes given below are standing timber estimates and may be more or less than the actual amounts. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 25 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 15, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the N 1/2 NE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2050 M. feet Douglas fir, 105 M. feet White Fir, 130 M. feet Western Red Cedar, 30 M. feet stamped Sugar Pine, 5 M. feet Incense Cedar, 55 M. feet Hemlock, and 1575 Lined Feet of Western Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$6.10 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas fir, \$2.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, Western Red Cedar, Incense Cedar, and Hemlock, \$10.10 per M. ft. B. M. for the stamped Sugar Pine, and \$0.25 per Lin. ft. for the Western Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$13,584.88, will be considered. Only those Pine trees stamped USOC are to be cut. All timber cut from the above described area must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement, to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 2nd day of August, 1946. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration.

The Philadelphia Athletics hammered Bob Feller for three consecutive hits in the seventh inning to outscore the Cleveland Indians, 8-6, for their third straight victory. Feller, summoned from the bullpen to protect a one-run Cleveland lead, gave up the winning runs before retiring the side. Joe Berry was charged with the loss.

A scheduled night game at Washington between the Detroit Tigers and the Senators was halted by rain at the end of two scoreless innings.

Umpqua Tourny Bills Six Matmen

Six of the top men in Matchmaker Don Owen's wrestling stable will be attempting to make the first lap on permanent possession of the Umpqua Tourny Trophy in an elimination round at the Roseburg Armory Saturday night.

The unique event and the trophy has been set up by the Roseburg wrestling commission. The first grappler to put his name on the trophy three times takes permanent possession.

The six men in the first round for possession of the trophy will be Karl Gray, Joe Lynam, Jack Kiser, Bulldog Jackson, Joe Wolf and Ike Cazell. The first five are familiar to local fans and Cazell is a newcomer who has displaced such performers as the Gray Mask, Bruno Angelo and Mike Nazarian in the hated of wrestling fans.

The tourny will be of the straight elimination type, complete in one evening. All matches will be one fall with a 20-minute time limit. The tourny makes a full evening of wrestling.

Government-Owned Buildings to Be Sold

Public sale of several government-owned buildings of a non-portable type at Camp Williams Creek, near Grants Pass, was announced today by James E. Slattery, district forester for the Oregon and California Revested Lands Administration.

Sealed bids will be received and opened at 2:30 P. M., September 10, at the office of the chief forester, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon. Awards will be made within 48 hours.

The buildings include a sawmill building, planer shed, lumber drying shed, a frame building, a warehouse and warehouse annex. The buildings may be purchased separately or together. Further information may be obtained from the O. and C. office in the Pacific Building at Roseburg.

Los Angeles Rams Favored to Take Football Classic

CHICAGO, Aug. 23.—(AP)—An old reliable Chicago attraction — the 13th annual all star football game, with the Los Angeles Rams and the class of the collegians contending — will be played to a sellout crowd of 95,000 in Soldier Field tonight.

The kickoff is scheduled for 8:30 P. M., central daylight time, and if you haven't a seat for the grid classic, a description will be carried over 325 stations of the Mutual Broadcasting system and will be re-broadcast by short wave to America's service men throughout the world.

The Rams, titleholders of the National Football league who were victorious in nine out of 10 league contests last year, are favored. However, Bo McMillin, head coach of the collegians, again will be enjoying his familiar role of underdog, and it may be that his All-Stars are better than he has admitted thus far.

McMillin said yesterday, "It looks like we are in for a lot of trouble." But the wily Indiana mentor might be thinking of the 1938 all-star game in which he led the collegians to a 28 to 16 victory over the Washington Redskins. His 1946 squad is the oldest in age and football experience, possibly the most brilliant cast assembled in the classic's history.

Jansen Fattens Hurling Mark By Halting Angelenos

(By the Associated Press)

Larry Jansen of the San Francisco Seals with 25 triumphs today held an edge over the won-lost season averages of the Pacific Coast Baseball League's leading hurlers since 1934 and had seven to go to top the record of total wins since 1922.

The loop's mound ace, who goes next season to the New York Giants, last night held off the Los Angeles sluggers for a 3-1 decision and his 25th against four

losses, making his season average .862.

That is the best mark of regularly used hurlers since Fay Thomas of Los Angeles led the circuit with 28 wins and four defeats for 3.75 in 1934. The highest record of victories in 24 years was Bob Joyce's 31 for the Seals last season.

Beavers Win Twice

The 1945 pennant winning Portland Beavers, now in the cellar, took a twin bill, 2-1 and 5-4, from Sacramento, dampening the Solon challenge of Los Angeles for third place. Kampouris homered to tie the count for Sacramento in the ninth inning of the afterpiece but Portland came back in the 10th with singles by Mayo, Smith and Storey and an error by losing hurler Mann.

Pinch hitters accounted for most of the scoring as the Oakland A's held their pace five games behind the leading Seals in a 5-4 victory over the Hollywood Stars.

The Stars tied the count in the seventh when pinch hitter Eddie Stewart poked a four-run blow over the fence.

Seattle's Rainiers set down the San Diego Padres 3-1 behind the five hit hurling of Test. The winners did all of their scoring in the first inning.

Ram Brings \$2,200

SALT LAKE CITY, Aug. 23.—(AP)—Sheep growers, bidding against each other for prize animals offered at the National Ram Sale here, hiked the price for one yearling Suffolk stud to \$2,200. The animal went to Walter P. Hubbard of Junction City, Ore. It was consigned by H. L. Finch of Soda Springs, Idaho.



MAKING FAMILY FINANCE Smoother!

Our family finance service will help you iron out money problems. Inquire!

Calkins Finance Co.
S-264 Lic. M-337
Douglas Co. Bank Bldg.
Phone 466

TELEPHONE POLES WANTED BUY AS FAR NORTH AS DRAIN

30's, 35's, 40's and 45's

Contact

F. A. FENLEY PILING CO.

740 S. Stephens St.

Roseburg, Oregon

BASEBALL



Umpqua Chiefs

vs.

Crescent City

Sunday, August 25 at 2:00 P. M.

Adm. Adults 74c—Students 25c (tax incl.)

FINLAY FIELD



WRESTLING

UMPQUA TOURNAMENT TROPHY EVENT Six Wrestlers

Karl Gray Joe Lynam
Jack Kiser Bulldog Jackson
Joe Wolf Ike Cazell

Wrestling, Roseburg Armory, Sat., Aug. 24, 8:30 P. M.

JUST ARRIVED AT WARDS

Cast Aluminum
SAUCEPANS
3-Qt. with Cover
4.95
9" Skillet with Cover
4.95

Cheny Coke
PLASTIC PURSES
4.98
(Plus Tax)

Men's
All-Wool
Sleeveless Sweaters
4.49

Women's
White Anklets
20¢ pr.

MONTGOMERY WARD

315-317 N. JACKSON ST.

Phone 95

"GOODWORD" GARY'S GABFEST



Our store IS modern, and we try to keep it that way--our stocks are of the best, and reasonably priced--our service is rapid, our clerks courteous and helpful--stop in at Grimm's today!

FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE — FREE DELIVERY

OPEN
EVENINGS



GRIMM'S Grocery
PHONE 690 ROSEBURG

OPEN
SUNDAYS

JUST NORTH OF DEER CREEK BRIDGE

Here's the more "powerful" Motor Oil to go with today's more powerful gasolines



CHANCES ARE you're driving more miles—at higher speeds—calling upon your "veteran" engine for extra all-around performance.

To help meet these stresses, new Golden Shell Motor Oil is fortified. It has an oxidation inhibitor, added during manufacture, to fight gum, lacquer and sludge—enemies of good lubrication. New Golden Shell Motor Oil stays free flowing, full bodied, and efficient from one oil drain to the next.

Doesn't it make good sense to protect the working parts of your engine with this improved oil? Ask the man at the Shell Pump for Golden Shell, largest selling 25¢ Motor Oil in the West.