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NOTICE OF FINAL HEARING
NOTICE HEREBY IS given that Julyat tVia hniie. 1A MIMW a u

in the County Court Room, at the Couri
House In Roseburg, Douglas County.
Oregon, has been fixed as the time and
place for hearing objections, if anymere oe, to tne final account filed bythe underalffnea evavurriv In th ahnvn
entitled court.

ROBERTA KESTER, Executrix
of the Last Will and Testament
of R. L. McLaughlin, Deceased.

NOTICE OF ADMINISTRATOR'S SALEur kisaIj rKurEKTi
NOTICE is hereby riven that under

and pursuant to an Order of the County
Court of the State of Oregon for Doug
las county, auiy made ana entered of
record in the matter ot the Estate of
Catherine B. Schusler, deceased, au
thorising the undersigned as adminis-
trator de bonis non of the estate of
said deceased to sell the real property
hereinafter described.

NOW. THEREFORE. L J. V. Long, as
such administrator de bonis non, will
at the law offices of Rice, Orcutt &
Long in Roseburg. Douglas County. Ore
gon, on and after the 8th day of July,
1946, offer for sale and sell at private
sale for cash In hand, subject to con-
firmation by the court, the following
ojsjriDcojujjropi

Notice of Timber Sale
Sealed bids, marked outside

Bid for Timber," and addressedto the Chief Forester, O. and C.
Administration, 901' Guardian
Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will
be received until and opened at
10:30 A. M., Pacific Standard
Time, July 9, 1946, for the pur-
chase of timber upon tracts here-
inafter described; each bid must
state the amount per M. feet
B. M., which will be offered for
each species and the total consid-
eration which will be paid for the
timber. No bid for less than the
appraised value will be consider-
ed. Each bid must be submitted
in duplicate and be accompanied
bv a deposit in the form of a cer-
tified check in favor of the Treas-
urer of the United States. The de-
posit of anv successful bidder will
be credited on the contract. Pay-
ment in full at the time of filing
the contract is required in sales
amounting to S2.500.00 or less.
For copies of the form of pro-
posal, form of contract and bond,
terms of payment, amount of de-

posit required with bid, amount
of bond required with contract
and other information, applica- -

RODEO THRILLERS Typical of action to be seen Saturday and
Sunday at the Douglas County Sheriff Posse rodeo is the above
photo, which will be duplicated many times over in the County
Fair Grounds arena during the two-da- y performance.

CHERRY GROWERS ATTENTION

The Roseburg Canning Co. will start

receiving cherries Monday, June

24th. They must be ripe. If in

doubt present sample.

SUMMONS
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF TBS

STATE OF OREGON FOR
DOUGLAS COUNTY

ROBERT ANLAUF, Plaintiff,
VS. ,

BOBBIE MAXINE ANLAUF. Defendant
To BOBBIE MAXINE ANLAUF. the

above named defendant:
IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF

OREGON: You are hereby required to
appear and answer the Complaint of
plaintiff filed against you in the above
entitled court and cause on or before
four 14) weeics from tne aate ox the
first publication of this Summons, and
if you fail to so an Dear and answer
said Complaint, plaintiff for want there-
of will apply to the court for the relief
demanded In aald Complaint, a succinct
statement or wnicn is as xouows; ror

decree dissolving the marriaae con
tract existing between nlaintlff and
defendant,

This Summons is served noon vou bv
publication once each week for four
successive weeks In the Roseburg

by order of the Honorable Carl
B. Wimberly, Judge of the above en-
titled court, made on the 29th day of
May, 1046, and the time provided in
said order for defendant to appear and
answer plaintiff's Complaint is on or
Detore lour () weens from tne aate of
tne lira dud. .cation or this summons.

The date of first publication of this
summons is may ai, ltMo.

RIICE. ORCUTT & LONG,
Attorneys for Plaintiff.
Post Office Address:
Roseburg, Oregon.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All oersoni having claims asalnst the

estate of Elmer L. Bashford now pend-
ing in the County Court of the State
of Oregon for Douglas County, are here-
by notified to nresent the same Dronerly
verified to the undersigned at the offices
or Mice, urcutt at uong in Koseourg,
Douglas County, Oregon, within six
months from the 34th day of May, 1946.

A. W. BASHFORD, Executor
of the Last Will and Testa-
ment of Elmer I. Bashford,
deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All nersons having claims against the

Estate of Katherlna Vuorhles. deceased.
now Dendlna in the County Court of
uougias ouniy, uregon, are nereoy
notified to present the same, verified
as required by law, to the undersignedat the office of Paul S. Geddes, At-
torney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six
months from tlie date hereof.

Dated this 31st day of May, 1946.
ERNEST VOORHIES, Executor
of the Last Will and Testament
of Katherlna Voorhics, de
ceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
VOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that

Mat.'.'uerlte Stevens has been duly ap-

poir.ieo. ana nai quauiiea u ntxecuinx
of the last will and testament and es
tate or wiuiam Hoeiwe, deceased, ana

ill persons navine claims against saia
estate are hereby notified to present the
same, verified as required by law, with
iroper voucners. to saia executrix at
he law office of William G. East, Wal

ling Building, Eugene, Oregon, within
six months from the date of the first
publication of this notice.

uaiea June Jin, iwn.
MARGUERITE STEVENS, Ex-
ecutrix of the Estate of Wil-
liam Hoeltke, deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the

estate of Frank W. Br amhall, deceased,
now pending in the County Court of
the State of Oregon, for the County of
Douglas, are hereby notified to present
the same to the undersigned at the
office of Ira B. Riddle, attorney, room
zz facmo .tsuiiaina, ttoseourg, uregon,
verified as reaulr by law within six
months from the date hereof.

Dated this 2Qth day of April, 1040.
E. E. Hart, Administrator of
the Estate of Frank W. Bram-hal- l,

deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims against the

Estate of James T. Hart, deceased, now
ponding In the County Court of Doug-
las County, Oregon, are hereby notified
to present the same, verified as re-

quired by law, to the undersigned at
the office of William D. Green, Jr., At-
torney. 208-- Doualas Countv State Bank
Building, Roseburg, Oregon, within six
monins from tne ante nereor.

Dated this 24th day of May. 1040:
DAYTON W. HART, Adminis-
trator of the Estate of James

nan,

Rawrvationa for prlvata
SKATING PARTIES

ars available at the
Rainbow Skating Rink

Winchester

Cream Shippers
SHIP YOUR CREAM TO

DOUGLAS COUNTY
CREAMERY

MAKERS OF
MEL-O-MAI- D

BUTTER AND
ICE CREAM

Jackson and Douglas
Telephone 340

Agents for DeLaval
Cream Separators

and Milkers

Top Prices Paid

COST ONLY

BBACLEnAIX FINISH

Umpqua Valley Hardware
202 N. Jackson Phone 71
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tion should be made to the ad-

dress shown above. IN DOUGLAS
COUNTY: T. 25 S., R. 2 W., Sec.
15, all merchantable timber desig-
nated for cuttin" on the NJ NW1,
estimated for the Durpose of this
sale to be 1Y55 M. feet Douglas
fir, 170 M. feet stamped Sugar
Pine, 10 M. feet White Fir, 20 M.
feet Western Red Cedar. 15 M.
feet Incense Cedar. No bid for
less than $4.75 per M. ft. B. M.
for the Douelas Fir. $10.35 Der M.
ft. B. M. for the stamped Supar
Pine. $2.25 per M. ft. B. M. for
the White Fir, Western Red Ce-

dar, and Incense Cedar, or a total
purchase price of $10,197.00, will
be considered. T. 25 S., R. 2 W.,
Sec. 31, all merchantable- timber
designated for cutting on the
NW1NEJ and SJNEi, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
3735 M. feet Douglas fir, 565 M.
leet stamped sugar Pine, is M.
leet western Kcd cedar, 30 M.
feet Hemlock, 20 M. feet White
Fir, 25 M. feet Incense Cedar. No
bid for less than $4.40 Der M. ft.
B. M. for the Douglas fir, $10.95
per M. ft. B. M. for the stamped
Sugar Pine, $2.25 per M. ft. B. M.
lor the Western Ked Cedar. Hem-
lock, White Fir. and Incense Ce-

dar, or a total purchase price of
$22,823.25, will be considered.
Unly tnose Pine trees stampea
uSOC are to be cut. The area is
to be logged by use of Caterpillar-tvn- e

tractor equipment except
where otherwise authorized by
the oitlcer in charge of the sale.
T. 25 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 1, all mer
chantable timber designated for
cutting on Lot 3 (NE.WW1), lot
4 (NW1NW1), and SW1NW1, es-

timated for the purpose of this
sale to be 2405 M. feet Douglas
fir, 220 M. feet White Fir, 15 M.
feet Hemlock. 255 M. feet In
cense Cedar. 20 M. feet Western
Red Cedar. No bid for less than
$3.70 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Douglas fir, S2.25 per M. ft. B. M.
for the White Fir, Hemlock, In-

cense Cedar, and Western Red
Cedar, or a total purchase price
of S10.046.00, will be considered.
Logging is to be done with Caterpil-
lar-type tractor unless other-
wise authorized by the officer in
charge of the sale. T. 32 S., R. 1
W.. Sec. 17. all merchantable tim- -
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And With Quality We Combine That Other

Ingredient of a Good Grocery Service

JUST PHONE

YOUR ORDER

CITATION
No. S83

IN THE COUNTY COURT Or THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR

DOUGLAS COUNTY
In the Matter of the Guardlanihlp

IDA F. HOLDRIDGB,
An Intnmnplent Pernn.

TO: The unknown n of the
eld Ida F. Holdridge:IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF

OREGON. You are hereby cited and
reauired to aDoear In the Cnuntv Court
of the State of Oregon for Douglaa
County, within four weeks from Uie
date of the first publication of this cl- -
uttion to snow cause, n any exists, wnyan order of the above entitled court
should not be entered authorizing Mabel
Baylos, guardian of Ida F. HnldHdge. an
incompetent person, to sell the real
property of said estate, described as
follows,

Lot 5. Block 7. Waite's Addition
to the City of Rosehurg. Doupl-'-
County. Oregon, as the same ap-
pears of record and on plat ot su.d
Addition, and of record In the office'
of the County Clerk of said county.Lot 11. Block 84, Fourth South
Addition to the City of Roseburg,
Douglas County. Oregon, as the same
appears of record and on plat of
sold Addition, and of record In the
ofiice of the County Clerk of aaid
county,as prayed for In the petition ot said

guardian on file herein.
WITNESS the Hnnnrnhln Ti Tff Sntan.

bark. Judse of the above ntltlri
with the seal of said court affixed this

aay 01 June,
U. n. DUaGNBARK,Cnuntv JtiriaM.

Attest: ROY AGEE.
County Clerk.

First Oubllshed this Slat dav nt June.
1946.

NOTICE FOR BIDS
FOR SCHOOL BONDS OF

SCHOOL DISTRICT NO.
ALSO KNOWN AS NO. 1ft.

DOUGLAS COUNTY, OREGON
Notice Ik herehv fflvn that tti unrinr.

signed will up to 7:30 o'clock P. M, on
the 3rd day of July. 1048, receive at the
high school building In the Town of
Myrtle Creek, Oregon, sealed bids for
the purchase of negotiable, serial, cou-
pon bonds of School District No. 19--

niiuwn an acaooi uisinci no. 1W.
In Douslas Countv. Oretrnn. In the iiim
of JrBS.oou.00. Said bonds will be In de-
nominations of $1,000.00 each, all dated
August 1, 1946, maturing seven bonds
annuauy, commencing August 1, 1948,
until and including Ausust 1. 1058. and
eight bonds maturing August 1, 1059.

oaia Donas win a raw interest at tnerate to be specified by the successful
oiauer, payaDie on eD-

ruory 1 and August 1, and the orinclDal
and intercut shall be payable at the of
iice oi tne Treasurer or uougias county,
Oregon, or at the Fiscal Auencv of the
State of Oregon in the City and State
of New York, at the option of the pur- -
cnaaer. au dios must oe accompaniea
by a certified check payable to School
District No. In Douslas County.
Oregon, in an amount equal to 5 of
the bid, to be forfeited to the school
district In case the successful bidder
shall fail to complete the purchase of
said bonds in accordance with the terms
ot nis bid.

Said- bids shall bo onened at a nubile
meeting of the school board to be held
in the hlHh school bulldina in the Tnwn
of Myrtle Creek In said district on the
3rd day of July. 1046. at 7:30 o'clock
P. M., or at any legal adjournment of
said meeting, and the bonds shall be
sold by the board to the highest and
oest omaer, out ror not less man par
and accrued Interest. The board reserves
the riant to refuse any and all bids
and to the sale of said bids.

By order of the Board of Directors of
school District No. 19-- also known i
No. 10, in Douglas County, Oregon.

i'. a. rroenitcn,District Clerk of School
District No. 19-- also
known as No, 19, Douglas

county, tjrtJKon.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
Notice is hereby given that the under

signed executor or tne Jbast wm ana
Testament of John a. Rondeau.
ceased, has filed in the County Court
of the State of Oregon for Douglas
County his Final Account In settle
ment of said estate and Tuesday, the
ltith day of July, 1040, at 10 o'clock
A. M. In the County Court Room In the
Court House in Roseburg. Douglas
County, Oregon, has been fixed as the
time and place for hearing objections,
if any there be, to said Final Account
ana for the settlement tHereof.

WALTER RONDEAU, Executor
of the Lata Will and Testa
ment of John B, Rondeau, de-
ceasea.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
Notice Is hereby aiven that the under

signed executrix of the Last Will and
Testament of W. R. Buck, deceased, has
filed In the County Court of the State
of Oregon for Douglas County, her Final
Account in settlement of said estate and
Tuesday, the 0th day of July. 1946, at
10 o'clock A. M. in the County Court
Room in the Court House In Roseburg,
Douglas County, Oregon, has been fixed
as the time and place for hearing ob-

jections, if any there be, to said Final
Account and for the settlement thereof.

MARY C. FURBER, Executrix
of the Last Will and Testa- -
ment of W. R. Buck, deceased.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
Notice is hereby given that the under-

signed executor of the Last Will and
Testament of Eva J. Jones, deceased, has
filed In the County Court of the State
of Oregon for Douglas County, his Final
Account in settlement of said estate, and
Tuesday, the 9th day of July, 1940, at
10 o'clock A. M. in the County Court
Room in the Court House in Roseburg.
Douglas County, Oregon, has been fixed
as the time and place for hearing ob-

jections, if any there be. to said Final
Account and fore the settlement thereof.

DALLEN HALL JONES. Exec-
utor of the Last Will and Tes-
tament of Eva J. Jones, de-
ceased.

soothes away the petti--

minutes each day with

The Southeast Quarter (SE) of
Section Twenty-eig- (28), Township
20, South Range 8 West, Willamette
Meridian, Douglas County Oregon,
and containing 160 acres more or

J. V. LONG, Administrator de
bonis non of the Estate of
Catherine B. Schusler, de-
ceased.

Official

RODEO
DANCE

Saturday Night
Armory .

Starts About 9:43

QUALITY

ALWAYS

WE DELIVER
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CITATION
No. 4804

IN THE COUNTY COURT OF THE
STATE OF OREGON FOR THJS

COUNTY OF DOUGLAS
In the- Matter of the Guardianship-of the RcLftte nf

WDYNDTRED BARRY, a person Incapable
oi cui.auc.ng ner own aiiairs.

To ALICE MEAGHER, only known next
oi Kin oi ine auove nar.iea wara,
and all other persons interested In
the guardianship estate of W1NNI-FRE-

BARRY, ward above named,
if any there be:

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF
OREGON. You are hereby commanded
to appear in the Department of Probate
of the County Court of the State of
Oregon in and for the County of Doug-
las, at the Court House In the City of
Roseburg, Oregon, on the 8th day of
July, 1946, at the hour of 0:30 o'clock
A. M. of said day. to show cause, if
any exists, why a license should not be
gramca to this unueu siAits NA-
TIONAL BANK OF PORTLAND (ORE-
GON), guardian of the above named
ward, to sell the real property belong-
ing to the estate of WINNIFRED
oAkki, a person mcapaoie oi conaucv
lng her own affairs,

Carry County, Oregon
Lot Four 14). Section seven ai.

Township Thirty-si- x (36), South,
Range Thirteen. W.W.M.

Lot One (1), Section Eighteen (18),
Township Thirty-si- x (361 South,
Range Thirteen (13), W.W.M.

East half (EVj of Southeast quar-
ter (SEV), Section Twelve (121,
Township Thirty-si- x (36) South,
Range Fourteen (14), W.W.M.

Northeast quarter NEli, Sectlonr
Thirteen (13), Township Thirty-si- x

(361 South, Range Fourteen (14),
W.W.M.

Washington County, Oregon
Lots Twenty (20), Twenty-on- e f2H,

Twwnty-tw- o (22) and Twenty-thre- e

(23), Block Sixteen (16), Portland
HelghU No. 3

or such portion thereof as may be nec-
essary, at private sale and for cash, for
the purposes of paying the costs and ex-

penses of the ward and medical care
and hospitalization of said ward, and
to pay the costs and expenses of the
administration of the guardianship.

By virtue of an order of this Court
made and entered on the 31st day of
May. 1046, this citation li served upon
you who are residents of the State of
Oregon by personal service and upon
you who are of the State
of Oregon by publication thereof In the
Roseburg a newspaper of
general circulation published In the
County of Douglas. State of Oregon, not
less than once a week for four (4) con-
secutive weeks from the date of first
Dublicotlon thereof.

WITNESS my hand and seal of said
court anixea tnts aist any or May, xvw.

Clerk of the County Court
Date of first publication, June 7, 1046.
uate or last dudi cat on. juiy o. iimo.

HALL. CALDWELL Ac ROEHR.
374 U. S. Bank Building,
Portland 4, Oregon,
Attorneys for Guardian.

SUMMONS
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE

STATE OF OREGON FOR
DOUGLAS COUNTY

ARTHUR J. FAWCETT and VERL V.
FAWCETT. Husband and wifo.

Plaintiffs,
vs.

Thomas E. Lawson. T. F. Atterberry,
Jane Doe Mynatt, wife of William
K, Mynatt: William R. Mynatt,
Mary A. Levens, widow of D. D.
Levens. Deceased: Grant Levens,
Jane Doe Overs treet, wife of James
Overstreet; Jane Doe Hansen, wife
of Kennedy H. Hansen: Louis An
toine, J. O. Lystul, Howard Lystul,
Frances I. Levens, widow of U.
Levens, Deceased; the unknown
heirs of each of the above named
Defendants, who may be dead, and
all other persons and parties un'
known, claiming any right, title,
estate, lien or interest In or to the
hereinafter described real property
or any Dart thereof. Defendants.

Greeting: To each of the above named
Defendants:

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF
OREGON, You and each of you are
hereby summoned and required to ap-
pear In the above entitled court and
cause and answer the Complaint filed
against you therein within four 4)
weeks from and after June 14th, 1046,
the date of the first publication of this
Summons, and If you fail to appear
within the time as aforesaid the Plain-
tiffs will apply to the court for the re-
lief prayed for therein, viz: For a De-
cree quieting title against the Defend-
ants and each of them to lands described
as:

The Southeast Quarter of the
Northwest Quarter of the North-
east Quarter of the Southwest Quar
ter; the Northeast Quarter of the
Northwest Quarter and Lots 3, 4,
9 and 0 In Section 30, Township 3a
South, Range 8 West of the Wi-
llamette Meridian, Douglas County,
Oregon;

and barring and enjoining the Defend-
ants and each of them and all persons
claiming by, through or under them
from asserting any Interest In the above
described lands adverse to the Plaintiffs.

This summons is published by order
of the Honorable Carl Wimberly, Judge
of the Circuit Court of Douglas County,
Oregon, dated the 13th day of June,
1046, ordering publication horeof for
four consecutive and successive weeks,
the date of tho first publication hereof
being June 14th, liMfl.

SHERMAN S. SMITH.
Attorney for Plaintiffs,
108 Uj So. 6th Street,
Grants Pass, Oregon.

NOTICE OF FINAL ACCOUNT
Notice Is hereby given that the undcr- -

fiiod' fn the County Court of Douglas
oumy nis iinai account an sucn aninm-istrat-

of the estate of Gene Richard
Rachor, deceased, and that 10 o'clock
A. M., July 13, 1B46, in the County
Courtroom in the Courthouse at Rose-
burg, Oregon, has been set as the time
and place for hearing objections, if any,
to said final account and tho settlement
of said estate.

FRANK RACHOR, Administra-
tor de bonis non. Estate of
Gene Richard Rachor, De-
ceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
AH persons having claims against the.

estate of J. J. Whisler, deceased, now
pending In the County Court of the
State of Oregon are hereby notified to
present tho same to the undersigned
duly verified, at the offices of Rice,
Orcutt & Long In Roseburg, Douglas
County, Oregon, within six months from
May 31, 1.MU.

NAOMI ELDER. Administra-
trix with the Will annexed of
the estate of J. J. Whisler, de-
ceased.
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ber designated for cutting on the
NW1, estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 3885 M. feet
Douglas fir, 210 M. feet stamned
Ponderosa Pine, 155 M. feet
stamped Sugar Pine, 230 M. feet
White Fir, 325 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than $3.40

M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas?er $7.65 per M. ft. B. M. for the
stamped Ponderosa Pine, $9.70
per M. ft. B. M. for the stamped
Sugar Pine, S2.25 per M. ft.
B. M. for the White Fir, $2.50 per
M. ft. B. M. for the Incense Ce-

dar, or a total purchase price of
S17.649.00, will be considered.
univ those Pine trees stamped
USOC are to be cut. The area is
to be logged by use of Caterpillar-typ- e

tractor equipment unless
otherwise authorized by the offi-
cer in charge of the sale. All tim
ber cut from the above described
areas must be manufactured in
the local marketing area desig-
nated by the O. and C. Adminis-
tration unless otherwise author-
ized by the Chief Forester. If the
unit prices bid are above those au-
thorized bv MPR 460, they will be
reduced to the maximum permit-
ted under that order. In case of
two or more identical bids for the
same timber, the successful bid-

der will be selected on the basis
of ability to further the objec-
tives of the Act of August 28,
1937. The right is hereby reserv-
ed to waive technical defects in
this advertisement; to refect all
bids, or to award the timber for
the amount of the highest bid to
other than the highest bidder
when necessary, pursuant to the
Act or August 6, 193Y oo stat,
!74). in order to provide a con
tinued supply of timber to local
industry so as to assure the per
manence of the communitv which
is dependent upon such industry.
Dated at Portland, Oregon, this
31st day of .Mav, 1946, W. H.
Horning, Chief Forester," O. arid
C. Administration.

LEOAL NOTICE

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
Notice li hereby slven thnt the un-

denri Rned administrator han filed In the
County Court of the Slate of Oregon
for Dou sins County, hl final account
In settlement of the 6state of Edward
Lee Smith, deceased, and the court has
aoDointcd Monday June 34th. iD4fi.
10 o'clock A. M. In the County Court
room in tnc uourt House in noacDurtr,
Douglas County,- Oregon, as the time
and place for hearing objections, If any,
to said final account end the lettlement
of said estate.

iiAKvai w, ami i n, flamin- -
ifltrator of the Estate of. Ed-
ward Lee Smith, Deceased.

NOTICE OF FINAL BKTTLEMENT
NOTICE If hereby slcvn that Monday

the 22nd day of July. 11146, at 10 o'clock
A. M. in the' County Court room in the
Court House In Roseburg, Oregon, have
oecn nxea aj tne time ana place or
hedrlng objection, If any there be, to
the final account of the undersigned
filed tn the County Court of the State
oi uregon, for uougias county.

ISAAC riiANARY, Adminis
trator of the estate of Bessie
Cain, deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITOR!
All Demons having claims asalnst the

estate of Caroline M. Walsh, deceased.
now pending In the ounty court of
Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby
notified to present the same verified as
required by law to the undersigned at
the office of Rice, Orcutt & Long,
Roseburg, Oregon, within tlx months
from tne date hereof.

Sated this. 14th day of June. lV4fl.
J. V. LONG, Administrator of

ine j&siaie oi uaroiino M.
wnisn, Qprcnscd.
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Music calms the mind,

FRIDAY

NIGHT ONLY
JUNE 21

Concrete Pipe Concrete Blocks

Bulk Concrete Delivered to Your Job

When you start building and need concrete call

us for service

REDY MIX CONCRETE CO.
Phone 620

RODEO EVE
NCEDA

Featuring

.$Vf-- fa Tiny and His Wranglers

AT THE.

ROSEBURG ARMORY

ass - lmk
EAU DE C0L0G5EI

f

.
- 11 size

NOW
Also 2 izo at

Untiled time

Sponsored

DANCING 9-- 1

by Jr. Chamber of
. nesseg and childish squabbles of day to day busi- -

nes. Let us spend a lewifiower. Keeps youSefreshing at a summer

feeling frosty-co- ond fragrant on the

hottest days. Big, handsome bottle of Tussy'f

deliriously scented cologne. Get yours today!

ourselves, divorced from the present, and decide
the path we are traveling.

Fronk W. Long Jewell A. Long
Managers

' A. F. "Tony" Shuklt, Embalmttr

AMBULANCE SERVICE

' DOUGLAS FUNERAL HOME

DOOR PRIZES INCLUDE:

Nylon Hose Bacon Wrisrwarch Alarm Clock Gasoline

And Many Others

In three faetovt

Tussy fragrances!
Mountain Laurels

Early Iris,

Ginger Spice.
Pin and Lant Sts. Phonal 12

Roseburg, OregonFullerton Drug
Rexall Store -


