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til they find another location.
Skiing Planned on r f:

3735 M. feet Douglas fir. 5G5 M.
feet stamped Suear Pine, 15 M.
feet Western Red Cedar, 30 M.
feet Hemlock. 20 M. feet White

DAILY DEVOTIONAL

DR. CHARLES A. EDWARDSSociety and Clubs
By LOTUS KNICHT PORTER

Double Wedding Takes Place May 24

thorized bv MPR 460, they will be
reduced to the maximum permit-
ted under that order. In case ot
two or more identical bids for the
same timber, the successful bid-
der will be selected on the basis
of ability to further the objec-
tives of the Act of August 28,
1937. The right is hereby reserv-
ed to waive technical defects in
this advertisement; to reject all
bids, or to award the timber for
the amount of the highest bid to
other than the highest bidder
when necessary, pursuant to the
Act of August 28, 1937 ( 50 Slat.
b74), in order to provide a con-
tinued supply of timber to local
industry so as to assure the per-
manence of the community which
is dependent upon such industry.
Dated ut Portland, Oregon, this
31st day of Mav, 194U. W. H.
Horning, Chief Forester, O. and
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TENMILE COMMUNITY
CIRCLE HAS MEETING

TENMILE Tenmile Commun-
ity Circle held their regular meet-

ing at the attractive home of Mrs.
Stocking on Wednesday May 29
with a large crowd of members
and friends present. The affair
was also a household shower
for Mrs. Avis Birman, recent
bride, formerly Avis Sarrison,
who reecived many lovely gifts.
The two previous meetings of the
club had been held at the home of
Mrs. Bert Mellius in Reston where
a lovely quilt, which had been do-

nated by one of the members,
and quilted by the club, was sold
and won by Warren Lockwood, re-

turned service man. A small quilt
has lately been sent to the Shrine
Hospital for crippled children, at
Portland and another will soon
be ready. Twelve complete cush-
ions were sent to the veterans hos-
pital in Portland and twenty-fiv-

cushion covers to the veterans
hospital at Roseburg by this
group in recent weeks. Mrs. Cecil
Carrol invited the club to her
home to a shower for Mrs.
Dorene Weber, nee Henry, on
Wednesday afternoon, June 5,
and the next regular meeting of
the club will be at the home of
Mrs. R. D. Lockwood on Wednes-
day, June 12, when the Camas
Valley Garden Club members will
be guests of the Tenmile group.
PAST MATRONS CLUB
IS ENTERTAINED

The Past Matrons Club of Rose-
burg Chapter No. , O. E. S. met
at the home of Mrs. V. J. Micelli
on Monday evening, June 3, for
a 7:30 dessert-suppe- r with Mrs.
R. L. Whipple as assisting hos-
tess. The large serving table was
centered with a lovelv arrange
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Both photos by Clark's Studio
Mr. and Mrs.

Joyce Jacobson, daughter of
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Thomas, Scotts-burg- ,

and Milo Laharty, son of
Catherine Kennedy, Roseburg,
were married in a double ring
ceremony with Marlis Vang,
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Art
Reitmann Sutherlin. pnd Lloyd
Hill, son of Mr. and Mrs. Earl
Hill, Rospbure, at St. Paul's Lu-
theran Church. Friday evening,
May 24. Rev. W. A. Sylwester per-
formed the imnressive ceremony
at seven o'clock in the presence
of relatives and friends of the
two coudIcs.

Roses formed the very beauti

Reedsport Dunes
REEDSPORT Just as soon

full information can be re
ceived and equipment ordered, the
sport of sand skiing will be in-

augurated on the sand dunes in
the vicinity of Reedsport, and a
new sport will be introduced on
the second largest sand dunes in
the United Slutes, located Just
southwest of this oily in the Light
House State Park.

These dunes are under constant
study by the University of Minne
sota and monthlv measurements
of their shifting are recorded and
sent to ihe university.

R. D. Burling, a local young
man who during the war was in
the Army ski troops with service
in Ilaly and other European
mountain battle fields, is to have
charge of the experiment under
the sponsorship of the Reedsport
Chamber of Commerce.

As soon as data can be secured
and the proper equipment In-

stalled, fun loving sportsmen can
receive instructions in skiing and
enjoy the fun right on the sand
dune beaches of Douglas County,
in the salt breeze of the wide Pa-
cific, in the summer sun, without
danger of frost bites, chilblain's
or snow blindness.

Yoncalla
YONCALLA Mr. and Mrs. T.

H. Burton have sold their larpe
ranch north of town, to a family
from California. The Burtons left
Saturday for McMinnvillc, where
they will visit for a couple of
weeks before starting out with
their trailer house to find a suit
able location to live.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Boueock and
three children left Wednesday
nicht for Canada. Mr. Boueock
will go as far as Vancouver. B. C.
with his family, returning home
Sunday. Mrs. Boueock and their
children will o on to Calgary,
where they will visit Mrs. s

parents for two months.
Mr. and Mrs. Bragg and famil"

left Thursday to make their home
in California.

Mr. and Mrs. H. L. Stonaker
spent Memorial Day with rela
tives In Grants Pass.

Mr. and Mrs. R. W. Davis of
Eugene spent Memorial Day here
visiting at the Sam Walkinshaw
home.

Mrs. Shoenberg and daughter,
May Margaret, left Saturday for
a two weeks' vacation to the
coast, and at Albany. Mrs. Shoen-
berg is commercial teacher in
Yoncalla High School.

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Parsons
and their daughter. Lucy Ann,
will leave this week for a two
weeks' trip to Sacramento, Calif.,
where thev will meet Mrs. Par
son s mother from Tennessee.

Miss Ethel Woolev. home eco
nomics teacher, will spend two
weeks with her parents at Smith
River before going to summer
school.

At a meetin" of the Havhurst
school board, Mrs. Loy Ehrlick
was elected teacher for the com-
ing year.

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Britt
and family have moved into the
Percy Langdon house.

Mr .and Mrs. Tom Russell have
moved to Nvssa to make their
home. Mr. and Mrs. Joe Marsh
and daughter have moved into
the house left vacant by the Rus
sell family.

Jack Brown of Sutherlin is put
ting in a mill on the Conner
place near tikneao.

Raymond Britt and Merle Bab- -

cock are logging on the Ray Lam- -

berson and George Langdon
ranches.

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Kelso sold
their trailer house and are mak-
ing their home with the Ed Kelso
family for the present. They pur-
chased a large garage from Mr.
and Mrs. Tom Palmer and have
moved it across the street on a
lot purchased from Mr. and Mrs.
Crow. Mr. Crow is remodeling
the garage and will add another
room and bath room, making it
a three-roo- cottage with bath.

Sutherlin
SUTHERLIN Mr. and Mrs. W.

C. Weaver, shopped and transact-
ed business In Roseburg Satur-
day.

Billy Trozolle of the Army
spent a few days in Sutherlin
this week visiting with his par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Paul Trozelle,
and friends. He will then report
at Seattle, where he expects to
receive his discharge.

Mr. and Mrs. Richard King who
have sold their property to D. L.
Davidson, have moved to Scotts
Valley, where they will reside un- -

Who
Said

It's always so hard to
find something for
father? Don't vou be-
lieve it. From keytaln-er- s

to diamond rings,
vou'll find m a n v
things to please Fath-
er at Williams Jew-

elry. Why not all chip
in and give him a
humdinger this year?
He rates it, doesn't
he?

301 N. Jackson St.
Across from
Star Theatre

C. S. 1 nomas, who has been
visiting with his sons, Robert,
Wilt and William, and tneir fami
lies, returned to his home in
California last week.

The state highway repaired sev
eral bad places on West Central
Avenue Monday, and are gravel-
ing west across the S. P. tracks
and will oil the road for about
two miles.

Mr. and Mrs. Claude Petty and
children have moved to Yoncalla,
Ore., where they will make their
home and Mr. Petty has accented
employment.

Mr. anil Mrs. i',u Alien nave
purchased the new residence
built by Floyd Souier on East
Third avenue and took possession
Mopdav.

Mrs. Maude Vogelpohl, who has
ueen very ill, is reported as much
better and is able to be out again.

Miss Virginia Norris has ac-

cepted emolovment at Wofford's
Super Creamed, and began her
duties last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Pierce Jones, Jr.,
and children. Dennis and Mary,
of Blue Hill, Nebraska, are visit-
ing at the home of Mrs. P. A.
Comstock for a couple of weeks.
Mrs. Comstock is an uunt of Mrs.
Jones.

Mrs. Blanche Mecham of Myr-ty- e

Point spent a few clays In
Sutherlin last week visiting at
the home of Mr. and Mrs. A. L.
Wade and Mr. and Mrs. Edgar
Slack.

Pvt. and Mrs. L. A. Cooper, Jr.,
and daughter, of Fort Lewis,
Wash., visited In Sutherlin last
week with Mrs. Cooper's mother,
Mrs. Herman Hugh, and other
relatives and friends.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Braunenger
and daughter, Barbara, left Sat-

urday for Baker, Ore., where they
will attend a grange convention
as delegates from the Sutherlin
Grange.

Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Maine of
Silverdale, Wash., spent last
weekend with Mr. and Mrs. J. L.

Himelwright. This is the first
time Mrs. Maine and Mrs. Himel-

wright had been together in sev-
en years. They were schoolmates
when girls in school.

Mr. and Mrs. George Bailey,
former residents of Sutherlin,
spent several days in this city last
week visiting with friends.

Jimmy Payne of the Navy ar-
rived home "the forepart of last
week to spend a leave visiting
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Wilbur Payne, and sister, Evelyn.

Lloyd Thornton of the Navy,
who is stationed at San Diego,
Calif., was home over the week-
end visiting with his parents, Mr.
and Mrs. Carl Thompson, and
other relatives and friends.

Notice of Timber Sale
Sealed bids, marked outside

"Bid for Timber," and addressed
to the Chief Forester, O. and C.
Administration, 901 Guardian
Buildine. Portland 4. Oregon, will
be received until and opened at
10:30 A. M., Pacific Standard
Time, June 11, 194B, for the pur
chase of timber upon tracts here
inafter described; each bid must
stute the amount per M. feet
B. M.. which will be offered lot
each species and the total consid-
eration which will be paid for the
timber. No bid for less than the
appraised value will be consider-
ed. Each bid must be submitted
in duplicate and be accompanied
ov a deposit in the form of a cer-
tified check in favor of the Treas-
urer of the United States. The de- -

of any successful bidder willEosit on the contract. Pay-
ment in full at the time of filing
the contract Is required in sales
amounting to $2,500.00 or less.
For copies of the form of

form of contract and bond,
terms of payment, amount of de-

posit required with bid, amount
of bond required with contract
and other information,, applica-
tion should be made to the ad-

dress shown above. IN DOUGLAS
COUNTY: T. 25 S., R. 2 W., Sec.
15, all merchantable timber desig-
nated for cuttin- - on the N4 NWJ.
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be lo5 M. feet Douglas
fir, 170 M. feet stamped Sugar
Pine, 10 M. feet White Fir, 20 M.
feet Western Red Cedar. 15 M.
feet Incense Cedar. No bid for
less than $4.75 per M. ft. B. M.
for the Douglas Fir, $10.35 per M.
ft. B. M. for the stamped Sugar
Pine $2.25 per M. ft. B. M. for
the White Fir, Western Red Ce-

dar, and Incense Cedar, or a total
purchase price of $10,197.00, will
be considered. I. 2.1 s K. i. w.,
Sec. 31, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on "the
NW1NEJ and SJNEJ, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
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Fir, 25 M. feet Incense Cedar. No
bid for less than $4.40 per M. ft.
B. M. for the Douglas fir, $10.95
per M. ft. B. M. for the stamped
Sugar Pine, $2.25 per M. ft. B. M.
for (lie Western Red Cedar. Hem-
lock, White Fir and Incense Ce-

dar, or a total purchase price of
$22,823.25, will be considered.
Only those Pine trees stamped
0.SOC are to be cut. The urea is
to be logged by use of Caterpillar-typ-

trai'lor equipment except
where otherwise authorized by
the officer in charge of the sale.
T. 25 S.. R. 8 W.. Sec. 1. all mer
chantable timber designated for
cutting on Lot 3 INEJNWU, lot
4 INW1NW1), and SWiNWJ. es
timated for the purpose of this
sale to be 2105 M. feet Douglas
fir, 220 M. feet White Fir. 15 M.
feet Hemlock. 255 M. feet iln- -

cense Cedar. 20 M. feet Western
Red Cedar. No bid for less than
$3.70 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Douglas nr, s.M per M. it. a. M.
for the White Fir. Hemlock, In
cense Cedur, and Western Red
Celar or a total purchase price
of $10,040.00. will be considered.
Logginp is to be done with Caterpil-

lar-type tractor unless other-
wise authorized by the officer in
charge of the sale. T. 32 S R. 1

W., Sec. 17, all merchantable tim-
ber designated for cutting on the
INW1, estimated for the nurnose
of this snle to be 3885 M. feet
Douglas fir, 210 M. feet stamoed
Ponderosa Pine, 155 M. feet
stamped Sugar Pine, 230 M. feet
White Fir, 325 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than $3.40
per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas
fir. $7.65 per M. ft. 13. M. for the
stamped Ponderosa Pine, $9.70
per M. ft. B. M. for the stamped
Sugar Pine, $2.25 per W. ft.
B. M. for the White Fir. $2.50 per
M. ft. B. M. for the Incense Ce
dar, or a total purchase price of
S17.G49.00, will be considered.
Onlv those Pine trees stamped
USOC are to be cut. The area is
to be logged by use of Caterpillar-typ- e

tractor eauipment unless
otherwise authorized bv the offi-
cer in charge of the sale. All tim-
ber cut from the above described
areas must be manufactured in
the local marketine area desig-
nated bv the O. and C. Adminis
tration unless otherwise author
ized bv the Chief Forester. If the
unit prices bid are above those au
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A young air force friend was
explaining to me the mysteries
of blind flying, "You feel as if
you were flying backwards," he
said, "and it is hard to believe
the instruments, but they al-

ways guide you truly." Many
of us feel today that we are
moving in the wrong direction,
in fact, believing without see-
ing is the hardest thing we are
called upon to do. We do not
understand the things that are
hupening to us, and we cannot
see always how any good can
come out of them, but we know
that as long as eJsus Christ is
our pilot, and we have put Him
in control of our lives, we shall
come safely through the dark-
est night into the glory of a
new dawn. We can trust in
His guidance. Just as the young
aviator trusts his instruments.
For He always guides us truly.
"Jesus, Saviour pilot me,
Over life's tempestuous sea,
Unknown waves before me roll,
Hiding rocks and treacherous

shoal,
Chart and compass, come from

Thee,
Jesus Saviour pilot me."

Amen

Southern Oregon
Baseball League
Games Scheduled

SOUTHERN OREGON
BASEBALL

LEAGUE STANDINGS
W Pet.

Ashland 3 1.000
Roseburg 2 1.000
Crescent City 1 1.000
Medlord 1 .500
Grants Pass 1 .500
Central Point 1 .500
Canyonville 0 .000
Gold Hill 0 .000

Results June 2.
Roseburg 5. Gold Hill 2: Grants

fass a, canyonville 2; Ashland 5,
Central Point 3; Medford vs.
Crescent City, rained out.
Scheduled Games

Saturday. June 8: Rosebure at
Medford, night game.

Sunday." June 9: Rosebure at
Central Point, Ashland at Grants
Pass, Canyonville at Medford
Gold Hill at Crescent City.

Wilbur
WILBUR Mr. and Mrs. Robert

Newhans of Sandy, Oregon, spent
Sunday visiting Mr. and Mrs. W.
H. Carey, Mrs. Newhaus is a
granddaughter of Mrs. Carey.

Mrs. tine coney ot saiem ar
rived here Sunday to visit her
sister, Mrs. Granville Nye lor a
tew aays.

Mr. and Mrs. Sidney Helllwell
oi Kosenurg spent Tuesday eve
ning at tne home of Mr. and Mrs
Leslie Bramhall.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Sands
left Wednesday for Mitchell, Ore-
pon, to spend a lew days visitingtheir and daughter,
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Howard, and
oaugnter, Vicky Kae.

Mr. and Mrs. Vance left Mon
day for New York to spend their
vacation. He is employed as jani
tor at tne WilDur school and ex-

pects to be back to take over the
Job for next year.

Mr. and Mrs. Ross J. Hutchin
son and granddaughter, Betty
Haines of 'Roseburg were dinner
guests of Mrs. Eva Kinsel Thurs
day.

Mr. and Mrs. Menzie Lee and
family left Monday for Nebraska
to visit their old home and rela
tives in Sheldon during their va
cation. They are driving through
and expect to ne gone six vears.

Those here from a distance for
Decoration Day were Mr. and
Mrs. Dan Todd of Portland, Mr.
and Mrs. Frank Jones. Mr. and
Mrs. Bryan Counte, Mrs. Geor-
giah Staten of Eugene.

Mr. and Mrs. Harvv Carev ar
rived home Sunday morning from
immanuel Mospitat in Portland
where their daughter, Marlyene,
was taking treatment for a dis
located elbow the past week. She
was able to come home with
them

Mrs. Vv. H. Rummell of Dillard
spent a few days last week visit
ing Mrs. D. P. McKay and other
friends. Their son and daughter- -

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Rum
mell, came Sunday for a short
visit. She accompanied them
home.

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Maska re
turned to their home in Salem
Sunday after visiting the latter's
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Vernon
LaRaut, for the past week. Their
small son. h.ddie, remained for a
longer visit with his grandpar-
ents.

Mrs. Rosella Bridge spent the
weekend at Hugo with her son
and daughter-in-law- , Mr. and
Mrs. Ivan Bridee and family.

Miss Mary Ellen McKay and
ner inena, mjss Dorothy Samuel-so-

of Eugene, was visiting rela
tives in wiinur Friday.

DANCE
Every Saturday Night

Evergreen Grange Hall

"Fiddlin' Fools"

Admission

Adults 40c, Tax Includ.
Grad school children 10e

Dancing from 9 to 1

C. Administration.

LOSEE'S
Baby Togs

CI .
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Giffs --7

337 N. Jackson Phone 534-- J

NOW PLAYING

STARTS SUN. !

The Collier's Magazine
Serial
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The Man Who Dared
A NEWSPAPER STORY

Saturday Sunday

Matinee and Evening

Hard Riding
Hard Fisted

Straight Shooting

That's the
Range Busters

in

mm
with

John King
David Sharpe

.Max Terhune

Also

Submarine
Action and Thrills
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Engraving
Milo Laharty.
ful altar decorations. Mrs. Lewis
Wilson was organist and Miss
Elizabeth Peterson, Roseburg,
sang. "O, Perfect Love."

Miss Jacobson and Mr.
were attended by Mr. and

Mrs. Ernie Teague and Marvel
.......111UII1C13 '"vwui

were attendants for the Vang-Hil- l

nuptials.
Receptions were held at the re-

spective homes of the two
couples, after which thev left to-

gether on a short wedding trip.
Mr. and Mrs. Laharty are now re-

siding in Scottsburg and Mr. and
Mrs. Hill are residing in Rose-our-

BERN ICE OLLIVANT AND
DONALD PARKER MARRY

Bernice Ollivant. daughter of
Eugene Ollivant, became the bride
of Donala rarKer Monaay aner- -

noon at the home of Dr. Charles
A. Edwards on South Kane Street.
Mr. and Mrs. R. J. Smith were
attendants.

The bride was lovely in a
fuchsia colored suit with white
accessories and a corsage of
sweetpeas. Mrs. Smith wore a
chartruse colored dress with
brown accessories.

The couple will spend their
honeymoon at coast points of in-

terest, after which they will re-

turn to Roseburg to make their
home. The bride is employed at
the F. W. Woolworth store and
Mr. Parker is employed by Staley
Logging Company.

PYTHIAN SISTERS HOLD
INITIATION WEDNESDAY

Temple No. 23, Pythian Sisters
met Wednesday night at the K.
of P. Hall for initiation of Ruth
Todd of Drain. Plans were made
for the birthday party to be held
June 19 at eight o'clock at the
hall honoring members having
birthdays the last three months.
Special entertainment has been
planned for the occasion.

MARGIE CAROLINE MOORE
AND ISAAC WEAVER MARRY

In a double ring ceremony at
the Christian Church in Coquille,
Friday, May 24th, Margie Caro-
line Moore, daughter of Mr. and
Mrs. C. I. Moore, Roseburg, be
came the bride of Isaac S. Weaver,
son of Mr. and Mrs. R. R. Weaver,
Myrtle Creek. Rev. Leston Pason
performed the ceremony.

CIRCLE NO. 2 TO
MEET MONDAY NIGHT

Circle No. 2 of St. Joseph's Al
tar Society will meet Monday
night, June 10, at eight o clock at
the home of Mrs. Joseph Fest with
Mrs. Sidney Domenlco,
All members are urged to be
present

ment of pink roses and tall lighted
tapers on a beautiful handmade
lace cloth. Guests of the eveningwere Mrs. Naomi Riggs, Mrs.
Juanita Holgate and Mrs. Ella
Sharpe, past matrons of Oakland

and Mrs. Georee Mar.
shall, worthy matron of Rose- -

Durg Chapter. 1 he members pres.
ent were: Mrs. P. T. Bubar, Mrs.

j. finiay. Mrs. F lorence Her- -

cher, Mrs. Ella Lenox, Mrs.
Frances Lintott, Miss Margaret

Mrs. s. J. Shoemaker. Mrs.
A. B. Taylor, Mrs. Flossie Virden,
ana me nosiesses, Mrs. K. L,
Whipple and Mrs. V. J. Micelli.

ALPHA LODGE TO
MEET MONDAY NIGHT

Alpha Lodge No. 47, Knights of
Pythias will confer the rank of
Esquire at a regular meeting to
De neia Monday evening, June 10,
at eight o'clock at Castle Hall. All
members, especially all Pages, are
requested to De present.
RIVERSDALE GRANGE
TO MEET TONIGHT

Riversdale Granee will meet to
night, June 7, at a seven o'clock
potluck supper at the hall. All
members are urged to be present.

Softball Doubleheader
Slated Here Tonight

Four evenly matched teams
will meet ton Pht in the citv soft.
ball league double-neade- r at the
senior High field. First t?ame
will be at 7:15, Eddie Wyatt,
league manager, reports.

Rainbow Grill and the Mon- -

archs will meet in the first con-
test, and the Elks Club and As- -

sociated Service Station in the
second.

Girls' Softball team will work
out tonight at 6 o'clock at the
senior High field. Ladies interest
ed In turning out should reportto Wyatt for practice tonight and
every Monday, Wednesday and
f rmav evenings.

After the local team has heen
formed, it will be entered In the
Southern Oregon Girls Softball
League, with games to be sched-
uled in other cities In this area.

Port of Umpqua Decides
To Sell Pilot Craft

REEDSPORT At the regular
monthly meeting of the Port of
Umpqua- commissioners, it was
decided definitely to sell the port
pilot boat, liger, which lor the
past three years has been of little
use, as shipping here has been at
a virtual standstill because of the
poor condition of the Umpqua
Klver Bar.

The boat has been leased sev
eral times to local deep sea fisher
men, but the leasing arangements
netted the port little revenue, so
it was definitely decided to sell
the boat at public auction under
sealed Olds, with a minimum sale
price set at $6,000. Bids will be
opened June 17.

Vital Statistics .

BORN .
HUGHES To Mr. and Mrs. Al

bert O. Hughes, Roseburg, at
Mercy Hospital, Saturday, June
1, a daughter, Patricia Jane;
weight seven pounds.

PHILLIPS To. Mr. and Mrs.
Eugene D. Phillips, Roseburg, at
Mercy Hospital, Friday, May ai
a daughter, Edith Ann; weight
eight pounds thirteen ounces.

COLLINS To Mr. and Mrs
Marvin A. Collins, Roseburg, at
Mercy Hospital, Saturday, June 1
a daughter, Margaret Ann; weight
six pounds thirteen ounces.

ADAMS To Mr. and Mrs. I.
Dale Adams, Roseburg, at Mercy
Hospital, Monday, June 6, a son,
Robert Earl; weight eight pounds
four ounces.

MARRIAGE LICENSE
COCKERAM-BURNET- Ward

O. Cockeram and Susie H. Bur-
nett, both of Oakland.

DIVORCE COMPLAINTS
KLEICH Jessie M. vs. Edward

Kleich; married at Vancouver,
Wash., November 15, 1945;
cruelty.

ROMBERGER Edna vs. Bill
Romberger; married September
S, 1SJ40, at Keno, Nev.; cruelty.

SHOWER PARTY GIVEN
AT GILBERT HOME

Mrs. B. J. Gilbert, assisted by
Grace Smith and Bernice Ellis,
entertained at a shower party
Mondav evening at the former's
home "Gilbert Acres" In compli-
ment to Mrs. Donald Parker, nee
Bernice Ollivant, who was mar-
ried that afternoon.

Visiting and games were
joyed with Elta Robertson win-

ning the first prize and Mabel
Roberts winning second prize,

. Mrs. Gilbert served delicious re- -

freshments, assisted by Grace' Smith and Bernice Ellis. The table
was covered by a beautiful lace
cloth and centered with tall tapers
and colorful spring flowers. Fol-

lowing the refreshments, the
many lovely gifts were opened
by the guest of honor.

Those enloying the occasion
with Mrs. Gilbert honoring Mrs.
Parker included: Shirley Laurie,
Alice McKibben, Katie Harris,
Alice Beck, Alice Brown, Leatrice
Christian. Mabel Roberts, Daisy
Swan. Elta Robertson, Bessie
Kelly. Edith LaBore, Esther Gard-
ner, Effie Spencer, Mildred Rob-
erts. Betty Kronke, Gerry Wil

f3lnnfjDay
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liamson and the assisting hos
tesses, Grace Smith and Bernice
Ellis.

KEYSTONE CLUB TO
HOLD SKATING PARTY

The Methodist Keystone Club
has planned a delightful skating
party for all members, their lam-ilie- s

and members of the Epworth
League for Monday evening. June
10, at the Winchester rink. Those
attending are asked to meet at
the Methodist Church at 7:15
o'clock in the evening for trans-
portation.
NURSES TO HOLD FIRST
PICNIC OF SEASON TUESDAY

District No. 11. Oregon State
Nurses Association has announced
its first picnic affair of the sea-
son for a six o'clock potluck sup- -

per Tuesdav, June 11, to be held "

f at tne picnic grounas oi tne vet
erans Hospital. All members are
urged to be present.


