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Swap
TACOMA, Wash.. May 24. UP)
Safe crackers, who stole $450

from a meat market, forgot some-
thing.

They left behind their ticket in

A FADING PICTURE Churche
FOR SALE

Vse4 Lwnrnower and Parti
Sharpening

dootj itock round uwi and timber
saws in all lengths. Repairlrig of all
kinds ot saws.

North Side Sqw Shop
highway 99N at Sign of pig Saw

CHURCH OF JESUS CHRIST
OF LATTER-DA- SAINTS

Sunday School at 10:30 A. M.

at "The Gospel of the Roses,"
comer of Qak and Kane Streets.
Everyone welcome.

Sunday
at the

Pabliihed Dally Except Sandtjr bj lb
COMPANY. INC.

Entered ai ecor.'j clou nutter May
17, 1920, at th potofflco at Roseburg

By CHARLES V. STANTON

The Prain Enterprise has installed a typesetting machine.
It no longer bears the distinction of being one of the two

newspapers, in Oregon on which type was set exclusively by
hand. The unique position as Oregon's pole remaining; hand
picked weekly now is held by the Weston Leader, although
a few weeklies still present part of their printed matter in
hand-se- t type.

" Installation of the linotype in the office of the Drain
weekly was completed recently by Clifford D. and Lilyan
Irwin, who purchased the paper several months ago from
H. R. Young, veteran publisher.

We miss the old format of the Drain paper, which, in

TONIGHT
Roseburg High 8 P. M.

"GOOD NIGHT, LADIES"

Senior Class Play

Three-A- ct Hilarious Comedy

PRICES 75c, 50c, 35c

content well deserves its name Enterprise.
The sight of its columns with type carefully set by hand

never failed to stir nostalgic memories memories of comely
women and grizzled men perched on tall stools, hours upon
end, as hands with lightning rapidity and unerring accuracy
plucked type from cases and into sticks; the endless galleys
of used type to be distributed back into cases, with the
printer's devil being bawled out roundly for every typo
graphical error, on the claim that he messed up distribution ;

the careful scrubbing of forms with a bucket of lye water,
and another cussing of the printer's devil because he failed
to rinse the type thoroughly,
fingers of the typesetters.

And there are memories, too, of the old cylinder press and
feeding in sheets of newsprint by hand, and a clattering old
folder, and a Mustang mailer; the musty, grimy shop with
what seemed to be acres of floor space to be swept up daily,
sorting out leads, quads, rules, and the boss' corncob pipe
from the litter of paper and other refuse; the old printers'
towel, left unchanged until black and stiff, which hung
beside the grimy wash basin; the hooded light bulbs which

SIGHT
Most Precious

of the Fiye
Senses

Have you had your eyes
checked lately? Don't let
your most valuable sense suf-
fer from lack of care. Visit
your registered optometrist
today for a complete

cast soft yellow islands of light in the half dusk occasioned

by unwashed window panes.
Modern methods have relegated the craft of hand-pickin- g

"ti --'n
type to the limbo of the past. Vast strides have been made
in the printer's art, and many new developments are yet to
come. Tomorrow's newspapers, decked out in colors, will
bear little resemblance to those of yesterday or even today.

s
EDEN LUTHERAN CHURCH

Elgarose
Enoch Sandeen, B.D., pastor.

Services are held regularly every
Sunday evening at 8 o'clock.
Come to the Church in the Val-

ley" It is pleasant to be in the
House of God.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
Glide. Oreaon

Sunday School, 10 A. M. Classes
tor ait age3. Morning worship,
11 A. M. Message: "Eden." There
will start Sunday, May 26, a long
series of sermons on the subjectof ''Eden to Canaan." These will
be given by maps and charts.
Come and enjoy these illuminat-
ing sermons. Young Peoples ser-
vice, 8:30 P. M., all young people
invited. Evening worship, 7 30
P. M. Message, "Not Ashamed
of Preaching" (Rom. 15). Wednes-
day, 7:30 P. M., prayer meeting.
S. R. Beck, pastor.

PRESBYTERIAN OAKLAND
Oakland

J. H. Howard, minister. Sun-
day SchooL meets at 10 A. M. We
are expecting the orchestra to
lead the music for us next Sun
day. "Christian Certitude, Basic
in any Philosophy of Life" will
be the theme for the sermon at
11 o'clock. Special music by the
choir directed by Mr. Wahlton.
At 7 o'clock P. M., the meeting of
the Young People's group and
8 o'clock "Relaying the Founda-
tions of Faith" will be the sub-
ject for a discussional group cal-
culated to stir sober thought. An
invitation is extended to all to
attend these services.

ST. GEORGE'S EPI8COPAL
CHURCH

Main and Cass Streets
Father Blaker. Sunday services

at 8:00 and 11:00 A. M. Church
School, 9:45 A, M.

ST. PAUL'S LUTHERAN
CHURCH (Missouri Synod)

Corey and Military Sts,, West
Roseburg

'The-- Church of the' Lutheran
Hour." The service of Sunday,
May 26, begins at 11 A. M. The
sermon topic is, "How to Keep
Our Prayers from Becoming a
Waste of Time." The Sunday
School meets at 9:45 A. M. We
most cordially invite all, espec-
ially those having no church-home- ,

lo attend our service nnri
Sunday School. The Lutheran
Hour is broadcast Sundavs over
KRNR at 8:30 A. M. Tune in:
write in; tell others. The next
meeting of the Bible
class will take place on Thursday,
June 6, at the home ol Mrs. C.
Malitz, in W. A.
Sylwester, U70 Military Streets,
pastor,

CALAPOOIA FREE METH-
ODIST CHURCH

Our goal for the Sunday School
this Sunday is 100. Rev. Ed-
wards, visiting evangelists, prom-
ises a surprise if we reach the
goal. Rev. Edwards will bringthe Sunday morning message at
11 o'clock, and also Sunday eve-
ning and each evening throughthe coming week at 8 o'clock.
His messages are vital, spiritual,
prophetic, sensational and differ-
ent. Each message is thoroughly
illustrated in sound motion pic-
tures. You will want to hear
him. Come. Gilbert Johnson,
pastor.

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH
Douglas and Kane Streets

Kenneth W. Knox, minister.
Bible school at 9:45 with Wr.
Unrath, superintendent, in chareo
of oxming exercises. There are
classes with competent teachers

for every age. Morninr v.oishio
service at 10:45 will be bioadcast
over KRNR. The Lord's Supperwill be served. The sermon topic
will be "Preparation foi-- Pente-
cost." Mrs. Lena Poole will sinir

Alone with God," bv Jane Ab
bott. There will be music bv the
choir Mr. and Mrs. S. Clarence
Trued, directors of music. C. E.
at 6:30 for all young peonle.
Wednesday night nraver service
and Bible study at 8:00. Study
acis l.i. and loin us lor discus
sion. Thursday night, choir prac
tice at 7:45. Dally vacation Bible
school, June for all children
4 12 years of age.

Combining scientific advances in communication, trans
portation, and photography
is working diligently upon

DR. BRUCE TUCK
Optometrist

Boring Optical
printing and disseminating the news. New types of presses
are in the making. Color process engraving is invading the
newspaper field. Improvements
soon make the world's best news pictures available to even

Oregon, unaer bci ox aaarcn , ioo.
CBAHLEg V. STANTON..
EDWIN h. KNAF1

Member, of the Associated Press. Ore-
gon Nevnpuper Publishers AsKoclfllion,
ina Auaii .Bureau os (.itcuihuuiib.

Represented by CO.,
INC., offices In New York, Chicago, San
Francisco, Los Angeles. Seattle, Port
land, St. Louis.

Out of
By Mall Oregon State
Per Year .15.50 $0.00

300
Threa Months 1.1 1.75
Per year, by city carrier..... 17.00
Per month, by city carrie- r- .85

The Weather
U. S. Weather Bureau Office

Roseburg, Oregon .

Forecast tor Roseburg and vi-

cinity: Partly cloudy tonight;
light ahowers, cooler Saturday,
Highest temp, for any May.... 102
Lowest temp, for any May .... 30
Highest temp, yesterday 73
Lowest temp, last night 51

Precipitation yesterday 0
Precipitation from May 1 37
Deficit from May 1, 1846 1.18
Excess from Sept. 1, 1945 3.85

In the Day's News

(Continued from page 1)

Ing of spring wheat In Siberia.
Unless these crops produce, he

concludes, Russia too will be hun-

gry.

sounds reasonable. There are
ITso many aspects of the Russian
attitude that sound unreasonable.
It pleases us, someway, to lind
something in the Russian situa-

tion that seems to make sense.

to Russia, this is TRUE:
ASThe attitude oi the American
people toward the Russian people

' in a FRIENDLY attitude. We
want nothing so much as to get
along with them in peace and
amity. It Is this writer's belief,
based on limited personal obser-

vation, that the Russian PEOPLE
tcel much the same toward us.

Yet American-Russia- relations
are going rapidly from bad to
worse.

t
WHY? In trying to answer
that question we shall have to

onr olf into the realms of specu
lations und surmise.

UfE must remember that some

If 180 million Russians' nrc rul
ed absolutely by some four or

five million members of the com-

munist party. These members of
the ruling party value their pow
r and their privileges.

Tbey MAY fear the western
democracies even more than we
of the western democracies fear
communism. Everyone who has
been there agrees that Kussiun

private soldiers have ben tremen-

dously Impressed by what they
think of as the PLENTY existing
in ravaged eastern Germany, in
Czechoslovakia, in Austria and
even in Hungary. Comparing it
with what they have at home, It

looks to them like ABUNDANCE.

They MIGHT come home and
say to their rulers: "Why can't
WE have as much as these other
people who havo been living un-

der despised capitalism?"
" That would be embarrassing.

IT Is an unfortunate, but HIS-

I TORICAL, fact when thoughts
such as this begin to run through
the minds of the common people
RULERS find foreign wars a con

venient and quite effective way to

hold onto their privileges tinu
their power.

That has happened over and
Over in the long centuries of

which we havo a record. It could

happen again in Russia.
..That is-- what keeps us fearful

ol what Russia is up to.

can we do about it?
WHAT all we ordinary people
cm do is to go on feeling friend-

ly toward common, ordinary Rus-

sians. "But we' must inslst'that our

own government shall keep Am-

erica's military power unweak-ened- .

It Is doubtless unfortunate, but

It villi is TRUE, that power wins

respect In international dealings.
. Weakness seldom does.

the smaller newspapers, which,
esses will be able to reproduce them with greater clarity and,
in many instances, in full color.

In these days' of stress and speed, demanding complicated
machinery to meet the pace of production, it is restful to
recall the old days when skillful men and women, through
experience and long training, translated the seemingly il

tne lacoma policeman s Hall.

Notice of Timber Sale

Sealed bids, marked outside
"Bid for Timber", and addressed
to tne (mel f orester, (J. and C.
Administration, 901 Guardian
Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will
be received until and opened at
10:30 A. M., Pacific Standard
Time, June 11, 1946, for the pur-
chase of timber upon tracts here-
inafter described; each bid must
state the amount per M. feet
B.M., which will be offered for
each species and the total consid-
eration which will be paid for
the timber. No bid for less than
the appraised value will be con-
sidered. Each bid must be sub-
mitted In duplicate and be ac-

companied by a deposit in the
form ot a eertuiea enecK in lavor
of the Treasurer of the United
States. The deposit of any suc-
cessful bidder will be credited on
the contract. Payment in full at
the time of filing the contract is
required in sales amounting to
$2,500.00 or less. For copies of
the form of proposal, form jfcontract and bond, terms of pay-
ment, amount of deposit required
with bid, amount of bond re-

quired with contract and other
information, application should
be made to the address shown
above. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY:
T. 21 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 17, all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on the NWiNEt, Por.
SWJNEi, Por. NW4NW1, Por.
5W4NW1, estimated lor tne pur-
pose of this sale to be 755 M. feet
live Douglas Fir, 570 M. feet

Douglas Fir. 190 M. feet
Western Red Cedar, 15

M. feet live Hemlock. No bid
for less than S5.95 per M .ft. B.M.
for the live Douglas Fir, S1.50
per M. ft. B.M. for the fire-kille-

Douglas Hr and live Hemlock,
$.50 per M. Ft. B.M. for the

Western Red Cedar, or a
total purchase price of $5,464.75,
will be considered. In the NWl
NEl, all Douglas fir trees 26
inches DBHOB and under are re-
served. In the SW1NEJ, an area
of approx. 21 acres lying south
and cast of blazed line on ridge
top is entirely reserved from sale.
On the remainder of the SWJ
NEi, only timber is in-

cluded in the sale. In the WS
NW1, only that portion lying
north and west of the Big Creek
road is included in .the sale, and
only those trees stamped USOC
are to be cut. On this area, log-

ging by use of Caterpillar-typ- e

tractor is mandatory. On the Wj
NEI logging is to be done by use
of Caterpillar-typ- tractor except
wnere otherwise authorized by the
officer in charge of the sale. T. 23
S.. R. 9 W., Sec. 7, all merchant-
able timber designated for cutting
on Lot 10 (SWiNEl), and portion
of Lot 15 (NWiSEJV estimated
lor tne purpose OI tins sale to nc
1295 M. feet Douglas Fir, 20 M.
feet White Fir, 10 M. feet West-
ern Red Cedar. No bid for less
than $5.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Douglas Fir, $2.50 per M. ft.
B.M. for the White Fir, $2.00 per
M. ft. B.M. for the Western Red
Cedar, or a total purchase price
of $6,804.00, will be considered.
In Lot 10 and that portion of
L.ot lo lying worm ot blazed line,
all trees 30 inches DBHOB and
under are reserved from cutting.
Logging on this area is to be
done by use of Caterpillar-typ- e

tractor, except where otherwise
authorized by the officer in
charge of the sale. In an area of
approx. 7 acres bounded by a
blazed line south and east of log-
ging road in Lot 15, only those
trees stamped USOC are to be
cut. On this area, logging bv nse
of Caterpillar-typ- tractor is man
datory. 1 . a 5., K. 10 w., Sec. 13,
all merchantable timber desig
nated for cutting on a portion of
the NE1NEI. estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 115 M.
feet Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet Hem
lock. No bid for less than $5.30
per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglasnr. IW.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Hemlock, or a total purchase
price of $629.50, will be consid
ered. The sale area contains
approx. 3 acres lvlng north and
east of a blazed line in the north-
east corner of the NE1NES. The
remainder of the NEINEI is re
served from cutting, including
blazed line trees. T. 25, S., R. 7
W Sec. 31, all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
the FINE I, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 1230 M.
feet Douglas Kir, 30 M. feet
While Fir, 110 M. feet Incense
Cedar. No bid for less than $2.90
per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas
Kir, S2.(KI per m ft H.M. for the
While Fir and Incense Cedar, or
a total purchase price of $3,847.00.
win nc considered. All Douglasfir trees less than IS inches
DBHOB are reserved. The area
is to be logged by use of Caterpil-

lar-type tractor unless other-
wise authorized by the officer in
charge of the sale. All timber
cut from the above described
areas must be manufactured in
the local marketing area desig
nated ny me u. and t . Admin-
istration unless otherwise author-
ized by the Chief Forester. If
the unit prices bid are above
those authorized by MPR 460.
they will be reduced to the maxi-
mum permitted under thaf order.
In case of two or more Identical
bids for the same timber, the
successful bidder will bo selected
on the basis of ability to further
the objectives of the Acts of
August 28. 1937. The right Is
hereby reserved to waive- techni-
cal defects in this advertisement:
to reject all bids, or to award the
timber for the amount of the
highest bid to other than lite
highest bidder when necessary.
pursuant to the Act of August 28,

(SO Stat. 8741 In order lo
provide a continued sunnlv nf

ROSEBURG CHURCH OP THE

NAZARENE
Forest Hill, pastor. Sunday

School, 10 A. M.; Mr. S. S. Linnel,
superintendent in charge. Work
shop, 11 A. M.; S. S. Linnel in
charge; sermon by Mervin
Storms. Evening services dis
missed to allow for school ac
tivities. Prayer meeting, Wednes
day, 7:30 P. M.; Mrs. Bertha
Denny in charge.

ASSEMBLY OF GOD

Mrs. Betty Williams, pastor.
cunoay scnooi, iu A. M.; preach-
ing, 11 A. M.; evangelistic serv
ice, 7:30 P. M. Bible study and
prayer service, Wednesday, 7:30
i . m. xoung service,
Friday, 7:30 P. M. D.V.B.S., June
xutn-tust- .

DAYS CREE KCOMMUNITY
METHODIST CHURCH

Church school. 10 A. M.: morn
ing worship hour, 11 A. M. Levi
n.. wnue, pastor.
FIRST METHODIST CHURCH

Lane and Main Streets
W. A. MacArthur, minister.
"The Conversion of an Honest

Doubter" is the subject which the
pastor will develop In the Sunday
morning service, beeinnins at 11
o'clock. All newcomers to Rose-
burg will find a welcome await-
ing them here. There will be no
Sunday evening service because
of the baccalaureate sermon to
be given at the high school by
Mr. MacArthur. Choir practice
win oe on tuesday mgnt, as
usual, under the direction of Mr.
Thomas McNeill.

LOOKINGGLASS METHODIST
COMMUNITY CHURCH

Sunday School, 10 A. M.; wor-
ship service, 11 A. M. We will be
looking for you. C. N. Currier,
pastor.

CMLLARD METHODI6T
COMMUNITY CHURCH

Sunday School, 10 A. M. No
preaching' this week. C. N. Cur-
rier, pastor.

CAMAS VALLEY METHODIST
COMMUNITY CHURCH

Sunday School, 10 A. M.; every-
one welcome. C. N. Currier, pas-
tor.

TENMILE METHODIST
COMMUNITY CHURCH

Sunday School, 2 P. M. Every-
one is urged to attend to keepour community Sunday School
going. C. N. Currier, pastor.

FIRST PRESBYTERIAN
CHURCH

Lane and Jackson Streets
The Rev. Morris H. Roach

Th.D., minister; Mrs. Homer
Grow, organist; Mr. Ralph

cnoir director; Mr. J. A.
Pinkerton, Sunday School super
intendent. Morning sermon: "For
me neaung oi me XNations.
Anthem: "Safely to the Sunset
oaies, Lanaon. solo: "Ave Ma-
ria," Schubert. Mrs. W. O. Strad-
ley. The evening service at the
church will be omitted that the
congregation may join in the bac-
calaureate service at the Senior
High. Calendar for the week:
Sunday: Sunday School, 9:45
A. M.; morning worship, 11 A.
M.; Westminster Fellowship, 6:30
P. M.; evening service, 7:30 P. M.
Monday: Cruisers' Club, 6:45 P.
M. Tuesday: Character Clinic,
KRNR, 11:30 A. M.; choir prac-
tice, 7:30 P. M. Wednesday: Spir-
itual advance, 7:30 P. M. Thurs-
day: Pastor's Scrap Book, KRNR,
11:30 A. M.

THE FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
Rev. Vern R. Hodges, tormerlyof Glide and Burns. Oregon, will

preach at the First Baptist
Church Sunday morning at 11.
Mrs. Joseph Dccts and Miss Mary
Apia will sing. There will be no
meetings at the church Sunday
evening. All are invited to attend
baccaulaureate services for high
school graduates at the Junior
High School auditorium, 8
o'clock. Rev. H. P. Sconce, pastor,
will return to be in his pulpit
June 2nd. Vacation Church
School, Miss Apia in charge, will
open Monday. June 3. 9 A. M. to
11:15 A. M. Children 4 years and
up are ipvited to attend. Sunday
School, Ben Irving, superintend-
ent, meets each Sunday morningat 9:45. Mid-wee- service 7:30
each Wednesday evening.

FREE METHODIST CHURCH
Corner of Harvard and Umpqua

L. N. Otis, pastor. Sunday
School. 10 A. M. Morning wor-
ship, 11 A. M., sermon by pastor.
The regular Young; peoples ser-
vice at 7:15 P. M and Eeningservice al :45 P. K.. wi!l be dis-
missed in favor of the special re-
vival services being held at the
C alapooia Free Methodist Church
with Rev. !.. T. Eowards, who is
an outstanding prophecy teacher
with moving plenties and rHdes
to illustrate, his messages. Mid
week prayer sen-ic- this week
will also omitted becausa of
the revival service. .

FIRST CHURCH OF CHRIST,
SCIENTIST -

312 Last Oougus Street
Kcgular service Sunday at 11

A. M. Subject of lesson. "Suul and
Btxly." Sunday School convenes
at 9:45 A. M. Wednesday eve--

nlng meetings which include testi-- !

monies of healing and remarks on
Christian Science are held at 8
o'clock. The reading room at 317
Pacific Building Is open dailv ex

legible penciled scrawl of editors and reporters into the news

225 N. Jackson

Rev. and Mrs. A. C. Wegner
Sunday School

leaving it slippery in the moist

in collection of news, the press
improvements in the field of

in wirephoto technique will

with better engraving proc

is a fading picture and soon,
through the eyes of memory.

dynamite and are built along the
meanle vs. cleanle formula to
provide sure-fir- action. Katonen
and Lvnam are both
champions, Katonen having held
the pacmc coast ngni Heavy
weight crown before losing it to
Al Szasz a couple of weeks ago.
Lynam held the coast junior
heavyweight title until he lost it
recently to Bruno Angelo. Both
men will be out to score as im-

pressive a victory as possible in
an attempt to get back Into the
championship picture.

Lynam showed an Impressive
return to form last week in beat-
ing Jack Kiser but he will need
all his skill to offset the rugged
rough-hous- attack of Katonen.

The preliminary should be a
colorful affair between Achlu and
Kenaston. Achiu will probably re-
sort to the use of his

art to combat the vil-

lainous tactics of the

Dr. Bellinger Named T-- B

Adviser for Vets Adm.

SEATTLE. May 23. (VI The
appointment of Dr. (.rover C
Bellinger of Salem, Ore., as chief
consultant In tuberculosis for the
northwest branch medical service
of the Veterans Administration
was announced yesterday by Col.
R. K. giving, branch medical di-

rector.
Bellinger is superintendent of

the Oregon state tuberculosis hos-
pital.

Mill lob Started

Pile driving started Tuesday for
the Kir Manufacturing Co.'s new
plywood mill ut Myrtle Creek.

KRNR
Mutual Broadoaatlng System

1490 Kllooyoles.

RIMAININO BOIES TODAT

jno-- 4 rulton l.fwls. Jr.
t.1- - Rex Mtilfr. Nation Biscuit Co.

4 - Emkmc Johiiwn. rutcx.
4.4ft Cexd New Prostam, AMmblT of

of Clod
5 00-- Mustr.,1 Clock. Mxlern Furmtuio.
a: 1ft Superman. KclloBfi'
3 .to- - Captain Midnight. Wander Co.
ft 4.V Tom Mix. H!.ttoti-Purina- .

6 Hpatter. Krcml.
Interlude.

6.2- 3- State and Local News. Roseburg
Motor Co.

6 :io Spotlight nnnd. Coca Cola.
7 00 Hccltal Hall of the Air.
T:lftKhylhm HiHtlld-L'p- . Lockwood

Motor,,.
7 W The Cluco Kid.
S on Melody Toui n. Studcbaker.
tt .'Hl Can tnsMon Pla house,sou Alka Kelttcr News

IS. Hex Miller. S. and W. Fine roodv
fKtrt-- Neifhbor. t'aisten a luinituro.
9 Heorv J Taylor, l.eneral Mnlaia.

10.00 Fulton Lewu, Jt., Roseburg.
riiarniao,

10 v' ' ! .
lu;3ts Ton Thirty. jLlub. ILAWkun't

, Jewelry. I V
11 Ilevane ...i v

OtivePaOtclujiits. : --

U.J0 ln. OIL . .t-
-

(A wideawake and interesting class awaits YOU!

Phon 386

HEAR!!
Rev. and Mrs. A. C.

Wegner
of

San Jose, California
at

3 BIG SERVICES

SUNDAY

. 11:00 A. M.
2:30 P. M.
7:30 P. M.

9.45 M.

Mrs. DcLoss Crook

(:,. - . ... ..

FREE TRANSPORTATION EVERY SUNDAY
One of the busses or private cars will pick you up and return
you to your home. Just drop a card to Rev. D. Crook', P. O.Box 103, Roseburg, or call at 546 Mill St.

Overcomers (Youth) &:15 P. M.
"The Friedly Church With a Hearty Welcome"

llbN. KoseSt. Knights of Pythias Hail

and opinion of the day. But it
perhaps, it will be seen only

Accidental Single
Gives Oakland 1-- 0

Win Over Portland
(By the Associated Press)

Les Scarsella, heaviest slugger
of Oakland's rampaging Acorns,
bloopecl a winnlug rim without
trying and stretched the gap be-

tween the Acorns and their near-
est rival in the Pacific Coast Base-
ball League to two and a half
games.

The strong contender for
league home run honors tried to
duck the pilch that lost the game
for the Portland Heavers last
nicht. The ball hit Scarsclla's bat
handle as he stepped back, looped
closely tiown uie loui line lor a
hit and drove In the tally lor a
10 victory. The baseball curved
shortly In the outfield after
Scarsella, looking for a foul, had
slowed down. Sabol, who had
.singled and advanced on a bunt
and an Infield out, crossed the
plale.

Oakland's victory cave Gassa
way his filth win of the season
and brought the Acorn's record to
10 straight wins and 2.1 In the
last J(l games, liarrett oi me
Beavers limited the Oaks to five
hits In seven Innings before he
was lifted for a pinch hitler.

San Diego's giant-killin- Padres
sank live second-plac- San Kran-Cisc-

Seals, erstwhile pace setters
of the league, deeper behind the
Oaks on a 31 victory, the second
In a row for the Padres. Olson, the
winning pitcher, allowed the
Seals seven safeties.

Hollywood s Stars continued
their reverse of form In sinking
the Los Angeles Angels, 4 to a,
for the third consecutive time.

At Seattle, $100,000 First Base
man . largesoii poled a homer
with full bases and two out in
the tenth inning for a 0 2 decision
by the Seattle Kalnicrs over the
Sacramento Solon.s.

Achieu, Kenaston
Will Battle In

Mat Preliminary
Walter Aehlu, the veteran Chi-

nese wrestler w ho has the ancient
art of tluiltsu down nut. will pro
vide: part of the color on Satur-
day night's wrestling card at the
itoseourg Armory. The oriental
grapplcr will tanrle with

Serceant Bob Kenaston In
the preliminary match starting at
8:30 P. M.

. The card; will be headlined bv
the Paavo Katoncn-Jo- . Lyiiarii
battle. - VvV'-- v

'

castors: Kov. and

y (

BASEBALL
SUNDAY, MAY 26

at

Finlay Field

Starting at 3:00 P. M.

Game has been moved back one hour due to Rodeo Queen Contest
at 2:00 P. M.

Roseburg Chiefs vs. Grants Pass
Some of the suits will be lettered with sponsor's names.

General Admission: 75 cents (tax incl.)
Students (with student cards); 25c (tax incl.)

Will Attend Meeting Of

Oregon Library Assn.
Mrs O. V. Wimbcrly of Hie

Roseburg Public Library board
and Mr Hilda llciensteln, city
librarian, leit today for.Sa'cm to
attend the fourth annual confer-
ence of the Oregon Library As-

sociation, set for Saturday.
Topics to bo discussed tnrliulo

certification of librarians, recom-

mendations of the legislative com-

mittee, and the library, servico
demonstration act.

Dr. Peter 1L Oder.aid. presi-
dent of Reed College, will ad-

dress the afwrnon meeting on

professional prido and pressure
politics. More I han 200.. represen-
tative Of public; school, college,
university and special libraries
V.ilUttcnd. ' t -- '

;
. - .

timber to local industry so as to loci11 Sundays and holidays from
assure the peimanence of the 10:30 A. M. to 4:30 P. M." Here
community which is dependent the Bihle and all. authorized, Chris-upo-

. such . industry. Dated at tian:' Science li,tr;alure. .maybe )

port intra, vtitis-- 1 .th ,riav i re.Kt,.oorrowed ot suosci ibcd.for.'il
of May. .VMS. ..W.IH. liurning.'r-The- . ptiWIc.is. cowHaHy. InvitedvtoJi &
Chief Forester, 'OA and C.Ai- - atteixdlthehui-dvsorvice- s and to I 'J''uuiiUtratiou.-'- ' s . .. UUftto ...t'L!i:feotri matches aiekkiadetl tlth

t- -. i : -...


