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LEOAL NOTICILIOAL NOTICI LEOAL NOTICIJunior Woman's Club to Meet
The Junior Woman's Club will
meet Monday night at i o'clock
at the home of the contact chair-
man, Mm. O. S. Chambers, at
l2tl Madrone Slreet In

Elmer Lee Boock and Betty
Jean Mitts, both of Houser, Ore.,
were married yesterday after-
noon by Justice nf the Peace
Thomas C. Hartfiel. Witnesses to
the ceremony were Doroihy M.
Cherryholmes and Gilan Ellis.

No. 88
NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE.

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid
for Timber," and addressed to
the Chief Forester. O. and C. Ad-

ministration, 901 Guardian Build-

ing, Portland 4. Oregon, will tie
received until and opened at
10:30 A. M., Pacific Standard
Time, March 12. 146, for the
purchase of timber upon tracts
hereinafter described; each hid
must state the amount ner M.

Local
News
Reported Better Roy Kurtz of

Roseburg is now rpportod to be
Improved, following an illness at
his home in this city.

Returns to School Mrs. Rnnlta
Rkilling returned to her teaching
in the Fullerton School this morn-
ing, following a short illnss at her
home.

Back From Portland Pon
Metzger has returned to his home
on Blakeley Street, following a
lew days in Portland attending
to business.

Spend Thursday in Eugene
Mr. and Mrs. It L. Daniel and
son, Bobby, of Roseburg spent
Thursday in Eugene attending to
business.

Residing on Cobb Street Mr.
nnd Mrs. Peyton Oderkirk have

i moved into the home formerly' pcupied by Mrs. Dottlce Snook
at 804 Cobb Street.

, Out of Hospital Mrs. R. J.
Hughes, of the Greyhound restau-
rant in Roseburg, has been dis-

charged from Mercy Hospital,
where she received treatment for
pneumonia.

Back From Eugene Mr. and
Mrs. G. V. Wimberly have re-

turned to their home on Glenn
Street In Roseburg, following a
few days in Eugene attending, to
business.

Return From Portland Mr.
nnd Mrs. Redford Tester and
small son. George, and Mrs.
Tester's mother, Mrs. C. E. Marks,
have returned to their homes in
Roseburg, following a business
trip to Portland.

Back From Portland Miss
Helen Casey and Miss Naomi
Scott have returned to their home
on Blakeley Street, following a
week in Portland enjoying a visit
with relatives and friends. While
there, they attended the ballet.

Visiting In Roseburg W. H.
Bowden is spending a couple of
days in Roseburg visiting friends
en route from Chiloquin, Ore., to
San Jose, Calif., where he will
make his home with his son, Eu-

gene Bowden. The Bowden family
made their home in Roseburg for
many years.

Leave For Tacoma Mr. and
Mrs. Charles Close have left for
their home in Tacoma, Wash., fol- -

Club Party Postponed On ac-

count of illness, the
Club party planned for

Saturday night, March 2, at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. George
Johnson, has been indefinitely
postponed.

Past Matrons Club to Meet
The Past Matrons Club of Rose
burg Chapter of Eastern Star will
meet Monday nlcht at 7:30 o'clock
at the home of Mrs. A. B. Tavlor
in Laurclwood. Light refresh
ments will be served at the close
of the meeting. Members and
vis'ting past matrons are Invited.

Visiting Here Mrs. H. F. Beau-cham-

of Salem is in Roseburg
visiting her parents, Mr. and Mrs.
J. A. Cobb, and two sisters. Mrs.
Don Metzger and Mrs. W. A.
Oerding. Mrs. Cobb is reported io
be convalescing satisfactorily at
her home, following a recent fall,
at which time she suffered a frac-
tured ankle.

Recovering From Operation
Mrs. Craig Marsters, nee Helen

Cobb of Roseburg, is reported to
be convalescing satisfactorily at
the Coffey Memorial Hospital in
Portland, where she underwent a
major operation last Eridav. She
is a daughter of Mr. and Mrs. J.
A. Cobb and a sister of Mrs. Don
Metzger and Mrs. W. A. Oerding
of Roseburg.

Completes Service School
Robert L. Hickerson, son of Har-
old J. Hickerson, Roseburg Cham-
ber of Commerce secretary, re
cently discharged from military
service, has completed a training
course in the Standard Oil Com-

pany service school at Mcdford
and has been employed in the
Standard station at Oak and
Stephens Streets in Roseburg.

Nurses to Meet District No.
11 of the Oregon State Graduate
Nurses Association will meet
Tuesday night, March 5, at a 7:30
o'clock dessert-suope- r at the home
of the president, Mrs. ivan u.
Pickens, 441 Fowler Street, with
Mrs. E. C. Patterson as
All graduate nurses are invited.
and those planning on attendin
are asked to telephone either Mrs.
Pickens at 727-- J or Mrs. rauerson
at 834-R- .

Executive Meetina Planned
Tho March executive meeting of
the Roseburg woman s Club of-

ficers, clubhouse board and board
of directors will be held Tuesday
at a 12 o'clock lunch-
eon at the Hotel Rose. Mrs. A.
J. Geddes, president, will conduct
the meeting, followed by the regu
lar meeting of thcWoman's Club
at a 1:30 o clock dessert-luncheo-

at the First Presbvterlan Church,
Mrs. G. V. Wimberly and Miss
Marie Martens will be in charge
of the orogram and hostesses
elude: Mrs. O. W. Harrah, Mrs.
D. L. Chase. Mrs. Stanley Glick.
Mrs. C. W. Dishman, Mrs. D. H.
Morgan and Mrs. Jessie Wag
goner. Mrs. Harrie W. Booth,
vocal soloist, will be guest artist
accompanied by Mrs. Thomas Mo
Niell.

I.CAGAL NOTICES

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having claims aeainst the

estate of BERNARD BENJAMIN
Deceased, now pending In the

County Court of Douglas County. Ore-
gon, are hereby notified to present the
same, duly verified, to the underpinned
executor at Voncalla. Oregon, or to R.
L. Whipple, hla attorney. IT. S. Nat.
Bank Bldg., Roseburg. Oregon, within
tlx months from the data of this notice
which la March 1. 100

DANIEL B. BENNER.
Executor of the of
Bernard Benjamin Benncr,

Notice of Timber Sale
Sealed bids, marked outside

"Bid for Timlier," and addressed
to the Chief Forester, O. and C.
Administration, 901 Guardian
Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will
be received until and opened at
10:30 A. M., Pacific Standard
Time.' March 12, 1946 for the
purchase of timber upon tracts
hereinafter described: each bid
must state the amount per M.
feet B. M., which will be offered
for each species and the total con-
sideration which will be peid for
the timber. No bid for less than
the appraised value will be con-
sidered. Each bid must lie submit
ted In duplicate and be accom-
panied by a deposit in the form
of a certified check In favor of
the Treasurer of the United
States. The deposit of any success-ful- l

bidder will lie credited on the
contract. Payment in full at the
time of filing the contract is re-

quired in sales amounting to
S2.5O0.0O or less. For copies of the
form of proposal, form of con-

tract and bond, terms of payment,
amount of deposit required with
bid. amount of bond required
with contract and other Informa-
tion, application should be made
to the address shown above. IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY": T. 21 S., R.
8 W., Sec. 17, all merchantable
timber desicnated for cuttinrr on
the SE1 SWV. estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 440 M.
feet- - Douglas Fir, 50
M. feet Red Cedar. No
bid for less than S2.00 oer M.
ft. B. M. for the Doug
las Fir. $.50 per M. ft. B. M. for
the Red Cedar, or a
total purchase price of $905.00
win be considered, univ lire- -

killed timber Is included In this
sale. T. 23 S., R. 9 W., Sec. 7,
all merchantable timber desig
nated for cutting on Lot 18 (SW1
SWi), estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 1440 M. feet
Douglas Fir, 135 M. feet Hemlock.
No hid for less than S5.00 per M.
ft. a. M. for the Douglas
S2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Hemlock, or a total purcnasc
price of $7,470.00, will be consid-
ered All Douelas Fir trees under
28 Ins. DBI IOB are reserved from
cutting. Logging to be done by
Caterpillar-tvp- tractor unless
otherwise directed by officer In

charge of sale. T. 30 S.. R. 4 W.,
Sec. 27, ail merchantable timber
designated for cutting on the SE1
Nfc-J- , estimated for the purpose ot
this sale to be 880 M. feet Doug-
las Fir, 80 M. feet Incense Cedar.
No bid for less than $3.50 per M.
ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir,
$2.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the In-
cense Cedar, or a total purchase
price of $3,280.00. will be consid-
ered. T. 31 S., R. 5 W., Sec. 27, all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on a portion of the
Wt SE1, estimated for the pur-nos- e

of this sale to be 565 M. feet
Douglas Fir, 5 M feet stamped
Sugar Pine. No bid for less than
$2.40 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Douglas Fir. $7.50 per M. ft. B. M.
for the stamped Sugar Pine, or
a total purchase price of $1,393.50,
will be considered. Only an area
of approximately 25 acres lying
East of blazed cutting line in Wl
SE is included in the sale. Blazed
line trees and unstamped pine
trees are reserved from sale. All
timber cut from the above des
cribed areas must be manufac-
tured in the local marketing area
designated by the O. and C. Ad-

ministration unless otherwise au-

thorized by the Chief Forester.
If the unit prices bid are above
those" authorized by MPR 460,
they will be reduced to the maxi-
mum permitted under that order.
In case of two or more identical
bids for the same timber, the suc-
cessful bidder will be selected on
the basis of ability to further the
objectives of the Act of August
28. 1937. The right is hereby re-

served to waive technical defects
in this advertisement; to reject
all bids, or to award the timber
for the amount of the highest
bid to other than the highest bid-

der when necessary, pumuant to
the Act of August 28, 1937 ( 50
Stat. 874), in order to provide a
continued suddIv of timber to
local Industry so as to assure the
permanence ot tne community
which is dependent upon such in-

dustry. Dated at Portland, Ore-

gon, this 15th day of February,
1946. W. H. Horning, Chief For-
ester. O. nnd C. ArlmlniMrntlnn.

feet B.M., which will be offered
for each species and the total
consideration which will be paid
for the timber. No bid for less
than the aDoraised value will be
considered. Each bid must he sub
mitted in duolieate and be ac
companied by a deposit in the
form of a certified check in favor
of the Treasurer of the United
States. The deposit of anv suc- -

cessiui bidder win be cmnteq on
the contract. Payment In full at
the time of filing the contract is
required In sales amounting to
$2,500.00 or less. For copies of
the form of proposal, form of
contract and bond, terms of Day- -

ment, amount of deposit required
with bid. amount of bond re
quired with contract and other
information, application snouid
be made to the address shown
above. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY:
T. 22 S., R. 10 W., Sec. 35, all
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on a portion of the
NW1SWJ and portion of SWI
SWI. estimated for the purpose
of this sale to be 2050 M feet
Douglas Fir and 65 M feet Hem-
lock. No bid for less than $5.80
tier M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas
Fir nnd $2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for
the Hemlock, or a total purchase
price of $12,020.00. will be con-
sidered. In the NWISWI only
those trees branded USOC, on an
area of approximately 3 acres in
the Southeast corner lying south
and east of the ridge, are in-

cluded in this sale. Logging on
this 3 acres is to be done by
caterpillar type tractor unless
otherwise specified by the offi-
cer in charge of the sale. In the
SWISWi approximately 10 acres
lying In the western side and
bounded by a well blazed line
are reserved from sale. T. 28 S.,
R. 3 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
tne ivwi, Lot .i iivwsiW), por-
tion Lot 4 (SWSW). and Por.
Hons of the EiSWl, estimated
for the Duroose of this sale to
be 5350 M feet Douglas Fir, 100 M
feet Stamoed Suear Pine. 120 M
feet White Fir, 670 M feet Incense
Cedar, 140 M feet Western Red
Cedar and 5 M feet Hemlock.
No bid for less than $4.00 per
M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Fir,
$10.30 per M.ft.B.M. for the
Stamped Sugar Pine. $1.50 per
M.ft.B.M. for the Incense Cedar
and $2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the
White Fir, Western Red Cedar
and Hemlock, or a total pur
chase Drice of $23,965.00. will be
considered. Those portions of
Lot 4 and E1SWJ lying south of
a well blazed line on tne ridge
toD are reserved from cutting.
Including blazed line trees. All
pine trees' not stamped USOC
are reserved irom cutting, ah
timber cut from the above de- -

cribed areas must be manufac
tured in the local marketing area
designated by the O. and C.
Administration unless otherwise
authorized by the Chief Forester.
If the unit prices bid are above
those authorized by MfK
thev will be reduced to the maxi
mum permitted under that order.
In case of two or more identical
bids for the same timber, the
successful bidder will be selected
on the basis of ability to further
the objectives of the Act of Aug
ust 28, 1937. The right is nereDy
reserved to waive technical de
fects in this advertisement; to
reject all bids, or to award the
timber for the amount of the
highest bid to other than the
nignest nianer wnen necessary,
pursuant to the Act of August 28.
1937 ( 50 Stat. 874). In order to
provide a continued supply of
timber to local industry so as to
assure the permanence of the
community which Is dependent
upon such industry. Dated at
Portland, Oregon, this 1st day of
February, 1946. w. H. Morning,
Chief Forester, O. and C. Ad
ministration.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having clalma against the

saiaie or Anna 1. smn, oeceaseo. now
nendlne In the County Court of Dottclas
County. Oregon, are hereby required
to present the same, duly verified, to
the undersigned at the ofTlcea of Rice,
Orcutl St Long In Roaeburg. Pougl
Countv, Oregon, within aix months from
the gin day or February. IBM.

R FLOYD AMES.
Administrator with the Win
annexed of the Estate of Anna
I, Ames, deceased
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NOTICE U hereby given that by vir-
tu of n order of tituird unt of

County Court uf tha Slate of
for Doula(i County, In th maltrr

tha Uuatdiaintahip of tha and
l of Xnul0 bowman, CUrica

and Dal Bowman. Minor, the
uidtr:...ad (.uaidijin of tha Drrn and
axtaia ot aald minora Will on and after

mat day of April. io. otrer lor
r and tall at private al for rah in

hand, all tha right, title and !nteret
aald minora, in and to th following

dttirriDM raai oroDfnv. iiujiira ir
DourUi County, State of Oregon,

Undivided imrr in
tha Northwest quarter nf Section 32,
and tha South half of the Northwest
ouarter and tha North half of tha
Sovlhweat quarter of Section '2M,

Townahio 39 South. Range 4 West
nt tha Willamoitt- - Meridian.
fteaird nidi for the ale of ald real

propar-- Will be received at tha office
Ira B Riddle, attorney at law. Room

222. Pacific Building, in KOeturs. Jre-

uaifm n nni iuuiiim a.

f. I HIM BUWrnrMl.
Guardian of tha peroon and
estate of Donnld Bnwfan,
Clarlr Bowman and Dale
Bowman, Mlnoi.

NOTICE TO CrOITOR
All oenLons bavin claim against tha

atata of Prank K- Pottf, deceed. now
pending in in uxiniv vourv m im
State of Oregon for, Douglaa County,
are hereby notified to preaent the urne.
property veriliea. io mr unorrnmu
administratrix at Ine office of Ira B
Riddle, Attorney. Roaeburg, Oregon,
within aix months from tha first duy

March. lfHli.
liAHKA K. ru
Admlnlotratrtx of tha Estate of
Frank E. Potta, Deceased.

NOTICE OF FINAL ftETTLEMKNT
Notice Is hereby given that the under-

signed Administratrix of the Estate of

her Final Account In tha Countv Court
of tha State of Oregon for Douglas
County and said, court haa appointed
Tuesday. April 2. W6. at 10 o'clock In
the forenoon of aaid dav, tn the County
Court Room in the Court House In
Roseburg, Douglaa Countv, Oregon, as
the time and place for hearing objec-
tions, if anv, io said account and the
settlement thereof.

Dated March 1, ltMft.
AGNES A. WEBER, formerly
Agnea A. Hunter. Administra-
trix with the will annexed of
the Estate of Sarah K. Hunter.
Deceased.

NOTICE OP FINAL HEARING
Notice is hereby given that the un-

dersigned Administratrix of the Estate
of Alva D. Hunter, deceaued. haa filed
her rinai Account in ine uouniv voun
of the State of Oregon or Douglna
Countv and aald court haa appointed
Tuesday. April 2. IMd. at 10 o'clock in
the forenoon of said day. In the County
Court Room in tne court House in none--

burg. Douglaa Countv, Oregon, as the
lime ana piace ior nearims imjc.iiuu.,
if any. to said account and the settle-
ment thereof.

Dated Marcn i, new.
AGNES A. WEBER, formerly
Agile A. Hunter. Administra-
trix of the Estate of Alva D.

" Hunter, Deceased.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
The Administrator of tha estate of

J. U Kent, deceased, hereby gives notice
that tha County Court of Douglaa
County. Oregon, has fixed Saturday.
March SO. 1940, at 10 00 o'clock A. M..
In the County Court Room in the Court
House at Roseburg. Douglas County.
Oregon, aa the time and place for hear-

ing objections, if any there be. to the
Final Account of the Administrator.

Dated March 1. 1044
G. V. WIMBERLY.
Administrator of the estate of
J. L. Kent. Deceased.
R. L. WHIPPLE. Attorney.

For Good Quality Beauty
Work and Evening

Appointments,
Phone 591

Dottice's Beauty Shop

L

5 Wool

Plaid Blankets

4.39 pair

Wool

Boot Sox

69C

NOTICE or PINAL SETTLEMENT
Notice la Hereby erven that the un

dersigned Adtmnlstratrta has filed, her

Slate of Oregon fur Douglas County, lhand taid court haa appelated Tuesday,
March M. 1M. at 10 ou 'clock in the ulforenoon in the County Court Room in estthe Court House, In ftoaaburg. Oregon,
aa the time and place for hearing otj
jecllone, if any. to aald .svount.

Dald February 23. 110. thapraui. uksehve.
Admimatratriw of the Eatatt
of Aimer Meaerve. Deceased. of

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
All persons having clalma agalnat the

ealate of George Stancliff, deceased,
now pending in the county court of the
Siata of Oregon, for the county of
Douglai. are hereby notified to preaent
the unt to the undenugned at the
office of Ira B. Riddle, in Roeeourg.
Oregon, duly verified within aix month,
from the lint publication of thla noucc
which la February 23. IM. of

ELLIS QUENT1N STANCLtFr",
Executor of the e.tate ot
'George Stancliff. deeeased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
Notice ia hereby given that the d

has been appointed administra-
tor of the Eatata of Willi Ann Chur-
chill, deceaued. All persona having
claims againat said Esta'a are notified to
preaent the num. verified aa requirea oy

w. to the administrator at tne oincea
Rice. Oreult at Long In Roseburg.

Douglas County. Oregon, within six
months from the date of thla notice.

Dated February 22. im
J. F. CHURCHILL.
Administrator of the Eitate
Willie Ann Churchill, de-

ceased.
of

TO CREDITORS
r iinriiimii havlne been eonolnt

l hv IK County Cnurt of Dnuatas.
Slat o' Oregon, aa the
of tne Estate or nro n w.n r.n,

I -- ,, h.vlna Aiialiffen.
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN to the

creditors of. and all persons having
laims aeainst aaia oeceesea. w vrc--i

tp-- verified as required bv law.
within six (61 montha after the first
publication nf thla notice to aald ad
ministrator, sifnon swi". "
flee of Sneneer W. Yatea. Attorney,
Rosebure, Oregon.

DATED this 7in ttay nr rcoruary,
IMS.

' Administrator.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
XTnilr I. trhv eivan that the ua

.f.l.n.H .tminl.tratnr haa filed in the
County Court of the State of Oregon
for Douglaa county, nts rinai section
In aettlement of aald Estate and Tues-
day the 19lh day of March. 190 at
10:u0 o'clock A. M. In the County Court
Room In the Court House In Roseburg.
Douglas county, uregon, nas oeen nacu
as the time and place for hearing

If any there be. to said Final
Account and for the settlement thereof.

JAMES 1NUKAM.
Administrator of the Estate of
Clarence J. Ingram, deceased.

NOTICE OP FINAL SETTLEMENT
1tlAtlfA la harathv ejiVon that tha Pinal

Account of the undersimed Executor
has been filed in the Countv Court of
Douglas County. Oregon and bv order
or said court, Monaay, marcn ia,
at ten o'clock In the forenoon of aaid
day, in the County Court Room in the
Court House, In Roseburg, Douglas
County, Oregon, hat been fixed as the
time and place for hearing objections.
if any. to aaia rinai accous. hw iw
the settlement thereof.

CHAHLES A. LLt, execu-
tor of the Estate of Fanni
Turner, Deceased.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
NOTICE HEREBY la given that Tues

day. April 2. 1146. at the hour of 10

O CIOCK A. 1W. in tne OUny somn
at the Court House In Roaeburg. Doug
las County. Oregon, have been fixed as
the time and nlace for hearing objec
tions, if any there be. to the final ac
count Ilieo djt me unaeminw in ui
ihnv antitltM, Court.

Da tea ana first pupusnea tnia im

day of March. IMS.
JA.MU A.
Administrator of the Estate of
Stephana A. Combs, Deceased.

A l' s having claims against the
Estate of Joseph M. Deardorff. deceased,
now pending In tha County Court of
the County of Douglas. State of Oregon,
are hereby notified to present the same,
verified as required by law. to the un-

dersigned at the office ot Paul E.
Geddea. Attorney, Roaeburg. Oregon.

ithin six months from tne date nereoi.
Dated thla 1st day of March, 1944.

CLINTON JONES.
Administrator of the Estate of
Joseph M. Deardorff, De-

ceased.

NOTICE OF HE ARINO OF FINAL
ACCOt NT

NOTICE HEREBY Is given that April
2, 1U46, at the hour of 10 o'clock A. M.

In the County court ttoom in ine toun
House in Roaeburg, Douglas County,
Ornn. have been fixed as the time
and place for hearing objections. If any.
to ine iinai account inea oy iiw unur-slgne-

In the above entitled court.

Guardian of the Estate of O.
L. Ot ant. an incompetent
per. 'If.

Boys'

Waist Overalls

1.13

Kitchen

Aluminum

Ware

25c to 1.30

NOTICE TO CRFDITORR
All oeraona havlnt claima aualntt tha

aatata uf Shirley Cain, deceased, now
pending in the County t ouit or tha
State of Oreuun, for Uouglua County,
are hereby required to preaent the
wma to the uitUen.igneu, properly veri
fied at tne omce oi ira a. itiuaie,
Huaeburg. Dougl County Uregon. utiti-.i- i

aix motiUta from rrbiuary l&th,
14C.

T. L. WEAVER.
Admin Ik Ira tor with will an-
nexed of tha Eiaia ot Shir-
ley Cain, leceased.

Chest
Colds
Act promptly. Mother, to help relieve
muscular soreness or tightness, contf- -

tion and irritation in upper breathing
passages, fits of coughing due to
colds. Rub on Vicks VapoHub ... it

PENETRATES to upper bronchial
tubes wit h its special medicinal vapors,

"Stimulates chest and back
surfaces like a warming poultice.

Often by morning most of the
misery of the cold is gone ! Remember- -

ONLY VAPORUB Gives YOU this spe-
cial double action. It's

the n home
remedy for relsev- - aa
ing miseries of W WS 9children's colds. V VaPORul

DANCE

Myrtle Creek
Grange Hall
Saturday Evening,

March 2

Music by

Melody Mountain Boys

Admission: SI.25 Couple

Midnight Refreshments

WILL YOU -- KA'CHO-O-

AURRY 00

60 OVCR TO

FULLERTON
Human
(TORE i

AN0 GET SOMETHING

FOft THAT COLO -- THEN
START YOUR 6TORV

r AOAIN.f

Pleas noto: Children's morn

lng matin 10 A. M.

Also Reg. Mat. & Eve.
'

SAT. and SUN. ONLY

,ikelt! arfef

who nu

ELLIOTT

lotbl Ileal
tail neaint,

mm.
Also:

A man without a memory

with murder on his mind.

I "V
1 I

'TlUft - l aBSBSBSe"se,?

I II m in.A aya

OdOCki CONWAY

lowing a week in Roseburg as
I euests of the former's brother-in- -

law and sister, Mr. and Mrs. K. 15.

Hampton, and family, in Laurel-wood- .

Visit at Youngren Home Miss
Elizabeth Levensaler and Miss
Zora Wooley have returned to
their homes in Sacramento, Calif.,
following a few days in Roseburg
as guests at the Carl Youngrens'
home at 1032 S. Main Street. Sig
Lindroth, also a resident of Sacra-
mento, was a guest at the young-
ren home Sunday.

Leave For North Mr. and Mrs.
Loren L. Miller of Red Bluff,
Calif., left Thrusday for points
north on business, following a
stop-ove- r in Roseburg to visit
their son. Sam. student at Rose
burg Senior High School, who
makes nts nome auring me scnuui
year with Dr. and Mrs. Clair K.
Allen and family on Watson
Street.

!

Do You Need Drain or Sewer Pipe
Bring in your drainage problems to us as we have
all sizes of concrete pipe to take care of your
needs. We stock Concrete Pipes, sizes from 4" to
24". Consult us for the size and kind of pipe you

need for your drain problem.

We Will Only sell Tou concrete ripe wnere
V Concrete Pipe Will Do the Job.

Ready Mix Concrete Co. Phone 620
SCOTTISH RITE MASONS

Remember, work in the ninth degree,
Saturday night, March 2. Your presence

is requested. Dinner at 6:30 P. M.

E. Leroy Hiatt,
Ven. Master.FUEL FOR SALE

SAWDUST
Sawdust Burner Parts

Carried in Stock

SLABWOOD 16. in. Green
4 ft. Dry and Green

IMMEDIATE DELIVERY

Prion. 468469

ROSEBURG LUMBER COMPANY

"WILL MEN ALIYE TODAY LIYE TO

SEE THE RETURN OF JESUS

HAYE WE COME TO THE WORLD'S

SUPREME HOUR?

Hear This Gripping Lecture at
The Seventh-Da- y Adventist Church

SUNDAY. MARCH 2, 7:30 P. M.
Corner of South Mo',n and Lan Slrtots

COME EVERYONE WELCOME

LJ fttWEERCHLEY L- -
MONTGOMERY WARD

315317 N. JACKSON ST.

Phono 5

I


