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No. 88
NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE.

$2,500.00 or less. For copies of the
form of proposal, form of con--

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid
for Timber." and addre--LEADERS FOR LIBERTYPvkliihM Dkllr txcmpt Bwb4t t7 OH

k,t V IE W LOMPAN V. INC the Chief Forester, 'O. and C. Ad-- ! bi1- - amount of bond required
ministration, 901 Guardian Build- - wl,n contract and other Informa-lng- .

Portland 4, Oregon, will be tion- - application should be made

temporary bachelor quarters on
the reservation for applicants
who are unable to secure other
bousing.

When all vacancies have been
filled, applicants who have not
been employed will have their
applications forwarded to other
installations of the Veterans Ad-

ministration for consideration if
they so desire.

Additional Information and ap-

plication forms may be secured
at the personnel office at the

As we celebrate the 214th anniversary of the birth of

Sea Mine Finder Saved
From Ghastly Tragedy

SEATTLE, Feb. 21 UPt Don't,
the Coast Guard begs, try to re-

convert a sea mine.
One of the lethal globes floated

up on the Washington shore and
just as an unidentified man was
loading his find onto a truck, au-

thorities intervened, probably sav-
ing his life.

The Coast Guard reported the
man said he planned to take it
home and convert it into a flower
pot.

received until ana opened at
10:30 A. M.. Pacific Standard
Time, March 12, 1946, for the
purchase of timber upon tracts'
hereinafter described; each bid
must state the amount per M. '

feet B.M., which will be offered

George Washington, we are impressed by the thought that
we need today, as in the Revolutionary period, men willing
to lead out with their fortunes and their lives in the cause
of Liberty. Not since the days of Washington has the prin

Numerous Types
Of Positions Open .

At Vets Hospital
' Due trr Increasing activities, the
Roseburg Veterans Administra-
tion hospital is now accepting ap-
plications for numerous types of
positions. The recruiting officer
reports that applications are be-

ing accepted for various medical
personnel, including doctors, den-
tists, nurses, laboratorians and
ward attnedants. There is an im-
mediate shortage in these types
of positions, especially the latter.
To provide the patients with the
high standard of service estab-
lished by the Veterans Adminis-
tration, It is necessary that there
be employed a sufficient number

ciple of freedom been more seriously threatened than today,
lor earn species and the total Jpe Red Cedar. No
consideration which will be paid bid for less than $2.00 per M
for the timber. No bid for less B- M. for the

the appraised value will bej' Fir, $50 per M. ft. B. M. for
considered. Each bid must be sub-- the Red Cedar, or a

Just as Washington was forced to contend with enemies at
milled In duplicate and be ac -

home as well as from abroad,
waging battle today with those
of Revolutionary times, would

companiea ny a deposit in the w"i e considered. Only fire-for-

of a certified cheek infavor killed timber is included in this
of the Treasurer of the United sale. T. 23 S., R. 9 w.. See 7

hands of a chosen few and submit to rule by the state rather States. The deposit of any sue--1 all merchantable timber desig-cessi-

bidder will be credited on nated for cutting on Lot 18 (SW4the contract. Payment in full atjSWi), estimated for the purpose
than follow the rough path of

Bowl for Health
AT

Roseburg Bowling Alley
Now open from tl A. M. to midnife in their new location

t 135 S. Rose St.

BOWLING BILLIARDS

PINSETTERS WANTED

The cause for which George Washington and his gallant
armies fought did not have unanimous approval from the
people of the Colonies. A large part of the aristocracy was
definitely opposed to the Revolution. Vested interests worked
openly to discredit Washington and force his removal, know

m: nine ui tiling me wiuiaci is "i ii'ia iwiit? iu oe 1140 m. leet
required in sales amounting to Douglas Fir, 135 M. feet Hemlock
$2,500.00 or less. For copies of No bid for less than $5.00 per M
the form of proposal, form of ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fircontract and bond, terms of 0 per M. ft. B. M. for the
ment, amount of deposit required Hemlock, or a total purchasewith bid, amount of bond re-- 1 price of $7,470.00, will be consid-quire-

with contract and other ered All Douglas Fir trees under
information, application should 2K ins. DBHOB are reserved from
be made to the address shown cutting. Logging to be done bv
above. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: Caterpillar-typ- e tractor unless

ing that by so doing the struggle for independence would

bo proponents of freedom are
forces which, like the Tories
maintain authority in the

struggling independence.

preferred to follow the easy
from The Crown, unwilling

fact, contending that the Col
to combat the power of Great

independence did not envi

throughout the world. Doleful

fail.
Alany of the common people

course of accepting domination
to aiek independence and, in
onies lacked military strength
Britain, freely predicting failure of the "uprising."

The authors of our national
sion an easy course. Subsequent events proved that rugged

Beautiful Floors
WITH

KENTILE
For Homes, Stores. Offices, Schools, Churches, Lodges, the

Universal Floor Covering
Fine Appearance Long Lasting Economical

KENTILE
Sold and installed only by the

' COEN LUMBER COMPANY

indeed was the path which led to eventual agreement be-

tween States and organization of Constitutional government.
How parallel the situation runs today:
Freedom and Liberty are threatened by statist doctrines.

State socialism is spreading
prophets openly predict inability of the United States to
escape engulfment by totalitarianism and propose the easy
course of drifting with the tide, rather than struggling to
maintain our hard-wo- n and bitterly -defended independence.
There are many who, without remonstrance, would submit
to regimentation; who would exchange democratic govern-
ment for a beneficent dictatorship virtual monarchy.

Concrete Pipe Manufactured At

Redy Mix Concrete Company

Sizes pipe to 30-in-

We Sell a Truckload or One Piec-e-

National emergency led to
bureaucratic administration, perpetuation in power, subju-
gation of states' rights. We saw the breakdown of our Con-

stitutional system of checks and balances. We saw a "rubber
stamp" Congress, a "packed" Supreme Court. We saw our
government surrendered to the control of one man. We have
seen federal interference with the right of free enterprise.

Telephone 620

Today, although the emergency no longer exists, we still
find ourselves regimented, controlled and directed. We see
in the making an effort to substitute regional "authorities,"
n place of our present system

"aa ana b"""- - of payment,amount of deposit reauired with

Iu "1F "uuress snnwn above. IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 21 S . R.
8 W, Sec. 17, all merchantable
'imber designated for cutting on
,n SEI SWt, estimated for the
purpose 01 tnis sale to be 440 M
leei- - Douglas Fir, 50

total purchase price of $905.00

otherwise directed hv off Wr in
charge of sale. T. 30 S . R. 4 W.
Sec. 27, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on the SEi
NEi, estimated for the purpose of
this sale to be 880 M. feet Doug-
las Fir, 80 M. feet Incense Cedar.
No bid for less than $3.50 per M.
ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir,
$2.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the In-
cense Cedar, or a total purchase
price of $3,280.00, will be consid-
ered. T. 31 S.. R. 5 W.. Sec. 27, all
merchantable! timber designated
for cutting on a portion of the
WJ SE4, estimated for the pur-
pose of this sale to be 565 M. feet
Douglas Fir, 5 M feet stamped
Sugar Pine. No bid for less than
$2.40 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Douglas Fir, $7.50 per M. ft. B. M.
for the stamped Sugar Pine, or
a total purchase price of $1,393.50,
will be considered. Only an area
of approximately 25 acres lying
Fast of blazed cutting line in WJ
SEi is included in the sale. Blazed
line trees and unstamped pine
trees are reserved from sale. All
timber cut from the above des-
cribed areas must be manufac-
tured in the local marketing area
designated by the O. and C. Ad-
ministration unless otherwise au-
thorized by the Chief Forester.
If the unit prices bid are above
those authorized by MPR 460,
they will be reduced to the maxi-
mum permitted under that order.
In case 01 two or more identical
bids for the same timber, the sue--1

cessful bidder will be selected on
the basis of ability to further the
ohjeclives of the Act of August
28, 1937. The right is hereby re- -

served to waive technical delects
in this advertisement: to reject
all bids, or to award the timber
for the amount of the highest
hid to other than tne highest bid-

icr when necessary, pursuant to
!.nc A.Si .

nf
. AURl'st f"' 1MI. .

isn
Stat. K4,, in oroc-- r 10 proviao a
continued supply of timber to
local industry so as to assure the
permanence of. the community
which is dependent upon such in-

dustry. Dated at Portland, Ore-
gon, this 15th day of February,
li4ti. VV. H. Horning, Chief For-
ester, O. and C. Administration.

Welfare Shop to Be Open The
Catholic ladies welfare shop, lo-

cated in the basement of the par-
ish house on East Oak Street,
will be open Saturday.

NOTICE
To Velerant of the Civil War. Mexican

War and Indian War and widow re-

maining unmarried thereof Veterana
of the War. and
World War 1. who are dlaabied to the
extent of 40 per cent or more: and
wtdowa remainms unmarried of

and World War I vet-
eran: Notice Is hereby given that all
claima for lax exemption must be on
file In thla olflce. on or before April
1. ISM.

NED DIXON. v
Douglas County Assessor.

(Adv.) israr

SEE
FLOYD WILSON

SPECIALIST
For

Body and Fender
Repairing and Painting
ROSEBURG
MOTOR CO.

Buick Pontiac
Authorized Dealers

Phone 141
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Clara's
MILLINERY AND TOT SHOP

. US W. Cass
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states' rights would be practically eliminated, except in
token form, by the "authorities."

We find our people lulled
by clever leftist propaganda,
liberty, free enterprise, and
which Washington and our Revolutionary patriots so, gal-

lantly fought. .. .

We have our "Tories" today,, just as they existed two
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The Weather
U. 8. Weather Bureau Office

Hoacburg, Oreaan
Forecast for Hoseourg and vl- -

- 'y"i rain lonignt and

nigneat temp, for any Feb 79
Lowest temp, for any Feb. 3
highest temp, yetterday 5SLowest temp, last mgnt .. 40
precipitation yesterday Z .1
Precipitation trom fao. 1 . f.73Deficit from Fnii 1 iiu
fcxcese from Sept. 1, !"!!s!l

In the Day's Mews

(Continued from page 1)

expire if nothing is done.

MEANWHILE Republicans in
talking of. a

DrJ-INIT- FORMULA ior end-
ing price ceilings. They are mull-in-

these two points:
L Redefine OPAs powers in

such a way as to prevent their
use to control the nation's econ-
omy.

2. Remove ceilings in each in-

dustry as and when its produc-tion reaches 75 per cent of nor-
mal.

'

THE fact that Republicans in
are considering ANY

sort 01 definite, POSITIViS pro-
gram is interesting, and perhaps
significant.

So far the Republican party has
been, PURELY NEGATIVE. It
has criticized and complained, but
has offered no constructive plan
Pf own.

IN Bombay there
demonstrations.

are

A mob of Indians (meaning
peoples, who live in India), Includ-
ing It number of persons wearingthe uniform of the Roynl Indian
Navy, tears a U. S. Hag down
front, above one of our govern-
ment offices and BURNS IT in
the street.

The motives back of tho flat
burning incident are unclear
from the dispatches, but a spokes-
man for the mob said to a group
of American correspondents:

'Thlfl is nnl nn unli.An.1, .biiu niiu-iiLa-

demonstration. It is
"ie Americans snouid get out

of India too. What right have you
here when you are not Indian V

WHAT
hits us with a Jolt Is the

fact that America's
reputation is not what it ONCE
WAS throughout the world. In
Bombay, apparently, there are
people who look uixw us as UP-
HOLDERS OF OPPRESSION.

There was a time when Amer-
ica stood forth as the FOE ol op-

pression.
a

THESE arc admittedly difficult
The world is filled with

loar and hatred. As ONE OF
THE VICTORS, America is nat
urally under suspicion. Maintain-
ing our historic reputation un-

sullied, under such conditions, is
a task of staggering proportions,
railing for leadership of almost
superhuman excellence.

But, in incident after Incident,
it has seemed to this Insignificant
writer that our foregn policy has
FAILED to dramatize to the
world the genuine good will of
the American people toward oth-
er peoples.

If that U true, tiie failure U a
tragedy.

of dramaticSPEAKING
dispatches picture

one for us.
HIROH1TO comes forth from

his palace and WALKS among
the people of Tokyo, pausing re-

peatedly among working men at
their benches for a few brief
words.

Duanc Honncssy, Al corre-
spondent,' comments: "it wasn't
like prewar days, when everyone
was cleared from upper floors of
buildings so they could mil look
down on the l of the
sun goddess."

Illrohlto Is smart. He hro'eva
how to adapt himself tit WW

Ways.

Taken lo Penitentiary
Pepufy Sheriff Al Smith

delivered John Rons Casey.
Tacnma, Wash., to the stale peni-
tentiary at Sa'.rm, to brain his
five-yea- r term for the sotibciy if
Max Pence's barber shi p. N.
alacktuti SU

centuries ago. We have our defeatists, our vested interests,
our political cowards.

We need today men like Washington and his associates

of medical personnel.
No previous experience is re--1

quired for the position of ward
attendant, as a continual course
of instruction is given in the care
of patients to all personnel en-

gaged in this type of work.
Applications are also being ac-

cepted for positions of clerk,
clerk-typis- t and stenograoher.All applications will be consid-
ered for appointment In the fol-

lowing order: Ui disabled vet-
erans; (2) veterans; 3 former
federal employees, and 14) others.

Up to the present time, very
few veterans have applied for
work, and the recruiting officer
stated that in certain positions
there is very little competition,
and for this reason anyone inter-
ested should place his application
on file.

Action has been taken to set up

Beware Coughs
from common colds

That Hang On
Creomulsion relieves nromntlT bs.

cause It goes right to the seat of the
trouble to Help loosen and expel
germ laden phlegm, and aid nature
to soothe and heal raw. tender. In
flamed bronchial mucous mem
branes. Tell your druggist to sell yona bottle of Creomulslan with the un
derstanding you must like the way it
quickly allays the cough or you are
to have your money back.

CREOMULSION
for Coughs, Chest Colds, Bronchitis

LADIES'

AUXILIARY

V. F. W.
Tea-Tow- el Rummage

and Food Sale

Saturday, Feb. 23rd

at

Roseburg Electric Shop
131 N. Jackson St.

A Superb
I 711 n I

I " luMca

rurntturt

Maqnavox
Retfia J Paeeeerap.

OH DtMONITaATION NOV AT

Bob's Music Shnn
'Everything In Music'

l 30S N. Jackson SL I

Phone: 908 I

Dream

i stuff i

5 It's so easy to make
everyone happy with
a eTift fnm WtliiAms
Jewelry Ior our entire
store is stocked with
the KtuK Irom whih

ai-- made.
Stop In today and oc
our tllsplav of tcvclry- Icarn how aimplc it
l to make your
difains come true.

301 Jocko St.
Arrow from
Star Theatre '

who place Freedom above selfish interest and personal gain;
men and women willing to sacrifice, if need be, to main-

tain tho democratic principles for which our forefathers

TIRES TIRES
HUNDREDS OF THEM!

Sizes:
60016. . . ... i .....4 and 6 ply
65016. . . . ......... 4 and 6 ply
75016. . 6 and 8 ply
70015 ....4 and 6 ply
60020 :.6ply
70020 .8 ply
32x6.......... lOply
75020. 8 ply
82520 10 ply
90020 10 ply
100020 12 ply
110020 . . 12 ply

All Good Used Tires

U. S. TIRE STORE
Stephens and Mosher Streets

j. t& 0., n. iu w., jc od, ail
merchantable timber designated
for cutting on a portion of the
NW.SWJ and portion of SW1
SW1, estimated for the purpose
Df this sale to be 20J0 M feet
Douulas Fir and 65 M feet Hem.
lock. No bid for less than $5.80
per M. rt. H.M. for the Douglas
Fir and $2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for
the Hemlock, or a total purchase
price of $12,020.00, will be con-
sidered. In the NWJSWt only
those trees branded USOC, on an
area of approximately 3 acres In
the Southeast corner lying south
and east of the ridge, are in-
cluded in this sale. Logging on
this 3 acres Is to be done by
caterpillar type tractor unless
otherwise specified by the offi-
cer in charge of the sale. In tho
SW1SWJ approximately 10 acres
lying in tne western side and
bounded by a well blazed line
are reserved from sale. T. 28 S.,
R. 3 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
the NWi. Lot 3 (NWSW). Por
tion Lot 4 (SWSW), and Por-
tions of the E1SW1, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to
be 5350 M feet Douglas Fir, 100 M
feet Stamped Sugar Pine, 120 M
feet White Fir, 670 M feet Incense
Cedar. 140 M feet Western Bed
Cedar and 5 M feet Hemlock.
No bid for less than $4.00 Der
M.ft.B.M. for the Douglas Kir,
$10.30 per M.ft.B.M. for the
Stamped Suear Pine. $1.50 ner
M.ft.B.M. for the Incense CedarJ
and S2.00 per M.ft.B.M. for the
White Fir. Western Red Cedar
and Hemlock, or a total pur
chase price of $23,965.00. will be
considered. Those portions of
Lot 4 and E.SWJ lying south of
a well blazed line on the ridge
top are reservea irom cutting.
inciuuing oiazea line l?,cAr"pine trees not stampedare reserved from cutting. AIU
timoer cut irom tne aoove

areas must lx manufac-turi'-

in the local marketing area
designated by the O. and C.
Administration unless otherwise
authorized by the Chief Forester.
If the unit prices bid are above
those authorized hy MPR 4(i0.
they will be reduced to the maxi-
mum permitted under that order.
In case of two or more identical
bids for the same timber, the
successful bidder will be selected
on the basis of ability to further
the objectives of the Act of Aug-
ust 28, 1937. The right is hereby
reserved to waive technical de-
fects in this advertisement; to
reject all bids, or to award the
timber for the amount of the
highest bid to other than the
highest bidder when necessary,
pursuant to the Act of August 28,
1!7 150 Stat. 874). in order to
provide a continued supply of
timber to local Industry so as to
assure the permanence of the
community which is dependent
u(n,,i auui iiiuuawy. i.ctlt'U HI
Portland, Oregon, this 1st day of
February, W. II. Horning,
Chief Forester, O. and C. Ad-
ministration.

Notice of Timber Sale
Sealed bids, marked oulside

"Bid for Timber," and addressed
to the Chief Forester, O. and C.
Administration, 901 Guardian,
Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will
be received until and opem-- at
10:30 A. M.. Pacific Standard
Time, March 12. 1946 for the
purchase of timber upon tracts
hereinafter described; each bid
must slate the amount per M.
fwt B. M., which will be offered
(or each species and the total con-
sideration which will be paid
the timber. No bid for less than
the appraised value will be con-
siclemi. F.ach bid must be submit
ted in duplicate and be accom--

paniod by a deposit In the form
of a ceriitied chock In favor ol
the Treasurer of Ihe United'
States. The deposit of any success-
ful! bidder will he credited on tho
contract. Payment in full at the
time of filing the mnlract is

in sales amounting In

CAN'T KEEP
GRANDMA EN
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Stva Llvly a ounttslsr
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fought and died.

Fine. Jail Meted
To Drunk Driver

Roy Melvln Nichols. 41, Port-
land salesman, was fined $130,
Jailed for 3D days, and his license
was revoked fur one year, yes-

terday, by Justice of tho Peace
Thomas C. Hart del, for operat-
ing a motor vehicle while under
the Influence of Intoxicating
liquor.

George W. Cooper was fined
$25 for intoxication on a public
highway, in addition, Hartfiel
tired 14 other persons for traffic
violations:

Leslie McFarland, overload,
$23; Albert C. McCall, axle over-
load, $23; Carlyle E. Klllitz. no
tail light, $10; Floyd Beck, over-
load, S10, and unit overload, $15;
Kaymond C. Ijounnce. unit over-
load, $20, James L. Barnes, axle
overloads, $10 anil $20: Frederick
W. Rcrwcrt, unit overloads, $10
and $30: George R. Wilkinson,
overload, $15; Charles A. lluruth,
unit overload, $211; Roy V. Long,
overload, $25, and axle overload,
$23; Ralph E. Krohn, unit over-
load, $30; Wilbur B. Meredith,
unit overload. $13.

restriction of freedom through

of government by states, for

into a sense of false security
failing to realize the threat to
those rights of freedom for

campaign should call or contact
Carter, telephone 832, at the
American Red Cross in the Rose-hnr- r,

Armnrv.

KRNR
Mutual Broadcasting System

1480 Kllooyelea.

KKMAININO HOIJKS TODAT
iM lulua Lwlk, Jr., rUugh Chem-

ical.
4:IH Htm MllUr, Kabltra.
4 fcraklne Johnton, Pares.
4;4& 04 Nrwa rrif'raa, AtMmbtjr

( OW.
Sao Mul,al Clark. Mnora rarnUare.
fl:IA httirrmin, Krlloio.

::lft Capl. MltfnltM. UariaVr ('.Tom Mia. Ral.Un
H.M Oahrlrl Hrallrr. KnaiL
ff I.V Musical Inlcilud.
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Mnlar a.

:Sa Seellight BanSt, Cera rata
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Mv-B- lw ana Shine. Merlin Oree.
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Roseburg, Oregon
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o

Thieves at Grants Pass
Steal Two Automobiles

("HANTS PASS, . Fch. 22.

.' Car thieves struck twice
here Wednesday night, according
to reports given city police. A

l!137 hlack Packard sedan regis-
tered to Lilwaid T. Phipps was
missing from the Stott Buiik
Garage on South Sixth street and
a IP to Chevrolet master coupe
was stolen from the garage of T.
K.- Mathews.

Tlielt of $i;i;5 30 and a wrist
watch was reported to police this
morning bv Albert Alison, mana-
ger of the Laylon hotel.

Volunteer Workers for
Red Cross Sought Here

t need for volunteer work-
ers lo aid In the Red ("mess fund
ramimlgn riming March was
voiced lodav hv C. H. Carter,
chairman of the linn;las I'ounty
Red ( 'ross drive. Assistance- '
neiik'd, he said, In oMhv work
and In various other campaign
activities, including the staging
of special events and serving on
planning committees.

Funds raised In the forthcom-
ing drive tii be used pnm-ipal-

by the Dougla Countv dm pier
In aiding reluming
a:!d their families.
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