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tract the major attention, how
ever. president of the.Sargem Com-

pany, lor $450,000. The transac-
tion included some other

his comparatively short career.
Joe, a former Redmond High ath-
lete and of Aus-
tralia, is the better fundamental

pleted early In February.
The People's Water and Gas

Company was recently purchased
by R. M. Sherttt, New York City,

Dassy Wrestling
Card Offered Fans

Kiser. former Coast Lleht- -

WHY DEFLATE IT7 heavy Chamo. is the more sDeo
wrestler and is credited withtacular and his t hold

rkUsh4 Deily Kietpt dar Ml
btt EKY1EW COM FAN, INC.

Bntrd u Mcoad ciam utter May
17, lWtO, at th poatofftcs at Kueburg.
Orasuo. under act oi atarcb t, l7tv

has been the downfall of more
veterans than Lynam has met in

slight edge In aggressiveness.
These two counts have made him
a favorite to dispose of Kis-
er and retain his coveted crown.

At Armory Here
CBAILII V. ITANTON
KD WIN U KNAfF fty Charles V. Stanton

"Some of our western towns never seem to grow up. They
Rufus "Pinkv" Jones and Hrh ine usual inree-roun- d prelim-

inary boxing exhibition will open
NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE

Sealed bids, marked outside
Bid for Timber." and addressed

ifamber of Um AMoclatcd Pr, a

lNewipajxw PubUebarm Auociatlor.
loa Audit bureau ui Circulation.

Parks in a preliminary? Never!
The "Blrmineham Bomber" the match at 8:30 o'clock. Elton

threeand the Canadian champ will
want to pose as relics of the Old West, of the gun-totin-

g, hell-f-or leather west, most of which never was."
Owen will referee all
matches.

Concrete Pipe Manufactured At

Redy Mix Concrete Company

Siies pipe 4 Inch to 30-in-

We Sell a Truckload or One Piec-e-

aapraaeatod by CO.,
INC.. ollicaa Id Maw York. Cbica, San
rranclaco. Lot Aajalaa SaalUa, rorv

to the Chief Forester, O. and C.
Administration, 901 Guardian

meet at the Roseburg Armoryarena next Saturday night. Un-
der ordinary circumstances the

Such is the statement made by Charles A. Sprague, in his
column, "It Seems To Me," appearing daily in The Oregon

Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will
be received until and opened at Coo Boy Vote Slated on

Buy of Water System
10:30 A. M.. Pacific Standard

two t mat men would be
billed in the headline match but
not this week.Statesman. Time, January 8, 1946, for the

purchase of timber upon tracts
hereinafter described: each bid

No one can question the truth of Editor Sprague's state COOS BAY, Ore.. Dec. 28. VP
Telephone 620 Roseburg, Oregonment, but why deflate our legends and traditions?

A capacity crowd is expectedto be on hand to see Joe Lynam
defend his newiywon Pacific
Coast Junior Heavyweight Cham- -

must state the amount per M.

aaorlaUea Bataa
in Out of

Br Mali Oregoa Hut
Par Year l.ao fo.oo
Nix Mouth 3.7S 4.UU
Tbxaa Muulai W Mo
Far year, by city carrier f" "
Far month, by city carrier U.00

feet B. M which will be offered
for each species and the total con-
sideration which will be paid for
the timber. No bid for less than

The Coos Bay Water District
Commission recommended today
the purchase of the People's
Water and Gas Company filtra-trio- n

plant, mains, distribution
system, and office building for
$373,000.

An election will be held Jan-
uary 21 on the proposed purchase
of the plant by a bond Issue. If
approved, the sale would be com- -

the appraised value will be con
sidered. Each bid must be sub
mitted In duplieate and be accom
panied by a deposit in the form
of a certified check in favor of
the Treasurer of the United

Eionsnip against Jack Kiser.
the championship

angle, the match Is one that oth-
er cities have been seeking for
several months.

Actually Matchmaker Don
Owen is givin" Douglas county
fans a double main event. Jones,
the "Alabama Assassin" is well
known here and enemy No. 1 on
the grappling book at the pres-
ent time. Parks Is a great favo-
rite and he will be given no bet-
ter than an even chance to dis-

pose of the head butting Negro
villain. Regardless of the out-
come, the match will be packed
with color and excitement.

The championship tilt will at

States. The deposit of any suc-
cessful bidder will be credited on

TROUBLED WITH HERNIA?

You don't need to continue it!

Successful Treatment by

DR. R. L. DUNN
CHIROPRACTOR

The Weather
U. 8. Weather Bureau Office

Roseburg, Oregon
Forecast for Roseburg and vi-

cinity; Rain tonight and Satur-
day.
Highest temp, for any Deo. ,. . 70
Lowest temp, for any Dec... .. S
Highest temp, yesterday ...... 58
Lowest temp, last night ... 55
Precepitation yesterday . 1.73
Precipitation from Dec. 1 6.54
Exoesa from Deo. 1, 194S 1.97
Excess from Sept 1, 1945 5.43

the contract. Payment In full at PRUDENTIAL LIFE

lauraace
HORACE C. BERQ

8peelal Agent
Douglaa Abstract Company

Phone 87

the time of filing the contract is
required in sales amounting to
$2,500.00 or less. For copies of
the form of proposal, form of
contract and bond, terms of pay-
ment, amount of deposit required
with bid, amount of bond re-- . Phone 397-- JIn Masonic Building Roseburg
juired with contract and other

application should be
made to the address shown above.In the Day's News

Says Mr. Sprague:
Legend always exaggerates, and the wild west which sur-

vives In western movie and western adventure stories is
the magnified glorification of a west whioh was by no means
universal. Most of the western towns were drab, dull, un-

eventful. The holdups and the shooting scrapes were,
occasional, Just as they are today. Only in the mining
settlement was there any steady run of killings. There the
combination ef gold and liquor, of greed and revenge, kept
the crime chart at fever stage.

But this pose of being wild west, of being tough and primi-
tive, seem to have a grip on some ef our cities, until even
the reapeotable elements, who really are in big majority,
accept the pose as genuine and meekly acquiesce.

Editor Sprague's comment was prompted by a report from
a Klamath county grand jury which, while investigating
complaints of widespread gambling, said :

It recommends to the law enforcement bodies a policy In
this respect which takes Into consideration the character
and neede of Klamath county, Including Its topography, In-

dustry and inhabitants.
In other words, the grand jury recognized that people in

Klamath county revel in historic legend which painted a
picture of a bad, bold community; a community where men
took their liquor straight, their poker seriously, and kept
their Colts in readiness to enforce their own laws or lack
thereof. The grand jury took cognizance of the fact that
present-da- y Klamath county residents emulate early-da- y

practices in a sort of a way and, in effect,
advises law officers to soft-ped- al enforcement of gambling,
as long as the situation doesn't get out of hand.

Thus it is officially proclaimed that the people of Klamath
county are "DIFFERENT" from the ordinary run, for
whom gambling laws were made.

RUSSELL'S

Typewriter Service
Office Machine Service

and Supplies
335 N. Jackson Phone 320

Notice of Timber Sale
Scaled bids, marked outside

"Bid for Timber", and addressed
to the Chief Forester, O. and C.
Administration, 901 Guardian
Building, Portland 4, Oregon,
will be received until and

(Continued Xrom page 1)

opened at 10:30 A. M., Pa

good apostle tor American for-

eign policy. II our diplomats can
follow the broad trail he has
blazed throughout the world,
American leadership will be

cific Standard Time, January 8,
1946, for the purchase of timoer
upon tracts hereinafter described;
each bid must state the amou.it

WESTERN UNION
is now enrolling young women in their Santa Cruz, Calif.

COMMUNICATIONS SCHOOL
Course" Runs Nine Weeks

Salary While Learning
Railroad Transportation Furnished

Immediate Assignment Upon Graduation
Rapid Promotion Frequent Increases

Vacation With Fay
Permanent Dignified Work

FORTIFY YOUR FUTURE
See Mr. Coles

Western Union Telegraph Co.
200 West Cass St. Phone 22

IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 21
S., R. 8 W., Sec. 17, all merchan-
table Umber designated for cut-
ting on the NWi, NE1 SWi,
NWJ SWJ. and SWI SWI,
estimated for the purpose of
this sale to be 845 M. feet
Green Douglas Fir, 2785 M. feet

Douglas Fir, 35 M. feet
Green Red Cedar, and 240 M.
feet Red Cedar. No bid
for less than $5.00 per M. ft. B.
M. for the Green Douglas Fir,
$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the fire-kille-

Douglas Fir and Green Red
Cedar and $.50 per M. ft. B. M.
for the Red Cedar, or a
total purchase price of $9,985.00,
will be considered. All timber on
W., NWJ, North and West of the
road, is reserved from cutting.
On the balance of Wi NWI and
NE1 NWI only Douglas Fir trees
26" DBHOB and over and fire-kille-d

timber Is included in the
sale. On SEJ NWi and SWJ only

per M. feet B. M., which will be
offered for each species and the
total consideration which will be

aid lor the timber. No bid for
ess than the appraised value will

be considered. Kach bid must be
submitted In duplicate and be ac

DANCE
Azalea Grange

January 1,
8:30 P. M.

Refreshments
Music by Azalea Grange

Orchestra

Christmas Eve news thisTHE had its SIGNIFICANT
as well as its pitiful points.

In Paris, children whose par-
ents still can't buy new shoes for
them "pressed their noses against
show windows displaying toy
Jeeps costing $175 each and

dolls."
Stores In Rome, blacked out by

a power shortage, "displayed an
abundance of cheeses, nuts and
confections at which the workpr
making $2 a day could only
LOOK."

companied by a deposit In the
form of a certified check In favor
of the Treasurer of the United
States. The deposit of any suc-
cessful bidder will be credited on
the contract Payment in full at
the time of filine the contract is

This idea of being "different" is paying big dividends in
a good many spots. required In sales amounting to

$2,500.00 or less. For copies of the timber is inciuoeo in
the sale. T. 28 S., R. 4 W., Sec. 13,Talk to a Californian about California weather and you'll

find that any disturbance is "unusual". California's normal
form ox proposal, iorm oi con all merchantable timber desig

nated for cutting on the NEJ
NWJ, NWJ NWJ and SWJ NWJ,

tract and bond, terms of payment,
amount of deposit required with
bid, amount of bond required with
contract and other Information,

estimated for the purpose of this
fOOWT IET YOua MONEV GO--

sale to be 1580 M. feet Douglas
IN 9M0KE - OCT COMW.CICUCII are the fruits of inflation. A siFir, 45 M. feet White Fir, 60 M.s not pBoncTiON s nfeet Incense Cedar and JO M.which makes black market

application should be made to the
address shown above. In DOUG-
LAS COUNTY: T. 24 S., R. 3 W.,
Sec. 5, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on the SW1
NEi and NKi SW1, estimated for

feet Red Cedar. No bid for less
than $3.20 per M. ft. B. M. for the

weather is "a little better than perfect."
Talk to a Texan and you'll learn that Texas is a part of

the United States only because its people feel sorry for the
Union and want to help it along. Any Texan will tell you
that we would have lost the late war had it not been for
Texas' contribution. And he'll even prove it to you if you'll
give him time.

The Californian or the Texan isn't fooling himself or
anyone else by his pose, but both he and his listener enjoy

ers rich and STARVES decent,
ordinary people.-Th-

lesson wo must learn Is

FROM

KtvM BAIUY frJDouglas Fir and ?.uo per M. it.
B. M. for the wnite f ir, incense
Cedar and Red Cedar, or a totalthat inflation arises out of LACK

CLOSED
Monday, Dec. 31st

Account Inventory

DENN-GERRETSE-
N CO.

OF PRODUCTION.
the purpose of this sale to De oooo
M. feet Douglas Kir, 115 M. feet
Hemlock. 55 M. feet Incense
Cedar, 55 M. feet Red Cedar, 15

purchase price of $5,326.00, will
be considered. Logging is to be
done by caterpillar-typ- tractor
unless otherwise authorized byIN contrast with most of the bhe make-believ- e, the provincial pride, theI world, this Christmas season in the officer in charge of the sale.

M. feet White f ir. ino Did ior
loss than $5.0 per M. ft. B. M. for
the Douglas Fir, $2.00 per M. ft.
B. M. for the Hcmlork and White
Fir, $1.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the

America is a riotous time. ALL-TIM- E

sales records have been
falling like a row of dominoes incense cedar, .so per m. ii.

B. M. for the Red Cedar, or a

T. 28 S., R. 4 W., Sec. 35 all mer-
chantable timber designated for
cutting on the NEJ SWJ and
NWJ SWJ, estimated for the
purpose of this sale to be 1350
M. feet Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet
Stamped Sugar Pine, 40 M. feet
Incense Cedar, 5 M. feet Red
Cedar and 25 M. feet Whito Fir.

402 W. Oak Phone 128
total purchase price of $19,156.00,
will be considered. Logging is to
be done by Caterpillar-typ- e trac

pretension of being "different"
For many years there has been a determined trend toward

uniformity. Our educational system has endeavored to
"standardize" education to the point where individual char-
acteristics and personality were subjugated to a common
mold. Every city has tried to make itself like every other
city. Individuality has been stifled. Homogeneity has been
overemphasized.

tor unless otherwise specmea Dy
the officer In charge of the sale.
T. 32 S.. R. 5 W.. Sec. 17. all mer

when the end one is pushed over.
It Is FINE, of course.
In Its way, It dramatizes the

blessed fact that the American
way of life is BETTER because It
brings the American people more
of the good things of life. The
war has PROVED that fact to
the satisfaction of every Intelli-

gent thinker.

chantable timber designated for
I-- 1

No bid for less than 52.70 per M.
ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir,
$8.40 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Stamped Sugar Pine and $2.00
per M. ft. B. M. for the Incense
Cedar. Red Cedar and White

Though it may be a juvenile characteristic to seek to be
cutting on the Nut and tne inw
SEI, estimated for the purpose of
this sale to be 4085 M. feet Doug-
las Fir, 160 M. feet White Fir,
205 M. feet Incense Cedar, 70 M.

TONIGHTdifferent , we get a kick out of it. Maybe it's because
we're juvenile minded. But if so there's a lot of others like Fir. or a total purchase price

RIABof S3.869.00. will be consideredfeet stamDed Sugar Pine. b5 M.
feet stamDed Ponderosa Pine. Nous. This desire to be "different" can be made to pay divid-

ends when applied commercially. It appeals to our eeo,
D hirl for less than S4.40 Der M. ft.

All Douglas Fir less than 22"
DBHOB, all unmarked pine trees,
and all trees within two tracts of
about 21 acres each, bounded by
blazed lines are reserved from

Much of our affectation is founded upon wild west legend.
B. M. for the Douglas Fir. S2.30
per M. ft. B. M. for the White
Fir and Incense Cedar, $11.80Why Ueflato it 1

HENRY J.
TAYLOR

Noltd Economist

ud Author

Der M. ft. B. M. for the stamped

RAINBOW GRILL
120 South Stephens Street

NOW
OPEN

Completely New Kitchen Equipment Including

Electric Dishwashes and Sterilizer.

D forget that America can't RE-
MAIN an island of riotous pro
perlly in a bankrupt world.
EVENTUALLY, we must either
bring the rest of the world UP
or we will be DRAGGED DOWN.
That Is one of these hard truths
that can't be escaped.

Sugar Pine, $8.00 per M. ft. B. M.
cutting. All timber cut from the
above described areas must
be manufactured In the local
marketing area designated hy the
O. and C. Administration unless

Olt?n was listrii as mlsslnt? In for the stamped ronnerosa
or a total Durchase price ofaction after the? U.S.S. Helena

went down July 6, 11M3. Auuust otherwise authorized by the Chief$20,232.50, will be considered. All
Douglas Fir trees less than 22 ins.
DBHOB, all unmarked Pine trees,
and all cull trees are reserved

Forester, if tne unit prices Diaid, IMZ the Navy ent word to
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Glen

Memorial Service Set
For Glen B. Woodruff

As a part of the Sunday morn-
ing services at the First Baptist
Church of Roseburg next Sunday,
there will be a brief memorial
service for Glen Byron Woodruff.

Woodruff, 1103 S. Mill Street, ; YOUR LAND jHERE Is an undertone of grav- -

T Kosermrgr, that Glen was de-
ceased. Glen was born In Rose- -

are above those authorized by
MPR 460, they will be reduced to
the maximum permitted under
that order. In ease of two or
more Identical bids for the same
timber, the successful bidder will
be selected on the ha:is of ability

this GAY Christmas season In AND MINE
from cutting. All snags over 20
Ins. DBHOB and 24 feet high are
to be felled. All timber cut from
the above described areas must
be manufactured In the local
marketing area designated hy the
O. and C. Administration unless
otherwise authorized by the Chief
ForestcT. If the unit prices bid

buiR May 4, 1920. He graduatedfrom the local schools and then
attended the U. S. Navy School
ot Music In WashlnRton, D. C.
He was first trombonist In the

GOOD MEALS

C. T. Krewson, Prop.

REASONABLE PRICES

Van Vandervegt, Chef
ana on the U.S.S. Helena. Presetted as Public Senrioe

by
GENERAL MOTORS

are above those authorized by
MPR 4B0. thev will be reduced to

America.
MONEY Is plentiful. THINGS

are scarce.
More money Is being spent, but

LESS THINGS are being obtain-
ed for It. To the observing eye
and the understanding brain,
that spells danger.

That Is how starvation started
throughout this hungry world.

K.H M.l.r c.
lnttrluoe.

Ml Kh.iara a. ,.4 I,, Lart4Mlara.
T m Tha line ftanfar.

00 Dinner Concert.
rrrrtsm af Opparlsalljr,Malaal IUnm.

:M Alka Krlti, Nva.it a Mm.,, sew r..
:( III NHfhnar. Cantaa'a tarnllara.9:45 SUrhilit sVrtnada.R?ar'B nigral. ,

lull. a l.tou, Jr aaaiaart
rharmai'jr,

tO For The NtllH.
10 isn Oil.

the maximum permitted under
that order. In case of two or more

to further the objectives ol the
Act of August 28, 1937. The right
is hereby reserved to waive tech-
nical defects in this advertise-
ment to reject all bids, or to
award the timber for the amount
of the highest bid to other than
the highest bidder when neces-
sary, pursuant to the Act of
August 28, 1937 ( 50 Stat. 8741, In
order to provide a continued sup-
ply of timber to local industry so
as to assure the permanence of

Murder Conviction, Life
Term Upheld on Appeal

SALEM. Ore.. Dee. 2f(-P-i

The Rainbow Staff Wishes You a Happy New YearKRNRIdentical bids for the same tim
ber, the successful bidder will be

I ...Iselected on the basis of ability
to further the objectives of the
Act of August 28, 1937. The rightSATURDAY. UtCIMIlEI IMS la herehv reserved to waive tech' C0EN'WPLUM8E!Uthe community which is depend-

ent upon such industry. Dated at
nlcal defects In this advertise-
ment: to reject all bids, or to
award the timber for the amount Portland, Oregon, this Ktn aay

of December, 1915. W. H. Horn

The State Supreme Court yester-
day upheld the second degreemurder conviction and life sen-
tence of George Wilson, Port-
land, who shot and killed LeRny
K. Logan in Portland on June
mi.

The men, both shipyard work-
ers, were engaged in an t

dice g.ime wnen they got Into an
argument over the winnings. The
Grand Jury Indicted Wilson on a
first degree murder charge, but
the trial Jury reduced It to sec-
ond degree.

PLUMBING-'- S AN

of thousands of
HUNDREDS who have seen
people starving with their pock-
ets stuffed wilh money are hop-

ing fervently that after this

splurging Christmas season we
all get back to work MAKING
THINGS. ONLY more things can
restore PLENTY.

ing, Chief Forester, O. & C. 1AWFUL LOT OP FUN"
WHEN YOU

I 1DO THE in 1

of the highest bid to other than
the highest bidder when neces-
sary, pursuant to the Act of Au-

gust 28, 1937 ( 50 Stat. 874), In
order to provide a continued sup-
ply of timber to local Industry so
as to assure the permanence of
the community which is depend-
ent upon such industry. Dated at
Portland. Oregon, this 3rd day of
December, 1945. W. II. Horning,
Chief Forester, O. and C.

Ski --is
1

one more thought for this
JUST season:

The world la theoretically at

peace again. But It Is an uneasy
peace In an uneasy world.

Thoughtful penpl are coming
slowly to realiw that there can
he no lasting peace until there is

wider acceptance of the teach-

ings of Jesus, whose birthday Is

celebrated on Chrlslmns.

"HELLO. FOLKS'Paint Risht Over

Lakevlew Draft Board
Member Wins Free Trip

SALEM, Ore., Dee. IW.FV
O. C. Gibhs, Lakevlew, mem her
of the Lake County Selective
Service Hoard, won the drawing
yestcroay to determine the rep-
resentative of Oregon dratt
boards who will appear at cere-
monies at the White House Jan-
uary '21.

Girths will get an expense-pai-

trip lo Washington and return.
Including a two day stay there.

TV Yawn Patrol
) Whit KlRff Reap.
7 ATimely Farm Topic
I M HUlt antl Ler Nt,Win Optical.
M& The Beehive.
T 4v Rhapsody in Was
2 m Havtn mf RU. ((e4 ahts Graft.

- K.y Lutrnin".
t lta f Meitrtrjr. ra T ...

Kalnhnw firlllft 1A Murnirtf Conrart.
is as Alk JtetUfr haws.
IS IV A I H llllams.
It .tS l.n Marcaa Aa ! Shaw,I lahtr
11:00 Morning MelodlM.
M.:inpry llou. Ralttan rsrlaa.
12 tNVMnalcal Inlorlud
Itf.lS MpnHt Ravlt, Dsitlisni

1 ranafrr.
la IS- - Mu.lral Interlude
U.3S Bluer a OulSa, A Maria It 4

Diatrlhaiera.
13 34 Bhthm at Ranrlom
K;IS fllftte and I.oral ISftre,

Hanaett Malar.
It 45 Nfwi Review of the Air.
I i4 Terminal Market Report a,

HiC ret!.
t ss-- Ma an Ins Street, neanlnier'i

Mart.
I iHfnumentit, Serenade.
I MV liinr Muatr
1 o NpmtB I'aratte
3. Hon Terry OnheMrs.
2 4A Adrian Rollnt Trio
3 ) Crav Uordort Orcheetra.
3 M Hawaii Call.
4 nit Sinrmltla
4 .n- - Opinion. Htietv

ita New ;ian (.rata MerSmnl.
ft It Canary Pel ftaet. Haiti Ml.
5 Mimr

A A h lorn IS Haritionle
I1 e II Jn The Uirls.
S Mi bieak The Bank
l a me .lie) Latal Ntwa,

Keel Malarto Musrr Interhrate.
T OpA Prtijtam.
T so PetJ R derlft.n Time. I rak

fcarenada
Alia tteltiee Netei,t irrTlre SaUie. R a SJivfc.

S 3 reii!!:.g Ui.k. ,, omyVirkal

Palmer's will qive Merchan-
dise Gifts to the first and
second babies born at Mercy

Hospital In 1946.

It's Thrifty to Buy at
Palmer's. '

PROMPT REPAIR SERVICE
Complete stock of fixtures and
fittings, including sinks, toilets,
lavatories, tubs, showers, range
boilers, gas and electric water
keaters, steel and concrete sep-
tic tanks, shallow and deep

wed pumps.

KRNR
Mutual Broarfcjiat.no System

1490 Kilocycle.

We Carry a Full Line of Baby Food

PHONE US YOUR ORDER WE DELIVER
ttr. MAIN IN O HCU'ftft TODAT

i.Ht, jr.. runt
smoi wmi ma

mi ear fL t uiu
Umpaua Valley Hardware cm- -

Aecldenr Death Toll in

1945 Exceed. 1944 Total
NEW YORK. Pec. 2.-.- f-.

An estimate that 1945 accidents
caused 98.000 d(th. about 1.0OO
more than 1914 mishaps, comes
from statisticians of the Metro-
politan Life Insurance Co.

They attributed the Increase en-

tirely to the rise of motor vehicle
fatalities after the end ef ge-lin- e

rdtionui.

Phene 71Jeoksen101 N, 3

MWKfi Miller. N'ahlM
J ott , r ..Je;r.hltl P)lli

yM.Ma.tral ( ir. Wt1fra rraltM.
k atipei mQ, Kfitoii
1 M- -4 iiim Midntrot. Wati1r f,t A Tom Mil, aiian rurta.

o (.ahrtel Haier. Ntcml.
t H ? ml " V. ft. Tlr
Stores.

fc iA ,t,i:i,kt Hint), rrtu.I.N-k- ltll u4 LmI !.
Th fond.

Owner
404 W. Lint I I


