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Fake Attack That
.

Opened War Bared

A new spray has been devel-
oped which kills weeds among
vegetables at a cost of less than
$12 per acre, as compared with
about $60 for hand- - pulling
methods.

rbUmbt4 Dtllr Eacapt m4f bp tost ANOTHER MILL QUITS

porters of electrical equipment
and appliances.

"Such maldistribution with ap-

parent disregard to the film's
history is depriving old line con-
cerns not only of export licenses
but even If granted a license, of
an allocation that would permit
them practically no business."

The representative said Wash-
ington State firms were prevent-
ed from exporting apples.

Huln.cs told Wallace the situa-
tion probably would be taken be-
fore a House committee for inves-
tigation of food shortages.

Firms Allot Money to

Licenses to Export
Apples Hot Fairly
Allotted, Charge

WASHINGTON, Dec. 21 (PLicenses ot export apples are
being unfairly distributed. Rep.Holmes charged todayin letter to Secretary of Com-
merce Wallaoe.

The agriculture departmentset a quota of 1,125,700 bushels of
this year's aople crop that could
be exported by firms which pre-
viously have exported apples to
foreign countries. Licenses were
issued by the old foreign econom-
ic administrations whose duties
have been transferred to the com-
merce department.

"I am alarmed over he Infor-
mation which has come to me in-

dicating these licenses have been
inequitably distributed," Holmes
wrote. "The information is to the
effect that one film obtained a
license for approximately 400,000
bushels. Added to this situation is
the startling Jaet that the firm
never nad any history in fruit ex-
port. In fact they have been ex- -

Douglas for Bond Buying
Allocations of corporation Vic-- 1

tory Bond purchases to Douglas
County total $332,613, according
to a report received at county
headquarters in Roseburg today.
In addition to amounts previously
reported, clearances are

as follows Montgomery
Ward Co. $70,000, Tidewater As-- !

sociated Oil Co., San Francisco,
$4,000; Southern Oregon Produc-
tion Credit Association, Medford,
Ore.. $5,000; American Telephone
and '1 elegraph Co., New York,
$4,000.

By Charles V. Stentoa

The Eastern Si Western Lumber company of Portland, a

conctirn, has announced it has exhausted its Sup-

ply of timber and will be orced to cease operation sifter the
first of the year. More than 400 persons are employed by
that company. Just a year ago Clark & Wilson company,
also of Portland, was forced out of business, after a half-centu-

of continuous operation during which it had more
than 700 persons employed in peak seasons.

Says the Albany Democrat Herald :

As depletion becomes acute to the north, timber interests '

are turning to Linn, Lane and Douglas counties for their
logs, and, with the government out of the market and com-

petition certain to return as a faotor in the lumber business,
it is inevitable that some manufacturers will move into this
territory to be nearer timber sources, augmenting the ranks
of those relatively few industries already here.

Yet in our gratification over the advent of new Industry
to this territory we should not lose sight of the fact that our
timber supplies are not inexhaustible. Unless judicious har-

vesting of precious reserves still standing in the Cascade and
Coast Mountains tributary to the Willamette Valley is prac-
ticed, we may find ourselves in a few years in the same pre-
dicament which is overtaking the Portland woodworking
plants. If the lumber industry Is over-don- e here, as H has
been in the Columbia River Basin and in Washington, it will
be a matter of only a short time when industry will be mov-

ing hence to more fertile fields.
We are rapidly awakening to the danger threatening our

forest reserves. But, for the most part, our awakening
comes too late.

Washington's timber industry, only a few years ago lead-

ing the nation in volume, became second to Oregon in 1937.
Washington's cut lias rapidly dwindled, and, soon, Oregon
will have little reserve left.

The lower Columbia Basin has been virtually exhausted.
Lane, Linn and Douglas counties are the principal sections

of the state insofar as large bodies of commercial timber are
concerned. Lane and Linn, combined, will barely top
Douglas county's supply. Forest service figures in 1942

gave Linn county a total of 29.5 billion board feet of stand-

ing timber, Lane county 59.5 billion, and Douglas county 71
billion. In both Lane and Linn counties the rate of cut
throughout the war period has been far greater than annual
reproduction. Both have depleted their reserves tremend

FUEL FOR SAL

SAWDUST
Sawdust Burner Parts

Carried in Stock

SLABWOOD 16. in. Green
4 ft. Dry and Green

IMMEDIATE DELIVERY

Phone 468-46- 9

ROSEBURG LUMBER COMPANY

ously since .

Are we to permit our Southern Oregon timlier to go the
way of resources in Washington and the Lower Columbia
Valley? Are we mi! ficieirtly aware of our danger to support
a program of sustained yield?

Commenting on the recent Siuslaw sustained yield unit

Ration-Priorit- y Power
Of President Extended

WASHINGTON, Dec. 20 (WW

The House passed today and
sent to the White House war pow-
ers legislation continuing ration-
ing and prjority allocation auth-

ority until July 1, 1946.
The legislation also makes va-

ried changes in several portions
of the existing Second War Pow-
ers act.

These Include a section directing

the Treasury to resume use
of nickle in making five-cen- t

pieces, and another section auth-
orizing continued g of
ships until troops overseas are re-
turned.

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE
Sealed bids, marked outside

"Bid for Timber," and addressed
to the Chi-- f Korester, O. and C.
Administration, 901 Guardian
Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will
be received until and opened at
10:30 A. M., Pacific Standard
Time, January 8, 1946, for the
purchase ol timber upon tracts
nereinaltcr described; each bid
must state the amount per M.
feet B. M., which will be offered
for each species and the total con-
sideration which will he paid lor
the timber. No bid for less than
the appraised value will be con-
sidered. Each bid must be sub-
mitted in duplicate and be accom-
panied by a deposit in the form
of a certified check in favor of
the Treasurer of the United
States. The deposit of any suc-
cessful bidder will be credited on
the contract. Payment in iull at
the time of filing the contract is
required in sales amounting to
S2.S00.00 or less. For copies of
the form of proposal, form of
contract and bond, terms of pay-
ment, amount of deposit requiredwith bid, amount of bond re-

quired with contract and other
application should be

made to the address shown above.
IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 21
S., R. 8 W., Sec. 17, all merchan-
table timber designated for cut-
ting on the NWi, NE1 SW,
NW) SW1, and SWi SW1,
estimated tor the purpose of
this sale to be 84S M. feet
Green Douglas Fir, 2785 M. feet
fire kijled Douglas Fir, 35 M. feet
Green Red Cedar, and 240 M.
feet Red Cedar. No bid
for Jess than $5.00 per M. ft. B.
M. for the Green Douglas Fir,
$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the fire-kille-

Douglas Fir and Green Red
Cedar and $.50 per M. ft. B. M.
for the lire-kille- Red Cedar, or a
total purchase price of $a,985.00,
will be considered. All timber on
W, NWI, North and West of the
road, is reserved from cutting.
On the balance of WJ NWI and
NE1 NWi only Douglas Fir trees
26" DBHOB and over and lire-kille-

timber is included in the
sale. On SE1 NWi and SWi only

timber is included in
the sale. T. 28 S R. 4 W., Sec. 13,
all merchantable timber desig-
nated for cutting on the NLi
NWi, NWI NWI and SWi NWi,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 1580 M. feet Douglas
Fir, 45 M. feet White Fir, 60 M.
feet Incense Cedar and 30 M.
leet Red Cedar. No bid for less
than $3.20 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Douglas Fir and $2.00 per M. ft.
B. M. lor the White Fir, Incense
Cedar and Red Cedar, or a total
purchase price of $5,326.00, will
be considered. Logging is to be
done by caterpillar-typ- tractor
unless otherwise authorized by
the officer in charge of the sale.
T. 28 S R. 4 W Sec. 35 all mer-
chantable timber designated lor
cutting on the NEi SWi and
NWi SWi, estimated for the
purjxise of this sale to be 1350
M. ii'ot Douglas Fir, 10 M. leet
Stamped Sugar Pine, 40 M. feet
Incense Cedar, 5 M. feet Red
Cedar and 25 M. feet White Fir.
No hid for less than $2.70 per M.
ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir,
$8.40 per M. ft. B. M. lor the
Stamiied Sugar Pine and $2.00
per M. ft. B. M. for the Incense
Cedar, Red Cedar and White
Fir. or a total purchase price
of S3.K).O0, will be considered.
All Douglas Fir less than 22"
DBHOB, all unmarked pine trees,
and all lives within two UacU ol
about 2j acre's each, bounded by
hlaed lines are reserved from
rutting. All timber cut Irom the
abeve described areas must
be manufactured in the local
marketing area designated by the
O. and C. Administration unless
otherwise authorized by the Chief
Forester. If the unit prices bid
at-- above Ihose authorized by
Ml'R 460. they will be reduced lo
the maximum permitted under
that order. In case of two or
more identical bids for the seime
timlier, the successful bidder will
be selected on the Iw is of ability
to further the objectives of the
Act of August 28, 1937. The right
is hereby resrrved to waive tech-
nical defects in this advertise-
ment to reject all bids, or to
award the timber fur the amount
ol the highest bid to other than
the highest bidder when uecss-sarv- ,

pursuant to the Act of
August 28. 1937 130 Stat. 8i4l, in
order to provide a continued sup-
ply of timber to local industry so
as to the permanence of
the community which is ut'nd
ent UHin ucli industry. Dated at
Portland. Oregon, tnis 17th day
of IVivmlier. 1945. W. 11. Horn-

ing. Chief Forester, O. & C.

hearing in Eugene, Kalph T. Moore, sawmill operator, legis-
lator and columnist said:

CLEARANCE SALE

BLANKETS & AUTO ROBES

100 VIRGIN KARAKUL WOOL

An Ideal Xmas Gift that will last.
See them at our office and show room.

201 LUMBERMEN'S BLDG
116 Cass Street

Open from 9:30 O'Clock A. M. to 8 P. M.

Sans Soussi Persian

Sheep Products Co.

Reservations for private
SKATING PARTIES

are available at the
Rainbow Skating Rink

Winchester

DANCE
Evsry Saturday Night

Sponsored by Townsend Club

Music By
Colorado Modern Hillbillies

MOOSE HALL

Everybody Welcome
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The Weather
U. 8. Weather Bureau Office

Roseburg, Oregon
Forecast for Hueburg and vl

clnity: Occasional light rain to
night and Saturday.
Highest temp, for any Deo.70
Lowest temp, for any Oeo.....
Highest temp, yesterday 45
Lowest temp, last night 42
Hrecipitation yesterday 09
Precipition from Dec. 1 .2.88
Deficit from Dec. 1, 1945 32
bxcess from Sept. 1, 1945 3.14

Yule Cantata to
Be Presented at
Baptist Church

The choir of the First Baptist
Church, unik-- r the direction ol
Mrs. Joe Ducts, will present the
Christmas cantata, "The Salva-
tion of Israel," by Ira U. Wilson,
at the regular evening service,
starting at 1:M o'clock Sunday.

The program will include a
short message by the pastor, Kev.
H. P. Sconce, and a baptismal
service.

The cantata will Include the
following :

1. "Seek Ye Out of the Book,"
Wen's chorus and choir.

2. "Thou Blessed Bethlehem,"
contralto solo, Mary Apia.

3. "Blessed lie the Lord God of
Israel," by choir.

4. "Midnight in Her Dusky
Mantle, soprano solo, Mrs. Hugh
Whipple; tenor solo, Frank
Grbbe, and choir.

5. "And There Were Shep-
herds," by choir.

6. "Chiming Bells," souranos
Lois Mabley, Beverly Hatfield;
altos, Bobbie Mabley, Mrs. C.
Mabiey, and Men's Chorus.

Olteralory Mrs. Don Mulkey,
violin solo, "Cantique de Noel."

7. "The Adoration ot the Wise
Men '' by choir.

8. "A Lullaby," soprano ohliga-lo- ,

Lois Mabley, Beverly Hattieid.
Violin obligato, Raymond L.
Vates and choir.

S. "Christ, the Lord Is Born,"
by choir.

10. "My Shepherd and My
King," baritone solo, Kaymond L.
Yates and choir. .

11. "Night of Nights," soprano
and alto duet, Mis. Hugh Whip-
ple, Mrs. Clarence Maoley and
choir.

12. "Rejoice O Earth," by choir.

Massacre of Americans
On Wake Island Revealed

PEARL HARBOR, Dec. 21.
((!') The Navy announced yes-

terday Japanese massacred 9t
American civilian prisoners on

' Wake Island in October of
while expecting an invasion by
United Stales troops.

The mass execution was charg-
ed by the War Crimes Commis-
sion at Kwiijalcin, where Rear
Adm. Sakatbara of the Jaanese
Imperial Navy went on trial to-

day as the commander of Wake
who issued the order.

The announcement said that
Lt. lto of tile Japanese Navy as-
serted in a confession that Sakai-har-

ordered the civilians killed
Oct. 7, l'.M.'l. I to committed sui-
cide two days ago In a prisoner
of war camp on Kwajalein, Mar-
shall IsIjihIs.

Previously the Japanese had
claimed that tin civilians were
killed by a bomb hit on an air
raid shelter or were shot when
they tried lo escape liom the
prison camp.

Mrs. Sarah J. Williams
Passes Away at Longview

Word has Iwvn reivived of the
death at Longview, Wash., lee.
Id. of Sarah Jane Williams, Mi.
for 2 years a resilient of the
Calkins road district in .

Born Feb. 1.1, 1RMI, she
came lo Hosclnirg in 1 i ' ller
hiisliand. the late 11. R. Williams,
died in the late fall of l'.HI, and
Mix. Williams moved to Long
view lo make her home with a
granddaughter, Mrs. Helen Hail.

Surviving are a sun, llul.nl
Williams, Modesto. Calif.; three
granddaughters and two great
giandeliiUlren.

Funeral seivices were held
Wednesday ill Longview.

Camp Adair Declared

Surplus Property
WASinvirmM iw ! ni'n

- Camp Ail.nr, near Corvallis,
tiie., ha been declared surnlus,
the War I Vmiintent not lied
Senators Cordon and Morse of
Oii'iron yesteidny.

M'Hse's assistants said Ihcy
were inloimed that all of the
biiililines at the camp would he
sold. The land will he resold lo
the former ownrrs if I hey wish
lo huv II.

Fnder the suiplns property act
government agencies have prior,
it v in purchasing equipment, ma-
terial and buildings at Camp
Adair I union s assistants said
that If another government agen-
cy wish-- to lake over the hsni-ta- l

at the camp It would be able
tu do so.

In Gestapo Report
NUERNBERG, Dec. 21. (UP))
The first full story of the

spaiK that set oil World War II
a lake attack on a ra-

dio station staged by Gestapo
agents dressed in Polish army
unilorms was unfolded yester-
day belore the International Mili-
tary Tribunal.

as the war crimes trial was re-
cessed for the Christmas holi-
days, American prosecutors sub-
mitted a Gestapo uilicial's story
ol the raid, naming the assassi-
nated hangman, Reinhard Hcyd-rich- ,

as the man who engineered
the coup which Hitler used as the
excuse lor the Polish invasion
crying to the world that Ger-
many had been attacked first.

The storv was told in the affi-
davit of Alfred Naulocks, who
said he led a company of Gesta-
po agents dressed in Polish uni-

lorms in a raid on the German
radio station at Gleiwitz on Aug.
31, 1939, the day before the in-
vasion. Toe raiders broadcast in-

cendiary remarks in Polish and
then left behind the bullet rid-
dled bodies of drugged German
concentration camp prisoners, al-

so dressed in Polish uniforms, as
"evidence," Naujocks said.

Naujocks, in his affidavit, said
the lake attack with a company
of disguised Gestapo men "should
make it aopear that Polish sol-
diers were attacking German
troops."

Eleanor Roosevelt

Ready to Accept
United Nations Job

NEW YORK, Dec. 21.UP))
Mrs. Eleanor Roosevelt said to-

day she will "naturally" accept If
her nomination as a delegate to
the United Nations organization
general assembly is conlirmed by
the Senate.

"I feel it is a great opportunity
and I will do the best I can to be
a useful member as long as I am
there." declared the wife of the
late President at a press confer-
ence to announce her accentance
of the honorary chairmanship of
the American Committue lor Yu-

goslav Relief.
"I want it very clearly under-

stood that until the nomination
is confirmed, I can't accept it,"
she continued. "I was never one
to count my chickens before
they're hatched.'

Mrs. Roosevelt said that she
hoped she would "hear" from the
people of this country about vari-
niiK niu'Ktione thut uHu

Asked if she believed in feed--

ing the German people this win-
ter. Mrs. Roosevelt declared:

"I have no desire to starve
pie anywhere in the world. How-
ever. I fwl strongly that our Al-
lies who had everything taken
from them and who endured star-
vation should have first call on
relief."

Stassen Man to Beat in

1948, Oregon Demos Told
PORTLAND, 'Dec. 2i..r.4i

Former Governor Harold E. Stas-
sen of Minnesota will be the man
for IVmocrats to beat in 'MH
national elections. Warren

state legislator, predicted at
a session of the Willamette
Democratic Society.

"The time lor pussyfooting Is
past," declared the 'Portlandi--

yesleray, advising parly candi-
dates to take a definite stand on
issues.

Krwin scolded party leaders for
failing to round up the 2M voters
nieded to legally nominate Bruce
Spauldlng, Salem, as candidate
fur First District Congressman
at a recent Salem assembly. "The
finger of accusation points at
soinoone for that lack of pre-
paredness," he said, "and for the
failure to live up to the party's
responsibilities."

Deferred UntH Spring
WASHINGTON'. Ioc. 2H.Work to improve rt'iroation

arras in UroRon and Washington
NalKHul Kunts, for which a
CiMiuressional ftppropri.it ion is
stuij-nt-

. cannot start until spring
H'auiO of wreathrr conditions,

to .r'orvfct STvife uffi-tial-

Northwrst Srnitors, upon ro
(vivuiK this information, said it
wouiti niH, thrrclorr, tn n'(vs-sa- i

v to rush the locislatioii U'ioic
I'liriMmas. An Mppixpnation of
ah hM Sl.rtiUMHK) will rn nctflM,
stated Sen. Vjno .Moiso of tre-Kn- .

L If Watt, Forest Srvive
rlnrf. rcporttni thtMV wvve no
funds for restoration and

Ht Ttmlvrilnp Uw(j,t. 500
tamp aiul picnic tpots and 23 kt
tn d m Ort gun.

Sizable Shark Liver Haul
Recorded at Coos Bay

roos BAY. Orv. lw. 2. --

Ut A hHiil of $T"v(hK worth of
shark livem here whs tho mxxih
hin tatrh in two wvks bv lour
boats from the .Seattle pool
rated b halibut fisheries. It was
reported tiniay.

A heavy j;ale means tvtlrr luck
for shark f ishe- uien. industty
spokesimn akt, rxplainink' pres-
ent weather not so favorable.
The livers are eanned here, then
sent to Seattle for oil refinery.

Don't Neglect Slipping
FALSE TEETH

t, fal tlh dree., .lie H W4bSlt
hrn llh. ts' tjush or nr'.P" t I mvid A rn.bsrrsMrd hfi h.ndu-r- . FA.rsrTM. mn

tin iron pi.d,r to .prtnklv pe
oiit plu. krpt ratM tth mors

ftrtrlr t rtwfiurnl ls;ins c4
euntjr and sU.1d ron forl No fumrrff. ttv ut f.in ct iIU.M1 tous st sur Ofus .tws.

Notice of Timber Sale
Sealed bids, marked outside

"Bid lor lunDer", and addressed
to tne Chiet forester, V. and C
Administration, 901 Guardian
bunding, poruanu 4, Oregon,
will tx received until anu
opened at 10:30 A. M., Pa-
cific Standard Time, January 8,
1946, for the purchase ot timber
upon tracts hereinatter described;
each bid must state the amou.it
per M. leet B. M., which wiii oe
ottered lor each species and the
total consideration which will be
paid for the timber. No bid for
less than the appraised value will
be considered, tach bid must be
submitted In duplioate and be ac-

companied by a deposit in the
lorm of a certified check in favor
ot the Treasurer of the United
States. The deposit of any

bidder will be credited on
the contract. Payment in lull at
the time of filing the contract is
required In sales amounting to
$2,s00.00 or less. For copies ot the
lorm of proposal, form of con-
tract and bond, terms of payment,
amount of deposit required with
bid, amount ol bond required with
contract and other imoitnation,
application should be made to the
auuress shown above. In DOUG-
LAS cOUiNix: i. 2 S., K. i w..
Sec. 5, all merchantable timber
designated for cutting on the SWi
Njfc. and NEi SWi, estimated for
the pur pose of this sale to be 3335
M. leet Douglas Fir, 115 M. leet
Hemlock, bo M. feet Incense
Cedar, 55 M. feet Red Cedar, 15
M. teet White Fir. No bid for
less than $5.60 per M. ft. B. M. for
the Douglas Fir, $2.00 per M. tt.
B. M. for the Hemlock and White
Fir, $1.50 per M. ft. B. M. lor the
Incense Cedar, $2.50 per M. it.
B. M. for the Red Cedar, or a
total purchase price of $19,156.00,
will be considered. Logging is to
be done by Caterpillar-typ- e trac-
tor unless otherwise specified by
the officer in charge of the sale.
T. 32 S., R. 5 W., Sec. 17, all mer-
chantable timber designated for
cutting on the NEi and the NWi
SEi, estimated for the purpose of
this sale to be 4085 M. leet Doug-
las Fir, 160 M. feet White Fir,
205 M. feet Incense Cedar, 70 M.
feet stamped Sugar Pine. 65 M.
feet stamped Ponderosa Pine. No
bid for less than $4.40 per M. ft.
B. M. for the Douglas Fir, $2.50
per M. ft. B. M. lor the White
Fir and Incense Cedar, $11.80
Der M. ft. B. M. for the stamped
Sugar Pine, $8.00 per M. ft. B. M.
for the stamped Ponderosa Pine,
or a total purchase price of
$20,232.50. will be considered. Ail
Douglas Fir trees less than 22 ins.
DBHOB, all unmarked Pine trees,
and all cull trees are reserved
from cutting. All snags over 20
Ins. DBHOB and 24 feet high are
to be felled. All timber cut Irom
the above described areas must
be manufactured in the local
marketing area designated by the
O. and C. Administration unless
otherwise authorized by the Chief
Forester. If the unit prices bid
are above those authorized by
MPR 460. they will be reduced to
the maximum permitted under
that order. In case of two or more
identical bids for the same tim-
ber, the successful bidder will be
selected on the basis of ability
to further the objectives of the
Act of August 28, 1937. The right
is herehv reserved to waive tech-
nical defects in this advertise-
ment: to reject all bids, or to
award the timber for the amount
of the highest bid to other than
the highest bidder when neces-
sary, pursuant to the Act of Au-

gust 28, 1937 150 Stat. 874), in
order to provide a continued sup-
ply of. limber lo local industry so
as lo assure the permanence of
the community which is depend-
ent upon such Industry. Dated at
Iortland. Oregon, this 3rd dav of
December, 1943. W. II. Horning,
Chief Forester. O. and C. Admin-istrritinn- .

65T

While no objection was voiced to the general purpose,
there was considerable difference of opinion over method. Aa
proposed, the plan contemplates rapid liquidation of all but
nine-o- f the 50 mill operations dependent upon timber in the'
Siutlaw master unit. The question immediately arises as
to which shall be selected to survive. The problem is less
than the figures indicate because of the transitory charac-
ter of many of these mills and the small amount of capital
involved in most instances. Nevertheless, the Department
is up against the painful necessity of saying to one group of
mills that they must liquidate and to another that they may
proceed with what is sure to be profitable operation indefi-
nitely. The public must first be persuaded that such dis-

crimination is Justified by potential future benefit. Un-

avoidably, the program favors the large and strong over
the small and weak, a circumstance sure to be unpopular at
first glance.

Douglas county lias the opportunity to avoid the disaster
which has befallen practically all other timbered sections of
the I'acific Northwest. The industry in major form is com-

paratively new. It has not yet reached the dangerous state
in annual cut. On the other hand, stocks in Washington and
Northern Oregon hae been either totally exhausted in some
areas or seriously depleted in others. Counties to the north
and south of us have been ovcrcut. Here in Douglas county
we have not yet been damaged.

We can either support a policy of sustained yield a
balanced cut allowing our practical mind to weigh against
our sympathy for the small mills, which w ill be crowded out
when tracts unsuitable for sustained yield operation are ex-

hausted, or we, too, w ithin a comparatively few years will
be rending of local industries folding up, throwing hundreds
of people out of work.

Opening Event
Joe Lynam

vs.

Angelo Martinelli

Main Event
Bulldog Jackson

vs.
The Gray Mask

Roseburg Armory, Sat.. Dec. 22, 8:30 P. M.
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Hospitalized Vets Set
New Record in Number

WASHINGTON, Dec. 21
- More veterans will spend this
Christmas In hospital beds than
ever In American history
anil ttie raHtrity lor caring lor
them has reached a near crisis.

Ma. Gen Paul R. Mawlcy act
big Surgeon General of the Ve-
terans Administration, lold a

lod.iv there are approxi-
mately Ito.iVW veterans, of all
wars, under treatment in hospi-
tals or at homes.

The peak of World War I vet-
erans: is expected within a yearor two. The e of World War
II will not be reached until 1975,
experts have ji ivtuted. They say
as many as 2 XJ.OUO veterans may
become patients.
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