

# Local News

**Visiting at Powers Home**—Mr. and Mrs. Ben Ryberg of Toledo, Ore., are guests of Mr. and Mrs. L. L. Powers on East Oak street.

**Welfare Shop to Be Open**—The Catholic ladies welfare shop, located in the basement of the parish house on East Oak street, will be open all day Saturday.

**From Central Point**—Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Ward and son, Keith, of Central Point, are at Winchester visiting Mrs. Ward's parents, Mr. and Mrs. R. C. Colley.

**Obtain Marriage License**—Frederick Stephen Renner, Tacoma, and Genevieve R. Goodrow, Roseburg, obtained a marriage license at Tacoma this morning, Oct. 19.

**Spending Honeymoon Here**—Mr. and Mrs. Ben Huver of Tacoma, Wash., are spending their honeymoon in Roseburg. They plan to go farther south before returning to Tacoma. Mr. Huver is a close friend of Ted Arzner of this city.

**Returns Here**—Mrs. George Jackson has returned to her home in Roseburg, following a trip to Seattle, Tacoma and Yakima to visit relatives and friends. She visited the Harold Bender family and Mrs. Lottie Rose, all former Roseburg residents.

**Discharged From Service**—Lt. Sidney Fredrickson has been discharged from the point system from the U. S. Army base at Santa Barbara, Calif., and is now at his home in Roseburg. He is a son of Mrs. C. E. Fredrickson of Roseburg. Lt. Fredrickson was taken prisoner by the Germans in Europe.

**Leaves For East**—Marshall Pengra, manager of Radio Station KRNZ, left today on a business trip which will take him to Chicago, Washington and New York, where he will contact officials of the various networks in his capacity as chairman of the committee on small radio stations of the National Broadcasters' association.

**Petersons Here**—Mr. and Mrs. Roy Peterson and son, Bobby, are spending a few days visiting at the home of Mrs. Peterson's mother, Mrs. S. A. Roser, in Roseburg. Mrs. Peterson was formerly Helen Roser. Mr. Peterson, recently discharged from the U. S. Navy, was an aviation chief machinist's mate and stationed at Monterey, Calif., the last year. Prior to that, he served 19 months in the South Pacific area.

## Acute Gas Pains Stomach Distress?

Try Hot Water To Which a Little Neutracid Has Been Added

At the first sign of distress smart men and women now know just what to do. They put a teaspoonful of Neutracid in half a glass of hot water and drink it after meals, that's all. Neutracid is new—it's made especially for the symptomatic relief of gastric hyperacidity. Nothing quite like Neutracid to bring fast, quick relief to the sufferer of stomach distress, indigestion, gas pains, heartburn, burning sensation, and other conditions when caused by excessive stomach acidity. Ask for Neutracid at Kampfer's Pharmacy and all druggists.

**AN AMAZING OFFER**  
The makers of Dr. Parker's Corn Remover will give you double your money back if it fails to remove your corn or callous. Only 35c at Chapman's Drug Store.

## OLD TIME DANCE

Every Saturday Night  
Sponsored by Townsend Club  
String Music

## MOOSE HALL

Everybody Welcome

To serve others as we would be served.

## DOUGLAS FUNERAL HOME

Cor. Pine and Lane Streets



FRANK W. LONG, Manager  
Licensed Lady Attendant

Call 112 Day or Night  
AMBULANCE SERVICE

## Officers, Including Roseburg Man, Perform K. P. Drudgery In "Turnabout" at V-J Fete



Captain Clyde W. Adair, 223 E. Lane St., Roseburg, is pictured above at extreme right as he worked on K. P. duty when officers of the Jolly Rogers Bombardment group on Ie Shima did "turnabout" duty in celebration of V-J day.

**FIFTH AIR FORCE, Okinawa**—Lieutenants dishing out chow, captains washing pots and pans and moping floors. It was enough to make the GIs grin. And grin they did when the Moby Dick squadron of the Fifth Air Force's famed Jolly Rogers Bombardment group held their turnabout day at the group's camp on Ie Shima.

It all came about when the officers in the squadron decided that the enlisted men should be given a holiday in honor of V-J. It was arranged that the officers would assume the duties of the men. The squadron flight surgeon, Captain Seals S. Spear of Bogalusa, La., was appointed mess sergeant, and his K. P.'s including Capt. Clyde W. Adair, Roseburg, were chosen from among the officers. The only rule followed was, "The higher the rank the lower the job." Chuckling GIs saw the unusual sight of Captain Roger Groves, Nashville, Tenn., and Captain Don

McDonald, Elden, Idaho, waiting patiently for them to finish washing their mess gear so that they could begin the huge pile of pots and pans from the kitchen.

Greatest embarrassment resulted from the fact that at all three meals the brass hat cooks ran out of food before all the men had filed through the line. The shortage was quickly remedied by hurriedly opened cans. Difference of opinion arose regarding cause of shortage. "Amateur cooks poor planning" said the men. "Superior food, large portions," claimed the officer-cooks. The debate is still raging.

Worst blow, however, was the discovery that the "holiday" of all days was the squadron's turn to collect garbage for the entire group. Undaunted by this, but slightly less cheerful, five officers, led by Captain Arthur Weeks, Jr., of New London, Conn., completed the detail while GIs looked on and grinned.

## Hunting Tragedy Shocks Reedsport

**REEDSPORT**—Residents of Reedsport were shocked by an announcement early this week of the death of Verne Finley, a former property owner and business man of this city, who recently sold his holdings and moved with his family to Ailsa, Benton county, where he purchased a fine farm with the intention of raising stock.

Details of the death were not learned but it was said to have been a hunting accident. The announcement made here Wednesday stated that he was accidentally shot by a bad recently discharged from the U. S. Navy. Harold Conrad, who for a time lived at the Finley home in this city and worked in the shoe shop operated by Finley. The shooting occurred while the two were hunting on the Finley farm. When Finley failed to return home after the hunting trip, search was instituted for him by neighbors the body being found early the next day. A coroner's inquest exonerated Conrad from blame.

Finley was a charter member of the Reedsport division of the Douglas County Sheriff's posse, whose members will act as pallbearers at the funeral service at Corvallis, Friday.

## Piluso, Martinelli to Clash in Mat Semi-Final

**Wrestling Promoter Elton Owen**, after lining up the Gray Mask and Joe Lynam for the main event of Saturday night's wrestling card at the armory, has added another headline attraction for the preliminary match. Angelo Martinelli, the Toledo, Ohio flash, will meet Ernie Piluso in a bout that would ordinarily be of main event caliber were it not for the major interest in the Lynam-Mask feud.

Martinelli showed plenty of class last week in Eugene as he and Jo-Jo wrestled to a draw in one of the closest, fastest wrestling bouts seen in those parts in many a moon. Piluso, the Portland headkick expert, will put Martinelli to a real test. Piluso failed, as has everyone else, to subdue the infamous Rufus Jones, but showed himself to be in excellent condition. A victory over the flashy Martinelli will put Piluso right back into contention for Jack Lipencov's Pacific coast junior heavyweight championship.

## Legion of Merit Won by Lt. Col. Victor Bryant

**Lt. Col. Victor W. Bryant**, Portland, recently received the award of the legion of merit for exceptionally meritorious service in the Southwest Pacific area as an officer in charge of the equipment branch of the assistant chief of staff. Col. Bryant is the husband of Lois Bryant, formerly Lois Reed of Sutherlin, now a member of the teaching staff at the Rose school in Roseburg.

"Col. Bryant, who was in charge of planning and effecting changes to adapt equipment to conditions in the Pacific theater, contributed substantially toward equipping units so as best to meet the requirements of jungle and amphibious warfare," said the citation. Col. Bryant was overseas with the 41st division and later served on General MacArthur's staff.

## Legion Post Visited By District Heads

Umpqua post of the American Legion at its regular Tuesday meeting entertained Robert W. Bryant, district commander, of Grants Pass, and Mrs. Marie Wilcox, district president of the auxiliary. A potluck dinner was held with the two visiting officials as speakers. Music was furnished by Les Irwin, trumpet, and Vera McClintock Jones, piano.

At the business meeting which followed, plans were discussed and approved in connection with construction of the Legion building to be erected in the near future. Committee reports indicated substantial growth and improved financial condition.

## Birth Certificate of Pocket Size Favored

**PORTLAND, Oct. 18**—Dr. Harold M. Erickson, state health officer, today proposed a pocket-sized birth certificate to fit wallet folders be adopted by the state.

A 3 and 1/2 inch by 2 and 1/2 inch

card has been approved by the attorney general's office to replace the present bulky certificate, but the State Board of Health must make final approval. Erickson said.

## NEWS OF OUR MEN—WOMEN IN UNIFORM

**Mrs. Wm. Debolt**, 926 S. Jackson street, Roseburg, has received word from her son, Captain Alfred L. Koleno, now stationed in Rezon, India, that he is now enjoying the assignment of flying American soldiers out of China and India on the first lap of the return to the States. Captain Koleno has been flying between India and China since last spring and states he is now ferrying men instead of supplies to the port at Shanghai. He anticipates he will remain overseas until about the first of the year.

## Cougar Slips Through Myrtle Creek Cordon

**MYRTLE CREEK**—Considerable excitement was created here early this week when Mrs. William DeWitt, returning from the mill after transporting her husband to his work, saw a large cougar in the P. R. Weaver field, adjoining the highway and near the hills south of town. The animal apparently was preparing for an attack on several head of cattle feeding in the pasture. Mill workers summoned by Mrs. DeWitt surrounded the cougar and were preparing to shoot it when it slipped out of sight and escaped from the cordon of hunters. It is the second cougar to be seen near the city limits within the past month.

## Memorial Services Set For Late Glenn Callen

Memorial services for Glenn Callen, Roseburg barber who died October 13 in the Veterans hospital at Portland, will be held at 2 P. M. Friday in the chapel of the Roseburg Funeral home, instead of at the Douglas Funeral home, as erroneously reported previously. The service will be conducted by Father William L. Blaker of St. George's Episcopal church. The American Legion, of which Mr. Callen was a member, will provide military honors.

## Myrtle Creek

**MYRTLE CREEK**—Ray Norton, Jr., is constructing a large reservoir on his property southeast of town.

T. R. Dunnavin of Ashland was in Myrtle Creek Sunday to attend funeral services for his friend, T. L. Brewer.

Plans are being made at the Christian church for an Old People's party to be held in the near future. An interesting program is in prospect.

Sgt. Dean Powell has been honorably discharged from military service and is at home with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. E. W. Powell.

Word has been received of the birth of a daughter, Sara Carolina, weight seven pounds, to Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Chaney, Jr., in Portland. The father is in military service and was last reported at Honolulu.

## NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber," and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 A. M., Pacific Standard Time, November 6, 1945, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B.M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms

Sec. 25, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SW1 SW1 and portion of the SE1 SW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 775 M. feet of Douglas Fir, 5 M. feet White Fir. No bid for less than \$1.80 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M. ft. B.M. for the White Fir, or a total purchase price of \$1,402.50, will be considered. All Douglas Fir trees less than 22 inches DBHOB are reserved from cutting. In the SE1 SW1, all trees East of a blazed line are reserved from cutting, including blazed line trees. Logging is to be done by Caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by Forester in charge of sale. T. 25 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 29, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the S4 SW1 SW1 and NW4 SW1 SW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 890 M. feet Douglas Fir, 15 M. feet Red Cedar, 30 M. feet Hemlock, 30 M. feet stamped Sugar Pine. No bid for less than \$4.20 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the Red Cedar and Hemlock, \$9.80 per M. ft. B.M. for the stamped Sugar Pine, or a total purchase price of \$4,122.00, will be considered. All unmarked Pine trees are reserved from cutting. Logging is to be done by Caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by Forester in charge of sale. T. 27 S., R. 4 W., Sec. 23, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the SE1 SE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 80 M. feet Douglas Fir, 5 M. feet In-cense Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.40 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, and \$2.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the In-cense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$202.00, will be considered. Only Douglas Fir and In-cense Cedar trees marked USOC are included in the sale. All other trees are reserved from cutting. All timber cut from the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 15th day of October, 1945. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration.

of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 26 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 29, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3140 M. feet Douglas Fir, 210 M. feet White Fir, 60 M. feet Hemlock, 190 M. feet Red Cedar, 75 M. feet In-cense Cedar, 45 M. feet stamped Sugar Pine. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the W. Fir, Hemlock, Red Cedar and In-cense Cedar, \$8.70 per M. ft. B.M. for the stamped Sugar Pine, or a total purchase price of \$10,881.50, will be considered. All unmarked trees South of blazed lines, all blazed line trees, and all unmarked Pine trees are reserved from cutting. Logging to be done by Caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by the Forester in charge of the sale. T. 32 S., R. 5 W., Sec. 17, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE1 and NW1SE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 4085 M. feet Douglas Fir, 160 M. feet White Fir, 205 M. feet In-cense Cedar, 70 M. feet stamped Sugar Pine, 65 M. feet stamped Ponderosa Pine. No bid for less than \$4.40 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M. ft. B.M. for the White Fir and In-cense Cedar, \$11.80 per M. ft. B.M. for the stamped Sugar Pine, \$8.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the stamped Ponderosa Pine, or a total purchase price of \$20,232.50 will be considered. All Douglas fir trees under 22 ins. DBHOB, all unmarked Pine, and all cull trees are reserved from cutting. All snags over 20 ins. DBHOB and 24 feet high are to be felled. Fortune Creek shall be kept free of brush, logs, and windfalls. The purchaser shall protect the water ditch in the SE1 SE1 from damage caused by the logging operations. Whenever this ditch is broken or obstructed in the course of logging operations, the purchaser shall promptly repair the damage. All timber cut from the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. and C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 27th day of September, 1945. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration.

## Sturdy Wearable Togs

From Tots to Teens

## Clara's

MILLINERY AND TOTS SHOP  
122 W. Cass

ENDS SAT.!

The Thrill-and-Shock Picture of the Year...

## DILLINGER

WRESTLING

MAIN EVENT

The Gray Mask vs. Joe Lynam

Opening Bout

Angelo Martinelli vs. Ernie Piluso

Roseburg Armory—8:30 P. M.—Saturday, October 20

ENDS SAT.!

SUNDAY Thru TUES.!

NEVER in motion picture history a picture like this!

THE STORY OF A MAN DRIVEN BY AN EVIL DESTINY — THE URGE TO DESTROY WHAT HE LOVED MOST!

THE PICTURE OF DORIAN GRAY

George SANDERS HURD HATFIELD DONNA REED Angela LANSBURY Peter LAWFORD Richard FRASER

ENDS SAT.!

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

2 GREAT SHOWS

WOMAN of the Town

Thrills of the Old West with CLAIRE TREVOR

of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 26 S., R. 2 W., Sec. 29, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3140 M. feet Douglas Fir, 210 M. feet White Fir, 60 M. feet Hemlock, 190 M. feet Red Cedar, 75 M. feet In-cense Cedar, 45 M. feet stamped Sugar Pine. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the W. Fir, Hemlock, Red Cedar and In-cense Cedar, \$8.70 per M. ft. B.M. for the stamped Sugar Pine, or a total purchase price of \$10,881.50, will be considered. All unmarked trees South of blazed lines, all blazed line trees, and all unmarked Pine trees are reserved from cutting. Logging to be done by Caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by the Forester in charge of the sale. T. 32 S., R. 5 W., Sec. 17, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE1 and