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gust 26, 1937, The right is herebytract and bond, terms of payment,
amount of deposit required with

wise authorized by the officer In
charge of the sale. T. 26 S., R.
3 W., Sec. 35, all merchantable

Picnlo Announced-r-Th- e Army
Mothers club viU hold a optluck
picnic supper August' 2 at 7:30
P. M. at the hotne of Mrs. Belle
Crenshaw at 1021 ' Harvard ave-
nue. Members, their families and
Invited friends are asked to brine

Society and Clubs Local
News

By LOTUS KNIGHT PORTER

Mrs. R. Baimbridge
Of Oakland Passes

Mrs. Ruth Caroline Baimbridge,
49, wife of Harry R. Baimbridge,
died at her home near Oakland,
Thursday after a short illness.
She was born In Henrietta. Okla.,
May 22, 1896, and made her home
In the Oakland vicinity for the
past 32 years and in the state for
thv past 42 years. She was mar-
ried to Mr. Baimbridge, in Sep-
tember, 1913, in Roseburg. She
was a life-lon- member of the
Christian ' " 'church.

Besides her husband, she Is sur-
vived by four sons and three
daughters: Mrs. Lillian H. Hart,
Dale S. Baimbridge, Wm. H.
Baimbridge, Mrs. Margery Spen-
cer, Robert Baimbridge and Bert-
ram Baimbridge, all of Oakland;
also by a brother Frank Carter,
Portland.

Services will be held in the
Christian chucb, at Oakland Sun-
day at 2 P. M., Rev. R. L. Dunn
officiating, assisted by Freeman
Yardley.

Interment will be in the Fair
Oaks cemetery. Arrangements
are in charge of the Stearns mor-
tuary, Oakland. -

Mrs. Newell Morgan, served de-

licious refreshments to: Mrs.
Arthur Longbrake, Mrs, Lawer-- .
ance Longbrake and son, Larry;
Mrs. Gordon Epps and daughter,.
Janis; Mrs. Allan Martin, Mrs.
Vern Holgate and son, Gordon;
Mrs. Harry Barker, Mrs. Harry
Matthews, Mrs. Royal Abeene,
Mrs. Sarepta Saucerman, Miss
Marie Shellbourne, Mrs. Milo
Pope, Mrs. Harry West, Mrs. Wil-
liam Crowell, Mrs. Maude Mc-

Donald, Mrs. Ruth Lewis, Mrs.
Henry Hebard, Mrs. Newell Mor-
gan and Mrs. Richard Garman.

The pleasant afternoon was
spent in sewing and visiting.
P. N. G. CLUB HAS
ENJOYABLE MEETING

SUTHERLIN The Past Noble
Grands club met at the home of
Mrs. John Saucerman and a,
sumptios potluck supper was

The business meeting was
called to order by the president,
Mrs. Florence Cook.

Mrs. Juanita Holgate won the
penny prize and the next meet

a covered dish, their own table
service and enjoy tna aitair. -

Leaves for Florida Mis. John
Beelev. the former Peeev Blaker,
daughter of Father and Mrs. W.
L. Blaker and daughter-in-la- of
Mrs. fctnei Littler or Hosenurg,
has left by bus for Orlando, Fla
where her husband, Corp. John
Beeley, is stationed. She plans to
stop over in Denver, wnere she
will visit two sisters.

Victory Over Japan Tops
Objectives of Attlee

(Continued from Page 1)
to survive the tide of labor votes
which repudiated the party and
the philosophy of free priate en-
terprise for which it stood.

For Churchill, since 1940 the
empire's outstanding figure, there
was lett the relatively humble
position of leader of the House of
Commons minority one so small
it can wield but little Influence
in shaping Britain's immediate
future.

The leftward tide of votes
swamped his conservative party
in the worst political defeat the
party has suffered in many years,
and gave the laborites the .first,
clear Commons majority .any,
party ever held In Britain.,

' .'

Most commentators agreed
that the election result d.id not'
constitute a personal repudiation
of Churchill, whose record as a
war leader was praised even by
the staunchest of labor support-
ers. But none denied this was
a swift leftward surge for tradi-
tionally conservative Britain.
Some attributed it to natural dis-
satisfaction among the people
after six years of wartime hard-
ship.
Socialism to Shake Nation

The labor party 'is committed
to a socialistic program which
can shake the foundations of
British economy as it is consti-
tuted at present. The party calls
for nationalization of basic indus-
tries such as coal, iron and steel
and inland transportation, and of
me nanK oi England.

"We are embarkine on a ereat
adventure," Attlee declared, sum-
marizing the party goal as "the
highest standard of life we can
achieve for all."

"We want a securitv that will
banish war forever," asserted the

labor leader who
worked 26 years in politics for
this change to test his socialist
theories in action.

''We want widesDread Dresner:
ity for all people," he said. "We
must reconstruct our ruined
homes and build up the hiehest
standard of life we can achieve
lor all.
War Plans Unchanged

Churchill, in a valedictory state-
ment- as prime minister, said all
plans and preparations had been
made for a victory over Japanwhich might come "much quickerthan we' have hitherto been en-
titled' fb'epect," and declared he
regrettctj he had not been permit-
ted to finish that 1ob e exDres- -

sed gratitude' to the British people
lur umnrjcning support duringthe perilous.years of the European war, '.!

"
,

There was some sneculatlnn
here that the ultimate effect of
the election would be to bringRussia ,' and '. Britain closer to-

gether on some issues. Prof. Har-
old Laski, chairman of the labor
party's executive committee, said
the victory would make possible
"full friendshin" with the Soviet
union, and that the government
would be in a position to do "full
justice" to the Snain of General
Franco.

Attlee also SDOke for "ennnprn.
tion with other nations, particu-
larly our great allies, The United
States of America and the Union
of Soviet Socialist Republics."

Navy Recruiter Here
Chief William E. Bell of the

Navy recruiting station Eugene,
in charge of recruiting in the
Roseburg area, was at the Rose-
burg Chamber of Commerce

interviewing applicants for
enlistments in the Navy. He will
remain in Roseburg until noon
Saturday. .

Four Pay Trafflo Fines
Traffic fines imposed in the

Roseburg justice court were re-

ported by Judge Thomas C. Hart-fie- l

today to include Charles O.
Leach, $10, overload; Blayne J.
Flora, $10 speeding; Robert H.
Briggs, $15, speeding; Cecil L.
Lindley, $10, defective muffler.

timber designated for cutting on
the NEJNEJ, E1NWJNEV EJ.
SWJNEJ, and SE1NEI, estimated
for tiie purpose of this sale to be
1810 1VJ'. feet Douglas Fir, 105 M.
feet White Fir, 120 M. feet In-
cense Cedar, 5 M. feet Hemlock,
85 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for
less than $2.20 per M. ft. B.M.
for the Douglas Fir, $2.00 per M.
ft. B.M. for the White Fir, Horn-loc-

and Red Cedar, $1.50 per M.
ft. B.M. for tiie Incense Ceclar, or
a total purchase price of $4,353.00,
win bo considered. T. s., K.
7 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
a portion of tha SEJNE1, esti-
mated for the purpose of this sale
to be 435 M. feet Douglas Fir, 40
M. feet White Fir, 55 M. feet In-
cense Cedar. No bid for less than
$2.60 per M. ft. B.M. for the Doug-
las Fir, $2.00 per M. ft. B.M. for
the White Fir, $1.50 per M. ft.
B.M. for the Incense Cedar, or a
total purchase price of $1,293.50,
will be considered. ' T. 32 8., ft.
1 W., Sec. 19, all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
a portion or tne iNmtrNwt, esti-
mated for the purpose of this sale
to toe 135 M. feet stamped Doug-
las Fir, 10 M. feet stamped Sueur
Pine. No bid for less than $3.10
per M. ft. B.M. for the stamped
Douglas Fir, $10.00 per M. ft.
B.M. for the stamped Sugar Pine,
or a total purchase price of
$518.50, will be considered. Sale
area consists of approximately
five acres in the npi'theast corner
of the forty. Only trees stamned
USOC are to be cut. Caterpillar-typ- e

tractor logging is manda-
tory. All timber cut from each
of the above described areas must
be manufactured In the local
marketing area designated by the
O. & C. Administration unless
otherwise authorized by the Chief
Forester. If the unit prices bid
are above those authorized by
MPR 460, they will be reduced
to the maximum permitted under
that order. In case of two or
more Identical bids for the same
timber, the successful bidder will
be selected on the basis of com-
parative Importance to the war
program and ability to further
the objectives of the Act of Au
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bid, amount of bond required with
contract and other information,
application .should be made to the
address shown above. IN DOUG
LAS COUNTY: T. 20 S., R 6 W.,
Sec. 35, all merchantable limber
designated for cutting on the
NE1SW1, estimated for the pur
pose of this sale to be 1475 M. feet
Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet Red Cedar.
No bid for less than 5k1.hu per n.
ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, $2.00
per M. ft. B.M. for the Red Cedar,
or a total purchase price of
$5,772.50, will be considered. T.
21 S.. R. 6 W.. Sec. 11, all mer
chantable timber designed lor out
ing on a portion ox the fcliswt, ail
of the NEJSE1, portion of the
NWJSEl, and all of the S1SEJ,
estimated for the purpose of this,
sale to be 3,995 M. feet Dougliii
Fir, 65 M. feet hemlock, E0 M.
feet Incense Cedar, 20 M. feet Red
Cedar. No bid for less than $3.80
per M. ft. B.M. for the Douglas
Fir, $2.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the
Hemlock and Red Cedar, $1.50
per M. ft. B.M. for the Incense
Cedar, or a totul purchase price
of $15,426.00, will be considered.
All Douglas Fir less than 26 ins.
DBHOB and all trees West of a
blazed line in the ElSWi and
NW1SE1 are reserved from cut-
ting. In an area of approx. 18
acres in the N4SE1, bounded by a
blazed lino, only Douglas fir trees
34 ins. DBHOB and over are to
be cut. Caterpillar tractor log-
ging is mandatory.. T. 25 S R.
2 W., Sec. 19, all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
the W5NE1, SEINE!, NEiNWl,
Lot 1 (NW3NW1), Lot 2 (SWi
NW3), and SElNWi, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
4830 M. feet Douglas Fir, 250 M.
feet stamped Sugar Pine, 95 M.
feet Hemlock, 165 M. feet Red
Cedar, 65 M. feet White Fir. 480
M. feet Incense Cedar. No i'id for
less than $3.60 per M. ft. B.M. for
the Douglas Fir, $10.30 per M. ft.
B.M. for the stamued Sugar Plna.
$2.00 per M. ft. B.M. for the Hem
lock, Red Cedar, White Fir, and
Iincense Cedar, or a total pur-
chase price of $21,573.00. will be
considered. All unmarked Pine
trees are reserved from cutting.
In the W1NEJ, and SElNEi, all
Douglas llr trees less than 2o ins.
DBHOB and all trees on an area
of seven acres bounded by a
blazed line are reserved from cut-
ting. Caterpillar type tractor log-
ging is mandatory in this area.
T. 25 S.. R. 2 W.. Sec. 21. all mer
chantable timber designated for
cutting on all of tie SE1NE1 and
NE1SE1, portion of the W4SEJ,
and all of the SE1SE1, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
3160 M. feet Douglas Fir, 2L0 M.
leet incense 'ueciar, 4U M. feet
Red Cednr. 55 M. feet Hemlock.
450 M. feet stamped Sugar Pine.
ino ma ior less tnan $3.40 per M.
ft. B.M. for the Douglas Fir, $1.50
per M. ft. B.M. for the Incense
Cedar, $2.00 per M. ft. B.M. for
the and Hemlock, and
$10.30 per M. ft. B.M. for the
stamped Sugar Pine, or a total
purchase price of $15,899.00 will
be considered. AU Douglas fir
trees less than 18 Ins. DBHOB and
all unmarked Pine Is reserved
from cutting. Logging to be done
by Caterpillar-typ- e tractor unless
otherwise authorized by the of-
ficer in charge of the sale. T. 26
S., R. 2 W.. Sec. 33. all merchant-- ,
able timber designated for cutting
on me inwiswi, estimated tor
the purpose of this sale to be 590
M. feet Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet
Red Cedar. 60 M. feet Incense
Cedar, 25 M. feet White Fir, 70
M. feet stamped Sugar Pine. No
bid for less than $1.90 per M. ft.
B.M. for the Douglas Fir,' $1.50
per M. ft. B.M. for the Red Cedir,
Jncensa cedar, and White Fir.
$9.30 per M. ft. B.M. for the
stamped Sugar Pine, or a total
Curchase price of $l,9l4.au, will

An area of ten
acres, more or less, along the East
side or tne tony anu oounueu ny
a blazed line is reserved from
cutting. All unmarked Pine trees
are reserved from cutting. The
area is to Be logged by cater-
pillar type tractor unless other
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Daneing 9:00 to 1:00

GARDEN CLUB HAS
ALL-DA- MEETING

CAMAS VALLEY Members
of the Garden club met at the
home of Mrs. Bert Krogel on Fri-
day for an all day meeting to put
together the quilt that was don-
ated to be sold as a benefit for
the blood donors trips to Port-
land. They finished about half pf
the quilting and left it in the
frames upstairs. Anyone who de-

sires to help the Red Cross fund
is urged to call at Mrs. Krogel's
and quilt for whatever time they
can spare at any time. One
afghan was set together and
Mrs. Hattie Long took it home to
stitch together. The other afghan
lacks a few blocks for complet-
ing. Any woman in the valley
who has yarn out to make those
blocks is urged to turn in the
finished blocks or the yarn so
someone else may finish them.
The afghans are now being given
to nurses for overseas duty as
well as to convalescent soldiers
and sailors. The next meeting of
the club will be at the regular
time at the home of Mrs. E. A.
Markham. Mrs. Banks, the presi-
dent, and Mrs. Markham will

- ... .1 .. . i i . .. ,1 it..stfi vt? uuaatri i uiiu a uiiiiiv aiiu mu
members are each to bring one
disn tor a picnic dinner at noon
and each one is asked to bring
her own table service. New
comers in the valley are especially
invited to attend and become
acquainted. At noon a delicious
picnic dinner was served on the
spacious veranda. 1 hose who were
not quilting did Red Cross knit-in-

Those present were Mrs.
Harry Boyle, Mrs. Rose Kinnan,
Mrs. Howard Milton, ' Mrs. Guy
Moore, Mrs. Emery Thrush, Mrs.
Dave Thrush. Mrs. Hattie Long,
Mrs. Louis Papst. Mrs. E. A.
Markham, Mrs. Lloyd Roberts,
Mrs. Ralph Richter, and the
hostess, Mrs. Bert Krogel, with
her house guest, Mrs. Mattie B.
Johnson.

CLUB
MEETS ON FRIDAY

SUTHERLIN The Mary-Marth- a

club of the Christian
church met Friday in the church
parlors, with Mrs. Arthur Long-brak-

president, in charge.
Mrs. John Higgins, a recent

bride, was honored with a lovely
bridal shower. After viewing the
nice gifts the hostesses, Mrs.
Harry West, Mrs. Milo Pope and

Reservations for private
SKATING PARTIES

are available at the
Rainbow Skating Rink

Winchester

PRUDENTIAL LIFE
Insurance

HORACE C. BERG
Special Agent

Douglas Abstract Company
Phone 87

AN AMAZING OFFER
The makers of Dr. Parker'!
Corn Remover will give you
double your money back if it
fails fo remove your corn or
callous. Only 35c at Chap-
man's Drug Store.

Real Estate

L O'A Ns;
CONSTRUCTION

REFINANCING
Low Interest Rates

Ralph L. Russell
112 Cass P. 6. Box 1244

Telephone 913

DANCE
'

Every Saturday Night

Evergreen Grange Hall

"Fiddlin- - Fools"

Admission
Adults 60c, Tax Includ.
Giatle school children .... 10c

Dancing from 9 to 1

OLD TIME

DANCE

EVERY SATURDAY

NIGHT

Sponsored by the

Townsend Club

String Music

MOOSE HALL

EVERYBODY WELCOME

Atends To Business Eugene
Boise of Glide attended to busi
ness in Roseburg Wednesday.

Lookingglass Visitors Mr. and
Mrs. Wes Mereaun were luukimk-Iglas-

visitors' in Roseburg Wed-

nesday. ''.''.'
r. t ft...t. . iceun duiiiic in

L. A. Rhoden of Lowell's in Rose
burg is spending today in urams
tJass on ousiness. .

Worklnn At Abstract Office
Mrs. Ivan Andrus has accepted
employment at the Douglas Ab
stract company onsse.

Returns to Work - Doris
t oinsrH rtf Rncnhitrp hns returned
to her work at the U. S. National
bank after a short vacation.

Return To Home Miss Wanda
Da" has returned to her home in
Roseburg after visiting the past
week with relatives at aaiem.

in Rosebura Mr. and Mrs,
Charlie Neal and three children
of Grants Pass are spending a
few days In Roseburg visiting
relatives.

Visits at Dlllard Home Miss
LaVerne Gunderson, student at
U. of O., has returned to her
home at Sandy, Ore., following
a lew days in ttosepur as me
guest of Miss Jeanne Dlllard on
South Jackson street.

Artn4e' MAtinn Meld An
agents' meeting of the Farmers
r.Mcmm unn holri nt the
office of Fred A. Goff, Roseburg,
district manager, with Floyd
Schmitt agency supervisor, and
local agents in attendance.

t - .

E .L, Cm i?nni,lllw MlN V).

A. Pearson and daughter, Mary
Lynn, returned to their home on
Reservoir avenue, Roseburg,
TiincHni fnllnwlna a trln tn Cn- -

quilie last Thursday to visit the
lormers sisier, ivirs. lmiuiik
Clarke.

Vlsltino Here Mrs. Dora John
son of Portland is spending a few
days visiting relatives ana irienas
in Roseburg and Yoncalla, before
continuing on her way home, fol-

lowing a trip to Hemet, Calif., to
attend the funeral of her mother,
Mrs. Hattie Zimmerman, form
erly of Portland.

Returns To Florence Mrs.
Joseph Strattman returned today
to Florence, Ore., after spending
a few days in Roseburg on busi-
ness. Mrs. Strattman and daugh-
ter, Katheryn, and Mrs. Stratt-man'- s

parents, Mr. and Mrs. B. P.
Enyeart, all- - of Roseburg, are
vacationing at Florence. -

Returning' Home Pfc. Gilbert
Watkins, son of P. A. Watkins,
Camas Valley, has arrived in
New. York with the 44th infantry
division of the Seventh Army,
according to word received by
relatives. He will be transferred
to Fort Lewis, Wash., after which
re will be furloughed home for
30 days.

Visits In Roseburg Richard
Underdahl, engineer third class,
U. S. Navy, has arrived at his
home in Coos Bay on a
leave to visit his parents, Mr.
and Mrs. H. J. Underdahl. Mr.
and Mrs. Underdahl and Richard
visited Sunday with Richard's
aunt and uncle, Mr. and Mrs. P.
E. Thompson, at Roseland Auto
Court. ..

Leaves for Bremerton Mrs.
Laura Cummings of the county
health office, left Friday for
Bremerton, Wash., where she
visited her brother, MM. Sim
Lowman, before he left for over-
seas duty. She also visited an-
other brother, Pvt. Jack L. Low-ma-

who was in, Seattle at that
time. Mrs. Cummings returned
to Roseburg today.

Returns, to Texas Sgt. Otis F.
Conn has returned to his base
at San Marcas, Texas, after spend-
ing a furlough with his
wife,' the former Pauline Dowl-ing- ;

his father, J. F. Conn;
brother and sister-in-law- , Mr. and
Mrs. O. L. Conn, and daughter,
Barbara, and with Mrs. Conn's
parents, Mr; and Mrs. G. H.
Trent, and family of Melrose.
Sgt. and Mrs. Conn also enjoyed
a few days stay at coast points.

To serve others as we would
be served.

DOUGLAS
FUNERAL HOME

Cor. Pin and Lne Street!
FRANK W. LONG, Manager

Licensed Lady Attendant

Caiimr
AMBULANCE SERVICE

Mrs. Olive Mary Eby of
Sutherlin Passes Away
i Mrs. Olive Mary Eby, 76, wife
of Norman K. Eby of Sutherlin,
died Thursday after a short ill-
ness in Mercy hospital. She was
born October 24, 1868, in Kent
County, Michigan, and had been
a resident of Sutherlin for the
last 33 years.

Mrs. Eby is survived by her
husband, Norman K. Eby, of
Sutherlin, and a daughter, Ber-nic- e

Goff of Oakland, Oregon;
she also leaves two grandchildren
and two

- Funeral services will be held
Sunday at 2 P. M at the Com-
munity church in Oakland, with
Rev. J. K. Howard officiating.Interment will be at Valley View
cemetery in Sutherlin. Arrange-
ments are In charge of the Rose-
burg Funeral home.

Funeral Services Held
For Regenia Freeman

Funeral services forMrs. Re-

genia Freeman, wife of Ray J.
Freeman, was held in the chapel
of the Roseburg Funeral home
Wednesday at 10 a. m. The body
was then taken, to the Salem
mausoleum for entombment.

Vital Statistics
BORN

RILEY To Mr. and Mrs. Prent-
ice Austin Riley, route 2, Rose-
burg, at Mercy hospital, Thurs-
day, July 26, a daughter, Judith
Ann; weight six pounds fifteen
ounces.

!' LICENSES
L A T H R O

Loran M. Lathrop, Riddle, and
Simona H. Stricevich, Aberdeen,
Wash. -

HANSON-HEFLI- Basil Jack
Hanson and Lillian Mae Heflin,
both residents of Klamath Falls.

DIVORCE COMPLAINTS
- GENTRY Emma Estella ver-
sus Newman Watson Gentry;
married at Chicago, III., Jan. 10,
1945; cruelty.

Visits In Roseburg Lester
Child of Grants Pass visited his
son and daughter-in-law- , Mr. and
Mrs. Les Child, Jr., in Roseburg
recently.
NOTICE OF TIMBE.R SALE

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid
for Timber," and addressed to the
Chief Forester, O. and C. Admin-
istration, 901 Guardian Building,
Portland 4, Oregon, will be re-

ceived until 10:30 A. M., Pacific
War Time, August 7, 1945, for
the purchase of timoer upon
tracts hereinafter described; each
bid must state the amount per M.
feet B.M., which will be offered
for each species and the total con-

sideration which will be paid for
the timber. No bid for less than
the appraised value will he con-

sidered. Each bid must be
in duplicate and be accom-

panied by a deposit in the form
of a. certified check in favor of
the Treasurer of the United
States. The deposit of any suc-

cessful bidder will be credited on
the contract. Payment in full at
the time of filing the contract is
required in sales amounting to
$2,500 or less. For copies of the
form of nronosnl. form of con- -
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ing will be held in September at
the home of Mrs. .Holgate. The
pleasant evening was spent in
visiting.

Those enloying the evening
with Mrs. Saucerman were: Mrs.
Bertha Barce. Mrs. Belle Cook
Mrs. Florence Cook, Mrs. Hazel
Green, Mrs. Ella Wegner, Mrs
Juanita Holgate, Mrs. Anna Hall,
Mrs. Charlotte Parker, Mrs
Elizabeth Dopp and the following
guests, miss Mane scneiDourne,
Mrs. Nellie Parker. Mrs. Mar
garet Collier and Mrs. Leta
Young.
SUTHERLIN REBEKAH
LODGE MEETING HELD

SUTHERLIN Sutherlin
lodge met in regular form

Thursday evening with Mrs. Hazel
Green, noble grand presiding.
After lodge closed a social hour
was enjoyed.

The hostess of the evening, Mrs.
Adelaide Cooper furnished a word
game, which was won by Mrs.
Green. At a late hour delicious
refreshments were served by the
hostess to: Mrs. Belle Cook, Mrs.
Bertha Barge, Mrs. Mable Ross,
Mrs. Charlotte Parker, Mrs. Mar-
garet Collier, Mrs. Vesta Thomas
and Mrs. Hazel Green.

YONCALLA COUPLE
MARRY IN ROSEBURG

YONCALLA Mr. and Mrs.
Archie Damon announce the mar-
riage of their daughter, Patricia
Jackson, to Glen Cox, son of Jim
and Gussie Cox of Yoncalla. The
marriage took place in Roseburg
early in June. They will make
their home in Roseburg, where
the groom is employed. Both Mr.
and Mrs. Cox attended Yoncalla
High school, the bride being grad-
uated with the class of 1945.

CLASS MEMBERS ENJOY
PICNIC AND HIKE

CAMAS VALLEY The Junior
High Sunday school class, whose
teacher is Mrs. Bessie Wheeler,
had a wonderful time on Friday,
when the pastor, Gene Elliott,
took them for a hike. . They
climbed a mountain, had a picnic
lunch, went to the old swimming
hole in the afternoon, then were
served a baked bean supper at
the church grove. Games were
played during the evening.

THREE LINKS CLUB
HAS MEETING FRIDAY '

MYRTLE CREEK Last Fri-
day the Three Links club held
their regular meeting In the par-
lor of the lodge hall.

After the regular business of
the club was finished a social
hour was enjoyed and refresh-
ments were served by Mrs. Naomi
Burke, Mrs. Clara Bailey, Mrs.
Emma Buick and Mrs. Faith
Adamson.

TOWNSEND CLUB TO
PICNIC ON SUNDAY

The Townsend club will hold a
picnic Sunday, July 29, at the
Deer creek bridge. All members,
their families and friends are in-

vited to bring a basket dinner and
their own table service. .

SHRINERS CLUB TO
PICNIC ON SUNDAY

The Douglas County Shriners
club, their families and invited
guests are asked to enjoy a pic-
nic dinner and affair Sunday,
July 29, to be held from 10 A. M.
to 7 P. M. at the C. B. Calkins
summer place on the North Ump-qu- a

river.
DRAIN NORMAL SCHOOL
PICNIC TO BE SUNDAY'

The annual Drain Normal
school picnic will be held Sunday
at a one o'clock basket dinner at
the Drain city park. All former
students of the school, their fami-
lies and friends are cordially in-

vited to enjoy the affair.
OREGON O. E. S. TO
PICNIC ON SUNDAY

The annual picnic dinner of the
Oregon O. E. S. No. 57, Canyon-ville- ,

will be held at the Canyon
Auto park Sunday, July 29. All
members, their families, visiting
members and Invited guests are
asked to enjoy the occasion. . .'

MARRIAGE OF 80N IS
ANNOUNCED BY ALLEN8

YONCALLA Mr. and Mrs.
Lee Allen of Hayhurst communityannounce the marriage of their
son, Everett Allen, to Miss Maude
Faunan, of Elkton. The wedding
took place in Roseburg, June 30.

Undergoes Op e r a 1 o n Mrs.
George Churchill, of Roseburg,
who has been with her husband
at Diamond lake, where he is
forest ranger, underwent a major
operation at Sacred Heart hos-
pital in Eugene Tuesday. Her
sons are in Roseburg under the
care of their aunt, Mrs. Paul
Trueblood, at the horne of their
paternal grandmother. Mrs. F. H.
Churchill.

MAIN EVENT
Walter Achiu

vs.

Paavo Katonen

Opening Bout
Buck Davidson

vs.
Tex Hager
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