

Local News

On Business — George Lukens of Roseburg left for Coos Bay on business. He will also visit his sisters, Betty Webster and Frances Cramer.

Spends Day at Reedsport — H. O. Pargeter and H. C. Berg of Roseburg spent Thursday in Reedsport attending to business regarding the sale of war bonds.

Return to Portland — Rev. and Mrs. G. H. Roach left last night for their home in Portland, following a couple of weeks in Roseburg visiting at the home of their son and daughter-in-law, Dr. and Mrs. Morris H. Roach and family, on Lane street.

Visiting in Roseburg — Mrs. Dolores Gerrits of Corvallis is visiting in Roseburg with her sister, Mrs. Herman Aydelott, and family. She plans to leave Sunday, Mrs. Aydelott's niece, Ala Wilson, who is attending college in Corvallis, left Sunday for her home in Myrtle Point, after spending a short time here.

DANCE

Every Saturday Night
Evergreen Grange Hall
"Fiddlin' Fools"
Admission
Adults—50c, plus tax
Grade school children 10c
Dancing from 8:30 to 12

ONE GALLON "DOES" AN AVERAGE ROOM!

Kemi-Tone

MIRACLE WALL FINISH

COSTS ONLY \$2.98

Umpqua Valley Hardware

202 N. Jackson Phone 73

YOUR Kemi-Tone DEALER

WRESTLING

Roseburg Armory
Saturday—March 31, 8:30 P. M.

MAIN EVENT

Tex Hager
vs.
The Grey Mask
OPENING BOUT
Gust Johnson
vs.
Ivan Jones
Wrestling "As You Like It"
Tickets on Sale at Powell's Sporting Goods Store

OPENING

SATURDAY, MARCH 31

The
ORIENTAL GARDENS

DANCING FROM 9 TO 12

ADMISSION
60c per person

Sponsored By
Patrick W. Kelley Post
No. 2468 V. F. W.

Myrtle Creek Visitor — Lewis Hunter was a Myrtle Creek visitor in Roseburg Wednesday.

In Portland — Senator Tom Parkinson of Roseburg is in Portland this week on business.

Visits in Roseburg — Mrs. C. B. Austin of Glendale and Mrs. F. N. Harrel of Astoria visited recently with Mrs. Herman Aydelott in Roseburg.

Staying at Aydelott Home — Miss Doris Janney is staying at the Herman Aydelott home in Roseburg to be able to finish school. Her aunt and uncle, Mr. and Mrs. H. H. Walker, with whom she was staying, left for Baker, Ore.

Return from Spokane — Mr. and Mrs. R. L. Strickle have returned to their home on East Oak street, Roseburg, following a trip to Spokane, Wash., on business and to visit Mr. Strickle's manager of the Federal Farm Loan association in Roseburg.

Easter Sale to be Held — The W. S. C. S. of the Methodist church of Yoncalla has announced an Easter sale for Saturday, March 31, at the Tavenner building. Aprons, fancy work, cooked foods, shrubbery and used clothing will be sold.

Attends Convention — Mrs. Arthur Marsh has returned to her home in Lookingglass, following the last several days in Portland attending the state convention of the W. C. T. U. Mrs. Marsh is president of the Douglas county W. C. T. U.

Will Leave Sunday — Libby Shellenbarger, sister of Mrs. Paul Blaskie of Roseburg, will leave Sunday for her home in Lake Odessa, Mich., after a long visit here. She states she likes the country very much and hopes to return soon.

Visits in Grants Pass — Mr. and Mrs. C. R. Holmquist and daughter Patricia, have returned to their home in Grants Pass, following a couple of days in Grants Pass as guests of Mr. and Mrs. Homer Rand and daughter, Letta, and Mrs. Rand's mother, Mrs. Emma Erickson. They were accompanied back to Roseburg by Mr. and Mrs. Rand, who spent a few hours visiting Mr. Rand's parents and other relatives and friends, after which they returned to Grants Pass.

Leaves for San Francisco — Mr. and Mrs. Charles E. Hafer, son-in-law and daughter of Mrs. Paul Blaskie of Roseburg, and Mrs. Myrtle Porter, sister-in-law of Mrs. Blaskie, left for San Francisco to spend a few days. From there they will go to Los Angeles for a longer visit with relatives before returning to their home at St. Francis, Mich., where they will sell their stock and personal belongings following previous sale of their farm, and then return to Oregon. They have purchased a large ranch at Ocala, Fla. They will attend the graduation exercises of Mr. and Mrs. Hafer's son, Midshipman Alvin A. Hafer, from the U. S. Naval academy at Annapolis, Md. He will accompany them to Roseburg before going to Florida for four more weeks of training. He will be in command of a destroyer upon entering sea duty.

Leave for Portland — Mr. and Mrs. Forrest Losce and son and daughter of Roseburg have left for Portland for a few days, where Mr. Losce will attend to business.

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE.
Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 301 Guardian Building, Portland 4, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 a. m., Pacific War Time, April 10, 1945, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B. M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above, IN DOUGLAS COUNTY, T. 21 S. R. 6 W. Sec. 31, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE1 SE1 SE1; T. 22 S. R. 6 W. Sec. 5, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on lot 4 SW1 NW1, NW1 SW1, W1 SW1 SW1, T. 22 S. R. 6 W. Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the N1 NE1; estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3470 M. feet Douglas Fir, 20 M. feet Red Cedar, 170 M. feet White Fir, 15 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the Red Cedar and Incense Cedar, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, or a total purchase price of \$10,802.50, will be considered. Douglas Fir less than 26 ins. DBHOB on the N1 NE1 of Sec. 7, and on the SW1 NW1, NW1 SW1, W1 SW1 SW1 of Sec. 5, are reserved from cutting. On the N1 NE1 of Sec. 7, area to be logged with Caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by the Forester in charge of the sale. On the SW1 NW1, NW1 SW1, W1 SW1 SW1 of Sec. 5, Caterpillar-type tractor logging is mandatory. T. 22 S. R. 7 W. Sec. 1, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on portions of the SW1 NW1 and N1 SW1, all of the SW1 SW1, and portion of the SE1 SW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2125 M. feet Douglas Fir, 540 M. feet White Fir, 20 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$4.25 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, \$1.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$10,141.25, will be considered. All timber north and east of the blazed boundary line is reserved from cutting. All Douglas Fir less than 22 ins. DBHOB is reserved from cutting. Area to be logged with Caterpillar-type tractor. T. 23 S. R. 6 W. Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the E1 NW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 340 M. feet Douglas Fir. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M. ft. B. M., or a total purchase price of \$1,020.00, will be considered. The sale area is that portion of the E1 NW1 which is east of a line blazed on top of the main north and south ridge. All live trees west of this line are reserved. T. 24 S. R. 6 W. Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SW1 NW1 and SW1 NW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be \$20 M. feet Douglas Fir, 25 M. feet White Fir, 35 M. feet Red Cedar, 10 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, Red Cedar, and Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$2,600.00, will be considered. All timber is reserved from cutting in an area of 6 acres, more or less, bounded by a blazed line as indicated on the sale map. T. 25 S. R. 5 W. Sec. 9, all merchantable Douglas Fir Piling designated for cutting on the S1 NW1 SE1 and SW1 SE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be as follows: 13 pcs. 715 Lin. Ft. at \$0.4 per Lin. Ft.; 70 pcs. 4550 Lin. ft. at \$0.45 per Lin. Ft.; 203 pcs. 15,225 Lin. Ft. at \$0.5 per Lin. Ft.; 78 pcs. 6630 Lin. Ft. at \$0.55 per Lin. Ft.; 11 pcs. 1045 Lin. Ft. at \$0.6 per Lin. Ft., or a total purchase price of \$1,421.95, will be considered. Only Douglas fir trees stamped USOC are to be cut. All other trees are reserved from cutting. No slash burning or land clearing will be permitted. The area is to be logged by Caterpillar-type tractor or by horses. All timber cut from each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. & C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 17th day of March, 1945. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration.

Fiftieth Combat Mission Over Nazi Targets in Southern Europe Listed by Capt. Plin A. Laurance

15th AAF IN ITALY—Captain Plin A. Laurance, 23, at right, of Roseburg, recently clocked his fiftieth combat mission over enemy targets in southern Europe, flying his twin-engine P-38 Lightning fighter plane, "Margaret Ann," and now pauses at his 15th AAF base in Italy for a brief backward glance at the high spots of an

The name "Margaret Ann," painted on the nose of his plane, refers to his wife, Margaret Ann Laurance, daughter of U. S. Senator and Mrs. Guy Cordan.

Top thrill in a career that includes strafing, bombing and fighter sweep missions, Laurance declares, came on an escort assignment to protect a formation of B-24 Liberators bombing Blechhammer, Germany. It comes out a tale of a series of "close ones" for the veteran young flyer, when he was forced to "lone wolf" through enemy skies with a bad engine for company.

"We are returning from the bombing mission," Laurance recalls, "and the first thing that happened was my flight was jumped by 12 ME 109s and 190s. It was a lively go for a few moments, but we could only score some strikes on them before they dove into an undercast and got away."

"About then," Laurance, who studied aeronautics at the Fullerton, Calif., Junior college before the war, and who still lists flying as his chief hobby, continued, "my right engine began acting up. I had to head out for home alone. Before I'd gone very far, it got going again, and spotted this B-24 bomber all alone, too, flying with one engine feathered."

Ten minutes later enemy planes returned, and attacked the bomber.

"Two ME 109s," Capt. Laurance specifies. "They didn't see me, and probably figured they had a nice kill in that crippled bomber. When I dove on them, they turned tail, however. Much," the young pilot adds with a smile, "to my relief."

Top Scorer of Group
Entering the AAF July 18, 1942, at Los Angeles, Laurance took flight training, won his wings and commission as a second lieutenant January 7, 1944, at Williams Field, Ariz. He now flies his Lightning with the top scoring fighter group in the Mediter-



anean theatre of operations, a veteran unit credited with more than 1,050 enemy aircraft destroyed or damaged.

His first combat mission saw him over Genoa, Italy, August 12, 1944, and his fiftieth assignment took him over Linz, Austria, February 17, 1945. Sandwiched in between those two career landmarks are a wide variety of mission types, from bombing and strafing to fighter sweep assignments.

Striking at German ground installations and rail yards, Capt. Laurance has destroyed two locomotives, and inflicted damage on miscellaneous rolling stock.

He has been awarded the Air Medal and four oak leaf clusters for his action against the enemy.

Berry Growers Set Meet For Anti-Nisei Action

FOREST GROVE, March 30 — (AP)—Washington county's united berry growers will sponsor a public meeting here tonight for "anyone interested in ridding the coast of Japanese," spokesmen said.

T. W. Pattee, discharged marine veteran of the Pacific, and A. E. McCroskey, organizer for the Oregon Property Owners Protective league, Gresham, will speak.

Communities throughout the county displayed posters advertising the meeting, at which return of Nisei to the coast will be discussed.

The board of education must approve the action, and meanwhile, the students are planning ways of raising the necessary \$65,000, estimated cost of the statute.

LEGAL NOTICES

SUMMONS
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR DOUGLAS COUNTY
Grace B. Buser, Plaintiff,
vs.
Clara Moshier, Defendant.

In the name of the State of Oregon, you are hereby notified to appear and answer the Complaint filed against you in the above entitled court and cause by plaintiff, on or before the expiration of four weeks from the date of the first publication of this summons, and you fail to answer for want thereof the plaintiff will apply to the court for the relief prayed for in her Complaint, a succinct statement of which is as follows: To-wit: for a decree dissolving the marriage contract existing between plaintiff and defendant and awarding plaintiff the custody of the minor children of plaintiff and defendant and for the payment by defendant to the plaintiff of such sum as the court may award for the support and maintenance of the plaintiff and the minor children.

This summons is served upon you by publication thereof by order of the Hon. Carl F. Winberry, judge of the above entitled court, which said order was made and dated the 27th day of March, 1945, and the time prescribed in said order for you to appear and answer is on or before four weeks from the date of the first publication of this summons. The date of the first publication of this summons is March 30, 1945.

RICE & ORCUTT
Attorneys for Plaintiff,
Post Office Address
Roseburg, Oregon.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

All persons having claims against the Estate of Frank J. Ising, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present said claims, together with proper vouchers to the undersigned at 311 Corbett Building, Portland 4, Oregon, within six months from the date of publication of this notice, which date is March 30th, 1945.

FRANK S. SEVER, Administrator.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

All persons having claims against the Estate of Clara Moshier, deceased, now pending in the County Court of Douglas County, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to Paul E. Geddes, attorney, Roseburg, Oregon, within six months from the date hereof.

Dated this 30th day of March, 1945.
WARREN G. BIRCH
Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Clara Moshier, Deceased.

NOTICE

To veterans of the Civil war, Mexican war and Indian wars and widows remaining unmarried thereof—veterans of the Spanish-American war, and World War I, who are disabled to the extent of 40 per cent or more, and widows remaining unmarried of Spanish-American and World War I veterans: Notice is hereby given that all claims for tax exemption must be on file in this office on or before April 1, 1945.

(Adv.) NED DIXON,
Douglas County Assessor.

ROSE Theatre

It's here today—the show you wanted to see

"My Friend Flicka" in Technicolor



With Roddy MacDowell, Preston Foster, Rita Johnson

SUNDAY

William BENDIX
Helen WALKER
Dennis O'KEEFE

ABROAD with TWO YANKS

ELYSE KNOX • RICK VALLIN

PLUS

"Banjo on My Knee"

Wife Spurned "Burden." Disabled Veteran Says

MEMPHIS, March 30 — (AP)—A disabled war veteran, saying that his wife deserted him because she felt he would be a burden to her for the rest of his life, has filed suit for divorce here.

The suit was filed by Robert F. Isom, whose disability is rated by the army at 80 per cent. He lost his right lung and suffered wounds about the chest, back, legs and abdomen in the initial phases of the invasion of France.

He said his wife, Mrs. Helen Galloway Isom, returned to her family in Tampa, Fla., while he was undergoing treatment in the army hospital here.

The Isoms were married Jan. 15, 1942, at Aiken, S. C.

Dog Owners Fined
James Hall and J. F. Willard paid fines of \$2.50 each on the charge of letting dogs run at large. A. J. Geddes, city recorder, stated today.

STEECK AND SMITH

Electric Motor Repair
119 N. Stephens
Repair and rewind large industrial motors and fractional H. P. Quick service. Guaranteed work—Pick up service.
Phone 353 Roseburg, Oregon

STAR

TODAY
"MARK OF THE WHISTLER"
With RICHARD DIX
And
ROY ROGERS
and "TRIGGER"
Singer "Toby" Farris
Sally Evans
Lloyd Corrigan
Claire Lee Lewis

SUNDAY

SWEET SLOW-DOWN

With LINDA DARNELL
TOM BARKI
JACK OAKIE
JAMES CAGNEY
GOODMAN and His Band

With "Hot Money" Cartoon

L. F. LOZIER

DEALER

P. O. Box 746

Our stock located on Highway #9 at Junction of Garden Valley

COLD SPRING MONUMENTS
BEAUTIFUL GRADING

With "Hot Money" Cartoon

MONTGOMERY WARD

It pays to buy...

WARD PLUMBING

BETTER QUALITY

LOWER PRICES

VITREOUS CHINA CLOSET OUTFIT

22.75

Made of stainless white Vitreous china Acid-proof! Easy to keep clean and shining. Positive flushing action cleans bowl thoroughly! Modern design... tank and bowl form single unit.

Save On Wards Steel Pipe

7.87

Per 100 Ft.
Top-quality galvanized steel pipe in all popular sizes cost you less at typical low Ward prices!

30-Gal. Range Boiler

10.45

Galvanized steel, tested for pressure. Rust-proofed... gives years of service!

Laundry Tub

10.25

Removes dirt from washday! Corrugated washboard! Leak-proof one-piece construction!

Medicine Cabinet Sale!

4.80

Large white enameled wall-type cabinet. 3 glass shelves. Save in this sale!

Modern Shower Stove

43.95

Enameled white walls, smooth concrete base. Complete with fittings. Easy to install.

Wards China Sink

9.35

Less Fittings
Made of gleaming white Vitreous china! Smooth, sanitary surface is easy to clean. Acid-proof!

Montgomery Ward