

Local News

Move Tractor — Clay Germond took a tractor to Grants Pass this week for an overhauling job. The tractor has been employed by the forest service at Rock Creek.

Here Wednesday — Thor A. Bergstrom, manager of the Maryland Casualty company, Portland, spent Wednesday in Roseburg on business.

Leaves for Salem — Marvin Helland returned to his duties in the state forester's office at Salem yesterday, following a two-day stay in Roseburg on business.

Attends Meeting — Mrs. Lulu C. Gorrell, county school superintendent, attended the meeting of the 7th war bond drive held at Eugene the first part of the week.

Visiting at Sutherlin — Miss Bernadine Sparks, who is employed by the Medford Telephone company, is spending a few days visiting Miss Joan Carpenter at Sutherlin.

Visits in Grants Pass — Mrs. B. T. Jackson, Mrs. Fred Barker and Mrs. Steve Lorenz of Roseburg made a trip to Grants Pass Wednesday where they visited relatives.

Inspects Shops — W. L. McDonald, who is in charge of the forest service repair shops with headquarters at Portland, spent Wednesday in Roseburg checking equipment. He is on a tour of state district shops.

Moving To Roseburg — Clay Germond and Plin Cooper, who have been in charge of road maintenance during the winter months, are temporarily moving away from the camp at Dry Creek to Roseburg. Mr. Germond is now temporarily employed at the forest service warehouse in Roseburg.

Meeting Announced — A social meeting will be held by Valentine chapter No. 93, O. E. S. Monday night at Myrtle Creek. Members having birthdays in January, February and March will be guests of honor. Officers are requested especially to be present, as this will be the last practice session before the district meeting to be held in Riddle March 31. Mrs. Aker, worthy matron, has asked all members to be present.

Visiting at Keasey Home — Ph. M. 2-c Dow Keasey, U. S. navy, who has served 28 months in the south Pacific, is spending his leave in Roseburg, visiting his parents, Mr. and Mrs. D. W. Keasey. He was joined here for the weekend by his brother and sister-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. Harry Keasey, and sons, Dale and Larry, of Klamath Falls, who have since returned home. Harry Keasey is a former employee of the Hansen Motor company. Dow Keasey will report at Bremerton, Wash., following his leave, where he will be given a new assignment.

U. S. GIVES GOOD HOUSEWIVES BONUS OF RED POINTS

Patriotic American housewives every day are getting extra red points for doing a job that they alone can do for this country.

For those who wish to get this red-point bonus, here's what to do. Save every drop of your used kitchen fats. Turn them in to your butcher promptly. For every pound, he'll give you 2 red points bonus... that's how urgently these used fats are needed to make medicines, gunpowder, synthetic rubber, soaps and a hundred other essentials on the battlefield and home front. Keep saving until the last gun's fired!

First Navy Nurse on Iwo Jima



Ensign Jane Dendlegh of Oberlin, O., first Navy flight nurse to arrive for duty on Iwo Jima, bends over a Marine seriously wounded in battle for the Iwo Jima airfield. U. S. Navy photo, transmitted from Guam by Navy radio-telephoto.

Lieut. F. S. Asam Of Glide Awarded Medal for Valor



Mr. and Mrs. Fred Asam, well known residents of Glide, have been made very happy and proud by a personal commendation of their son, Lieutenant Fred David Asam, pictured above, from General George C. Kenney, commander of the allied air forces in the southwest Pacific area.

Lt. Asam, a graduate of Glide High school, has been serving overseas for the past year as pilot on an army bomber.

In a personal letter to the parents, General Kenney said: "Recently your son, Lieutenant Fred D. Asam, was decorated with the Air Medal. It was an award made in recognition of courageous service to his combat organization, his fellow American airmen, his country, his home, and to you."

"He was cited for meritorious achievements while participating in aerial flights in the Southwest Pacific area from October 10, 1944 to December 24, 1944."

"Your son took part in sustained operational flight missions during which hostile contact was probable and expected. These flights included bombing missions against enemy installations, shipping and supply bases, and aided considerably in the recent successes in this theater."

"Almost every hour of every day your son, and the sons of other American mothers, are in just such things here in the southwest Pacific."

"I would like to tell you how genuinely proud I am to have men such as your son in my command, and how gratified I am to know that young Americans with such courage and resourcefulness are fighting our country's battle against the aggressor nations."

Lions Club Entertained By Three of Its Members

Forrest C. Losee, acting president of the Roseburg Lions club, at its regular dinner meeting last night introduced Dr. Alton E. Dalros, who entertained members with a "Surprise Package" program.

Lion Harry Rinabarger and Lion Frank Long gave short biographies of themselves.

Lion L. K. Wade, Shell Oil Co. agent, from The Dalles, was introduced as a new member of the club.

Fatal Joke Sends Man to Prison for Manslaughter

PHILADELPHIA, March 23.—(AP)—A navy yard welder began

Reservations for private SKATING PARTIES are available at the Rainbow Skating Rink Winchester

FUEL FOR SALE

SAWDUST

Sawdust Burner Parts

Carried in Stock

REPAIR SERVICE

SLABWOOD—16in. Green. 4 ft. Dry and Green

IMMEDIATE DELIVERY

ROSEBURG LUMBER COMPANY

Phone 468-469

a five-month prison sentence today for administering a fatal "hotfoot."

Rufus Bissrup, 40, said he ignited a piece of paper at the foot of fellow welder, Naron Jackson, 36, while Jackson was asleep at the navy yard foundry. Jackson's grease-soaked pants caught fire. Badly burned, he died several weeks later.

Bissrup pleaded guilty to a charge of "manslaughter on a government reservation."

New Owner of Studio Arranging Details Here

W. E. Klosterman of Seattle, who recently purchased the Bishop studios from Don Simmons of Salem, was in Roseburg today to arrange new details and make improvements.

Klosterman said that Mrs. Linda Hughes will be retained as manager of the studio in Roseburg and Mrs. Freda Heavilin as bookkeeper and receptionist.

Mr. Klosterman and H. L. Harmon of Tacoma now have the largest operating system of portrait studios on the west coast. Klosterman says they also have shops at Vancouver, Wash., Portland, Salem, Eugene, Tacoma, Yakima, Spokane and Coos Bay and are also publishers of the Fort Lewis, Wash., Sentinel and official photographers for the post.

Leaves For Ashland — Mrs. C. E. Hart has returned to Ashland to be with her mother, Mrs. J. A. Hart, who is spending several weeks there for her health.

Back From Portland — Mrs. Gladys H. Strong, Roseburg piano instructor, has returned to her home on South Main street, following a week in Portland, where she attended Arthur Schnabel's Sonata recital; heard James Melton, Metropolitan opera tenor, and attended the annual Music Teachers association festival.

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 10:30 a. m., Pacific War Time, April 10, 1945, for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B. M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 21 S. R. 6 W., Sec. 31, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE1 SE1 SE1; T. 22 S. R. 6 W., Sec. 5, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on lot 4, SW1 NW1, NW1 SW1, W1 SW1 SW1; T. 22 S. R. 6 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the N1 NE1; estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3470 M. feet Douglas Fir, 20 M. feet Red Cedar, 170 M. feet White Fir, 15 M. feet Inland Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the Red Cedar and Inland Cedar, \$2.00 per M.

ft. B. M. for the White Fir, or a total purchase price of \$10,802.50, will be considered. Douglas Fir less than 26 ins. DBHOB on the N1 NE1 of Sec. 7, and on the SW1 NW1, NW1 SW1, W1 SW1 SW1 of Sec. 5, are reserved from cutting. On the N1 NE1 of Sec. 7, area to be logged with Caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by the Forester in charge of the sale. On the SW1 NW1, NW1 SW1, W1 SW1 SW1 of Sec. 5, Caterpillar-type tractor logging is mandatory. T. 22 S. R. 7 W., Sec. 1, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on portions of the SW1 NW1 and N1 SW1, all of the SW1 SW1, and portion of the SE1 SW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2125 M. feet Douglas Fir, 540 M. feet White Fir, 20 M. feet Inland Cedar. No bid for less than \$4.25 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, \$1.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the Inland Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$10,141.25, will be considered. All timber north and east of the blazed boundary line is reserved from cutting. All Douglas Fir less than 22 ins. DBHOB is reserved from cutting. Area to be logged with Caterpillar-type tractor. T. 23 S. R. 6 W., Sec. 13, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the E1 NW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 340 M. feet Douglas Fir, No bid for less than \$3.00 per M. ft. B. M., or a total purchase price of \$1,020.00, will be considered. The sale area is that portion of the E1 NW1 which is east of a line blazed on top of the main north and south ridge. All live trees west of this line are reserved. T. 24 S. R. 6 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 2 (SW1 NW1), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 820 M. feet Douglas Fir, 25 M. feet White Fir, 35 M. feet Red Cedar, 10 M. feet Inland Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, Red Cedar, and Inland Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$2,600.00, will be considered. All timber is reserved from cutting in an area of 6 acres, more or less, bounded by a blazed line as indicated on the sale map. T. 25 S. R. 5 W., Sec. 9, all merchantable Douglas Fir Piling designated for cutting on the S1 NW1 SE1 and SW1 SE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be as follows: 13 pcs. 715 Lin. Ft. at \$0.4 per Lin. Ft.; 70 pcs. 450 Lin. Ft. at \$0.45 per Lin. Ft.; 203 pcs. 15,225 Lin. Ft. at \$0.05 per Lin. Ft.; 78 pcs. 6630 Lin. Ft. at \$0.55 per Lin. Ft.; 11 pcs. 1045 Lin. Ft. at \$0.6 per Lin. Ft. or a total purchase price of \$1,421.95, will be considered. Only Douglas fir trees stamped USOC are to be cut. All other trees are reserved from cutting. No slash burning or land clearing will be permitted. The area is to be logged by Caterpillar-type tractor or by horses. All timber cut from each of the above described area must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. & C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 17th day of March, 1945. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration.

Three Forest Products Laboratories Sought

WASHINGTON, March 23.—(AP)—Construction of three forest products laboratories, one of which would be in the Pacific northwest, was proposed in a bill introduced yesterday by Senators Brewster (R-Me.), Russell (D-Ga.) and Morse (R-Ore.).

The plants would study reforestation, forest conservation, timber mechanics and physics, development of new uses for forest products and by-products, reduction of waste in timber operations.

Visiting At Wilbur — Mrs. L. L. Wilson of Oakland, Calif., is visiting her son and daughter-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Bar-

neberg, at Wilbur. Mrs. Wilson plans to leave the last of the week.

Roseburg Paint Shop
General Painting Contractors
Exterior & Interior Decorating
Phone 524 or 422
411 Pacific Bldg.
ROSEBURG, OREGON

Road Grading, Ditch Digging, Basement Excavation, Land Leveling.
Salem Sand & Gravel Company
225 E. 2nd Ave. S. Phone 338

New Evening Show Times

At the Theatres

Effective

Sunday, March 25th

Doors Open at 6:45

SHOWS START at 7:00

2nd Evening Shows Start 9:00

NOW AT WARDS

A NEW SHIPMENT OF

SHEETS

Wards Famous Longwear Sheets

81 x 99

1.29 each

Limit 2 per customer

SHORTS

Men's Cotton Athletic Shorts

55c

1/2 Elastic Top Band
Sizes 30 to 40

5% Wool Blankets

Sizes 72 x 84

3.34

Limit 2 per customer

Lunch Kits

Metal Lunch Kits with Thermos Bottle

1.69

Catalog Department

45 Gauge Sheer Rayon Hose

Full Fashioned

Sizes 8 1/2 to 10 1/2

92c pair

Montgomery Ward

INDIAN THEATRE
Most Unique in the West!

TODAY
One of the truly great stories of all time!
From the Novel by A. J. Cronin
Gregory PECK Vincent PRICE
Chuck Kettler Cartoon-News

SUNDAY
THE GYPSIES ARE COMING!
IN TECHNICOLOR
Gregory PECK Vincent PRICE
Chuck Kettler Cartoon-News

STAR
★ TODAY ★
JACK LONDON'S Great STORY!
ALASKA
KENT TAYLOR
JOHN CARRADINE
DEAN JAGGER
AND
LET'S GO STEADY
Jackie MORAN
Pat PARRISH
SUNDAY
IT'S A BREEZY-TEASY MUSICAL COMEDY
EADIE was a Lady
ANN MILLER
JOE BESSER
with Cartoon & News

ROSE Theatre
TODAY
WATCH THESE ZANIES!
Ever Since VENUS
BILLY GILBERT
ANN SAVAGE
HUGH HERBERT
and
SONG OF THE RANGE
with JIMMY WAKELY
SUNDAY
Follow The Falcon For New Thrills Below The Rio Grandel
The Falcon in Mexico
TOM CONWAY
MARTHA McVICAR
MONA MARIS
PLUS
Youth ON TRIAL
JOHN COLLINS
DAVID NEED