

Dairymen

SHIP YOUR CREAM TO
DOUGLAS COUNTY
CREAMERY
MAKERS OF
Butter and
Mel-O-Maid
Ice Cream

TOP PRICES PAID
Jackson and Douglas
Telephone 340

Clark Field Captured
By Manila-Bound Yanks
(Continued from Page 1)

forts and Liberators poured 187 tons of bombs on the island. A half dozen Japanese ships were sunk or damaged at two, at Aparri on northern Luzon, off Formosa and in the Banda sea. A dispatch from the task force disclosed that a battleship led the two Jima raiders, whose destroyers blew up one cargo vessel and set fire to two others.

Bases in China Bombed
China-based Mustang fighters whipped out 40 or 46 Japanese planes in a sweep over Peiping airfield in north China and wrecked four locomotives. Japanese columns consolidating their hold on southeast China captured Lokehong and Pingshek, narrowing the Chinese hold on the Canton-Hankow railway to less than 100 miles.

A Japanese imperial communiqué reported several Superforts bombed Singapore before dawn today and a solitary B-29 scouted the former British naval base in daylight—probable harbingers of

a mass raid on the former British naval base.

Indian troops smashed back fresh Japanese counterattacks and drove their own lines deeper into Ramee island off the west Burma coast. In central Burma other British units edged closer to Mandalay.

Increasing Chinese war production was forecast by Donald M. Nelson. Japanese were assured by cabinet ministers they would get more food and fuel this winter to lessen the hunger and cold and the present rice ration would be maintained "to the very end."

Less Butter for Civilians
Unless Government Acts
(Continued from Page 1)

ter taken for the armed forces and lend-lease—287,000,000 pounds. He said the 1944 output of creamery butter was 1,478,000,000 pounds, as compared to a normal output of 1,800,000,000 pounds.

Last year's trend is continuing

this year, Dr. Ruehe said, "requiring action at once to reverse it and provide more butter for American tables."

Owen M. Richards, manager of the American Dairy association, said "millions find it hard to understand why they are being deprived of so much butter when milk production is the highest in history. The butter that is being allocated for civilians this year will provide only about two ounces per person per week—less than a pat of butter a day."

Richards said "the government controls farm production. Production is controlled through prices. To get more butter, raise the return to the producers of butter. This can be done without cutting production of other essential dairy needs."

LEGAL NOTICES

SUMMONS

In the circuit court of the state of Oregon for Douglas county.

Earl Sumner and Cora Sumner, husband and wife, plaintiffs.

vs.

Neil Kunkel, the Unknown Heirs of Lewis D. Rose, deceased, and Mary B. Rose, also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real estate described in the complaint herein, defendants.

To Neil Kunkel, the unknown heirs of Lewis D. Rose, deceased, Mary B. Rose, also all other persons or parties unknown claiming any right, title, estate, lien or interest in the real property described in the complaint herein, defendants.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON, you and each of you are hereby required to appear and answer the complaint of the plaintiffs filed against you in the above named court and cause, on or before four weeks from the 20th day of January, 1945, that being the date of the first publication of this summons, and if you fail to so appear and answer said complaint, plaintiffs for want thereof will apply to the court for the relief demanded therein, to-wit:

That it be decreed that the plaintiffs are the owners in fee simple by the entirety, and are in lawful possession of the following described real property in Douglas county, Oregon, to-wit:

Lots numbered thirteen (13) and fourteen (14) of Section 22 in Township 30 South of Range 4 West of the Willamette Meridian; and

A parcel of land the boundaries of which are as follows: Beginning at a point 40 rods east of the north-west corner of the Southwest quarter of Section 27 in Township 30 South of Range 4 West, W. M., running thence north 17 1/2 rods, thence east 46 rods, thence south 17 1/2 rods, thence west 40 rods to the place of beginning, and that the right of possession and title to said premises be forever quieted in said plaintiffs, and that it be further decreed that any and all claims of the defendants, or either of them, are without foundation in law and equity, and that the said plaintiffs are the owners of the said premises and the whole thereof, and that the said defendants, claiming by, through or under them be forever enjoined and barred from asserting any right, title, estate, lien, or interest in said premises or any part thereof, and for such other relief as to the court may seem meet and equitable.

This summons is served upon you by publication once each week for four successive weeks in The News-Review, a newspaper of general circulation published in Roseburg, Douglas county, Oregon, by the order of the Hon. Carl E. Wimberly, Judge of the above entitled court, made on the 20th day of January, 1945.

GEORGE NEUMER, Attorney for Plaintiffs, McMinnville, Oregon.

First publication, January 20, 1945. Last publication, February 23, 1945.

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

Notice is hereby given that the final account of the undersigned administrator of the estate of George M. Bassett, deceased, has been filed in the county court of Douglas county, Oregon, and by order of said court, Tuesday, February 27, 1945, at 10:00 o'clock a. m. in the county court room in the court house in Roseburg, Douglas county, Oregon, has been fixed as the time and place for hearing objections, if any there be, to said final account and for the settlement thereof.

C. FRED APPLEGATE, Administrator of the estate of George M. Bassett, deceased.

DOUGLAS MARKET

Shop our counters and see the values you can find. Approximately 85% of all meats have gone back on the rationed list. We are still able, however, to offer some unrationed meats, including veal and mutton.

VEAL ROAST	26c
'C' Grade, lb.	
VEAL CHOPS	36c
'C' Grade, lb.	
GROUND BEEF	30c
Fresh, (4 pts.) lb.	
SAUSAGE	30c
(2 pts.) lb.	
FRESH SMELTS	35c
2 lbs.	
SALMON & OYSTERS	
ALL KINDS OF SMOKED FISH	
BRING US YOUR WASTE FAT	
We pay 4c per lb. and 2 red points.	
WE CUSTOM SLAUGHTER AND BUY YOUR HIDES.	
Telephone 350	
230 N. Jackson	

BOWLING

Open Play
Every
Tuesday, Friday
Saturday and
Sunday

WE
HAVE PIN SETTERS

**Roseburg
Bowling Alley**

WRESTLING

ROSEBURG ARMORY

Saturday Nite, Jan. 27, 8:30 p. m.

JACK KISER VS. BILLY McEWIN
COAST CHAMP VS. TEXAS COWBOY
ERNIE PILUSO VS. TARZAN POTVIN
PORTLAND FAVORITE VS. CANADA STRONG BOY

Supervised by Roseburg Boxing Commission
Don Owen, Promoter

Admission: Ringside \$1.50; General \$1.00
Tax Included

THE INSURANCE COMPANY IS PREPARED TO ASSUME THE FINANCIAL RISK—ARE YOU?

Your precious personal property is very attractive prey to the lawless now-a-days. If it is worth owning it is worth protecting.

Obtain an individual All Risk Jewelry and Fur policy—or an All Risk Blanket Personal Property Floater policy covering all your personal property against practically every conceivable loss.

KEN BAILEY INSURANCE AGENCY

COMPLETE INSURANCE SERVICE

315 Pacific Building Telephone 398

PLUMBING

PROMPT REPAIR SERVICE

Complete stock of fixtures and fittings, including sinks, toilets, lavatories, tubs, showers, range boilers, gas and electric water heaters, steel and concrete septic tanks, shallow and deep well pumps.

Call or see

Coen Lumber Company

Flood and Mill Streets Phone 121

BAKING NEEDS

AT LOW POINT VALUES

These snappy January days are good baking ones.

Our complete line of staples will make your selection easy.

FULL LINE OF QUALITY MEATS and Fresh Vegetables

GRIMM'S

OPEN EVENINGS OPEN SUNDAYS

574 North Jackson Telephone 690

Seesaw Combat Still Rages in Alsace Region
(Continued from page 1)

said, the British had seized 11 more towns as far inside Germany as 11 miles, and were within a mile of the Roer river, barrier to the Cologne plain.

U. S. First army troops made methodical progress toward the German border in the St. Vith sector of the Ardennes, and were less than three miles from the frontier. The U. S. Third pushed steadily toward the Siegfried line after crossing the Cerve and driving into Cleroux, last town of any size to be held by the Germans in Luxembourg.

Foul weather limited aerial punishment of the Germans who still were withdrawing from the Ardennes, possibly to bolster the fluid Russian front.

After being paralyzed by debris-choked roads and wreck strewn rails and being compelled to shift their main movement to the south, the enemy yesterday was able to resume his north-eastward trek from the Ardennes.

American planes, however, were able to destroy or damage 1,700 or so more vehicles.

Vital Statistics

DIVORCE COMPLAINTS
ARTHUR—Dorothy L. vs. Loren K. Arthur; married at Eugene, September 17, 1934; desertion.

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 2:30 p. m. of the day of the sale, February 6, 1945 for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B. M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, and bond of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above.

IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 21 S. R. 9 W., Sec. 29, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SW 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 435 M. feet Douglas Fir, 530 M. feet Hemlock, 205 M. feet Red Cedar, 5 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$5.25 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the Hemlock, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Red Cedar, \$7.50 ea. for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$24,602.50, will be considered. T. 22 S. R. 9 W., Secs. 25 and 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the SW 1/4 of Sec. 25, and Lots 9, 10, 15, and 16 (SE 1/4) of Sec. 35, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 3475 M. feet Douglas Fir, 185 M. feet Hemlock, 190 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$3.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.75 per M. ft. B. M. for the Hemlock, and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$12,818.75, will be considered. T. 25 S. R. 8 W., Sec. 1, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 1 (NE 1/4 NE 1/4), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 475 M. feet Douglas Fir, 25 M. feet White Fir, 10 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$1.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$1.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$757.50, will be considered. T. 22 S. R. 1 W., Sec. 19, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE 1/4, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2290 M. feet Douglas Fir, 85 M. feet stamped Sugar Pine, 25 M. feet White Fir, 25 M. feet In-cense Cedar, 30 M. feet Hemlock. No bid for less than \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$7.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the stamped Sugar Pine, \$1.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, In-cense Cedar, and Hemlock, or a total purchase price of \$5,297.50 will be considered. All unmarked Pine is reserved from cutting. Timber to be logged with Caterpillar-type tractor, unless otherwise authorized by Forester in charge of sale. All timber cut from each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. & C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460 they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in the advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon this 15th day of January, 1945 W. H. Homing, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration.

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

All persons having claims against the estate of Elmer McClure, deceased, now pending in the county court of Douglas county, Oregon, are notified to present the same, properly verified, to the undersigned executor at Myrtle Creek, Douglas county, Oregon, within six months from the 26th day of January, 1945.

GLENN N. RIDDLE, Executor, last will and testament Elmer McClure, deceased.

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

Notice is hereby given that the undersigned, executor of the estate of Pearl Clara Jones, deceased, has filed in the county court of Douglas county, Oregon, her final account as such executor, and that Saturday, the 17th day of February, 1945, at the hour of 10 o'clock a. m. in the county court room in the court house in Roseburg, Douglas county, Oregon, has been fixed as the time and place for hearing objections, if any there be, to said final account and for the settlement thereof.

G. W. WAGNER, Executor, last will and testament of Pearl Clara Jones, deceased.

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT

Notice is hereby given that the final account of the undersigned executor has been filed in the county court of Douglas county, Oregon, and by order of said court, Tuesday, February 20, 1945, at 10:00 o'clock a. m. in the county court room in the court house in Roseburg, Douglas county, Oregon, has been fixed as the time and place for hearing objections, if any there be, to said final account and for the settlement thereof.

SARAH ELLEN AIKINS, Executor, last will and testament of G. E. Aikins, deceased.

ATTENTION MERCHANTS

STOLEN

Check Book

with signed checks.

Payment has been stopped on all checks.

LEE MORTENSEN

CALL 553-R if presented.

Orange Blossom

... the "buy" words in selecting your rings. Their reputation for beauty and fine quality is backed by our own recommendation.

Easy terms always
Never a carrying charge

M. LAWSON

Jeweler

116 North Jackson

FISHER'S DEPARTMENT STORE

Swansdown

GIVES YOU THIS WONDERFUL COUPLE!

Coat and Suit in a Miron Woolen

This outfit is merely one of the many exclusive in stock at Fisher's now.

Exclusive with us — Featured in Harper's Bazaar

The happiest pair in town! They go beautifully together... or walk smartly apart! The slim, collarless suit has handsome stitched geometric detail... the coat wide notched lapels. Swansdown designed both in a fine, pure worsted. Sizes 10-18.

We Give S. & H. Green Stamps

Fisher's Dept. Store

ROSEBURG'S OWN STORE

To serve others as we would be served.

DOUGLAS FUNERAL HOME

Cor. Pine and Lane Streets

FRANK W. LONG, Manager

Licensed Lady Attendant

Call 112 Day or Night

AMBULANCE SERVICE