

U. S. Convoy Battled By Japanese Planes

(Continued from Page 1)

ported over the Kobe-Osaka area tonight.

Tokyo radio reported complete

Reservations for private **SKATING PARTIES** are available at the **Rainbow Skating Rink** Winchester

Prudential Life Insurance H. C. BERG, Special Agent, Savings & Loan Building, Phone 87

AN AMAZING OFFER The makers of Dr. Parker's Corn Remover will give you double your money back if it fails to remove your corn or callous. Only 35c at Chapman's Drug Store.

BOB'S STUDIO POPULAR PIANO Bob Doty, Instructor Room 225 Pacific Bldg. 7-9 Evenings

FAMILY HOTEL 313 West Lane Street now under the new management of Mrs. Ada Warner.

H. C. STEARNS Funeral Director Phone 472 OAKLAND, ORE. Licensed Lady Assistant Any Distance, Any Time Our service is for ALL, and meets EVERY NEED

NEW YEAR'S DANCE

Rice Valley Hall Saturday, Dec. 30 Upshaw Orchestra EVERYBODY WELCOME

BIG DANCE

Azalea Grange Hall Music by Rhythm Rascals Everyone Welcome **SATURDAY** Admission: Gents \$1.00 Ladies 40c

SAWMILL OPERATORS

We are always in the market for Pine - Cedar - Douglas Fir or other lumber.

Quick Cash Return George F. Weis Company Wholesale Lumber 1151 So. Broadway Los Angeles 15, Calif.



Open Play Every Tuesday, Friday Saturday and Sunday

WE HAVE PIN SETTERS **Roseburg Bowling Alley**

tion of an underwater tunnel linking the main islands of Japan—Honshu and Kyushu—which may be used when fighting the homeland. It also announced the death of another ranking admiral, this time from natural causes. He was Adm. Nobumasa Suetsugu.

In a significant soviet statement the Moscow newspaper Pravda discussed at length Japan's "continuous defeat on land, sea and air."

U. S. PACIFIC FLEET HEADQUARTERS, Pearl Harbor, Dec. 29—(AP)—A major turn in the Pacific war by next summer is foreseen by Vice Adm. Marc A. Mitscher who helped whip the Japanese decisively in two battles of the Philippines sea and figures "in another year we should have their navy pretty well cleaned up."

"By next summer, they will be sitting on a decidedly uneasy seat in the empire," he told war correspondents yesterday.

Mitscher, whose carrier forces crushed the enemy's naval attempt to interfere last June with the invasion of Saipan and helped thwart the Japanese naval effort to interfere in October with the invasion of Leyte, expects another such battle.

"They've reached the point where they'll throw everything in the fight," he said. Mitscher returned to Pearl Harbor after a month and a half leave in the United States.

Japs Strike Back On the side of current action, Adm. Nimitz reported the second Nipponese air raid in three days on the Salipan base of the Superfortresses, now blasting Japan. He also announced another American air smack at two Jims, the Volcano Island from which the Japanese planes are flying to Saipan.

Nimitz said enemy raiders inflicted minor damage at both Saipan and Tinian during attacks Dec. 26, the same day that American warships turned up with planes in an assault on two Jims.

Five enemy planes dealt the first blow. Two more followed them in. Two raiders were shot down.

Nimitz also reported that Liberator bombers, escorted by Lightning fighters, bombed and strafed two Jims that day, after the previously announced plane-warship assault. An enemy fighter was shot down. Two more were wiped out on the ground and two damaged. Two has been pounded daily by such attacks for 20 days.

In the Marianas, Maj. Gen. Robert W. Douglas, deputy commander of the Pacific strategic airforce, told Vern Haugland, associated press war correspondent, the Japanese are able to repair the airfields at two as fast as they are bombed.

"It would take thousands of planes dropping bombs every hour, to keep two Jims knocked out all the time," he said.

Toll of Jap Planes Up (In the Philippines, MacArthur reported only mopping up operations on the ground and the usual sweep of airforces over the archipelago and islands to the south; but a spokesman amplified the Japanese task force attack Tuesday on the Yank air base at Mindoro, saying it had been determined the Nipponese made no attempt to land forces under cover of the shelling.

(MacArthur's communique today, in a recapitulation, added 20 more enemy planes to the total shot down Dec. 26 over Clark field, Manila, making a total of 144 bagged in three consecutive strikes there by land-based bombers and fighters.

(The communique for the third straight day reported a heavy attack on Halmahera, the enemy position 300 miles southwest of the Philippines which is close by the Yank air base of Morotai. The 180 tons dropped made a total of more than 400 in three days. Among the targets were bivouacs. The enemy has been reported attempting to move troops by barge from Halmahera to Morotai to menace the air base).

British Open Drive to Rid Athens of ELAS

ATHENS, Dec. 29—(AP)—The British opened a three-pronged drive against ELAS forces in the eastern suburbs of Athens today, jumping off after a prolonged artillery barrage in the second phase of operations designed to clear the embattled Greek capital.

An official announcement said 2,500 prisoners have been taken by the British and Greek forces. In all the cleared areas of the capital and Piraeus some 350,000 civilians received free meals from British-American relief stocks.

Gobblers Don't Gobble LOS ANGELES, Dec. 29—(AP)—Not an alarm-sounding gobble in a truckload of turkeys? That's what Helen Goodrich of suburban Van Nuys concluded after thieves in the night trucked away 200 birds.

The turkeys, which she valued at \$2,150, apparently didn't emit a single squawk.

Beware Coughs from common colds That Hang On Creomulsion relieves promptly because it goes right to the seat of the trouble to help loosen and expel germ laden phlegm, and aid nature to soothe and heal raw, tender, inflamed bronchial mucous membranes. Tell your druggist to sell you a bottle of Creomulsion with the understanding you must like the way it quickly allays the cough or you are to have your money back.

CREOMULSION for Coughs, Chest Colds, Bronchitis

Smashing of Bastogne Siege Work of Patton

(Continued from Page 1)

but it still is firmly in American hands. Patton's hard-hitting men and armor advanced up to 20 miles in six days along an east-to-west front extending from the Luxembourg-German border to west of Bastogne.

They lifted a threat to the city of Luxembourg by pounding the Germans back two to 14 miles after they had speared within 13 miles of the Duchy's capital.

They reached Bastogne through a corridor that narrowed to only one mile as it entered the town, but widened at its base to three miles.

German Casualties Heavy The task of countering von Rundstedt was a ready-made one for Patton, an old cavalry hand who now is considered the world's foremost tank expert.

Meeting the German challenge required a speedy shuffling of troops. Patton accomplished this swiftly and expertly.

In Bastogne, bulldozers had to clear the streets. Litter squads lifted the dead from the ruins.

Von Rundstedt threw all he could against Bastogne but he failed.

Today there were some 200 destroyed German tanks lying in and about the town, hundreds of dead and more hundreds of German prisoners in cages.

Veto Hits Jackson Hole Park Abolishment Bill (Continued from Page 1)

lands within the monument. Among other things, he suggested, this legislation might provide assurance for private landholders who now have grazing privileges.

Precedent Pointed Out Mr. Roosevelt said his proclamation creating the monument followed precedent repeatedly established by his predecessors, beginning with Theodore Roosevelt, in exercising authority conferred by an act of 1906. He said 82 national monuments have been established by presidents of both political parties and that seven are larger than the Jackson Hole monument.

"There are few official acts of the president of the United States, in the field of conservation, or in any other phase of government, so amply supported by precedent as is the proclamation establishing Jackson Hole national monument," Mr. Roosevelt asserted.

Saying that whatever "reasonable objections" may exist can be overcome, he added:

"Therefore it would seem to me that the proper remedy in this situation is not the undoing of what has been done, but the making of such adjustments as may be appropriate to meet the local conditions."

Nazi Spearheads Pounded By Allies Into Reverse

(Continued from Page 1)

furiouly all along the German perimeter.

German pressure flagged along the Marche-Hottel line, where, von Rundstedt had been stopped cold when he hurled his weight toward the Antwerp supply line. The Americans recaptured Grandmenil, Manhay and Humain.

Patton's forces on the southern flank buffeted the Germans back a mile to a mile and a half across the Sure river in crossings which have been widened to seven miles, and smashed them against the Sauer river at the German frontier east of Echternach, base of the Nazi bulge.

Nazis Admit Withdrawal Patton's prisoners in seven days of his counterattack mounted to 5,351. His swift drive last night to have driven the Nazis back as much as 16 miles in six days on the southern flank.

The Germans acknowledged a withdrawal "according to plan" virtually all around the perimeter.

U. S. Eighth air force Flying Fortresses and Liberators, again defying foul weather, were over Germany again today, and Berlin said Italian-based U. S. 15th air force planes also were attacking. But weather curtailed direct support of ground troops on the front.

Fighting slackened in the Serchio valley in Italy, where strong Nazi counterthrusts had driven U. S. Fifth army troops from Barga and from the area of Galliano, 21 miles from Barga on the Serchio river's west bank.

CHRISTMAS CELEBRATED AT CAMAS VALLEY CHURCH CAMAS VALLEY — Under the direction of Mrs. Ernest Wheeler, superintendent, the community Sunday school commemorated the true spirit of Christmas. Gifts of food and money were presented to the pastor, Gene Elliott, on the morning of Dec. 17th, at his regular preaching service. The church was decorated with the creche and Bethlehem scene loaned by Mrs. Boyle. The Christmas

program was given after Sunday school on the Sunday before Christmas. Margaret and Esther Brown had beautifully decorated the church with mistletoe and holly and snow laden trees. An untrimmed tree was the focal point of the program. The various classes decorated the tree as the legend pertaining to the origin of each type of decoration was given by Mrs. Wheeler. The reading of the Christmas story from Luke by Ellen Jones, Luther's grade hymn and Van Dyke's "The Other Wise Man" were part of the impressive service which concluded with each member adding gifts of toys for orphans and money for the world service of the church to complete the trimming of the tree.

Christmas eve twenty-seven members of the Sunday school sang Christmas carols at various homes in the valley. They stopped at every home where a candle had been left burning in the window. Mrs. Boyle treated the singers to candy. The Wakefield family invited them in to warm and treat them to popcorn, candy and nuts. There sang around the piano there and also at the Frank Church home where they warmed by the fireside. The last stop was at the home of Mrs. Ethel Brown, where doughnuts and hot chocolate and a fire in the fireplace were very welcome to all.

Singing the carols from house to house deepened the desire of all present for the hastening of the time when there will be "peace on earth and good will to men" in every nation.

CAMAS VALLEY BOYS HONORED AT PARTY CAMAS VALLEY — Friday evening the junior class of the high school gave a party honoring Don Cairns and Frank Milton who are going into the navy. The entire student body was invited.

Charge of Damaging Property Is Denied A plea of innocent to a charge of damaging property and disturbing the peace was filed in the Roseburg justice court today by Henry Denn, Jr., Camas Valley, who posted cash bail of \$200.

District Attorney H. A. Canada reported that a restraining order had been issued in circuit court on petition of J. M. Rasmussen and Claude Baum, who charged that Denn had been blocking a road right of way over which logging trucks were operated.

A bridge located on the roadway under dispute was recently damaged, the district attorney said, leading to the filing of the complaint against Denn.

LEGAL NOTICES NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 2:30 p. m., Pacific War Time, January 9, 1945 for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B. M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required

Society

YOUNG PEOPLE ENJOY DELIGHTFUL PARTY

SUTHERLIN — A hay ride and caroling party was enjoyed by the cadets for Christ and Junior Endeavors of the Christian church last Thursday evening, ending up at the home of Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Longbrake about five miles east of Sutherlin where games and bingo were enjoyed until a late hour. Peggy Parrott was awarded the prize for winning the most games.

Chili, crackers and cocoa were served to the following: Rev. and Mrs. Newell Morgan, Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Longbrake and children, Mrs. Byron Harmon, Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Longbrake, Beverly Pope, Milo Pope, David Garman, Don West, Bruce Pope, Evelyn Garman, Betty Hosman, Donald Robertson, Jimmy Stone, Leana McCrory, Myrdred Chester, Carol Firman, Larry Longbrake, Peggy Parrott, Lloyd Holgate, Linden Longbrake and Joyce Holgate.

COMMUNITY CHRISTMAS DINNER IS ENJOYED

CAMAS VALLEY — The community Christmas dinner was a real happy occasion. There was enough turkey, dressing, cold slaw, coffee, sandwiches and pie for everyone of the estimated five hundred who were there. It took an hour and a half for the line to pass the serving table but everyone was busy visiting all along the line and did not mind waiting. Those who had charge of the serving are to be complimented on the speed and efficiency with which they accomplished the feeding of so many. The Standley logging crew had set up the tables and erected a huge Christmas tree that was so beautifully trimmed that it was a joy to behold. There was plenty of mistletoe and other greens for trimming also. The Skaggs family had filled three hundred cellophane bags with candy, nuts and oranges which gave Santa a generous pack to share with each family. Under the supervision of Mrs. Crouch the children sang the familiar carols, Carl Borgess and Helen Tillman sang a duet "The White Christmas" and Geo. Packard and Leroy White played a violin duet. Santa came in as the children were singing "Santa Claus Is Coming to Town," much to the joy of the young guests. The rest of the evening was spent in dancing.

CHRISTMAS CELEBRATED AT CAMAS VALLEY CHURCH CAMAS VALLEY — Under the direction of Mrs. Ernest Wheeler, superintendent, the community Sunday school commemorated the true spirit of Christmas. Gifts of food and money were presented to the pastor, Gene Elliott, on the morning of Dec. 17th, at his regular preaching service. The church was decorated with the creche and Bethlehem scene loaned by Mrs. Boyle. The Christmas

program was given after Sunday school on the Sunday before Christmas. Margaret and Esther Brown had beautifully decorated the church with mistletoe and holly and snow laden trees. An untrimmed tree was the focal point of the program. The various classes decorated the tree as the legend pertaining to the origin of each type of decoration was given by Mrs. Wheeler. The reading of the Christmas story from Luke by Ellen Jones, Luther's grade hymn and Van Dyke's "The Other Wise Man" were part of the impressive service which concluded with each member adding gifts of toys for orphans and money for the world service of the church to complete the trimming of the tree.

Christmas eve twenty-seven members of the Sunday school sang Christmas carols at various homes in the valley. They stopped at every home where a candle had been left burning in the window. Mrs. Boyle treated the singers to candy. The Wakefield family invited them in to warm and treat them to popcorn, candy and nuts. There sang around the piano there and also at the Frank Church home where they warmed by the fireside. The last stop was at the home of Mrs. Ethel Brown, where doughnuts and hot chocolate and a fire in the fireplace were very welcome to all.

Singing the carols from house to house deepened the desire of all present for the hastening of the time when there will be "peace on earth and good will to men" in every nation.

CAMAS VALLEY BOYS HONORED AT PARTY CAMAS VALLEY — Friday evening the junior class of the high school gave a party honoring Don Cairns and Frank Milton who are going into the navy. The entire student body was invited.

Charge of Damaging Property Is Denied A plea of innocent to a charge of damaging property and disturbing the peace was filed in the Roseburg justice court today by Henry Denn, Jr., Camas Valley, who posted cash bail of \$200.

District Attorney H. A. Canada reported that a restraining order had been issued in circuit court on petition of J. M. Rasmussen and Claude Baum, who charged that Denn had been blocking a road right of way over which logging trucks were operated.

A bridge located on the roadway under dispute was recently damaged, the district attorney said, leading to the filing of the complaint against Denn.

LEGAL NOTICES NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 2:30 p. m., Pacific War Time, January 9, 1945 for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B. M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required

with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 21 S. R. 9 W. Sec. 29, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE1 NE1 and W1 NE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 4365 M. feet Douglas Fir, 1385 M. feet Hemlock, 80 M. feet Red Cedar, 40 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$4.25 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the Hemlock, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Red Cedar, \$1.75 ea. for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$22,203.75, will be considered. T. 24 S. R. 6 W. Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 3 (NW1 SW1), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 650 M. feet Douglas Fir, 40 M. feet White Fir, 20 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.75 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$1,907.50, will be considered. T. 30 S. R. 4 W. Sec. 27, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE1 NE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 640 M. feet Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet White Fir, 10 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, and \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$1,620.00, will be considered. Area to be logged with caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by Forester in charge of sale. T. 31 S. R. 5 W. Sec. 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE1 SE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1285 M. feet Douglas Fir, 15 M. feet White Fir, 60 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.75 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, \$2.25 per M. ft. B. M. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$3,738.75, will be considered. All timber cut from each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. & C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the Maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 18th day of December 1944. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration.

LEGAL NOTICES SUMMONS. In the circuit court of the state of Oregon for Douglas county. Joy F. Miller, Plaintiff, vs. Juanita Miller, Defendant.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby required to appear and answer the complaint filed against you in the above entitled court and cause within four (4) weeks from the date of the first publication of this summons, and if you fail to do so, the court for the relief therein demanded, a succinct statement of which is as follows:

That the bonds of matrimony heretofore entered into by and between the parties hereto be dissolved.

This summons is served upon you by publication in the Roseburg News-Review, a newspaper of general circulation published in Douglas county, Oregon, pursuant to an order of the Honorable Carl E. Wimberly, Judge of the above entitled court, duly made and entered on the 9th day of November, 1944, requiring this summons to be published once a week for four (4) successive weeks and requiring you to appear and answer plaintiff's complaint within four (4) weeks from the date of the first publication of this summons.

Dated and first published this 8th day of December, 1944.

CARL M. MELKER, Attorney for Plaintiff.

U. S. Nat'l Bank Bldg., Roseburg, Oregon.

The Pekin Court Gazette, China, was 640 years old when the first newspaper was printed in Europe in 1521.

LEGAL NOTICES SUMMONS. In the circuit court of the state of Oregon for Douglas county. Joy F. Miller, Plaintiff, vs. Juanita Miller, Defendant.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby required to appear and answer the complaint filed against you in the above entitled court and cause within four (4) weeks from the date of the first publication of this summons, and if you fail to do so, the court for the relief therein demanded, a succinct statement of which is as follows:

That the bonds of matrimony heretofore entered into by and between the parties hereto be dissolved.

This summons is served upon you by publication in the Roseburg News-Review, a newspaper of general circulation published in Douglas county, Oregon, pursuant to an order of the Honorable Carl E. Wimberly, Judge of the above entitled court, duly made and entered on the 9th day of November, 1944, requiring this summons to be published once a week for four (4) successive weeks and requiring you to appear and answer plaintiff's complaint within four (4) weeks from the date of the first publication of this summons.

Dated and first published this 8th day of December, 1944.

CARL M. MELKER, Attorney for Plaintiff.

U. S. Nat'l Bank Bldg., Roseburg, Oregon.

mas program was given after Sunday school on the Sunday before Christmas. Margaret and Esther Brown had beautifully decorated the church with mistletoe and holly and snow laden trees. An untrimmed tree was the focal point of the program. The various classes decorated the tree as the legend pertaining to the origin of each type of decoration was given by Mrs. Wheeler. The reading of the Christmas story from Luke by Ellen Jones, Luther's grade hymn and Van Dyke's "The Other Wise Man" were part of the impressive service which concluded with each member adding gifts of toys for orphans and money for the world service of the church to complete the trimming of the tree.

Christmas eve twenty-seven members of the Sunday school sang Christmas carols at various homes in the valley. They stopped at every home where a candle had been left burning in the window. Mrs. Boyle treated the singers to candy. The Wakefield family invited them in to warm and treat them to popcorn, candy and nuts. There sang around the piano there and also at the Frank Church home where they warmed by the fireside. The last stop was at the home of Mrs. Ethel Brown, where doughnuts and hot chocolate and a fire in the fireplace were very welcome to all.

Singing the carols from house to house deepened the desire of all present for the hastening of the time when there will be "peace on earth and good will to men" in every nation.

CAMAS VALLEY BOYS HONORED AT PARTY

CAMAS VALLEY — Friday evening the junior class of the high school gave a party honoring Don Cairns and Frank Milton who are going into the navy. The entire student body was invited.

Charge of Damaging Property Is Denied

A plea of innocent to a charge of damaging property and disturbing the peace was filed in the Roseburg justice court today by Henry Denn, Jr., Camas Valley, who posted cash bail of \$200.

District Attorney H. A. Canada reported that a restraining order had been issued in circuit court on petition of J. M. Rasmussen and Claude Baum, who charged that Denn had been blocking a road right of way over which logging trucks were operated.

A bridge located on the roadway under dispute was recently damaged, the district attorney said, leading to the filing of the complaint against Denn.

LEGAL NOTICES NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE. Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 2:30 p. m., Pacific War Time, January 9, 1945 for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B. M., which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required

with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 21 S. R. 9 W. Sec. 29, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE1 NE1 and W1 NE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 4365 M. feet Douglas Fir, 1385 M. feet Hemlock, 80 M. feet Red Cedar, 40 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$4.25 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the Hemlock, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Red Cedar, \$1.75 ea. for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$22,203.75, will be considered. T. 24 S. R. 6 W. Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 3 (NW1 SW1), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 650 M. feet Douglas Fir, 40 M. feet White Fir, 20 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.75 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir and Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$1,907.50, will be considered. T. 30 S. R. 4 W. Sec. 27, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the NE1 NE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 640 M. feet Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet White Fir, 10 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, and \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$1,620.00, will be considered. Area to be logged with caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by Forester in charge of sale. T. 31 S. R. 5 W. Sec. 35, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE1 SE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 1285 M. feet Douglas Fir, 15 M. feet White Fir, 60 M. feet Incense Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.75 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, \$2.25 per M. ft. B. M. for the Incense Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$3,738.75, will be considered. All timber cut from each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing area designated by the O. & C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the Maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 18th day of December 1944. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. & C. Administration.

LEGAL NOTICES SUMMONS. In the circuit court of the state of Oregon for Douglas county. Joy F. Miller, Plaintiff, vs. Juanita Miller, Defendant.

IN THE NAME OF THE STATE OF OREGON: You are hereby required to appear and answer the complaint filed against you in the above entitled court and cause within four (4) weeks from the date of the first publication of this summons, and if you fail to do so, the court for the relief therein demanded, a succinct statement of which is as follows:

That the bonds of matrimony heretofore entered into by and between the parties hereto be dissolved.

This summons is served upon you by publication in the Roseburg News-Review, a newspaper of general circulation published in Douglas county, Oregon, pursuant to an order of the Honorable Carl E. Wimberly, Judge of the above entitled court, duly made and entered on the 9th day of November, 1944, requiring this summons to be published once a week for four (4) successive weeks and requiring you to appear and answer plaintiff's complaint within four (4) weeks from the date of the first publication of this summons.

Dated and first published this 8th day of December, 1944.

CARL M. MELKER, Attorney for Plaintiff.