

Enrolls at College—Miss Carlette F. Bailey, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Walter C. Bailey, route 2, Roseburg, has registered for the fall term at Pomona college, Claremont, Calif. She was graduated from Roseburg senior high last spring.



Room 201 Pacific Bldg.
S. M. SORESEN Phone 288

Proposed Application For Housing Aid Studied

(Continued from page 1)
within the community.
The county commission, Chairman Orr reports, is of the opinion that an application should be filed, the principal question being the number of units to be sought.
The county court also has approved the filing of an application, Judge D. N. Busenbark reports.
"We have agreed with the commission that we should make an application for a Douglas county unit," Busenbark said, "although we do not know how essential it will be for us to provide such facilities or how many we should request. However, as we understand the project, the commission has three years in which to undertake actual con-

Carload CELOTEX

Insulation Board
Just Received
Side Wall and Ceiling Tile

DENN-GERRETSEN CO.

Phone 128 402 W. Oak St.

MR. BUSINESS MAN: YOUR INCOME STOPS

When fire hits your business unless you have protected yourself. You need that income now—you will need it after the fire.

Let us help you to complete your protection program.

BAILEY & McKIBBIN

"Ken" "Bill"
COMPLETE INSURANCE SERVICE

315 Pacific Building Phone 398
Successors to Ken Bailey Insurance Agency

PLUMBING

PROMPT REPAIR SERVICE

Complete stock of Fixtures and Fittings, including Sinks, Toilets, Lavatories, Tubs, Showers, Range Boilers, Gas Water Heaters, Shallow and Deep Well Pumps.

CALL OR SEE

COEN LUMBER COMPANY

Flood and Mill Sts. Phone 121

It's Time for a Change!



ELECT Thomas E. Dewey and John W. Bricker

This year . . . Vote Republican

Pd. Adv. Republican State Central Committee. Carl Moser, Executive Secretary, Morgan Bldg., Portland, Oregon.

Arnhem Hero Escapes



(A.E.A. Radio-Telephone)
Lieut. Gen. Lewis H. Brereton, commanding general of the First Allied Airborne Army (U. S. 1st), Maj. Gen. K. N. Crawford, director of air, British War Office, and Maj. Gen. R. E. Urquhart, commander of British Paratroopers Force in Holland, following latter's return from the Holland front. General Urquhart commanded the First British Airborne Division in its epic stand at Arnhem and escaped from the Germans after being captured by them north of Lek, Holland. U. S. Army photo.

struction. Furthermore, it will probably be at least a year before congress appropriates funds with which to start building and by that time we should have a clearer idea of need."

"Rise and Strike," Urge Of MacArthur to Filipinos

(Continued from page 1)

resolute devotion to the principles of freedom that challenges the best that is written on the pages of human history. I now call upon your supreme effort that the enemy may know from the temper of an aroused and outraged people within that he has a force there to contend with no less violent than is the force committed from without.

"Rally to me. Let the indomitable spirit of Bataan and Corregidor lead on. As the lines of battle roll forward to bring you within the zone of operations, rise and strike! Strike at every favorable opportunity. For your homes, and hearths, strike; for future generations of your sons and daughters, strike! In the name of your sacred dead, strike! Let no heart be faint. Let every arm be steered. The guidance of divine God points the way. Follow in his name to the Holy Grail of righteous victory!"

MacArthur's call for guerrilla warfare was a summons to thousands of Filipinos who have been operating in roving bands throughout the islands, sometimes under American leadership, since the fall of Bataan. And it was a plea for others to join their numbers.

The extent of guerrilla activities was recognized by the puppet government a year ago when it voted to grant amnesty to any guerrilla who would swear "to become a good citizen."

Guerrilla activity could be of immeasurable value to MacArthur's men in the scattered islands, garrisoned by hated enemy troops.

Guerrilla activity could be of immeasurable value to MacArthur's men in the scattered islands, garrisoned by hated enemy troops.

Guerrilla activity could be of immeasurable value to MacArthur's men in the scattered islands, garrisoned by hated enemy troops.

Guerrilla activity could be of immeasurable value to MacArthur's men in the scattered islands, garrisoned by hated enemy troops.

Guerrilla activity could be of immeasurable value to MacArthur's men in the scattered islands, garrisoned by hated enemy troops.

Guerrilla activity could be of immeasurable value to MacArthur's men in the scattered islands, garrisoned by hated enemy troops.

Guerrilla activity could be of immeasurable value to MacArthur's men in the scattered islands, garrisoned by hated enemy troops.

Guerrilla activity could be of immeasurable value to MacArthur's men in the scattered islands, garrisoned by hated enemy troops.

Guerrilla activity could be of immeasurable value to MacArthur's men in the scattered islands, garrisoned by hated enemy troops.

Guerrilla activity could be of immeasurable value to MacArthur's men in the scattered islands, garrisoned by hated enemy troops.

Aachen Won by Yankees In Combat of 12 Days

(Continued from page 1)

and Dusseldorf.
The siege provided the first test whether Adolf Hitler would see German cities leveled in last ditch defenses all the way across the Reich to Berlin, 340 miles away.

Doughboys tonight had jammed the Nazi remnants into the outskirts of the city and were mopping them up, dispatches said.

Fanatical Officers Slain
Young German officers, many of them not long back from the Russian front, threw away their lives to gain another oak leaf cluster on their iron crosses—waging warfare for vanity.

The last convulsive gasp of resistance in the center of the city was at a large stone building in which 100 SS men had barricaded themselves in defiance of artillery which had pressed the defenders into an ever narrowing space.

Troops knocked out this last major stronghold with direct fire from a 155 mm gun. The gun literally knocked down the building.

Dispatches from Aachen today said from 500 to 1,000 Germans remained in isolated traps around the edges, while nearly 2,000 already had been captured.

Canadians Deliver Smash
Canadians opened a new phase of the allied drive to rout Nazis blocking use of Antwerp, prospective supply port for a massive offensive against the Reich.

Jumping off in the new assault early in the morning, the Canadians gained several miles in flat, wooded country. One force, predominantly armor, followed a rail line, and infantry struck out along a highway from areas about eight miles north and northeast of Antwerp, with heavy air support and British protection on the right flank.

On the extreme southern end of the allied front, French and Americans outflanked the village of Venroon, entrance to a 15-mile pass opening on the Rhine valley only seven miles from Mulhouse. They captured Bruyeres, one mile from Egnal, in a drive toward two more Vosges passes.

The British Second army, attempting to eliminate the German salient west of the Maas river in Holland, was bogged down by deep mud. American and British columns converging on Amerika, key town astride a main railroad to the Rhineland, were halted by entrenched German infantry, anti-tank and machinegun positions.

Major Ben B. Irving Resumes Practice Here

Major Ben B. Irving, who has been in active duty in the army since June 1941, announced today that he is resuming his practice of professional engineering and surveying in Roseburg. He is the unopposed candidate for the office of county surveyor, to succeed the late Harvey L. Epstein, having secured the endorsement of both parties at the primary election. He has recently been on leave at his home here pending a return to the officer reserve list, and will pass from an active to reserve status at midnight tonight.

Mr. Irving has been a registered civil engineer in Oregon since 1919 and has served as U. S. mineral surveyor and deputy county surveyor in Douglas county for a number of years.

Private Funeral Rites Set for Joel Duncan

Private funeral services will be held Saturday at the Roseburg Undertaking company chapel for Joel A. Duncan, 61, who died Wednesday at the Myrtle Creek hospital. Time of the services will depend upon arrival of relatives.

Born at Greenville, Mo., he came to Myrtle Creek two years ago as a millwright. Surviving are his wife and son.

The service will be conducted by the Rev. M. H. Roach and interment will follow in the Masonic cemetery.

Pacific coast rainfall ranges from 100 inches a year in northern Washington to two inches in the California desert.

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid for Timber", and addressed to the Chief Forester, and C. Administration, 901 Guardian Building, Portland, Oregon, will be received until 2:30 p. m., Pacific War Time, November 7, 1944 for the purchase of timber upon tracts hereinafter described; each bid must state the amount per M. feet B. M. which will be offered for each species and the total consideration which will be paid for the timber. No bid for less than the appraised value will be considered. Each bid must be submitted in duplicate and be accompanied by a deposit in the form of a certified check in favor of the Treasurer of the United States. The deposit of any successful bidder will be credited on the contract. Payment in full at the time of filing the contract is required in sales amounting to \$2500 or less. For copies of the form of proposal, form of contract and bond, terms of payment, amount of deposit required with bid, amount of bond required with contract and other information, application should be made to the address shown above. IN DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 20 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 25, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE1 NE1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 166 M. feet Douglas Fir, 10 M. feet White Fir. No bid for less than \$2.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, or a total purchase price of \$4,115.00, will be considered. T. 21 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 1, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lot 1 (NE1 NE1), SE1 of Lot 7 (SE1 SW1 NE1), Lot 8 (SE1 NE1), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2565 M. feet Douglas Fir, 15 M. feet Red Cedar. No bid for less than \$2.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Red Cedar, or a total purchase price of \$6,442.50, will be considered. T. 28 S., R. 7 W., Sec. 5, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9 and 10, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2485 M. feet Douglas Fir, 340 M. feet stamped Sugar Pine, 20 M. feet stamped Ponderosa Pine, 90 M. feet White Fir, 65 M. feet Incense Cedar, 5 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$2.25 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$8.25 per M. ft. B. M. for the stamped Sugar Pine, \$6.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the stamped Ponderosa Pine, \$1.75 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir, \$1.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the Incense Cedar, \$7.75 each for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$8,775.00, will be considered. All Douglas Fir less than 22 ins. DBHOB, all White Fir and Incense Cedar less than 14 ins. DBHOB, and all unmarked Pine are reserved from cutting. The area is to be logged by Caterpillar-type tractor or horses. T. 30 S., R. 8 W., Sec. 7, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on the SE1 NW1, Lot 2 (SW1 NW1), NE1 SW1, Lot 3 (NW1 SW1), estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2400 M. feet Douglas Fir, 130 M. feet stamped Sugar Pine, 37 M. feet stamped Ponderosa Pine, 210 M. feet stamped Port Orford Cedar, 160 M. feet White Fir, 100 M. feet Red Cedar, 140 M. feet Incense Cedar, 57 Red Cedar Poles. No bid for less than \$3.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$9.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the stamped Sugar Pine, \$6.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the stamped Ponderosa Pine, \$15.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the stamped Port Orford Cedar, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the White Fir and Red Cedar, \$1.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the Incense Cedar, \$7.75 each for the Red Cedar Poles, or a total purchase price of \$12,533.25, will be considered. All Port Orford Cedar, Sugar Pine and Ponderosa Pine trees not stamped USOC are reserved from cutting. Timber to be logged with Caterpillar-type tractor unless otherwise authorized by the Forester in charge of the sale. T. 31 S., R. 4 W., Sec. 27, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the NE1 NW1, and all of the NW1 NW1 and SE1 NW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 2590 M. feet Douglas Fir, 5 M. feet Incense Cedar, 55 M. feet White Fir. No bid for less than \$4.25 per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir, \$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Incense Cedar and White Fir, or a total purchase price of \$11,127.50, will be considered. All Douglas Fir, White Fir and Incense Cedar less than 22 ins. DBHOB are reserved from cutting. All timber South and East of a blazed line in the NE1 NW1 is reserved from cutting. SE1 NW1 to be logged by Caterpillar-type tractor. T. 32 S., R. 3 W., Sec. 3, all merchantable timber designated for cutting on a portion of the NW1 SW1, estimated for the purpose of this sale to be 145 M. feet stamped Ponderosa Pine. No bid for less than \$7.50 per M. ft. B. M. or a total purchase price of \$1,087.50, will be considered. All timber cut from each of the above described areas must be manufactured in the local marketing areas designated by the O. and C. Administration unless otherwise authorized by the Chief Forester. If the unit prices bid are above those authorized by MPR 460, they will be reduced to the maximum permitted under that order. In case of two or more identical bids for the same timber, the successful bidder will be selected on the basis of comparative importance to the war program and ability to further the objectives of the Act of August 28, 1937. The right is hereby reserved to waive technical defects in this advertisement; to reject all bids, or to award the timber for the amount of the highest bid to other than the highest bidder when necessary, pursuant to the Act of August 28, 1937 (50 Stat. 874), in order to provide a continued supply of timber to local industry so as to assure the permanence of the community which is dependent upon such industry. Dated at Portland, Oregon, this 16th day of October, 1944. W. H. Horning, Chief Forester, O. and C. Administration.

MISCELLANEOUS

TRUCK AND TRAILER FRAMES, chassis welded and reinforced. All work guaranteed. Umpqua Welding Works, 515 Fullerton St.
NO HUNTING or trespassing on my property at Deady or W. H. Daugherty property at Sutherlin. H. L. Wahl.
DEPOT BARBER SHOP—Quick efficient service, 2 barbers, baths. 409 W. Cass street.
THERE WILL BE NO HUNTING or trespassing without permission. Thomas Bros.
NO HUNTING or trespassing on any property owned and operated by A. A. Tipton.
NO HUNTING OR TRESPASSING on Happy Valley ranch. Lyle E. Marsters.
NO HUNTING ON J. F. Culver place—on head of Rice creek. A. A. Bellows.
NO HUNTING OR TRESPASSING on my ranch near Glide. C. G. Gilbreath.
NO HUNTING OR TRESPASSING on T. O. Dixon estate. O. H. McNece.
NO HUNTING OR TRESPASSING on my property. M. H. Doering.
NO STOCK SQUASH for sale this year. W. F. Wright, Curry estate.
NO TRESPASSING OR HUNTING on our property. Kruse Bros.
NO HUNTING OR TRESPASSING on our property. F. Baragar & Son.

MISCELLANEOUS

NO HUNTING or trespassing on Sunshine ranch. Frank Strader.
NO HUNTING or trespassing on the Smith place. S. E. Green.
NO HUNTING or trespassing on W. F. Paris ranch at Carnes.
NO HUNTING OR TRESPASSING on Lynn Beckley place.
NO HUNTING OR TRESPASSING on C. T. Brown place.
RENTALS
APARTMENT FOR RENT to carpenter who will complete and occupy it. 530 W. Oak.
FOR RENT—Rooms, one up and one down stairs. Close in. Men only. 126 W. Lane.
FOR RENT—3 room furnished apartment. 328 N. Chadwick St.
NO HUNTING OR TRESPASSING on Stanley Pearce ranch.
POULTRY
FOR SALE—Chinese silkies, two cockerels and four pullets six months old. H. J. Klinger, Winchester.
WANTED—Mature New Hampshire pullets immediately. Mrs. Frank Brown, Camas Valley, Ore.
FOR SALE—Turkeys. Reasonable. H. H. Long, Umpqua.
HAY, GRAIN, FEED
TRIANGLE FEEDS FOR BETTER RESULTS. Page Lumber & Fuel Co. 301 N. Main St.
FOR SALE—Really good baled rye grass hay. Rt. 2. Box 320. Emmett Hall place. J. D. Blake.

NOTICE

Notice to holders of preferred stock certificates No. 976 to 1021 inclusive, of the Douglas County Farm Bureau Cooperative Exchange. You are hereby notified that the above mentioned certificates have been called for payment and will be paid on presentation at the company's office. Interest on the above mentioned certificates will cease on October 31st, 1944.
A. R. KRONKE, Secretary.

LEGAL NOTICES

NOTICE OF FINAL SETTLEMENT
Notice is hereby given that the undersigned, administrator with the will annexed of the estate of Frank Spaur, deceased, has filed in the county court of Douglas county, Oregon, her final account as such administratrix and the court has fixed, Thursday, the 19th day of November, 1944, at 10:00 o'clock in the forenoon, and the county court room at the courthouse, Roseburg, Oregon, as the time and place for hearing the objections, if any, to said final account and for the closing of said estate.
GRITTA SPAUR, Administratrix cum testamento annexo of the estate of Frank Spaur, deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

All persons having claims against the estate of John B. Rondeau, deceased, now pending in the county court of Douglas county, Oregon, are hereby notified to present the same, properly verified, to the undersigned executor at the office of Rice & Crevel in Roseburg, Douglas county, Oregon, within six months from the 22nd day of September, 1944.
WALTER RONDEAU, Executor of the last will and testament of John B. Rondeau, deceased.

NOTICE

Regular meeting of the Veterans of Foreign Wars Post No. 4268 and Auxiliary, 8 p. m., K. P. hall, Friday, October 20.

G. E. Aiken, Ex-Oregon Wildlife Official, Dies

BEND, Ore., Oct. 20.—(AP)—A former official of the Oregon Wildlife federation and early-day publisher of the Sisters Herald, George E. Aiken, 72, died at his home in Sisters Wednesday. Aiken, after moving to Sisters from Salem 32 years ago, advocated in his newspaper the completion of the McKenzie highway. His widow and two sons, Kenneth of Fresno, Calif., and Donald of Sisters, survive.

DANCE

Saturday, Oct. 14

ORIENTAL GARDENS

Every Saturday 9 p. m.

TURKEY GROWERS

Come in and see our new set up for turkey killing.
We also buy poultry and eggs at top market prices.
We sell our own mixed feeds under Northwest Brand.

NORTHWEST POULTRY CO.

500 West Lane Phone 210

AL'S ROSEBURG AUCTION

On Highway 99 North
Monday, October 23, 1944
SALE STARTS AT 11:00 SHARP

FURNITURE AND MISCELLANEOUS

Along with the usual house full of furniture and miscellaneous, we have a General Electric range, and a General Electric refrigerator, both in A-1 condition.

LIVESTOCK AT 2:00 O'CLOCK

Five head of good dairy cows, twelve head of good yearling and two year old heifers. All classes of weaner and feeder pigs are bringing top market prices. Bring in your livestock, we always have a buyer.

Be sure and tune in KRNR Monday morning 7:25 and Al will give you a full listing of the consignments in.

Al La Pan Olie Cooper
AUCTIONEERS
Phone 896, Roseburg Phone 7-F-24, Oakland

Roseburg News-Review

1944 BARGAIN OFFER — RENEWALS ONLY

Monday is Closing Day

All payments mailed up to Monday night will be accepted.

By Mail — One Year \$4.50

City Carrier Rate \$6.50 per year

Due to the paper shortage our allowance of paper has been reduced and we are sorry that we are unable this year to extend the Bargain Offer to new subscribers. All subscribers already on our list may save by taking advantage of the Bargain Offer for a year.