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Dated Good Friday at
Pilgrim Holiness Church

tho Church of Christ officiating.
Concluding services and inter-
ment will follow at Civil Bend
cemetery.

Airways Plan for
Feeder Service is

Explained Here

UMPQUA SAVINGS ANP
LOAN ASSOCIATION

Real Estate Loam

Phone 87

if

Local
iNews

hi

Be One of 400
in the

Christian Church Bible School
Across from the Courthouse

An area of 7 acres, more or less,
in the S1NEJNE1, and an area
of 6 acres, more or less In the
SJNWJNE1, are reserved from
cutting. Caterpillar type logging
is to be used in the NiNWl un-
less otherwise designated by the
District Forester. T. 29 S., R. 7
W., Sec. 25, all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
the SJNW1, and SW1, estimated
for the purpose of this sale to be
3590 M. feet Douglas Fir. 405 M.
feet Incense Cedar, 215 M. feet
White Fir, 5 M. feet stamped a

Pine, 25 M. feet Red Ce-
dar. No bid for less than S3.00
per M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas
Fir. S1.50 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Incense Cedar and White Fir,
$7.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the
stamped Ponderosa Pine, $1.00
per M. ft. B. M. for the Red Ce-

dar, or a total purchase price of
$11,700.00, will be considered. An
area of 21 acres, more or less,

Glide Visitors Here Mr. and
Mrs. Harold Barker of Glide at-

tended to business In Koseburg
yesterday. .irjV.-i-n

: A

J. F. Safely, Former

Douglas Resident, Dies

Joseph F. Safely, formerly
Douglas county resident, died
Wednesday at Cottage Grove.

Born in Arkansas in 1880, he
spent the greater part of his life
in Oregon, making his home at
Days Creek for a number of
years prior to moving to Cottage
Grove 19 years ago. He was a
former member of the city coun-
cil at Cottage Grove, where he
was in business as an insurance
agent.

Surviving are tho widow, the
former Pearl Beals, to whom he
was married November 7, 1909;
two sons, Rodney Safley, Cottage
Grove, and Cecil Safley, U. S.
navy, and two grandchildren.

mm
TOMORROW

and

FRIDAY

"FUGITIVE
FROM

SONORA"
and

"COLT
COMRADES'

Shoos And Visits Mrs. Free-
man Williams of Elgaroso spent
today ,in Roseburg visiting and
shoppnlg.

i within a blazed boundary line in
Shoos And Visits Mrs. Clem

Schneider of Garden Valley spent
yesterday in Roseburg shopping
and visiting.

Mrs. Grimm In Hospital Mrs.
C. J. Grimm of Fosehure was ad-

mitted Tuesday to Sacred Heart
hospital in Eugene for medical
treatment.

m

The plan of the Southwest
Ainvays for Inauguration of feed-
er air lines in Washington, Ore-
gon and California was explained
here Wednesday evening to a
committee of the Roseburg cham-
ber of commerce by W. J. R.
Simms, operations manager, and
Paul G. Sturges, public relations
director.

The company, which Is now op-

erating a feeder service, for army
camps in California, while main-

taining four major training
schools for the army air forces,
is planning to extend Its service
as soon as equipment Is obtain-
able, providing federal authority
is secured, it was stated.

The organization Includes 400

pilots, 1150 mechanics and 450 ad-

ditional employes In various
phases of the ground work. The
personnel Is now engaged in du-

ties connected with the war ef-

fort, but at the end of the war
they will be released fpr civilian
work, it was stated.

System Is Explained.
Plans have been made where-

by plane connections would be
given all of the principal towns
of Oregon, to connect at Portland
and Medford with transcontinen-
tal air lines. The planes would
handle mail, express and passen-
ger services. Schedules starting
with three planes dally in each
direction would be augmented as
rapidly as business Justified, the
officers said. The application for
federal authority will provide for
added schedules as soon as a 50
per cent load factor Is reached
on any established schedule.

A new tvpe of

Rev. O. C. Keller, above, dis-

trict superintendent of Pacific
Northwest district of the Pilgrim
Holiness church and former pas-
tor of the local congregation, will
speak at a special Good Friday
service at the church at 477 S.
Jackson at 8 p. m.

Mrs. Beckvith, the present pas-
tor's wife, and Mrs. Keller, who

the SWiNWi is reserved from
cutting. All timber in each of
the above described areas must
be manufactured in the local mar-

keting area designated by the O.
and C. Administration, unless
otherwise authorized by the
Chief Forester. If the unit prices
bid are above those authorized by
MPR 4G0, they will be reduced to
the maximum permitted under
that order. In case of two or
more identical bids for the same
timber, the successful bidder will
be selected on the basis of com-

parative importance to the war
program and ability to further
the oblectives of the Act of Au-

gust 28, 1937. The right to waive
technical defects, and to reject
any and all bids is reserved. Dat-
ed at Portland, Oregon, this 25th
day of March, 1944. W. H. Horn-
ing, Chief Forester, O. and C.

accompanies her. husband, will i

Obtain Marriaae License John
Richards, 49. and Rhoda Chris-

tian, both of Rqscburcr, obtained
a marriage license this week at
Vancouver, Wash.

ENDS TONIGHT
ERROL FLYNN

"GENTLEMAN
JIM"

: ALSO

Easter Sunday. April 9
at 9:45 a. m.

The Young Peoples Chorus Choir will sing
Be a part of the biggest Bible School to

ever assemble in Douglas County.

COME!!

Hull Dates Broadcast
On U. S. Foreign Policy

WASHINGTON, April 6.
(AP) The state department an-

nounced today that Secretary
Hull will make a
speech on foreign policy Sun-
day.

The address Is expected to be
an elaboration of the secretary's
recently summarized 17 points of
foreign policy with some specific
examples of the way in which
the policy is working out.

The speech will be broadcast
from 3:30 to 4:15 p. m. PWT,
April 9.

Reported Ml Mrs. Theodore
Althaus is reported to be ill of
a bad cold at her home inWorklnq At Abstract Office-M- rs.

Charles Hart, nee Gladvs
Hart, has accepted a position in
the office of the Commercial Ab-

stract company office.
"GIRLS ON

PROBATION" Degree Staff to Practice
Roseburg Rebekah degree staff
members are asked to attend a
practice meeting Friday night at
the I. O. O. F. hall.

Leaves For Davs Creek Mrs.
Virginia Mesick, teacher at the
Rose school, has left for Davs
Creek to spend the Easter vaca-
tion at her home.

KOW PLAYING Attends to Business Rawl-sto-

Cole of Oakland spent yes-

terday In Roseburg attending to
business.

Go To Elkton Mrs. Ella Fen-le-

and Mr. and Mrs. DeGnath of
Roseburg went to Elkton Tues-

day to attend the Rebekah lodge
session. Mrs. Fenlcy remained at
Elkton to visit over Easter Sun-

day with her sister.

plane, especially designed for theV
Ai'endina To Business Mrs.

C. W. Clark, owner of Clark's
nhotogranhic studio In Roschnrg.
is spending a few davs" in Fort-lan-

aitending to business.

THE STORY OF (IGH1

HEROIC AMERICANS

WHO, IN THE fACI

01 dfatu niiitn . ? 4&

Vlsitlno At Port Orford
Naomi Cushman of Rosehurc is

spending a few dnvs at Port Or-

ford, Ore., visiting her brother-in-la-

and sister, Mr. and Mrs.
John Llles.

type of service proposed, has been
developed, it was stated. It will
carry from 10 to 12 passengers
in addition to a large express and
mail load.

A pre hearing conference Is to
be held by the Civil Aeronautics
board In the near future, the
chamber of commerce committee
was told, and It was requested
that data be filed to show Rose-burg- 's

transportation needs. No
endorsement of the company's
plan was requested.

Here for Over Easter Mr. and
Mrs. Ferroll lies and two daugh-
ters, Lorelee and Bonnie, of Eu-

gene arc In Roseburg to visit over
Easter with Mr. lies' parents, Mr.
and Mrs. Story lies, and his broth-
er and sister-in-law- , Mr. and Mrs.
G. M. lies.

Food Sale To Be Held The
South Deer Creek school will
soonsor a cooked food sale Satur-
day, April 8, at Powell's hardware
store on North Jackson street to
raise money for club work.

AN EMPIRE...

HEART &

William Andrew Teague
Passes Away Here

William Andrew Teague, 75,

Arrive From Los Angeles
Mr. and Mrs. Charles D. Mitchell
of Los Angeles arrived in Kose-

burg Wednesday to spend their
vacation visiting the latter's par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Fred A.

Knight, and brother-in-la- and
sister, Mr. and Mrs. Frederick J.
Porter.

Grange Plans Meeting Ever-

green grange will meet at the
hall Monday night with the men
furnishing lunch for two in a
sock. The socks will he purchas-
ed bv the women. Officers and
members, are being especially
urged to atend the meeting.

died this morning at the home
of his daughter, Mrs. Dora Boll-ma-

on North Jackson street,
Roseburg, following a long 111

ness. He was born In Indiana,Scout Expansion
In Douglas County
Leads District

Leave For Meetlnq Fred I,
Southwlck, sunervlslng warden of
the Douglas Forest Protective as-

sociation, accompanied by Iceland
Hart or and Ed Schrocder, Rose-

burg, left Wednesday for Salem
to spend the remainder of the
week attending a meeting of all
wardens of the state.

c ill. U tkt Dmoiu Cfi it Of iMritM talitrl

("TJ
eeaBBeBMassaBBBseeaBsaBBBBeasBaeaaBaaeeaeaesBsses

jTEINWTS, Knyr I. a I
funds rtnltjr ilStii'y I V
purchase; jJT frrCW I '

cHt li'', v ...

!! 1 iy A ' H.

' '" ''' '"''..s"!S'vv,l ! . ' '

V . i r '
4-- .

uhWJ ijtw u&e i , ?r (

I i 7 ili"iili.iMTii' nun iiii r3 yjirf ''it I ,A4niv wuMJrTrtiafnoiilu Tftwir)-- - l
I r,r mi f$ Hrtwkhivs KWitttftti; ton 4t " ippV idL 1

, i.tfi HfcO tfr cheats, cupj&y .nH ttAUort- ofiVt ? v.
ty- Wit. I

--" f erchandiso Wonted - ll J
'

,R jontnl ,?::;' 'i I

UK tl rk. wilKht JTb" !rtlf f!
' " J"''

i , J? Ptt aim ftnya y Mied . Jftj '
onwt l, v.hc.s noVoi;T-fi- OT CASK J ;ui -.

K'- jt ;ir. mil v. CAIrwala j'X 'j"tl I '
T

tvitA
Dana Richard Parity

ANDREWS CONTE - GRANGER

Kivln Donald Tnidy
O'SHEA BARRY MARSHALL

May 13, 1868, and was married
to Mary Ann Cornelison at Plain-ville- ,

Mo., March 12, 1894. Ho
came to Roseburg from Oakland,
Calif., in January of this year
to make his home with his daugh-
ter.

Surviving are nine sons and
daughters: Mark T. and Francis
Teague both of Council Bluffs,
Iowa; Kenneth Teague, Denver,
Colo.; Charles Teague, Mrs. Dora
Bollman, Roseburg; William
Teague, Oakley, Kansas; Leon-
ard Teague, Lincoln, Neb.; Mrs.
Fern Walker, Omaha, Neb., and
Wayne Teague, Cody, Wyoming.
A brother, a sister, nineteen
grandchildren, and two great-
grandchildren also survive.

The body has been removed to
the Douglas Funeral home and
will be forwarded to Council
Bluffs, Iowa, for services and

"The people in Douglas countyare backing the Boy Scout move-
ment with more enthusiasm and
hard work than those of any oth-
er of the six counties in the Oor-go-

Trail council" said J. - R.
Bruckart, president of the Boy
Scout council in a letter received
today by B. C. Elliott, district
scout chairman.

The Boy Scout movement is
doing' a concrete Job in helping
to solve the youth problems of
this area as evidenced by the
membership figures for the end

Visiting From Bremerton
Mrs. Samuel E. Carson and chil-

dren, Patsy, Alma and Perry Car-

son, of Bremerton, Wash., are
visiting with Mrs. Carson's par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. A. E. Hodges,
at Olalla. They formerly resided
in Roseburg and will return to
their home at Bremerton

NOTICE OF TIMBER SALE.

Sealed bids, marked outside "Bid
for Timber," and addressed to
the Chief Forseter, O. and C. Ad-

ministration, 901 Guardian Build-
ing, Portland, Oregon, will he re-
ceived until 2:30 p. m., Pacific
War Time, April 11, 1944, for the
purchase of timber upon tracts
hereinafter described; each bid
must state the amount per M. feet
B. M., which will be offered for
each species and the total consid-
eration which will be paid for the
timber. No bid for less than the
appraised value will be consider-
ed. Each bid must be submitted
In duplicate and be accompanied
bv a deposit In the form of a cer-
tified check in favor of tho
Treasurer of the' United States.
The denosit of anv successful bid-

der will be credited on the con-

tract. Payment In full at the
time of filing the contract Is

In sales amounting to
$2500 or less. For copies of the
form of nropnsal, form of eon-tra-

and bond, terms of pavment,
amount of deposit required with
bid. amount of bond required
with contract and other informa-
tion, application should be made
to the address shown above. IN
DOUGLAS COUNTY: T. 21 S., R.
6 W., Sec. 13, all merchantable
timber designated for cutting on
the SEJSWJ and SW1 SEl. esti-
mated for the purpose of this
sale to he 17fi0 M. feet Douglas
Fir, 10 M. feet Hemlock. 30 M.
feet Red Cedar, 60 M. feet In-
cense Cedar. No bid for less than
$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the
Douglas Fir. $1.50 per M. ft. B.
M for the Hemlock, Red and In-
cense Cedar, or a total purchase
price of $3,670 00, will bo con-
sidered. T. 26 S., R. 2 W., Sec.
29, all merchantable timber de-

signated for cutting on the SEJ,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 3945 M. feet Douglas
Fir, 215 M. feet stamped Sugar
Pine, 220 M. feet Hemlock. 190
M. feet Incense Cedar, 255 M.
feet Red Cedar, 5 M. feet White
Fir. No bid for less than $2.50
oer M. ft. B. M. for the Douglas
Fir, $7.00 per M. ft. B. M. for
the stamped Sugar Pine, $1.50
per M. ft. B. M. for the Hemlock
and White Fir, $2.00 per M. ft.
B. M. for the Incense Cedar and
Red Cedar, or a total purchase
price of $12,595.00, will be con-
sidered. T. 26 S., R. 2 W., Sec.
33, all merchantable timber de-

signated for cutting on the N5NJ,
estimated for the purpose of this
sale to be 5585 M. feet Douglas
Fir, 15 M. feet stamped Sugar
Pine, 150 M. ft. White Fir, 205
M. feet Hemlock, 320 M. feet Red
Cedar. 30 M. feet Incense Cedar.
No bid for less than $3.75 per M.
ft. B. M. for the Douglas Fir,
$7.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the
stamped Sugar Pine, $1.50 per M.
ft. B. M. for the White Fir,
Hemlock, and Incense Cedar,
$2.00 per M. ft. B. M. for the Red
Cedar, or a total purchase price
of $22,266.25, will be considered.

'Mo' Uiuuuc in the Wastf

of March, just released by the

AZALEA GRANGE HALL

Saturday, April 8

MUSIC BY RHYTHM RASCALS

A CLASSIFIED

scout office in Eugene.
One year ago January when

the scout leaders of the district
determined upon an agressive
plan of expansion, a total of 105
bovs were in scouting in the dis-

trict. On April 1, 1944, just 15
months later, this total had climb
ed to exactly 300. New troops
have been organized, new leader-
ship recruited and trained, and
the program made available to
an expanding group of boys
throughout the county. In spite
of the many problems confront-
ing men of all ages these days,
the total number of adult men
engaged in scouting leadership
In the district has risen from 30
to 84.

The present membership figure
of 384 men and boys does not take
into account the four new troops
now organizing in the district,
but which are not as yet oftically
registered. According to K. A.
Wells, scout executive, "this Is

the largest gain made by any dis-

trict in the entire
council and now gives to the
Douglas district the enviable posi-
tion of leading all of the districts
in the number of scouts and cubs
registered in relation to their
boy population."

Mrs. Carrie Buffington
Of Roseburg Passes

Mrs. Carrie G. Bufflngfon, 52,
wife of J. T. Buffington and
well known resident of Roseburg,
died at her home on East Douglas
street yesterday following a pro-
longed Illness. She was born
January 4, 1892, at Tallapoosa,
Alabama, and was married to Mr.
Buffington in 1910 In Cass county,
Texas. She came to Roseburg
about 12 years ago from New
Mexico.

Mrs. Buffington was a member
of the Church of Christ. Surviv-
ing besides her husband, are five
children, Mrs. Gertrude Helen
Hall, Midland, Texas; Mrs. Lucy
Edna Kemp, Roseburg; Byron
Dennis Buffington, Eugene; Mrs.
Leora Lynn, Melrose and Mrs.
Arvllla Hiney, Roseburg. Three
sisters and one brother also sur-
viveMrs. Nora Hicks, Jal, New
Mexico; Mrs. Ethel Cox, Pitts-
burg, Texas; Mrs. Emmer Smith,
Louisiana, and Floyd Martin,
fjilmn Tpvn. Rho la nlcrt onrvltz.

CRYSTAL

ER SET:
GIVES THE ANSWER

Yes! You have cash, and to get the best pos-

sible value for it, you'll buy through the CLAS-

SIFIED ADS daily listings of things other re-

liable folks have to sell.

52 pieces
Service for eight

There's a world of

interest in classified

ads and profit too!

Read them today,
and every day it's

a habit that pays!
$7.f51 1 RADIATOR

REPAIRING AND

CLEANING
Fire King Glassware

ed by twelve grandchildren.
Funeral services will be held

in the chapel of the Douglas Fu-- !

neral home Sunday afternoon at
2:30 o'clock, Rev. Joe L. Banks of

Tired Kidneys
Often Bring

No! You have no cash, but you must raise it

ribht away! For speediest results, you'll sell

through the CLASSIFIED ADS daily listings of

things other reliable folks want to buy.

Two Pay Fines Here for
Traffic Law Breaking

Fines paid in the justice court
at Roseburg today were reported
bv Judge Thomas Hartflel to in-

clude Claude E. Talcott. $10, no
vehicle 'license; George E. Hamp-
ton, $50, reckless driving.

Ovenware

O

Umpqua Valley Hardware

Ship me your radiators
3 repairmen
Quick Return

Quality Work

COAK'S RADIATOR
SERVICE

872 Pearl Street
Eugene, Oregon

PHONE 100
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Sleepless Nights
When disorder of kidney function permits

prisonous miturto remain In your blood. It
mar cause nagging backache, rheumatic
pains. Ice pains, loai of pep and energf,
grating up niRliU. swelling, pufnneac under
tlie eyes, iieedar-he- and dizziness. Frequent
or scanty passages with smart! ng and burn-
ing sometimes shows there Is something
wrong with rour kidneys or bladder.

pon't waltt Aik your druggist for Doan's
Pills, used successfully br millions for over
41" years. They give happy relief and will help
the 16 miles of kidnty tube lush out poison-
ous wute from your blood. Get Doen'a 1'llla.

CHURCHILL HARDWARE CO.
202 North Jackson Telephone 73

FOR ITCHING OF
MINOR SKIN RASHES
get thia medicated powder. Contain in-

gredient often recommended by many
specialist a for simple raxhea. diaper raah
and chafing. Mexnana eoothea and forma
coat of protection on tender akin.
Coal! little. Atwaya demand Mcxaana.


