

SEE THE

CLASSIFIED

FOR SELLING

BUYING

RENTING

LOANS

SERVICE

For Your Convenience

These Douglas County stores will take Want Ads for the NEWS-REVIEW.

STEARNS & CHENOWETH
Oakland
STONARD DRUG CO.
Yoncalla

McDONALD STORE
Elkton

HEBARD'S
Elkton

GLICK STORE
Gladstone

L. B. NICHOLS
Bend

R. H. RITCHIE CO.
Camas Valley

HOWELL'S STORE
Tumalo

C. C. FOSBICK
Bilham

REYNOLDS & ADAMS
Myrtle Creek

KIMMERS
Biddle

HENNINGER'S
Gladstone

HENNINGER'S
Canyonville

DAN'S CREEK STORE
Dunsmuir

The above stores will accept and pay for them. Just tell the merchant listed above. I want to put an ad in the News-Review, and he will take care of all the details for you.

NEWS-REVIEW

Classified Ads

Phone 100

RATES

First insertion, per word 2c
Each subsequent insertion per word 1c
One week, per word 6c
One month, per word 20c
Minimum charge 25c

Copy for this page will be accepted until 11 a. m. on the day of publication.

The News-Review assumes no responsibility for and in no way guarantees the financial responsibility or integrity of the advertisers in the classified columns. Advertisers are urged to make full investigation before sending money in response to advertisements.

The News-Review reserves the right to reject objectionable advertising. It further reserves the right to classify all advertising under the proper classification.

To get in touch with advertisers giving as their address "Box so and so, care News-Review," it is necessary to write them. The News-Review doesn't know who they are either.

Livestock

FOR SALE—2-year-old Jersey heifer, freshen soon; 2 extra fine, yearling Jersey heifers. Phone 39F11, or see C. W. Lawson at Farm Bureau Shop.

WANT to correspond with one who has a male poodle dog. Money or puppy. Route 2, Box 401, Roseburg.

TEAM mares, 1200, ten years old. Harness, wagon, cheap. J. B. Wilson, Yoncalla.

FOR SALE—10 head young milk goats. See Emory Baker at the Flour Mill.

FOR SALE—Jersey cow, two nice heifer calves. Phone C-F-24.

150 HEAD of sheep for sale. J. C. Schneider, Leona, Oregon.

TEAM OF MARES. Bargain for quick sale. Phone 34-F-5.

Hay, Grain, Feed

HAY for sale—Oats, hay, cheat and rye grass. Frank Brown, Phone 39F3.

FOR SALE—Baled alfalfa hay, first and second cutting. A. A. Bellows, 864 Military.

FOR SALE—Hay, baled oats and vetch. Howard Hatfield, phone 14-F-41.

FOR SALE—Loose and baled alfalfa. H. Hurley, Edenbowser.

For Sale Miscellaneous

WHY NOT get the Hy-Power, guaranteed muffler and for get your muffler troubles. Also get your glass at Sariff's Auto Wrecking House.

FOR SALE—O. S. C. electric brooder, 500 capacity. A. H. Marsh, Route 2, Wilbur-Garden Valley road.

A NEW modern storage locker system at Douglas Ice and Storage Co. Attractive rates. Cartons for sale.

ELECTROLUX sales and service. Phone 561. 119 W. Mosher.

Impounded

UNLESS claimed within 48 hours from date of notice, all dogs described below will be sold or killed as provided in City Ordinance No. 1014.

Black and white, female, mixed shepherd and bird, about 5 months old.

White and tan, long tail, female, fox terrier.

Tom Fletcher, City Enforcement Officer, phone 2F4. January 16, 5:00 p. m.

UNLESS claimed within 48 hours from date of notice, all dogs described below will be sold or killed as provided in City Ordinance No. 1014.

Medium, black and white, long tail, male, mixed shepherd and collie.

Large, white and tan, short hair, bob tail, female, mixed terrier and shepherd.

Tom Fletcher, City Enforcement Officer, phone 2F4. January 17, 5:00 p. m.

Real Estate

PRICED TO SELL and has an income—9 acres on highway 99, 7 miles from town, near high school, on good soil. Cultivation. Fruit. Good 7-room house, modern. One 4-room house, modern, with built-ins. This rents for \$10 a month. Inside plumbing. Electricity. Two good chicken houses. Price—\$2850. \$300 down, balance \$25 a month including interest. W. A. BOGARD, REAL ESTATE, 214 Cass street.

INVESTIGATE the opportunities we are offering you to get established on a farm of your own. Call at the National Farm Loan office, 415 Perkins Building, Roseburg, or write C. A. Barnes, 167 E. 8th St., Eugene, Federal Land Bank of Spokane.

Dentistry

Special Extraction and Pyorrhea Treatment. Gas when desired. New style plates and teeth. Old plates refitted like new. Dr. Nerbas. Masonic Bldg. Phone 488.

Dr. G. W. Marshall, Med. A. Bldg.

Wanted

WANTED—Hens and fryers. Portland quotations paid. Free pickup. Box 133, Camas Valley.

WANTED—Small sawmill outfit. M. B. Emmett, Umpqua.

Fuel

PHONE 282

Green and Dry Slab Wood

ROSEBURG LUMBER CO.

Rentals

4-ROOM furnished flat. Electric range. Reasonable. Mrs. A. H. Perrin, 1127 Harvard Ave.

FURNISHED room, steam heat, bath. Bell building, 122 S. Jackson, opposite Indian theatre.

HOUSES for rent at 709 S. Stephens and 217 Chadwick. Page Lumber & Fuel Co., phone 242.

RANCH for rent—45 acres, 12 acres Landina clover. C. D. Dyer, Myrtle Creek.

FOR RENT—Apartment on East avenue. Inquire 454 N. Stephens.

SEVEN-ROOM, unfurnished, close in. Inquire 211 Washington.

KOHLHAGEN APARTMENTS—Strictly modern. Phone 550.

FOR RENT—5-room furnished duplex. Phone 179R.

FIVEROOM modern house. 420 Vista avenue.

MODERN, furnished apartment. 926 S. Main.

ROOMS—Board if desired. Phone 803.

APARTMENT for rent, 646 S. Pine.

Work Wanted

WANTED—Jobs papering, painting, kalsomining. Herman Schulze, Brockway. Phone 2F41.

Chiropractor

DR. H. B. Scofield, Phone 273.

Miscellaneous

WILL the lady who made the mistake and wore the wrong coat away from Rebekah installation last Tuesday night, please phone 463-R or call 444 N. Rose street.

WILL the lady who got luncheon cloth at the Hematite Shop, 112 E. Cass street, Saturday, please return to shop.

PUBLIC dance, sponsored by Federal Employees, Oriental Gardens, January 18.

Educational

MEN WANTED to start immediate training for airplane construction work. Wonderful future. Must be American citizen. Small fee. P. O. Box 1223, Seattle, Washington.

Poultry

HUBBARD and Christie's New Hampshire pullets from blood-tested stock. Beginning to lay. A bargain. M. Squier, Sutherland, R. F. D.

Help Wanted

WANTED—Man to help slash. Must be good hand with axe and saw. Box 968, c/o News-Review.

Lost and Found

LOST—January 2-3, spotted hounds, between Riddle and Gladstone. W. A. Blackert, Myrtle Creek, Oregon.

NOTICE

American Legion Auxiliary Food Sale, January 18, Kohlhaugen Building—(Adv.)

BUSINESS DIRECTORY

RAPID REFERENCE TO RELIABLE BUSINESS HOUSES

GENERAL SAW FILING

Howard Casebeer, 443 S. Stephens. Also furniture repairing.

ANTIQUES

The Strange Shop, 106 S. Main.

AUTO REPAIRING

Knigh-Porter, Douglas & Main. Body, fender work, painting.

LOCKSMITH

Pacific Key Serv. Phone 348.

WASHING MACHINES—IRONERS

Bergh's, 630 Winchester, Ph. 805.

REFRIGERATION SERVICE

E. C. Jones, Phone 139-L.

RADIO ELECTRICAL REPAIRING

Roseburg Electric. Phone 123.

RADIO SERVICING

Bill Cuthbert's Radio Music Store. Ph. 93.

Hargis Radio Service. Phone 196.

Land Radio Service. Phone 34.

FLUE CLEANING

Furnaces vacuum cleaned—flue cleaning. Call 811. J. C. Bewley.

GARBAGE SERVICE

Bill's Garbage Service. Efficient serv. Reasonable rates. Ph. 338.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

In the County Court of the State of Oregon, for Douglas County.

In the Matter of the Estate of William Albert Imrie, Deceased.

Notice hereby is given, that the undersigned, by order of the County Court of the State of Oregon, for Douglas County, has been appointed administrator with the will annexed of the estate of William Albert Imrie, deceased.

All persons having claims against the estate of William Albert Imrie, deceased, hereby are notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the offices of Hallmark & Gledhill, in the Douglas National Bank Building, in Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, within six (6) months from the date of this notice.

Dated this 2nd day of January, 1941.

ROSEBORG COONS, Administrator with the will annexed of the estate of William Albert Imrie, deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

In the County Court of the State of Oregon, for Douglas County.

In the Matter of the Estate of Rhad O. Thomas, Deceased.

Notice hereby is given, that the undersigned, by order of the County Court of the State of Oregon, for Douglas County, has been appointed Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Rhad O. Thomas, deceased.

All persons having claims against the estate of Rhad O. Thomas, deceased, hereby are notified to present the same, verified as required by law, to the undersigned at the offices of Hallmark & Gledhill, in the Douglas National Bank Building, in Roseburg, Douglas County, Oregon, within six (6) months from the date of this notice.

Dated this 2nd day of January, 1941.

ROSEBORG COONS, Executor of the Last Will and Testament of Rhad O. Thomas, deceased.

National Forest Timber for Sale

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.

Sealed bids will be received by the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon, up to and including January 21, 1941, for all the timber marked or designated for cutting, located on an area embracing about 180 acres within S4, S5, NW1/4, and S5, Sec. 10, T. 33 S. R. 5W, W. 3M, Wolf Creek watershed, Umpqua National Forest, Oregon, amounting to 1,272,960 feet B. M. of Douglas Fir and 15,078 feet B. M. of sugar pine. No bid of less than \$1.50 per M. feet for Douglas Fir and \$1.50 per M. feet for sugar pine, will be considered. \$1,000 must be deposited with each bid, to be applied on the purchase price, refunded or retained in part as liquidated damages, according to conditions of sale. The right to reject any and all bids reserved. Before bids are submitted, full information concerning the timber, the conditions of sale, and the submission of bids should be obtained from the Forest Supervisor, Roseburg, Oregon.