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The  Lady  Ou t l aws 
snapped their five-game los-
ing streak with a 48-44 win 
on the road at Newport on 
Friday, February 11. 

In Friday9s matchup 
against Newport, both teams 
started off slow on the offen-
sive end of the court. Payden 
Petterson hit a shot from 
behind the arc and Josie 
Patton scored a bucket, for 
Sisters9 only points in the 
first quarter. Newport also 
struggled to score, and at the 
end of one the Lady Outlaws 
held a slim 5-4 advantage.

Petterson hit two more 
long balls in the second 
period, and Juhree Kizziar 
also hit one from behind the 
arc. Haleigh Froehlich went 
4-6 from the charity stripe 
for Sisters9 10 points in the 
quarter. The Cubs9 offense 
got on track and they scored 
17 points to enter the half 
with a six-point lead.

Sisters continued to drill 
three-pointers in the third: 
Petterson hit two long balls 
and Emma Lutz also hit from 
behind the arc. The Lady 
Outlaws outscored the Cubs 
18-11, and at the end of the 
third held a one-point edge 
over the Cubs with a score of 
33-32, holding momentum 
as teams entered the fourth 
quarter.

Newport put together an 
early run in the final period, 
and the Outlaws found them-
selves down by six with 
approximately four minutes 
left on the clock. Sisters 
kept their composure and 

responded with a run of their 
own. Big plays down the 
stretch included two three-
pointers from Ellie Mayes, 
which tied the score, and 
Josie Patton grabbing an 
offensive rebound and put-
back to give the Outlaws a 
two-point edge.

Both teams failed to score 
on the next several posses-
sions, and then the Outlaws 
pressured the Cubs and 
forced a turnover. Haleigh 
Froehlich was fouled and 
went to line. She made both 
her shots with three seconds 
left securing the Outlaws9 
four-point win.

Seven different play-
ers contributed points with 
Payden Petterson leading 
the team with 12 points, 
all of them three-pointers. 
Petterson also had three 
steals in the contest. Emma 
Lutz had her best game of 
the season with 10 points, 
including a three-pointer. 
She went four-for-six from 
the free-throw line, led the 
team with eight steals, and 
dished out three assists.

Haleigh Froehlich had 
nine points, pulled down six 
boards, and had three steals. 
Ellie Mayes scored seven, 
tallied six rebounds, and 
had three steals. Josie Patton 
contributed four points, and 
Ila Reid and Juhree Kizziar 
added three points each.

Coach Paul Patton said, 
<Newport is a team we beat 
the first time we played them 
and I think the expectation 
that we should beat them 
again led us to feel some 
pressure and that created 
anxiety, which affected our 

play, mainly in missed shots 
and turnovers. We collected 
ourselves at halftime and 
came out strong in the third 
quarter.=

<Getting this come-from-
behind win was a huge boost 
to the team9s morale and 
hopefully set us up to play 
well in our last three games 
of the season,= added Patton.

Petterson said, <I am 
super proud of us for really 
working together as a team, 
especially toward the end. It 
came down to the trust we 
had in one another that we 
would be smart with the ball, 
make good passes, play solid 
defense, and make our shots. 
That trust definitely showed 
with the outcome. I felt that 
it wasn9t just one player who 
changed the game, but it was 
all of us coming together and 
playing for each other that 
made us win.=

Earlier in the week, on 
Tuesday, February 8, the 
Outlaws were hoping to post 
a win in their game at Sweet 
Home. In the first round of 
league play, they were actu-
ally ahead going into the 
final quarter but lost the 
game at the end. It turned out 
to be the same scenario this 
time around, and Sisters had 
to record the 11-point loss.

Sisters9 game plan was 
to put a lockdown defender 
on Sweet Home9s best 

player, Brooke Burke, who 
scored 29 points against the 
Outlaws in their last match- 
up. Patton told The Nugget 
they were fairly successful 
at that, and held her to 16 
points. Unfortunately for the 
Outlaws, the Huskies had 
a couple of other players 
step up and score 16 and 12 
points.

Patton said, <They just 
shot the ball a little better 
than us and we struggled at 
times to take care of the bas-
ketball, which limited our 
scoring opportunities.=

Freshman Shae Wyland 
stood out for the Outlaws in 
her first time as a starter, and 
led the team in scoring with 
eight points and three steals.

Josie Patton also had a 

good game for the Outlaws 
and led the team with seven 
rebounds, and scored four 
points. As always, Patton was 
a vocal leader on defense.

Ila Reid scored seven 
points, Payden Petterson 
scored six, Juhree Kizziar 
tallied five, and Tatem 
Cramer added four. Haleigh 
Froehlich pulled down four 
rebounds and had two steals.

<The girls competed 
hard, as always, and showed 
improvement despite coming 
up short on the scoreboard,= 
said Patton.

A bright spot on the night 
was the JV team9s 52-28 
win, highlighted by Dulce 
Dunham, who scored two 
baskets, her first points of 
the season.

Lady Outlaws snap losing streak on basketball court
By Rongi Yost 
Correspondent

•  Large organic
produce selection

•  Huge organic &
natural selection
storewide

•  Meat cut &
ground fresh daily

•  Huge bulk-foods 
department

•  All your favorite 
local brands & 
items

•  Only 20 minutes 
from Sisters

•  Proud to be 100% 
locally owned 
& operated

Located in the Cascade Village 
Shopping Center, Bend

Open every day, 7 a.m. to 9 p.m.
Isolated shopping hour: 6 to 7 a.m.
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Local is Local is 

what we are. what we are. 

Local is Local is 

who we love.who we love.

Nothing says quality
like true hand-forged

 ironwork

“Your Local Welding Shop”
CCB# 87640

541-549-9280 | 207 W. Sisters Park Dr. | PonderosaForge.com 

Ad sponsored by The Nugget Newspaper.

Sisters 
Dental

541-549-2011
491 E. Main Ave. •  Sisters

Trevor Frideres, D.M.D. 
Greg Everson, D.M.D.

Kellie Kawasaki, D.M.D.

Hours: Mon., 9 a.m.-6 p.m.; Tues.-Thurs., 8 a.m.-5 p.m.; Fri., 7 a.m.-3 p.m.

www.sistersdental.com
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HERE
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